‘(V\D c)\/\PJ){ \A\ cors Com &u\c)bue,@ud:(\&dte ~S
(2e) s HES o
CONSTRUCTION BOARD OF APPEALS \5‘
City of El Paso, Texas

CITY DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT
Mg ; : A 222 S. Campbell St CLDVK
BUILDING & DEVELOEMENT PERMIﬁING DIVISION El Paso. TX 79901-1196

915-541-4557

. CONTACT INFORMATION

| 1. e L
PROPERTY on(\NER(S): ECT\Lond ﬁeoe/\egemu«i
ADDRESS: B vecwhioe Dr.zipcobe: )00 -pHON
REPRESENTATIVE(S): L ewtd) Hoaus /
ADDRESS: ZIP CODE:
E-MAIL ADDRESS:
[2.  PARCEL INFORMATION | | e
PROPERTY IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Q&Sﬁf‘tﬁﬂ{ Q_;J\' ("\p«rémge_)&
\
LEGAL DESCRIPTION: M\ Tonc sy, Residlentiad
STREET ADDRESS OR LOCATION: LKD (PBR Q,c..% C/U_cpvta REP. DISTRICT:
"ACREAGE: ZONING: LAND USE: YEAR BUILT:
‘3. 'SPECIAL EXCEPTION OR VARIANCE REQUEST
TveE:_ E\e o Xeccal
EXPLANATION g EQUEi ‘Fo C e U\Z\QQC \D«ré?cjt oo X EP
B/ESIDENTIAL ($540.00 APPLICATION FEE) [ ] COMMERCIAL ($540.00 APPLICATION FEE)
| 4. NOTETO APPLICANT — see additional notes on Page 2. ' i ]
The applicant or representative must be present at the scheduled hearlng to answer any questions or
present required information to the Board. It is the Board’s policy to postpone the case when the
applicant or representative fails to appear at the scheduled hearing; however, the Board is not required to
postpone the application and may postpone, approve or disapprove the application with or without the
applicant or representative's presence. If the applicant or representative is unable to attend the hearing,
a postponement may be requested prior to the meeting. Per Section 2.16.060 F of the El Paso City Code,
the Board will not consider an appeal or application that is the same or very similar to one that has been
‘ denied, for a period of one year.
['5. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION =

I attest that this application is complete and accurate to the best of my knowledge and that the statements
and exhibits submitted with thls appllcation are true and correct. | understand that any inaccurate or

incomplete informatiof..» pay delay the processmg and schedulingof this

request.
SIGNATURE OF-P ER-
THE STATE OF TEXAS oottt | e TS

)
COUNTY OF EL PASO )

This instrument is acknowledged before me on this l §+\(‘\d/aﬁj A\)b\)ﬁﬁ'/ / s 20 l% .
L0 XY Tpriteq

_/ “Slgnature of State'df Texas Notary Public

*OFFICE USE ONLY** ,
CASE NUMBER: P{ pa 2. ~CIODA APPEAL FILE DATE: / / RECEIVED DATE: © |\§l \3
CBA REVIEW DATE: / / (5:30 PM, CITY HALL — COUNCIL CHAMBERS 300 N. CAMPBELL)
ACCEPTED BY  X"(0 6€r¥ra. APPLICATION FEE: $540.00

Rev 3/22/2013




AR W 00 700 0T Sy I 93

City of El Paso
222 South Campbell St.
El Paso, Texas 79901

Dear Mr. Vega,

Comanche contractors hereby request at your earliest convenience a variance meeting
“for the El Paso electrical code adderidum 18.16.160 section 334.10 that modifies the 2008
NEC code. The “Addendum” requires the use of the metallic shielded wire in the construction
of a project four story or higher on wood framed multi-family residential project. We offer no
excuse to our ignorance of the addendum except for fact that the code compliance sheet only
states “2008 National Electrical Code” and there was no mention of “with addendums”

We offer for your consideration in our request for a variance to the addendum the City of
Houston, Dallas, Fort Worth, San Antonio, Austin, and Amarillo building electrical codes which
allow the use of romex wire in the construction of multi-family residential projects above three
story wood framed construction of multi-family residential projects per the 2008 national electric
codes with no exceptions for four story construction.

Please let us know when variance can be arrange. Thank you. For your consideration,

- Very truly yours

>

Alan T. Cooke
Sr. Project Manager
Comanche Contractors, L.P.

COMANCHE CONTRACTORS, L.P.
www.comanchecontractors.com
10450 Westoffice Dr.
Hauston, TX 77042
Ph. (713)862.4545 - Fax (713)862-8407



City of El Paso
222 South Campbell St.
El Paso, Texas 79901

Dear Mr. Vega,

We are sending to you this letter in reference to your denial of allowing us to install Romex
wire in a four (4) story, multi-family residential building, per NEC 2008 guide lines.

We would like to request a hearing before the construction board to get their interpretation
on wiring the first three floors with Romex and the 4™ with MC Cable.

Regards,

2

Michael Travis
Project Manager
Comanche Contractors, L.P.

COMANCHE CONTRACTORS, L.P.
www.comanchecontractors.com
10450 Westoffice Dr.
Houston, TX 77042
Ph. (713)862.4545 - Fax (713)862-8407



8/13/13 Retreat at Montecillo Request for Electrical Interpretation.pdf

iy vyl Tl ey g g g
ey Pariners

(¥

August 13, 2013

Ms. Rocio Genera
Constructien Board of Appeals

Dear Ms. Genera:

Per the NEC Section 334.10(2), NMC cable is specifically allowed in multifamily dwellings of
Type ¥V construction. Per the El Paso local electrical amendments, however, NMC cable is only

allowed on structures three stories in height or less.

The Retrem a1 Montecillo is a four (4) floor Type V-A multifamily building. It is fully sprinklered
(NFPA 13R system) with one (1) hour rated walls. The building is currently under consteuction, and
NMC (Romex) wiring has already been installed in Floors one (1) to three (3). We are requesting
an interpretation of the El Paso electrical amendments 1o allow NMC cable for up 1o three (3) floors,

and the installation of MC cable on the fourth floor.

Sincerely,

» - Tt
&g/\l\/\ / ‘\%\VV" \ { E..-"" S :
WD | %
b 3 W
;.':‘l"...“‘!ﬁ P‘..!'.U’.'.‘.“J

#
g SUJAYA REGMI 7

savrsannsurprnnsnsrrersnanars il

Sujay Regmi, P.E. R 3

JAy BeBT V5w S8
Semor Project Manager WO & CENSER- é&'
Texas Licensed Professional £ 102737 "lfé‘:s:;mﬁ"g%@'

\\@NA\‘_‘,«—
LS X
03l 1Bl2003

TAI0THMI0016 Retreat at Mookcillo\Cormespondenccd Out8 12,13 Genera.docidn BURY = ARTNERS

291 Weast Sixth Shaol, Suile 600
Sarsting, TX 78701

w (512) 3280011
o, (B19) 32B0325

: wvrve Lt ypusrmers.cam
Austin = Dallos » Honslan » Son Anionio « lanple, Texos FEPE B, 11043

https://mail .comanchecontractors.com/owa/WebReadyView.aspxt=att8id=R g AAAAC Jegh5SBF c1T6V] RSChQN 7ABWDZKEBeHAL2Q7VjpMbrscOBAAAAAABY...



‘ Outstanding Customer Service for a Better Community
G 5 HREe :
City Development Department
August 13, 2013

Alan T. Cooke
Sr. Project Manager
Comanche Contractors, L.P.

Ref: Case No: BCNN12-00009
Address: Retreat C Montecillo — 140 W. Castellano

Mr. Cooke
This will constitute official response to your letter sent on August 12, 2013

requesting a variance to Title 18.16.160, enacted through Ordinance 017417,
adopted on September 21, 2010 and effective as of June 1, 2011, which modifies
Section 334.10 of the 2008 National Electrical Code as follows:

Type NM, NMC and NMS cable shall be permitted to be used in the following:
1. One and two-story family dwellings.
2. Multifamily dwellings not exceeding three floors above grade.

This request is therefore denied, this office cannot grant variances on adopted
ordinance enacted by City Council.

Any request for Code interpretation can be directed to the Construction Board of
Appeals through an application submitted to the City Clerk’s office along with the
application fee of $540.00. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Chief Plans Examiner
EstalalQuelpasotexas.pon

(915) 541-4795

City Development Department
222 S. Campbell | P.O. Box 1890 | El Paso, Texas 79950-1890] (915) 541-4622
EL PASO.IT'S1.2 GOOD.




Alan T. “Bink” Cooke Michae! Trévi
acooke@comancheconiractors. com mira vis@cnmanchecont:actors com

i
LAND COMMUNITIES

Dawvin Boaas
DIRECTOR OF DEVELOPMENT

T: (915) 838-8100 | C: (915) 667-1800 | F: (915) 838-8200

dbogas@eptcommunities.com

444 Exvcunive Center Brvp., St 238 = E1 Paso. TX 79902



P




[T TSTENGTES .

FUTURE PARCEL -
NOT PART OF . “
THIS PROJECT N S

- i ~
~. w
L — . =¥
[ — ; ~ =
1 I mm <
! ] m o
3 <<
Crszsint e
— ,: . g s
H & smr
I
LB A s
— 10
- J_ [ [ICSET %
| T
— <
— b1 2
- — - ‘ .qvmo_wa
e o CKS o = —— - N EXP. 0573728
7 \w - S R I _ _ 4- o
! e D - N
_ - . 3
. i
Z bk
= 44
: € 2
‘ o Y]
< s 9
- =
i > B 7
r————e L) - w T & m
} Rt S A, ! x e g
- T = it
A < I
....... i 2 3

SHEET CONTENTS:
ABCHITECTUR
STEPLAN
e———
ougTm.

N
== /7 ARCHITECTURAL SITE PLAN N\ AL
J Ll = N wusvws @y

_ 0928¢




Page 5 of 8

Municode

NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, Section 250.8 Connection of Grounding and Bonding
Equipment, (B) Methods Not Permitted, Is hereby amended to read as follows:

250.8 Connection of Grounding and Bonding Equipment, (B) Methods Not Permltted. (1)
Connection devices or fittings that depend solely on solder shall not be used. {2) Sheet metal screws
shall not-be used to connec! grounding conductors or-connection devices to enclosures. -

(Ord. No. 17417, § B, 8-21-2010, eff, 6-1-2011)

18.16,160 - Section 310.2 Conductors (B) Conductor Material, amended.

NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, Section 310.2 Conduclors, (B) Conducior Material, is
hereby amended (o read as follows: .
310.2 Conductors, (B) Conductor Material. Conductors in this article shall be of aluminum, copper

clad aluminum or copper unless otherwise specified. Aluminum or copper-clad aluminum conductors
shall not be smaller than No. 2 AWG, except a ground conductor which is part of an approved cable

assembly shall be not smaller than No. 6 AWG.
(Ord, No. 17417, § B, 8-21-2010, eff. 6-1-2011)

48116.160~ Section:334:10 Uses: Permitted(1);( 2);::a(3);z'(4}.;zﬁfamended;'f':;,,

NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, Section 334.10 Uses Permitied, items (1), (2), (3) and
(4) are amended to read as follows:

334.10 Uses Permitted; T
the following:
“#1)20ne- and two-family dwellings.
(2) Muttifamily dwellings not exceeding three floors above grade.

' (Ord. No. 17417, § B, 9-21-2010, ef. 6-1-2011)

ype NM, Type NMC, and Type NMS cables shall be permitted to be used in

18.16.170 - Section 358.10 Uses Permitted (B) Corrosion Protection, amended.

NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, Section 358.10 Uses Permitled, (B) Corrosion

Protection, is hereby amended to read as follows:

358.10 Uses Permitted, (B) Corrosion Protection. Ferrous or nonferrous EMT, elbows, couAplings,
and fittings shall be permitted to be installed in concrete. EMT shall not be used in direct contact with

the earth or in areas subject to severe corrosive influence. '

(Ord. No. 17417, § B, 9-21-2010, eff. 6-1-2011)

18.16.180 - Article 382 Nonmetallic Extensions, deleted.
NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Ed’rtion,‘ Article 382 Nonmetallic Extensions is hereby deleted
in its entirety. .

(Ord. No. 17417, § B, 9-21-2010, eff. 6-1-2011)

18.16.190 - Article 394 Concealed Knob-and-Tube Wiring, deleted.

NFPA 70 National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, Article 394, concealed Knob-and-Tube Wiring, is
hereby deleted in its entirety.

(Ord. No. 17417, § B, 9-21-2010, eff. 6-1-2011)

18.16.200 - Article 398 Open Wiring on Insulators, deleted.
! Code, 2008 Edition, Article 398, Open Wiring on insulators is hereby

NFPA 70 National Elecirica
deleted in its entirety. ' :

(Ord. No. 17417,.§ B, 9-21-2010, eff. 6-1-2011)

http://library municode.com/ brint.-asnx?cﬁ enfID=1010&HTMR emiect=htin%232%2 047 f1;

18.16.210 - Section 404.10 Mounting of Snap Switches, {A) Surface-Type, deleted.

-

SAAMNTT






u~
e,
e

BI20/13 PWVX Guidelnio - Nonmetallic-sheathed Cable

ONLINE CERTIFIGATIONS DIRECTORY

PWVYX. GuidelInfo
Nonmetallic-sheathed Cable

View Listings Page Bottom

Nonmetallic-sheathed Cable

Guide Information for Elecrical Equipment for Use in Ordinary Locations

USE

This category covers Types NM-B and NMC-B nonmetallic-sheathed cable, rated 600 V, intended for use in accordance with Article
334 of ANSI/NFPA 70, "National Electrical Code" (NEC), and certifiad in copper sizes 14 to 2 AWG inclusive and aluminum or
copper-clad aluminum sizes 12 to 2 AWG inclusive.

This cable contains conductors rated 90°C; however, the ampacities of the cable are those of 60°C conductors as specified in
Article 334 and Table 310.16 of the NEC.

PRODUCT MARKINGS

Cable with copper-clad aluminum conductors is surface marked "AL (CU-CLAD)" or "Cu~-clad Al," and cable with aluminum
conductors is surface marked "AL."

Wire and cable employing compact-stranded copper conductors is so identified directly following the conductor size, wherever it
appears (surface, tag, carton or reel), by "compact copper.” The abbreviations "CMPCT" and "CU" may be used for compact and
copper, respectively.

Tags, reels and cartons for products employing compact-stranded copper conductors have the marking: “Terminate with
connectors identified for use with compact-stranded copper conductors.”

Cable suitable for use in cable trays is appropriately marked. Cable marked for cable tray use may aiso have a supplementary
sunlight resistant marking.

Cable that complies with the Limited Smoke Test requirements specified in UL 1685, "Wertical-Tray Fire-Propagation and Smoke-
Release Test for Electrical and Optical-Fiber Cables,” is surface marked "ST1."

PRODUCTIDENTITY

One of the following product identities may appear on the product:

Nonmetallic-sheathed Aluminum Cable (for nonmetallic-sheathed cable that contains aluminum conductors)

nNonmetallic-sheathed Cable (for nonmetallic-sheathed cable that contains copper or copper-clad aluminum conductors)

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
For additional information, see Electrical Equipment for Use in Ordinary Locations (AALZ).
REQUIREMENTS
The basic standard used to investigate products in this category is ANSI/UL 719, "Nonmetallic-Sheathed Cables."
UL MARK

The UL symbol on the product and the Certification Mark of UL on the attached tag, coil, reel, or on the smallest unit container in
which the product is packaged is the only method provided by UL to identify products manufactured under its Certification and

Follow-Up Service. The Certification Mark for thase products includes the Ul symbol, the words "CERTIFIED" and "SAFETY," the
geographic identifier(s), and a flle number,

Alternate UL Mark

Tha UL symbol on the product and the Listing Mark of UL on the attached tag, coll, reel or smallest unit container in which the
product is packaged is the only method provided by UL to identify these products manufactured under its Listing and Follow-Up
Sarvice, Th ting Mark for these products Includes the UL symbol (as iHlustrated in the Introduction of this Diractory) together
with the word STED," a control number, and the product name as appropriate: Nonmetallicosheathed cable that contains copper
or copper-clad aluminum conductors has the produdct name "Nanmetallic-sheathed Cable"; nonmetallic-sheathed cable that
contains aluminum conductors has the product name "Nonmetallic-sheathed Aluminum Cable.”

deode ook oA SR R R st ook W ok ok ol A RO R R R Rk R K

UL, in performing its functions in accordance with its objectives, does not assume or undertake to discharge any responsibility of
the manufacturer or any other party, UL shall not incur any obligation or kability for any loss, expense or damages, including

database.ul.comicgi-binfXYVitemplate/LISEXT/IFRAME/showpag & himi?name=PWVX. Guidelnfo&censhortiitle=Nanmetallic-sheathed+ CableSobjid=10741138... 172



820113

b

e
|

T

PWVX.Guidelnfo - Nonmetallic-sheathed Cable
incidental or consequential damages, arising out of or in connection with the use, interpretation of, or reliance upon this Guide
Information.

Last Updated on 2013-05-16

Questions? Print this page Terms of Use Page Top

© 2013 UL LLC

When the UL Leaf Mark is on the product, or when the word "Environment” is included in the UL Mark, please search the UL
Environment database for additional information regarding this product's certification.

The appearance of a company's name or product in this database does notin itself assure that products so identified have been
manufactured under UL's Follow-Up Service. Only those products bearing the UL Mark should be considered to be Certified and

covered under UL's Follow-Up Service. Always look for the Mark on the product.

UL permits the reproduction of the material contained in the Online Certification Directory subject to the following conditions: 1.
The Guide Information, Assemblies, Constructions, Designs, Systems, and/or Certifications (files) must be presented In their
entirety and in a non-misleading manner, without any manipulation of the data (or drawings). 2. The statement "Reprinted from
the Online Certifications Directory with permission fram UL" must appear adjacent to the extracted material, In addition, the
reprinted material must incude a copyright notice in the following format: "© 2013 UL LLC".

database.ul.com/ogi-binsXYVitempl ateLISEXT/1F RAME/showpag e.htrrl Znarme= PYWVX, GuidelnfolconshorttillesNonmetatlic-sheathed+ Gableobjid= 10741139, . 22



2120112 Romes® SIMpull® Type NM-B i

Pasgwordl - Register Now  Forgot Passw ord?

Username

Keyw ord Search

RELATED PRODUCTS

Residential

Commarcial
Mining )
Non-metallic Sheathed Cable
Industrial 600 Valt
Copper Conduclors
Transmission Color-Coded Jacket 8IM Jackat™
Construction Designed for Easier Pulling
Substation Four Conductor Available With Two Neutrals
Pulls Faster
Distribution e
Strips Easier
Reduced Burn-Thru
Renewables
Tear Resistant
OEM o _
APPLICATIONS
SCR Technologies Southwire's Romex? SIMpult® Type MM-B (non-melallic sheathed cable) may be used for both
exposed and concealed work in normally dry locations atlemperatures notlo exceed 80°C (with
Canada ampacity limited to that for 50°C conductors) as specified in the Nalional Elactrical Codel NM-B

cable is primarily used in residential wiring as branch circuits for outlets, switches, and other
Amorica Lat loads. NM-B cable may be run in air voids of masonry block or tile walls where such walls are not
a . N . . .
mérica Latina subjectlo excessive moisture or dampness. Voltage rating for NM-B cable is 600 volts.

Product pecifications

MADE
I x THE

USA

LISTED

weasouthwire.conyproducts/RomexSIMpull TypeNMBOEM tm






820113 PJAZ. Guidelnfo - Metal-clad Cable

ONLINE CERTIFICATIONS DIREGCTORY

PIAZ. . Guidelnfo
Metal-clad Cable

View Listings Page Bottom

Metal-clad Cable

Guide Information for Electrical Equipment for Use In Ordinary Locations

GENERAL

This category covers Type MC metal-clad cable. The cable is rated for use up to 2000V, and certified in sjzes 18 AWG through
2000 kemil for copper, 12 AWG through 2000 kemil for aluminum or copper-clad aluminum, and employs thermoset or
thermoplastic insulated conductors. It is intended for installation in accordance with Article 330 of ANSI/NFPA 70, "National Electrical
Code" (NEC).

The cable consists of one or more insulated circuit conductors, a grounding path (grounding conductor, metal sheath, or
combination thereof) as described below, one or more optional optical fiber members, and an overall metal sheath. The metal
sheath is an interlocked metal tape, a corrugated metal tube, or a smooth metal tube. The metal sheath of single-conductor
cable is nonferrous. A nonmetallic jacket may be provided under and/or over the metal sheath. Cable with metal armor, rated
2400 to 35,000 V is covered under Medium-voltage Power Cable (PITY) and is marked "Type MV or MC."

Cable with interlocked armor that has been determined to be suitable for use as a grounding means has interlocked aluminum or
steel armor in direct contact with a single, full-sized, bare aluminum grounding/bonding conductar. This cable is marked to
indicate that the armor/grounding conductor combination is suitable for ground. The equipment grounding conductor required
within @l other cable with interlocked armor may be insulated or bare, may be sectioned, and is located In the cable core but not
in contact with the armor, Any additional grounding conducters of either design have green insulation. One insulated grounding
conductor may be unmarked, one other may have only a yellow stripe and the balance have surface markings that indicate they
are additional equipment grounding conductors orisolated grounding conductors.

The sheath of the smooth or corrugated tube Type MC cable or a combination of the sheath and a supplemental bare or unstriped
green insulated conductor is suitable for use as the ground path required for equipment grounding. The supplemental grounding
conductor may be sectioned. When sectioned, all sections are identical. Each additional green insulated grounding conductor has
either a yellow stripe or a surface marking or both to indicate that it is an additional equipment or isolated grounding conductor.
Additional grounding conductors, however marked, are not smaller than the required grounding conductor,

PRODUCT MARKINGS

Information regarding temperature rating, voltage rating, cable and conductor Type and AWG size is shown either on a marker
tape under the armor or on the surface of a nonmetallic jacket, if used.

Copper-clad aluminum conductors are surface printed "AL (CU-CLAD)" or "Cu-clad ALY Aluminum conductors are surface printed
ALY

Cable employing compact-stranded copper conductors is so identified directly following the conductor size, wherever it appears
(surface, tag, carton or reel), by "compact copper.” The abbreviations "CMPCT" and "CU" may be used for compact and copper,
respectively.

Tags, reels and cartons for products employing compact-stranded copper conductors have the marking: "Terminate with
connectors identified for use with compact-stranded copper conductors.”

For termination information, see Electrical Equipment for Use in Ordinary Locations (AALZ).

Cable sultable for use In cable trays, direct sunlight or direct burlal application is so marked. Cable marked for direct burial Is also
considered acceptable far encasement in concrete.

Cable marked "Oil Resistant I" (or "Oil Res 1") is suitable for exposure to mineral oil at 60°C. Cable suitable for exposure to
mineral oil at 75°C is marked "Oil Resistant 11" (or "Oil Res II").

Cable containing one or more optical fiber members is marked "MC-OF."

Cable with a nonmetallic outer jacket that complies with the Limited Smoke Test requirements specified in Ut 1685, "Vertical-Tray
Fira~-Propagation and Smoke-Release Test for Electrical and Optical-Fiber Cables,” and all unjacketed metal-clad cable may be
marked with the suffix "-L8."

Cable with an interlocked armor thatis intended as a ground path is marked "armor is grounding path component,” and is
provided with instatlation instructions.

Cable intended for use in hazardous (cassifled) locations, Class I, Division 1, Groups A, B, C and D; Class II, Division 1, Groups
E, Fand G Class [, Zone 1, Groups IIA, 11B and 1IC in accordance with the NEC, is marked "MC-HL." See Cable for Use in
Hazardous Locations (PIPP) for Certification Mark requirements for cable marked "MC-HL.”

PRODUCTIDENTITY

database.ul.comveg i=bin/XYVitemplate/LISEXT/F RAME/showpag e htrl Pname=PJAZ Guidelnfodconshortiitie= Metal-clad+ Cabledabjid=1074113452&a(gld=10.,. /2



PO [
b T =

820113 PJAZ Guidelnfo - Metal-clad Cable ®

One of the following product identities may appear on the product:
Metal-clad Aluminum Cable (for metal-clad cable that contains aluminum conductors)
Metal-clad Cable {for metal-clad cable that contains copper or copper-clad aluminum conductors)
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
For additional information, see Electrical Equipment for Use in Ordinary Locations {AALZ),
REQUIREMENTS

The basic standard used to investigate products in this category is ANSI/UL 1569, "Metal-Clad Cables."

Cable marked "MC-HL" has been additionally investigated to ANSI/UL 2225, "Cables and Cable Fittings for Use in Hazardous
(Classified) Locations."

UL MARK

The Certification Mark of UL on the attached tag, reel, or on the smallest unit container in which the product is packaged, with or
without the UL symbol on the product, is the only method provided by UL to identify products manufactured under its Certification
and Follow-Up Service, The Certification Mark for these products includes the UL symbol, the words "CERTIFIED" and "SAFETY,” the
geographic identifier(s), and a file number.

Alternate UL Mark

The Listing Mark of UL on the attached tag, the reel, or the smallest unit container in which the product is packaged, with or
without the UL symbol on the product, is the only method provided by UL to identify products manufactured under its Listing and
Follow-Up Service. The Listing Mark for these products includes the UL symbol (as illustrated in the Introduction of this Directory)
together with the word "LISTED,” a control number, and the product name as appropriate: Metal-clad cable that contains copper or
copper-clad aluminum conductors has the product name "Metal-clad Cable®; metal-clad cable that contains aluminum conductors
has the product name "Metal-clad Aluminum Cable.”

ook o ok ook R K BBk Kk R ok R ok M OE R OR M R E K

UL, in performing its functions In accordance with its objectives, does not assume or undertake to discharge any responsibility of
the manufacturer or any other party. UL shall not incur any obligation or liability for any loss, expense or damages, incduding
incidental or consequential damages, arising out of or in connection with the use, interpretation of, or reliance upon this Guide
Information.

Last Updated on 2013-05-16

Questions? Print this page Terms of Use Paae Top

© 2013 UL LLC

When the UL Leaf Mark is on the product, or when the word "Environment" is included in the UL Mark, please search the UL
Environment database for additional information regarding this product’'s certification.

The appearance of a company's name or product in this database does not in itself assure that products so identified have been
manufactured under UL's Follow-Up Service. Only those products bearing the UL Mark should be considersd to be Certified and
coverad under UL's Follow-Up Service. Always look for the Mark on the product.

UL permits the reproduction of the material contained In the Online Certification Directory subject to the following conditions: 1.
The Guide Information, Assemblies, Constructions, Designs, Systems, and/or Certifications (files) must be presented in their
entirety and in a non-misleading manner, without any manipulation of the data (or drawings). 2. The statement "Reprinted from
the Online Certifications Directory with permission from UL" must appear adjacent to the extracted material. In addition, the
reprinted material must include a copyright notice in the following format: "® 2013 UL LLC",

-

database.ul.com/cgi-binXYWiemplate/LISEXT/FRAME/showpag e.html ?name=PJAZ Guidelnfo&censhorttite=Metal-clad+ Cable&objid= 10741 13452&cfgid=10... 2/2



e
D

8120012 ARMORLITE ® Type MC

Usernarmi T Passw ord E - Ragister Now  Forgot Password?

Keyw ord Search

Southwire Froduct Catalog £ Ty

RELATED PRODUCTS
ARMORLITE ® Type MC

Residential

Commergial

Mining . . .
Lightweight Aluminurm interlocked Armor
Industrial 600 Volt
Copper PowerConductors
Transmission THHN/THWHN Insulated Singles

Green Insulated Grounding Conductor 1 \,-,).u 1o
Substation Sizes 14 AWG through 2 AWG

Rated VW-1

Distribution
APPLICATIONS

Renewables

Branch, fesder and senice power distribution in commercial, indusidal, institutional, and mul-
OEM residential bulldings
Power, lighting, contral, and signal circuits
SCR Tachnologiss Fishad or embedded in plasier
Concealed or exposed installations.
Ganada Emdropmental air-handling spaces per NEC 300.22(C)

Piaces of Assembly per NEC 518.4 and theaters per NEC 520.5
América Latina .

As aerial cable on @ messenger

Installation in cable tray and approved raceways

Under raised floors for information tachnology squipment conductors and cables per NEC
6545.5(D) & 845.5(D)H2)

Class I Div. 2, Clags 1l Div. 2, & Class Il Div. 1 Hazardous Locations

THT Al et

Product Specifications

Ly

wwww.southwire.comproducts/ ARMORUTE TypeMCOEM him 12






Show Receipt Detail Page 1 of 1

RECEIPT

ELPASO

ELPASO

2 CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
City of El Paso

Application: BCNN12-00009
Application Type: Building/Commercial/New/NA
Address: 140 W CASTELLANO, EL PASO, TX 79912

Receipt No. 1071471
Payment Method Ref Number Amount Paid Payment Date Cashier ID Received Comments
Credit Card $550.69 08/13/2013 CONEJODE 1In Person

Owner Info.:

140 CASTELLANO DR
EL PASO, TX 79912

Work Description: New Apertment Building

https://avprodvm01.ad.elpasotexas.gov/portlets/fee/receiptView.do?mode=view&receiptnb... 8/13/2013



