CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Fire _
AGENDA DATE: TBD - January 6, 2009

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Maintenance Chief Michael V Calderazzo _
T Freib » Purchasing Manager, 541-4313
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All o on¢e Freiburg & ger .

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / Iease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City

Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $

amount if applicable. .

Award Solicitation 2009-013 Work Uniform to the Following companies. Group I- Ttems 1, 2. 3: Gro -Items
1,2, 3.4.5.6,7.8,9a, 9b; Group II Iteras 1.2, 3, 5; Group IV Items 1. Awarded to Bazaar Uniforms, 2430 E.
Yandell, El Paso, Texas 79903. Value of award: $273,405.00 for 1 vear, § 820 213,

Lancell, ti1'aso, lexas 79903. Value of award: $273,405.00 for 1 year, $ 820,215.00 for 3 years.
Group IIT Item 4: Group IV items 3 and 4 to Uniforms of Texas, 6601 Montana Ste D, El Paso. Texas 79925.
Value of award; $4.230.00 for 1 year, $12,690.00 for 3 years.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Discassion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid L
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of )
this action? What are the citizen concerns?

This Bid is for the purchase of ar work uniforms for Fire Fighting personnel as required by contractual

agreement between and the International Association of Fire Fighters T.ocal 51. _
PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: :

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?
Yes

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source

by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

The total value of this contract is for § 832.905.00 for three years.. Funding will be from the El Paso Fire

Department budget; Fund 01101, Dept ID 22010100, Account 503120,

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

Enter appropriate comments or N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************
LEGAL: (if required) —_ ANCE: (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD:

(Example:  ifRCA Wzsﬁg client department should sign also)
InfoPmation copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: DECEMBER 19, 2008

PROJECT: DUTY UNIFORMS

SOLICITATION NO: 2009-013

DEPARTMENT: FIRE DEPARTMENT

BUDGET NO: 22010100-503120-01101 — UNIFORMS & APPAREL SUPPLIES

FUNDING SOURCE: = GENERAL OPERATING FUNDS
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor (1): BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN’'S STORE, LLC

El Paso, TX :

Item(s): Groupl-1,2,3
Groupll-1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9a, 9b
Group lll-1,2,3,5
Group IV -1

Yearly Amount: $273,405.00 Estimated

Vendor (2): UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
El Paso, TX

Item(s): Group Il - 4
Group IV-3,4

Yearly Amount: $4,230.00 Estimated

This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of thirty-six (36) months.

The cost under this requirement contract is only an estimated value. The actual cost of this contract may be
higher or lower than the total estimated value and will be the sum total at the end of the contract term so
long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

The Fire Department and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest
responsive, responsible Bidders.

Group |, Item #4 “No Award”

Group Il, ltems #9A & #9B awarded as one. Iltem #9C “No Award”
Group lll, Item #6 “No Award”

Group IV, Item #2 “No Award”

BIDS SOLICITED 41 (12 local)
BIDS RECEIVED 08

“NO BID” RECEIVED 01

ANNUAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $277,635.00

TOTAL RECOMMENDED ESTIMATED AWARD: $832,905.00
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REJECTED D MUNICIPAL CLERK

Terrence Freiburg, Pur g Manager
M2

COUNCIL MEETING DATE: JANUARY 6, 2009




JonN Cook
MAYOR

JOYCE WILSON
CITY MANAGER

ROBERTO RIVERA
FIRE CHIEF

To:
From:
Subject:

Date:

City Council

City COUNCIL
ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
EMMA ACOSTA, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
RACHEL QUINTANA, DISTRICT 5
EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6
STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8

FIRE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

December 9, 2008

A

Fire Chief Roberto River.

Duty Uniform Bid 2009-013
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Please award the following items on Work Uniform Bid 2009-013. Items awarded to lowest
responsive, responsible bidder unless otherwise specified.

Group | 56 Hr. Employee

Bazaar
Item 1. Work pants $11.37|Uniforms  [Lowest bid
VF IMAGEWEAR
Model PT2CNV
Item 2. Female work Bazaar
pant $13.09Uniforms  |Lowest bid
DICKIES
Model FP116DN
Item 3. Polos $10.69Bazaar 3rd Lowest bid. 1% lowest bid Corporate Connection polo
Uniforms  (did not meet spec, no chest pocket. 2™ lowest bidder
Standard Issue polo did not meet color specification.
Sample is a faded navy blue.
Model| ANVIL 4603
Item 4. Female Polo’s Delete None of the submitted items matched specification.
Group Il 40 Hr. Employee
Item 1. White I/s dress Bazaar
shirt $12.98/Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Elbeco
Model| V610MWH
Item 2. White female l/s Bazaar
dress shirt $12.98Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model Elbeco V610W |
ﬂj «7%30
00-000 Fre Department 54

ISO Class 1
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llstem 3. White s/s dress Bazaar
hirt $11.27|Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V6610W
Item 4. White female s/s Bazaar
ress shirt $11.27|Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V6610W
Item 5. Blue I/s dress Bazaar
shirt $12.98Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V613
Item 6. Blue female I/s Bazaar
dress shirt $12.98|Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V613
[Istem 7. Blue s/s dress Bazaar
hirt $11.27|Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V6613
Item 8. Blue female s/s Bazaar
dress shirt $11.27|Uniforms  |Lowest bid
Model| Elbeco V6613W
Item 9a. Men’s Dress Lowest bid for coat and pant ensemble as per spec to
coat Bazaar maintain color similarity. As per bid spec will award as one
$74.99Uniforms __fitem to maintain color similarity.
Model| ElbecoDC13820
Lowest bid for coat and pant ensemble as per spec to
Item 9b. Men'’s dress Bazaar maintain color similarity. As per bid spec will award as one
pant $28.29Uniforms __item to maintain color similarity.
Model| Elbeco 8941
Item 9¢c. Women'’s Delete Department does not anticipate using this item enough to
dress pant add to contract.
Group lll Misc. Uniform Components
Bazaar
Item 1. Belt $6.34/Uniforms  [Lowest bid
Model| ART 2273
Item 2. Exercise $7.19Bazaar Bazaar was the lowest, responsive bidder. The 2XL size
shorts Uniforms  [offered by Bazaar will not be used by the Fire Department.
Model| Arrow 25036-2P
Item 3. Exercise t- Bazaar
shirts $4.15Uniforms  |Lowest bid.
Model| Jerzees 29MP
Uniforms of
item4. Tie $2.95[Texas Lowest bid
Modell Sam Broom
2nd lowest. 1st Lowest bid does not comply with spec
Bazaar Corporate Connection bided on a 100% Cotton ball cap.
Item 5.  Blue ball cap $4.59Uniforms

ZL%

Fire Deparfment
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Model| OTTO 25-022
Department does not anticipate using this item enough to
Item 6.  White ball cap Delete add to contract
Group IV Footwear
Item1.  Work boot $55.99Bazaar 3rd lowest. 1st lowest Northern Imports did not meet
Uniforms  |spec, no side zipper. 2nd Lowest Rocky Brands did not
meet spec no side zipper.
THOROGOOD
Model 804-6190
Item 2. Women's work Department does not anticipate using this item enough to
boot Delete add to contract
Uniforms of
Item 3. Oxford $32.50[Texas Lowest bid
DICKIES CD3390
Model|  (alternate)
Uniforms of
Item 4. Female oxford $32.50[Texas Lowest bid
DICKIES CD3390
Model (alternate)

The breakdown for each item and cost are as follows.

Bazaar Uniforms
Men’s trouser $62,535.00
Female trouser $1,309.00
Male polo $58,795.00
White I/s $1,298.00
Female white I/s $155.76
White s/s $2,817.50
Female white s/s $135.24
Blue I/s $5,192.00
Female blue I/s $311.52
Blue s/s $3,381.00
Female blue s/s $270.48
Dress jacket $3,749.50
Men’s dress trouser $11,316.00
Belt $5,706.00
Exercise short $39,545.00
Exercise t-shirts $22,825.00
Blue ball cap $3,672.00
Work boots $50,391.00

Uniforms of Texas

Tie $590.00

Oxford $3,250.00

Female oxford $390.00

1 Year $4,230.00

3 yr contract total $12,690.00

$273,405.001 year

$820,215.003 yr contract total

ZLf%

Fire Department

ISO Class 1

g
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013|
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR
) EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES
GROUP I: 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS (FIELD EMPLOYEES) EL PASO, TX , EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT.PRICE | - TOTAL PRICE
$11.37 $62,535.00 .
1. 5500 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, NAVY BLUE NONE STATED (ADD 20% FOR SIZES 44 AND ABOVE) $13.42 $73,810.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND (ALTERNATE: DICKIES 2112272NV - $11.49) ($14.45 SIZES 44-60)
MANUFACTURER VF IMAGEWEAR PT2CNV DICKIES
CATALOG NO. RED KAP 211272
l
2, 100 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, NAVY BLUE NONE STATED $13.09 $1,309.00 $13.32 $1,332.00 NOBID .
) EA POLY/COTTON BLEND ($14.35 SIZES 20-24) :
MANUFACTURER DICKIES FP116DN DICKIES
CATALOG NO. DICKIES 2008 FP111
$10.69 | $58,795.00 '$9.89 $54,395.00
(ALTERNATE #1: RED KAP SK28NV - $13.79) (MENS $11.86 2XL / $12.86 3XL)
3. 5500 SHIRTS, POLO, MALE, NAVY BLUE NONE STATED (PLEASE ADD AN ADDITIONAL 20% (ALTERNATIVE 8900 GILDAN NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE) UNISEX $9.75 = $53,625.00)
MANUFACTURER . ANVIL 4603 PORT AUTHORITY
CATALOG NO. BRODER K500
1 $9.89 |  $989.00
4. 100 SHIRTS, POLO, FEMALE, NAVY BLUE NONE STATED $14.99 " $1,499.00 (ALTERNATIVE GILDAN
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND (ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE) 8900 UNISEX $9.75 = $975.00) NO BID
MANUFACTURER ' SUPERIOR UNIFORMS 61156 || - PORT AUTHORITY LADIES STYLE
CATALOG NO. SUPERIOR UNIFORMS L500
TOTAL GROUP I: NONE STATED $124,138.00 $130,526.00 NO BID
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I: $129, 742.00)
GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES)
1. 100 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NONE STATED $12.98 $1,298.00 $14.49 $1,449.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V610MWH SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP56WH UNISEX
- l
2. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NONE STATED $12.98 $155.76 $14.49 $173.88 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V610W SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP56WH UNISEX

APPROVED BY:_ ...

DATE:__/{

2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TAB’ULATION

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.
' ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR
GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED EL PASO, TX : EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
3. 250 * SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NONE STATED $11.27 $2,817.50 $12.87 $3,217.50 NO BID
EA : POLY/COTTON | '
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V6610W SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP66WH UNISEX
4. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NONE STATED $11.27 $135.24 $12.87 $154.44 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND |
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V6610W SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP66WH
5. 400 SHIRT, MEN'S BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NONE STATED $12.98 $5,192.00 $14.49 $5,796.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON |
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V613 SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP56MB
6. | 24 _ SHIRT, FEMALE, BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NONE STATED $12.98 $311.52 $14.49 $347.76 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON |
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V613 SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO SP56MB
7. 300 SHIRT, MEN'S LIGHT BLUE, NONE STATED $11.27 $3,381.00 $14.20 $4,260.00 NO BID
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON | ‘
MANUFACTURER ELBECO V6613 SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO HS1483 LIGHT BLUE
8. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, LIGHT BLUE, NONE STATED $11.27 $270.48 $14.20 $340.80 NO BID
‘ EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON |
MANUFACTURER ‘ ELBECO V6613W SENTINEL
CATALOG NO. ELBECO HS1483 LIGHT BLUE
9a. 50 DRESS, JACKET, MEN'S DARK NAVY NONE STATED $74.99 $3,749.50 NO BID
EA BLUE, 100% POLYESTER | .
MANUFACTURER - ELBECO DC13820 NO BID
CATALOG NO. ELBECO
9b. 400 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, DARK NAVY NONE|STATED $28.29 $11,316.00 NO BID
BLUE, 100% POLYESTER |
MANUFACTURER ' ELBECO 8941 NO BID
CATALOG NO. ELBECO

APPROVED BY:O&Q’é

DATE: [Oé 'd 20

2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP II: $15,736.38)

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2009-013
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
NORTHERN IMPORTS INC. |
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR
GROUP IIi: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
9c. 50 'TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, DARK NONE STATED $28.29 $1,414.50 NO BID
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% POLYESTER | :
MANUFACTURER ELBECO 8945 NO BID
CATALOG NO. ELBECO
TOTAL GROUP II: NONE STATED $30,041.50 $15,739.38 NOBID - -

1 900 BELT, SMOOTH, BLACK 1 1/2, LEATHER $7.38 $6,642.00 $6.34 $5,706.00 $6.75 $6,075.00 NO BID
EA E
MANUFACTURER SAMUEL BROOME ART 2273 6803-40
CATALOG NO. 6620 ART 2273 ARTCRAFT
2. 5500 EXERCISE, SHORTS, NAVY BLUE $7.98 $43,890.00 $7.19 $39,545.00 $7.40 $40,700.00 NO BID
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (S-XL) (PLEASE ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE) '
MANUFACTURER ANVIL 122 ARROW 25036-2P ANVIL
CATALOG NO. PAU 208 ARROW 122AN
3. 5500 EXERCISE, T-SHIRT, NAVY BLUE $4.74 $26,070.00 $4.15 $22,825.00 $5.19 $28,545.00 NO BID
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (S-XL) {PLEASE ADD 20% FOR SIZES 2X AND ABOVE)
MANUFACTURER GILDAN JERZEES 29MP JERZEES
CATALOG NO. G230 BRODER 29P
4, 200 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, $3.57 $714.00 $4.99 $998.00 NO BID
EA 100% SILK
MANUFACTURER SAM BROOME SAMUEL BROOME NO BID
CATALOG NO. 45050 SAMUEL BROOME
5. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP WITH $6.87 $5,496.00 $4.59 $3,672.00 $3.97 $3,176.00 NO BID
EA FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO
MANUFACTURER 6 PANEL OVERSEAS OTTO 25-022 RCC
CATALOG NO. IMPORTED OTTO 45058

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & CORPORATE CONNECTION DBA WORK WEAR
: EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX SAFETY SHOES
GROUP [il: MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS - CONTINUED EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
6. 60 SOLID WHITE, CAP, WITH FIRE $6.92 $415.20 $4.59 $275.40 $3.97 $238.20 NO BID
EA DEPARTMENT LOGO
MANUFACTURER - 6 PANELS OVERSEAS OTTO 25-022 RCC
CATALOG NO. IMPORTED OTTO 45058
TOTAL GROUP il: $83,227.20 $73,021.40 $78,734.20 NO BID
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP IlI; $95,953.20)
GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR
1. 900 MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, NONE STATED $55.99 $50,391.00 NO BID $40.75 $36,675.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE |
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD 804-6190 WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER S677
|
2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, NONE STATED $55.99 $3,359.40 NO BID $40.75 $2,445.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE |
MANUFACTURER ' THOROGOOD 804-6190 WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER S677
3. 100 SHOES, MALE OXFORD, BLACK, NONE STATED $34.19 $3,419.00 NO BID $32.75 $3,275.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER ‘
MANUFACTURER WEINBRENNER 834-6041 WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER N422
4. 12 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD, BLACK, NONE STATED $34.19 $410.28 NO BID $32.75 $393.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER
MANUFACTURER WEINBRENNER 834-6041 WORK ZONE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER N422
TOTAL GROUP IV: NONE STATED $57,579.68 $42,788.00
APPROVED BY:
DATE: 2009-013 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 4




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.
EL PASO, TX

BAZAAR UNIFORMS &
MEN'S STORE
EL PASO, TX

CORPORATE CONNECTION
EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.
DBA WORK WEAR
SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
'THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

[x]*

[X ]

(* OPTION OFFERED, EXCEPT FOR

RED WINTER JACKETS, GROUP Il ITEM 5)

[ ]

(]

(]

NO OPTION OFFERED Ej D :]

. [IPAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY ¥ g YES NO
PROCUREMENT CARD: YEJX] NO[ | YESX] No[ ] YES_ | NO[X] | [ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: T,

i . 30 30 15 30
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within hours after receipt of verbal order in 48 48 48 48

cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BYJ,S‘D

DATE:

2009-013 DUTY UNIFORVMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I:_56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS (FIELD EMPLOYEES) NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1. 5500 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, NAVY BLUE NO BID $20.00 $110,000.00 $30.85 $169,675.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND :
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECH -
CATALOG NO. S11001 #49400
2. 100 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, NAVY BLUE NO BID $20.00 $2,000.00 $30.85 $3,085.00
. EA POLY/COTTON BLEND
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECH #49450
CATALOG NO. S11002
' $14.69 $80,795.00 (SIS)
3. - 5500 SHIRTS, POLO, MALE, NAVY BLUE (LONG SLEEVE PORT AUTHORITY $10.00 $55,000.00 $11.85 $65,175.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND K 500 LSP = $18.90) (L/S $21.95)
MANUFACTURER NO BID PORT AUTHORITY STANDARD ISSUE BRODER BROTHER 4603 SHORT SLEEVE
CATALOG NO. K 500 P 1003 ASH CITY #85076 LONG SLEEVE
| ' (SIS)
4, 100 SHIRTS, POLO, FEMALE, NAVY BLUE $14.69 $1,469.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $11.85 $1,185.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND (L/S $21.95)
MANUFACTURER NO BID PORT AUTHORITY STANDARD ISSUE ASH CITY #75041 SHORT SLEEVE
CATALOG NO. L500 S1 1004 ASH CITY #75042 LONG SLEEVE
TOTAL GROUP I: NO BID $82,2§4.00 $168,000.00 $239,120.00
GROUP Il: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM :
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) . .
1. 100 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $1,800.00 $13.25 $1,325.00
_ EA POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $180.00)
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE RED KAP
CATALOG NO. ‘ SI 1005 SP56WH
2. 12 _SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $216.00 $19.95 $239.40
-EA - POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. S11006 #126R5400
3. 250 SHIRT, MEN'S WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $4,500.00 $12.25 $3,062.50
. EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SI 1007 SP66WH

APPROVED BY: @é

DATE: /OZJ f (03
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS -
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS 'DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX
(ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE [ UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
4. 12 SHIRT, FEMALE, WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $216.00 $18.00 $216.00
EA POLY/COTTON BLEND
MANUFACTURER ) NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. S11008 #176R5400
5. 400 SHIRT, MEN'S BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $7,200.00 $13.25 $5,300.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE RED KAP
CATALOG NO. S11009 SP56MB
6. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, BLUE, LONG SLEEVE NO BID $18.00 $432.00 $19.95 $478.80
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. S11010 #126R5435
7. 300 SHIRT, MEN'S LIGHT BLUE, NO BID $18.00 $5,400.00 $11.45 $3,435.00
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE RED KAP
CATALOG NO. S1 1011 SP66MB
8. 24 SHIRT, FEMALE, LIGHT BLUE, NO BID $18.00 $432.00 $18.00 $432.00
EA SHORT SLEEVE, POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE * FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. S11012 176R5435
9a. 50 DRESS, JACKET, MEN'S DARK NAVY NO BID $100.00 $5,000.00 $87.00 $4,350.00
EA BLUE, 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE WHALING
CATALOG NO. S11013 211PY
9b. 400 TROUSERS, MEN'S CUT, DARK NAVY NO BID $20.00 $8,000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00
BLUE, 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. S11014 #38200

APPROVED BY: @i )2 .
DATE: /O[ Cia [223
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ROCKY BRANDS

SCHOOL WEAR

(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP II: $32,576.00)

STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX

‘ (ADMINISTRATIVE EMPLOYEES) - CONTINUED - NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. - DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
9c. 50 TROUSERS, FEMALE CUT, DARK NO BID $20.00 $1,000.00 $25.00 $1,250.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% POLYESTER .
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. . S1 1015 #38233
“TOTAL GROUP II: NO BID NO BID $34,196.00 $30,088.70 )

1. 900 BELT, SMOOTH, BLACK 1 1/2, LEATHER $15.00 $13,500.00 $9.95 $8,955.00
EA
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE DUTYMAN
CATALOG NO. SI1016 #1511
$8.25 |  $45,375.00
2. 5500 EXERCISE, SHORTS, NAVY BLUE (ALTERNATE ANVIL #122 - $8.00 $44,000.00 $8.33 $45,815.00
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND $8.05 = $44,275.00)
|MANUFACTURER NO BID AUGUSTA STANDARD ISSUE BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 910 PAGE 24 SI1017 #122
$5.18
3. 5500 EXERCISE, T-SHIRT, NAVY BLUE (S-XL) $28,490.00 $8.00 $44,000.00 $4.50 $24,750.00
EA 50/50 POLY BLEND (XXL = $6.68)
MANUFACTURER NO BID JERZEES STANDARD ISSUE BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. STYLE 29MP SI1018 29MP
4. 200 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, NO BID $12.00 $2,400.00 $2.95 $590.00
EA 100% SILK
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE SAM BROOM
CATALOG NO. ST 1019 90099
5. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP WITH NO BID $8.00 $6,400.00 $6.00 $4,800.00
EA . FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO '
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE ALPHA
'|cATALOG NoO. S11020 BX002

APPROVED BY: b

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ROCKY BRANDS SCHOOL WEAR STANDARD ISSUE, LLC UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
RETAIL, LLC AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS DALLAS, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1Il: MISCELLANEOUS UNIFORM COMPONENTS - CONTINUED NELSONVILLE, OH EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
6. 60 SOLID WHITE, CAP, WITH FIRE NO BID $8.00 $480.00 $6.00 $360.00
EA DEPARTMENT LOGO (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $300.00)
MANUFACTURER NO BID STANDARD ISSUE ALPHA
CATALOG NO. S11022 BX002W
$110,780.00 $85,270.00
TOTAL GROUP lli: NO BID $73,865.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP llI: $117,280.00)| (BIDDER'S GROUP Il TOTAL: $96,710.00)
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP lll: $72,765.00) {|( INCLUDES ITEM 5 THAT WAS DELETED) || (INCLUDES ITEM 5 THAT WAS DELETED)
GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR ;
1. 900 MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $45.00 $40,500.00 NO BID $65.00 $58,500.00 $56.00 $50,400.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE
MANUFACTURER SLIPGRIPS STANDARD ISSUE THOROGOOD
CATALOG NO. UNISEX STYLE 5333 SI 1023 #804-6091
2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, $45.00 $2,700.00 NO BID $65.00 $3,900.00 $43.50 $2,610.00
EA BLACK, STEEL TOE (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $270.00)
MANUFACTURER SLIPGRIPS STANDARD ISSUE THOROGOOD
CATALOG NO. UNISEX STYLE 5333 S1 1024 #804-6086
3. 100 SHOES, MALE OXFORD, BLACK, $40.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $40.00 $4,000.00 $67.50 $6,750.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER (ALT# $32.50) $3,250.00
|MANUFACTURER DICKIES STANDARD ISSUE THOROGOOD #834-6905
CATALOG NO. CD4290 S1 1025 DICKIE #CD4390 ALTERNATE
4. 12 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD, BLACK, $40.00 $480.00 NO BID $40.00 $480.00 $67.50 $810.00
EA SMOOTH LEATHER (ALT# $32.50) $390.00
MANUFACTURER DICKIES STANDARD ISSUE THOROGOOD #534-6905
CATALOG NO. CD3290 SI 1026 DICKIE #CD3390 ALTERNATE
TOTAL GROUP IV: $47,680.00 NO BID $66,880.00 $60,570.00

(BIDDER'S GROUP IV TOTAL: $58,230.00)

APPROVED BY: ’\Z
DATE:® l@z / Uq
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: OCTOBER 22, 2008

BID # 2009-013|
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ROCKY BRANDS
RETAIL, LLC
NELSONVILLE, OH

SCHOOL WEAR
AKA ROCKS T-SHIRTS
EL PASO, TX -

STANDARD ISSUE, LLC
DALLAS, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

[ ]

[ ]

>

L]

L]

[ ]

[x]

[ ]

o

[ ]

[ ]

2% -10 DAYS

JPAYMENT TERMS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY g q ’
PROCUREMENT CARD: YE§X] NO[ ] YE§X| No[ ] YE§X] No[ ] YE§X] no[ ] .1
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calendar days. 7-10 DARO 10 30 30
Within __ hours after receipt of verbal order in NONE STATED 48 48 NONE STATED
cases of emergency.

|'F BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS RECEIVED: 8 NO BIDS: 1

BIDS SOLICITED: 41 -

BIDS LOCAL: 12

APPROVED BY: ﬁ
/Z)//)??%(/V

—
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| ALCO INDUSTRIAL
13525 B. HUECO ST
'EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

' UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA AVE
'EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

: FAMOUS UNIFORMS

: DBA B.J.’S UNIFORMS

. 3942 LEOPARD -

. CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78408

. PIMA UNIFORMS
13760 S. PARKWAY, STE C
- TUCSON, ARIZONA 85713

' SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVE
'EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

WORKWEAR SAFETY
11345 LEE TREVINO
|EL PASO, TEXAS 79936

'PORTSMOUTH ARMIE
'NAVIE STORES, INC.
1817 HIGH ST
PORTSMOUTH, VIRGINIA 23704

UNIFORMS MANUFACTURER
P.0.BOX 12716
SCOTSQALE ARIZONA 85267

2009- 013 DUTY UNIF ORMS_.,
(PREVIOUS BID :

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMMARRON
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32205

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVE
GARDENA, CA 90247

PROEESSJONAL POLICE SUPPLY
722 C ST 07/?
OAKLANR, CALIFQRNIA 946 <

' N

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERVICE
SUBS OF UNIFIRST CORP
P.O0. BOX 26159

EL PASO, TEXAS 79926

SUN CITY EMBROIDERY
9300 CARNEGIE, STEB
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

NETON N ORM
520/92 \X(?

LOVERAND/OHIO 45140

CABELA’S INC
ONE CABELA DR
SIDNEY, NEBRASKA 69160

- LION APPAREL
6450 POE AVENUE

DAYTON, OHIO 45413-0576

WEARGUARD .
141 LONGWATER DR

LAV by Svatvoy sy

b\

R INIRORMS & MENS ST5§RE

304 ENOVER

EL PAS XA 79901
(%76 05

EXCLUSIVE LAW 7%

ENFORCEMENT PROD.

P.O. BOX 1864

DENTON, TEXAS 76202

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3535 YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY
141 SUMIT AVE., STE 2
PLANO, TEXAS 75074

J DK UTORS
4 GU / ALUPE ST
N, "TEXAS 78751

MAGIC CITY SALES i
4363 FIRST AVE NORTH
BIRMINGHAM, ALABAMA 35222

LAY o
NAD %]PPI 353)% 30

NORWELL, MA 02061

CPAGE TR

T




tavpusy ) viuvos sy

' PRIZM INC/UNIPRO E%ERT%'?ESRX\'/‘I”EACH'NES PLUS, LLC ON ERT CO
1320 ELIZABETH AVE., SUITE 204 ‘ o 2D A
EL PASO, TEXAS 79901 o E% 1915 uﬂ/

LNEV%ARK,NEVVJERSEY 07112

‘L ;,aﬂ
’6/ \ QI?(S'
| MASTORC RP ¢ %" VERNON SALES PROMO P kf( e
303 FTH A 2625 DESERT AIRE 202 UTDR >
: K 10016 CHAPARRAL, NEW MEXICO 88081 EL A , S 79912
| INDUSTRIAL DISC FOOTWEAR US CALVARY MATTHEW OPPERMAN
15324 WERLING CT 2855 CENTENNIAL AVE 15832 SW 66 LNAE
'HORIZON CITY, TEXAS 79928 RADCLIFF, KENTUCKY 40160 MIAMI, FLORIDA 33193-3637
EMBLEM ENTERPRISE PARROTT PRODUCTIONS TRANSCON MANUFACTURING
| 409 N. CAROLINA DR
'P.O. BOX 10033 EL PASO. TEXAS 70915 5725 SOUTH MAIN ST
VAN NUYS, CALIFORNIA 91410 ; LOS ANGELES, CA 90037-4171
OUTDOOR OUTFITS
372 RICHMOND STREET WEST NAFECO
TORONTO, CANADA M5V 1X
LEHIGH SAFETY SHOES 6 1515 WEST MOULTON STREET,
10203 KOTZEBUE, STE 110 DECATUR, AL 35601 Q))V
' SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217 QD \ o
(ﬂeeo( Ater B.d openi A5

2009- 01_3 DUTY UNIFORMS i
(PREV OUS BID 2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS)
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