CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM.

DEPARTMENT: General Services

AGENDA DATE: January 8,2013

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:  Stuart Ed, General Services Director, 621-6822
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
Recommend award of Solicitation No. 2013-064, Chevrolet & Dodge Truck Van Optional Equipment for
Groups 2, 8 and 11 (Ttem #3) to Dick Poe Dodge LP and Groups 1, 3, 5 and 11, (ftem #°s 1, 3, 5, and 5A)

to Rudolph Chevrolet LLC., for an initial term of three (3) years in the estimated initial term amount of
$372,339.72. Groups 4, 6, 7, 9 and 10 did not receive any bids and will not be awarded including

Group 11, item #4.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: ) '
The General Services - Fleet Division is recommending the award of the above purchase. The City is currently
through a Fleet Replacement Program that targets vehicles that have

in the process of replacing the old fleet
met their life expectancy. Once identified, they are replaced with new, more cost effective vehicles that operate

more efficiently and are environmentally-friendly. Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: '
Yes. Council previously approved Contract 2012-293 Trucks and Vans Gasoline and Diesel on October 9,

2012,

SELECTION SUMMARY:

This solicitation was advertised on October 23, 2012 and October 30, 2012, and opened on November 14, 2012.
On November 14, 2012, postcards were mailed out, the solicitation was posted on the City’s website on and the
email (Purmail) notification was sent out, Seventeen (17) local bidders were solicited and two (2) local bidders

responded. :
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Department: General Services

Environmental Services Department
Amount $372,339.72

Dept: 231 Div: 37010 Acct: 580540 Fund: 4960

Dept: 334 Div: 34060 Acct: 580290 Fund: 4150

Dept: 322 Div: 22130 Acct: 580070 Fund: 2720 Project: 2010SST804
General Services Dept — Cars, Pickups, Vans

Environmental Services Dept — Heavy Off Road Equipment

Funds Available:

Funds Source:

. Fire - Grant
BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

********************AUTHORIZATION*********#**********

DEPARTMENT HEAD: , . O %

Stuart Ed, General Services Director




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM

(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

***POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW****** e M

& * kokdedeokdkkdk Kededkk *kfekk

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of JANUARY 8, 2013.

The award of Solicitation No. 2013-064 (Chevrolet & Dodge Trucks & Vans Optional Equipment) to Dick Poe
Dodge LP and Rudolph Chevrolet LLC for an initial term estimated amount of $372,339.72.

Department:
Award to Vendor #1:

Item(s):
Estimated Annual Amount:

Initial Term Award Amount:

Award to Vendor #2:

ltem(s):
Estimated Annual Amount:

Initial Term Award amount:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Total Estimated Award:
Account No.:

Funding Source:

District(s):

General Services — Fleet Division
Dick Poe Dodge, LP

El Paso, Texas

Groups 2, 8 and 11 (ltem #3)
$29,379.24

$88,137.72 (3 year Total)

Rudolph Chevrolet, LLP

El Paso, Texas

Group 1, 3, 5, and Il (Item #'s 1, 2, 5 and 5A)
$94,734.00

$284,202.00 (3 Year Total)

No Options

Net 30 days

$ 372,339.72(3 Year Total)
231-37010-580540-4960
334-34060-580290-4150
322-22130-580070-2720 Project 2010sst804
General Services Dept — Cars, Pickups, Vans
Environmental Services Dept — Heavy Off Road Equipment
Fire - Grant

All

This is a Best Value, unit pribe contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Services — Fleet Division recommends that the
contract be awarded to Dick Poe Dodge, LP and Rudolph Chevrolet, LLC the vendors offering the best

value bids.

s ADDITIONAL INFO BELOWY* bttt ikt

Groups 4, 6, 7, 9, 10 and Item #4 of Group 11 were not awarded because no bids were received for these
items.




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

DICK POE DODGE LP

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC

EL PASO, TX

BEST VALUE EVALUATION FACTORS

COST (# POINTS/PERCENT MAX) 65% (See each Group or item below for Cost Score) (See each Group or item below for Cost Score)
REPSUET;\;fgﬁ;ﬁgﬁ%ggg:ﬁf,'v&?sws 9.34 9.34 9.34 9.34 11.99 11.99 11.99 11.99
FAGILIY (f PONTSIPERCENT st 10.00 - 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
# POINTSIPERGENT M) 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

DODGE TRUCKS -

CREW CAB

SERVICE BODY

ITEM CHEVROLET TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | 3ERVICEBODY| peguar .‘EXTENDED CREW CAB | CREW CAB
NO. 2 TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) |, Ton ONLY CAB CAB (4DOOR) | (4DOOR)
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP | NO BID $9.964.00 | $11.812.00 | $9.007.00 $3.542.00
b. COST SCORE NOBID 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NOBID Total 91.99 | Total 91.99 | Total 91.99 | Total 91.99

ITEM REGULAR | EXTENDED REGULAR cAB | REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | CREW CAB
NO. %2 TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) | "5 1onONLY CAB CAB (4 DOOR) (4 DOOR)
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP II $9.391.52 | $9.866.81 | $8.823.00 | $7.030.52 NO BID
b. COST SCORE 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 NOBID
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 NO BID




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Departmeni: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC

EL PASO, TX

iy CHEVROLET CARGO VANS 15 TON 34 TON ONE TON 5 TON % TON ONE TON
a. ~ OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, G;:u NO iBID $3.192.00 $4.892.00 $3.992.00
b. COST SCORE NO BID 65.00 65.00 65.00
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NO BiD Total 91.99 | Totai 91.99 | Total 91.99

N DODGE CARGO VANS 15 TON ONE TON 52 TON ONE TON
a. ~ OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP IV NO BID NO BID
b. COST SCORE NOBID NO BID
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NO BID NO BID




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

EL PASC, TX

DICK POE DODGE LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

o CHEVROLET PASSENGER VANS Y52 TON 34 TON ONE TON 5 TON 34 TON ONE TON
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP V H Né BIDV ) $1.843.00 | $1.843.00 $767.00
b. COST SCORE NO BID 65.00. 65.00 65.00
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NO BID Total 91.99 | Total 91.99 | Total 91.99

DODGE PASSENGER VANS

NO. ONE TON 15 TON 34 TON ONE TON
S N - =

a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP VI NOC BID NO BID

b. COST SCORE NO BID NO BID

C. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NOBID NO BID




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CHEVROLET MIiNI VANS

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

PASSENGER

PASSENGER

NO BID

ITEM

a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP Vii NO BID
b. COST SCORE NO BID NOBID
C. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NO BID NOBID

NO. ~ DODGE MINI VANS CARGO PASSENGER CARGO PASSENGER
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP VIii $2,782.00 $1,045.00 NO BID
b. COST SCORE 65.00 65.00 NO BID
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 86.34 Total 86.34 NO BID




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

'L%"f' CHEVROLE\T;‘I’: g RT UTILITY 15 TON %4 TON Y5 TON | %4 TON
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP IX NO BID INC |
b. |- COST SCORE NO BID NO BID
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NOBID NO BID

o, | DODGE SPORT UTILITY VANS 12 TON %4 TON 2 TON ¥ TON
a. OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT, GRP X NOBID NO BID
b. COST SCORE NO BID NO BID
c. TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE NO BID NO BID




Bid Open
Project N

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

ing Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012
: CHEVROLET &

E TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064

" Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO, TX

ITEM

REGULAR

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC

EL PASO, TX

EXTENDED | CREW CAB | REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB
NO. TRUCKS - % TON AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4 DOOR) CAB CAB (4 DOOR)
9' FLAT BED WITH STEEL BED
#1. (1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) NO BID $2.850.00 $2.850.00 $2.850.00
COST SCORE 65% 65.00 65.00 65.00
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 91.99 | Total91.99 | Total 91.99
11" FLAT BED WITH STEEL BED
#2. (1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) NO BID $3.060.00 $3.060.00 $3.060.00
COST SCORE 65% 65.00 65.00 65.00
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE - Total 91.99 | Total 91.99 | Total 91.99
12" FLAT BED WITH STEEL BED
#3. (1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) $3.105.00 $3.105.00 $3.105.00 $3.410.00 $3.410.00 $3.410.00
COST SCORE 65% 65.00 65.00 65.00 59.00 59.00 59.00
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 85.99 Total 85.99 Total 85.99
T4 FLAT BED REQUIRES F450 or F550, LIST
#4. OPTIONS IN COMMENT SECTION NO BID NOBID
(1 TON CAB & CHASSIS)
COST SCORE 65%
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE
GOOSENECK OPTION - FLAT BED
#5. (%& 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) $757.00 $757.00 $757.00 $760.00 $760.00 $760.00
COST SCORE 65% 65.00 65.00 65.00 64.70 64.70 64.70
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 86.34 || Total 86.34 Total 86.34 | Total 91.69 Total 91.69 Total 91.69
#5A. | GOOSENECK REAR RECEIVER HITCH - FLAT BED $452.30 $452.30 $452.30 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00
COST SCORE 65% 65.00 65.00 65.00 63.90 63.90 63.90
TOTAL BEST VALUE SCORE Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 86.34 | Total 90.89 | Total 90.89 | Total 90.89




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

El Paso

All-Araerica Ciy

200
Solicitation #: 2013-064

Depariment: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

ITEM CHEVROLET TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | GREW CAB |SERVICEBODY) pegy ap | EXTENDED | cREWCAB | SERVICE BODY
NO. | % TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB | (4DoOR) | FSULARCABY o R CAB (4DOOR) | RESILAR CAB
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID $782.00 $850.00 $505.00 $782.00
*PKG *PKG *PKG *PKG
b. POWER SEATS NO BID NO BID
c. POWER LOCKS NO BiD *PKG *PKG *PKG *PKG
d. POWER MIRRORS NO BID *PKG *PKG *PKG *PKG
e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID INCL INCL INCL I'NCL
f. REAR SEAT NO BID NO BID INCL INCL NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other faciors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabuiation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:__// -2 _2_, T2o 2 2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL. SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




Bid Open

ing Date: NOVENMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

El Paso

Alt-America City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM CHEVROLET TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | SERVICEBODY| prgyar | EXTENDED | CREWCAR | SERVICE BODY
NO. | 1, TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) | REGILAR CAB CAB CAB (4DOOR) | RESILARCAB
g. 4AWD NO BID $3394.00 (112) | $3,660.00 $2,900.00 $2,700.00
$2,700.00 (3/4 +1) ‘
h. FRONT BUCKET SEATS NO BID NO BID
i HITCH NO BID $182.00 $182.00 $182.00 NOBID
j. TOWING PRCKAGE wiT PIN NO BID $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 NO BID
k. | 1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE NO BID $2,350.00 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 NO BID
WEST COAST MIRRORS
L. w/ CONVEX SPOT NOBID $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
(¥4 & 1 TON PICKUPS) CAMPER STYLE | CAMPER STYLE | CAMPER STYLE | CAMPER STYLE
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabul

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/-22 -207 2. 2013

ation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012
Proi

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

ct Name: CHEO & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

El Paso

Ali-America Gty

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC

EL PASO, TX

ITEM CHEVROLET TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB |SERVICEBODY! pray) aR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | SERVICE BODY
NO. | % TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) | L SULAR CAB CAB CAB (4DOOR) | REGuLAR CAB
.
m. LONG BED NO BID $364.00 (1/2) | $1,878.00 (1/2) |$178.00 (314 +1) NO BID
INCL 3/4 +1 |$178.00 (314 +1)  N/A 1/2
n, | FUHLBEDWIDTH LOCKING TOOL NO BID §270.00 | $270.00 | $270.00 | NOBID
14" 14" 14" - 14"
o. ROLL TOP BED COVER NO BID $987.00 $987.00 $987.00 NOBID
‘ INTEGRATED BED CAP,
p. REGULAR BED NO BID $1,360.00 $1,360.00 $1,360.00 NOBID
( YaTON PICKUPS)
% | (170N 8 17ON CAB & Criassis) NO BID NCPU | NICPU | NCPU | NOBID
DUAL ALTERNATORS
" | (170N & 17TON GAB & CriAsSIS) NO BID $170.00 | $170.00 | $17000 | NOBID
DIESEL ONLY | DIESEL ONLY | DIESEL ONLY
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee,

The information contained in this bid tabula

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/]2 201

tion is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Ale-fmerica City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC

EL PASO, TX

W' | iTON, % oM, AND 1ToN | "Foss™ | EXTENDED | oREW oAB Reousm o) RECUILAR | EXTENDED | cRewcns REGULA cr
a. POWER WINDOWS $398.81 $734.81 STD $798.81 NOBID
b. POWER SEATS NO B»ID NO BID
c. POWER LOCKS $169.71 $309.00 STD $196.71 NO BID
d. POWER MIRRORS NO BID NO BID 8TD NO BID NOBID
e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.60 NOBID
f. REAR SEAT NO BID STD STD NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best-Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid ta

APPROVED BY:
paTE: ([-22— 2012

bulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

-

2010
Solicitation #: 2013-064

Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM DODGE TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB |SERVICEBODY| proy ap | ExTENDED | GREW GAR | SERVICE BODY
No. | 14 TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) | SR CAB CAB CAB (4DOOR) | TSI AR CAB

g. 4WD $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 NO BID

h. FRONT BUCKET SEATS NOBID NO BID

i. HITCH $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 NO BID

i TN P CHACE wiT PIN $180.00 | $180.00 | $i80.00 | $180.00 NO BID

k. | 1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE | $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 NO BID

WEST COAST MIRRORS
. w/ CONVEX SPOT $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 NO BID
(34 & 1 TON PICKUPS)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardes.

The information contained in this bid tabulati

APPROVED BY:

paTE: /[- 2 201 2013

-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

on is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




Bid Opening Date: NOVENBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

El Paso

SR S
Ai-tmerlca City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DODGE TRUCKS - REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB |SERVICEBODY) peeiy ap | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | SERVICE BODY
NO. | 7 TON, % TON, AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4DOOR) | G SIPREAS] T oag - CAB (4DOOR) | (ESULAR CAB
m. LONG BED $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 NO BID NOBID
n | PURLBEDWIDIHLOCKINGTOOL | cons00 | $305.00 | $305.00 | NOBID NO BID
0. ROLL TOP BED COVER $986.00 $986.00 $986.00 NO BID NO BID
INTEGRATED BED CAP, ‘
p. REGULAR BED $997.00 $997.00 $997.00 NO BID NO BID
( Y2TON PICKUPS)
DUAL REAR WHEELS
DUAL ALTERNATORS .
" | (17ON& 1 TON CAB & CLASSIS) STD NO BID STD NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulatio

APPROVED BY:

DATE: _ /[. 2> -20/2_

1 is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUGK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BiD TABULATION FORM

2010
Bid Opening Date: NOVENIBER 14, 2012

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

A-fmercaCity

-

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
o CHEVROLET CARGO VANS Y2 TON ONE TON 2 TON % TON ONE TON
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID $404.00 $404.00 $404.00
i *PKG *PKG *PKG
b. ' POWER LOCKS NO BiD *PKG *PKG *PKG
c. POWER MIRRORS NOBID » i PKG *PKG *PKG
d. CRUISE CONTROW/TILT WHEEL NO BID $336.00 $336.00 $336.00
e. ROOF MOUNTED LADDER RACKS NO BiD $655.00 $655.00 $655.00
f. REAR DOOR WINDOWS NO BID : $51.00 $51.00 $51.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other fact

tors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:,

pate:_/[-22-20/>

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: NOVENBER 14, 2012
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMIENT

El Paso

Al-manerica City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064

Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

o CHEVROLET CARGO VANS 12 TON ONE TON Y2 TON % TON ONE TON
g. REAR & SIDE DOOR WINDOWS NO BID $111.00 $111.00 $111.00
h: SLIDING SIDE DOOR NO BID $128.00 $128.00 $128.00
i. BULKHEAD NOBID $417.00 $417.00 $417.00
j. INTERIOR RACKS AND BINS NO BID $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $1,090.00
k. EXTENDED VAN NO BID NOBID $1,700.00 $800.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evatuated to determine o awardee,

The information contained in this bid tabulati

APPROVED BY:

DATE:_ [/~ 22 -2 0/

on is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2010
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVOLE & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

All-America City

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASQ, TX EL PASQ, TX
o DODGE CARGO VANS 12 TON 34 TON ONE TON 15 TON %4 TON ONE TON
a. ' POWER WINDOWS | NO BID NO BID
b. POWER LOCKS NO BID NO BID
c. POWER MIRRORS NO BID NO BID
d. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID . NO BID
e. ROOF MOUNTED LADDER RACKS NOC BID NOBID
f. REAR DOOR WINDOWS NO BID NOBID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated 1o defermine on awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does net constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: _//f- 22 ~29 72

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso
CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM N
A 2010
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
]
o DODGE CARGO VANS 15 TON 34 TON ONE TON 5 TON % TON ONE TON
g. REAR & SIDE DOOR WINDOWS NO BID NO BID
h. SLIDING SiDE DOOR NO BID NO BID
i BULKHEAD NORBID NO BID
j. INTERIOR RACKS AND BINS NO BID NOBID
k. EXTENDED VAN NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: [/ 22-20s%

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

All-fmerica City
o

§

2010
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14,2012 Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
CHEVROLET PASSENGE
o CHEVROLET PASSENGER VANS V2 TON ¥ TON | ONETON V2 TON %4 TON ONE TON
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID $404.00 $404.00 $404.00
*PKG *PKG *PKG
b. POWER SEATS NO BID $235.00 $235.00 $235.00
C. POWER LOCKS NO BID * * ®
c. POWER MIRRORS NO BID % * *
d. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID $336.00 $336.00 INCL
e. SLIDING SIDE DOOR NOBID $128.00 $128.00 $128.00
f. REAR A/C NO BID $740.00 $740.00 INCL
;
NOTE: This is a Best Valie Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to defermine an awardee.

The information containe/d in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: _ / 2 ~22-2ura 2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

(¥




CITY OF EL PASO El Paso
BID TABULATION FORM mﬁég,

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012 =010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICKPOEDODGELP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
o DODGE PASSENGER VANS Y2 TON %TON | ONETON ONE TON
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID NO BID
b. POWER SEATS NO BID | NO BID
c. POWER LOCKS NOBID NO BID
c. POWER MIRRORS NO BID NOBID
d. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NOBID NOBID
e. SLIDING SIDE DOOR NO BID NO BID
f REAR AIC NOBID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Vajue Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluatod (o detormimg an awardee.

The information containéd in this bid tabulati

on is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATB:// o/ 2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
/
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CITY OF EL PASO El Paéo
BID TABULATION FORM gu-ﬂmencacn;

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012 2010
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-064

Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
o CHEVROLET MINI VANS CARGO PASSENGER CARGO PASSENGER
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID NO BID NOBID
b. POWER LOCKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
c. POWER SEATS NO BID NO BID NOBID
d. POWER MIRRORS NOBID NO BID NO BID
e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID NOBID NO BID
f. REAR AND SIDE WINDOWS NO BID | NO BID NO BID
g. © BULKHEAD NO BID NO BID NO BID
h. RACKS AND BINS NOBID NO BID NOBID
NOTE: This is a Best Vaﬂﬁe Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardes.

The information contai( ed in this bid tabul

ation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:

DATE: {2._ 22 - 200 2 2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUGK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION 13




CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso
BID TABULATION FORM qy
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012 2010 Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASQ, TX
ol DODGE MiNI VANS CARGO PASSENGER CARGO PASSENGER
a. POWER WINDOWS $275.00 $275.00 NO BID NO BID
b. POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 NO BID NO BID
c. POWER SEATS $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NOBID
d. POWER MIRRORS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID
f. REAR AND SIDE WINDOWS $641.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
g. BULKHEAD $606.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID
h. RACKS 740 BINS $490.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evatuated to determine an awardee.

The information contaified in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:

DATE: /(— 22-"20/2__ 2013

-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION 14




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

All-America City

iy

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH HC‘HEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1;1":31\'11 CHEVROLE&ASIS;)RT UTILITY 15 TON 34 TON 15 TON 34 TON
a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID INCL INCL
b. POWER LOCKS NO BID INCL INCL
C. POWER SEATS NO BID INCL INCL
d. POWER MIRRORS NO BID INCL INCL
e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID INCL INCL
f. REAR AIC NO BID NO BID INCL
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaliaied to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and doe

APPROVED BY:

DATE: /z‘ 22 ~20/2

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

s not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

=0
Al-America Clty

2010
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
No. | DODGE SPORT UTILITY VANS Y2 TON ¥ TON 12 TON % TON

a. POWER WINDOWS NO BID NO BID : NO BID

b. POWER LOCKS NO BID NO BID NO BID

c. POWER SEATS NO BID NO BID NO BID

d. POWER MIRRORS NO BID NO BID NOBID

e. CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID NO BID NO BID

f. REAR A/C NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shail be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: -22 "2 or 2 2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION 16




Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

El Pasco

Sut-America City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-064
Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASOQ, TX
ITEM REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB | REGULAR | EXTENDED | CREW CAB
NO. TRUCKS - % TON AND 1 TON CAB CAB (4 DOOR) CAB CAB (4 DOOR)
9' FLAT BED WITH STEEL BED
#1. (1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) NO BID $2,850.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00
11" FLAT BED WITH STEEL BED
#2. (1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) NO BID $3,060.00 $3,060.00 $3,060.00
#3.  TONcAR S crtases §3,105.00 | $3,10500 | $3,40500 | $3,410.00 | $3410.00 | $3410.00
14" FLAT BED REQUIRES F450 or F550, LIST
#4. OPTIONS IN COMMENT SECTION NO BIiD NO BID
(1 TON CAB & CHASSIS)
GOOSENECK OPTION - FLAT BED
#5. (%8 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS) $757.00 $757.00 $757.00 $760.00 $766.00 $760.00
#5A.| GOOSENECK REAR RECEIVER HITCH - FLAT BED $452.30 $452.30 $452.30 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information containdd in this bid tabulat

APPROVED BY:

DATE: )

-22-2072 2013

ion is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of confract.

@64CHEVROLETDODGETRUCKVANOPWONALEQUWMENTGENERALSERVWES-FLEETD“ﬂﬂON
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CITY OF EL PASO )
BID TABULATION FORM RERURT

N V.
b2

*1% Solicitation #: 2013-064
Project Name: CHEVROLET & DODGE TRUCK & VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2012

Department: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DICK POE DODGE LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

I
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

a. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S |
BUILDOUT DATE FOR MODEL YEAR 2016 VEHICLES, SUBJECT TO
PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE, IF OPTION IS EXERCISED

PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE

CONTRACT: YES NO -4 YES NO X
b. VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S |]

BUILDOUT DATE FOR MODEL YEAR 2017 VEHICLES, SUBJECT TO

PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE. IF OPTION IS EXERCISED

PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE YES NO X YES NO X
CONTRACT:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY v

PROCUREMENT CARD: | ves [ | NG X VES NO
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: P

Within ___ consecutive calendar days. 120 60 - 90

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MIAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 23 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 BiDS LOCAL: 17 NOBID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evatuated to determine an awardee.

The information contained/in this bid tabulation i

s for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of confract.

APPROVED BY:

pate: //~22.-2015

2013-064 CHEVROLET DODGE TRUCK VAN OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION




DICK POE CHRYSLER
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SUNLAND PARK
PONTIAC BUICK GMC
955 CROCKETT WAY
EL PASO, TX 79922

HOY FOX AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
7230 VISCOUNT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MACK MASSEY MOTORS
950 CROCKETT STREET
EL PASO, TX 79922

DRIVEWAY DODGE
8434 GATEWAY BLVD. E
EL PASO, TX 79907

ASMAR TRUCK EQUIPMENT
7713 ALAMEDA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

JACK KEY MOTORS
1840 N. MAIN
LAS CRUCES, NM 88001

BORMAN MOTOR COMPANY
470 W. BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

DICK POE DEALERSHIPS
1363 AIRWAY BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MISSION CHEVROLET
1316 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

RUDOLPH AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
ATTN: MIKE RUFFIN

5625 S. DESERT

EL PASO, TX 79932

BRAVO CHEVROLET
CADILLAC HUMMER
6555 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EL PASO HONDA
1490 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

ENTERPRISE RENT-A-CAR
ATTN: JENNIFER JENNINGS
4115 N, MESA

EL PASO, TX 79902

BRAVO CHEVROLET
1601 8. MAIN ST.
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

VISION FORD LINCOLN-MERCURY

1500 S. WHITE SANDS BLVD,
ALAMOGORDO, NM 88310

MIDWAY CHEVROLET
5915 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SHAMLALEY FORD
11301 GATEWAY BLVD. W
EL PASO, TX 79936

CASA FORD

ATTN: RICK KENLEY
5815 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79825

TRAVIS CRAWFORD BUICK
6800 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EXPRESSWAY FORD
5550 N. DESERT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79912

FABCO INDUSTRIES INC.
8406 SPRAGUE ROAD
ODESSA, TX 79764

SISBARRO BUICK, PONTIAC
425 W. BOUTZ ROAD
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005




