CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

AGENDA DATE: L January 29. 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: CHIEF ROBERTO RIVERA/TERRENCE FREIBURG, PURCHASING
MANAGER

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
SUBJECT:

The Fire Department has reviewed solicitation #2008-023 and recommends Council to approve the three
Pumper Fire Apparatus award to First In, Inc. Each Pumper cost $425.344.26; total award $1,276,032.77.
First In, Inc. was the only responsive bidder.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The recommended award is for alternate bid item number 2 and should include items 1-21, 24, 34, 42, 53,
and 56 in the quantities specified. Item 22 should also be included; however, the quantity requested will be
reduced to 4. The new fire apparatuses will replace vehicles already scheduled for replacement, but suffered
accelerated aging daeto flood responses. The districts affected by this purchase are district 1, 2, and 4. The
apparatus will be placed in the following Fire Stations; Station 12 at 3801 Ft. Blvd, Station 23 at 5315
Threadgill, and Station 27 at 6767 Ojo de Agua.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: NA

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department 14200500; Account 508006; Fund 27264; Project PSTM06PWS555; Class 3700; Requisition #
2008000370; estimated value of $1,276,032.77

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION: NA

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: (if required) FINANCE:_(if required)
R Ny
DEPARTMENT HEAD: Roberto Rivera, Fire Chlef’ (gD v,f:;

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:
CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: January 10, 2008

PROJECT: Pumpers, 4 Person Tilt Cab
SOLICITATION NO: 2008-023 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
BUDGET NO: 508006-27264-14200500-37000-PSTMOBPW555

FUNDING SOURCE:  STORM 2006, Vehicular Equipment
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: First In, Inc.
El Paso, Texas
ltem(s): Alternate Bid Item No. 2 — Delete Options 23, 25-33, 35-41,

43-51, 54, 55, 57-65
Total Award:  $1,276,032.77

The award of Solicitation No. 2008-023, Pumpers, 4 Person Tilt Cab to First In, Inc. for a total amount of
$1,276,032.77.

This is a fixed-price, single (one-time) purchase. Vendor offers an option to purchase up to one hundred
percent (100%) of the original contract quantities, at the same unit price, if the option is exercised within six
(6) months from the date of award of the contract. No prompt payment discount was offered.

The Fire and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the sole vendor offering
the best value bid.

BIDS SOLICITED 34 (2local)
BIDS RECEIVED 01
“NO BID” RECEIVED 00

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $1,276,032.77
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COUNCI APPROVED REJECTEDD MUNICIPAL CLERK
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: January 22, 2008

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager




Crty COUNCIL

JonN COOK ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
MAYOR SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO L0ZANO, DISTRICT 3
JOYCE WILSON MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
CITY MANAGER RACHEL QUINTANA, DISTRICT 5
EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6
ROBERTO RIVERA STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
FIRE CHIEF BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
FIRE DEPARTMENT
MEMORANDUM -
To: Mary Jane Lopez, Procurement Analyst
From: Michael Calderazzo, Logistics Chl_,ef?;«/{/ ( —

Subject: Award Recommendation For Bid # 2008-023 .

Date: December 13, 2007
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The Fire Department has reviewed the bid for Pumper Fire Apparatus and recommends award of
solicitation # 2008-023 to First In, Inc. as the only responsive bidder. The award is for alternate bid
item number 2 and should include items 1-21, 24, 34, 42, 53, and 56 in the quantities specified. Item
22 should also be included; however, the quantity requested will be reduced to 4. It is assumed that
item 52 is already included in the price for the alternate bid. Therefore, each pumper should total
$425,344.26. For three 4-person tilt-cab non-IFS pumpers, overall value of this contract is expected to
be $1,276,032.77.

Funding for this contract is from the following:

Account 508006

Fund 27264
Department 14200500
Project PSTMO6PW555
Class 37000

Requisition # 2008000370 has been submitted for this project.

ZL1%

Fire Department @

ISO Class 1
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB

BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM# | QTY. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNIT PRICE - | EXTENDED PRICE
BID ITEM NO. 1
1. 3 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB, $542,616.86 $1,627,850.58
EACH AS SPECIFIED
MANUFACTURER PIERCE MFG.
MODEL NUMBER ARROW XT PUMPER
ALTERNATE BID ITEM NO. 2
PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB, AS
2, 3 SPECIFIED, NON-INDEPENDENT $533,316.86 $1,599,950.58
EACH FRONT SUSPENSION. SPECIFY
SUSPENSION COMPONENTS
MANUFACTURER PIERCE MFG.
MODEL NUMBER ARROW XT PUMPER

)

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL QUANTITY OF ITEMS,
BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE
HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT
QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED WITHIN:

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ’2-/-5’/07( U

(REVISED) / 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT ) 1




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
A. SIX (6) MONTHS FROM DATE OF AWARD YES | X NO| |
OF THE CONTRACT. |
B. TWELVE (12) MONTHS FROM DATE OF AWARD ‘ YES [ X NO
OF THE CONTRACT. : +2.5% OF ORIGINAL CONTRACT PRICE
C. EIGHTEEN (18) MONTHS FROM DATE OF AWARD T YES X NO
OF THE CONTRACT. + 2.5% OF ORIGINAL CONTRACT PRICE
D. TWENTY-FOUR (24) MONTHS FROM DATE OF - YES X NO
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. : + 3% OF CONTRACT PRICE @ 18 MONTHS
E. NO OPTION OFFERED. . [
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 210 CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BID SECURITY: | ves [X] NO [ ] |

BIDS SOLICITED: 33 BIDS RECEIVED: 1 BIDS LOCAL: 3 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:

DATE::
(REVISED) ) 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1. 2 SNAPTITE FSA FT 40 5" STORZ TO $176.63 $353.26
4" EL PASO THREADS ADAPTER
MANUFACTURER RED HEAD
MODEL NUMBER STYLE S-37
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
30' LENGTH OF 5" ANGUS 3 PLY HI-VOL
2. 1 FIRE HOSE WITH SNAPTITE STORTZ $1,207.68 $1,207.68
CONTRAXIAL SEXLESS COUPLINGS
MANUFACTURER KEY
MODEL NUMBER RC50-400-STORZ
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [
AKRON SLOW OPEN BUTTERFLY VALVE #7960 OR
3. 1 | EQUIVALENT, 6" FNST TO 6" MNST. 6" FNST SWIVEL | - $532.45 $532.45
ON 30 DEGREE ELBOW TO 5" STORTZ WITH CAP. | (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $7,986.75)
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER #7960
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO []
100' LENGTHS OF 5" ANGUS 3 PLY l
4. 15 HI-VOL FIRE HOSE WITH SNAPTITE $302.22 $4,533.30
STORTZ CONTRAXIAL SEXLESS COUPLINGS (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $3,324.42)
MANUFACTURER KEY
MODEL NUMBER RC50-400-STORZ
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ |

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: WA'Z
DATE: /l/g/o}fj

(REVISED) / / 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPAR:I'MENT ‘ 3




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

100" LENGTHS OF 3" POLYESTER OR DACRON 600
POUND TEST DOUBLE JACKETED HYPALON

5. 11 TREATED YELLOW FIRE HOSE WITH 2 1/2" NST $126.11 $1,387.21
THREADED PYROLITE COUPLINGS (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,513.32)
MANUFACTURER KEY
MODEL NUMBER DP-25-800-ARN
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]

LENGTHS OF 2 1/2" POLYESTER OR
DACRON 600 POUND TEST DOUBLE

6. 12 JACKETED HYPALON TREATED YELLOW $91.67 $1,100.04
FIRE HOSE WITH 2 1/2" NST THREADED
PYROLITE COUPLINGS ! (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $2,108.41)
MANUFACTURER KEY
MODEL NUMBER DP-17-800-ARN
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

50' LENGTHS OF 1 3/4" POLYESTER OR
DACRON 800 POUND TEST DOUBLE

7. | 23 JACKETED HYPALON TREATED $259.96 $5,979.08
YELLOW FIRE HOSE WITH 1 1/2" NST
PYROLITE COUPLINGS (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $779.88)
MANUFACTURER KEY
MODEL NUMBER DP-17-800-ARN
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

aperove sy, N1 [} Z
oate:_J2)57/o ;7/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

AKRON #1581 PYROLITE LEADER LINE
WYE OR EQUIVALENT 2 1/2" FNST X

8. 3 TWO 1 1/2" MNST (ELBOW FOR THIS $259.96 $779.88
IS ON LEFT REAR OUTLET)
MANUFACTURER RED HEAD
MODEL NUMBER STYLE 272 NL

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES NO [ ]

AKRON #1767 1 1/2" WIDE RANGE
TURBO JET NOZZLES, WITH #2431

0. 8 SABET SHUT OFF, 15/16" ORIFICE AT $731.32 $5,850.56
100 PSI OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER RED HEAD
MODEL NUMBER STYLE 1767 / STYLE 2431
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
AKRON #1442 2 1/2" BALL SHUTOFF
10. 1 PYROLITE NOZZLE WITH STACKED $460.28 $460.28
TIPS OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER #1442
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [
AKRON #1726 2 1/2" BREAKAWAY
1. 2 TURBOJET NOZZLE WITH TWIST SHUT $773.94 $1,547.88
OFF, 100 PSI OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER STYLE 1726
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO []

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: %&%
DATE: /2-/5/07 '

(REVISED) rf 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
AKRON #3488 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" CHROME
12. 1 DISCHARGE PIPE (FOR MONITOR) $326.43 $326.43
OR EQUIVALENT ,
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER 3488
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
13. 1 AKRON #2499 STACK TIPS (FOR $371.72 $371.72
MONITOR) OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER 2499
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]
14. 4 AKRON 336 CP BRASS DOUBLE $59.96 $239.84
MALE ADAPTERS OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER 336 CP
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]
15. 4 AKRON 335 CP BRASS DOUBLE $114.72 $458.88
FEMALE ADAPTERS OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER 335 CP
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: }’7) (\ Z‘

DATE: /9—/ 5//07 v

(REVISED)

2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
16. 8 2 1/2" AKRON 350 RUNNING $23.62 $188.96
BOARD MOUNTS OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER STYLE 350
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
17. 4 FOUR 1 1/2" AKRON 350 RUNNING $20.80 $83.20
BOARD MOUNTS OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER STYLE 350
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
18. 1 AKRON #773 3" HOSE JACKET $711.47 $711.47
OR EQUIVALENT
'MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER #773
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
19. 1 AKRON #588 HOSE CLAMP AND ONE $464.46 $464.46
AKRON #589 MOUNT OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER #588

. BIDDER COMPLIES

YES NO []

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: m A- i

DATE: /5‘*/5//.07U

(REVISED) /
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
AKRON #448 DUAL WRENCH HOLDER
20. | 2 WITH TWO STYLE 10 WRENCHES $100.78 $201.56
OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER #448
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO []
21. 2 SNAPTITE #FSPH-1 FOUR 5" SPANNERS $77.60 $155.20
WITH MOUNTING BRACKET
MANUFACTURER SNAPTITE
MODEL NUMBER SS-MP
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
22. 6 ANGUS MB5 5" STORTZ MOUNTING $28.19 $169.14
BRACKETS
MANUFACTURER ANGUS
MODEL NUMBER SMP
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
23. 1 LARGE RUBBER MALLET $20.95 $20.95
MANUFACTURER FIRE HOOKS
MODEL NUMBER CM-2
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. = | .1

14

APPROVED BY: h’ A %

DATE: )2//5/09
(REVISED) / /
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
24, 2 WHITE CANVAS 12' X 18' $143.21 $286.42
SALVAGE COVER (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $859.26)
MANUFACTURER GOSPORT
MODEL NUMBER CCS-12

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES NO [ ]

25. 2 WHEEL CHOCKS $213.82 $427.64
MANUFACTURER ZICO
MODEL NUMBER SAC-44-3

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES [X] NO [

COLLINS HAND HELD SPOTLIGHT
WITH MOMENTARY SWITCH WIRED

26. 1 AND MOUNTED AS DIRECTED ON $167.79 $167.79
THE OFFICER SIDE
MANUFACTURER HAVIS SHIELDS COLLINS
MODEL NUMBER CL-12 ‘
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

27. 6 VULCAN STREAM LIGHTS $131.00 $786.00
MANUFACTURER STREAMLIGHT
MODEL NUMBER 44001

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES NO [

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

approVED BY:_ 1A 2
DATE: /7—/5/07\\
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC. ‘
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
28. 2 FLATHEAD AXE WITH WOOD HANDLE $88.89 $177.78
AND MOUNTING HARDWARE
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER WF-6, AS510 AS520
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [
29. 1 PICKHEAD AXE WITH WOOD HANDLE $113.56 $113.56
AND MOUNTING HARDWARE
MANUFACTURER AKRON
MODEL NUMBER WP-6, AS-510 AS-520, PAPC
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
30. 1 20 LB. ABC EXTINGUISHER WITH $160.40 $160.40
BRACKET
MANUFACTURER BROOKS AX411 15HB
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO (]
31. 1 15 LB. CO2 (CARBON DIOXIDE) $294.04 $294.04
WITH BRACKET
MANUFACTURER BROOKS
MODEL NUMBER ‘ AX331 15HB
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

approvensy. I Z
pATE:_/ l/ 5'/ O\} 7
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | Qry. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
32. 1 ' 5 LB. ABC EXTINGUISHER $69.53 $69.53
WITH BRACKET
MANUFACTURER BROOKS
MODEL NUMBER AX402T
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ |
33. 1 2 1/2 GALLON PRESSURIZED WATER $170.02 $170.02
EXTINGUISHER WITH BRACKET
MANUFACTURER BROOKS
MODEL NUMBER AX240 15HB
BIDDER COMPLIES YES No []
ROLLS OF BLACK RUBBER TURTLE
34, 2 STYLE MATTING FOR COMPARTMENTS | $1,153.10 $2,306.20
AND SHELVES
MANUFACTURER TURTLE PLASTICS
MODEL NUMBER 943090
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
35. 4 RECHARGEABLE VULCAN STREAM $210.00 $840.00
LIGHTS MOUNTED IN THE CAB
MANUFACTURER STREAMLIGHT
MODEL NUMBER 44001
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: //)M f
DATE: /1/5/ nV’7 |

(REVISED)
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
36" HALLIGAN TYPE TOOL
36. 1 NO MOUNTING HARDWARE TO $166.70 $166.70
BE PROVIDED
MANUFACTURER GENESIS
MODEL NUMBER ART.340.13.6.0
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]
AXE/BAR CARRYING AND SHOULDER
37. 1 STRAP. ZICO ORDER # ABCS, PART # $57.06 $57.06
3099-760-000, OR COMPARABLE ITEM
MANUFACTURER ZICO
MODEL NUMBER 3099-760-000
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
ADJUSTABLE SHOULDER STRAPS FOR
HIGH-RISE HOSE PACK, ZICO ORDER
38. 3 # SS-4800, PART # 5010-285-110, $16.94 $50.82
OR COMPARABLE ITEM
MANUFACTURER ZICO
MODEL NUMBER SS-480-5010-285-00
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
16" TO 25" VARIABLE STRAPS FOR
HIGH-RISE PACK, ZICO ORDER #
39. 9 UMVS-1625-11, PART 3099-738-000, $24.78 $223.02
OR COMPARABLE ITEM
MANUFACTURER ZICO
MODEL NUMBER UMVS-1625-11
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ |
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

approven sy: SN z
DATE: /2'/5/0 I}J

(REVISED) /

/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

AKRON RIGID FEMALE TO MALE
40. 3 ADAPTER (REDUCER) 2 1/2" X 1 1/2",
OR EQUIVALENT

$56.07

$168.21

MANUFACTURER

AKRON

MODEL NUMBER

337

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES [X]

NO [ ]

HOSE BED COVER - HEAVY DUTY (MINIMUM 18 TO
20 OUNCE MATERIAL) RIP STOP TYPE VINYL WITH
41. SNAP FASTENERS AND WEIGHTED FLAP AT REAR
CAPABLE OF COVERING ENTIRE HOSE LOAD

$1,400.00

$1,400.00

MANUFACTURER

LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES

NO []

DAVID CLARK VOICE ACTIVATED
INTERCOM SYSTEM WITH RADIO
42, INTERFACE. FOUR STATION
WITH HEADSETS

$7,700.00

$7,700.00

MANUFACTURER

LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES [Xx]

NO [ ]

QUICK CONNECT REGULATOR, DUAL EBSS,

43. 4 EZ FLO Il + CBRN, PAK ALERT SE+, EPIC VOICE

AMPLIFIER/RI ASSEMBLY WITH BRACKET
AND AV3000 FACE PIECE

SCOTT NXG7 2.2 AIR-PACKS, STANDARD HARNESS,

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER

NO BID

MODEL NUMBER

NO BID

BIDDER COMPLIES

YES [_|

NO [X]

APPROVED BY: _/_ﬂgd_é@_%
DATE: /Q—/C;' / 07

(REVISED) / 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007

BID # 2008-023
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
44. 7 SCOTT CARBON CYLINDER AND NO BID NO BID
NXG2 VALVE ASSEMBLY 30 MINUTE
MANUFACTURER NO BID
MODEL NUMBER NO BID
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [] NO
EZ COMM RADIO INTERFACE/VOICE
AMPLIFIER COMMUNICATION SYSTEM
45, 4 FOR USE WITH MOTOROLA NO BID NO BID
XTS5000R MODEL 2
MANUFACTURER NO BID
MODEL NUMBER NO BID
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [ NO [X]
SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL FRONT
GOODYEAR 315/80R22.5, 18 PLY
46. 1 G291 MOUNTED ON 22.50" X 9.00" $1,352.00 $1,352.00
ALUMINUM WHEEL WITH 10 STUD
11.25" BOLT CIRCLE
MANUFACTURER LOT
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

DATE: /fL/ Y /0\]7

APPROVED BY: MA %

(REVISED) /
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL REAR
GOODYEAR 12R2.50, 16 PLY "MUD
47. 1 AND SNOW" G124 TREAD MOUNTED $1,318.00 $1,318.00
ON 22.50" X 8.25" ALUMINUM WHEEL
WITH 10 STUD 11.25" BOLT CIRCLE
MANUFACTURER LOT
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
ENGINE OVERHAUL/REPAIR
48. 3 SCHOOL AT AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY $7,275.00 $7,275.00
PERSONS FOR (3) PEOPLE (LOT OF 3)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
ALLISON TRANSMISSION OVERHAUL
49. 3 SCHOOL AT AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY $7,275.00 $7,275.00
PERSONS FOR (3) PEOPLE (LOT OF 3)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
EGR AIR HANDLING FAMILIARIZATION
50. 3 SCHOOL AT AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY $4,590.00 $4,590.00
PERSONS FOR (3) PEOPLE (LOT OF 3)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. SRR

PO MEAND A LIS
APPROVED BY:%_%&K_{%JO
DATE: /2—/ 5//0
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB ( BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTy. ‘ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
51. COMPRESSED AIR FOAM SYSTEM $38,340.00 $38,340.00
MANUFACTURER PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES No [
52, STANDARD FRONT STEERING AND $9,300.00 $9,300.00
SUSPENSION (NON-IFS)
MANUFACTURER PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
53. SIDE ROLL PROTECTION PACKAGE $4,900.00 $4,900.00
MANUFACTURER PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO []
MOTOROLA XTS 5000 MODEL 2
54, 4 PORTABLE RADIOS FOR AN 800 MHz $17,804.00 $17,804.00
SMART NET SYSTEM (LOT OF 4)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES . YES NO []

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: %%%
DATE; /Q—/S”/) A

(REVISED) /

2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

MOTOROLA XTL 5000 MOBILE RADIO
55. FOR AN 800 MHz SMART NET SYSTEM $5,065.00 $5,065.00
INCLUDING CABLING KIT.

MANUFACTURER LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

56. CF-19 PANASONIC TOUGH BOOK $4,542.00 $4,542.00
WITH WIRELESS PASS-THROUGH

MANUFACTURER LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

GAMBER JOHNSON CAB
57. MOUNT DOCKING STATION $1,290.00 $1,290.00
FOR CF-19 TOUGH BOOK

MANUFACTURER LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]

MOTOROLA 850 VRM DATA RADIO
58. FOR PANASONIC TOUGH BOOK $3,666.00 $3,666.00
(MCT) INCLUDING CABLING KIT

MANUFACTURER LOT

MODEL NUMBER

BIDDER COMPLIES YES - NO [_]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: MA‘Z

DATE: ‘/?//5/ 0
Revisep) [/ /7 2008-023 PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB - FIRE DEPARTMENT 17




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB : BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM | QTY. DESCRIPTION ' UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
IVLU (INTELLIGENT VEHICLE LOGIC UNIT) FOR THE
59. AVL TO INCLUDE A MOTOROLA GTX DATA RADIO NO BID NO BID
OR EQUIVALENT DATA RADIO AND THE CABLING KIT
MANUFACTURER NO BID
MODEL NUMBER NO BID
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [ ] NO
60. 2 ADVANCED RTA SYSTEM TRAINING $2,620.00 $2,620.00
PERSON (RTA-FLEET SOFTWARE) (LOT OF 2)
MANUFACTURER TRAINING IN
MODEL NUMBER PHOENIX, AZ
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [ ]
61. 2 IQ REPORT WRITER (RTA) TRAINING $1,870.00 $1,870.00
PERSONS , (LOTOF 2)
MANUFACTURER TRAINING IN
MODEL NUMBER PHOENIX, AZ
BIDDER COMPLIES YES. NO [ ]
62. 2 RTA PAPERLESS SHOP AND $1,870.00 $1,870.00
PERSONS MECHANIC TRAINING (LOTOF2)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES [X] NO [ ]

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

ApprOVED BY: /N A’i
DATE: /2/5/ é‘)7
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: PUMPERS, 4 PERSON TILT CAB BID # 2008-023
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 28, 2007 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM Qry. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
63. 1 ENGINE PARTS SCHOOL NOT AVAILABLE
PERSON FROM MANUFACTURER
MANUFACTURER NO BID
MODEL NUMBER NO BID
BIDDER COMPLIES YES m NO [:I
64. 3 VEHICLE MANUFACTURER $8,100.00 $8,100.00
PERSONS ELECTRICAL SCHOOL (LOT OF 3)
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO [_]
65. 1 TIRE SNOW CABLES FOR APPARATUS $187.70 $187.70
SET
MANUFACTURER LOT
MODEL NUMBER
BIDDER COMPLIES YES NO |

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: /” A Z
DATE: /7—/51/0\’&

(REVISED) [
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4 GUYS INC
230 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD
MYERSDALE PA 15552

LONGHORN EMERGENY
1014 OAK ST.
MCKINNEY, TX 75069

AMERICAN LAFRANCE OF NEW
MEXICO

12901 US HWY 66 W FRONTAGE RD

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87121

BECKER FIRE EQUIPMENT CO

1275 N 6 MILE RD é v‘

G

CASPER WY 82604 u,(
ogjﬁ
CUSTOM FIRE APPARATUS INC

509 68™ AVE
OSCEOLA WI 54020

M & W FIRE APPARATUS
845 THIRD STREET
VINTON, VA 24179

EMERGENCY ONE INC
PO BOX 2710
OCALAFL 34478

FERRARA FIRE APPARATUS INC
137 EASTPARK DR
EUNICE LA 70535 ,(\‘('

FIRSTININC
21442 N CENTRAL AVE
PHOENIX AZ 85024

AMERICAN LAFRANCE
9550 NORTH LOOP EAST
HOUSTON TX 77029

HME INC
1950 BYRON CTR AVE
GRAND RAPIDS MI 49509

INDEPENDENT FIRE COMPANY
711 ASPEN NW
ALBUQUERQUE NM 87102

LTD

LUVERNE FIRE APPARATUS CO
1209 E BIRCH ST

BRANDON SD 57005-2003

KME
ONE INDUSTRIAL COMPLEX

g:ﬁyNESQUE gwaG PA 18240
4/%‘31

F & F SUPPLY
17134 LENA LANE
FAYETTVILLE, AR 72704

OSHKOSH
PO BOX 2566
OSHKOSH WI 54903-2566

PIERCE MANUFACTURING INC
2600 AMERICAN DR PO BOX 2017
APPLETON WI 54913

S & S FIRE APPARATUS
4353 W 1900 N-48
FAIRMONT IN 46928

SEAGRAVE
105 E12™ ST
CLINTONVILLE WI 54929

SMEAL FIRE APPRATUS {/

3318 BUTTERLEIGH

SAN ANTONIO, TX 7824 Q
\)‘C(

CENTRAL STATES FIRE APPARTUS
100 THIRD ST PO BOX 57
LYONS SD 57041

SOUTHERN COACH INC
1985 NW 57™ ST ¢
OCALA FL 34475

SUTPHEN CORPORATION
7000 COLUMBUS-MARYSVILLE RD
AMLIN OH 43002-0158

THE PHOENIX GROUP EMERGENCY
308 LAKEWOOD
WAXAHACHIE TX 75165

VERMONT FIRE TECHNOLOGIES
PO BOX 154 154 INDUSTRY ST
WILLIAMSTOWN VT 05679

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
201 AVENUE R
LUBBOCK, TX 79915

RUSH TRUCK CENTER, EL PASO
12253 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

PETE’S EQUIPMENT REPAIR
1400 BROADWAY
NE ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87102

FIRST IN INC

6400 AIRPORT RD SUITE ¢
EL PASO TX 79925 {

ATTN: DOUG BRADFORD
FERRARA FIRE APPARATUS, INC.
27855 JAMES CHAPEL ROAD
HOLDEN, LA 70744




ATTN: WYATT OAKLEY
NAFECO WEST TEXAS
BOX 704

STAMBORD, TX 79553

FREIGHTLINER OF SAN ANTONIO
ATTN: ARTHUR BLISS

8700 IH - 10E

CONVERSE, TX 78109

FERRARA FIRE APPARATURS, INC.
ATTN: SHELLI HAGAN

P O BOX 249

HOLDEN, LA 70744

F & F SUPPLY
1100 OHIO AVENUE
BIG LAKE, TX 76932




