om——___ CITYOEELPASO, TEXAS -

AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM
DEPARTMENT: General Services
AGENDADATE:  TBD byFinaneialServices— January 23, 2007
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Jeff Belles, 621-6821 , Terrence Freiburg, 541-4313
DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT: APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City
Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $ amount if

applicable. ,

Award contract 2007-043, Pothole Patch Truck, to Border International El Paso Texas.
Award item 1 Pothole Truck $105131

Optional Item O3 Hydraulic tool hose reel $695

Optional Item O4 Vibratory Roller $4995

Optional Item O8 Diesel fuel hosereel ~ $295
Optional Item 09 Tack oil hose reel $395
Optional Item 010 230HP Engine $4400

Total price per truck $115911
Border International is the lowest responsive bidder.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: Discussion of the what, why, where when, and how to enable
Council to have reasonably complete description of the contemplated action. This should
include attachment of bid tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the
benefits to the City of this action? What are the citizen concerns?

See attached bid tabulations. This bid is for the purchase-of one Pothole Patch Truck.
PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes City Council has awarded numerous vehicle purchase contracts.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: How will this item be funded? Has the item been
budgeted? If so, identify funding source by account numbers and description of account. Does
it require a budget transfer?

04102010-27503-508006, Project P540010CTY Capital Outlay for Vehicular Equipment

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

NA

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION*******************‘k

DEPARTMENT HEAD: Jeffrey A Belles 01/04/2007 % M——

(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purc) chent epartment should sign also)
Informatwn copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: 'DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: January 5, 2007

PROJECT: Pot Hole Patch Truck
SOLICITATION NO: 2007-043 DEPARTMENT: Street
BUDGET NO: 508006-27503-04102010-P540010CTY

FUNDING SOURCE: Capital Outlay for Vehicular Equipment
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Border International Trucks
El Paso, TX
Item(s): #1  Pot Hole Patch Truck — Qty. 1 @ $105,131.00/each

#0-3 Hydraulic Tool Line Hose Reel Option @ $695.00/each

#0-4 Vibratory Roller Option @ $4,995.00/each

#0-8 Diesel Fuel Hose Reel Option @ $295.00/each

#0-9 Tack Oil Hose Reel Option @ $395.00/each

#0-10 Chassis Engine, 230HP Option @ $4,400.00/each
Total Award: $115,911.00 ‘

The award of Solicitation No. 2007-043, Pot Hole Patch Truck, to Border International Trucks for a total
amount of $115,911.00.

This is a fixed-price, single (one-time) purchase. Vendor offers an option to purchase up to one hundred
percent (100%) of the original contract quantities, at the same unit price, if the option is exercised within
ninety (90) days from the date of award of the contract. No prompt payment discount was offered.

The General Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest
responsive, responsible Bidder.

BIDS SOLICITED 38 (18 local)
BIDS RECEIVED 04
“NO BID” RECEIVED 00

CURRENT TAXES PAID
OUT-OF-TOWN

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $115,911.00
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: January 23, 2007

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Mana




BID ITEM: POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2007-043
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BID DATE: DECEMBER 20, 2006

MODEL NUMBER (CAB & CHASSIS/BODY)

BORDER : ,
INTERNATIONAL DUNCAN FREIGHTLINER- MHC RUSH TRUCK
TRUCKS STERLING-WESTERN STAR |KENWORTH/STERLING| CENTER - EL PASO
. EL PASO, TX WACO, TX EL PASO, TX ' EL PASO, TX
ITEM| QTY. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM _ UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. 1 POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK, - $105,131.00 NO BID $110,335.00 NO BID
EACH AS SPECIFIED ‘
' 2008 INTERNATIONAL MODEL 4200 STERLING .
MANUFACTURER (CAB & CHASSIS/BODY) "~ SBA4X2CHASSIS WITH FREIGHTLINER H.D. INDUSTRIES, INC.
PRO-PATCH MODEL TCM 425-100DHE| ACTERRA

AS WELL AS PLATE COMPACTOR

ALTERNATE BID ITEM:
$115,971.00 (EXT. WARRANTY ENGINE &)
2. 1 "FLAMELESS" POT HOLE . “TRANSMISSION-5 YEAR OR 150,000 MILES
' EACH PATCH TRUCK N/A $119,318.00 NO BID $3,125.00 (CAB & CHASSIS ALLISON
. : TRANSMISSION-5 YEAR/UNLIMITED MILES
MANUFACTURER (CAB & CHASSIS/BODY) FREIGHTLINER / BERG KAMP, INC. GMC / BERGKAMP, INC.
MODEL NUMBER (CAB & CHASSIS/BODY) M2106 / FPS TC7C042 / FP5
OPTIONAL ITEMS (SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS) AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT
‘ $-0- $ - 0 - (OPTIONAL TOOL BOX =
TOOL BOX: 12 gauge steel, (OPTIONAL TOOL BOX: 7.92 CUBIC FEET 7.92 GUBIC FEET (19X24X30) LOCKABLE
0-1 approximately 19" x 24" 30" tool box $395.00 (19X24X30). LOCKABLE STORAGE CALLS FOR| $395.00 STORAGE CALLS FOR 10.57 CUBIC FEET
with waterproof locking door. 10.57 CUBIC FEET (83X22X10) FOR A TOTAL OF (83X22X10) FOR A TOTAL OF $18.49
) $18.49. BERGKAMP OFFERS 22.5 CUBIC FEET BERGKAMP OFFERS 22.5 CUBIC FEET
OF LOCKABLE STORAGE ON THE FP5.) OF LOCKABLE STORAGE ON THE FPS.
SAND SPREADER ASSEMBLY: includes ‘
chute, spinner, hydraulic motor,
0-2 hydraulic lines and all quick coupler $3,695.00 $4,300.00 - - $3,695.00 $4,300.00
connecting fittings. In-cab controls. ' ’
HYDRAULIC TOOL LINE HOSE REEL: $695.00 . INCLUDED $695.00 INCLUDED
dual 25", auto retractable . (STANDARD) (STANDARD)
- , , $3, 250.00 ($5,400.00 - UPGRADE : $3, 250.00 (55,400.00 - UPGRADE
VIBRATORY ROLLER: Bomag model $4,995.00 FROM PLATE COMPACTOR TO ROLLER) $4,995.00 FROM PLATE COMPACTOR TO ROLLER)

AS WELL AS PLATE COMPACTOR

APPROVED BY:

DATE: /2/28/0 "

2007-043 POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK

BID # 2007-043 ‘
BID DATE: DECEMBER 20, 2006 DEPARTMENT: STREET
‘BORDER . . '
. INTERNATIONAL DUNCAN FREIGHTLINER- MHC RUSH TRUCK ,
TRUCKS STERLING-WESTERN STAR KENWORTH/STERLING| CENTER - EL PASO
EL PASO, TX WACO, TX EL PASO, TX —EL PASO, TX
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
x $0-
: $-0- (ATARP COVER ON THE UNIT WOULD BE Al
TARP COVER: $795.00 . (A TRAP COVER ON THE UNIT WOULD BE A $795.00 DOWNGRADE. BERGKAMP OFFERS .
tarp material is capab|e of sustaining DOWNGRADE. BERGKAMP OFFERS HYDRAULIC HYDRAULIC STEEL DOORS AS STANDARD
temperatures up to 500 degrees F. STEEL DOORS AS STANDARD EQUIPMENT. THESE EQUIPMENT. THESE DOORS ARE
DOORS ARE SUPERIOR TO A TARP COVER, ' SUPERIOR TO A TARP COVER.
o ' NOT NEEDED. COMPRESSED NOT NEEDED. COMPRESSED
HYDRAULIC AIR COMPRESSOR: $3,650.00 AIR IS ALREADY PROVIDED $3,650.00 - AIR IS ALREADY PROVIDED
25 CFM @ 125 PsI AT NO ADDITIONAL COST. ' AT NO ADDITIONAL COST.
' 4 $1,100.00 (THIS IS A TWO-IN-ONE $1,100.00 (7HiS 1S A TWO-IN.ONE
'AIR LINE HOSE REEL: $695.00 AIR TACK SYSTEM SO REQUIRES ONE $295.00 AIR TACK SYSTEM SO REQUIRES ONE,
20' of hose, auto retractable REEL MOUNTED UNDER TRUCK FENDER. REEL MOUNTED UNDER TRUCK FENDER.
DIESEL FUEL HOSE REEL.: $295.00 $550.00 $295.00 $550.00
20' of hose, auto retractable
TRACK OIL HOSE REEL: $395.00 INCLUDED IN O-7 $395.00 INCLUDED IN O-7
15' of hose, auto retractable. :
CHASSIS ENGINE: Electronically ’ :
controlled 250HP in lieu of 190HP 230 HP $4,400.00 $915.00 INCLUDED 230 HP, INCLUDED
(input difference in price) (250 HP NOT AVAILABLE) (230 HP) 260 HP - $1,675.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL QUANTITY OF ITEMS, BY GIVING
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE
HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT
QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED WITHIN:

APPROVED BY:

M@Z
DATE: /97/9—5’,/06 .

2007-043 POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK .
BID DATE: DECEMBER 20, 2006 .

BID # 2007-043

DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER |
INTERNATIONAL DUNCAN FREIGHTLINER- . MHC RUSH TRUCK
TRUCKS STERLING-WESTERN STAR |KENWORTH/STERLING| CENTER - EL PASO
EL PASO, TX WACO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
A. NINETY (90) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.{  YES[ X |No[ ] ves[x] wno[_] YEs[ X ]no[ ] ves[ X ]no[ ]
B. ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY (180) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF|  YES[__|No[ ] vEs[X] o[ ] vEs[__|No[ ] YEs[ X ] No[ ]
THE CONTRACT. . ) ‘
C. THREE HUNDRED SIXTY-FIVE (365) DAYS FROM DATE OF YEs[__|no[ ] YES Nno[ | - yes[ |No[ ] YES[__|NO
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.
D. NO OPTION OFFERED. [] (] L] [ ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NONE STATED NET - 30 DAYS
180 CONSECUTIVE 180 CONSECUTIVE 175 CONSECUTIVE
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: . CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS 180 - 210 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 38.

BIDS LOCAL:

NO BIDS:

APPROVED BY: }/77 ﬁ Z
DATE: JQI/J_X’/O g/

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

2007-043 POT HOLE PATCH TRUCK - STREET DEPARTMENT




D & H EQUIPMENT, LTD.

1564 LOOP 163

POST OFFICE BOX 519

BLANCO, TX 78606

ATTN: ANDREWT. COX -
GEN. MGR. & SALES

CLOSNER EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
13800 FM 973 N ~
MANOR, TEXAS 78653-4554 ’%

N

SISBARRO BUICK-PONTIAC GMC
INCORPORATED

425 WEST BOUTZ ROAD

LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

WESTWAY DODGE — Q )<< :

4646 NORTH MESA STREET
EL PASO, TX 79902

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
10901 GATEWAY WEST BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79935

MIDWAY CHEVROLET
5915 MONTANA
EL PASO, TX 79915

DICK POE CHRYSLER PLYMOUTH
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

BORDER INTERNATIONALTRUCKS
12283 ROJAS DR
EL PASO, TX 79936

CIMA TECHNOLOGIES ___
ATTN: RUDY MENDOZA
4717 OSBORNE DR. STE. 300
EL PASO, TX 79922

. SAM PACK’S FIVE STAR
FORD OF CARROLLTON
16351 35E
CARROLLTON, TX 75006
ATTN: ALAN J. ROSNER

H.D. INDUSTRIES, INC.
P.O. BOX 8250
JACKSONVILLE, TX 75766

DICK POE CHRYSLER PLYMOUTH
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EXPRESSWAY FORD
5550 N. DESERT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79912

CRAWFORD AUTO PLAZA
6800 MONTANA
EL PASO, TX 79925

SUNLAND PARK
PONTIAC/BUICK/GMC
955 CROCKETT WAY
EL PASO, TX 79922

MISSION CHEVROLET
1316 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

" BORMAN MOTOR COMPANY

470 WEST BOUTZ :
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

WALLACE CHEVROLET
SOUTH MAIN & BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

ALTEC INDUSTRIES

2106 SOUTH RIVERSIDE RD
ST. JOSEPHS, MISSOURI 64507
ATTN: MARTY THORMTON

NAFECO

1515 WEST MOULTON STREET
DECATUR, AL 35601

ATTN: GARY JOHN SHERRILL

CLOSNER EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
1415 WEST POPLAR

PO BOX 7328

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78207-1234

TRUCKS WEST INC.
5010 JEFFERSON STREET NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87109-2309

RN

RICK KENLY

CASA FORD ,
5815 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

DICK POE DODGE INCORPORATED
ATTN: MICHAEL MONROE

1363 AIRWAY BOULEVARD

EL PASO, TX 79925

RUDY SANDOVAL
SANDOVAL DODGE

PO BOX 608

LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

SHAMALEY FORD ISUZU
11310 GATEWAY BLVD. WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

RUDOLPH AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
ATTN: WES BENSON

5625 S. DESERT BLVD.

EL PASO, TX 79932

MHC KENWORTH/FORD
ATTN: RENE REYES
10901 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79935

UTILITY TRUCK EQUIPMENT CO.
(UTEC) .

P.0.BOX9

HEWITT, TX 76643-0009

ATTN: ROBERT HILL

LAWRENCE MARSHALL
DEALDERSHIPS

P.0.BOX 983
HEMPSTEAD, TX 77445
ATTN: ADRIENNE MARBLE




EQUIPMENT TECHNOLOGY INC. AMERICAN INSPECTION AND

341 NW122 o TEST, INC.

OKLAHOMA CITY, OK 73114 P.0.BOX 1389

ATTN: BRIAN CARVER CHANDLER, AZ 85244-1389
ATTN: ART COOK

BOWHEAD MANUFACTURING CO.
1011 SW KLICKITAT WAY SUITE 104
SEATTLE, WA 98134

ATTN: JEFF GUENTZEL

FABCO
P. 0. BOX 1551
ODESSA, TX 79760

A.C.W. SALES, INC.
8409 LOCKHEED SUITE #28
EL PASO, TX 79925
ATTN: ANDY R. BARRERIO

RUSH GMC COMMERCIAL TRUCKS
12253 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

FRANK R. MARTINEZ
2008 BROOKVILLE LANE
FLOWER MOUND, TX 75028

PB LOADER
5778 W. BARSTOW AVE.
FRESNO, CA 93722




