CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: PARKS & RECREATION

AGENDA DATE: March 12, 2013
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: NANETTE SMEJKAL, PARKS & RECREATION DIRECTOR, 541-4283

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED:

SUBJECT:

BRUCE D. COLLINS, PURCHASING MANAGER, 541-4313

ALL

Award Solicitation Number 2013-083 Pool Chemicals to the following vendors:

Item Vendor Estimated Annual Estimated 3 Year Option Offered

#2 Baron Chemical $6,860.00 $20,580.00 2 years
Company, El Paso, TX

#23 Environmental $40,976.00 - $122,928.00 1 year
Compliance Resources,
LLC. Cheyenne, WY

#3#44#5,and | Leslie’s Poolmart, INC. $2,047.70 $6,143.10 No Option 1

#7 Phoenix, AZ

#12 and #22 Mayfield Pool Supply, $440.18 $1,320.54 No Option 1
LP. El Paso, TX

#1, #6, #8, #9, | Triple-S Janitorial $24,387.00 $73,161.00 2 years

#10, #11, #14, | Supplies, El Paso, TX

#18, #19 and

#20

#13, #15,#16 | W.M. Smith & Assoc. $1,263.80 $3,791.40 No Option 2

and #17 INC./DBA: WMS :
Aquatics. Ellensburg,
WA

Totals $ 75,974.68 $227,924.04

There were no bids for item 21. This is a 36 month contract.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Proper chemical levels in the pools are critical to maintaining public health and safety. The Parks and
Recreation Department needs the chemicals and test tablets for all of the City’s 14 public pools. This purchase
will ensure that State and City codes are met and that proper and safe chemical levels are maintained.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 11/20/2012 and, 11/27/2012. The postcards were mailed out on 11/20/2012.

The solicitation was posted on City website on 11/20/2012. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on
11/20/2012. A total of twelve (12) bidders solicited, eleven (11) local vendors were solicited. A total of nine
(9) bids were received, five (5) being local vendors.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Council awarded Solicitation 2010-023 Pool Chemicals on December 1, 2009.




AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

The total value of this contract is for $227,924.04 for 36 months. Funding will be from the Parks and
Recreation Department — Aquatics Division: General Fund 1000: Division ID: 51240: Account 531260

(chemicals).

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

--------

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Name Signature Date




SBTI.1

COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(LOW BID)

*******'k'k*'k****‘k‘k*’k*********************POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW**************‘k****************

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of MARCH 12,

2013. -

The award of Solicitation No. 2013-083 (Pool Chemicals) to Baron Chemical Company,
Environmental Compliance Resources, LLC, Leslie’s Poolmart, Inc., Mayfield Pool Supply, LP,
Triple-S Janitorial Supplies, and W.M. Smith & Assoc. Inc./ dba WMS Aquatics for an initial term

estimated award of $227,924.04.
Department:
Awarded to: Vendor 1

ltem:

Initial Term:

Option: 4
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:
Total Estimated Award:

Awarded to: Vendor 2

ltem:

Initial Term:

Option:

Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:
Initial Term Estimated Award:
Total Estimated Award:

Awarded to: Vendor 3

ltems:

Initial Term:

Option: '

Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:
Total Estimated Award:

Parks and Recreation

Baron Chemical Company, Inc.
El Paso, TX

2

3 Years

None

11/2% - 10 Days

$6,860.00

$20,580.00 (3 years)

Environmental Compliance Resources, LLC
Cheyenne, WY :

23 ‘

3 Years

1 year

Net — 30 Days

$40,976.00

$122,928.00 (3 years)

$163,904.00 (4 years)

Leslie’s Poolmart, Inc.
Phoenix, AZ

3,4,5 and 7

3 Years

None

Net — 30 Days
$2,047.70

$6,143.10 (3 years)




SBTI.1

Awarded to: Vendor 4 Mayfield Pool Supply, LP
El Paso, TX _
ltems: 12 and 22
[nitial Term: 3 Years
Option: None
Payment Terms: Net — 30 Days
Annual Estimated Award: $440.18
Total Estimated Award: $1,320.54 (3 years)
Awarded to: Vendor 5 Triple-S Janitorial Supplies
El Paso, TX
Items: 1,6,8,9, 10, 11, 14, 18, 19 and 20
[nitial Term: 3 Years
Option: 2 years
Payment Terms: Net - 30 Days
Annual Estimated Award: $24,387.00
Initial Term Estimated Award: $73,161.00 (3 years)
Total Estimated Award: $121,935.00 (5 years)
Awarded to: Vendor 6 W.M. Smith & Assoc. Inc./ dba: WMS Aquatics
Ellensburg, WA
ftems: 13, 15, 16 and 17
Initial Term: 3 Years
Option: None
- Payment Terms: Net — 30 Days
Annual Estimated Award: $1,263.80
Total Estimated Award: $3,791.40
Initial Term Estimated Award: $227,924.04 (3 Years)
Total Estimated Award: $317,674.04 (5 Years) .
Account No.: ' 451-51240-531260-1000
Funding Source: - Parks and Recreation Department.— Aquatics Division
District(s): All

This is a Low Bid, unit type contract

The Financial Services — Purchasing Department Division and Park and Recreation Department
recommend award as indicated to Baron Chemical Company, Inc; Environmental Compliance
Resources, LLC; Leslie’s Poolmart, Inc.; Mayfield Pool Supply, LP; Triple-S Janitorial Supplies; and
W.M. Smith & Assoc. Inc./ dba: WMS Aquatics, the lowest responsive, responsible bidders.

********************************************AD DI TI O NAL l N Fo B E LOW********************************

ltem #21, no bids received, therefore, no award.




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Atl-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

‘BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX

CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX

o | _EXTeuDeD A P
TEM || ESTIMATED | UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL
NO. I quantITy MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES WISTABILIZER ;
1. 110 SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 55| 50 LBS/PAIL $94.50 $10,395.00 $31,185.00 50 LBS/PAIL $114.50 $12,595.00 $37,785.00
LB. (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS BIDDER'S AMOUNT:
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) woLes.
CARBOQOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND - :
2. 100 OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL.ICARBOY {TO BE G ALIC1 :RBOY $68.60 $6,860.00 $20,580.00 | 15 GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EACH
AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50 Lé
3. 100 BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BAsis| 50 LBS/ BAG $20.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) BAG
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE .
4, 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50 LBS IBAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 L.B. BAG (TO BE :
5 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED B,is,s To 50 LBS/ BAG $21.00 $420.00 $1,260.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CHLORINE) FOR
6. ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR 100 LBS./PAIL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 100 LBS./PAIL $139.00 $5,560.00 $16,680.00
40 POOLS 100 LRB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS -
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)
12 BTL/CS.
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS 1
7 20 QT. BOTTLE {AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE ggéi?_ $156.00 $468.00 1 QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
QTs. 12/CS.
8 140 | A-GARCIDE OREQUIVALENT FORALL POOLS|| 4 g1 o $14.50 $2,088.00 $6,264.00 1 GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID
) 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS)
QT BTL. 144 (12 CIS)
NOTE: The information con

APPROVED BYy':

DATE:

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

W in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of COnuUract.



Project Name:

POOL CHEMICALS

DECEMBER 12, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC. CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED EQ?QSSED EXTENDED Eﬁz_lg%\él) EXTENDED
Em || E2UMAIED 3-YEAR TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
ITEM ANNUAL DESCR'PT|ON UNIT OF UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL UNIT OF UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
NO- 1 quanTITY MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED- MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS
9. 20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED || 1000 TABLETS | ¢499 o $2,440.00 $8,052.00 1000 TABLETS $91.00 $1,820.00 $5,460.00
BASIS) PER BOX 250 TBLT/ROX = PER BOX
8/CS=2,-000/CS
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 || 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS :
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX NO BID $0.00 $0.00 PER BOX $91.00 $1,820.00 $5,460.00
. DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, TAB
1. | 40 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (re Nacoms | 1000 TABLETS | $65.50 $655.00 $1,965.00 | 1000 TABLETS |  $91.00 $910.00 $2,730.00
BASIS PER BOX 50 TABLETIPACI12 PER BOX
) PKS/BOX = 600
TABSIBOX
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY,
12, 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX || 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 TABLETS $91.00 $273.00 $819.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX ’
BOX (CS) 240 TABLETSIPACK v :
13. 2 ﬂ(s:.as;l ?ESEETSSS }g&'ﬂﬂ:{?@f SB%X 1000 TABLETS $24.95 $49.90 $149.70 1000 TABLETS $91.00 $182.00 $546.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX 240 TABLETS PER CS/12) PER BOX
PACKS/CS = 240 TABS
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 TABLETS 800 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
YA, )
14. 1 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX 13&%%952 - $99.00 $297.00 PER BOX $142.00 $142.00 $426.00
600/BOX
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST|
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (As || 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 [ABLETS | NOBID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 10(:,°ELA:;§TS NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX .
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: .

APPROVED BY: Iam
,2[:2/5

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-Amerlca City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC. CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
T cxree R
e || ESTIMATED UNIT OF 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
No. || ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL
* | QUANTITY MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
SLIANTITY. Agxll:er;_R?c}"‘-:) x TOTAL x 3) Aﬂﬁ;“;—;gg)x TOTAL x 3)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL :
17. 5 CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETS 10‘;"%"!‘33'6?5 $0.00 -$0.00 $0.00 1_0(1’;°E;A"33'6)E(TS NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 5 TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 || 1900 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 TABLETS | NO BID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) || PERBOX PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. 1 HARDNESS, TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS{ 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 10?,°ELA§§TS NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
20. 1 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX mefELAgéiTs $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 10(1)35?5'6?3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS) :
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO BE D NO BID
21. 48  [DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO PAT] c Az?sl}iR' $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 CAS?SI}IIBERS NO BID NO Bi
O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY) S :
22. 10 PHOSPHATE REB'X'\SI‘Q)ER (ASNEEDED | orgorie $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 QT/BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 0 LBS
23. | a8 RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHL ORITE 50 LBS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 5 $92.00 $38,272.00 | $114,816.00
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) PAIL/BUCKET PAILIBUCKET
$25,162.90 $76,220.70 $61,574.00 $184,722.00
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 BIDDER'S PRIGE: BID?;R;§4P§;CEZ BIE;[:?:ZSSZT):)CE:
NONE ’ - » -
{ Y i -
NOTE: The informatign|contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not conshitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Z,

2013-083 POCL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

All-imerica City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND T RM OF THE AGREEMENT

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION -
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING "
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (f) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), I

X
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE :
CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: ‘ PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%.

[]

NO OPTION OFFERED I:I

L]

PAYMENT TERMS: 11/2% - 10 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

X
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES NOD
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES NO [:l

ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY IF
PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 14 5
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 24
order in cases of emergency.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: m_

DATE: .;/ 2' l E 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12,2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Au-America Gity

(3

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.
CHEYENNE, WY PHOENIX, AZ
iTEM || ESTIMATED UNIT OF EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3 ?é:iN'IPCI)E'?AL
ANNUAL IT PRIC - ‘ UNIT PRICE -
NO. | e DESCRIPTION MEASURE | UNITPRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESMD EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES WISTABILIZER 35 LBS/PAIL
1| 110 | o0 pe be VR o oOORPOOLS 80| espa | NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/PAIL $72.95 | $11,453.15 | $34,359.45
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND
OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./JCARBOY (TOBE 15
2. 100 | Dl vEReD ON AS NemoE BASIS TO EACH | GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO BID 15 GALICARBOY |  NO BID NO BID $0.00
AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50 LB
3. 100 |BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS| 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG $15.49 $1,549.00 $4,647.00
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG $39.95 $79.90 $239.70
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG $15.49 $309.80 $929.40
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CHLORINEJ FOR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR QUTDOOR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS|| 100 LBS.PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 LBS./PAIL $128.95 $5,158.00 $15,474.00
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS 1
7. 20 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID 1QT BOTTLE $5.45 $109.00 $327.00
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS : .00 20,979.00
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 GALLON $49.95 $6,993.0 $
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

-APPROVED BY:,

DATE:

Il

&

NI

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-fimerica City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.
CHEYENNE, WY PHOENIX, AZ
ESTIMATED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED
NO. || ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE | UNIT PRICE EXTENDED | 3.YEARTOTAL| o ASURE UNITPRICE | EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
) QUANTITY TOTAL (ANNUAL TOTAL {ANNUAL
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
9. 20 1000 TABLETS PERBOX (as NeEDED | o NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 $1,559.00 | $4,677.00
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) | PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 $1,559.00 $4,677.00
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS|
1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
1. | 10 1000 TABLETS PER Box(aseeDED | 0 NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 $779.50 $2,338.50
ALK. W/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY
’ 'l 1000 TAB 1000 TABLETS
12.| 3 | TESTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX | "0 TABLETS| () b NOBID - | NOBID PER BOX $77.95 $233.85 $701.55
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
3. | 2 | vesTTABLETS 1000 TaBLETS PERBOX | "W TOBLETS | Nogip | NoBID NoBID | "ELIABLETS | g77.05 $155.90 $467.70
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
14. 1 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $113.95 $113.95 $341.85
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
M ! 0 TABLETS
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (A5 O Reox °|  NOBID NO BID NoBID | "heeE $77.95 $389.75 $1,169.25
. INSTRUMENTAL PHEMOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as | "% TABLETS | o gy NO BID NoBID | "RTABLETS | 47705 $389.75 $1,169.25
NEEDED BASIS)
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America Gity

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC
CHEYENNE, wy

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.
PHOENIX, AZ

ESTIMATED EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
M || ESIIMATED UNIT OF UNIT OF
NO. || ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURe | UNITPRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
* | QUANTITY . (ESTIMATED EXTENDED : (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL -
! 000 TABLET: 1000 TABLETS
7|5 |omomermn mae i s RIS wonp | womp | womp | M| oo | g
INSTRUMENTAL. ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18.] & | TOTALALKALMY,TESTTABLETS 1000 | 000 TABLETS| /b NO BID NOBID | RTABETS | g409.05 $549.75 | $1,649.25
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. T |HARDNESS, TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| "0 TABLETS | e gy NO BID NOBID | "0 TASLETS | g100.95 $109.95 $329.85
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID, 0 TABLETS
20. | 1 | TEsT TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX ™ NOBID NO BID NOBID | “hpoet $109.95 $109.95 $329.85
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO B 50 LB 50 LB
21. 48  |IDELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO PAT CANISTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID CANISTERS NO BID NO BID $0.00
O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
‘ 3 LITER
22, 10 PHOSPHATE REB"/’:gI‘Q)ER (ASNEEDED | ormorrie NO BID NO BID NO BID QT/BOTTLE $42.95 $128.85 $386.55
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS EQUIVALENT TO 50 LBS
23. | 416 RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE |  S8LBS | gq0 b $40,976.00 | $122,928.00 | parsucker | NO BID NO BID $0.00
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) SEE ATTACHED .
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $40,976.00 | $122,928.00 $32,120.80 | $96,362.40
BIDDER'S PRICE: BIDDER'S PRICE:
NONE NONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

-APPROVED BY:

2

DATE:

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12,2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

D THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC

CHEYENNE, Wy

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.
PHOENIX, AZ

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING | .

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE GONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), |

EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TER‘M OF THE
CONTRACT:

PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM

]

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: ‘

L]

1

PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%
' X
NO OPTION OFFERED D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES[ | NO[x] YES NO[ ]
PROCUREMENT CARD: ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY IF
PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 5 3.5
Within __ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal A48 24
. ALL EXPENSES FOR THIS SPECIAL HANDLING AND ALL EXPIDITED
order in cases of emergency. FREIGHT WILL BE CHARGED TO THE CITY OF EL PASO, TX.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and doés not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPRQVED BY: m

DATE: P H 1%

2013-083 POOL. CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-fimcerlca Clity

N

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM || =58~ UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. (% DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRIGE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
—— (ESTIMATED EXTENDED . (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES WISTABILIZER .
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50
1. 110 LB. (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BAsia || 50 LES/PAIL $104.00 $11,440.00 $34,320.00 50 LBS/PAIL $100.67 $11,073.70 $33,221.10
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FAGILITY)
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND
OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. 100 | oeiiveReD ON AS NEEDED BASS YO Do cAUCARBOy |  NOBID NO BID NOBID | 15GALCARBOY |  $84.15 $8,415.00 | $25,245.00
AQUATIC FACILITY) ’
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50 LB
3. 100  ||BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS| 50 LBS/ BAG $23.10 $2,310.00 $6,930.00 50 LBS/ BAG $35.70 $3,570.00 $10,710.00
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) ’
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG $87.00 $174.00 $522.00
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS) A
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5 - 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG $30.19 $603.80 $1,811.40 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) .
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CALORINE] FOR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON As|| 100 LBS./PAIL $139.95 $5,598.00 $16,794.00 100 LBS./PAIL $131.60 $5,263.20 $15,789.60
NEEDED BAS}S TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)
7. 20 T (e AEORMLPOOLS | | moTrie | $5.47 $100.44 $328.32 | 1arBOTTLE $7.30 $145.80 $437.40
st
8. 140 | e O s o masie 0| 1eaLLon $45.60 $6,384.00 | $19,152.00 1 GALLON $41.00 $5,712.00 | $17,136.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: & ,m

DATE: é \q \%

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-America City

2010

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12,2012

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATEb EXTENDED EXTENDED
TE UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3.-YEAR TOTAL
ANNUAL
NO. Q“UI\;NNT?TY DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRIGE TOTAL (ANNUAL
N (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS 999 - 1000
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
9. | 20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as NEEDED | 1000 TABLETS | o oo $1,172.60 | $3,517.80 PR Box $42.00 $840.00 $2,520.00
BASIS) : -
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 TABLETS S915AM 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $58.63 $1,172.60 $3,517.80 PER BOX $42.00 $840.00 $2,520.00
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS| B197A (100
. ’ y 1000 TABLETS COUNT) 1000 TABLETS :
1. 10 1000 TABLETS ‘;i‘;g‘)”‘ (AS NEEDED PER BOX $119.16 $1,191.60 | $3,574.80 PER BOX $42.00 $420.00 $1,260.00
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY, 3920A-M
12. 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX meLAE'(;iTS $58.625 $175.88 $527.64 1°‘,’,°ELASS§TS $92.00 $276.00 $828.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
6846-3 (100
2 ng':'{ﬁigsgfss HOC(;-\(ILS\LS\IH.:TERPDS:;%X 1000 TABLETS CouNT) 1000 TABLETS $92 00 $1 84.00 $552.00
56.5 113.00 339.00 . . .
13. (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $56.50 $ $ PER BOX .
6994-J (100
1 CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 1000{ 1000 TABLETS COUNT) 1000 TABLETS
14. TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $56.50 $56.50 $169.50 PER BOX $92.00 $92.00 $276.00
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST 1000 TABLETS
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as | 1090 TABLETS | (/s ) NO BID NO BID PER Bo $92.00 $460.00 $1,380.00
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST 1000 TABLETS
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 10(’;’ELABB'6§TS NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $92.00 $460.00 $1,380.00
NEEDED BASIS) ‘ :
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY:M

DATE:

PIRIE

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-Amnerica Clty

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ESTIMATED

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
EL PASO, TX

PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX

EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
UNIT OF UNIT OF
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED - EXTENDED
ANNILIAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNHIAL OTY x TOTAL x 3}
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
. 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5 CHLOT)'SE ;gi'f(:A LASEESZS?;:;Q)BLETS PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX 92.00 $460.00 $1,380.00
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 1 5 | TOTALALKALITY, TESTTABLETS 1000 | "000TABLETS | () by NO BID NOBID | "N TELETS | 592,00 $460.00 | $1,380.00
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. T |HARDNESS, TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| "7 TABLETS |\ gy NO BID NO BID R eseTS | $92.00 $92.00 $276.00
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) .
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID, 1000 TABLETS
20. | 1 | Test TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER 50 eS| NOBID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $92.00 $92.00 $276.00
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO BH| 50 LB 50 LB
21. 48  |DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO PAT| CANISTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID CANISTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
22. | 10 PHOSPHATE Rﬂ;‘sR (ASNEEDED | ovsotTie $26.43 $264.30 $792.90 QT/BOTTLE $29.60 $296.00 $888.00
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 L85 : 50 LBS
23. | 416 RTEXSﬁS?sC?é&"E’Q"O‘;TSSﬁEESEE,E pAILUBUCKET | $110.00 $45,760.00 | $137,280.00 | pauucker | $110.16 $45,826.56 | $137,479.68
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $76,351.72 | $229,055.16 $85,152.26 | $255,456.78
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY: &Q m

e oS

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All—Anmﬂcaill;
2010 ;

- Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT |

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
EL PASO, TX

PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING "
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), I“

CONTRACT: |

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE D

TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL D

NO OPTION OFFERED
PAYMENT TERMS:

L]

NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

YES[_| NO[X]

YES [ ] " NO[X]

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

LEFT BLANK

order in cases of emergency.

438

LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-Amernica City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES .
EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
’ (ALTERNATE
ITEM ESTII\)IAfED EXTENDED ED
Sunriar | UNIT OF EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
QUANTITY
S — (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES WISTABILIZER
SLOW DISSOLV!
1. 110 | 8 70 B8 DELIVERED o e o POOLS S0 BspAL $98.70 $10,857.00 | $32,571.00 | 50LBS/PAL NO BID NO BID NO BID
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) :
. DEPOSIT OF $30.00 PER
DRUM; MIN 4 HR PER
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND LOCATION DELIVERY
100 OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EAGH GAL/CARBOY $82.50 $8,250.00 $24,750.00 | 15-GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO-BID
AQUATIC FACILITY)
$15 CHARGE PER
MISSING LID
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50 LB -
3. 100 | BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS|| 50 LBS/ BAG $35.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER GHLORINE
4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG $85.00 $170.00 $510.00 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
AL POOLS STABILIZER FOR QUTDOBR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS| 100 LBS./PAIL $129.00 $5,160.00 $15,480.00 100 LBS./PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC :
EACH 1TV
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS 1 '
7. 20 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE $7.15 $143.00 $429.00 1QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS . ,786.00 29,358.00
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1GALLON $40.00 $5,600.00 $16,800.00 1GALLON $69.90 $9,78 $
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY: 43& i

diz

DATE:

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Au-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES TRIPLE'S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
’ (ALTERNATE)
ESTIMATED — T UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED UNIT OF ANNUA ED
NO ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL MEASURE UNITPRICE | EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
) QUANTITY TOTAL (ANNUAL TOTAL (ANNUAL
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS :
? 0 b 1000 TABLETS
9. 20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED | 1° ;)ELABBO,E(TS $41.00 $820.00 $2,460.00 PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASIS)
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $41.00 $820'00 $2’460'00 PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS]
1. 10 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as NEEDED | 1000 TABLETS ) o0y $410.00 $1,230.00 | "% ASLETS | no gD NO BID NO BID
BASIS)
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY
) , 0 TABLETS
12. | 3 | TESTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS pER BOX | "0 TABLETS | oo $270.00 $810.00 | " hrmox NO BID NO BID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
3.1 2 | TESTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX | "0 TABLETS | o0 0 $180.00 $540.00 | D TSSTS L NoBID NO BID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS) . i
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 1.000 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
14. 1 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) | PEl BOX $90.00 $90.00 $270.00 PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST|
] ] 1000 TABLETS
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as | ""%0 TABLETS | oo 1 $450.00 $1,350.00 PER BOX NOBID | - NOBID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST 1000 TABLETS
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (as | '%00 TABLETS | ¢ 4 $450.00 $1,350.00 | "% AL NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS) ’
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__| M\\)

DATE:____ 9| \q 5

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

At-Amonch ity

‘EEEIV

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL STIPPLIES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ (ALTERNATE)
ITEM ESTIMATED UNIT OF EXTENDED XTENDED UNIT OF EXTENDED
ANNUAL 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESTIMATED EXTENDED {ESTIMATED EXTENDED
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL i ’
. 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5 CHLOF;!EE ;(E)iT&\ LASEE;E SISJXSTIQ;BLETS PER BOX $90.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, .
18. 5 TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 100 TASLETS | ¢g4 $450.00 $1,350.00 | 00 TABLETS |- o BID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS CALCIUM
! 1000 TABLETS . 1000 TABLETS
19. 1 HARDBL!EES}féEiS; ';Ah?é_gEs ;ng)SITé\)BLETSf PER BOX $90.00 $90.00 $270.00 PER BOX NO BIiD NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
10600 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20. 1 TEST TAB(L}\E;‘?I ég(l)DDE“II;ABB/I\_;TS? PER BOX PER BOX $90.00 $90.00 - $270.00 PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO BE| 50 LB ' 50 LB
21. 48 Dsuvgiaouugg s QNUEE%E:: EglsLllsT ;)o PATI  CaniSToRS NO BID NO BID NO BID CANISTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHOS -
22.1 10 AT R S NEEPED | qrpormie | g2g.95 $289.50 $868.50 | QUBOTTLE | $425.00 | $42500 | $1,275.00
ACCUTAB 40 NSF - 50 NON NSF. 50
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLow 50 LBS APPROVED TABLET 50 LBS TABLET )
23. | 416 Rfk:ﬁgTEsclfég'é’R“"ongS‘;:ECD’S;T)E PAIL/BUCKET |  $116.40 $43,888.00 | $131,664.00 | PAIL/BUCKET | $108.00 | $44,928.00 | $134,784.00
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $82,427.50 | $247,282.50 $55,139.00 | $165,417.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: h

DATE:

2

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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CITY OF EL PASO by
BID TABULATION FORM ML

2010 )
Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
EL PASO, TX : EL PASO, TX
! (ALTERNATE)
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. ,
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRAGT FOR: |
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), I“ D
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE I:I
CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE X
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%
NO OPTION OFFERED D ' : D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS :
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES[ ] NO[X] YES [ ] NO
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 1 LEFT BLANK
Within ____ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 1 LEFT BLANK
order in cases of emergency. . ,
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2013-083 POOL. CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 16



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12,2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BiD TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-Amcerica City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS

ELLENS

BURG, WA

ANNUAI EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM ESTIMATED UNIT OF EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
" || QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER : : i : '
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50 || -
1. 110 /5 (vo BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS || 50 LBS/PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/PAIL
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FAGILITY)
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND
OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. 100 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EACH || GALICAREOY NO BID NO BID NO BID 15 GAL/CARBOY
AQUATIC FACILITY) '
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50 LB
3. 100 BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS| 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY}
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO.LOWER CHLORINE
4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS) :
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
FOWCR TOWOERK ooy ‘Lll" l-\.-rlI-UI'\INI:' TUIC
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL {TO BE DELIVERED ON AS|| 100 LBS./PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 LBS./PAIL
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
EACILITYY
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS 1
7. 20 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE $15.93 $318.76 $956.28 1 QT BOTTLE
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS LLON
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON $85.70 $11,998.60 $35,995.80 1GA

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of coniract.

APPROVED BY: é N

DATE: 2 \__\

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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" CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

AN-Amcrica Gity

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12,2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS '
ELLENSBURG, WA
ANMUAL. EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
TEm || ESTIMATED UNIT OF . EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
© | QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS i .
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
9. 20 1000 TABLETS gil;g)ox (AS NEEDED PER BOX $75.19 $1,503.94 $4,511.82 PER BOX
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $75.19 $1,503.94 $4,511.82 PER BOX
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS|
’ ; 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
11. 10 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED PER BOX $75.19 $751.97 $2,255.91 PER BOX
BASIS)
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY
’ ’ | 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
12. 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX $75.19 $225.57 $676.71
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS
, , BLET
13. 2 | TESTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX | 1000 TABLETS | (0 o $150.39 $451.17 || 000 TABLETS
PER BOX PER BOX
: (AS NEEDED BASIS)
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 1000] 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
14. 1 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $109.15 $109.15 $327.45 PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
: : 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS PER BOX $75.19 $375.98 $1,127.94 PER BOX
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
» P, 1000 TABLETS
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 10?,°ELA:'55(TS $72.30 $361.52 $1,084.56 PER BOX
NEEDED BASIS)
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

N

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREA'I;ION
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-fimeddca City

-

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS

ELLENSBURG, WA
ANNUAL EXTENDED EXTENDED
ESTIMATED : EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| _ -
ITEM j| =5 == 3-YEAR TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
No. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MeAsorz | UNITPRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MERSURE | UNITPRICE |TOTAL (EsTIMATED) 3-YEAR TO
T || QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) TOTAL x 3)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL :
: 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
T e et ey TS| remsox | s7519 | swrses | staores | VRIS
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 5 TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 | %% TABLETS | ¢4 o7 $528.30 $1,584.90 | "0 ABLETS
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. 1 HARDNESS, TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| 10?'5;‘“5'6?5 $105.63 $105.63 $316.89 10(:35?5'0'?8
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
’ Y || 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20. 1 TEST TAB%E;?J;;%UELA&;?) PERBOX | " oer Box $104.97 $104.97 $314.91 PER BOX
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO B 50 LB 50LB
21. 48 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO PAT CANISTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID CANISTERS
O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
PHOSPHATE REMOVER (AS NEEDED
22, 10 BASIS) QT/BOTTLE $43.98 $439.80 $1,319.40 QT/BOTTLE
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS 50 LBS
B e tortroson ot | Patmucier | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | pufiiter
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $18,854.50 | $56,563.50
BIDDER'S PRICE: | BIDDER'S PRICE: l
BLANK BLANK
joR contained in this bid tabulation is for information on

NOTE: The inform
APPROVED BY:
N

DATE: 2
i

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

ly and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

Al-fiumerica City

201.0

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS
ELLENSBURG, WA

OF THE AGREEMENT |
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), |

EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE D
CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INGREASE OF 5% PER ITEM

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL . I:I

TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%

X
NO OPTION OFFERED -
PAYMENT TERMS:

]

NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYWMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES NO[ ]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY IF -

YES NO[ ]

PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED

5
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 21
order in cases of emergency.

BIDS SOLICITED: 12 BIDS RECEIVED: 9 BIDS LOCAL: 11

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contra

) e

DATE: d/

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

ct.

20



MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY
1516 E. SAN ANTONIO AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901 -

UNIVAR USA
6980 MARKET AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING
10017 CARNEGIE
EL PASO, TX 79937

DISCOUNT POOLS SPAS & SUPPLIES
111 SOUTH ROADRUNNER PARKWAY
LAS CRUCES, NM 88011-8281

UNIVERSAL SUPPLIES
11233 REDHAWK LANE
EL PASO, TX 79936

BEST BUY DISTRIBUTING
ATTN: MARTHA RAMIREZ
1690 DONNA CAPONI LANE
EL PASO, TX 79936

U-DO-IT POOL SUPPLY
8927 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79904-1403

L & R SUPPLY & CHEMICAL
11355 ROJAS DRIVE #10
EL PASO, TX 79936

BARON’S CHEMICAL CO.
817 TEXAS AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

ARSA INDUSTRIES
3900 ROSA
EL PASO, TX 79905

FM POOL CENTER, INC
9925 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 798925

D&D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
ATTN: JAVIER COSME
6825 MARBLE CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79912




