- CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

AGENDA DATE: March 12, 2013

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: TED MARQUEZ, INTERIM DIRECTOR, DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 621-

6750
BRUCE D. COLLINS, PURCHASING MANAGER, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL
SUBJECT:

Department of Transportation recommends awarding solicitation 2013-078 Ground Maintenance-City Medians
to the following bidders Evergreen Lawn Service and Three C’s Contractors. The table below is the annual

estimated amount and the estimated 3 year total by solicitation group:

Group Vendor Estimated Estimated Option Offered
Annual 3 Year

1 Three C’s Contractors $93,600 $280,800 2 Additional Years

2 Evergreen Lawn Service $169,560 $508,680 2 Additional Years

3 Three C’s Contractors $29,066 $87,198 2 Additional Years

4 Three C’s Contractors $24,650 $73,950 2 Additional Years

5 Evergreen Lawn Service $13,780 $41,340 2 Additional Years
TOTALS $330,656 |  $991,968

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Department of Transportation has reviewed best value solicitation, 2013-078 and recbmmends the contract be
awarded to Evergreen Lawn Service for Groups 2 & 5 and Three C’s Contractors for Groups 1, 3, & 4 as the

most responsible bidders to meet specifications.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 11/20/2012 and 11/27/2012. The postcards were mailed out on 5/22/2011. The
solicitation was posted on City website on 11/20/2011. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 11/21/202. A
total of forty two (42) bidders including forty two (42) local vendors were solicited. A total of seven (7) bids were

received, seven (7) being local vendors.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Council awarded Contract No. 2010-036 Grounds Maintenance - City Wide on February 09, 2010.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
32050-522210-3100-532 Grounds keeping Horticulture Contracts — Environmental Services Fund FY 13 -FY 16

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Name . Signature Date




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(BEST VALUE BID)

dkdkkkokkdokkkkkkidkkkikdkkkiokikkkkkikiikkkihkk POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda (under BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT) for the
Council Meeting of MARCH 12, 2013

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2013-078 (Ground Maintenance-City Medians) to Three
C’s Contractors, Inc. and Evergreen Lawn Service for an initial term estimated award of $991,968.00.

Department:
Award to: Vendor1:
ltem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Award to: Vendor 2:

ltem(s):

Initial Term:

- Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:
Account No.:

Funding Source:
District(s):

Transportation

Three C’s Contractors, Inc.

El Paso, TX

Group 1, Group Ill and Group IV
3 Year

2 Years

2%-10 days —N30

$147,316.00

$441,948.00 (3 Years)
$736,580.00 (5 Years)

Evergreen Lawn Service
El Paso, TX

Group Il and Group V

3 Year

2 Years

1%-10 days

. $183,340.00

$550,020.00 (3 Years)
$916,700.00 (5 Years)

$330,656.00

$991,968.00 (3 Years)

$1,653,280.00 (5 Years)
532-32050-522210-3100
532-32050-532020-3100

Environmental Services Fund FY13-FY16
All

This is a Best Value, services contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and Department of Transportation recommend award as
indicated to Three C’s Contractors, Inc. and Evergreen Lawn Service, the bidders offering the best value

bid.

*******************************************AD D ITI O NAL I N FO B E LOW**********************************************




SOLICITATION No: 2013-078

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION TITLE: Ground Maintenance -City Medians

Group |- Groudskeeping Xeriscaped Medians, Triangles, Traffic Circles, Roundabouts, & Parkway (West of Railroad Dr./US Highway 54)

Affordable Delta Unlimited, Evergreen Lawn Green Earth H. Repair Ransom Lawn
. Landscape Inc Service Landscape Solutions, Inc Service
Maximum|  Maintenance P !
Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX S
Group 1: Group 1: Group 1: Group 1: Group 1: Group 1:
No Bid $114,216.96 $131,919.84 $376,480.00 $117,145.60 $177,199.88 $93,600.00
$114,216.96 $131,919.84 $376,480.00 $117,146.60 $177,199.88 $93,600.00
Total Cost 60
Not Scored 49.17 42.57 14.92 47.94 31.69 60.00
Certifications & _ ’
Licenses 15 Not Scored 10 10 0 0 10 10
Reputation & Quality 10 Not Scored 6.67 10 333 0 6.67 10
of Bider's Service
Employee Medical
Benefits and 5 Not Scored 3 1 5 1 . 1 2
Incentives
Past Relationship / ' ‘
Performance with the 10 Not Scored 10 10 0 3.33 10 10
City
GRAND TOTAL . 0.00 78.84 73.57 23.25 52.27 59.36

Certifications 5 each:

5= Irrigator's License

5= Pesticide Applictor

5= Tree Care Safety Professional

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET (1)



SOLICITATION No: 2013-078

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION TITLE: Ground Maintenance -City Medians

Group II- Groudskeeping Xeriscaped Medians, Triangles, Traffic Circles, Roundabouts, & Parkway (East of Railroad Dr./US Highway 54)

Affordable Delta Unlimited, Green Earth H. Repair Ransom Lawn Three C's
Landscape . .
Maximum|  Maintenance Inc e Landscape Solutions, Inc Service Contractors, Inc.
Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX . ElPaso, TX. - El Paso, TX El Paso, TX E! Paso, TX El Paso, TX
Group 2: Group 2: Group 2: Group 2: Group 2: Group 2; Group 2:
$0.00 $255,771.36 $169,560.56 $525,200.00 $259,001.60 $231,199.80 $223,600.00
$255,771.36 $169,560.56 $525,200.00 $259,001.60 $231,199.80 $223,600.00
Total Cost 60 ‘
Not Scored 39.77628144 60.00 10.37 39.28 44,00 45.50
Certifications & 15 Not Scored 10 10 0 0 10 10
Licenses
Reputation & Quality | Not Scored 6.67 10 3.33 0 6.67 10
of Biderr's Service
Employee Medical
Benefits and 5 Not Scored 3 1 5 1 1 3
Incentives
Past Relationship /
Performance with the 10 Not Scored 10 10 0 3.33 10 10
City N
GRAND TOTAL 0.00 69.45 27.70 43.61 71.67 78.50

Certifications 5 each:

5= lrrigator's License
5= Pesticide Applictor

5= Tree Care Safety Professional

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET (2)




SoLICITATION No: 2013-078

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION TITLE: Ground Maintenance -City Medians

Group lI- Maintenance Turf Medians

Affordable Delta Unlimited, Evergreen Lawn Green Earth H. Repair Ransom Lawn
Landscape . . .
. . Inc Service Landscape Solutions, Inc Service
Maximum Maintenance
Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX 'El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX
Group 3: Group 3: Group 3: Group 3: Group 3: Group 3:
$310,648.00 $79,000.00 $30,250.00 $59,960.00 $ 41,000.00 $48,818.00 $29,066.00
$310,648.00 $79,000.00 $30,250.00 $59,960.00 $41,000.00 $48,818.00 $29,066.00
Total Cost 60
5.61 22.07544304 57.65 29.09 42.54 35.72 60.00
Certifications &
Licenses 15 0 10 10 0 0 10 10
Reputation & Quality 10 0 6.67 10 3.33 0 6.67 10
of Biderr's Service
Employee Medical 4
Benefits and 5 0 3 1 5 1 1 2
Incentives
Past Relationship /
Performance with the 10 2 10 10 0 3.33 10 10
City
GRAND TOTAL 7.61 51.75 88.65 37.42 N 46.87 63.39

Certifications 5 each:

5= Irrigator's License
5= Pesticide Applictor

5= Tree Care Safety Professional

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET (3)



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION No: 2013-078
SOLICITATION TITLE: Ground Maintenance -City Medians

Group V= City on Demand Pruining and Tree/Bush Removal

Affordable Delta Unlimited, Evergreen Lawn Green Earth H. Repair Ransom Lawn
Landscape . . . :
Maximum Maintenance Inc Service Landscape Solutions, Inc Service _ntr_a_’ : _o[s, Inc. v,
Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX ‘El:Paso; TX
' Group 4: Group 4: Group 4: Group 4: Group 4: Group 4: Group 4:
$0.00 $38,875.00 $133,000.00 $36,500.00 $44,250,00 $156,250.00 $24,650.00
No Bid $38,875.00 $133,000.00 $36,500.00 $44,250.00 $156,250.00 $24,650.00

Total Cost 60

Not Scored 38.04501608 11.12 40.52 33.42 9.47 60.00
Certifications & _ ’
Licenses 15 Not Scored 10 10 0 0 10 10
Reputation & Quality 10 Not Scored 6.67 10 3.33 0 6.67 10
of Biderr's Service
Employee Medical
Benefits and 5 Not Scored 3 1 5 1 1 2
Incentives
Past Relationship / .
Performance with the 10 Not Scored 10 10 0 3.33 10 10
City .

GRAND TOTAL 0.00 67.72 4212 48.85 37.75 37.14

Certifications 5 each:

5= Irrigator's License

5= Pesticide Applictor

5= Tree Care Safety Professional

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET (4)



SOLICITATION NO: 2013-078

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION TITLE: Ground Maintenance -City Medians

Group V= Street Tree Maintenance

Affordable Delta Unlimited, Green Earth H. Repair Ransom Lawn Three C's
Landscape . 5
Maximum  Maintenance Inc : rv Landscape Solutions, Inc Service Contractors, Inc.
Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX L ElLPas El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX
Group 5: Group 5: Group 5: Group 5: Group 5: Group 5: Group 5:
$0.00 $97,786.00 $ 13,780.00 $149,240.00 $20,800.00 $78,936.00 $44,928.00
No Bid $97,786.00 $13,780.00 $149,240.00 $20,800.00 $78,936.00 $44,928.00
Total Cost 60
Not Scored 8.455198086 60.00 3.67 39.75 10.47 18.40
. Senlflcatlons & 15 Not Scored 10 10 0 0 10 10
icenses
Reputation & Quality |, Not Scored 6.67 10 3.33 0 6.67 10
of Biderr's Service
Employee Medical
Benefits and 5 Not Scored 3 1 5 1 1 2
Incentives
Past Relationship /
Performance with the 10 Not Scored 10 10 0 3.33 10 10
City
GRAND TOTAL 0.00 38.13 12.00 44.08 38.14 50.40

Certifications 5 each:

5= Irrigator's License

5= Pesticide Applictor
5= Tree Care Safety Professional

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET (5)




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America Clty

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

AFFORDABLE LANDSCAPE

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba

EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE

DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
MéﬂhgfsN: N&E SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUNDSKEEPING XERISC. DIANS; TRIANGH RKW LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT!| MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT|| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) . - 52) P 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS, o YEAR
TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES,
1. ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY: WEST OF NO BID NO BID $2,196.48 $114,216.96 $2,536.92 $131,919.84 $7,240.00 $376,480.00
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54

GROUP I - TOTAL

$114,216.96

$131,919.84

$376,480.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procur

$1,129,440.00, 3 YEAR

ement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY%LC’/

DATE: /Z '[Z‘ ZQJ

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



P

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

- CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Aft-Amerxica Clty

2010

Solicitation #: 2013.078
Department: TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba ’
AFFO?QS#E;’:SSS CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE | GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT! MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT |} MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. LOCATION WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
’ 52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,
TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES,
1. ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY: EAST OF NO BID NO BID $4,918.68 $255,771.36 $3,260.78 $169,560.56 $10,100.00 $525,200.00
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54 PER YEAR
GROUP Ii - TOTAL

| $255,771.36

$169,560.56 $525,200.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
.$1>,575,600.00 .
(GROUP | + GROUP I1) ’

$301,480.40

$901,680.00
BIDDER'S PRICE: $2,705.040.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factorsrshall be ;valuated t:) determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: W]VLG/

oi1/13

DATE:

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 189, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE

CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-Rmerica City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Department: TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORMDlﬁﬁ.lEE';':'\';I gg CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
AINTENANCE TURF M
MONTHLY AMOUNT | ESTIMATED ANNUAL| MONTHLY AMOUNT |ESTIMATED ANNUAL| MONTHLY AMOUNT |ESTIMATED ANNUAL|l MONTHLY AMOUNT | ESTIMATED ANNUAL
ITEM LOCATION (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING AMOUNT TQTAL (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL

NO. . SEASONONE | (GROWING SEASON|| ~ SEASONONE | (GROWING SEASON|  SEASONONE | (GROWING SEASON|  SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON
TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS) | TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X7 MONTHS)|| TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS)|| TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS)

1. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $29,595.00 $207,168.00 $5,600.00 $39,200.00 $3,000.00 $21,000.00 $7,780.00 $54,460.00

&%%TUHL_: ESTIMATED ANNUALIMONTHLY AMOUNT|ESTIMATED ANNUAL{ MONTHLY AMOUNT | ESTIMATED ANNUAL MONTHLY AMOUNT| ESTIMATED ANNUAL
LOCATION N AMOUNT TOTAL || (DORMANT SEASON { AMOUNT TOTAL || (DORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL (DORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL
(DORMANT SEASON (DORMANT SEASON||  ONE TIME ONLY | (DORMANT SEASON| ONE TIME ONLY (DORMANT SEASON|  ONE TIME ONLY | (DORMANT SEASON
ONE;,;'TEE?NLY PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS)
2. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $20,696.00 | $103,480.00 $7,960.00 $39,800.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00

GROUP lII - CITYWIDE TURF
MEDIANS
(ITEM 1+ ITEM 2)

$310,648.00

$79,000.00

$30,250.00

$59,960.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Pr

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

7
APPROVED BY:QZ}%W

if17/13

DATE:

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION -



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Tl Paso

Ant-fimcrica Gity

20U0

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORDABLE LANDSCAPE ’
DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
MAINTENANCE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
RGN
TEM ONE TIME ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO. LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT | ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT | ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
TOTAL " TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
1. | PRUNING SMALL TREES/BUSH NO BID NO BID $25.00 $2,500.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
(0 TO 1 2 lN TRU N K DIAM ETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
- ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED AtNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
2. | PRUNING MEDIUM TREES/BUSH NO BID NO BID $32.50 $3,250.00 . $185.00 $18,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
(1 2 IN TO 24 IN TRU N K DIAM ETE R) {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 {ONE TIME AIADUNT X100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTHAATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

3. | PRUNING LARGE TREES/BUSH NO BID NO BID $50.00 $7,500.00 $275.00 $41,250.00 $35.00 $5,250.00
(LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK . v
D]AMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150 (OME TIME AMOUNT X 150 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150
ESTIMATED ANMUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL,
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
4. SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL NO BID NO BID $175.00 $4,375.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
(0 TO 1 2 lN TRUN K DIAM ETER) ’ {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 . {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 {ONE THAE AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANHNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:K.zj[k !%

DATE: /Z /7//3

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY OF EL PASO

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department:. TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
FFORDABLE LANDSC ! .
A . AINTEI\II-AI\EJ\ICES APE | DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN|  EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
CITYWIDE ON DEWAND PRUN T
ITEM ONE TIME ' ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO. LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOU_NT ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
5. (MEDIUM TREE/BUSH REMOVAL (12 NO BID NOBID $400.00 $10,000.00 $750.00 $18,750.00 $350.00 $8,750.00
TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 ’ {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTHAATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS} REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL ,
6. (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK NO BID NO BiD $450.00 $11,250.00 $1,500.00 $37,500.00 $450.00 $114,250.00
DIAMETER) CESTHATED aNNGAL CESTIHATED AUAL CESTHATED AlUAL CestmTeD atnuAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
GROUP IV - ON DEMAND PRUNING AND -
TREE/SHRUB REMOVAL $38,875.00 $133,000.00 $36,500.00
(ITEMS 1-6)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors;aﬂ be evaiuated to determine an ;v_;rdee. )
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:&Z/}K&

DATE: /g)7gé'=;),

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION FORM J11

2010

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012 » | Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba

AFFOTADQS#EI\:':;\IE: CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN{| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
"EL PASO. TX SERVICE - ELPASO, TX EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM - LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT| (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT [(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
1. | various LOCATIONS CITYWIDE NO BID NOBID $1,880.50 $97,786.00 $265.00 $13,780.00 $2,870.00 - $149,240.00
' . PERYEAR

$13,780.00

$97,786.00 $149,240.00

GROUP V - TOTAL
BIDDER'S PRICE:

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

N

APPROVED BY:

DATE: /[ /7[ /‘3 2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 6



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Pa

SO

Solicitation #: 2013-078

‘Department: TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFOITWDS:;'E&:'\?EES CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASQ, TX
! EL PASO, TX '

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT
QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), “
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: |
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

]

]

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED l::l [j D D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT )

ves[ | No[X ves| | no[ X] ves[ x | no[ | ves Ino[]
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: d
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY Z}»u’_,

oate:_1/17/)3

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT-OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

An-Amertca City

BID TABULATION FORM NI
2010
Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

GROUNDSKEEPING XERISCAPED

ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED

MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT

WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
: 52) 52) 52) 52

LOCATION

ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,

TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, y »
1 | rounoaBouTS & ParKwAY: wEsTOF|  $225280 | $117,14560 | $3407.69 | $177199.88 | $1.80000 | $93,600.00

RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54

GROUP | - TOTAL $93,600.00

$117,145.60 $177,199.88

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Z?vtf/

DATE: / /7 /~3 2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - GITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CiTY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

EL Paso
Afi-ATwercS ity
LY

ZON0

Solicitation #: 2013-078

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

Department: TRANSPORTATION

ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT MAINTENANCE ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,
TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES,
1. | ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY: EASToF | $4,980.80 $259,001.60 $4,446.15 $231,199.80 $4,300.00 $223,600.00
RAILROAD DR./JUS HIGHWAY 54

GROUP Ii - TOTAL

$259,001.60

$231,199.80

$223,600.00

GRAND TOTAL
(GROUP I + GROUP Ii)

$376,147.20

$408,399.68

BIDDER'S PRICE: $0

$317,200.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall bgsvaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED B\&Z” NS
Y17/

DATE:

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

ASl-Arncrics Ciy

2030

Solicitation #: 2013-078

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

Department: TRANSPORTATION

$4,285.71

$30,000.00

$5,139.00

$35,973.00

$2,978.00

$20,846.00

i : IONS
MONTHLY AMOUNT | ESTIMATED ANNUAL|| MONTHLY AMOUNT |ESTIMATED ANNUAL|[ MONTHLY AMOUNT ESTIMATED ANNUAL|| MONTHLY AMOUNT ESTIMATED ANNUAL
ITEM LOCATION (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL {GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL
NO. ) SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON SEASON ONE {GROWING SEASON SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON
TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICEX 7 MONTHS) || TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X7 MONTHS) || TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X7 MONTHS) [ TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICEX 7 MONTHS)
1. | . CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS

“Z%%UJ_Y ESTIMATED ANNUAL|MONTHLY AMOUNT|ESTIMATED ANNUAL|MONTHLY AMOUNT | ESTIMATED ANNUAL|| MONTHLY AMOUNT| ESTIMATED ANNUAL
LOCATION D \ AMOUNT TOTAL || (DORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL | (DORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL (DORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL
(DORMANT SEASON | (n0RmANT SEASON|| | ONE TIME ONLY (DORMANT SEASON||  ONETIME ONLY | (DORMANT SEASON|| ONE TIME ONLY | (DORMANT SEASON
ONE;‘;'\:‘CEE?NLY PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS)
2. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $2,569.00 $12,845.00 $1,644.00 $8,220.00

GROUP IIl - CITYWIDE TURF
MEDIANS
(ITEM 1+ ITEM 2)

$41,000.00

$48,818.00

$29,066.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and otherv factoré shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:QZ_)}K‘(L
DATE: 1y [

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

10



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Taso

As-Rancrice City

2ZATO

Solicitation #: 2013-078

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.

Department: TRANSPORTATION
THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC. |

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
TEM ONE TIIE ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED _ ESTIMATED
NO LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT {ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TiME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
i TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
1. PRUNING SMALL TREES/BUSH $30.00 $3,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00
(0 TO 1 2 lN TRU N K D lAM ETER) {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS} REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

2. [ PRUNING MEDIUM TREES/BUSH

$45.00 $4,500.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00
(12 IN TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAM ETER) {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 160 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

3 PRUNING LARGE TREES/BUSH
’ (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK
DIAMETER)

$65.00

$9,750.00

(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150
ESTIMATED ANNUAL

REQUESTS)

$500.00 $75,000.00
(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150
ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS)

$25.00

$3,750.00

(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150

ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS)

(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 150
ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS)

4, SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL $80.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $3,750.00 $200.00 $5,000.00
(0 TO 12 IN TRUNK DIAM ETER) {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED vip e

DATE: / /7/i

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO Exeeea
BID TABULATION FORM NIk

2010
Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTE CE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC
EL PASO, TX - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED

ITEM ONE TIME

NO. LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT | ONE TIME AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT || ONE TIME AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

5. |MEDIUM TREE/BUSH REMOVAL (12 $200.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAM ETER) {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL

REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
6. (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK $800.00 $20,000.00 $1,000.00 $25,000.00 $250.00 $6,250.00

(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 {ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
D]AM ETE R) ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS)

{ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS)

{ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANHUAL
REQUESTS)

GROUP IV - ON DEMAND PRUNING AND

TREE/SHRUB REMOVAL $44,250.00 $156,250.00 $24,650.00
(ITEMS 1-6) . .

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. P

rice and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:(Z) e

DATE: iz 7 Z/ Z 2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 12



aon

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

ElL Paso

All-America City

N

2010

EV

Solicitation #: 2013-078

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

Department: TRANSPORTATION

ESTIMATED

$400.00 $20,800.00 $1,518.00 $78,936.00

ESTIMATED . ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM S LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT|| MAINTENANGE ANNUAL AMOUNT|| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT {WEEKLY AMOUNT x|l WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
1. | VARIOUS LOCATIONS CITYWIDE $864.00 $44,928.00

GROUP V - TOTAL

$20,800.00 $78,936.00

$44,928.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to-dretermine an aﬁar ee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(
APPROVED BY:\ZM
pare: ! / / 7; /3

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

13



El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM RAEET
2010
Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

EL PASQ, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
HCONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE
HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRAGT

QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION
* |is EXERCISED WITHIN:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), X ] ' L] |:|
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

iOF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRAGT: |

iTwo (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION l:|
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRAGCT:

| X X [ ]
NO OPTION OFFERED ; [:l l:l l:] \:I

PAYMENT TERMS: 1% - 10 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS/NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YES D NO YES nol[ ] YES NO ] ves L1 no[ ]

BIDS SOLICITED: 42 BIDS RECEIVED: 7 BIDS LOCAL: 42 NO BIDS: 0
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: W

DATE: i ,7

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 14
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RICKY ENTERPRISES
ATTN: RICKY NAVAR
1773 PALI DRIVE

EL PASO, TX 79936

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION &
LANDSCAPING

ATTN: LALO MARTINEZ
7724 TOLTEC DRIVE

EL PASO, TX 79912

THE GROWING CONCERN .
1918 BASSETT AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

ARRIBA MAINTENANCE
ATTN: SAMLUJAN gL [#%e
P. 0. BOX 352 pounty
SAN ELIZARIO, TX 79849 ~

LLEDESMA’S TREE & GARDEN SERVICE

P. 0. BOX 290480
EL PASO, TX 79929-0480 ’

DOUBLE T CONSTRUCTION & LA MACETA
GARDENT CENTER

ATTN: TONY VILLEGAS .

11410 MONTANA

EL PASO, TX 79936

ARTS LANDSCAPING
8729 CATHEDRAL /
EL PASO, TX 79907

HMB SPECIALIST COMMERCIAL
& INDUSTRIAL CONTRACTOR
ATTN: HECTOR M. BRIONES
5237 CLEVELAND AVENUE

zL PASO, TX 79905-3103

ZAGLE CONSTRUCTION CO.
11863 SAL BERROTERAN
il. PASQ, TX 79936

RAINVAKER MAINTENANCE 7

ATTN: DOUGLAS GELO
2915 E. WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

GREEN SCENE, INC. 7
10950 PELLICANO DR., SUITE B
EL PASO, TX 79935

§0TO’S LAWN SERVICE
208 GRAPHITE DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79932

HUMPHREY LESTER LANDSCAPING
160 MCCUTCHEON WAY
EL PASO, TX 79932

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE
1315 MAGOFFIN AV
EL PASO, TX 79901

ACCENT LANDSCAPING
& SPRINKLER INC.

150 EASY WAY LANE
EL PASO, TX 79932

ITS QUEST

ATTN: CYNTHIA CHAVEZ
6601 MONTANA SUITE E
EL PASO, TX 79925

EL PASO DRAIN SERVICE
ATTN: MICHAEL GONZALEZ
P.0.BOX 640446 -

EL PASO, TX 79904-0446

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC,
P. 0, BOX 220107 P

EL PASO, TX 79913

JFL ENTERPRISE -
151 S. RESLER DRIVE #168
EL PASO, TX 79912

BORDER TM INDUSTRIES INC. .
ATTN: BARRY STEPHENS

P. 0. BOX 9091

EL PASO, TX 79982

LIFE MANAGEMENT CENTER
FOR MHIMR SERVICES
ATTN: RICHARD T. GLENN
P. 0. BOX 9997

EL PASO, TX 79980

N.L.R. BUILDERS INC.
9708 CARNEGIE AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

JOE'S TREE SERVICE
ATTN: KEITH HENDERSON
4855 N. MESA SUITE #102
EL PASO, TX 79902

GEMCO CONSTRUCTION INC.
615 SCHUSTER AVENUE #9-A~
EL PASO, TX 79902

MASTER CUTS LAWN & TREE SERVICE
ATTN: SID STEDMAN

447 EXECUTIVE CENTER BLVD.

EL PASO, TX 79902

LAWN SERVICE OF EL PASO

14572 ALAMEDA AVENUE (¢35

b \
CLINT, TX 79836 £+, 7 /

CH & JM CONSTRUCTION
ATTN: GRISELDA JUAREZ
11315 SHEFFIELD DR.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79927

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE-CITY MEDIANS

yol 4o




H REPAIR SOLUTIONS-
ATTN: ARTURO ESCALANTE
12243 DE LA CROIX

EL PASO, TX 79936-0948

-

GOODWILL INDUSTRIES
ATTN: DES! SMITH /
7015 ALAMEDA AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79915

EL PASO TRENCH SAFETY
ATTN: LOUIS CEPEDA

P. 0. BOX 370196

EL PASO, TX 79937

CNC LANDSCAPING
ATTN: LUIS CRUZ, JR.
1450 CORONEL DRIVE
EL PASQO, TX 79928

TONEY'S MAINTENANCE
ATTN: ANN WASHINGTON
P.0. BOX 540397

EL PASO, TX 79904-0397

TRUGREEN CHEMLAWN

ATTN: VERNON AUTREY, JR.
1330 NORTHWESTERN DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79912 ~

BUILDING EXPRESSIONS
ATTN: ADRIAN MENDOZA
P. 0. BOX 1247
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC.
ATTN: RAFAEL LOPEZ

8201 LOCKHEED DRIVE SUITE 110
EL PASO, TX 79925

JORGE LEDESMA DBA AFFORDABLE
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE

12724 TIERRA ZULEMA COURT
EL PASO, TX 79038

RAFAEL MORALES
10916 LOMA DE COLOR
EL PASO, TX 79934

7

NATIVE LANDSCAPE

ATTN: ADAM NIETO

1713 GAMBLE QUAIL DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79936

PRIDE MAINTENANCE
ATTN: JAVIER NAVARRO -
1918 E. YANDELL DRIVE |
EL PASO, TX 79903

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC.
5869 WAYCROSS -
EL PASO, TX 79924

ARBOR-TECH TREE EXPERTS
ATTN: JOE TALAMANTES
6887 DONIPHAN

CANUTILLO, TX 79835

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & [RRIGATION,
GROUND MAINTENANCE

1751 Glen CAMPBELL

EL PASO, TX 79936

S

Adrsewn,

2013~078 GROUND MAINTENANCE-CITY MEDIANS




