CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: _STREETS
AGENDA DATE: March 20, 2007

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director > _lerrence Freibura, 541-4313
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: _Citywide

SUBJECT:
Bid 2007-081 GALVANIZED SIGN POST (LIGHT WEIGHT)
BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Recommend that the contract be awarded to Pathmark Traffic Products, as the
next lowest, responsible, and responsive bidder meeting specifications.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Fund 01101 (General Fund), 32010287 (Signs & Markings), 503203 Public Accesses Maint and Repairs,
32000 (class).

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: (if required) A j, ANCE: (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD: M 4‘&
=

37

Cc: Patricia D. Adauto, Deputy City Manager Development and Infrastructure Services
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM
DATE: March 7, 2007

PROJECT: 2" Galvanized Sign Posts (Light Weight)

NO:2007-081 DEPARTMENT: Street

BUDGET NO: 32010287-503203-01101-32000

FUNDING SOURCE: Street Department General Operations Funds-Public Access Maintenance & Repairs
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor: Pathmark Traffic Products
San Marcos, Texas
Item(s): #1 to #15

Annual Estimated Amount: $ 70,892.00
This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of twenty four (24) months.

The Departments of Financial Services and Street recommend award as indicated to the lowest
responsive, responsible bidder.

Sunwest Sales Company the low bidder was considered non responsive because they did not bid on the
galvanized piping, the most critical part of the solicitation.

BIDS SOLICITED- 26 (17 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 03
“NO BID” RECEIVED 02
CURRENT TAXES PAID-
OUT-OF-TOWN- .
TOTAL ESTIMATED RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 141,784.00
COUNCIL APPROVED [] REJECTED [_] MUNICIPAL CLERK

e e de v e e e de e e ok ****************’**************************************************************************************

APPRG@VED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: March 20, 2007

Ve Ay

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services Depag




CrTY COUNCIL

JOHN COOK
MAYOR

ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT §

JOYCE WILSON EDDIE HOLGUIN, JR., DISTRICT 6

CITY MANAGER STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
DARYL W. COLE
STREETS DIRECTOR
STREET DEPARTMENT
March 6, 2007
TO: Terrence Freiburg, Deputy Director Financial Services
ATTN: Jesus M. Juarez, Procurement Analyst %
FROM: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director 0/ 3 / ¢ / 77

SUBJECT:  Bid No. 2007-081 2” GALV ED SIGN POST (LIGHT WEIGHT)

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to
Pathmark Traffic Products, as the next lowest, responsible, responsive bidder meeting
specifications.

The estimated yearly amount is $70,892.00. Total contract award of $141,784.00, two year
contract.

If you have any questions please call me at 621-6750.

DWCl/en




CiTY COUNCIL

JOHN COOK
MAYOR

ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4

PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT 5
EDDIE HOLGUIN, JR., DISTRICT 6

JOYCE WILSON

CITY MANAGER STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE. DISTRICT 8
DARYL W. COLE
STREETS DIRECTOR

STREET DEPARTMENT

Memorandum

To: Edward Nunez

From: Albert Delgado

Date: 3/5/2007

Re: Solicitation 2007-081: 2” Galvanized Sign Post

I have reviewed the bids for solicitation 2007-081 and recommend the contract be awarded to
Pathmark Traffic Products of San Marcus, Texas. Pathmark Traffic Products is the lowest
overall responsive bidder. The total amount of the award is $70,892.00.

The funding source is:
Dept ID 32010287
Account 503203
Fund 01101

Class 32000
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST (LIGHT WEIGHT)
BID DATE: JANUARY 31, 2007

BID # 2007-081

DEPARTMENT: STREET

ALLIED TUBE & CENTERLINE SUPPLY PATHMARK TRAFFIC ‘SUNWEST SALES
CONDUIT CORPORATION| GRAND PRAIRIE, TX PRODUCTS COMPANY
HARVEY, IL SAN MARCOS, TX HAYWARD, CA
ITEM EST. )
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 700 GALVANIZED PIPE $11.44 $8,008.00 $18.21 $12,747.00 $16.39 $11,4f3.00 NO BID
EA. 2" X10'6" ,
2, 900 GALVANIZED PIPE $13.07 $11,763.00 $19.87l $17,883.00 $17.38 $15,642.00 NO BID
EA. 2" X12'
3. 200 GALVANIZED PIPE $15.25 $3,050.00 $23.18 $4,636.00 $19.89 $3,978.00 NO BID
EA. 2" X14' ‘ :
4, 200 10 GAUGE 2 7/8" X $31.50 $6,300.00 $41.26 $8,252.00 $49.99 $9,998.00 NO BID
EA. 14' TUBING '
5. 300 UNIVERSAL SIGN CLAMP $1.29 $387.00 $1.47 $441.00 $2.14 $642.00 $2.80 $840.00
EA. . ’
6. 20 PREFABRICATED "U" $118.49 $2,369.80 $69.06 $1,381.20 $117.93 $2,358.60 $59.00 $1,180.00
EA. BRACKET
7. 40 PREFABRICATED "T" $58.99 $2,359.60 $28.04 $1,121.60 $45.46 $1,818.40 $35.00 i$1,400..00
EA. BRACKET . ~
8. 150 SLIP BASE ASSEMBLY $121.18 $18,177.00 $30.14 $4,521.00 $44.94 $6,741.00 . | $70.00 - | $10,500.00
- EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $11,100.00)
9. 150 STUB $75.00 $11,250.00 $35.24 $5,286.00 $47.21 $7,081.50 $40.00 $6,000.00
EA. :
10. 50 SIGN CLAMP $2.99 $149.50 '$0.33 $16.50 $0.53 $26.50 $1.40 $70.00
EA. 21/2" U-BOLT ,

APPROVED BY%“L%
DATE; J/_?, 07 /

2007-081 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST - LIGHT WEIGHT - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST (LIGHT WEIGHT)

BID # 2007-081
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BID DATE: JANUARY 31, 2007

ALLIED TUBE & CENTERLINE SUPPLY PATHMARK TRAFFIC SUNWEST SALES
CONDUIT CORPORATION| GRAND PRAIRIE, TX PRODUCTS COMPANY
__HARVEY, IL SAN MARCOS, TX HAYWARD, CA
ITEM EST. ‘ .
NO. | QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 300 SIGN CLAMP $2.99 $897.00 $0.47 $141.00 $0.74 $222.00 '$1.60 $480.00
EA. 3" U-BOLT
12. 650 STREET NAME SIGN $3.94 $2,561.00 $3.53 $2,294.50 $3.99 $2,593.50 $4.20 $2,730.00
EA. CROSS BRACKET . *
13. 650 STREET NAME SIGN $4.06 $2,639.00 $3.53 $2,294.50 $4.09 $2,658.50 $3.00 $1,950.00
EA. POLE CAP *
14, 100 STREET NAME SIGN $5.06 $506.00 $5.00 $500.00 $4.99 $499.00 . $5.00 - $500.00
EA. POLE 3" CAP *
ALUMINUM SIGN : :
15. | 4000 CLAMPS FOR TRAFFIC $1.38 $5,520.00 $2.75 $11,000.00 $1.29 $5,160.00 $1.95 - $7,800.00
EA. CONTROL SIGNS (PAIR) \
GRAND TOTAL $75,936.90 - $72,515.30 $70,892.00 _ $33,450.00
‘ (BIDDER'S GRAND TOTAL: $34.050.00)
‘ * W/ISET SCREWS,
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY - NOT CAP SCREWS
EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO.EXTEND THE MINIMUM ORDER: 40,000 LBS.
TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON .
THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION
OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACT FOR:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:, S 7/ 7

2007-081 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST - LIGHT WEIGHT - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST (LIGHT WEIGHT)

BID DATE: JANUARY 31, 2007

BID # 2007-081
DEPARTMENT: STREET

. ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORPORATION
HARVEY, IL

CENTERLINE SUPPLY
GRAND PRAIRIE, TX

PATHMARK TRAFFIC
PRODUCTS
SAN MARCOS, TX

SUNWEST SALES
COMPANY
HAYWARD, CA

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME
UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED WITHIN:

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME

NONE@TED

i

UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS 1 ] ] ]
EXERCISED WITHIN:
- - I S — — — —

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD YES NO YES NO YES NO YES X NO

OF THE CONTRACT. '
B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD YES NO YES NO YES’_ NO YES NO

OF THE CONTRACT. '
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. ﬁ ﬁ ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

30 CONSECUTIVE 15 - 21 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE NOTE: FIRST ORDER

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS 60 DAYS ARO;
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. 30 DAYS FOR

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

SUCCEEDING ORDERS.

BIDS SOLICITED: 26

BIDS RECEIVED: 3

BIDS LOCAL: 17 -

NO BIDS: 2

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7"/7/ VA

2007-081 2" GALVANIZED SIGN POST - LIGHT WEIGHT - STREET DEPARTMENT




AREA IRON & STEEL WORKS, INC.
4653 OSBORNE DR.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79913

SPECIALIZED STEEL CONTRACTORS
9401 CARNEGIE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

AAA STEEL & ORNAMENTAL, INC
7117 NORTH LOOP DR.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

STEEL SPECIALTIES, INC.
701 PENDALE RD
EL PASO, TEXAS 79907

EL PASO MACHINE & STEEL WORKS
1600 E. FOURTH AVENUE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

RAMSEY STEEL, INC.
4137 ROSA
EL PASO, TEXAS 79923

VALLEY FENCE CO.
6684 DONIPHAN DR.
CANUTILLO, TEXAS 79835

AMERICAN FENCE CO.,, INC.
350 S. ARCHULETA
LAS CRUCES, NEW MEXICO 88005

TRINITY INDRUSTRIES, INC.
P. 0. BOX 568887
DALLAS, TEXAS 75356-8887

AMERICAN INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS
1420 GERONIMO, BLDG. C. STE 4
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925-1848

BORDER FENCE CO.
5413 ROSA
EL PASO, TEXAS 79905

BERGEN SOUTHWEST STEEL. INC.
P. 0. BOX 12909
EL PASO, TEXAS 79913-2909

WEIBEE STEEL, INC.
P. 0. BOX 5196
NORMAN, OKLAHOMA 73070-5196

GSI HIGHWAY PRODUCTION
720 W. WINTERGREEN RD
HUTCHINS, TEXAS 75141

" AZTECA METALS, INC.

720 S. VIRGINIA
EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

KEENAN SUPPLY
1041 EASTSIDE ROAD
EL PASO, TEXAS 79935

[

ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT
16100 LATHROP AVE.
HARVEY, IL 60426

CENTERLINE SUPPLY, LTD
530 JESSE ST.
GRAND PRAIRIE, TEXAS 75051

AARMOR METAL & SUPPLY, INC.
9925 CARNEGIE AVE.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

NORTHWEST PIPE
6307 TOLEDO ST.
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77008

KDC PIPE & STEEL, INC.
P. 0. BOX 12327
EL PASO, TEXAS 79912

A & RCONTRACTORS
8626 DYER, STE., B-3
EL PASO, TEXAS 79904

FAMILIAL PIPE & SUPPLY
6914 INDUSTRIAL
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915

ALAMO IRON WORKS
1310 LOMALAND DRIVE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79935

HALL SIGNS, INCORPORATED

PARAGOAL PIPE & STEEL, INC.

(4
ROCAL , INC, %’L& 4495 W. VERNAL PIKE
8032 GATEWAY EAST . 2068 er by WO BLOOMINGTON, IN 47404
EL PASO, TX 79907 FRANKFORT, OH 45628 X
Wy No Bid (After5:d Opening)






