CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

AGENDA DATE: March 26, 2013
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: TED MARQUEZ, INTERIM DIRECTOR, DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 621-

6750
BRUCE D. COLLINS, PURCHASING MANAGER, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:

Department of Transportation recommends award to Cemex Construction Materials South, LLC and Jobe
Materials, L.P. for solicitation 2013-094. The table below is the annual estimated amount and the estimated 3
year total by solicitation group:

Groups Vendor Estimated Annual | Estimated 3 Year | Option Offered
(FOB Plant) (FOB Plant)
1-All Items | Cemex Construction $269,547.50 $808,642.50 No Option Offered
2-All Items | Cemex Construction $228,162.50 $684,487.50 No Option Offered
3-All Items | Jobe Materials L.P. $52,571.25 $157.713.75 | 2Yeors opronto
Totals $550,281.25 $1,650,843.75

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Department of Transportation has reviewed solicitation 2013-094 and recommends the contract be awarded to
Cemex Construction Materials South, LLC for Group 1 (all items) ,2 (all items) and Group 3 (all items) to Jobe
Materials, L.P. Furthermore, the Solicitation was reviewed to determine cost benefit of shipping methods
between FOB Plant and On Site delivery with FOB Plant being the most effective shipping method.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 12/4/2012 and 12/11/2012. The postcards were mailed out on 12/4/2012. The
solicitation was posted on City website on 12/4/2012. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 12/4/2012. A
total of fourteen (14) bidders including eleven (11) local vendors were solicited. A total of four (4) bids were
received, three (3) being a local vendor.

Group 1: Cemex Construction bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant; Ergon, Jobe Materials
L.P., Jobe Materials L.P., and Miniconcrete Materials, Inc. did not bid on all items.

Group 2: Cemex Construction bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant; Ergon, Jobe Materials
L.P. and Miniconcrete did not bid on all items.

Group 3: Jobe Materials L.P. bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant: Cemex Construction,
Ergon, and Miniconcrete did not bid on all items.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Council awarded Contract No. 2010-077 Street Construction Materials on February 23, 2010.
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

32120-532030-1000-532 Public Access Maintenance & Repairs — General Fund FY 13 - FY 16



BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******************R EQ U I R ED AUTH O R I ZAT I O N********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Name Signature Date



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(Low Bid)

******'k**********************************POSTI N G LA N G UAG E B EL OW**********************************'k********

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of MARCH 26, 2013

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2013-094 Street Construction Materials to Cemex
Construction Materials South, LLC and Jobe Materials, L.P. for an initial term estimated award of
$1,650,843.75.

Department: Transportation

Award to: (Vendor #1) Cemex Construction Materials, LLC
El Paso, TX

Item(s): Group 1 and 2

Initial Term: 3years

Option to Extend: None

Payment Terms: Net 30 days

Annual Estimated Award: $497,710.00

Total Estimated Award: $1,493,130.00 (3 years)

Award to: (Vendor #2) Jobe Materials L.P.
El Paso, TX

Item: Group 3

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Payment Terms: Net 30 days

Annual Estimated Award: $52,571.25

Initial Term Estimated Award: $157,713.75 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $262,856.25 (5 years)

Total Annual Estimated Award: $550,281.25
Total Initial Term Estimated Award: $1,650,843.75 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $1,755,986.25 (5 years)
Account No.: 532 — 32120 - 532030 — 1000
Funding Source: Public Maintenance & Repairs.
District(s): All

This is a low bid, unit price contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and Department of Transportation recommend award as
indicated to Cemex Construction Materials South, LLC (Group 1 and 2) and Jobe Materials L.P. (Group 3),
the lowest responsive, responsible bidders.

*****************************************A D D I TI O NA L I N FO B E L OW**********************************************

Group 1: Cemex Construction bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant; Ergon, Jobe Materials L.P.,
Jobe Materials L.P., and Miniconcrete Materials, Inc. did not bid on all items.

Group 2: Cemex Construction bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant; Ergon, Jobe Materials L.P. and
Miniconcrete did not bid on all items.



Group 3: Jobe Materials L.P. bid on all items of the solicitation FOB Plant: Cemex Construction, Ergon, and
Miniconcrete did not bid on all items.



CITY OF EL PASO brfixd

AﬂAmBrlcacltv
\ ]
BID TABULATION 1]
2010
BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS ’ "~ Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2 2013 _ Department;: TRANSPORTATION
; CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

ESTIMATED A'NNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual

(QITNl{r‘l\TLY DESCRIFTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantityx | Extended Total x 3
No. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT: $17.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 NO BID NO BID
1 100 BUILDING STONE, IN LOADS OF TONS
TEN (10) TONS OR MORE

DELIVERED: $23.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 NO BID

F.OB PLANT: $73.00 $10,950.00 $32,850.00 NO BID NO BID
150 CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL| CUBIC -
2 (2 SACKS) TRANSIT MIX YARDS

NO BID

DELIVERED: $73.00 $10,950.00 $32,850.00 NO BID

20 ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) CUBIC F.0.B PLANT: - $135.50 $2,710.00- $8,130.00 NO BID
2a CUBIC YARDS YARDS

DELIVERED: $135.50 $2,710.00 $8,130.00 NO BID NO BID

CEMENT STABILIZED BASE F.O.B PLANT: $34.00 . $32,300.00 $96,900.00 NO BID NO BID
3 950 MATERIAL TONS

DELIVERED: $40.00 $38,000.00 | $114,000.00 NO BID NO BID
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. NOTE: The |nformat|on contamed in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constltute actual awardlexecutlon of contract

apPROVED BY: {0

DATE: 69\ - ) a "]3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO b
BID TABULATION I

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2 2013

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

ESTIMATED ENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED] 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL {Annual
Q‘LN,:"NUT‘I\}'Y DESCRIFTION MEASURE | PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quanfity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

NO. Unit Price) Unit Price) years)
— —_—

ORDRES LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: $38.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $46.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

i N

F.0.B PLANT: $6.00 $31,800.00 | $95,400.00
4 5300 BASE, DRY TONS

DELIVERED: $12.00 $63,600.00 | $190,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $6.75 $6,750.00 $20,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 1000 BASE, PROCESSED- TONS

DELIVERED: $12.75 $12,750.00 $38,250.00

e S e I e e G o A Wl a0 L S P L O s B A M S

" F.O.B PLANT: $14.00 $42,000.00 | $126,000.00 NO BID - NOBID NO BID

6 3000 SCREENING, COLORS: RED TONS

DELIVERED: $20.00 $60,000.00 | $180,000.00

pr————————————— -
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NOTE: The information contained in thls bld tabulatlon is for lnformatlon only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY: %_} .ﬂ

DATE: AaA—1A — \ % 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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[BID TTEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
|- e % |

All-nmerica ity

Al|1

2010

50

BID OPENING DATE:
£ i

Solicitation #: 2013-094

Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC

EL PASO, TX

ERGON ASPHALT &

EMULSIONS, INC.
AUSTIN, TX

STMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED] 3 YR EXTENDED
TEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual

&“}:‘N”T‘?TLY DESCRIPTION meAsURE | PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

7 1000

SCREENING, COLORS: GRAY

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$11.00

$17.00

$11,000.00

$17,000.00

8 500

SCREENING, COLORS: TAN

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$28.00

$34.00

—

$14,000.00

$17,000.00

$33,000.00

$51,000.00

]

$42,000.00

$51,000.00

9 500

9a 75

TRANSIT MIX

ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2)
TONS CUBIC YARDS
DELIVERED

B A A M T D L SR 2 £k T 8 AR ST A i gt Sy ST P d TS A

CUBIC
YARDS
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F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$152.50

$152.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information onl

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

e

A-12-13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

$45,000.00

$45,000.00

$11,437.50

$11,437.50

$135,000.00

$135,000.00

$34,312.50

$34,312.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America Clty

Yy

2010

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

!"* :

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

e e

ESTIMATED
TEM ||~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MUE’X;S:E PRICE PER ITEM
QUANTITY

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC

UNIT
PRICE

F.0.B PLANT:

EXIT STONE

10 3000 TONS

DELIVERED:

-EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

5
ANNUAL EXTENDED
TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

ANNUAL EXTEN
TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x

Unit Price)

)

TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

UNIT
PRICE

$42,000.00 | $126,000.00 NO BID

NO BID

$51,000.00 | $153,000.00 NO BID NO BID

F.O0.B PLANT:
11 1000 BLASTING ROCK TONS

DELIVERED:

ERGON ASPHALT &
EMULSIONS, INC.

i)

YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3

years)

NO BID

NO BID

$16,000.00 $48,000.00

NO BID

$22,000.00 $66,000.00

NO BID

GROUP 1 - TOTAL (1 through 11)
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NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation i fo

APPROVED BY: ?\'\‘ ()

d-r1a-\3

DATE:

S SENAISCSE
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r information only and does not

NO BID

NO BID

$269,547.50 | $808,642.50

NO BID

$356,047.50 | $1,068,142.50 | 5¢

ARG

S BT

constite actual award/execution of contract.

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

i'

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2 2013

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC
EL PASO, TX

ERGON ASPHALT &
EMULSIONS, INC.
AUSTIN, TX

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNITOF | oeicE PER ITEM UNIT
MEASURE PRICE

NO. QUANTITY

TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x

3
TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3

Unit Prici

e

years)

XTENDED |

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

F.O.B PLANT: $4.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2.50 $1,250.00
1 500 CSS-1HEMULSION GALLONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.9231 $1,461.55

F.0.B PLANT: $89.50
2 100 COLD MIX TONS

DELIVERED: $95.50

$8,950.00

$9,550.00

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: $89.50
2a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $97.50

F.0.B PLANT:

HOT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE $69.75

PAVEMENT, FOR PATCHING TONS

DELIVERED:

$75.75

A T A it 70t T S SN UV B

T
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NOTE: The information contalned in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecutlon of contract

APPROVED BY:

W

a—\'&’\B

DATE:

$4,475.00

$4,875.00

$209,250.00

$227,250.00

$26,850.00

$28,650.00

TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
" years)

$3,750.00

$4,384.65

NO BID

NO BID

ﬁ_'ﬁ

$13,425.00

$14,625.00

$627,750.00

$681,750.00

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-AmericaCity
\ l I I l f

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLGC
EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL
QUANTITY

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NO.

UNITOF
MEASURE

PRICE PER ITEM

PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
Unit Price) years)

ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED |
UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual

ERGON ASPHALT &
EMULSIONS, INC.
AUSTIN, TX

3 YR EXTENDED

UAL EXTENDED

UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

Unit Price)

years)

NO BID

APPROVEDBY: 5| D
DATE: o -3

NOTE The lnformatlon contained in this bid tabulatlon is for mformatlon only and does not constltute actual awardlexecutlon of contract.

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) $69.75 $3,487.50 $10,462.50 NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS :
DELIVERED $77.75 $3,887.50 | $11,662.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
$228,1.62.50 $684,487.50 $1,250.00 $3,750.00
GROUP 2 - TOTAL (1 through 3a)
$245,562.50 $1,461.55 $4,384.65

FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED
TO ABOVE PRICES AT RATE OF $.4424/TON FOR
ASPHALT & POLYMER LOADS OR $.00133/GAL FOR]
EMULSION LOADS.

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO e

All-Amexica City
\ /
BID TABULATION W
. 2010 -
BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS . Solicitation #: 2013-094
BlD OPENlNG DATE JANUARAY 2 2013 » Department: TRANSPORTATION
& CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
: MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASOQ, TX AUSTIN, TX

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EX'I:ENDED 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL X'l:E DED| 3 YREXTENDED
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT OF PRICE PER [TEM UNIT TOTAL (Estlm?ted TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
QUANTITY MEASURE PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

Unit Price) years) Unit Price)

F.0.B PLANT: $15.75 $2,362.50 $7,087.50 NO BID
1 150 FRANKLIN RED SCREENING TONS v
DELIVERED: $21.75 $3,262.50 $9,787.50
F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00
2 75 FRANKLIN RED 3/4" OREQUAL| TONS
DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BiID NO BID

w

FRANKLIN RED 1 12" OR F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 EQUAL TONS

DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 75 FRANKLIN RED 2" OR EQUAL TONS

DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY: H P

DATE: a- \a — \3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

[BIDTTEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

El Paso

\”

GCity

IV

2010

BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION

MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC
EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL

UANTI
NO. QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION

UNIT OF

MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM

ANNUAL EXTENDED
TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

SANTA FE RED 3/4"

F.0.B PLANT:

TONS
DELIVERED:

NO BID

NO BID

SANTA FE RED 1 12"

F.0.B PLANT:
TONS

DELIVERED:

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

8 100

T TR R A B R O e

MESA RED 3/4"

MESA RED 1 172"

APPROVED BY: 'WO

DATE:

A= -\3

F.0.B PLANT:
TONS

DELIVERED:

F.0.B PLANT:
TONS

DELIVERED:

R R O ST SR B S R B S RSB

2013-034 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

$38.00

$44.00

$38.00

$44.00

$2,850.00

$3,300.00

$3,800.00

$4,400.00

wﬁ_m“mwhfmmwum R S G T SR Lo ST
NOTE: The mformatlon contained in this b|d tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecutlon of contract

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$8,550.00

$9,900.00

$11,400.00

$13,200.00

ERGON ASPHALT &
EMULSIONS, INC.

UNIT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AUSTIN, TX

ANNUAL EXTENDED
TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL {Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




CITY OF EL PASO Ersny

Al Gity

\ /

BID TABULATION {1

2010
7BlD ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS _ Solicitation #: 2013-094
BlD 0PEN|NG DATE' JANUARAY 2 2013 ' Department: TRANSPORTATION
' CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED{ 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL {Annual
AUTNUTIIX'II'-Y DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO Q Unit Price) years) Umt Pnce)
530 ;’:‘,.‘- : D T R TS L3 R L SR I e o A e LT D TS T e 5 i z f“-""imfl‘tv&nﬁ?l‘ﬁm ] =
F.O.B PLANT: $33.00 $2,475.00 $7,425.00
9 75 . DESERT TAN 3/4" TONS
) ) DELIVERED: $39.00 $2,925.00 $8,775.00

F.0.B PLANT: $2,475.00 $7,425.00

10 75 DESERT TAN 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: $:f,9.00 $2,925.00 $8,775.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $75.00 $11,250.00 $33,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 150 COBBLESTONE 1" TO 6" TONS

DELIVERED: $81.00 $12,150.00 $36,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

R A BT T e et e G M o i R R Ly e

b3

F.O.B PLANT: $70.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 50 RED BOULDERS EACH
DEL{VERED: $120.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 NO BID

AR O DR e A I AR R

e = S

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecutlon of contract

APPROVED BY: H \()

DATE: (9 — ] a —\ 3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
By

All-America City

1114

BID OPENING DATE:

Solicitation #: 2013-094

£y

' ANNUAL EXTENDED
ESTIMATED .
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated
mNNUT?TLY DESCRIPTION MEASURE | PRICE PER [TEM PRICE Annual Quantity x
NO Q Unit Price)

13 20

GRAY BOULDERS

EACH

F.0.B PLANT:

$60.00

$1,200.00

DELIVERED: $110.00 $2,200.00

GROUP 3 - TOTAL (1 through 13)

$35,087.50

$43,687.50

Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
' EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

-

3V

el

R EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual UNIT
Extended Total x 3 PRICE

years)

ANNUAL EXTENDED

3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
Unit Price) years)

$3,600.00

$6,600.00

$105,262.50

$131,062.50

$532,797.50

APPROVED BY:

1
- 1512

DATE:

$645,297.50

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$3,750.00

$4,384.65

FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED
2] TO ABOVE PRICES AT RATE OF $.4424/TON FOR
5 ASPHALT & POLYMER LOADS OR $.00133/GAL FOR]
4 EMULSION LOADS.

10




[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
bt
[}

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE: JANQARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
. e CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]

]

]

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: . YES No [ | YES| | NO
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ____consecutive calendar 1 1

of emergency.

24

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H p

DATE: A~ ] a.. \3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
>

11

e




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO reers
BID TABULATION 11

2010

>BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
- = H ‘ MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO, TX

I - ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF unIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
oL PESCRIPTION MEASURE | PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT: $28.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $9.50 $950.00 $2,850.00
1 100 BUILDING STONE, IN LOADS OF TONS BIDDER'S PRICE:
TEN (10) TONS OR MORE NO BID
: DELIVERED: $35.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $16.50 $1,650.00 $4,950.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:
N 3]

F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 $8,250.00 | $24,750.00
. 150 CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL CUBIC : BIDDER'S PRICE:
2 (2 SACKS) TRANSIT MIX YARDS NO BID
DELIVERED: $67.00 $10,050.00 | $30,150.00 NO BID NO BID 'NO BID
-
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2a 20 ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) CUBIC . .
CUBIC YARDS YARDS | el WERED: $125.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:

10.B PLANT: ; 5,500.
3 950 CEMENT STABILIZED BASE TONS - FOBPLA $28,500.00 | $85,500.00
MATERIAL

DELIVERED: $35.50 $33,725.00 | $101,175.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is %or ir;formétl

APPROVED BY: )Jr p

DATE: aA-1D- \3 '2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 12

on only and does not constltute actual awardlexecutlon of contract




[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

C!TY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-AmerdcaCity
T

2010

BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. MINICONCRETE
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF " | TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
e DESCRIPTION MEASURE | PRICE PER ITEM o Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. A . Unit Price) years)

3a

50

ORDRES LESS THAN TEN (10)
TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD)
DELIVERED

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

NO BID

$125.00

NO BID

$6,250.00

5300

BASE, DRY

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$6.50

$11.50

$34,450.00

$60,950.00

1000

BASE, PROCESSED

APPROVEI? BY: a - \3' )5

DATE:

P
I

TONS

TONS

SRS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

]

$6,500.00

$11,500.00 "

$30,000.00

$48,000.00

NO BID

$18,750.00

ANNUAL EXTENDED|{ 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

Unit Price) years)

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

$103,350.00

$182,850.00

$19,500.00

$34,500.00

$90,000.00

$144,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

13




CITY OF EL PASO Exrred
BID TABULATION W

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. ,3,“ ,‘fﬁg,?,ﬂfg Elzli
EL PASO, TX ™

EL PASO, TX

TEM | esmimaTED UNIT OF
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEAGoRe | PRICE PER ITEM
QUANTITY

UNIT
PRICE

ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x

Unit Price)

F.0.B PLANT:
7 1000 SCREENING, COLORS: GRAY TONS

DELIVERED:

$7.50 $7,500.00 | $22,500.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
$13.50 $13,500.00 $40,500.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00

ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual * UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT:
8 500 SCREENING, COLORS: TAN TONS

DELIVERED:

$33.00 $16,500.00 | $49,500.00 NO BID NO BID

$40.80 $20,400.00 $61,200.00 NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO Bib

NO BID

NO BID

o CuBIC
9 500 TRANSIT MiIX YARDS

DELIVERED:

3 : ‘&é&gﬁﬁ

ORDERSLESS THANTWO (2) | .\ - F.0.B PLANT:
- 9a 75 TONS CUBIC YARDS YARDS
DELIVERED

DELIVERED:

@%z:
APPROVED BY: H» p

DATE: -1~ \_3

F.O.B PLANT:

SESETae 5&?@% ‘

$88.00 | $44,000.00 | $132,000.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$9,375.00 $28,125.00 $65.00 $4,875.00

NOTE The |nformat|on contained in this bld tabulation is for information only and does not constltute actual

NO BID

$14,625.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:

awardlexecutlon of contract

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO | b

Al-America City

BID TABULATION S 1|14

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DA 20

53

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

o JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. MINICONCRETE
s EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX

Eetell o F O R T & N
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ) ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
' UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Esfimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annua!
e DESCRIPTION MEASURE | " RICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. QUANTITY Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT: $9.00 $27,000.00 $81,000.00 $19.50 $58,500.00 $175,500.00

10 3000 "EXIT STONE TONS ' ' BlDDi;i:)‘SB :;alcs;
: DELIVERED: $16.00 $48,000.00 $144,000.00 $28.00 $84,000.00 $252,000.00

;l BIDDER'S PRICE:

NO BIiD

T

F.O.B PLANT: $14.00 $14,000.00 $42,000.00 $13.00 $13,000.00 $39,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
11 1000 BLASTING ROCK TONS NO BID
DELIVERED: $20.00 $20,000.00 $60,000.00 $18.00 $18,000.00 $54,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NOBID

$167,250.00 $248,100.00

BIDDER'S PRICE;
NO BID

$357,075.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:

$331,750.00

’%Y?:E% RET

APPROVED BY: L}p

DATE: R ) 9 — \5 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
(o4

( V — e = B i s R — e

15




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

- El Paso

e
11K

2010

[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL EXTENDED
ESTIMATED "
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated
(QJTNL%I:Y DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x
NO. Unit Price)

MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

1 500

CSS-1HEMULSION

GALLONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$5.00

NO BID

$2,500.00

NO BID

3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual

Extended Total x 3

years)

$7,500.00

NO BID

2 100

COLD MIX

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BiD

NO BID

2a 50

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10)
TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD)
DELIVERED

HOT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE
PAVEMENT, FOR PATCHING

APPROVEDBY: 1) _ 3 - 3 W )

DATE:

e -1Aa-)3

TONS

TONS

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

F.0.B PLANT:

" DELIVERED:

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$180,000.00

$199,200.00

NO BID

NO BID

$540,000.00

$597,600.00

TOTAL (Estimated
Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

16

[




ClTY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-America City

11K

2010

[BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO, TX

3 YR EXTENDED
ESTIMATED '
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
C?UTN%’?‘IF.Y DESCRIPTION MEASURE | PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years)

EXTENDED

50

ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10)
TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD)
DELIVERED

F.O.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID N

TONS

DELIVERED: $125.00 $6,250.00 $18,750.00

UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
Unit Price) years)

ﬁ NO BID

NO BID

MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED

O BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

ne
D151

$182,500.00 | $547,500.00

$205,450.00 | $616,350.00

f

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

17
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BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TAB

ULATION

El Paso

All-AmericaCity

{114

2010

ANNUAL

BlD OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2, 2013

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION

UNIT OF
MEASURE

PRICE PER ITEM

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO, TX

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL (Estimated
- Annual Quantity x
Unit Price)

1 150

FRANKLIN RED SCREENING

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$10.00

$16.00

$1,500.00

$2,400.00

ANNUAL EXTENDED

3 YR EXTENDED
TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

$4,50_0.00 NO BID
$7,200.00 NO BID
| _____

MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL EXTENDED
UNIT TOTAL (Estimated
PRICE Annual Quantity x

FRANKLIN RED 3/4" OR EQUAL

TONS

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$25.50

$32.50

$1,912.50

$2,437.50

$5,737.50

$7,312.50

NO BID

NO BID

Unit Price)

NO BID

NO BID

3 YR EXTENDED

TOTAL (Annual
Extended Total x 3
years)

NO BID

NO BID

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

FRANKLIN RED 1 1/2" OR
EQUAL

FRANKLIN RED 2" OR EQUAL

AP
-\~

13

TONS

TONS

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

F.O.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

F.0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$1,800.00

$2,325.00

$1,755.00

$2,280.00

$5,400.00

$6,975.00

$5,265.00

$6,840.00

18
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CITY OF EL PASO ‘ Exrera

BID TABULATION "

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. MINICONCRETE
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
? EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual . TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
UNIT UNIT
Kipypeiad DESCRIPTION MEASURE | PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

L |

F.0.B PLANT: $65.00 $4,875.00 $14,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 75 SANTA FE RED 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: $72.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
N

]
F.0.B PLANT: $65.00 $4,875.00 $14,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 75 SANTA FE RED 1 1/2* TONS
DELIVERED: $72.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.O.B PLANT: $49.55 $3,716.25 $11,148.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 75 MESA RED 3/4" TONS

DELIVERED: $56.55 $4,241.25 $12,723.75 NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $49.55 $4,955.00 $14,865.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 100 MESA RED 1 1/2" TONS

DELIVERED: $56.55 $5,655.00

$16,965.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only a
APPROVED BY: H p

DATE: a - ._]3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 19




CITY OF EL PASO Exrrad

All-AmericaCity

BID TABULATION Y

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. MINICONCRETE
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF i UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
(:EJTNL;'?;:Y DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER {TEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO.

Unit Price)

years) Unit Price)

years)

F.0.B PLANT: $40.80 $3,060.00 $9,180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 75 DESERT TAN 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: $47.80 $3,585.00 $10,755.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID |

F.O.B PLANT: $40.80 $3,060.00 $9,180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 75 DESERT TAN 1 1/2" TONS
. DELIVERED: $47.80 $3,585.00 $10,755.00 NO BID

: F.0.B PLANT: $75.55 $11,332.50 $33,997.50
11 150 COBBLESTONE 1" TO 6" TONS

$82.55

DELIVERED:

$12,382.50 $37,147.50 NO BID NO BID

F.O.B PLANT: $139.00 $6,950.00 $20,850.00 NO BID NO BID
12 50 RED BOULDERS EACH

DELIVERED: $180.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY: H\P

DATE: ~ — } a — \3 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
-~ .

20




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All Americatity

\"w

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO, TX

ITEM

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x
- NO. QUANTITY Unit Price) years) Unit Price)

EL PASO, TX

MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.

13 20

GRAY BOULDERS

F.O0.B PLANT:

DELIVERED:

$139.00

$180.00

$2,780.00

$3,600.00

ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED

Extended Total x 3

TOTAL (Annual

years)

$8,340.00 $80.00 $1,600.00
$10,800.00 $150.00 $3,000.00

GROUP 3 - TOTAL (1 through 13)

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

GRAND TOTAL ITEMS - GROUP 1 +2+3

HP

A1\

$52,571.25

$62,291.25

$4,800.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

$9,000.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

$157,713.75 $1,600.00

$186,873.75 $3,000.00

$402,321.25

$599,491.25

$4,800.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

$9,000.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:

$1,206,963.75 | $84,300.00

$1,798,473.75 $122,025.00

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

$252,900.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

$366,075.00

BIDDER'S PRICE:

21
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‘CITY OF EL PASO g
BID TABULATION |}

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P. MINICONCRETE
EL PASO. TX - MATERIALS, INC.
T EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE B l:]
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE D
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]

NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES | X NO D . YESAD NO ‘,
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Wi

PAYMENT TERMS:

: Within ___ consecutive calendar 1
days.
Within ___hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 8 24
of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 14 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 BIDS LOCAL: 11 NO BID: 0
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H_p

DATE: Q _ \ 9 ~ \B 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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ALLIED PAVING
5165 HERCULES AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79904

JOBE CONCRETE PRODUCTS
1150 Southview Drive
EL PASO, TX 79928

CURIEL CONSTRUCTION
266 S HORIZON BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79927

JORDON MATERIALS
5708 DONIPHAN DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79932

KOCK PAVEMENT SOLUTIONS
2411 N FREEMAN'
ARTESIA, NM 88210

JAN-CARINGC. -
14201 NORTH LOOP DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79836

CEMEX
1 MCKELLIGON CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79930

GENE LITTLE AND SONS
336 LISA DRIVE
CHAPARRAL, NM 88021

D&D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
ATTN: JAVIER COSME
6825 MARBLE CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79912

AMERICAN SAND & GRAVEL
1506 N ZARAGOSA ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79936

CHAPARRAL SAND AND GRAVEL
112 LISA DRIVE, BOX L-§
CHAPARRAL, NM 88021

MULLEN-TELLES, INC.
905 LOMA VERDE DRIVE SUITE A
EL PASO, TX 79935

VILLALVA SAND & GRAVEL
12450 PELLICANO DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79927

DAN WILLIAMS CO.
P. 0. BOX 220245
EL PASO, TX 79913
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