CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Fire
AGENDA DATE: April 12, 2011

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:

Bruce Collins — Purchasing Manager (915) 541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:

The El Paso Fire Department recommends avs_z/arding the following vendors for Solicitation 2011-

006:

Item 1 Coat, Item 2 Pant, and Item 7 Suspenders to Quest Enterprises, Inc., the second
lowest bidder for Items 1 & 2 and they are the lowest responsive bidder for item 7. Bid
states that coats and pants shall be procured from the same manufacturer to avoid liability
and interface problems. Quest does offer a 2% discount when payments are made within
20 days of being invoiced. When applied the option makes this vendor the lowest bid.
The total estimated bid value for Quest Enterprises, Inc. is $269,206.00.

We recommend Item 3 Helmet, Items O-1 Helmet Front, and O-2 Helmet IDs be awarded
to Fire Service Equipment as they are the lowest responsive bidder for these items. The
total estimated annual bid value for Fire Service Equipment is $64,983.00.

It is recommended that Item 4 Hood to DACO Fire Equipment as they are the lowest
responsive bidder. The total estimated bid value for DACO Fire Equipment is $4,625.00.
For Item 5 Gloves, we recommend Casco Industries Inc. The two low bidders
(Emergency Response and Alco) did not meet the required bar coding serial numbers on
the gloves as required in the bid specification. The total estimated bid value for Casco
Industries is $26,000.00.

We recommend that Item 6 Boots be awarded to Bazaar Uniforms & Men’s Store as they
are the lowest responsive bidder. The total estimated bid value for Bazaar Uniforms is
$89,500.00.

We recommend Item 8 PPE Bag be awarded to Emergency Response Solutions as they
are the lowest responsive bidder for this item. The total estimated bid value for
Emergency Response Solutions is $13,865.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

This contract is for the purchase of Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) for fire personnel. PPE
is used for the protection of personnel in a hazardous atmosphere due to extreme conditions.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Yes. Council awarded solicitation 2009-010 to multiple vendors on December 16, 2008.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department:

Amount:

Fire
$468,179.00

Funds Available: . Dept #04102010 - Acct #508007 - Fund #27503 - Project #P540010CTY
Funds Source: City Capital Outlay — Public Safety Equipment

Wade A. Warling - Logistics Battalion Chief, Fire (915)771-1071




BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A.

****‘).‘**7‘:***7‘.‘7‘.‘*******AUTHORIZATION*******************7‘:

DEPARTMENT HEAD:




Bid Opening Date: January 5
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011
Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
ik e

Ali-AimericaCity

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-006

Department: Fire

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & | CASCO INDUSTRIES INC. | DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX
EL PASO, TX
TWENTY-FOUR (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X
ITEM} (24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -
# 2YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) . EXTENDED PRICE)
’-~| : EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
1. 400 COAT, NONE STATED NO BID NO BID | $789.00 | $315,600.00
EA PROTEC|TIVE, STRUCTURAL
" MANUFACTURER LION APPAREL
MODEL NUMBER CLIM 32 LIBERTY
2. 400 PANTS, NONE STATED NO BID NO BID $561.00 $224,400.00
PAIR PROTEC|TIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER LION APPAREL
MODEL NUMBER PSUM
3. 600 HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER NONE STATED NO BID NO BID $139.00 $83,400.00
EA ’
MANUFACTURER BULLARD
{ T MODEL NUMBER FX
- $21.83 | $10,915.00
4, 500 HOOD, [FLASHOVER, KNIT (PRICE GOOD FOR 12 MONTHS, MAY NO BID NO BID $18.50 $9,250.00
EA ' INCREASE 7% ON REMAINING 12) :
MANUFAC[TURER FIREGUARD MAJESTIC FIRE
MODEL NUMBER PBIF-51-SP P84 PACII
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Kd’@ﬂ%@{éﬂédy DATE; / / /é; / [ / ' 1




Bid Opening Date: January 5,
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011

Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Rit-hne City

I{[1N

2040

Solicitation #: 2011-006

" Department: Fire
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & || CASCO INDUSTRIES INC. | DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX
EL PASO, TX :
OUR (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X - (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X
[TEM " (24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -

# 2 YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE .| EXTENDED PRICE
) T $53.84 | $43,072.00 ' -

5. 800 GLOVES, - (PRICE GOOD FOR 12 MONTHS, MAY NO BID $65.00 $52,000.00 $116.00 $92,800.00

PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL | INCREASE 5%-7% ON REMAINING 12) ' :
(SIZES S-2XL) | (3XL-4XL $57.78) '
MANUFACTURER SAFEGUARD AMERICA AMERICAN FIREWEAR AMERICAN FIREWEAR
MODEL NUMBER COMMANDER 90026-27 9950 GL-SGKCW
6. 1,000 BOOTS, NONE STATED $179.00 $179,000.00 $262.00 $262,000.00 $189.00 $1 89,000.00
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL I
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD SHOES GLOBE MFG CO THOROGOOD
'MODEL NUMBER 8040369 14" POWER HY SHADOW 1301400 804-6369
STRUCTURAL BOUNCER BOOT
7. 300 SUSPENDERS, HEAVY NONE STATED NO BID NO BID $28.50 $8,550.00
EA DUTY, DYNA BACK OR EQUAL| _ : .
| MANUFACTURER LION APPAREL
' MODEL NUMBER SB742T
o $40.87 | $40,870.00
8. 1,000 PRE GEAR BAG (PRICE GOOD FOR 12 MONTHS, MAY NO BID NO BID $34.00 $34,000.00
EA | INCREASE 7% ON REMAINING 12)
MANUFACTURER AMERICA SAFEGUARD OK-1 SAFETY:
MODEL NUMBER SSB-C-R-SP OK-3000
TOTAL PRICE (ITEMS #1 THRU #8): $94,857.00 $179,000.00 $314,000.00 © $957,000.00
’ ’ (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: NONE STATED) : ’ )
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: 10/5‘)\ DATE: / /g // 2




Bid Opening Date: January 5,

Pro'lect Name: Structural Fire Fighting Clothing

2011

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-America Gty

2010
Solicitation #: 2011-006
- Department: Fire

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

-INO OPTION OFFERED

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & | CASCO INDUSTRIES INC.
- ELPASO, TX MEN'S STORE SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX
EL PASO, TX ' '
TWENTY-FOUR (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST.QTY. X
ITEM| (24) MONTH] DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE = UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE -
# 2 YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) . EXTENDED PRICE)
EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Il 1,800 FIRE HELMET, FRONTS NO BID NO BID NONE STATED
EA : :
AN IPAC IURER OPTION ITEMS PAGE
: WAS NOT SUBMITTED
0-2 3,000 FIRE HELMET, ID WITH SOLICITATION NOBID | NOBID NONE | STATED
EA .
MANUFACTURER
. MODEL NUMBER

'OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERJNI OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE

TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
b ..:LDER OFFERS THE GITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING | OPTION TO EXTEND PAGE

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT [FOR: WAS NOT SUBMITTED

WITH SOLICITATION NONE STATED

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT{THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NOTE: The information cont

APPROVED BY: /(0

2

DATE: /g:ﬂ[ //

ained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




Bid Opening Date: January 5,
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011
Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
.. e

aGly
A

© 2010

s

Solicitation #: 2011-006 .
Department: " Fire.

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & | CASCO INDUSTRIES INC. :
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX
, EL PASO, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NONE STATED NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
Yes[ ] no[ | |
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
! |* PROCUREMENT CARD: YES No[] ' VEs|X| No[ | . YES No[ |

. NONE STATED
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive cdlendar days 435 - 45 45 60 -75
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARL

ER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID. -

NQTE: The information conts

APPROVED BY: ({L é\

DATE: /Z/a\é /l

ined in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




Bid Opening Date: January 5,{2011
Project Name: Structural Fire [Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
nll«nmnricagil;

2010 .

Solicitation #: 2011-006

Department: Fire

FERRARA FIRE

EMERGENCY RESPONSE FIRE SERVICE IN GEAR PROMOTIONS
SOLUTIONS - TEXAS APPARATUS, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC. KINGSPARK, NY
. THE WOODLANDS, TX HOLDEN, LA EL PASO, TX
TWENTY-F ) ) (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST.QTY. X {EST.QTY. X
ITEM} (24) MONTH/ ILESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -
# 2YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
e EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
‘[ $902.20 $360,880.00 o
1. 400 COAT, $878.65 $351,460-00’ $1,498.00 | $599,200.00 (ALTERNATE) NO BID
EA PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL $858.17 I $343,268.00
_ HONEYWELL FIRST
° MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LIMITED FIRE DEX RESPONDERS PRODUCTS
ALTERNATE RANGER (HONEYWELL)
MGDEL NUMBER CVNG-809-907-42-GBT CUSTOM COAT LT0-427G | ALTERNATE RNG-427G
. $658.36 | $263,344.00
2. 400 PANTS, $630.25 $252,100.00 | $564.00 $225,600.00 (ALTERNATE) NO BID
"PAIR || PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL $585.64 I $234,256.00
S HONEYWELL FIRST
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LIMITED FIRE DEX RESPONDERS PRODUCTS
C : ALTERNATE RANGER (HONEYWELL)
T MODEL NUMBER TVNG-809-907-41-GBT CUSTOM PANT BPR-4276 | ALTERNATE RNG-427G
3. 600 HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER $136.00 $81,600.00 NO BID NO BID $117.61 $70,566.00 NO BID
! . HONEYWELL FIRST
MANUFACTURER LION - PAUL CONWAY NOBID RESPONDERS PRODUCTS
_ MODEL NUMBER LFH3910E=12 NOBID HDO-LITE FORCE PLUS
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:_ /(O/é) vare:. | //01 /[ 5 .




Bid dpening Date: January 5,
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011
Fighting Clothing

Seees

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

‘El Paso

Al-[unerica Gity

: " 2010 .
‘Solicitation #: 2011-006
Department: Fire .

EMERGENCY RESPONSE - FERRARA FIRE FIRE SERVICE iN GEAR PROMOTIONS '
SOLUTIONS - TEXAS APPARATUS, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC. KINGSPARK, NY
THE WOODLANDS, TX HOLDEN, LA EL PASO, TX :
TWENTY-FOUR (EST.QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST.QTY.X
ITEM|| (24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -~ -
# 2YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
/‘[ | EST.Qry. ' EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
4. 500 HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT _$27.75 $13,875.00 NO BID NO BID $35.28 $17,640.00 NO BI_D
EA
AMERICAN FIREWEAR
- MANUFACTURER MAJESTIC FIRE APPAREL NO BID (HONEYWELL)
MODEL NUMBER PBI/P84-PACII-2PLY NO BID 30022557 FNF
5. - 800 GLOVES, $56.00 $44,800.00 $80.00 $64,000.00 $86.95 $69,560.00 NO BID -
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL .
AMERICAN FIREWEAR
MANUFACTURER DRAGON FIRE TECH-TRADE (HONEYWELL)
MODEL NUMBER G801-X-(SIZE) TITANK SGKCG SUPER GLOVE
6. 1,000 BOOTS, $253.25 $253,250.00 $205.00 $205,000.00 | $225.18 $225,1‘80.00 ‘$248.00. $248,000.00
T " PAIRR- PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL , = ,
. MANUFACTURER LION APPAREL INC. WEINBRENNER PRO-WARRINGTON HAIX
MODEL NUMBER L22013MM 804-6369 4200 504204-MEN 504206-WOMEN
. 300 SUSP ENDERS, HEAVY $31.70 $9,510.00 NO BID NO BID $19.86 $5,958.00 NO BID
EA DUTY, DYNA BACK OR EQUAL| ' A
i HONEYWELL FIRST
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LIMITED NO BID RESPONDERS PRODUCTS
MODEL NUMBER V523 NO BID SP-DB
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: /@Q pate” 1/ /ﬂif v b




Bid Opening Date: January 5,
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011

F‘i'ghting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

At-Amenica Clty

. 2010

Solicitation #: 2011-006.
- Department: Fire"

EMERGENCY RESPONSE

IN GEAR PROMOTIONS

OPTIONS (SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS). |

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,289,595.00)

ALTERNATE: $1,010,228.00

FERRARA FIRE FIRE SERVICE
SOLUTIONS - TEXAS APPARATUS, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC. KINGSPARK, NY .
THE WOODLANDS, TX HOLDEN, LA EL PASO, TX
TWENTY-FOUR (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X
ITEM|, (24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -

# 2YEARS EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
.»[‘ EST.QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
8. 1,000 PPE GEAR BAG $28.30 $28,300.00 NO BID NO BID $43.80 $43,800.00 NO'BID

EA .
- AMERICAN FIREWEAR
g MANUFACTURER OK-1 MANUFACTURING COINC. NO BID (HONEYWELL)
MODEL NUMBER 3000 NO BID B8ORS ’ -
TOTAL PRICE (ITEMS #1 THRU #8): $1,034,895.00 $1,093,800.00 $1,056,928.00 $248,000.00

O-1.4 1,800 FIRE HELMET, FRONTS $35.35 $63,630.00 NO BID NO BID $23.00 $41,400.00 NO BID
" EA )
" MANUFACTURER PAUL CONWAY SHIELDS NO BID FAHRENHEIT UNIFORMS
MODEL NUMBER 4.2PP NO BID EPFED SPEC
12 3,000 " FIRE HELMET, ID $17.45 | $52,350.00 | NO BID NO BID $6.00 $18,000.00 | NO BID
EA .
MANUFACTURER PAUL CONWAY SHIELDS | NO BID FAHRENHEIT UNIFORMS
MODEL NUMBER PP NO BID EPFD SPEC

NOTE: The information cont:

ained in this bid tabulation is for information only

and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /O/

onres 1)/ 3 /1

NOTE: ADD 2% TO SECOND YEAR PRICING OR
MANUFACTURER'S ACTUAL INCREASE TO
INCLUDE ANY NFPA-1971-2012 REVISION COST.
*NOTE: ALTERNATE BID COMPLIES TO THE

SPECIFICATIONS.




Bid Openlng Date January 5,

2011

Project Name. Structural Fire|Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-nerica Clty

"'010

Solicitation #: 2011-006

Department: Fire"

| EMERGENCY RESPONSE

IN GEAR PROMOTIONS

consecutive calendar days

* FERRARA FIRE FIRE SERVICE
SOLUTIONS - TEXAS APPARATUS, INC. EQUIPMENT, INC. KiNGSPARK, NY
THE WOODLANDS, TX - HOLDEN, LA EL PASO, TX C
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
T'-liE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETI DN, MAY EXERCISE ANY
J iION TO EXTEND THE TERM QF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS TVH‘E_ClTY THE|OPTION OF EXTENDlNG
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR: o )
_ ) : NONE STATED
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT [THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORlGINA_L TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED X X X |
PAYMENT TERMS: 2% - 20 DAYS NONE STATED NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS -
. | "PROCUREMENT CARD: 3.5% WILL BE ADDED - ADD 2% TO THE :
» TO TOTAL INDIVIDUAL TRANSACTION o Co :
\?JﬁllilsR S PROMISED DELIVERY:" 45 OR LESS 90 30 45 | 30

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EAR

LIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID

- NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecutlon of contract.

APPROVED BY:_ /{)4

DATE: /Z:;Z //




Bid Opening Date: January 5
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011
Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

- El Paso

Al-Ranerica Gity

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-006

Department: Fire

METRO FIRE APPARATUS [QUEST ENTERPRISES, INC
SPECIALISTS, INC. WALSENBURG, CO
HOUSTON. TX
(EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X
ITEM (24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -
# 2 YEARS X EXTENDED PR[CE) EXTENDED PRlCE)
i EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE ||~ EXTENDED PRICE
1. 400 COAT, $990.00 $396,000.00 $809.00 $323,600.00
EA PROTEC|TIVE, STRUCTURAL
_ SPERIAN PROTECTIVE QUEST
MANUFACTURER APPAREL ENTERPRISES, INC.
MODEL NUMBER ULTRAMOTION 526 15000
2. 400 PANTS, $675.00 $270,000.00 $554.00 $221,600.00
PAIR . PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL .
v SPERIAN PROTECTIVE - QUEST
MANUFACIURER APPAREL ENTERPRISES, INC.
MODEL NUMBER ULTRAMOTION S36 Q-NETIC
| '“P. ) ' 600 HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER $138.66 $83,196.00 NO BID
MANUFACITURER BULLARD
MODEL NUMBER FX

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

" . APPROVED BY: /)/ﬁ

DATE: [Zzg\[//




Bid Opening Date: January 5,
Project Name: Structural Fire

2011
Fighting Clothing

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Ri-RmericaGity .

2010 :
Solicitation #: 2011-006-
Department: Fire

| METRO FIRE APPARATUS

QUEST ENTERPRISES, INC

SPECIALISTS, INC. WALSENBURG, CO
HOUSTON, TX
TWENTY-FOUR (EST. QTY. X (EST. QTY. X
(24) MONTH/ DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -
# 2 YEARS _ EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
’J - EST. QTY. EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
4. 500‘ HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT $-0- $-0- NO BID
EA || .
; MANUFACTURER NOBID
MODEL NUMBER NOBID
5. 800 ' GLOVES, $82.29 $65,832.00 NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER PRO-TECH
MODEL NUMBER TITAN-K KANGAROO
6. 1,000 BOOTS, $247.06 $247,060.00 NO BID
PAIR " | PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL A
. MANUFACTURER COSMAS
J MODEL NUMBER VULCAN
h 7 300 - SUSPENDERS, HEAVY $21.50 $6,450.00 $14.00 . $4,200.00
EA DUTY, DYYNA BACK OR EQUAL]
SPERIAN PROTECTIVE QUEST
NUF
MANUFACTURER APPAREL ENTERPRISES, INC.
TRAD X-BACK WI/SLIDES -
MODEL NUMBER ABQ AND TRIM

NOTE: The information cont

APPROVED BY: 4@4

ained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: M

10




El Paso

Al-Rmerica City

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM L

Bid Opening Date: January 5,/2011 Solicitation #: 2011-006
Project Name: Structural Fire{Fighting Clothing '

Department: Fire

METRO FIRE APPARATUS |QUEST ENTERPRISES, INC

SPECIALISTS, INC. WALSENBURG, CO
OPTIONS (SUBJECT TO AVAJLABILITY OF FUNDS): HOUSTON, TX .
TWENTY-FOUR (EST. QTY. X © (EST.QTY.X -
ITEM| (24) MONTH! b ESCRIETION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE -
# 2YEARS | EXTENDED PRICE) EXTENDED PRICE)
' ,l . EST. QTY. ) . EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
\8 1,000 PPE GEAR BAG $-0- $-0- NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER NO BID
MODEL NUMBER NO BID
TOTAL PRICE (ITEMS #1 THRU #8): $1,068,538.00 $549,400.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,234,346.00) (BIDDER’S TOTAL PRICE: $560,200.00)

OPTIONS (SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS):

O-1.j 1,800 FIRE HELMET, FRONTS $41.75 $75,150.00
EA
MANUFACTURER BULLARD v
MODEL NUMBER BK40PLRDLBKL
0-2.1 3,000 FIRE HELMET, ID $10.47 $31,410.00 NO BID
MANUFACTURER BULLARD
MODEL NUMBER BK40INSERT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

" APPROVED BY: %2 : DATE: /[ /21 4 "




Bid Opening Date: January 52011
Project Name: Structural Fire|Fighting Clothing

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Ati-America Gity

2010 )
Solicitation #: 2011-006 -
" Departmerit: Fire

| METRO FIRE APPARATUS

SPECIALISTS, INC. .
HOUSTON, TX

QUEST ENTERPRISES, INC

WALSENBURG, CO

TEIE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETI

.

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT

NO OPTION OFFERED

-ION TO EXTEND THE TERM QF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRIT[TEN NOTICE WITHIN THE -
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE|/OPTION OF EXTENDING

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

ON, MAY EXERCISE ANY

FOR:

THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

X

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

2% - 20 DAYS
NET - 30 DAYS

?'ODER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
1.l."PROCUREMENT CARD:

ves[X] no[ |

Within consecutive ¢

BIDDER'S PROMISED DE LiVERY:

alendar days

45

YES[X] No[ |

45

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EAR

HER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITATED: 20

BIDS RECEIVED: 10

BIDS LOCAL: 7

NO BIDS: 1

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /D/é

VDATE: /[ :2\[ /l
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DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
P. 0. BOX 5024
_LUBBOCK, TX 79408

LION APPAREL
1529 SW 12157, STREET
OKLAHOMA CITY, OK 73170

FIRSTIN
21432 N, CENTRAL AVENUE
PHOENIX, AZ 85024

FALCON INDUSTRIES
P. 0. BOX 26248
EL PASO, TX 79926

QUEST ENTERPRISES, INC.
408 RUSSELL STREET
WALSENBURG, CO 81089

METRO FIRE APPARATUS SPECIALIST,
INC.

ALLEN WALTERS

6125 NORDLING ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076-4037

FIRE SERVICE EQUIPMENT
HUGO ARREOLA

1500 E WYOMING

EL PASQ, TX 79902

FIRE GEAR PROTECTIVE CLOTHING -
715 4™ AVENUE
RAN JUNCTION, CO 81501 -

ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B HUECO STREET
EL PASQ, TX 79903

FERRARA FIRE FIGHTING EQUIPMENT

774 JULIA DRIVE
NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130

NEEL ASSOCIATES, INC.
P.0.BOX 20126
WACO, TX 76702-0126

FIRST IN, INC,
500 W. PAISANO SUITE C
EL PASO, TX 79901

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN’S STORE
2430 E. YANDELL DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79903

NORTH AMERICAN FIRE EQUIPMENT CO.,
INC. (NAFECO)

- 1515 WEST MOULTON STREET N

DECATUR, AL 35601

- F & F SUPPLY CQ.

P. 0.BOX 26
ODEN, AR 71961 »

W.S. DARLEY & CO.
2000 ANSON DRIVE |
MELROSE PARK, IL 60160-1087

FIRE DEX, INC.
780 SOUNTH PROGRESS DRIVE

MEDINA, OH 44256

DISCOUNT EQUIPMENT & SAFETY
765 PENDALE ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79907

FERRARA FIRE APPARATUS
1106 11T STREET
P.0.BOX 300

SILVERTON, TX 79257

D&D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
ATTN: JAVIER COSME
6825 MARBLE CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79912




