CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: El Paso Police
AGENDA DATE: April 15, 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: A/C Tom Whitten, 564-7304 ; Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Mgr.,
541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:

Request that City Council award Solicitation No. 2008-060 to Bailey's House of Guns in the amount of
$27,160.40 and to C & G Wholesale in the amouint of $19,793.20 for the purchase of various uniform items.
Additionally, it is requested that Clty Council authorize City staff to megotiate, City Attorney's Office to review,
and the City Manager to execute any related contract documents and agreements necessary during the
contract.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The Department is required to furnish uniform employees various duty items to be used in the performance of their
work. Some of the items are; pistol belt, handcuff case, holster, etc. This bid will set the price for these items for
the next two years from date of award.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?
This bid was last awarded in 2005.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source
by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?
The funding for the bid will come from 21010060-503120, general fund. A budget transfer is not required. The bid
will be awarded as indicated: Bailey’s House of Guns $27,160.40 and C & G Wholesale $19.793.20. Total award is
46.953.60.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A
N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: (if required) FINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD: (7<IIMW/ /‘X[&v

(Example:  if[REA is initiAted by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
tformation copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: APRIL 3, 2008
PROJECT: POLICE DUTY GEAR DEPARTMENT: POLICE
BID: 2008-060 BUDGET NO.: 21010060-503120-01101
FUNDING SOURCE: POLICE OPERATING FUNDS, UNIFORMS & APPAREL SUPPLIES
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

RECOMMENDATION: VENDOR: #1  BAILEY’S HOUSE OF GUNS, INC.

HOUSTON, TX
ITEMS: GROUP | & I

ESTIMATED AWARD: $27,160.40/YR
CONTRACT PERIOD: 24 MONTHS
OPTION(S): NONE

DISCOUNT: NONE

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $54,320.80

RECOMMENDATION: VENDOR: #2 C & G POLICE SUPPLY dba C & G WHOLESALE
DALLAS, TX
ITEMS: GROUP 1l

ESTIMATED AWARD: $19,793.20/YR
CONTRACT PERIOD: 24 MONTHS
OPTION(S): NONE

DISCOUNT: NONE

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $39,586.40

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $93,907.20

Financial Services, Purchasing Division and Police Department recommend award as indicated, bidders
were the lowest meeting specification.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract maybe higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the
end of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BID’S SOLICITED 36 BID'S LOCALS 10

BID'S RECEIVED 12

BIDS SVCS 06

"NO BIDS" RECEIVED .00

CURRENT TAXES PAID _

OUT-OF-TOWN

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $93,907.20

FUNDS: AILABLE NOT AVAILABLE COMPTROLLER

REJECTED CITY CLERK
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APPRQVED: COUNCIL MEETING OF APRIL 15, 2008

TERRENCE FRIEBURG
PURCHASING MANAGER




Crity COUNCIL

JOHN CooK ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
MAYOR SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
JOYCE WILSON MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4

CITY MANAGER RACHEL QUINTANA, DISTRICT 5

EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6
STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8

GREGORY K. ALLEN
INTERIM CHIEF OF POLICE

POLICE DEPARTMENT

TO: Purchasing
ATTN: Ray Heredia

FROM: Gregory Allen, Interim Chief of Policegl

RE: Police Duty Gear, Bid #2008-060

DATE: - February 5, 2008

The Department recommends the above bid be awarded as indicated below by group. The
Department is awarding the bid by group. Each vendor is the low bidder meeting specifications
in all groups.

Rogue Tact did not bid on items 4 and 7 in Group I. Desantis Holsters and Leather did not
submit a bid for item 4 in Group II. Helmet Pro did not submit any bids for items in Group III.
Desantis Holsters and Leather did not submit bids for items 3 through 8. Bailey’s House did not
submit bids for item 3 and 5 through 8. The bid award is being recommended to C & G
Wholesale as low bidder meeting specifications for Group III.

All items in each group have to be compatible to insure a uniform appearance and that all items

can be placed on the belt.

Vendor Amount Source of Funding

Bailey’s House of Guns $22,465.60  21010060-503120 (General)

Bailey’s House of Guns 4,694.80  21010060-503120 (General)

C & G Wholesale 19.793.20 21010060-503120 (General)
Total $46,953.60

911 N. RAYNOR ¢ EL PAso, TX 79903 ¢ (915) 564-7000 « WWW.EPPD.ORG




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

ALAMO SHOOTER BAILEY'S HOUSE C & G POLICE SUPPLY GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
SUPPLY & UNIFORM CO. OF GUNS, INC. DBA C & G WHOLESALE AUSTIN, TX
) : EL PASO, TX HOUSTON, TX DALLAS, TX
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
. |
1. 140 BELT, GARRISQN $31.67 $4,433.80 $16.68 $2,335.20 $16.90 $2,366.00 $22.18 $3,105.20
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH SAFARILAND SAF
CATALOG NO. K57W 999 BW 999
2. 140 BELT, DUTY $32.61 $4,565.40 $31.82 $4,454.80 $34.30 $4,802.00 $44.93 $6,290.20
EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $4,690.00)
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH SAFARILAND SAF
MODEL NUMBER K59WSP 87 BW 87
3. 200 KEEPER SET, BELT $7.43 $1,486.00 $1.56 $312.00 $1.40 $280.00 $6.76 $1,352.00
EA. :
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI HOULD & GOODRICH SAF SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. K76W-4 65 BW 65-4
A. $89.10 | $12,474.00
4, 140 HOLSTER, DUTY, $52.69 $7,376.60 $61.15 $8,561.00 B. $66.30 $9,282.00 $77.20 $10,808.00
EA. RETENTION LEVEL lil C. $58.40 $8,176.00
MANUFACTURER A. W/070 LEVEL IlI;
: BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH B. W/200 HOLSTER LEVEL II; SAF
MODEL NUMBER K338W C. W/7940 HOLSTER 200
‘ 3¢ 140 HAND CUFF CASE $14.50 $2,030.00 $15.75 $2,205.00 $12.24 $1,713.60 $23.62 $3,306.80
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH SAF SAF
MODEL NUMBER K580WSP 90M BW 90
6. 140 MAGAZINE POUCH $20.10 $2,814.00 $18.94 $2,651.60 $15.25 $2,1 35.00 $25.06 $3,508.40
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH SAF SAF
CATALOG NO. K647W 77M 77

APPROVED BY: 4 ?

DATE: /? ‘/ ¢~&,7

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID

TAB

ULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BAILEY'S HOUSE

GROUP II:_ SPECIAL DUTY GEAR (WEB) i

o

ALAMO SHOOTER C & G POLICE SUPPLY GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
SUPPLY & UNIFORM CO. OF GUNS, INC. DBA C & G WHOLESALE AUSTIN, TX
: » EL PASO, TX HOUSTON, TX DALLAS, TX
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
| |
7. 140 RADIO POUCH, BLjACK, $24.84 $3,477.60 $13.90 $1,946.00 $27.50 $3,850.00 $32.64 $4,569.60
EA. BASKETWEAVE OR PLAIN ‘
MANUFACTURER | BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH BIA B1
IMODEL NUMBER K654W 79145 79145
A. $27,633.20
TOTAL GROUP I: $26,183.40 $22,465.60 B. $24,441.20 $32,940.20
| ' (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I: $22,700.80 C. $2

1. 40 BELT, DUTY $12.67 $506.80 $13.16 $526.40 A. $15.00 $600.00 $18.86 $754.40
EA. B. $14.00 $560.00
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 4301 SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. X54-2SP B. BIA 7205 7205
2, 40 BELT, DUTY INNER $32.15 $1,286.00 $11.50 $460.00 A. $12.80 $512.00 $16.13 $645.20
EA. B. $35.65 $1,426.00
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 4325 SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER X55 B. BIA 7225 4325
3. 40 KEEPER SET, BELT $7.09 $283.60 $1.35 $54.00 A. $5.92 $236.80 $7.06 $282.40
}- EA. B. $7.85 $314.00
..ANUFACTURER BIANCHI ‘GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 4200 SAF
CATALOG NO. B2099-4 B. BIA 6406 4200
4. 40 HOLSTER $38.97 $1,558.80 $52.37 $2,094.80 A. $89.10 $3,564.00 $103.71 $4,148.40
EA. B. $43.20 $1,728.00
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 070 SAF
MODEL NUMBER X341 B. BIA 7115 070

APPROVED BY:%

DATE: / J‘/g/ .@7

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO Bl

TAE

SULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

ALAMO SHOOTER BAILEY'S HOUSE C & GPOLICE SUPPLY | GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
SUPPLY & UNIFORM CO. OF GUNS, INC. DBA C & G WHOLESALE AUSTIN, TX
GROUP II: SPECIAL DUTY GEAR (WEB) EL PASO, TX HOUSTON. TX DALLAS, TX |
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCR|PTIQN UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
5. | 40 HANDCUFF CASE $12.06 $482.40 $11.50 $460.00 | A. $12.20 | $488.00 $14.54 $581.60
EA. B. $13.40 | $536.00
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 4260 SAF
MODEL NUMBER X70 B. BIA 7300 4260
6. | 40 MAGAZINE POUCH $16.45 $658.00 $14.40 $576.00 | A. $13.77 | $550.80 $21.60 $864.00
EA. ** | B. $18.22 | $725.80
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 4110 Bi
CATALOG NO. X627 B. BIA 7302 7302
11 (BIDDER'S TOTAL FOR A: $223.50)
7. | 40 RADIO POUCH $14.75 $590.00 $13.09 $523.60 | A. $14.95 | $598.00 $19.52 $780.80
EA. | : _ B. 16.47 | $655.80
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. UM 8880-4 BI
MODEL NUMBER X651 B. BIA 7314 7314
» (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP (A): $6,175.10)
TOTAL GROUP II: $5,365.60 $4,694.80 A $6,549.60 $8,056.80
B.: $5.051.60
GROUP I WACE & ACCESSORIES Eae oo =
1. | 140 AEROSOL HOLDER, 2 0Z $11.57 | $1,619.80 | $14.93 | $2,09020 | A. 12.24 | $1,713.60 | $15.20 | $2,128.00
- | EA. | B. $13.00 | $1,820.00
_.ANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 38-M BI
CATALOG NO. K681 B. BIA 7307 7307
' (BIDDER'S TOTAL FOR A: $1,797.60)
2. | 140 AEROSOL HOLDER, 3 0Z $14.00 | $1,960.00 | $14.93 | $2,09020 | A, $12.24 | $1,713.60 | $1520 | $2,128.00
EA. B. $13.00 | $1.820.00
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI GOULD & GOODRICH A. SAF 38M BI
MODEL NUMBER K631-3 B. BIA 7307 7307
APPROVED BY'cé é%
pATE: /2 —/4/ J/? 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 3




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR BID # 2008-060
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007 , ) DEPARTMENT: POLICE
. ALAMO SHOOTER BAILEY'S HOUSE C & G POLICE SUPPLY GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
SUPPLY & UNIFORM CO. OF GUNS, INC. DBA C & G WHOLESALE AUSTIN, TX
' EL PASO, TX HOUSTON, TX DALLAS, TX
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
3. 140 BATON (ASP) HOLiDER, $23.39 $3,274.60 NO BID $22.68 $3,175.20 $19.97 $2,795.80
|  EA. BREAKAWAY MODEL [
MANUFACTURER 1 ASP ASP ASP
CATALOG NO. 52233
1 140 HAND (3UFFSV.i $18.40 $2,576.00 $17.32 $2,424.80 $18.50 $2,590.00 $24.79 $3,470.60
EA. 3
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WESON SMITH & WESSON S&W SW
MODEL NUMBER | M100 NICKEL 100 350132
F7 |
5. 140 BATON, ASP 26" $54.59 $7,642.60 N0| BID $52.92 $7,408.80 $61.46 $8,604.40
EA.
MANUFACTURER ASP ASP ASP
CATALOG NO. 26 52611
|
6. 140 INSERT, BELT LOOP, $1.20 $168.00 NO BID $1.50 $210.00 $1.14 $159.60
EA. MODEL P-2200 |
MANUFACTURER SAFARILAND SAF SAF
MODEL NUMBER ' P 2200 P-2200
7. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY $9.59 $1,342.60 | NO BID $10.00 $1,400.00 $10.54 $1,475.60
EA. (MACE) MK3 |
~ ANUFACTURER DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DT
L;ATALOG NO. ] 5039 5039
8. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY $11.29 $1,580.60 NO BID $11.30 $1,582.00 $12.39 $1,734.60
EA. (MACE) MK4 |
MANUFACTURER DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DT
MODEL NUMBER 5049 5049
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP (A): $19,877.20)
TOTAL GROUP Ill: $20,164.20 $6,605.20 A. $19,793.20 $22,496.60
B. $20,006.00 |
APPROVED BY: %
DATE: A7 ‘/ 'y’d 7 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 4




BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

D TABULATION

BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060

ALAMO SHOOTER

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BAILEY'S HOUSE C & G POLICE SUPPLY GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
SUPPLY & UNIFORM CO. OF GUNS, INC. DBA C & G WHOLESALE AUSTIN, TX

EL PASO, TX HOUSTON, TX DALLAS, TX '
OPTION TO EXTEND: TO THE EXTENT PROVIDED FOR IN
IN CONTRACT, THE CITY, AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY
EXTEND THE INITIAL TERM OF THIS CONTRACT FOR TWO
(2) ADDITIONAL YEARS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF YES | X NO YES NO YES D NO YES NO | X
THE CURRENT TERM. IF THE OPTION TO RENEW IS

ERCISED THE CONTRACT WILL CONTINUE l:JNDER THE TO BE NEGOTIABLE NONE SELECTED
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS SET FORTH HEREIN. THE AT THAT TIME.
TOTAL DURATION OF THIS CONTRACT, INCLUDING THE
EXERCISE OF ANY OPTIONS UNDER THIS CLAUSE, SHALL
NOT EXCEED FOUR (4) YEARS.
1% - 10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS ,
30 CONSECUTIVE 15 - 45 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN 1

[HE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

HELGEN INDUSTRIES, INC.
DBA DESANTIS HOLSTER HELMET PRO NEW YORK POLICE ROGUETACTICAL.COM
& LEATHER GOODS MONTPELIER, ID SUPPLY, INC. W. SACRAMENTO, CA
GROUP I: DUTY GEAR | AMITYVILLE, NY ROCHESTER, NY
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 140 BELT, GARRlSdN $17.00 $2,380.00 $17.86 $2,500.40 $21.50 $3,010.00 $23.25 $3,255.00
EA. 1
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
|ICATALOG NO. B29 B 125 BW B125BW
2. 140 BELT, DUTY $36.81 $5,153.40 $30.82 $4,314.80 $38.16 $5,342.40 $43.00 $6,020.00
EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $3,753.40)
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
MODEL NUMBER B20 B 101 SL BW B101SLBW
3. 200 KEEPER SET, BELT $7.84 $1,568.00 $2.05 $410.00 $2.51 $502.00 $7.25 $1,450.00
EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $416.00)
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
CATALOG NO. uo1 S502-1 BW S502-1
4, 140 HOLSTER, DUTY, $61.04 $8,545.60 $67.56 $9,458.40 $81.33 $11,386.20 (7] (7]
EA. RETENTION LEVEL Il
MANUFACTURER ) DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME NO BID
MODEL NUMBER 049 H 746 SH BW H746SHBW
s 140 HAND CUFF CASE $16.86 $2,360.40 $15.98 $2,237.20 $19.24 $2,693.60 $28.60 $4,004.00
EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $2,335.20)
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
MODEL NUMBER U25 C 300 BW C300BW
6. 140 MAGAZINE POUCH $17.81 $2,493.40 $17.55 $2,457.00 $21.13 $2,958.20 $25.75 $3,605.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
CATALOG NO. u41 D 407 BW D407BW

APPROVED BY: ;Zg g .

DATE: /’2 - /7’07

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

HELGEN INDUSTRIES, INC.

DBA DESANTIS HOLSTER HELMET PRO NEW YORK POLICE ROGUETACTICAL.COM
& LEATHER GOODS MONTPELIER, ID SUPPLY, INC. W. SACRAMENTO, CA
GROUPI: DUTY GEAR | AMITYVILLE, NY ROCHESTER, NY
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
7. 140 RADIO POUCH, BL@;\CK, $22.09 $3,092.60 $23.15 $3,241.00 $27.87 $3,901.80 %] (7]
EA. BASKETWEAVE OR PLAIN ,
MANUFACTURER L DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME NO BID
IMODEL NUMBER : Us1 DH SWIVEL RADIO HOLDER BW | SWIVEL RADIO HOLDER BW
TOTAL GROUP I: , $25,593.40 $24,618.80 $29,794.20 $18,334.00
j (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I: $44 0)|| (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I: $24,624.80)|| (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP I $20,794.20)
GROUPIl: SPECIAL DUTY GEAR(WEB) | = - N -
1. 40 BELT, DUTY $23.99 $959.60 $19.61 $784.40 $23.61 $944.40 $18.38 $735.20
EA.
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
CATALOG NO. M20 NRB-FU NRB-FV
2. 40 BELT, DUTY INNER $23.99 $959.60 $11.83 $473.20 $14.24 $569.60 $16.00 $640.00
EA. ,
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
MODEL NUMBER M20 NB125-FU NB125-FV
3. 40 KEEPER SET, BELT $7.36 $294.40 $1.75 $70.00 $2.11 $84.40 $8.13 $325.20
. EA.
.....NUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
CATALOG NO. NO1 NS502-1 NS502-1
4, 40 HOLSTER $43.19 $1,727.60 $51.99 $2,079.60 $113.00 $4,520.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER NO BID DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
MODEL NUMBER NT-FORCE DS NT-FORCE DS
APPROVED BY: %
DATE: /’2 ’/3/’/7 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 7




CITY OF EL PASO BID

TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

HELGEN INDUSTRIES, INC.

DBA DESANTIS HOLSTER HELMET PRO NEW YORK POLICE ROGUETACTICAL.COM
& LEATHER GOODS MONTPELIER, ID SUPPLY, INC. W. SACRAMENTO, CA
GROUP II:_SPECIAL DUTY GEAR (WEB) AMITYVILLE, NY ROCHESTER, NY
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
5. 40 HANDCUFF CA§E $11.16 $446.40 $11.34 $453.60 $13.65 $546.00 $14.63 $585.20
EA. !
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
IMODEL NUMBER N27 NC 300 NC300
6. 40 MAGAZINE POUéH $14.49 $579.60 $14.74 $589.60 $17.75 $710.00 $14.13 $565.20
EA. ?
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME SAFARILAND 2007
CATALOG NO. N22 ND 407 DND407
7. 40 RADIO POUCH $19.24 $769.60 $18.20 $728.00 $21.91 $876.40 g (/]
EA.
MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL DON HUME DON HUME NO BID
MODEL NUMBER N51 NDH SWIVEL RADIO HOLDER NDH SWIVEL RADIO HOLDER
TOTAL GROUP II: $4,009.20 $4,826.40 $5,810.40 $7,370.80

GROUP ll: MACE & ACCESSORIES

1. 140 AEROSOL HOLDER, 2 0Z $13.20 $1,848.00 N/A $26.00 $3,640.00 $16.25 $2,275.00
- EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $153.02) .
....aANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL SAFARILAND BIANCHI 2007
CATALOG NO. U40 38-2-2

2. 140 AEROSOL HOLDER, 3 0Z $13.20 ‘ $1,848.00 N/A $26.00 $3,640.00 $16.25 $2,275.00

EA. (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $153.02)

MANUFACTURER DESANTIS EQUAL SAFARILAND BIANCHI 2007
MODEL NUMBER U40 38-2

APPROVED BY: %

DATE: /2 ’%/‘&7

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR BID # 2008-060
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
HELGEN INDUSTRIES, INC.
DBA DESANTIS HOLSTER HELMET PRO NEW YORK POLICE ROGUETACTICAL.COM
& LEATHER GOODS MONTPELIER, ID SUPPLY, INC. W. SACRAMENTO, CA
& A OR AMITYVILLE, NY ROCHESTER, NY
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE |  TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
!
3. 140 BATON (ASP) HOLDER, N/A $30.42 $4,258.80 $24.10 $3,374.00
EA. BREAKAWAY MODEL
MANUFACTURER NO BID ASP ASP 2007
CATALOG NO. . 52633
140 HAND CUFFS N/A $21.96 $3,074.40 $18.10 $2,534.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER NO BID SMITH & WESSON SMITH & WESSON 2007
MODEL NUMBER #100
5. 140 BATON, ASP 26" N/A $70.98 $9,937.20 $55.00 $7,700.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER NO BID ASP ASP 2007
CATALOG NO. 52611
6. 140 INSERT, BELT LOOP, N/A $1.56 $218.40 $1.50 $210.00
EA. MODEL P-2200
MANUFACTURER NO BID SAFARILAND SAFARLAND 2007
MODEL NUMBER P2200
7. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY N/A $12.84 $1,797.60 $11.88 $1,663.20
| EA. (MACE) MK3
. NUFACTURER NO BID DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY 2007
CATALOG NO. 5039
8. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY N/A $15.09 $2,112.60 $13.61 $1,905.40
EA. (MACE) MK4
MANUFACTURER NO BID DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY 2007
MODEL NUMBER 5049
TOTAL GROURP ik $3,696.00 N/A $28,679.00 $21,936.60
' (BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP Iii: $306.04)
APPROVED BY: ﬁ
DATE: / ,? -/ 5/'577 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 9




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

HELGEN INDUSTRIES, INC.

DBA DESANTIS HOLSTER HELMET PRO NEW YORK POLICE ROGUETACTICAL.COM
& LEATHER GOODS MONTPELIER, ID SUPPLY, INC. W. SACRAMENTO, CA
_ AMITYVILLE, NY ROCHESTER, NY
OPTION TO EXTEND: TO THE EXTENT PROVIDED FOR IN T
[CONTRACT, THE CITY, AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY
EXTEND THE INITIAL TERM OF THIS CONTRACT FOR TWO
(2) ADDITIONAL YEARS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE  YES No| X YES NO YES No| X YES| X NO D
JCURRENT TERM. IF THE OPTION TO RENEW IS EXERCISED, '
' CONTRACT WILL CONTINUE UNDER THE SAME TERMS
AND CONDITIONS SET FORTH HEREIN. THE TOTAL I
DURATION OF THIS CONTRACT, INCLUDING THE EXERCISE
OF ANY OPTIONS UNDER THIS CLAUSE, SHALL NOT
EXCEED FOUR (4) YEARS.
1% - 10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: (NOT CHECKED) NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
60 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: /%

DATE: A~/ 4—/7

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

"BID # 2008-060

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

ROGUETACTICAL.COM | TACTICAL GEAR NOW, INC. UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
W. SACRAMENTO, CA RICHARDSON, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
‘ (ALTERNATE BID) (ALTERNATE BID)
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1. 140 BELT, GARRIS(:)N $52.00 $7,280.00 $22.25 $3,115.00 $34.50 $4,830.00 $24.40 $3,416.00
EA. :
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. B57TW #B8V #999
2. 140 BELT, DUTY $44.17 $6,183.80 $39.50 $5,530.00 $36.50 $5,110.00 $44.50 $6,230.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER K59FLW #7960 #87
\
3. 200 KEEPER SET, BELT $11.00 $2,200.00 $8.25 $1,650.00 $8.60 $1,720.00 $7.50 $1,500.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. K764W #7906 #65
4, 140 HOLSTER, DUTY, $70.00 $9,800.00 $67.50 $9,450.00 $58.50 $8,190.00 $100.40 $14,056.00
: EA. RETENTION LEVEL Il
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER K338W #7940 #070SSIIl
-5, 140 HAND CUFF CASE $21.85 $3,059.00 $20.50 $2,870.00 $17.50 $2,450.00 $23.50 $3,290.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER B580W #7900 #90
6. 140 MAGAZINE POUCH $28.75 $4,025.00 $22.50 $3,150.00 $23.63 $3,308.20 $26.05 $3,647.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. K647W #7902 #77
APPROVED BY: ﬁ
DATE: (R -/ 4'd 7 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 1




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

ROGUETACTICAL.COM | TACTICAL GEARNOW,INC. | UNIFORMS OF TEXAS | UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
W. SACRAMENTO, CA RICHARDSON, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: DUTY GEAR | (ALTERNATE BID) (ALTERNATE BID)
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTIO;N UNIT PRICE . TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
|
7. | 140 RADIO POUCH, BLACK, $35.60 $4,984.00 $32.15 $4,501.00 $28.50 $3,990.00 $24.90 $3,486.00
EA. BASKETWEAVE OR PLAIN
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI UNCLE MIKES
MODEL NUMBER K652-1W #7914S #7499-4
TOTAL GROUP I: $37,531.80 $30,266.00 $29,598.20 $35,625.00

GROUP Il:_SPECIAL DUTY GEAR (WEB)
1. 40 BELT, DUTY $16.70 $668.00 $26.50 $1,060.00 $14.50 $580.00 $18.90 $756.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. X50 #7205 #4301
2. 40 BELT, DUTY INNER $44.60 $1,784.00 $13.95 $558.00 $36.00 $1,440.00 $15.90 $636.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 . GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER X55 #7225 #4325
3. 40 KEEPER SET, BELT $10.40 $416.00 $6.25 $250.00 $8.50 $340.00 $7.50 $300.00
- EA.
1..ANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. ' B2099-4 #6406 #4200
4, 40 HOLSTER $46.60 $1,864.00 $62.50 $2,500.00 $43.00 $1,720.00 $100.40 $4,016.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER X341 #7115 #070SSllI

APPROVED BY:

DATE: /’2’/6/'&77

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT

12




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

ROGUETACTICAL.COM | TACTICAL GEARNOW, INC. | UNIFORMS OF TEXAS | UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
W. SACRAMENTO, CA RICHARDSON, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
: (ALTERNATE BID) (ALTERNATE BID)
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE " UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
5. | 40 HANDCUFF CASE $16.85 | $674.00 | $13.95 | $558.00 $15.50 $620.00 $16.30 | $652.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER X70 #7300 #4260
6. | 40 MAGAZINE POUCH $21.65 | $866.00 | $17.25 | $690.00 $18.88 $755.20 $13.79 | $551.60
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. X527 #7302 #4116
7. | 40 RADIO POUCH $19.55 | $782.00 | $20.15 | $806.00 $22.90 $916.00 $19.90 | $796.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI UNCLE MIKES
MODEL NUMBER X652-1 #7314S #8880-2
TOTAL GROUP Ii: $7,054.00 $6,422.00 $6,371.20 $7,707.60
GROUP Il MACE & ACCESSORIES
1. | 140 AEROSOL HOLDER, 2 0Z $16.25 | $2,275.00 | $11.95 | $1,673.00 | $13.88 | $1,943.20 | $41.90 | $5,866.00
- _| EA.
..ANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
CATALOG NO. X681-3 #7307 #38-2-2
2. | 140 AEROSOL HOLDER/ 3 0Z $16.25 | $2,275.00 | $11.95 | $1,673.00 | $13.88 $1,043.20 | $24.20 | $3,388.00
EA. |
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI 2007 GOULD & GOODRICH BIANCHI SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER X681-3 #7307 #38-2

APPROVED BY: %

DATE: /»?‘/4/67

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO

D TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

| ROGUETACTICAL.COM

TACTICAL GEAR NOW, INC.

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

W. SACRAMENTO, CA RICHARDSON, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE BID) (ALTERNATE BID)
ITEM# | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
3. 140 BATON (ASP) HOLDER, $24.10 $3,374.00 $29.95 $4,193.00 $24.10 $3,374.00 $24.10 $3,374.00
EA. BREAKAWAY MODEL
MANUFACTURER I ASP 2007 ASP HWC HWC
CATALOG NO. 52633 - EXACT #52633 #52633
" 140 HAND CUFFS $18.10 $2,534.00 $20.25 $2,835.00 $19.80 $2,772.00 $19.80 $2,772.00
EA. i
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WESSON 2007 SMITH & WESSON KROLL S & W KROLL S & W
MODEL NUMBER , 100 - EXACT M100 M100
i
5. 140 BATON, ASP 26" $55.00 $7,700.00 $65.25 $9,135.00 $54.00 $7,560.00 $54.00 $7,560.00
EA.
MANUFACTURER ASP 2007 ASP F26B KWC HWC
CATALOG NO. #52611 #F26B #F26B
6. 140 INSERT, BELT LOOP, $1.50 $210.00 $1.50 $210.00 $1.50 $210.00 $1.50 $210.00
EA. MODEL P-2200
MANUFACTURER SAFARILAND 2007 SAFARILAND SAFAILAND SAFARILAND
MODEL NUMBER P2200 - EXACT P-2200 #P-2200
7. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY $11.88 $1,663.20 $12.50 $1,750.00 $10.15 $1,421.00 $10.15 $1,421.00
| EA. (MACE) MK3
NUFACTURER DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY 2007 DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DEFENSE TECH DEFENSE TECH
CATALOG NO. FIRST DEFENSE MX3-EXACT #5039 #5039
8. 140 FIRST DEFENSE SPRAY $13.61 $1,905.40 $14.75 $2,065.00 $11.75 $1,645.00 $11.75 $1,645.00
EA. (MACE) MK4 _
MANUFACTURER DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY 2007 DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY DEFENSE TECH DEFENSE TECH
MODEL NUMBER FIRST DEFENSE MK4-EXACT #5049 #5049
TOTAL GROUP lii: $21,936.60 $23,534.00 $20,868.40 $26,236.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL GROUP Ill: $25,534.00 .
APPROVED BY: %
DATE: /"2'/4'd 7 2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT 14




CITY OF EL PASO BID

TABULATION

[BIDTTEM: POLICE DUTY GEAR
BID DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2008-060
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

| ROGUETACTICAL.COM

W. SACRAMENTO, CA
(ALTERNATE BID)

TACTICAL GEAR NOW, INC.
RICHARDSON, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE BID)

OPTION TO EXTEND: TO THE EXTENT PROVIDéD FORINT
CONTRACT, THE CITY, AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY
EXTEND THE INITIAL TERM OF THIS CONTRACT FOR TWO

(2) ADDITIONAL YEARS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF TH YES NO _YES| X ,NQTT_‘ YES| X NO D YES| X NO
CURRENT TERM. IF THE OPTION TO RENEW IS EXERCISED —

' CONTRACT WILL CONTINUE UNDER THE SAME TERMS
AND CONDITIONS SET FORTH HEREIN. THE TOTAL I
DURATION OF THIS CONTRACT, INCLUDING THF EXERCISE
OF ANY OPTIONS UNDER THIS CLAUSE, SHALL NOT
EXCEED FOUR (4) YEARS.

2% -10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 1% - 20 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS_ NET - 30 DAYS
30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS 21 DAYS 21 DAYS
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 36 BIDS RECEIVED: 12 BIDS LOCAL: 10 NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY: C%

/R(T2]

DATE:

2008-060 POLICE DUTY GEAR - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B HUECO STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD.
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32205

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVENUE
GARDENA, CA 90247

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARKWAY SUITE C
TUCSON, AZ 85713

SIGNATURE UNIFORMS
6356 EDGEMERE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SOUTHWEST LAW ENFORCEMENT
2208 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903 '\)"?

SIRCHIE FINGERPRINT LAB
100 HUNTER PLACE
YOUNGSVILLE, NC 27596

TEXAS SECURITY
600 A SOUTH VALLEY MILLS
WACO, TX 76711

ATTN: TERRYJONES—
GALLS

2680 PALUMBO DRIVE
LEXINGTON, KY 40509-1000

SAFETY & SECURITY
INTERNATIONAL

P. 0. BOX 1028

FRANKLIN, TN 37065-1028

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMARRON
EL PASO, TX 79915

EXCLUSIVE LAW ENFORCEMENT
3004 DONNER LAKE CIRCLE
DENTON, TX 76210-2900

HARBOR LINEN CO.
P. O. BOX 1864
CHERRY HILL, NJ 08034

PROFESSIONAL POLICE SUPPLY
722 CLAY STREET
OAKLAND, CA 94607 \Y

DON HUME LEATHER GOODS

P. 0. BOX 351

MIAMI, OK 74355, %)
Lchnﬂﬁf op d

S06 2LTH Aw-_ NW
MAM I Oy TUu3sy-226%F
UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

6601 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

ARMOR HOLDING INC.
13386 INTERNATIONAL PARKWAY
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32218

PRIME VENDOR, INC.
4608 CEDAR AVENUE SUITE 106
WILMINGTON, NC 28403-4429

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & 0}
MEN’S STORE ,\ :
304 E. OVERLAND res

EL PASO, TX 79901 (y} ‘

FAMOUS UNIFORMS INC.
3942 LEOPARD
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408

MARCOBO UNIFORMS CO.
3535 YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TX 79925

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY
141 SUMMIT AVENUE SUITE 2
PLANO, TX 75074

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
2545 BROCKTON SUITE 100
AUSTIN, TX 78758

TOMMY ARP
911 HAWK DRIVE
MENCHACA, TX 78652

C & G WHOLESALE |
40354 MILLER ROAD {7
DALLAS, TX 75238 |\’

DUTY POLICE EQUIPMENT
P. 0. BOX 39
MAXWELL, TX 78656

7 ROCKY MOUNTAINDYN.

5400 WARD DRIVE BUILDING 5
ARVADA, CO 80002

LIGHTFIGHTER TACTICAL INC.
15858A FT. CAMPBELL BLVD.
OAK GROVE, KY 42262-7211

CCW VENTURES, INC. ,\‘?‘
310 INGLEWOOD DRIVE \)
TALLAHASSE, FL 32301

OLIVEIRA FIREARMS
10125 TRINIDAD DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925-5429




BAILEY’S HOUSE OF GUNS
3626 BLUEBONNET DRIVE
HOUSTON, TX 77053

DEPOT USA
9716 DYER STREET SUITE 300
EL PASO, TX 79925

TRANSCON MANUFACTURING
5725 SOUTH MAIN STREET
LOS ANGELES, CA 90037-4172

MICHAEL E. COLLINS

SAFETY TRAINER & CONSULTANT
5020 LYNCH LANE

EL PASO, TX 79932

OMB POLICE SUPPLY
9736 LEGLER ROAD A&
LENEXA, KS 66219 0

SAFETY & SECURITY
INTERNATIONAL

1664 MALLORY LANE
BRENTWOOD, TN 37027






