DATE: April 14, 2005

~
TO: Municipal Clerk (J’P\
FROM: Byron E. Johnson, C.P.M.

Director of Purchasing x 4313

THRU: Aurora Wells
Bid Clerk ext. 4038

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of
APRIL 26, 2005.

Iltem should read as follows:

Solicitation No. 2005-181 4 Person Tilt Cab Pumpers

Award to: First In, Inc.
El Paso, Texas

Iltem (s): #1A-1

Amount: $793,398.00

Department: El Paso Fire Department

Funds available: 71150069-508029-07818-G7130CD0038 ($396,699.00)
71150069-508029-07817-G7130CD0037 ($396,699.00)

Funding source: Community Development Grant

Total award: $793,398.00

District (s): 6.8

The Fire, Fleet Services and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated
as this vendor has provided the Best Value Bid. This vendor is also the low responsible
and responsive bidder.

This is a fixed-price, single (one-time) purchase, to purchase two (2) 4 Person Tilt Cab
Pumpers. There is an option from the vendor to purchase up to one hundred percent
(100%) of the original contract quantities, at the same unit price, if the option is
exercised within three hundred and sixty-five (365) days, from the date of award of the
contract. No prompt payment discount is offered.

Contact person: Monica Vera, Administrative Analyst at 541-4234.
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AGENDA FOR:_APRIL 26, 2005
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CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: Fire Department
AGENDA DATE: April 19, 2005
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Michael Calderazzo/771-1071

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED:

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City
Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $
amount if applicable.

Award contract for bid no. 2005-181 for two 4-Person Tilt-Cab Pumpers to First In, Inc.. 500 W. Paisano, Ste. C, Ll
Paso, TX 79901. Total value of award is $793,398.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of
this action? What are the citizen concerns?

In accordance with the fire department’s apparatus replacement program, these two new pumpers will replace front
line units that have exceeded their typical useful life for first line use.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes - Bid No. 2004-251, nine 4-Person Tilt-Cab Pumpers previously awarded in December, 2004.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source
by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

See associated award recommendation memo for funding information.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

*******‘k***********REQU]RED t&UTHORIZATION********************

YRT 4 wmT

LEGAL: (11 required)

- T
DEPARTMENT HEAD: SN AL / A eiag
(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

Date: April 14, 2005

PROJECT: 4 Person Tilt Cab Pumpers
SOLICITATION NO: 2005-181 Department: El Paso Fire Department
BUDGET NO: 71150069-508029-07818-G7130CD0038 ($396,699.00)

71150069-508029-07817-G7130CD0037 ($396,699.00)
FUNDING SOURCE:  Community Development Grant
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICTS: 6, 8
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: First In, Inc.
El Paso, Texas
ltem: #1A-1
Amount; $793,398.00

The Fire, Fleet Services and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated as this vendor has
provided the Best Value Bid. This vendor is aiso the low responsibie and responsive bidder.

This is a fixed-price, single (one-time) purchase, to purchase two (2) 4 Person Tilt Cab Pumpers. There is an
option from the vendor to purchase up to one hundred percent (100%) of the original contract quantities, at
the same unit price, if the option is exercised within three hundred and sixty-five (365) days, from the date of
award of the contract. No prompt payment discount is offered.

BIDS SOLICITED- 35 (2local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 2
“‘NO BID” RECEIVED- -0

CURRENT TAXES PAID- _XX
OUT-OF-TOWN--

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $793,398.00

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx

COUNCIL APPROVED REJECTED CITY CLERK
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APPROVED: w
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Council Meeting Date: April 26, 2005
ad
Byron E. Johnson ?\.P.M. R

Director of Purchdsjng



Ciry Council.

SUSAN AUSTIN, DISTRICT |
RoOBERT A. CUSHING, JR., DISIRICT 2
ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
JouN F. Cook, DISTRICT 4
PRESIORTEGA, DISTRICT S
PAUL J. ESCOBAR, DISTRICT 6

ROBERTO RIVERA VIVIAN ROJAS, DISTRICT 7
Firi: Chirr ANTHONY W. COBOS, DISTRICT 8

JOE WARDY
MAYOR

JOYCE WILSON
Ciry MANAGER

FIRE DEPARTMENT
MEMORANDUM

To: Monica Vera
Procurement Analyst

From: Michael Calderazzo /; C
Maintenance Chief*

Subject: Solicitation Number 2005-181
Date: April 13, 2005
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For two 4-Person Tilt-Cab Pumpers, we recommend awarding the above bid to First In, Inc., 500
W. Paisano. Ste. C, El Paso, TX 79901 as the best value responsive bidder for $793.398.00. All
optional items should be included under Alternate bid item 1A-1 for a unit price of $396,699.00.
A best value analysis is included with this recommendation. Funding for this contract is as
tollows:

Community Development Block Grant

Dept. 71150069

SubObject 508029

Requisition #’s 2005005567 and 2005005602
Funding Source 07818 and 07817

Project G7130CD0038 and G7130CD0037
Districts 6, 8

EL1 %005,

Fire Department -
pIS O Class 1

8600 MONTANA AVE. « EL. PASO, TX 79925-1214 ¢ 915.771.1000 « 915.771.1026 FAX * sV\ % DT ASOHE NASGOY
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BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT
4 Person Tilt Cab Pumpers
BID NO. 2005-181

$793,398.00

M

(max 70 points)

@)

(max 20 points)

@)

(max 5 points)

4)

(max 5 points)

©)

(Max 5 Points)

105 POINTS
MAX

BIDDER NAME/BID . Local Availability of [Design Quality of
AMOUNT Cost Delivery Employees |Service and Parts| the Apparatus TOTAL POINTS
F & F Supply 62.82 15.00 2.00 4.00 5.00 88.82
$884,058.00
First In, Inc. 70.00 20.00 2.00 4.00 5.00 101.00
$793,398.00

EVALUATION OF CRITERIA:

1) Cost (Lowest Bid / Vendor's Bid X 70) (70 Points)

2) Delivery Time (20 Points)
120 days or less 20 Points

121 days - 210 days 15 Points
211 days - 300 days 10 Points
Greater than 300 days 0 Points

3) Number of local employees in El Paso (5 Points)

Over 10 5 Points
5-10 3 Points
1-5 2 points
None - 0 points




4) Availablity of Parts and Service (5 Points)
a. Authorized Service Facilities

0-1000 Miles 1 Point

Over 1500 Miles - 0 Points

b. Factory Trained and Certified Technicians
5-10 technicians - 1 Point
Under 5 technicians - 0 Points

c. Operating Hours of Parts and Sevice Department
Over 40 hours/week - 1 Point
Under 40 hours/week - 0 Points

d. 24 Hour Web and Telephone Support
Yes -2 Points
No - 0 Points

5) Design Quality of Appratus (5 Points)
Compartmentation (Size, design, compliance, e.g.) 2 Points
Aerial Capacity 2 Points

Cab (Room, A/C, Seating) 2 Points

Turning Radius (under/over 33 ft.) 2 Points

Safety Features (airbags, cab integrity, etc.) 2 Points



CITY

Or kL

210 TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS BID # 2005-181
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
F & F SUPPLY F & F SUPPLY FIRST IN, INC
BIG LAKE, TEXAS BIG LAKE, TEXAS EL PASO, TEXAS
| ALTERNATE BID
ITEM| QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE| UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. | 2 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS | $451,909.00 $903,818.00 NO BID NO BID $424,759.00 $849,518.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH i
MANUFACTURER KME PIERCE

MODEL NUMBER

PREDATOR PUMPER

ALTERNATE BIDS" (SEE SECTION B, PARAGRA

PH TITLED "ALTERNATE BIDS")

TOTAL PRICE

| UNIT PRICE

DASH PUMPER

UNIT PRICE

SR L
TOTAL PRICE

ITEM| QTY. DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE
CUSTOM PUMPER THAT MEETS THE
1A-1| 2 DESCRIBED HEREIN, WITH A MINIMUM 40  $442,029.00 $884,058.00 $399,201.00 | $798,402.00 | $396,699.00 | $793,398.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH |HP RATING AND IS HARWIRED IN LIEU Of
BEING MULTIPLEXED
MANUFACTURER KME EXCEL PUMPER KME PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER , ENFORCER PUMPER
4 PERSON TIL CAB PUMBER
1A-2] 2 COMMERCIAL CHASIS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $365,825.00 |  $731,650.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER FREIGHTLINER CHASIS/PIERCE BODY
MODEL NUMBER FL M2 -112 / PIERCE PUMPER
ADDITONAL REQURED EQUIPMENT: (PURCHASE SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY OF FUNDING)
ITEM QUANTITY AND DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
TWO SNAPTITE FSA FT 40 5" STORTZ
0O1.|TO 4" EL PASO THREADS ADAPTER $510.00 $510.00 $256.00
MANUFACTURER REDHEAD BRASS
MODEL NUMBER S - 54RL
ONE 30' LENGTH OF 5" ANGUS 3 PLY HI-VOL
02. |FIRE HOSE WITH SNAPTITE STORTZ $225.00 $225.00 $245.00
CONTRAXIAL SEXLESS COUPLINGS
MANUFACTURER FIRE QUIP FIRE QUIP KEY
MODEL NUMBER 50 - 400 - STORZ
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ONE AKRON SLOW OPEN BUTTERFLY
03. |VALVE #7960 OR EQUIVALENT, 6" FNST TO $1,356.00 $1,356.00 $1,328.00
6" MNST. 6" FNST SWIVEL ON 30 DEGREE
ELBOW TO 5" STORTZ WITH CAP
MANUFACTURER / AKRON AKRON ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER ) $2,860.00

APPROVED BY: /1A

DATE: 11

2005-181 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASD BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LLAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRST IN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION i TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
FIFTEEN 100' LENGTH OF 5" ANGUS 3 PLY

0O4. |HI-VOL FIRE HOSE WITH SNAPTITE STORTZ $7,575.00 $7,575.00 $6,600.00
CONTRAXIAL SEXLESS COUPLINGS

MANUFACTURER FIRE QUIP FIRE QUIP KEY

MODEL NUMBER j RC 50 - 400 - STORZ
ELEVEN 100' LENGTHS OF 3" POLYESTER

0O5. |OR DACRON 600 POUND TEST DOUBLE $3,512.00 $3,512.00 $2,490.00
JACKETED HYPALON TREATED YELLOW
FIRE HOSE WITH 2 1/2" NST THREADED
PYROLITE COUPLINGS

MANUFACTURER FIRE QUIP FIRE QUIP KEY DP

MODEL NUMBER 30 -800 X100 ARN
TWELVE LENGTHS OF 2 1/2" POLYESTER

06. |OR DACRON 600 POUND TEST DOUBLE $1,520.00 $1,520.00 $1,786.00
JACKETED HYPALON TREATED YELLOW
FIRE HOSE WITH 2 1/2" NST THREADED
PYROLITE COUPLINGS

MANUFACTURER FIRE QUiP FIRE QUIP KEY

MODEL NUMBER

DP 25 - 800 X 50 ARN

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: LY

i | 7

DATE: 7] lilts

2005-181 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF L PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY F & F SUPPLY FIRST IN, INC
BIG LAKE, TEXAS BIG LAKE, TEXAS EL PASO, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
TWENTY-THREE 50' LENGTHS OF 1 3/4"
O7. |POLYESTER OR DACRON 800 POUND TEST $1,974.00 $1,974.00 $1,593.00
DOUBLE JACKETED HYPALON TREATED
YELLOW FIRE HOSE WITH 1 1/2" NST
PYROLITE COUPLINGS
MANUFACTURER FIRE QUIP FIRE QUIP KEY
MODEL NUMBER DP 17 - 800 X 50 ARN
THREE AKRON #1581 PYROLITE LEADER
08. |LINE WYE OR EQUIVALENT 2 1/2",FNST X $450.00 $450.00 $740.00
TWO 1 1/2" MNST (ELBOW FOR THIS IS ON
LEFT REAR OUTLET). ;
MANUFACTURER RED HACL RED HEAD ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER ; B-100
EIGHT AKRON #1767 1 1/2" WIDE RANGE
09. [TURBO JET NOZZLES, WITH #2431 SABER $4,488.00 $4,488.00 $1,925.00
SHUT OFF, 15/16" ORIFICE AT 100PSi OR
EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER ‘ PER ABOVE B - 275GAT
ONE AKRON #1442 2 1/2" BALL SHUTOFF
010.|PYROLITE NOZZLE WITH STACKED TIPS $355.00 $355.00 $223.00
OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE DB275A W/ST-185A
TWO AKRON #1726 2 1/2" BREAKAWAY
O11.|TURBOJET NOZZLE WITH TWIST SHUT OFF, $1,210.00 $1,210.00 $523.00
100PSI OR EQUIVALENT
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE DB-275A 2.5 C 1.5 W/CHIEF #4D00-22

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

)

)

APPROVED BY: |, J"‘
A

DATE:__ [ ] {/[s]
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2005-181 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




O BIiD TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY F & F SUPPLY FIRST IN, INC
BIG LAKE, TEXAS BIG LAKE, TEXAS EL PASO, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ONE AKRON #3488 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" CHROME
012.|DISCHARGE PIPE (FOR MONITOR:OR INCL INCL $104.00
EQUIVALENT)
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELKHART
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE 282A
ONE AKRON #2499 STACK TIPS (FOR
013.|MONITOR) OR EQUIVALENT INCL INCL $280.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELHART
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE ST-194
FOUR AKRON 336 CP BRASS DOUBLE
0O14.|MALE ADAPTERS OR EQUIVALENT $170.00 $170.00 $155.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON REDHEAD
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE BR35 21/2: DM PC
FOUR AKRON 335 CP BRASS DOUBLE
015.|FEMALE ADAPTERS OR EQUIVALENT $200.00 $200.00 $190.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON REDHEAD
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE BR 36 21/2 DEPC
EIGHT 2 1/2" AKRON 350 RUNNING BOARD
016.|MOUNTS OR EQUIVALENT ‘ $130.00 $130.00 $71.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON REDHEAD
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE STYLE M
FOUR 1 1/2" AKRON 350 RUNNING BOARD
017.|MOUNTS OR EQUIVALENT $60.00 $60.00 $59.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON REDHEAD
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE STYLE M
ONE AKRON #773 3" HOSE JACKET OR
018.|EQUIVALENT $549.00 $549.00 $532.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON
MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE AKRON 773 -3"

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDE

APPROVED BY: ___| bt

Y
DATE:_‘“f [ [} {,
masaee

& PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

2005-181 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF L PASO B

iD TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY F & F SUPPLY FIRST IN, INC
BIG LAKE, TEXAS BIG LAKE, TEXAS EL PASO, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ONE AKRON #588 HOSE CLAMP AND ONE
019.|AKRON #589 MOUNT OR EQUIVALENT $375.00 $375.00 $305.00
MANUFACTURER AKRON AKRON ELHART
MODEL NUMBER . OR HEBERT 285 & B
TWO AKRON #448 DUAL WRENCH HOLDER
020.|WITH TWO STYLE 10 WRENCHES OR $144.00 $144.00 $79.00
EQUIVALENT '
MANUFACTURER RED HEAD RED HEAD REDHEAD
MODEL NUMBER 146 - 2
021.|TWO SNAPTITE #FSPH $128.00 $128.00 $106.00
MANUFACTURER SNAPTITE SANPTITE GFE
MODEL NUMBER SSMP
SIX ANGUS MB5 5" STORTZ MOUNTING
022.|BRACKETS $370.00 $370.00 $120.00
MANUFACTURER ANGUS ANGUS REHEAD
MODEL NUMBER SMP - 50
023.|0ONE LARGE RUBBER MALLET $15.00 $15.00 $12.00
MANUFACTURER FIREHOOKS
MODEL NUMBER cM2
TWO WHITE CANVAS 12' X 18' SALVAGE
024.|COVER $167.00 $167.00 $195.00
MANUFACTURER FEDD GO SPORT
MODEL NUMBER TANK
025.|TWO WHEEL CHOCKS $404.00 $404.00 $60.00
MANUFACTURER LICE QUICK CHOC WORDEN
MODEL NUMBER ZICO NGS

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: I LU

A
DATE: / ,f/ /;/‘/im
{ [

2005-181 4 PERSUN 11T CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARITMEN




CITY OF EL "AST

[

s

D TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRST IN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ONE COLLINS HAND HELD SPOTlTIGHT WITH

026.MOMENTARY SWITCH WIRED AND MOUNTED $230.00 $230.00 $150.00
AS DIRECTED ON THE OFFICER SIDE

MANUFACTURER COLLINS COLLINS COLLINS

MODEL NUMBER PER ABOVE CD-CL12

027.|SIX VULCAN STREAMLIGHTS $474.00 $474.00 $450.00

MANUFACTURER UULCAN SL UULCAN STREAMLIGHT FIRE VULCAN

MODEL NUMBER NO INSTALLATION
TWO FLATHEAD AXE WITH WOOD HANDLE

028.{AND MOUNTING HARDWARE $185.00 $185.00 $117.00

MANUFACTURER GFE CFE GFE WF - 6

MODEL NUMBER W/ AS510 & AS520
ONE PICKHEAD AXE WITH WOQOD HANDLE

029.|AND MOUNTING HARDWARE $88.00 $88.00 $68.00

MANUFACTURER : GFE CFE GFEWP -6

MODEL NUMBER : W/ AS510 & AS520 & P- APC
ONE 20LB. ABC EXTINGUISHER WITH

030.|BRACKET $118.00 $118.00 $80.00

MANUFACTURER AX419

MODEL NUMBER 10HB VEHICLE BRACKET
ONE 15LB. CO2 (CARBON DIOXIDE) WITH

031.|BRACKET $198.00 $198.00 $120.00

MANUFACTURER AX322

MODEL NUMBER W/ 5HB BRACKET
ONE 5LB. ABC EXTINGUISHER WITH

032.|BRACKET : $50.00 $50.00 $30.00

MANUFACTURER I AX500 T

MODEL NUMBER

W/ VEHICLE BRACKET

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WiLL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: 4| n

o~
~

DATE: 1’ '

2005-181 4 PERSGN TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OrF EL

D Y A

i TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRSTIN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ONE 2 1/2 GALLON PRESSURIZED WATER
033.|EXTINGUISHER WITH BRACKET $118.00 $118.00 $78.00
MANUFACTURER AX240
MODEL NUMBER W/ BRACKET
TWO ROLLS OF BLACK RUBBER TURTLE
034.|STYLE MATTING FOR COMPARTMENTS $800.00 $800.00 $208.00
AND SHELVES
MANUFACTURER TURTLE PLASTICS TURTLE PALSTICS TURTLE TILE
MODEL NUMBER INSTALLED $1,212.00
FOUR RECHARGEABLE VULCAN STREAM
035.|LIGHTS SHALL BE MOUNTED IN THE CAB $316.00 $316.00 $500.00
MANUFACTURER UULCAN SL UULCAN STREAMLIGHT FIRE BULCAN
MODEL NUMBER 4401 - INSTALLED
ONE 36" HALLIGAN TYPE TOOL. NO
036./MOUNTING HARDWARE TO BE PROVIDED $144.00 $144.00 $130.00
MANUFACTURER ZiCO 3099 #5010 - 285 - 110
MODEL NUMBER »
ONE AXE/BAR CARRYING AND SHOULDER
037.|STRAP. ZICO ORDER #ABCS, PART #3099- $47.00 $47.00 $40.00
760-000, OR COMPARABLE ITEM |
MANUFACTURER : ZICO zICO ZICO
MODEL NUMBER 3099 - 760 - 000
THREE ADJUSTABLE SHOULDER STRAPS
038.|FOR HIGH-RISE HOSE PACK, ZICO ORDER $42.00 $42.00 $35.00
#22-4800, PART #5010-285-110, OR
COMPARABLE ITEM
MANUFACTURER ZICO zIco zZICO

MODEL NUMBER

#5010 - 285 - 110

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES Wil.l. BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: [ li "
j I

{]

[
DATE: {1
[T

{

2000-1671 4 PrziRoUM L] CAB PUMPFERY - FIKE DEFPARKITIVMIENI




CITY OF EL 4

®,

o 2iD TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRST IN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

TOTAL PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

NINE 16" TO 25" VARIABLE STRAPS FOR
039.|HIGH-RISE PACK, ZICO ORDER #UMVS-
1625-11, PART #3099-738-000, OR
COMPARABLE ITEM

$199.00

$199.00

$171.00

MANUFACTURER

ZICO

ZICO

ZICO

MODEL NUMBER

#3099 - 738- 00

THREE AKRON RIGID FEMALE TO MALE
040.|ADAPTER (REDUCER) 2 1/2" TO 1-1/2" OR
EQUIVALENT

$17.00

$17.00

$64.00

MANUFACTURER

RED HEAD

AKRON OR RED HEAD

REDHEAD

MODEL NUMBER

STYLE 37

HOSE BED COVER - HEAVY DUTY (MINIMUM
041./18 TO 20 OUNCE MATERIAL) RIP STOP TYPE

WEIGHTED FLAP AT REAR CAPABLE OF

$696.00

$696.00

$625.00

COVERING ENTIRE HOSE LOAD. |
MANUFACTURER ‘

ASC OF EL PASO

MODEL NUMBER

DAVID CLARK VOICE ACTIVATED INTERCOM,
042.|SYSTEM WITH RADIO INTERFACE. FOUR
STATION WITH HEADSETS

$5,404.00

$5,404.00

$3,675.00

MANUFACTURER

DAVID CLARK

DAVID CLARK

DAVID CLARK 4-MAN HEADSET

MODEL NUMBER

W/ PUMP PANEL PTT

FOUR SCOTT AIR-PAK 50 (2216PSI) WITH
043.|CARBON CYLINDER, EBSS, WITH MOLDED
CASE #804849-05 WITH ACCESSORY HOSE
#27537-01

$11,296.00

$11,296.00

$12,366.00

MANUFACTURER

SCOTT

SCOTT

SCOTT

MODEL NUMBER

804849 - 05 - 02 W/805796-02 PACK ALERT & 27537-01 HOSE ASSY

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES

]
APPROVED BY:__ [ [ A/,
N

DATE: o ([

2005-181 4 PERSON TiLT

WIiLL BE CONSIDERED.
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRST IN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
SEVEN SCOTT CARBON CYLINDER AND
044.|VALVE ASSEMBLY 30 MINUTE #804840-01 $4,011.00 $4,011.00 $3,820.00
MANUFACTURER SCOTT SCOTT SCOTT
MODEL NUMBER 804840-1
FOUR "VOICE VECTOR" RADIO INTERFACE/
045.|VOICE AMPLIFIER COMMUNICATION $2,817.00 $2,817.00 $2,773.00
SYSTEM FOR USE WITH MOTOROLA ASTRO
RADIO: GOLDEN WEST COMMUNICATIONS
MANUFACTURER SCOTT SCOTT
MODEL NUMBER 200119-409-ENVOY RADIOCOM
ONE SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL FRONT
046./GOODYEAR 315/80R22.5, 18 PLY G291 $917.00 $917.00 $1,000.00
MOUNTED ON 22.50' X 9.00" ALUMINUM
WHEEL WITH 10 STUD 11.25" BOLT CIRCLE
MANUFACTURER GOODYEAR AS SPECIFIED
MODEL NUMBER
ONE SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL REAR
047.,GOODYEAR 12R22.50, 16 PLY "MUD AND $1,625.00 $1,625.00 $915.00
SNOW" G124 TREAD MOUNTED ON 22.50"
X 8.25" ALUMINUM WHEEL WITH 10 STUD
11.25" BOLT CIRCLE |
MANUFACTURER | GOODYEAR AS SPECIFIED
MODEL NUMBER |
ISM ENGINE FAMILIARIZATION SCHOOL AT
048.|AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY FOR (3) PEOPLE $750.00 $750.00 $530.00

MANUFACTURER

CUMMINS ROCKY MOUNTAIN - EL PASO

MODEL NUMBER

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUFi?EMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

P
APPROVED BY:/ -/ s

Food
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DATE: M { {4 { £
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CITY OF EL PA

5 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRSTIN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ALLISON TRANSMISSION OVERHAUL SCHOOL
049.|AT AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY FOR (3) PEOPLE $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $6,900.00
MANUFACTURER ‘ STEWAR STEVENSON - DENVER
MODEL NUMBER
EGR AIR HANDLING FAMILIARIZATION SCHOOL
050.|AT AN AUTHORIZED FACILITY FOR (3) PEOPLE $750.00 $750.00 $255.00
MANUFACTURER CUMMINS ROCKY MOUNTAIN - EL PASO
MODEL NUMBER
O51.|INSITE 6.3 SOFTWARE $576.00 $576.00 $670.00
MANUFACTURER PART #3886390 & EGR AIR CD
MODEL NUMBER
0O52.|INSITE PROGRAM DATALINK KIT " $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,625.00
MANUFACTURER ' INLINE Il ADAPTER
MODEL NUMBER KIT 316382
INSITE 6 FAMILIARIZATION SCHOOL AT AN ’
0O53.|AUTHORIZED FACILITY FOR (3) PEOPLE $750.00 $750.00 $460.00
MANUFACTURER CUMMINS ROCKY MOUNTAIN - EL PASO
MODEL NUMBER
COMPRESSED AIR FOAM SYSTEM MEETING
054.| THE SPECIFICATIONS LISTED IN SECTION B $40,250.00 $40,250.00 $31,890.00
MANUFACTURER WATEROUS ECLIPSE PIERCE HUSKY 10
MODEL NUMBER W/HERCULES 200 CFM CAFS
INDEPENDENT FRONT SUSPENSION
O55. $17,414.00 NO BID $7,546.00
MANUFACTURER TIMMONY PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER TAK - 4
ADVANCED SIDE ROLL PROTECTION
056.PACKAGE $5,500.00 NO BID $4,600.00
MANUFACTURER KME PIERCE
MODEL NUMBER T.0.P

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WiLL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: - l Lol
[
DATE: L

2005-181 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




>

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS BID # 2005-181
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
F & F SUPPLY F & F SUPPLY FIRST IN, INC
BiG LAKE, TEXAS BIG LAKE, TEXAS EL PASO, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
MOTOROLA MODEL G241-ASTRO READY,
057.|ANALOG OPERATION ' $12,410.00 $12,410.00 $1,273.00
MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL G50-SAMARTNET
058.|OPERATION INCL INCL $6,020.00

MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL G241-ASTRO READY,
059.|ANALOG OPERATION | INCL INCL N/C

MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER ;

MOTOROLA MODEL W484 - 3DB GAIN ROOF
060.|MOUNT ANTENNA INCL INCL $32.00

MANUFACTURER | MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER |

MOTOROLA MODEL G94 - W5 CONTROL
061.|HEAD SOFTWARE | INCL INCL N/C

MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL G79 - W5 CONTROL
062./HEAD ‘ INCL INCL $368.00

MANUFACTURER 3 MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER !

MOTOROLA MODEL W22 - PALM
063.|MICROPHONE INCL INCL $62.00

MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL G67 - REMOTE MOUNT
064.|WITH 17' CABLE INCL INCL $252.00

MANUFACTURER MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED
MODEL NUMBER ‘

¢ /
APPROVED BY: /v(-:}i/‘

/ [ e ;
DATE: I ER 2005-181 4 PERSOMN TILT CAB PUMPERS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 1
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CitY OF EL FAS0 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRST IN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

MOTOROLA MODEL B18 - 5 WATT
065.|SPEAKER

INCL INCL $51.00

MANUFACTURER

MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL MW800 - MOBILE WORK
066.|SATATION/ COMPUTER

INCL INCL $127.00

MANUFACTURER

MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

MOTOROLA MODEL MW800 - MOBILE WORK
066.|SATATION/ COMPUTER )

INCL INCL $7,294.00

MANUFACTURER

MOTOROLA AS SPECIFIED

MODEL NUMBER

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
"|ANY OPTION TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL

QUANTITY OF ITEMS, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
PURCHASING ONE HUNDRED PERCENT (100%)
OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT QUANTITIES, AT

THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED WITHIN: !

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICES WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: / Lt

/// , /ﬁ \"f
DAIE: '[I{f///":)
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CiTY OF L PASO il TABULATION

BID ITEM: 4 PERSON TILT CAB PUMPERS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-181
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS

F & F SUPPLY
BIG LAKE, TEXAS
ALTERNATE BID

FIRSTIN, INC
EL PASO, TEXAS

A. NINETY (90) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF
THE CONTRACT.

B. ONE HUNDRED AND EIGHTY (180) DAYS FROM
DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

C. THREE HUNDRED AND SIXTY-FIVE (365) DAYS
FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

D. NO OPTION OFFERED.

YESE NO | ]
no (]

vo [x]

YES | X

YES ]
]

YES@ NO {:j
vo [

YES [ X
YES [ ]
]

YES [X]
YES [X]
YES [X]]
]

NO [ ]
No [ ]
NO [ ]

YES || NO

YES | NO

YES ] NO
]

L

PAYMENT TERMS: NET -30 DAYS NET -30 DAYS NET -30 DAYS
BID BOND: YES YES YES
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 200-240 DAYS 200-240 DAYS 120 DAYS

IF THE BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY

MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE OFFER.

BIDS SOLICITED: 35

BIDS RECEIVED:

3 BIDS LOCAL:

2

NO BID: 0

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

-
APPROVED BY:_ " /b
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4 GUYS INC
230 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD
MYERSDALE PA 15552

LONGHORN EMERGENY
1014 OAK ST.
MCKINNEY, TX 75069

AMERICAN LAFRANCE OF NEW MEXICO
12901 US HWY 66 W FRONTAGE RD
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87121

BECKER FIRE EQUIPMENT CO
1278 N6 MILE RD
CASPER WY 82604

CUSTOM FIRE APPARATUS INC
509 68" AVE
OSCEOLA WI 54020

M & W FIRE APPARATUS
845 THIRD STREET
VINTON, VA 24179

EMERGENCY ONE INC
PO BOX 2710
OCALAFL 34478

FERRARA FIRE APPARATUS INC
137 EASTPARK DR
. EUNICE LA 70535

FIRST IN INC
21442 N CENTRAL AVE
PHOENIX AZ 85024

AMERICAN LAFRANCE
9550 NORTH LOOP EAST
"HOUSTON TX 77029

HME INC :
1950 BYRON CTR AVE
GRAND RAPIDS MI 49509

INDEPENDENT FIRE COMPANY
711 ASPEN NW
ALBUQUERQUE NM 87102

LTD

LUVERNE FIRE APPARATUS CO
1209 E BIRCH ST

BRANDON SD 57005-2003

KME
ONE INDUSTRIAL COMPLEX
NESQUEHONING, PA 18240

F & F SUPPLY
17134 LENA LANE
FAYETTVILLE, AR 72704

OSHKOSH
PO BOX 2566
OSHKOSH WI 54903-2566

PIERCE MANUFACTURING INC
2600 AMERICAN DR PO BOX 2017
APPLETON WI 54913

S & S FIRE APPARATUS
4353 W 1900 N-48
FAIRMONT IN 46928

SEAGRAVE
105 E 12™ ST
CLINTONVILLE Wi 54929

SMEAL FIRE APPRATUS
3318 BUTTERLEIGH
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78247

CENTRAL STATES FIRE APPARTUS
100 THIRD ST PO BOX 57
LYONS SD 57041

SOUTHERN COACH INC
1985 NW 57™ ST
OCALA FL 34475

SUTPHEN CORPORATION
7000 COLUMBUS-MARYSVILLE RD
AMLIN OH 43002-0158

THE PHOENIX GROUP EMERGENCY
308 LAKEWOGD

WAXAHACHIE TX 75165

VERMONT FIRE TECHNOLOGIES
PO BOX 154 154 INDUSTRY ST
WILLIAMSTOWN VT 05679

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
201 AVENUE R
LUBBOCK, TX 79915

RUSH TRUCK CENTER, EL PASO
12253 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

PETE’S EQUIPMENT REPAIR
1400 BROADWAY
NE ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87102

FIRST IN INC
6400 AIRPORT RD SUITE H
EL PASO TX 79925

ATTN: DOUG BRADFORD
FERRARA FIRE APPARATUS, INC.
27855 JAMES CHAPEL ROAD
HOLDEN, LA 70744



ATTN: WYATT OAKLEY
NAFECO WEST TEXAS
BOX 704

STAMBORD, TX 79553

ATTN: ARTHUR BLISS
8700 IH - 10E
CONVERSE, TX 78109

FERRARA FIRE APPARATURS, INC.

ATTN: SHELLIHAGAN
P O BOX 249

HOLDEN, LA 70744

F & F SUPPLY
1100 OHIO AVENUE A ¢
BIG LAKE, TX 76932 M

ATTN: TAMARA BRONSON
SENIOR BUYER

CITY OF EUGENE

100 W. 10™ AVENUE SUITE 400
EUGENE, OR 97401



BID INFORMATION SERVICE
(ALL BIDS ARE ADVERTISED)

BID NET PROCESSING CENTER
PO BOX 5600
ALBANY, NY 12205

GREATER EI PASO CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
ONE CIVIC CENTER DLAZA
EI, PASO, TX 79901

L PASO HISPANIC CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
829 MONTANA AVE,; B-100
L PASO, TX 738303

=N [

=L PASO TIMES NEWSPAPER
CLASSIFIED/LEGAL SECTION
PO BOX 20

L PASO, TX 7895898

- SUBCONTRACTORS ASSOCIATION
PO BOX 3512
EL. PASO, TX 7895923

COMMERCE BUSINESS WEEKLY
2626 NORTHEAST #103
EL PASO, TX 79902

BLACK CHAMBER OF COMMERCEH
ONE CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
L PASO, TX 75501



