CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT:  Fire
AGENDA DATE: May 1, 2007

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Terrence Freiburg-Purchasing Manager
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City
Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $
amount if applicable.

Award Solicitation Number 2007-128 to the lowest responsive bidder for each piece of
firefighting protective gear as indicated in the accompanying memorandum.

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of
this action? What are the citizen concerns?

Execution of this contract allows the Fire Department to outfit all new structural firefighters and
Airport firefighters with protective clothing and replace aging and non NFPA-compliant gear.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

No.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source
by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

Funding information is detailed in the accompanying memorandum.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A.
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************
LEGAL: (if required) —_ ———, FINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD: %@%@MQ\
Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM
DATE: April 23, 2007

PROJECT: Structural & Proximity Fire Fighting Clothing
NO:2007-128
BUDGET NO: 22010319-503123 (FYO? -08)-01101

’ 62620010-503123 (FY07-08)-01101
FUNDING SOURCE: Fire Department General Operating Fund- -Safety Gear

DEPARTMENT: Fire

. REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S) All

uuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuu

RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor:

Quest Enterprises, Inc.
Walsenburg, CO

ltem(s): #1 & #2
Annual Estimated Amount: $ 217.600.00
RECOMMENDATION:. 2) Vendor: First In, Inc.
’ El Paso, TX
Item(s): #3 & #4
Annual Estimated Amount: $ 11,960.00

RECOMMENDATION: 3) Vendor:

W.S. Darley & Co ,
Melrose Park, IL

ltem(s):  #5 &#7
Annual Estimated Amount: $34,175.00
RECOMMENDATION: 4) Vendor: Ferrara Fire Apparatus
‘ Silverton, TX
ftem(s): #6 & #9
Annual Estimated Amount; $ 16, 425.00
RECOMMENDATION: 5) Vendor: Bazaar Uniforms & Men'’s Store
: ' El Paso, TX
ltem(s): #8
Annual Estimated Amount: $ 15, 778.00

This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of twelve (12) months.

The Departments of Financial Services and Fire recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive

responsible bidder.

Vendors #1, #2 #3 #4 & #5 offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for one (1) additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from the date of the award.

BIDS SOLICITED- 00 _ (00 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 00
“NO BID” RECEIVED 00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 295,938.00
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COUNCIL APPROVED [] REJECTED [ ] MUNICIPAL CLERK
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APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: May 8, 2007

LI

Purchasing Manager,
Financial Services Degpartment




CitY COUNCIL

JOE WARDY SUSAN AUSTIN, DISTRICT 1
MAYOR ROBERT A. CUSHING, JR., DISTRICT 2
ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
JOYCE WILSON JoHN F. CooK, DISTRICT 4

CITY MANAGER PRESI ORTEGA, DISTRICT 5
PAUL J. ESCOBAR, DISTRICT 6
VIVIAN ROJAS, DISTRICT 7

ANTHONY W. COBOS, DISTRICT 8

ROBERTO RIVERA
FIRE CHIEF

FIRE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

To: Jesus Juarez, Procurement Analyst

From: Michael Calderazzo, Logistics Chie% M
Subject: Award Recommendation For 2007-128

Date: April 12, 2007

3k 3k 3k 3 3k ok ok ok ok sk 3k 3k 3k ok ok ok ok ok ok 3k sk ok sk ok sk sk ok

After reviewing the bids for firefighting protective gear we make the following recommendations
for award to the lowest responsive bidder:

Item Estimated | Price Per Item | Total Award To
Qty
Structural Coat 200 659 $131,800.00 Quest
Structural Pants 200 429 $85,800.00 Quest
Total Award to Quest $217,600.00
Proximity Coat 10 532 $5,320.00 First In
Proximity Pants 10 664 $6,640.00 First In
Total Award to First In $11,960.00
Fire Helmet 200 107.75 $21,550.00 WS Darley
Gloves 250 50.50 $12,625.00 WS Darley
Total Award to WS Darley $34,175.00
Hood 250 20.5 $12,625.00 Ferrara
Suspenders 250 19 $3,800.00 Ferrara
Total Award to Ferrara 316,425.00
Boots | 200 | 78.89 | $15,778.00 Bazaar
Total Value of Award For One Calendar Year $295,938.00

Funding for all firefighting gear with the exception of proximity clothing: 01101-22010319-
503123 (FY07-08). Funding for proximity clothing: 62620026-503123 (FY07-08).

62620010

Fire Department

-~

ISO Class 1

8600 MONTANA AVE. * EL PASO, TX 79925-1214 +915.771.1000 * 915.771.1026 FAX * WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS DACO FIRE FERRARA FIRE
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE EQUIPMENT APPARATUS
EL PASO, TX LUBBOCK, TX SILVERTON, TX
ITEM EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED ' EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1. 200 COAT, PROTECTIVE, NO BID NO BID $842.50 $168,500.00 $819.45 $163,890.00
EACH STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER LION FIRE-DEX
MODEL NO. CRIM/F CUSTOM ASSULT PBI MATRIX
2. 200 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, NO BID NO BID $553.15 $110,630.00 $597.00 -$119,400.00
PAIR STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL JEACH [TOTAL
MANUFACTURER LION FIRE-DEX
" [MODEL NO. PBGM/F '
3. 10 COAT, PROTECTIVE, NO BID NO BID $685.00 $6,850.00 $684.00 $6,840.00
EACH PROXIMITY JEACH ITOTAL JEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER LION -FIRE-DEX
JMODEL NO. CMDA/CMAF CUSTOM ALUMINIZED PBAIKELVARI
4, 10 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, NO BID NO BID $596.10 $5,961.00 $548.00 $5,480.00
PAIR PROXIMITY IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER LION FIRE-DEX
MODEL NO. PSUA/PSAF CUSTOM ALUMINIZED PBI/KELVAR
5. 200 HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER NO BID NO BID $150.00 $30,000.00 $115.00 $23,000.00
EACH JEACH ITOTAL JEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD FX
MODEL NO. LEGACY 5

DATE:

vid @

APPROVED BY: % /77.

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMiTY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DACO FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS FERRARA FIRE
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE ~ EQUIPMENT APPARATUS
EL PASO, TX LUBBOCK, TX - SILVERTON, TX
ITEM EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
6. 250 HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT $22.78 $5,695.00 NO BID $25.00 $6,250.00 | $20.50 $5,125.00
EACH ‘ IEACH ITOTAL [EACH ITOTAL [EACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER FIRE BRIGADE FIRE BRIGADE FIRE-DEX
MODEL NO. PB-1 FLASHOVER KNIT FB 210 871 P-FNB
(BIDDER'S EXTNEDED PRICE: $13,125.00
7. 250 GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, $53.22 $13,305.00 NO BID $64.74 $16,185.00 $54.50 $13,625.00
PAIR STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH [TOTAL JEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER SAFEGUARD-COMMANDER FIREGUARD FIRE-DEX
MODEL NO. 90026 COMMANDER GO03BLDDN
8. 200 BOOTS, PROTECTIVE, $122.10 $24,420.00 $78.89 - $15,778.00 $138.35 $27,670.00 $81.00 $16,200.00
PAIR | STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH [TOTAL .
MANUFACTURER ‘ : SERVUS THOROGOOD SERVUS THOROGOOD
MODEL NO. 1408 507-6000 WOMEN / 807-6000 MEN 1408 - 806-600 & 807-6000
' SUSPENDERS, HEAVY 4 |
9. 200 DUTY, DYNA BACK $24.86 $4,972.00 NO BID $20.28 $4,056.00 $19.00 $3,800.00
PAIR NO SUBSTITUTE JEACH ITOTAL ' ‘ IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER DYNABACK LION FIRE-DEX
MODEL NO. SP-DBC SB342

APPROVED

DATE:

BY:

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING

BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.

EL PASO, TX

BAZAAR UNIFORMS
& MEN'S STORE
EL PASO, TX

DACO FIRE
EQUIPMENT
LUBBOCK, TX

FERRARA FIRE
APPARATUS
SILVERTON, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREE-
MENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
~ |THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE
CONTRACT.

B. NO OPTION OFFERED.

YESL:Jj No[ |

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

45 CALENDAR DAYS

45 CALENDAR DAYS

30 CALENDAR DAYS

75 CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: J‘/& '/ﬂ7

ra _ ’ .
(; 2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRE SERVICE FIRST IN, INC. LION APPAREL INC. . QUEST
EQUIPMENT, INC. " EL PASO, TX DAYTON, OH ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX WALSENBURG, CO
ITEM EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED ' EXTENDED
NO. QTYy. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1. 200 COAT, PROTECTIVE, $940.00 $188,000.00 $795.00 $159,000.00 $870.00 $174,000.00 $659.00 $131,800.00
’ EACH STRUCTURAL JEACH ITOTAL JEACH ~ [TOTAL JEACH ITOTAL I[EACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX LION APPAREL QUEST
MODEL NO. BPR-4222 CUSTOM ASSAULT CRTM 1500-32
2. 200 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, | $675.00 $135,000.00 $580.00 $116,000.00 $572.00 $114,400.00 | $429.00 | $85,800.00
PAIR STRUCTURAL [EACH ITOTAL [EACH ~ ITOTAL IEACH ~ ITOTAL [EACH [TOTAL
MANUFACTURER " MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX LION APPAREL QUEST
MODEL NO. . BPR-4222 CUSTOM ASSAULT " PBGM Q-NETIC
3. 10 COAT, PROTECTIVE, $805.00 $8,050.00 $664.00 $6,640.00 $710.00 $7,100.00 NO BID
EACH PROXIMITY JEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL JEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX LION APPAREL NO BID
MODEL NO. BPR-7602 PROXIMITY CMDA
4. 10 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, $702.0_0 $7,020.00 $532.00 $5,320.00" $620.00 $6,200.00 NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY JEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL JEACH ITOTAL . ‘
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX LION APPAREL NO BID
MODEL NO. BPR-7602 PROXIMITY PSUA
5. 200 HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER $108.00 $21,600.00 $126.85 $25,370.00 $165.00 $33,000.00 NO BID
EACH JEACH ITOTAL IEACH [TOTAL IEACH’ [TOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE ALLIANCE METRO LION APPAREL NO BID
MODEL NO. LITE FORCE PLUS ~ ALF3CXL LFH3910E

APPROVED BY:

DATE:_ 4/

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




'CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FIRE SERVICE FIRST IN, INC. LION APPAREL INC. QUEST
EQUIPMENT, INC. EL PASO, TX DAYTON, OH ENTERPRISES, INC.
: ‘ EL PASO, TX WALSENBURG, CO
ITEM EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. | QTy. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE - UNIT PRICE PRICE
6. 250 HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT $32.00 $8,000.00 $31.25 $7,812.50 $26.25 $6,562.50
EACH IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX " NOBID FIRE GUARD
MODEL NO. 300-2255 7FNF H37PSNB FL-PBI-51
7. 250 GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, $68.00 $17,000.00 $51.60 $12,900.00 $52.75 . | $13,187.50
PAIR STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL IEACH [TOTAL ~ IEACH [TOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX NO BID FIRE GUARD COMMANDER
MODEL NO. GL 9550 GO03BLDDN #90026
8. 200 BOOTS; PROTECTIVE, $111.00 $22,200.00 $84.00 $16,800.00 $88.00 $17,600.00
PAIR STRUCTURAL: IEACH ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL [EACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER ‘ SERVUS BLACK DIAMOND NO BID BLACK DIAMOND
MODEL NO. ! : 1408 (MORNING PRIDE) #9451 #9451
SUSPENDERS, HEAVY C ' - ‘
9. 200 DUTY, DYNA BACK $23.00 $4,600.00 $30.50 $6,100.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 NO BID
PAIR NO SUBSTITUTE [EACH ITOTAL IEACH _ITOTAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FIRE DEX LION APPAREL NO BID
MODEL NO. SPD8 DYNA-BACK S55BWB-PP SB342

APPROVED BY:

3

DATE:

/w/g 2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING

BID DATE; MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128
DEPARTMENT:

FIRE

FIRE SERVICE
EQUIPMENT, INC.
EL PASO, TX

FIRST IN, INC.
EL PASO, TX

LION APPAREL INC.
DAYTON, OH

QUEST

"ENTERPRISES, INC.

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREE-
MENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTIONvOF EXTENDING
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE

WALSENBURG, CO

CONTRACT.
' *YES ON ITEM * NO ON ‘ ,

B. NO OPTION OFFERED. 1,2,3,4,5, D ITEM 5 l:j
, ’ 56780 ™ -

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS" NET - 30 DAYS

‘ : 45 CALENDAR DAYS ] ‘ ’
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: | WE ARE QUOTING 30-45 DAYS | 30 CALENDAR DAYS | 45CALENDARDAYS | 45 CALENDAR DAYS
AFTER RECEIPT OF THE INITIAL 45 DAYS STRUCTURAL '

PURCHASE ORDER.

o o o e e o st s vt o it S T e B

60-75 DAYS PROXIMITY

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

APPROVED BY:

3

DATE:

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL &‘PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING BID # 2007-128
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007 | \ DEPARTMENT: FIRE
W. S. DARLEY & CO.
MELROSE PARK, IL
ITEM| EST. . EXTENDED
NO. | QTy. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE
1. | 200 COAT, PROTECTIVE, NO BID
EACH STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NO.
2. 200 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, NO A BID
PAIR STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NO.
3. 10 COAT, PROTECTI\'IE,I NO BID
~ EACH PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NO.
4, 10 PANTS, PROTECTIVE, NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NO.
5. 200 'HELMET, FIRE FIGHTER $107.75 $21,550.00
EACH IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE
MODEL NO. , : TXELPS00101

APPROVED BY: %}
DATE: 3/ /J 7 2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT
77




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128

W. S. DARLEY & CO.
MELROSE PARK, IL

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ITEM EST. ‘ EXTENDED
NO. QTYy. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE
6. 250 HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT $32.45 $8,112.50
EACH /EACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER - AMERICAN FIREWARE
MODEL NO. #HD-300-22557FNF
7. 250 GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, $50.50 $12,625.00
PAIR STRUCTURAL IEACH ITOTAL
MANUFACTURER SAFEGUARD AMERICAN
MODEL NO. #90026
8. 200 BOOTS, PROTECTIVE, NO BID
PAIR STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER '
MODEL NO. ‘ :
SUSPENDERS, HEAVY .
9. 200 DUTY, DYNA BACK NO BID
PAIR NO SUBSTITUTE
MANUFACTURER

MODEL NO.

APPROVED

DATE:

BY:

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

|BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL & PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING

BID DATE: MARCH 21, 2007

BID # 2007-128
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

W. S. DARLEY & CO.
- MELROSE PARK, IL

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREE-
MENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE
CONTRACT.

B. NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
_ 30 TO 45 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: AFTER DATE OF PO

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

BIDS SOLICITED: 15

NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ;/,)’f 47

BIDS RECEIVED: 9 BIDS LOCAL: 4

2007-128 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIRE FIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT

,



DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
P O BOX 5024
LUBBOCK, TX 79408

F & F SUPPLY CO.
P O BOX 26
ODEN, ARKANSAS 71961

ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B HUECO ST
EL PASO, TX 79903

VALLEN SAFETY SUPPLY CO.

POBOXT19 (>
ODESSA, TX 79760

FALCON INDUSTRIES
P O BOX 26248
EL PASO, TX 79926

FIRE GEAR PROTECTIVE CLOTHING
715 4™ AVE TP
RAN JUNCTION, CO 81501 <

LION APPAREL
1033 EAGLE CT
DESOTO, TX 75115

W S DARLEY & CO.
2000 ANSON DRIVE
MELROSE PARK, IL 60160-1087

FERRARA FIRE FIGHTING EQUIPMENT
774 JULIADR
NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130

NEEL ASSOCIATES, INC.
P O BOX 20126
WACO, TX 76702-0126

THOMPSON’S SPECIALTIES
411 W SECOND STREET ~ _
ODESSA, TX 79761 G\

DYNAMED )
6300 YARROW DR &>
CARLSBAD, CA 920091507

FIRST IN
6400 AIRPORT RD., STE.C
EL PASO, TX 79925

FIRE DEXINC.
780 SOUTH PROGRESS DR
MEDINA, OH 44256

DISCOUNT EQUIPMENT & SAFETY
765 PENDALE ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79907 FTT-{:






