DATE: April 21, 2005 ( /
TO: Municipal Clerk %
FROM: Byron E. Johnson, C.P.M.

Director of Purchasing x 431

THRU: Aurora Wells
Bid Clerk ext. 4038

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of
MAY 3, 2005.

Iltem should read as follows:

Solicitation No: 2005-169  Traffic Signal Heads

Award to: McCain Traffic Supply
Vista, California
ltem (s): #1 thru #4 (al)
Amount: $45,154.50 (estimated annually)
Department: Street
Funds available: 32010288-503203-01101

14200403-508027-29146-PBE04ST 131
14200403-508027-29145-PBE04ST130

Funding source: Public Access Maintenance & Repair & Construction
Total award: $90,309.00 (estimated)
District (s): All

The Street and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest
responsive offer meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Vendor offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within two (2) years from the
date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twenty-Four (24) months.

Contact person: Jesus M. Juarez, Procurement Analyst at 541-4317.
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AGENDA FOR:_MAY 3, 2005
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CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: _STREETS

AGENDA DATE:

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: BYRON E. JOHNSON, C.P.M.

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: _ALL__
SUBJECT:

Bid 2005-169 Traffic Signal Heads

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

50
Approve contract award to McCain Traffic Supply for an estimated amount of $45,154 5=
PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: R
N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Funding sources are: Fund 01101, DeptID 32010288, Account 503203 (Public Access Maint & Repair)
Fund 29146, DeptID 14200403, Account 508027 (Construction), PBE04ST131, Fund 29145,
DeptID 14200403, Account 508027 (Construction), PBE04ST130.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION****K*******7'{***7’:**7’;‘

LEGAL: (if required) 2 . EINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD: M W

Cc: Patricia D. Aduato, Deputy City Manager for Building & Planning Services
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

Cl1Y MANAGEK: DALEK:




PROJECT FORM
DATE: APRIL 20, 2005

PROJECT: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

NO:2005-169 DEPARTMENT: STREET

BUDGET NO: 32010288-503203-01101
14200403-508027-29145-29146-PBE04ST131-PBE04ST130

FUNDING SOURCE: PUBLIC ACCESS MAINTENANCE & REPAIR & CONSTRUCTION

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor: McCain Traffic Supply
Vista, California
Item(s): #1 thru #4 (all)

Amount: $ 45,154 50 (estimated annually )
The Street and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive offer
meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Vendor offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for two (2)
additional years if the option is exercised within two (2) years from the date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twenty Four (24) months.

BIDS SOLICITED- 42 (05 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 06
“‘NO BID" RECEIVED 00

CURRENT TAXED PAID-
OUT-OF-TOWN- XX

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 90,309.00 (estimated)
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COUNCIL APPROVED [ ] REJECTED [ MUNICIPAL CLERK
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APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: May 3. 2005

G

Byron E. Johndo, CP.M. "\
Director of Purchasing




City COUNCIL

SUSAN AUSTIN, DISTRICT |
ROBERT A. CUSHING, JR., DISTRICT 2
ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
JonN F. Cook, DISTRICT 4
PRESI ORTEGA, DISTRICT 5
PAatL J. ESCOBAR, DISTRICT 6
VIVIAN ROJAS, DISTRICT 7
ANTHONY W. COBOS, DISTRICT 8

JOE WARDY
MAYOR

JOYCE WILSON
CITY MANAGER

DARYL W. COLE
STREETS DIRECTOR

STREET DEPARTMENT

April 18, 2005

TO: Byron Johnson, Director of Purchasing
ATTN: Jesus M. Juarez, Procurement Analyst ”
FROM: Daryl W. Cole, Streets DirectorW y///“"f

SUBJECT:  Bid No. 2005-169 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to McCain
Traffic Supply, as the most responsive and responsible bidder meeting specifications, for an estimated
amount of $45,154.‘.;_4.‘

If you have any questions please call me at 621-6750.

DWClen

7969 SAN PAULO DRIVE * EL PASO, TEXAS 79907 < (915) 621-6750 « FAX (915) 621-6772 * WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV



JOE Warm
Mavyor

Jover Wipson

CImy MANAGER

Daryve W, Cori
STREETS DIRECTOR

STREET DEPARTMENT

Memorandum

To: Gerald Pucel

From: Albert Delgado

Date:  4/18/2005

Re: Solicitation 2005-169 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

Ciry Councrni

StsanAvsiie Distiaer ]
RoBert A CusHiNG, Jr.. DIsTRICT 2
Alexandro Lozano. District 3
John . Cook. District 4
Prest Ortega. District 3
Po d Bscorae Disticet 6
Vivies Roras, Districr 7
Antrioy WoCopos, DistricT 8

The bids were reviewed and | recommend the bid be awarded to McCain Traffic Supply.
McCain Traffic Supply the low bidder and they meet the specification. The amount of the

award is QAL 154 oAb~

19 YT/, 1 JTT.JTT.

. S50.
The funding sources are:

Fund 01101
Dept ID 32010288
Account 503203

Fund 29146
Dept ID 14200403
Accoinint RNRND7

Project PBEO4ST131

Fund 29145

Dept ID 14200403
Account 508027
Project PBEO4ST130

7969 SAN PauLo DRIVE, EL Paso, TExas 79907

(915) 621-6750 WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV



CiTY OF EL #4850 BID TABULATION

T

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS BID # 2005-169
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005 DEPARTMENT: STREET
CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC MC CAIN TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC PELCO PRODUCTS, INC
CONTROLS, INC SUPPLY SYSTEMS, INC EDMOND, OK
ARLINGTON, TEXAS VISTA, CA FT. WORHT, TEXAS
ITEM| ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | EST. QTY.| UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 100 EACH 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, $232.00 $23,200.00 $210.58 $21,058.00 $267.00 $26,700.00 $350.00 $35,000.00
'TYPE “E"
MANUFACTURER | PEEK/PELCO MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY ECONOLITE 12" SIGNAL
MODEL NO. HSC83B300G/SP-3011-TX MTSTA-30-2-6A SP3011TX-P29 | PELCO MOUNTING HARDWARE
2. 60 EACH PEDESTR}[AN SIGNAL HEADS, $172.00 $10,320.00 $155.95 $9,357.00 $191.00 $11,460.00 $300.00 $18,000.00
MANUFACTURER PEEKI/PELCO MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY MCCAIN 16" PED HOUSING
MODEL NO. 7T090AFY, 02, 01,01, 01,01 SP-3032 TX-SP | PS1065G0-AV SP3032TX-P29 | PELCO MOUNTING HARDWARE
3 50 EACH 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, $206.00 $10,300.00 $172.00 $8,600.00 $206.00 $10,300.00 $300.00 $15,000.00
TYPE "E" WITHOUT LENS,
REFLECTORS AND LAMPS SOCKETS
MANUFACTURER PEEK/PELCO MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY ECONOLITE 12" SIGNAL
MODEL NO. HSC83B300FO/ SP-3011-TX | MTSTA-3X-2-XX SP-3011TX-P29 | PELCO MOUNTING HARDWARE
4 50 EACH PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEADS, $143.00 $7,150.00 $122.79 $6,139.50 $150.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $12,500.00
WITHOUT LENS, REFLECTORS
AND LAMP SOCKETS
MANUFACTURER PEEK/PELCO 4302AFY, 02,01,01 | MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY MCCAIN 6" PEDHSA
MODEL NO. ‘ SP-3032-TX-SP PSXX65 SP3032 TX-P29 | PELCO MOUNTING HARDWARE
7 ) /\
APPROVED BY: ‘__ a¢y ) /][ pede b,
CATC. ,",’/: ),/‘: o ! ‘ 2005109 TRAFFIC 3iGNAL NEMUD - SIREE T UEFPARIVIEN | 1



CITY OF EL PASO B

D TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-169
DEPARTMENT: STREET

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC
CONTROLS, INC
ARLINGTON, TEXAS

MC CAIN TRAFFIC
SUPPLY
VISTA, CA

PARADIGM TRAFFIC
SYSTEMS, INC
FT. WORHT, TEXAS

PELCO PRODUCTS, INC
EDMOND, OK

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD O‘F THE CONTRACT.

C. NO OPTION OFFERED.

ves %]

NOD

rv]
NO A

1

ves| |
L]

YES D

YES @

vo[ ]
NOD
]

YES
—
YES U

no[ |
Nno| |
L]

YES
YES D

Nno[ |
no[ |
]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET -30 DAYS

NET -30 DAYS

NET -30 DAYS

NET -30 DAYS

CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:

60 DAYS

30 DAYS

30 - 45 DAYS

60 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY

BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

BIDS LOCAL:

NO BIDS:

2 7 Vk) P N
fH Jeedte

2005-169 TRAFFIC SIGNAL MEADS - STREET DEFAKITIVMIEN |




CITY OF EL FASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-169

DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY
PRODUCTS LTD
ROUND ROCK, TEXAS

TRAFFIC PARTS INC
CONROE, TEXAS

ITEM ANN. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | EST. QTY.| UNITS ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 100 | EACH 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, $206.00 $20,600.00 $250.00 | $25,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TYPE "E"

MANUFACTURER SIEMENS ITS TPI#SIG-TAY305-TTG-EHN-00
MODEL NO. SPS203AZ131ELP TPI# HOR12-443-Y21-B3F-FN

2. 60 EACH PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEADS, NO BID NO BID $180.00 $10,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER TPI SSPED-PIG-Y2N-N
MODEL NO. +TPI#5347

3 50 EACH 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS $151.00 $7,550.00 $195.00 $9,750.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TYPE "E" WITHOUT LENS,
REFLECTORS AND LAMPS SOCKETS

MANUFACTURER SIEMEN ITS SS TPl SIG-TAY-305-TTN-NHN-ON
MODEL NO. S$S230AZC131ELP30 TPI HORIZ-443-Y21-B3F-FN

4 50 EACH PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEADS, NO BID NO BID $130.00 $6,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

WITHOUT LENS, REFLLECTORS
AND LAMP SOCKETS
MANUFACTURER TPI SSPED-PNN-Y2N-N
MODEL NO. +TPI5347
/‘I / /] f/,kl; I
APPROVED BY: \ /it J). N ALtk ‘“3
.' ‘ 2U000-10Y | RAFFILC SIGNAL HEADS - SIREET DEPARITIVIEN | 3
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CiTY OF EL ¥

Y
FEtY

O BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 06, 2005

BID # 2005-169
DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY
PRODUCTS LTD

ROUD ROCK, TEXAS

TRAFFIC PARTS INC
CONROE, TEXAS

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

]
[]

L]
[]

[

L]
L]

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES [X] NO | | YES[ ] NO YES[ | NO[ | YES[ ] No[ ]
B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES [ | No [ ] YES | | NO YES [ | No[ ] YES [ | No[ |
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. ] ] L]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET -30 DAYS NET -30 DAYS

BIDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY 45 DAYS 30 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY

BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 42

BIDS RECEIVED:

6

BIDS LOCAL:

5

NO BIDS:

7 i a(k e
APPROVED BY: g LD // % :F
DATE: *{Z/;gm / ’

2005-169 TRAFFIC S5IGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




EAGLE SIGNAL
ATTN: DEBRA COLE
8004 CAMERON RD
AUSTIN, TX 78754

SIGNAL SALES CORP

ATTN: STUART ZIEFF

130 SHORE RD #218

PORT WASHINGTON, NY 11050

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS, INC
ATTN: FRANK BLAKLEY

P O BOX 1066

SAN MARCOS, TX 78667

TRAFFIC SIGNAL INC
ATTN: DAN MEADORS
P O BOX 430
EDMOND, OK 73083

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.
ATTN: JERRY PRIESTER

P O BOX 151837

ARLINGTON, TX 76015

HIGHWAY SUPPLY CO., INC.
ATTN: MIKE RADIGAN (S‘“
411 RANKINRD NE -
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87107

AMERICAN TRAFFIC SAFETY MATER*ATL;S\‘
ATTN: SANDI FRANZ \ W
1177 PARK A AVE., SUITE 5 D
ORANGE PARK, FL 32073

VALMONT DINSUTRIES, INC.
WEST HIGHWAY 275

P O BOX 358

VALLEY, NE 68064

PELCO PRODUCTS INC.
ATTN: STEVE PARDUHN
320 SW 18™ STREET
EDMOND, OK 73013-3628

TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS
ATTN: DAROLD CHERRY

P O BOX 928

ROUND ROCK, TX 78680

TRAFFICE SUPPLY INC
ATTN: MASON LAPHAM
500 FARM RD 3013 W

EAGLE LAKE, TX 77488

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC
ATTN: JENNIFER WARNACK

P O BOX 14509

FT WORTH, TX 76117-0509

TRAFFIC ENGINEERING & CONTROLS
ATTN: KEVIN BYRNE

4193 FM 811

CENTERVILLE, TX 75833

ECONOLITE CONTROL PRODUCTS, INC
ATTN: JOHN VARGAS

128 GRANT AVENUE

SANTA FE, NM 87501

TRAFFIC SIGNAL EQUIPMENT
P O BOX 8360
FORT WORTH, TX 76112

TEXAS POLE COMPANY
3932 OLD DENNIS RD
WEATHERFORD, TX 76087

TRIANGLE ELECTRIC SUPPLY
3815 DURAZNO
EL PASO, TX 79905

ADAME ELECTRICAL SALES
ATTN: FELIX ADAME

2512 PORTLAND

EL PASO, TX 79930

THE POLE COMPANY
ATTN: DAVID HRIVNATZ
6401 BINGLE SUITE 2194,
HOUSTON, TX 77092 §\

STPS INC.

ATTN: RODDY MARTIN

P O BOX 691015

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78269-1015

MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY
ATTN: PETER KOHL

2575 PIONEER AVE
VISTA, CA 92083

TRAFFIC PARTS INC
ATTN: BRUCE RULE
P O BOX 837
SPRING, TX 77383

HI-TECH SIGNALS INC

ATTN: ROBERT L. LEWELLYN
P O BOX 24071

FT WORTH, TX 76124

KENTROL TRAFFIC PRODUCTS INC
18403 GUFFSMITH KOHRVILLE
TOMBALL, TX 77375

MICA CORPORATION
ATTN: DICK SNIDER

P O BOX 161609

FORT WORTH, TX 76161

NORTH AMERICAN CONTROLS CORPORATION
ATTN: DANIEL SAUCEDO N{) '3-

510 ELLINGTON SUITE 100 (bV
HOUSTON, TX 77034-5507

LORIDA TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, INC.
ATTN: WYNDELL MCDANIELS
P O BOX 890028
HOUSTON, TX 77289-0028

SANTINI ELECTRIC INC.
ATTN: RUDY SANTINI
250 ELVIN WAY

EL PASO, TX 79907

CT CONTROL TECHNOLOGIES OF TEXAS
ATTN: DEREK S. TOWNSEND

30618 WM JUERGENS DR

TOMBALL, TX 77375

K & K SYSTEMS, INC.
ATTN: TROY KEITH
P O BOX 1065
VERONA, MS 38801



TRAFFIC PART, INC.

ATTN: JOHN FORD

P O BOX 837 —

SPRING, TX 77383 . \"
W .

CENTERLINE SUPPLY ", = .

ATTN: HEATHER JUAREZ\

530 JESSE STREET. - .

GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75051-1141

PRIME VENDOR INC.

LAURIE MELNICK

4608 CEDAR AVENUE SUITE 106
WILMINGTON, NC 28403

APFELBAUM INDUSTRIAL INC.
ATTN: MIKE COLLINS

6006 N MESA, STE. 510

EL PASO, TX 79912

U 'S TRAFFIC CORPQORATION
ATTN: B!LL HAYES

9603 JOHN STREET

SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA 90670

MEDLEY MATERIAL HANDLING CO.

4201 WILL ROGERS PARKWAY
OKLAHOMA CITY, OK 73108

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT,
CORP.

ATTEN: PENNY D. POLMAN

259 BROADWAY

NEWBURGH, NY 12550

MESA ELECTRIC
ATTN: JOHNNY TANZY
502 JOE ANGE RD
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

ATTN: MICHAEL BROOKS
149 BROOKS LN
BASTROP, TX 78602

PEEK TRAFFIC CORP
P O BOX 622

141 RAILROAD ST
BEDFORD, PA 15522

ECONOLITE

ATTN: JOHN VARGAS

811 SAINT MICHAELS DR STE 102
SANTA FE, NM 87505-7640

ALL TRADES ELECTRICAL
11005 ARGAL CT
EL PASO, TX 79935



BID INFORMATION SERVICE
(ALL BIDS ARE ADVERTISED)
BID NET PROCESSING CENTER
PO BOX 5600
ALBANY, NY 12205

GREATER EL PASO CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
ONE CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
EL PASO, TX. 79901

EL PASO HISPANIC CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
2829 MONTANA AVE, B-100
EL PASO, TX 79903

EL PASO TIMES NEWSPAPER
CLASSIFIED / LEGAL SECTION

PO BOX 20

EL PASO, TX 79999

CONTRACT OPPORTUNITY CENTER
4791 N. MESA

EL PASO, TX 79902

SAM’S CLUB
7970 NORTH MESA
EL PASO ,TX 79932
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PO BOX 3612
EL PASO, TX 79923

.I\I‘VT L r‘l"\'fl‘\'\Y
V\_/L_J..k ,l.L\JA

N
o

0
W

COMMERCE BUSINESS WEEKLY
2626 NORTHEAST # 103
EL PASO, TX 79902

BLACK CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
ONE CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
EL PASO, TX 79901



