Agenda Item Form Agenda Date: Mak 4

Districts Affected: All
Dept. Head/Contact Information: Byron Johnson, 541-4308

Type of Agenda ltem:

[[IResolution [Jstaffing Table Changes ["1Board Appointments
[JTax Installment Agreements [ITax Refunds [IDonations
XIRFP/ BID/ Best Value Procurement [[JBudget Transfer [Jitem Placed by Citizen
[Application for Facility Use [IBidg. Permits/inspection [introduction of Ordinance
Elnterlocal Agreements [IContract/Lease Agreement [IGrant Appilication

Other

Funding Source:

X General Fund

[_1Grant (duration of funds: Months)
[JOther Source:

Legal:
[ Legal Review Required Attorney Assigned (please scroll down): None [J Approved (] Denied
Timeline Priority: [JHigh XMedium Ctow # of days:

Why is this item necessary:
Uniforms needed for the Police Department.

Explain Costs, including ongoing maintenance and operating expenditures, or Cost Savings:
Onqoing vearly expense for Police Uniforms especially as new recruits are added.

Statutory or Citizen Concerns:
N/A

Departmental Concerns:
Contract necessary to provide the Police Department with uniforms.

H:\Agenda ltem Form2-Revised-Recommendations for Police Uniforms-2004-111.doc



DATE: April 26, 2004
TO: Municipal Clerk A 1 v 10807
FROM: Byron E. Johnson, C.P.M. \)?\
Director of Purchasing x 4313 \
THRU: Aurora Wells

Interim Bid Clerk ext. 4038

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of

MAY 04, 2004.

item should read as follows:

Bid No. 2004-111 Uniforms

Award to: Vendor 1 Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, Texas

ltem (s): Group I, #1 thru 19, Group [V, #1 thru 8,
Group V, #1 thru 7. Group VIl #1, #2_#6,
#7 & #8. Group VI, #1 & #2

Amount: $75,667.31 (estimated annually)

Award to: Vendor 2 Bazaar Uniforms & Mens Wear
El Paso, Texas

Item (s): Group |, #1 thru 12, Group IlI, #1 thru 4,
Group VI, #1 thru 7

Amount: $119,887.99 (estimated annually)

Award to: Vendor 3 Alco Industrial Co.
El Paso, Texas

ltem (s): Group VII, #3, #4, & #5

Amount: $5.774.20 (estimated annually)

Department: Police Department

Funds available:

21010060-503120-01101

Funding source:

Police Operating Funds-Uniform & Apparel Supplies

Total award:

$402,659.00

District (s):

All

The Police Department and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated to

the lowest responsive offer meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Group | is being awarded to the second lowest bidder. The winter jacket in Group |

submitted by lower bidder did not meet the required specifications, as it was the wrong

color and wrong material.

Vendor #1 & #3 offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same

unit prices for one (1) additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from

the date of the award.




Vendor #2 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for one (1) or two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or
two (2) years from the date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twenty-Four (24) months.

Contact person: Jesus M. Juarez, Procurement Analyst at 541-4317.
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AGENDA FOR: MAY 04, 2004
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PROJECT FORM
DATE: April 22 , 2004

PROJECT :Uniforms-Police Department

BID NO: 2004-111 DEPARTMENT: Police Department
BUDGET NO:21010060-503120-01101

FUNDING SOURCE: Police Operating Funds-Uniform & Apparel Supplies

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All

nnnnnnnnnnn * * KKK Je ek dok ek ok

RECOMMENDATION: 1) VENDOR:  Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, Texas

ITEM(s): Group Il, #1 thru 19, Group IV, #1 thru 6, Group V, #1
thru 7, Group VII #1 #2, #6, #7 & #8, Group VI, #1 & #2

AMOUNT: $75.667.31 (estimated annually)

RECOMMENDATION: 2) VENDOR: Bazaar Uniforms & Mens Wear
El Paso, Texas
ITEM(s): Group |, #1 thru 12, Group llI, #1 thru 4, Group VI, #1 thru
7
AMOUNT:  $119.887.99 (estimated annually)

RECOMMENDATION: 3) VENDOR: Alco Industrial Co.
El Paso, Texas

ITEM(s): Group VII, #3,#4, & #5
AMOUNT: $5,774.2Q (estimated annually)

The Police Department and Purchasing Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest

amamaibdoa .

responsive offer meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Group | is being awarded to the second lowest bidder. The winter jacket in Group | submitted by lower
bidder did not meet the required specifications as it was the wrong color and wrong material.

Vendor #1 & #3 offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for one
(1) additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from the date of the award.

Vendor #2 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for one (1) or
two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2) years from the date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twenty Four (24) months.

BIDS SOLICITED- 38 (14 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 05
“NO BID” RECEIVED 01
CURRENT TAXED PAID-

OUT-OF-TOWN- XX

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 402.659.00



xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx

APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: May 4. 2004

%\' M~

Byron EX Johnkon, C.P.M.
Director of Pukchasing




EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

DATE: April 15, 2004

TO: Jesus Juarez
Purchasing Department

FROM: Mariza MelendezW

Police Department
SUBJECT:  Uniforms Bid # 2004-111

The Police Department recommends award of the above bid as indicated below. The
Dept. has reviewed the bids and the below bidders meet all specifications. Group I1s
being awarded to the 2" Jowest bidder. The winter jacket Uniforms of Texas submitted
did not meet specification. The jacket was not Spiewak Model #1775 or equal and it 1s
the wrong color and material. Funds for this purchase will come from the General Fund.
Uniforms will be ordered on as needed basis. If you have any questions, please contact
me (@ 564-7332.

Vendor Group/Item Total Amount

Uniforms of Texas Group 11 #1-19 $11,873.94
' Group IV #1-6 $ 5,139.62
Group V. #1-7 $ 9,678.60
Group VII #1.2.6,7,8 $ 5.675.15
Group VIII #1-2 $43,300.00

Bazaar Uniforms Group I #1-12 $103,464.38

Group III #1-4 § 8.014.72

Group VI #1-7 $ 8.408.89

Alco Industrial Co. . Group VI #3.4.5 $ 5.774.20



THECITYOF EL PASO

REV 04-15-99

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Memo

TO: BOB ADKINSON DATE: MARCH 15, 2004

ALL RECOMMENDATIONS MUST BE E-MAILED BACK IN A WORD FORMAT
ATTACHEMENT , PLEASE FILL IN INFORMATION AND E-MAIL BACK TO ME
AS AN ATTACHEMENT.

The award recommendation cannot be presented to City Council until a requisition
has been posted in PEOPLESOFT.

We have been reminded by the City Attorney's Office, that no one from the ordering
Department, or from Purchasing should discuss the award recommendation with any party,
including the potential contractor, except other City employees involved in the project, until
after the actual award recommendation has been placed on the published City
Council Agenda. All questions concerning the award should be referred to the Purchasing
Department.

BID #2004-111 POLICE UNIFORMS

Please provide the following information with vour recommendation:

POSTED Requisition Number:

Recommended bidder(s): Various_ O&& W%Jﬂé
Recommended Item(s): Various <& CUIZ/sA
Department ID: 21010060

Account No: 503120

If applicable, Project Code:

Funding Source: 01101

If applicable, Fiscal Year:

Estimated annual expenditure: $ 201,329.50

Or Total award amount 3

District(s):

(-
Authorizing Signatur, ate ﬁr R4




CITY OFiEL PKSO BID TAB‘ULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM|  ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
GROUP I; REGULAR DUTY UNIFORMS ‘ i :
$40.99 | $4,099.00
1. 100 TROUSERS, WOMEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $41.99 | $4,199.00
MANUFAGTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
CATALOG NO. 8761 / L4300EL
$40.99 | $32,792.00
2. 800 TROUSERS, MEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NOBID | $0.00
EACH $41.99 | $33,592.00
MANUFACTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
CATALOG NO. 8760 / 4300EL
3. 20 COMMAND JACKET $0.00 $0.00 $89.99 | $1,799.80 | $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER ELBECO
CATALOG NO. 38169
4. 150 TIE, BLACK $0.00 $0.00 $2.49 $373.50 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER VALENTI
CATALOG NO.
$32.09 | $1,925.40
5. 60 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, WOMEN'S|  $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $32.99 | $1,979.40
MANUFACTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
GATALOG NO. 7767 / L4340EL

APPROVED BY:

DATE:,%&%@'

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF E:L PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004~ 1 1
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM|  ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
$32.09 |$25,672.00
6. 800 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $32.99 |$26,392.00
MANUFACTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
CATALOG NO. 7765 / 4340EL
$37.69 | $2,713.68
7. 72 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE WINTER, $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S $37.99 | $2,735.28
MANUFACTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
CATALOG NO. 7766 / L4040EL
$37.69 |$11,307.00
8. 300 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE WINTER, $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH MEN'S $37.99 | $11,397.00
MANUFACTURER ELBECO / PERFECTION
GATALOG NO. 7764 / 4040EL
9. 100 JACKET, WINTER $0.00 $0.00 $194.99 |$19,499.00] $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER SPIEWAK
CATALOG NO. 1775
10. 50 RAIN COAT $10.98 | $549.00 | $12.49 | $624.50 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PLASTEX PLASTEX
CATALOG NO. 90014 9001Y

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT 2



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
11. 50 CAP, DRESS $0.00 $0.00 $24.19 $1,209.50 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MIDWAY
GATALOG NO. 4/STAR
12. 100 VEST, SAFETY, REFLECTIVE $11.98 $1,198.00 $14.49 $1,449.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PLASTEX PLASTEX
CATALOG NO. 10-855V 10-8555V ORANGE
GROUP I: TOTAL $1,747.00 $103,464.38 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP II; UNIFORM ACCESSORIES

1. 288 TIE GLIP, SILVER

EACH

$0.00 $0.00

$1.59 $457.92

$0.00

$0.00

NO BID $0.00

MANUFACTURER

CATALOG NO.

P51

2. 150 TIE CLIP, GOLD

EACH

$0.00 $0.00

$1.59 $238.50

$0.00

$0.00

NO BID $0.00

MANUFACTURER

CATALOG NO.

P50

APPROVED BY:

DATE;%é& '

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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"CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
3. 10 GROSS BUTTON, SILVER $0.00 $0.00 $0.26 $37.44 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH (PER GROSS)
MANUFACTURER WATERBURY
CATALOG NO.
4. 4 GROSS BUTTON, GOLD $0.00 $0.00 $0.35 $50.40 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH (PER GROSS)
MANUFACTURER WATERBURY
CATALOG NO.
5. 200 NAME TAG, SILVER $0.00 $0.00 $2.09 $418.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
6. 100 NAME TAG, GOLD $0.00 $0.00 $2.09 $209.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
7. 1000 CHEVRON, CORPORAL $0.00 $0.00 $0.59 $590.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
APPROVED BY: :
2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT ! 4

DATE:E)/’/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION |

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM|  ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
8. 1000 HASH MARK, SILVER $0.00 $0.00 $0.25 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EAGH
MANUFAGTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
9. 1000 HASH MARK, GOLD $0.00 $0.00 $0.25 $250.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
10. 2000 PATCH, POLICE, LARGE $0.00 $0.00 $0.79 | $1,580.00 |  $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
1. 500 PATGH, POLICE, SMALL $0.00 $0.00 $0.68 $340.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
GATALOG NO.
$28.99 | $2,899.00
12. 100 BADGE, SHIRT, GOLD $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $67.99 | $6,799.00
MANUFACTURER PREMIER/BLACKINTON
CATALOG NO. PBC-158 / B-96

APPROVED BY:_

DATE:,?/[&(/QL/ ' 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT ’ 5




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
$28.99 | $2,899.00
13. 100 BADGE, SHIRT, RHODIUM $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $59.99 | $5,999.00
MANUFACTURER PREMIER / BLACKINTON
CATALOG NO. PBC-158 / B-96
$28.99 | $724.75
14. 25 BADGE, CAP, RHODIUM $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $50.99 | $1,274.75
MANUFACTURER PREMIER / BLACKINTON
CATALOG NO. PB1219 / B-627HA
$28.99 | $724.75
15. 25 BADGE, CAP, GOLD $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
$58.99 | $1,474.75
MANUFACTURER PREMIER / BLACKINTON
CATALOG NO. 1219 / B-627HA
16. 100 BUCKLE, BRASS $0.00 $0.00 $2.59 $259.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFAGTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
17. 100 BUCKLE, SILVER $0.00 $0.00 $1.99 $199.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFAGTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:§//( /Ql/
VA e

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT "6
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CITY OF ELPASOBID T BULATION

BID # 2004-111

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

-1 DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
] EL PASO, TX - EL PASO, TX
(\TEmM|  ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT ‘
_N_R»_(_]_T_Y & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION EXTENS_IPL\I__ PRICE EXTENSION L PRICE EXTENSION EXTENSION
18. 1000 CHEVRON, SERGEANT $0.00 $0.00 $0.63 $630.00 $0.00 $0.00
| EACH
MANUFACTURER T PREMIER o
CATALOG NO. — |
= ] . ——
19. 150 RIBBON BAR, CLOTH $0.00 $0.00 $1.49 $223.50 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
| EAcH BLACKINGTON, RC-1-RC-46
MANUFACTURER T BLACKINTON |
CATALOG NO. N ) o ,
GROUP Il: TOTAL $0.00 $12,980.26 $0.00 $0.00
ROUP 11l: SWAT, CANINE, CRI ENE
$17.89 $429.36
1. 24 TROUSERS, BDU, NAVY, $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $24.96 $599.04 NO BID $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S | $22.99 | $551.76 |
MANUFACTURER PROPPER / PROPPER CABELA’S
CATALOG NO. F520112412/F520138405 | 90-0037
1 $17.89 | $3,578.00 |
TROUSERS, BDU, NAVY, MEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $24.96 | $4,992.00 | NO BID $0.00
$22.99 | $4,598.00 |
MANUFACTURER PROPPER / PROPPER CABELA'S
CATALOG NO. 520112412 / F520138405| 90-0037

APPROVED BY: .

DA'TE'. # Z;Z: g 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT 7



-y

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABU‘LATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. [ QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
$17.89 | $429.36
3. 24 SHIRT, BDU, NAVY, WOMEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $24.99 | $599.76
MANUFACTURER PROPPER / PROPPER
CATALOG NO. F545412412 7/ F545438405
$17.89 | $3,578.00
a. 200 SHIRT, BDU, NAVY, MEN'S $0.00 $0.00 ALTERNATE: $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH $24.99 | $4,998.00
MANUFACTURER PROPPER / PROPPER
[CATALOG NO. F545412412 / F545438405
GROUP Ill: TOTAL $0.00 $8,014.72 $5,591.04 $0.00

GROUP 1V; CIVILIAN UNIFORMS
1. 35 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S, $0.00 $0.00 $30.99 $1,084.45 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH FRENCH BLUE
MANUFACTURER HORACE SMALL
CATALOG NO. H$1231
2. 60 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S, $0.00 $0.00 $32.79 $1,967.40 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH FRENCH BLUE
MANUFACTURER HORACE SMALL
CATALOG NO.

HS1133

APPROVED BY:_

DATE: -;")//J)/éc/
yARVA

7
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

$5,634.81

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. | BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
3. 8 SUN HELMET, MESH W/ADJ. $0.00 $0.00 $10.99 $87.92 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH HEAD BAND
MANUFACTURER WESCO
CATALOG NO. 324
POLO SHIRT W/POCKET,
4. 48 SHORT SLEEVE, COLOR: $0.00 $0.00 $11.79 $565.92 $14.50 $696.00 | NO BID $0.00
EACH ASSORTED, EMBROIDERED
MANUFACTURER EXPRESS MARK MAGNUM PIQUE
CATALOG NO. 2713 95-0070
]
5. 20 HI-TECH SHOES $0.00 $0.00 $53.99 | $1,079.80 | $104.96 | $2,099.20 | NOBID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MAGNUM CABELA'S DUTY BOOTS
CATALOG NO. 5204 81-1827
POLO SHIRT W/POCKET,
6. 48 LONG SLEEVE, COLOR: $0.00 $0.00 $17.69 $849.12 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH ASSORTED, EMBROIDERED
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
[CATALOG NO. SK10
GROUP IV: TOTAL $0.00 $2,795.20 $0.00

APPROVED BY:
” / - // .

2004-111 LINIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
iTEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
GROUP V;: BICYCLE UNIT UNIFORMS
1. 30 JACKET, NAVY, DELUXE, $0.00 $0.00 $139.99 | $4,199.70 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH BICYCLE OPTINAL WINDER LINER
MANUFACTURER MOCEAN
CATALOG NO. 6023SC
2. 30 PANTS, NAVY, BIKE, RAINWEAR $0.00 $0.00 $79.99 $2,399.70 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH OPTINAL WINTER LINER
MANUFACTURER MOCEAN
CATALOG NO. 2020
3. 25 SHORTS, BIKE, MOCEAN, NAVY $0.00 $0.00 $33.99 $849.75 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH BLUE, 8" WITH LYERA GOSSETS '
MANUFACTURER MOCEAN
CATALOG NO. 1023
SHIRT, POLO, MOCEAN, NAVY,
4 44 SHORT SLEEVE, W/REFLECTIVE $0.00 $0.00 $42.99 $1,891.56 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH STRIPES AND PANEL
MANUFACTURER MOCEAN
CATALOG NO. 0352

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ES%ML/
/7T

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-1 11
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.
ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, POLO, BLAUER, NAVY,
5. 69 LONG SLEEVE, W/REFLECTIVE $0.00 $0.00 $46.99 $3,242.31 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH STRIPES AND PANEL
MANUFACTURER MOCEAN
CATALOG NO. 0353
6. 20 BIKE HELMET $0.00 $0.00 $21.99 $439.80 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO. FLE511
7. 143 EMBROIDERY, NAME TAG $0.00 $0.00 $2.99 $427.57 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S
MANUFACTURER JCPRO
CATALOG NO.
GROUP V: TOTAL $0.00 $13,450.39 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP VIi: ACADEMY AND RECRUITS
SHORTS, 6" IN SEAM,
1. 500 DRAWSTRING, BLACK $9.63 $4,815.00 $6.29 $3,145.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.80 $4,900.00
EACH WITH POCKETS
MANUFACTURER ANVIL MERRYGARDEN AUGUSTA
CATALOG NO. 20238 12M STYLE #910

APPROVED BY:

DATE: S/, /4
7

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, TEES, 50/50
2. 500 HEAVYWEIGHT, RED WITH $4.66 $2,330.00 $3.09 $1,545.00 $9.96 $4,980.00 $3.48 $1,740.00
EACH WHITE ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER FRUIT OF THE LOOM JERZEES SUPER DUTY TEES FRUIT OF THE LOOM
CATALOG NO. ~ 04200 29MP 90-2571 #5930
SWEAT SHIRT, 80/20
3 100 HEAVYWEIGHT, NAVY BLUE WITH $10.22 $1,022.00 $9.09 $909.00 $22.46 $2,246.00 $10.48 $1,048.00
EACH WHITE ACADEMY LOGO, NO HOOD
MANUFACTURER JERZEE/AUDAN GILDAN MEGA SWEAT GUILDAN
CATALOG NO. 06149 096149-15 90-1789 G900
SWEAT PANTS, 80/20
4. 100 HEAVYWEIGHT, POCKETS $11.28 $1,126.00 $8.29 $829.00 $26.46 $2,646.00 $9.94 $994.00
EACH DRAWSTRING, NAVY BLUE
WI/WHITE ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER JERZEE/AUDAN BRODER MEGA SWEAT GUILDAN
CATALOG NO. 06151 04151-15 90-1795 G121
5. 100 POLO SHIRTS, BLACK $9.12 $912.00 $11.39 $1,139.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11.24 $1,124.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER HANES STEEDMAN EXPRESS MARK GUILDAN
CATALOG NO. 05482 2711 G880
SHIRT, TEES, 50/50 HEAVYWEIGHT,
6. 75 GRAY, RED OR BLACK W/GRAY $4.86 $364.50 $2.59 $194.25 $10.46 $784.50 $3.48 $261.00
EACH & BLACK ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER FRUIT OF THE LOOM HANES SUPER DUTY TEES FRUIT OF THE LOOM
CATALOG NO. 04202 07200- 90-2571 #5930

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 6//54 4
7

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT

12




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-t11
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
PANTS, KHAKI, CARGO
7. 36 POCKETS, HIP POCKET, $29.45 $1,060.20 $17.99 $647.64 $24.96 $898.56 $18.95 $682.20
EACH KHAKI COLOR
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES CABELA'S DICKIES
CATALOG NO. PC56 23-214 90-0037
GROUP VI: TOTAL $11,629.70 $8,408.89 $11,555.06 $10,749.20
GROUP Vil; POLICE AVIATION
1. 14 NOMEX FLIGHT SUIT, #5127 $244.00 $3,4156.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MILITARY FLIGHT
CATALOG NO. 5127
2. 14 NOMEX FLIGHT SUIT, #5128 $283.00 $3,962.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MILITARY FLIGHT
CATALOG NO. 5128
3. 14 NOMEX FLIGHT GLOVES $37.80 $529.20 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER NOMEX GLOVES
CATALOG NO. 7111

APPROVED BY:

DATE:_%Y/&L{

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM{ ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
4. 14 NOMEX FLIGHT JACKET $342.60 | $4,796.40 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MILITARY
CATALOG NO. 5812
5. 10 SHOULDER HARNESS $44.86 $448.60 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER EAGLE INDUSTRIES
CATALOG NO.
6. 30 CHEMICAL SLIP $70.86 $2,125.80 $0.00 NO BID $104.96 | $3,148.80 | NO BID $0.00
EACH RESISTANT BOOTS
MANUFACTURER COMMAND CABELA'S STEEL TOE
CATALOG NO. 834-6087 81-1827
7. 50 POLO SHIRTS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $13.80 $690.00 $14.24 $712.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MAGNUM PIQUE GUILDAN
CATALOG NO. 95-0072 46880
8. 15 ROYAL ROBBINS PANTS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.
GROUP VII: TOTAL $15,278.00 $0.00 $3,838.80 $712.00

APPROVED BY:

/A

DATE:3/(AQ/
VAVA

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. [ QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE PRICE EXTENSION
GROUP :
PANTS, MOTORCYCLE,
1. 100 FRENCH BLUE WITH $0.00 $0.00 $149.00 | $14,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH POCKETS
MANUFACTURER SINATRA
CATALOG NO. BR-270
HELMET, MOTORCYCLE,
2. 100 SEER, WITH ACCOMMODATIONS $0.00 $0.00 $313.00 [$31,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
EACH FOR RADIO COMM. :
MANUFACTURER SHOEI
CATALOG NO. R]-AIR BLACK & WHITE
GROUP VII: TOTAL $0.00 $46,200.00 $0.00 $0.00

APPROVED BY:

/4

DATE: f %5} gé!gz

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2004-11t
DEPARTMENT: POLICE
DAVID COHEN ENT. INC.

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

]

(x]

]

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS CABELA'S INC. dba MEX-TEX
EL PASO, TX & MEN'S STORE SIDNESY, NE OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION - PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, x] ]

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES [X] No[ | YES No[ | YES No ] YES No[ ]
B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT,  YES [_| No[ ] YES No[ | ves [ ] NO YES [X] No [ |
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. ] ] (] L
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

20 CONSECUTIVE
CALENDAR DAYS

20 CONSECUTIVE
CALENDAR DAYS

20 CONSECUTIVE

CALENDAR DAYS

IF THE BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE OFFER.

APPROVED BY: /77 .

DATE: 3//6/09/
yavay

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM{  ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. | QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION

PRICE

GROUP I;: RE DUTY UNIFORMS

1. 100 TROUSERS, WOMEN'S $39.50 $3,950.00 $0.00 $0.00 ~ $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER

CATALOG NO. #42287

2. 800 TROUSERS, MEN'S $39.50 |[$31,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER

CATALOG NO. #42287

3. 20 COMMAND JACKET $87.00 $1,740.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER

CATALOG NO. #32133

4. 150 TIE, BLACK $1.98 $297.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH

MANUFACTURER S. BROOME

CATALOG NO. #90001

5. 60 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, WOMEN'S | $32.00 $1,920.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER

CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ';//5//0 ‘{/

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 , DEPARTMENT: POLICE
UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
6. 800 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $32.00 |$25,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #55R8786Z
7. 72 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE WINTER, $36.50 $2,628.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #201W8786Z
8. 300 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE WINTER, $36.50 |$10,950.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH MEN'S
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. #05W87867
9. 100 JACKET, WINTER $172.00 |$17,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER SPIEWAK
CATALOG NO. #1775
10. 50 RAIN COAT $10.50 $525.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER LIBERTY
CATALOG NO, #581MYE
APPROVED BY: @W Y/ %
DATE: !;[l,g’[ayf / ; 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT _ 18




" CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
1. 50 CAP, DRESS $25.25 $1,262.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER MIDWAY
CATALOG NO. #1814
12. 100 VEST, SAFETY, REFLECTIVE $8.99 $899.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER SAFETY FLAG
CATALOG NO. #SVSOF-LY
GROUP I: TOTAL $98,571.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP II: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES
1, 288 TIE CLIP, SILVER $1.38 $397.44 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO. P52
2. 150 TIE CLIP, GOLD $1.38 $207.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO. P50

APPROVED BY:

DATE: .9

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT

19



BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
3. 10 GROSS BUTTON, SILVER $0.26 $2.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO. P53
4. 4 GROSS BUTTON, GOLD $0.35 $1.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO. P5300
5. 200 NAME TAG, SILVER $2.15 $430.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BURLANE
CATALOG NO.
6. 100 NAME TAG, GOLD $2.15 $215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BURLANE
CATALOG NO.
7. 1000 CHEVRON, CORPORAL $0.60 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:S//S/U
YAA

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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"CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
8. 1000 HASH MARK, SILVER $0.35 $350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
9. 1000 HASH MARK, GOLD $0.30 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
10. 2000 PATCH, POLICE, LARGE $0.465 $1,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
1. 500 PATCH, POLICE, SMALL $0.56 $280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH : '
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
12. 100 BADGE, SHIRT, GOLD $28.50 $2,850.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NO. B-96

APPROVED BY:
naTeE. 4 ///[:l/

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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‘CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
iTEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
13. 100 BADGE, SHIRT, RHODIUM $24.90 $2,490.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NO. #B-96
14. 25 BADGE, CAP, RHODIUM $27.50 $687.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NO. #B-627HA 7
15, 25 BADGE, CAP, GOLD $29.00 $725.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NO. #B-627HA
16. 100 BUCKLE, BRASS $1.74 $174.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
17. 100 BUCKLE, SILVER $1.74 $174.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

- QAI///A:/

G 1. Junsg,

2004-111 LINIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2004-111

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
18. 1000 CHEVRON, SERGEANT $0.60 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO.
19. 150 RIBBON BAR, CLOTH $0.60 $90.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH BLACKINGTON, RC-1-RC-46
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NO. RC-1
$11,873.94 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP 1i: TOTAL

GROUP 1lI: SWAT, CANINE, CRIME SCENE
1. 24 TROUSERS, BDU, NAVY, $18.00 $432.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S
MANUFACTURER PROPPER
CATALOG NO. F52011
2. 200 TROUSERS, BDU, NAVY, MEN'S $18.00 $3,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PROPPER
CATALOG NO. F520112412

APPROVED BY:

-/
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CITY OF EL F”ASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
ITEM{ ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
3. 24 SHIRT, BDU, NAVY, WOMEN'S $18.00 $432.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PROPPER
CATALOG NO. F54541
4 200 SHIRT, BDU, NAVY, MEN'S $18.00 $3,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER PROPPER
CATALOG NO. F545412412
GROUP Iil: TOTAL $8,064.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP IV; CIVILIAN UNIFORMS

1. 35 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S, $28.78 $1,007.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH FRENCH BLUE
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 85R7826

APPROVED BY:

ANNMAA A4 VIAITADARIC

DNl IS NEDARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
2. 60 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S;, $30.32 $1,819.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH FRENCH BLUE
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 35W7826
3. 8 SUN HELMET, MESH W/ADJ. $17.50 $140.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH HEAD BAND
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 11609
POLO SHIRT W/POCKET,
4. 48 SHORT SLEEVE, COLOR: $11.94 $573.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH ASSORTED, EMBROIDERED
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NO. 17476
5. 20 HI-TECH SHOES $47.60 $952.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER HI TECH
CATALOG NO. 5204
POLO SHIRT W/POCKET,
6. 48 LONG SLEEVE, COLOR: $13.50 $648.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH ASSORTED, EMBROIDERED
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

-7/
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR. QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
GROUP IV: TOTAL $5,139.62 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP V: BICYCLE UNIT UNIFORMS
1. 30 JACKET, NAVY, DELUXE, $75.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH BICYCLE OPTINAL WINDER LINER
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. 9010
2. 30 PANTS, NAVY, BIKE, RAINWEAR $41.00 $1,230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
‘ EACH OPTINAL WINTER LINER
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. 676
3. 25 SHORTS, BIKE, MOCEAN, NAVY $30.00 $750.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH BLUE, 8" WITH LYERA GOSSETS
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. 376
SHIRT, POLO, MOCEAN, NAVY,
4. 44 SHORT SLEEVE, W/REFLECTIVE $38.90 $1,711.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH STRIPES AND PANEL ,
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. UUP-WF
APPROVED BY: .

DATE:3//,{é(/
VAALl
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CITY OFWEL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: MARCH

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

10, 2004

BID # 2004-111
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN.EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, POLO, BLAUER, NAVY,
5. 69 LONG SLEEVE, W/REFLECTIVE $42.50 $2,932.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH STRIPES AND PANEL
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. UUP-WFL
6. 20 BIKE HELMET $29.50 $590.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BELL PRO POLICE BIKE
CATALOG NO.
7. 143 EMBROIDERY, NAME TAG $1.50 $214.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WOMEN'S
MANUFACTURER PREMIER EMBLEM
CATALOG NO.
GROUP V: TOTAL $9,678.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP VI: ACADEMY AND RECRUITS

SHORTS, 6" IN SEAM,

1. 500 DRAWSTRING, BLACK $6.50 $3,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WITH POCKETS

MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER

CATALOG NO. 20238-00

APPROVED BY:

A

DATE:j/fé‘/
VA
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.&UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, TEES, 50/50 '
2. 500 HEAVYWEIGHT, RED WITH $3.80 $1,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WHITE ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 06200
SWEAT SHIRT, 80/20
3. 100 HEAVYWEIGHT, NAVY BLUE WITH $8.30 $830.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH WHITE ACADEMY LOGO, NO HOOD
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NO.
SWEAT PANTS, 80/20
4, 100 HEAVYWEIGHT, POCKETS $10.55 $1,055.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH DRAWSTRING, NAVY BLUE
W/WHITE ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 03154
5. 100 POLO SHIRTS, BLACK $9.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 03402
SHIRT, TEES, 50/50 HEAVYWEIGHT,
6. 75 GRAY, RED OR BLACK W/GRAY $3.50 $262.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH & BLACK ACADEMY LOGO
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 06200
APPROVED BY: , '
2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT : 28
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2004-111

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 -

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

UNIT UNIT
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION

PANTS, KHAKI, CARGO
POCKETS, HIP POCKET, $17.00 $612.00 $0.00 $0.00
KHAKI COLOR

ANN. EST.
QTY. & UNIT

TUNIT UNIT
‘ PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

MANUFACTURER DICKIE WEAR

CATALOG NO.

’/__J___’/

GROUP VI: TOTAL $8,809.50 , $0.00 $0.00

GROUP ViI; POLICE AVIATION

BREREN

NOMEX FLIGHT SUIT, #5127 $1,296.40 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFAGTURER TOPPS '__
CATALOG NO. CO-07-5515
2. \ 14 NOMEX FLIGHT SUIT, #5128 $104.00 | $1,456.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER TOPPS :
CATALOG NO. C0-07-561 5
NOMEX FLIGHT GLOVES NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

MANUFACTURER B _
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ;Q%Z 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT 29



éiCITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS . BID # 2004-111

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004 - - DEPARTMENT: POLICE |
UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
Teml ANN. EST. o UNIT UNIT |
NR. -SIY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE ____EXTENS‘ON i EXTENSION
a. 14 NOMEX FLIGHT JACKET NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH i i
MANUFACTURER -
CATALOG NO.
cATS - T B
5. 10 SHOULDER HARNESS $73.25 $732.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH I s .
MANUFACTURER BIANCHI o i I R —
CATALOG NO. UM84H B
6. 30 CHEMICAL SLIP $65.95 | $1,978.50 |  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH | RESISTANT BOOTS |
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD - B
CATALOG NO. ] 804-6087 B
T ]
7. 50 POLO SHIRTS $9.00 $450.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH L o
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER — B
CATALOG NO. 03402
] i
8. 15 ROYAL ROBBINS PANTS $32.95 $494.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH | L
MANUFACTURER ] LIBERTY - | [ R —
CATALOG NO. 535KH 1
GROUP VII: TOTAL $6,407.65 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ._2 2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT 30



CITY OF EL PASO BID TAEULATlON
BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2004-111
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY.& UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
GROUP VIlI; MOTORS
PANTS, MOTORCYCLE,
1. 100 FRENCH BLUE WITH. $134.00 | $13,400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH POCKETS
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NO. MC-100
HELMET, MOTORCYCLE,
2, 100 SEER, WITH ACCOMMODATIONS $299.00 |$29,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EACH FOR RADIO COMM.
MANUFACTURER BELL PRO POLICE
CATALOG NO. SD600
GROUP VH: TOTAL $43,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

APPROVED BY: @w& /}7 -
DATE: /S éﬂé/ /(/Ldvg‘f
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CITYOF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2004

BID # 2004-11 1
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

EL PASO, TX
ITEM}  ANN. EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NR.| QTY. & UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

] L]

i

vol |
NOD
u

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

]

ves | ]
ves | ]
L]

]

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

NOD
NOD

YES D
YES D

YES
ves ||
]

no| |
nol |

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

C. NO OPTION OFFERED.

il
]

ves |
ves ||
EI

vo[ ]
vo[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

90 CONSECUTIVE
CALENDAR DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

IF THE BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY

MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE OFFER.

BIDS SOLICITED: 38 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 BIDS LOCAL: 14

NO BID: 1

2004-111 UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT

APPROVED BY: )
DATE: Jé\)//
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ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B HUECO ST.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMARRON
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32205

Soumlues"r [Ao ERFUZEMONT Sates

cC Pase, TX 49903
FAMOUS UNIFORMS, INC.
DBA B.J.’S UNIFORMS
3942 LEOPARD
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78408

IRON AGE PROTECTIVE CO.
2814 YANDELL AVE,
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

MISSION IND.
141 TEXAS AVE
EL PASO, TEXAS 72901

REGIONAL UNIFORMS & SUPPLY
141 SUMIT AVE., STE. 2
PLANO,, TEXAS 75074

GT DISTRIBUTORS

5428 GUADALUPE ST.
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78751
ATTN: MARGARET MORENO

L%W‘ 'S HOME IMPROVEMENT WHS
RE

ZL PASQ, T 79'9‘1%\
: ETA

AFINTCARLOS UZ

\TTN: IRVING FRANK
*ORTSMOUTH ARMIE
{AVIE STORES, INC.

817 HIGH ST.
'ORTSMOUTH, VA 23704

OTA P
25 41°L8T SUIT 306

v Y] BEACH, FL

Perzm T,
320 ELizhBeTw AvE.

Sovrre 209
Lol Pt 2. T2

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVE.
GARDENA, CA 90247

JP BATTLE UNIFORMS CO.
2415 WEST N.W. HWY., STE. 107
DALLAS, TEXAS 75220

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARKWAY, STE C
TUCSON, ARIZONA 85713

SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVE.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES
1346 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TEXAS 73936

SUN CITY EMBROIDERY
8300 CARNEGIE DR., SUITE B
EL PASO, TEXAS 79825
ATTN: JESSICA MARIE LARA

CLIFTON UNIFORM
529 MAIN STREET
LOVELAND, OH 45140
DEB RAYBURN

CABELA’S INC.

ONE CABELA DR.

SIDNEY, NE 89160

ATTN: KAREN WIEKHORST

MEX-TEL Up1Fodms
(O3 &. WYomine
= Pasy TEr 940]

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MENS
STORE

304 E. OVERLAND

EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

EXCLUSIVE LAW ENFORCEMENT
PROD.

P.C. BOX 1864

DENTON, TEXAS 76202-1864

HARBOR LINEN CO.
P.0. BOX 3510
CHERRY HILL, JN 08034

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3535 N. YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

PROFESSIONAL POLICE SUPPLY
722 CLAY STREET
OAKLAND, CA 94607

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERV.
SUBS. OF UNIFIRST CORP.
P.O BOX 26159

EL PASO, TEXAS 79826

SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVE.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

ATTN: SANDY LESKIN
MARTIN’S UNIFORMS
P. 0. BOX 7455
TAMPA, FL 33673

MAGIC CITY 8
4363 F

BIRMINGHAT,
AT’I’ﬁ(:NN?R. MAY.

D IDDKE
P.0.B 8
MAPTSON, MS 39130

UUIRoRms OF
Mowran s fue.
N4938

E-NORTH
L 35222

TSeASDS

Lo
S /;}Sol TX



BID INFORMATION SERVICE
(ALL BIDS ARE ADVERTISED)
BID NET PROCESSING CENTER
PO BOX 5600
ALBANY, NY 12205

GREATER EL PASO CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
ONE CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
EL PASO, TX. 79901

EL PASO HISPANIC CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
2829 MONTANA AVE, B-100
EL PASO, TX 79903

EL PASO TIMES NEWSPAPER
CLASSIFIED / LEGAL SECTION
PO BOX 20

EL PASO, TX 79999

CONTRACT OPPORTUNITY CENTER
4791 N. MESA
EL PASO, TX 79902

SAM’S CLUB
7970 NORTH MESA
EL PASO ,TX 79932

SUBCONTRACTORS ASSOCIATION
PO BOX 3612
EL PASO, TX 79923

COMMEERCE BUSINESS WEEKLY
2626 NORTHEAST # 103
EL PASO, TX 79902

BLACK CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
ONE CIVIC CENTER PLAZA
EL PASO, TX 79901



