CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services

AGENDA DATE: May 8,2012

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Stuart Ed, General Services Director, 915-621-6822
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 915- 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
Solicitation 2012-051, Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils

Discussion and action that the Purchasing Manager, Financial Services, Purchasing Division, be
authorized to issue a Purchase Order(s) to Tigua Transportation, Inc., El Paso, Western Refining
Wholesale, Inc., El Paso, Stewart & Stevenson Power Products, LLC, El Paso and Brewer Oil Co.,
Albuquerque, NM effective the date of the award for an initial term of three (3) years with a two (2) year
option to renew at the sole discretion of the City. The estimated annual expenditures are $948,000.00
with an estimated total expenditure of $2,844,000.00. Thermo Fluids, Inc., Scottsdale, AZ will be
awarded the Recycle/Buyback of Used Oil.

Group A — Antifreeze:

Western Refining Wholesale. Inc. - $153.000.00 p/year
Group A - Items 1A, 1B, 2A, 2B, 3A, 3B,

Group B — Motor Qil & Lubricants:
Tigua Transportation. Inc. - $383.000.00 p/year
Group B - Items 1A, 1B, 2A, 2B, 3B, 4B, 5B, 6B, 7B, 12B, 16B

Western Refining Wholesale, Irlc. - $38.000.00 p/year
Group B - Item 13B, 14B, 15B

Group C — Transmission & Hydraulic Qil & Fluids:
Stewart & Stevenson Power Products, LLC - $179.000 p/vear
Group C - Item 1B '

Tigua Transportation, Inc — $84.000.00 p/year
Group C - Items 7B, 9B, 10B, 11B, 12A, 12B

Western Refining Wholesale. Inc. - $106.000.00 p/year
Group C - Items, 2B, 5B ‘

Brewer Oil, Co. - $5.000.00 p/year
Group C - Items 6B, 8B

Group D — Recycle or Buyback of used Oil and Filters
Thermo Fluids, Inc. - $1.05 p/gallon
Group D - Item 1




BACKGROUND /DISCUSSION:

The General Services Department is recommending this award to Tigua Transportation, Inc.,
Western Refining Wholesale, Inc., Stewart and Stevenson Power Products, LLC and Brewer Oil,
Co. as they are the lowest, most responsive, responsible bidder offering the best value to City.
The current City fleet is made up of over two thousand light and heavy duty vehicles all of which
at some point in their useful life will require the use of motor oil, antifreeze, lubricants,
transmission oil, hydraulic oil and fluids. The utilization of this contract will allow for the
upkeep and maintenance of these vehicles translating into more efficiently operated vehicle
which implies potential savings for the City. By utilizing Tigua Transportation, Inc. and
Western Refining Wholesale, the City is also supporting a local business.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Yes. February 10, 2009, Item 7.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

This solicitation was advertised January 31, 2012 and February 7, 2012, and opened on February
15,2012. On January 31, 2012 bid notification postcards were mailed out, the solicitation was
posted on the City’s website and the email (Purmail) was sent out. Thirty-two (32) local bidders
were solicited and three (3) local bidders responded.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: General Services ,

Amount: $2,844,000.00 (3 year estimated at $948,000 /year)

Funds Available: Dept #: 37370510 — Acct # 503124 — Fund # 45202 — Grant # N/A
Funds Source: Internal Service Fund — Fuel Inventory Purchases "

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

Tskdwkkniknkknikinit ATUTHORIZATION® % fsdesesdesedesedesdedesedeied
DEPARTMENT HEAD: _ %

Stuart Ed, General Services Director




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

***************************************'k*POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of MAY 8, 2012.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2012-051 (Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants,
Transmission and Hydraulic Qils) to Tigua Transportation Inc., Western Refining Wholesale, Inc., Stewart and
Stevenson Power Products, LLC and Brewer Oil Co. for an initial term estimated award of $2,844,000.00.

Thermo Fluids, Inc. will be awarded the Recycle/Buyback of Used Oil.

Department:
Award to: (Vendor #1)
ltem(s):

Option:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Amount:

Total Initial Term Award:
Award to: (Vendor #2)
ltem(s):

Option:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Amount:

Total Initial Term Award:
Award to: (Vendor #3)
ltem(s):

Option:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Amount:

Total Initial Term Award:
Award to: (Vendor #4)
ltem(s):

Option:

Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Amount:

Total Initial Term Award:

General Services

Western Refining Wholesale, Inc.

El Paso, TX

Group A - ltems 1A, 1B, 2A, 2B, 3A, 3B

Group B - ltems 13B, 14B, 15B

Group C - ltems 2B, 5B

2 years

Net 30 .

$297,000.00 (Group A: $153,000.00/yr; Group B: $38,000.00/yr; Group C:
$106,000.00/yr) '

$891,000.00 (3 years)

Tigua Transportation Inc.

El Paso, TX

Group B — Items 1A, 1B, 2A, 2B, 3B, 4B, 5B, 6B, 7B, 12B, 16B
Group C - ltems 7B, 9B, 10B, 11B, 12A, 12B

2 years '

Net 30

$467,000.00 (Group B: $383,000.00/yr; Group C: $84,000.00/yr)
$1,401,000.00 (3 years)

Stewart & Stevenson Power Products, LLC
El Paso, TX

Group C - ltems 1B

2 years

Net 30

$179,000.00

$537,000.00 (3 years)

Brewer Oil Co.
Albuguerque, NM
Group C - Items 6B, 8B
2 years

Net 30

$5,000.00

$15,000.00 (3 years)




Award to: (Vendor #5) Thermo Fiuids, Inc.
Scottsdale, AZ
ltems: Group D (Buyback — Revenue to the City)

Option: 2 Years

Annual Estimated Award: $948,000.00
Initial Term Estimated Award: $2,844,000.00 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $4,740,000.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 37370510 — 503124 — 45202

Funding Source: Internal Service Fund — Fuel Inventory Purchases
District(s): All

This is low bid, supplies contract for Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oils and
buyback of used oil.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Service recommend award as indicated to
Western Refining Wholesale, Inc., Tigua Transportation Inc., Stewart & Stevenson Power Products, LLC,
Brewer Oil Co., the lowest responsive, responsible bidders and Thermo Fluids, Inc. for the buyback-revenue

to the City.

*******************************************ADD ITI O NAL I N FO B E LOW**********************************************




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
“minﬁi“i

2010
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids Department: General Services
NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWEROIL CO. CERTIFIED %%1;2&25:{3'3“' STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ) PRODUCTS, LLC
IRVING, TX ! EL PASO, TX
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK )
1A (GALLON) ANTIFREEZE YELLOW NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1B (SSDG‘:‘L’E’C')N) ANTIFREEZE YELLOW $330.16 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
~ DRUM
MANUFACTURER PAR PRODUCTS
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ANTIFREEZE 50/50
2A (Gi‘ﬂtgm ANTIFREEZE RED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
. GALLON
2B DRUM ANTIFREEZE RED $452.77 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
(55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 227811 982
BULK ANTIFREEZE RED / EXTENDED
3A (GALLON) LIFE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3B DRUM ANTIFREEZE RED / EXTENDED $452.77 'NOBID NO BID NO BID
(55 GALLON) LIFE
DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 227811 982
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY%C \/CM éa—e)&fl‘

DATE:_03/07/12

| ) T j T T T




CITY OF EL PASO ElFase

All-AnresicaCiiy.

VIEElT
‘ BID TABULATION FORM U
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Qil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
| ‘ NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED I\::cl:-{l.llil\(l;lggzgg: EIC\JIN STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ’ PRODUCTS, LLC
7 IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM| UNT | DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE . UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK i
LY P ALLON) ANTIFREEZE BLUE NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
‘ | bprum 5 ~
4B | seaion) ANTIFBEEZE BLUE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK | 330 GL TOTE 330 GL TOTE
A |G ALLON) MOTOR OIL CJ4 $9.23 $18.05 $18.05 NO BID
| GALLON GALLON GALLON
1B | o5 onrion) MOTOR OIL CJ4 $530.20 + TAX IF ANY $1,062.60 $1,062.60 ~ NOBID
f DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTUREk SINGLAIR HD SYNTHETIG S‘iii‘;‘i‘i%fﬁggﬁﬂ‘;ﬁo C“E"L’}ﬁgAR‘j;‘v;;’OBL'jﬁMAX
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER BLEND 814-001 10177023 / 10181792 10177022 / 10172337
BULK MOTOR OIL 15W40
2A (GALLON) L;OW ASH GAI;l_lIf\ON N/A N/A N/A
DRUM MOTOR OIL 15W40 :
2B | s caLion LOW ASH $7so.4sD+ RTS;([ IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER "~ CHEVRON HDAX
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 15W40 232331

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.
APPROVED BY:___ s V1D N  DATE: 0300712 _ 2

—




Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El I’aso

Al Am‘:ﬂﬂll:llll

T

Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services
BREWEROILCO, | NCHCORPORATION |\ oo o0 STEWART &
ALBUQUERQUE, NM CERTIFIED CHEMSEARCHDIV, | STEVENSONPOWER
LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX PRODUCTS, LLC
IL & LUBRICAN IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ uNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
s | auon |  MOTOROIL SAE 10w N/A N/A N/A N/A
3B | ssention MOTOR OIL SAE 10W $711.15 + TAX IF ANY $867.35 $867.35 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON DELO 400 10W CERT'F";';;:'TB: '::TOR'ES CHEMSEASRS:'O'V‘SBRA MAX -
BRAND PRODUCT NQMBER 235109 10187718 10189916
|
BULK ;
4A | GaLion MOTOR OIL SAE 30W N/A N/A N/A N/A
|
4B | o5 eaLLon MOTOR OIL SAE 30W $711.15 + TAX IF ANY $867.35 $867.35 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTUREjR - CHEVRON DELO 400 30w CERTIFIZ_'}RL:?AO;;\TORIES CHEMSEA:(‘;?O;‘;BRA MAX
BRAND PRODUCT NQMBER 235118 10042697 10185486
BULK |
0 :
5A | (GALLON) WOTOR OIL SAE 520 NIA NIA N/A N/A
5B | sseniton)|  MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20 $667.15 + TAX IF ANY $947.10 $947.10 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER VALVOLINE PC 5W20 S TRAT A FEORATORIES CHENSEARCH LUBRA MAX
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER VV110 10187682 10189896
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULglON IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:_03/07/12

T




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

a-fnmencathy

"

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
| C 0
BREWEROLCO. | " Cerpmp " | NCHCORPoRATON | STEWARTE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM CHEMSEARCH DIV.
LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX PRODUCTS, LLC
. LUBRICAN L IRVING, TX ! EL PASO, TX
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK ? ‘
MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30
6A (GALLON) ; N/A N/A N/A N/A
6B (55%'1‘5,'_":“) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30 $459.25 + TAX IF ANY $947.10 $947.10 NO BID
f DRUM DRUM DRUM
T CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX
MANUFACTU REB , SINCLAIR SUPREME STRATA XTREME 5W30 ULTRA 5W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SYNTHETIC BLEND 5W30 10187679 10189893
BULK |
7A (GALLON) MOTOR jOIL SAE 10W30 N/A N/A N/A N/A
7B | sseaton| MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30 $658.35 + TAX IF ANY $947.10 $947.10 NO BID
: DRUM DRUM DRUM
! CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX
MANUFACTUREiR VALVOLINE PC 10W30 STRATA XTREME 10030 ULTRA 1020
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER VV124 10062946 10189901
BULK |
ATF DE NI
8A | (GALLON) DEXRO NIA N/A N/A N/A
DRUM |
8B (55 GALLON) ATFEDEXRON Hi $476.85 $916.30 $916.30 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM
: CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA
MANUFACTURE‘R CHEVRON ATF NOD3 LUBEMASTER ATE paindedoes
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226502 10190019 10190008
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES N

APPROVED BY

— =

Is] 91/6

DATE:_03/07/12

OT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

T




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
i

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services

BREWER OIL CO. NCH CORPORATION NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
ALBUQUERQUE, NM CERTIFIED CHEMSEARCH DIV | STEVENSONPOWER
LABORATORIES DIV. RVING. TX PRODUCTS, LLC
e IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK TRANSMISSION FLUID
oA | (GALLON) MERCON V N/A N/A N/A N/A
9B (55%'1’&") TRAN;@E‘E&%NVFLmD $881.65 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00 $2,255.00 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM
: CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH M/M TRANS V
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON ATF MERCONS M/M TRANS V ATF ATFE
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226719 10187344 10187344
10A (G'f\‘L’th) | TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A
108 | . ONUM | TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 | $1,051.05 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
! (55 GALLON) ;
| DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON ATF + 4
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226533
1A | Galion) MERCON LV N/A NO BID NO BID N/A
1B | osaniton MERCON LV NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:___js1 VB

DATE: 03/07112

T




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Alt-fnesica Clly

e

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services
NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED %%'éﬁggzggﬁgﬁ"' STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ' PRODUCTS, LLC
IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM UNIT ) DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK |
12A | G ALLON) HYDRAULI(}‘ FLUID TRACTOR N/A N/A N/A N/A
12B (55DG'}\lLJI'.VION) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR $750.75 + TAX IF ANY $930.60 $930.60 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM
‘ DRIVE TRAIN CHEVRON FLUID CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA
MANUFACTU RE§R 30w OIL ALL PLUS SYSTEMS TH
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226608 10070636 10189989
BULK 1
UNIVERSAL. GEAR OIL 85W140
13A (GALLON) L N/A N/A N/A N/A
13B 55%'1’1"'0’\‘ UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 | $750.00 + TAX IF ANY $1,104.00 $1,104.00 NO BID
( ) DRUM DRUM DRUM
1 CHEVRON RPM UNIVERSAL CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH GEARCO SAE
MANUFACTURE;R GEAR OIL 85wW140 CERTOP 85W140 85W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 225039 10194601 10193091
BULK ‘
SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50
14A (GALLON) i N/A N/A N/A N/A
14B (55DG'7\l|:_l|IYION) SYNTHET'C GEAR OIL 50 $1,680.00 + TAX IF ANY $2,396.00 $2,396.00 NO BID
i DRUM DRUM DRUM
T CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA
MANUFACTUR%R CHEVRON RPM SYNTHETIC 50 LUBEMASTER SAE 50 SYSTEMS SYN SAE 50
BRAND PRODUGT NUMBER 210456 10172926 10172734

APPROVED BY: Is] Q’ UE)

DATE:_03/07/12

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

1]




CITY OF EL PASO | mr

Al-Amierica ity

i 7
BID TABULATION FORM i
Bid Opening Date: February 15 2012 : Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Qil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
i NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED 'i%iﬁggiggﬂﬁ,” STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ’ PRODUCTS, LLC
- BF B IRVING, TX ' EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
SYNTH lC: GEA
15A | (GALLoN | SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 NIA N/A | N/A N/A
15B (55'33'}\‘1"'()") SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 |  $1,513.00 + TX IF ANY $2,120.00 $2,120.00 NO BID
' DRUM DRUM DRUM
3 CHEVRON DELO SYNTHETIC | CERTIFIED LABORATORIES | CHEMSEARGH LUBRA TECH
MANUFACTU REB GEAR LUBE 80W140 CERTOP SN 80W140 SYN 80W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 277109 ) 10172931 10172731
|
BULK MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE,
16A (GALLON) [NLGI GRADE-2 BASED GREASE N,A N/A N/A N/A
DRUM MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE,
16B $1,052.00 + TAX IF ANY $1,212.00 $1,212.00 NO BID
(55 GALLON) |NLGI G ADE- BASED E ’
LGIGR 2 BASE GREAS DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON MOLY GREASE #2 CERT'F'E?T;’I‘ffS(ATOR'Es CHEMSEARCH LUBRAPLEX
BRAND PRODUCT NOMBER 255660 10190625 10189890
BULK :
TRANSYND Ol
1A | (GALLON) NSYND OIL N/A NIA N/A N/A
1B (55%'}\8["0”) TRANSYND OIL $1,517.45 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00 $2,255.00 $1,642.74
DRUM DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON SYNTHETIC ATF HD CERT'F“%I';Q%E'E‘:ISS'ES MM CHEMSEAR;SI;‘“E’M TORQUE CASTROL TRANSYND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226718 10177252 10177252 ALLISON TES295

THE INFQRARSTIENSONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION OBUAEANRRRES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARDIEXEGUTION OF CONTRAGCT. 7
I 2




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Alt-fnesicaCity

T

Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Qil, Antifreéze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
1 NCH CORPORATION ' STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED I\g_:-éncnggiggﬁ gg/N STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ’ PRODUCTS, LLC
. 0 IRVING, TX o EL PASO, TX
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC
2A (GALLON) BI%.END ATE N/A N/A N/A N/A
DRUM MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC
2B (55 GALLON) BILEND ATE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
3A BULK N/A N/A N/A N/A
(GALLON) ATF+4
DRUM
3B (55 GALLON) | ATF+4 $1,051.05 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
| DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON ATF + 4
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226533

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE AGTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

DATE:_03/07/12 - - 8

APPROVED BY:___is1 VB




JEXP

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

R-America City

111N

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission Ahd Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
! : NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED I\g_:-él\cnggzgg:gﬁ;q STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ) PRODUCTS, LLC
IRVING, TX ! EL PASO, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK |
4A (GALLON) MFRCON Vv N/A N/A N/A N/A
4B (55'36'1‘:&,1) MERCON v $881.65 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00 $2,255.00 NO BID
; - DRUM DRUM DRUM
1 1 LABORATORIES M/| CHEMSEARCH M/M TRANS V
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON MERCON CERTIF B s o IES i i
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226719 10187344 10187344
BULK
5A | (GALLON) DEXRON Vi N/A N/A N/A N/A
5B | (55 aniton) DEXRON VI $1,111.55 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID
| DRUM
MANUFACTURER CHEVRON DEXRON VI ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226532

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRAGT.

APPROVED BY:

—_— =

Isl 21’,6

DATE:_03/07/12

i

T |
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Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-fistierica Ciy.

T

2010

Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreéze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services

- NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED 'géncnggzggﬁgﬁl" STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE,NM | LABORATORIES DIV. RVING. TX PRODUCTS, LLC
- IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK | HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO
6A | (GALLON) VG 100 N/A N/A N/A N/A
6B DRUM | HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO $737.35 + TAX IF ANY $791.45 $791.45 NO BID
(55 GALLON) VG 100
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
i CHEVRON RANDO CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA GUARD
MANUFACTURE}R HDZ 100 HOC100 1SO 100
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 273263 10042741 - 10189950
7A BULK N/A N/A N/A N/A
@@ALLON) | HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26
7B (5;35\%) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26|  $667.15 + TAX IF ANY $791.45 $791.45 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTUREjR CHEVRON RANDO HD&8 CERTlFlEDHL(;\CBé;RATORIES CHEMSEAR(];SHOLéJaBRA GUARD
BRAND PRODUCT NjUMBER 273279 10172716 10186293
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION 1S FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

i
APPROVED BY: Isi 2 E 6

DATE:_03/07/12
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- CITY OF EL PASO ‘ El Paso

\ ¥
| BID TABULATION FORM lzml
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
| ' NCH CORPORATION - STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED %%iﬁggzg'gﬁgg’“' STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE,NM | LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ' PRODUCTS, LLC
’ - IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION ‘ UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK :
8A | (GaLLON) NIPBIL 424 N/A / N/A N/A N/A
8B (sszig&m MOBIL 424 $492.25 + TAX IF ANY $930.60 $930.60 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM
3 CERTIFIED LABORATORIES OIL CHEMSEARCH LUBRA
MANUFACTUR%R CHEVRON 1000 THF ALL PLUS SYSTEMS TH F
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 226606 10070636 10189989
BULK |
9A | (GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL N/A N/A N/A N/A
DRUM
9B | (55 aALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL $669.90 + TAX IF ANY $981.20 $981.20 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM DRUM
- CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER CERTIFIED LABORATORIES
MANUFACTURI%R OlL 46 PYROTHERM CHEMSEARCH FT HTO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 231709 10188458 10193147
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE AC TOAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Is] é \: 6 » DATE:_03/07/12

11
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-frtericaCity

v

2010

Project Name: Motor Qil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services
| NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED "éﬂéﬁggggﬁgﬁ,” STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE,NM | LABORATORIES DIV. RVING. TX PRODUCTS, LLC
- IRVING, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK | POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE
10A | (GALLON)' J20C-D) | N/A N/A N/A N/A
1
DRUM | POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE
108 | oo 1200.D) NO BID $930.60 $930.60 NO BID
| DRUM DRUM
. CERTIFIED LABORATORIES OIL CHEMSEARCH LUBRA
MANUFACTURER ALL PLUS SYSTEMS TH F
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 10070636 10189989
1A | Buk N/A N/A N/A N/A
(ALLON) | RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE |
MB | 55 anrton) | RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
THE INFORMATION GONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS F

APPROVED BY: __js/ ) V>

DATE:_03/07/12

OR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARDIEXECUTION OF CONTRACT.
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CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

X !
| BID TABULATION FORM "
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
‘ . NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED '}'ﬂﬁggig&:gﬁ,’" STEVENSON POWER
""" ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ) PRODUCTS, LLC
U6 L IRVING, TX ' EL PASO, TX
ITE UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
330 GL TOTE 330 GL TOTE
12A (Giftgm HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46 $7.29 + TAX IF ANY $13.60 $13.60 NO EID
: ? GALLON GALLON GALLON
12B (ssgﬁt’ﬁ"cm) HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46 $426.25 + TAX IF ANY $791.45 $791.45 NO BID
: DRUM DRUM DRUM
; CERTIFIED LABORATORIES CHEMSEARCH LUBRA GUARD
MANUFACTURE{R CHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL 46 HOC48 ISO-46
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 255674 10063996 / 10177153-330 10035453 / 10197155-330
MUST BE LISTED SEPARATELY ON ALL INVOICES
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE
1. BUYBACK WASTE MOTOR OIL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. BUYBACK USED OIL FILTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. BUYBACK USED jANTlFREEZE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATJON ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE AC TUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Isl 9/]/ [5 13

DATE:_03/07/12
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El Paso

- CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

All-kmesica ity

T

2010

APPROVED BY:___js| IV,

DATE:_03/07/12

Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
‘ NCH CORPORATION STEWART &
BREWER OIL CO. CERTIFIED '\éﬁi'éfnggiggﬂﬁf STEVENSON POWER
ALBUQUERQUE, NM LABORATORIES DIV. IRVING. TX ' PRODUCTS, LLC
IRVING, TX ! EL PASO, TX
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM dF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
~ |BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR: ‘
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SA?ME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO!THE EXPIRATION OF
THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRA;CT:
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SjAME UNIT PRICE(S), X I X
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED [ ] L]
PAYMENT TERMS: ; NET - 30 DAYS % - 30 DAYS % - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROGUREMSNT ves X/ No[ | | ves[x] no[ | | ves NO [ 1 ] ves[x] no[ |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY . . .
PURSUANT TO THE ABOVE REQUIREMENT% IN THE REQUIRED
DELIVERY SECTION, BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS: 2 DAYS 5-7DAYS 5-7 DAYS 14 DAYS
WITHIN CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS
3 / 2 DAYS - ALL HAZARDOUS 2 DAYS - ALL HAZARDOUS
» | INCLUDING ORMA & LIMITED || INCLUDING ORMA & LIMITED
WITHIN HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF 24 HOURS QUANTITY NOT ALLOWED TO | QUANTITY NOT ALLOWED TO 24 HOURS
VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY GO AIR WITHOUT APPROVAL || GO AIR WITHOUT APPROVAL
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
ADELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Bid Opening Date: February 15, %2012

Department: General Services

Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids
| TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
| .
THSE(I:QCI)VITC')rgExgsS, I:gc TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
' EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
‘ UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1A (Gifl':gm ANTIFREEZE YELLOW $5.00 NO BID $8.23
GALLON GALLON
DRUM 3
1B ANTIFREEZE YELLOW $297.00 NO BID $499.40
(55 GALLON) 1 DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER THERMO FLUIDS OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES
. FULL FORCE LONGLIFE
. BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ECO-SHIELD CONCENTRATE
2A (G?\EII:SN) ANTIFREEZE RED $5.50 NO BID $15.00
a GALLON GALLON
DRUM
2B ANTIFREEZE RED $324.50 NO BID $871.75
(55 GALLON) ! DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER THERMO FLUIDS OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES
i FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL
BRAND PRODUCT NPMBER ECO-SHIELD CONCENTRATE
BULK ANTRIFREEZE RED /
3A : $5.50 NO BID $15.00
(GALLON) EXTENDED LIFE GALLON GALLON
DRUM ANTRIFREEZE RED /
3B $324.50 NO BID $871.75
(55 GALLON) EXTENDED LIFE DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER THERMO FLUIDS OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES
i FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ECO-SHIELD CONCENTRATE
WARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:

Isl ‘2«)6

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL A

DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO Elraso

An-fmiericaCily
X f
BID TABULATION FORM i)
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids Department: General Services
| ' TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THggnggglﬁz:?Esgc. TRANSPORTATION, INC.|  WHOLESALE, INC.
? EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
‘ BULK ' :
4A ANTIFREEZE BLUE $4.75 NO BID NO BID
(GALLON) | GALLON
DRUM i
4B | iAo ANTIFREEZE BLUE $283.25 NO BID NO BID
| DRUM
MANUFACTURER THERMO FLUIDS
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ECO-SHIELD
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
1A MOTOR OIL CJ4 NO BID $7.64 $8.78
(GALLON) GALLON GALLON
DRUM
1B MOTOR OIL CJ4 NO BID $440.00 $521.95
(55 GALLON) : DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL FLEET
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661455008097 15W40 CJ4
BULK MOTOR OIL 15W40
2A \ NO BID $9.68 $12.91
(GALLON) LOW ASH GALLON GALLON
2B | (SS%T\EIT)N) MOTSSVS g‘sﬁw‘m - NO BID $549.45 $750.20
; " DRUM ~ - DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO CITGARD NATURAL GAS MOBIL GEO 15W40
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 632015001097

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:___1si IV €> DATE:_03/07112 - 16

T T T T




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-umesica Clly

i

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 16, 2012 ,
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifregze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051
Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSECISOMT?'QSK:?ES,AI‘?C. TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
...... ! EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRIGE UNIT PRICE
BULK :
3A | GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W N/A N/A N/A
DRUM 3
3B MOTOR OIL SAE 10W NO BID $399.30 $664.95
(55 GALLON) | DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL HYDRAULIC 10w
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661450008097
BULK
4 | GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 30W N/A NIA N/A
DRUM
4B MOTOR OIL SAE 30W NO BID $409.75 $650.65
(55 GALLON) | DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL DELVAC 1230
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661453008010
BULK :
5A | (GaLLON) MOTOI?{ OIL SAE 5W20 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM 5
5B MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20 NO BID $409.75 $545.05
(55 GALLON) DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL SPECIAL 5W20
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER . 661402008097
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION 1S FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES

APPROVED BY: Isl 2/\) 6

—

DATE:_03/07/12

NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.
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CITY OF EL PASO i Paso

\ !
‘ BID TABULATION FORM i
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antlfrgeze Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
| ‘ TIGUA WESTERN REFINING |
THSE(? gIT(%gEK:?ESﬂC. TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK f
6A (GALLON) MOTORj OIL SAE 5W30 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM |
6B MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30 NO BID $409.75 $542.85
(55 GALLON) ; DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL SPECIAL 5W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661405008097
BULK 3 : '
7A (GALLON) MOTORj OIL SAE 10W30 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM 3 ‘
7B MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30 NO BID $409.75 $535.15
(55 GALLON) | DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL SPECIAL 10W30 _
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661413008097
BULK | ,
8A (GALLON) ATF: DEXRON il N/A N/A N/A
DRUM 3
8B ATF DEXRON I NO BID $399.30 $565.40
(55 GALLON) DRUM , DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL ATF D/M
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661433008097

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

18

APPROVED BY: Ist 2 d £> DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO Bty

Al-tunenica City

BID TABULATION FORM . Wy

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051
Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSECRONIT?_?.SK:{)ES,IQC. TRANSPORTATION, INC.|] WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASOQ, TX
s BRI
TION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRIGE UNIT PRICE
BULK TRANSMISSION FLUID
9 | (GaLLON) WMERGON V N/A N/A N/A
DRUM TRANSMISSION FLUID
9B | 55 marton MERGON V NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER SUB MOBIL MULTI VEHICLE
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ATF
10A (Gi‘L’th) TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 N/A NIA N/A
108 | . Saton | TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 NO BID $797.50 NO BID
i DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO TRANSGARD ATV
BRAND PRODUGT NUMBER : 633179001001 SUB MOBIL. ATF+4
1A | GaLLoN) MERCON LV NI/A N/A N/A
MB | oo MERCON LV = NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER MOTOR CRAFT DEALER
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER PRODUCT

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXEGUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Ist 2/\) & DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Afl-Arierica Cily

T

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, ‘2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
‘ TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSE(F:Q (I;nTc')l'glISK:?ES’AIgC. TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
? EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM UNIT mI‘:“)‘VESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK ?
12A (GALLON) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR N/A N/A N/A
12B | iion | HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR NO BID $415.80 $596.20
DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER TF MOBIL FLUID 424
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661435008097
BULK |
13A | GaLLon) UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 N/A N/A N/A
13B (55'33‘}\‘:,'_“:)") UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 " NOBID $678.00 $664.00
’ DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER ¢ireot R o NP B5-1 yOBILUBE PLUS 85-W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 631320001027
BULK ‘
14A | GaLlon) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM |
14B SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50 NO BID $1,600.50 $1,451.25
(55 GALLON) DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO SYNTH. GEAR 50 MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 631815001001 TRANSMISSION FLUID 50

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:

Isl ’2\’} B

—_—

DATE:_03/07/12

20




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Pasco

All-lAnterica City.

\iiilf

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 ‘
Project Name: Nlotor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSE(?OMT?.?ISX:_I-)ES’AI;C' TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
15A | Garron) | SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM :
15B SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 NO BID $1,755.00 $1,290.00
(55 GALLON) ‘ DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO SYNTHETIC 75-140 MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 632497001027 GEAR OIL 80W-140
BULK MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE,
16A | (GALLON) |NLGI GRADE-2 BASED GREASE NIA N/A N/A
DRUM | MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE
16B ’ NO BID $935.60 $1,051.52
(55 GALLON) | NLGI GRADE-2 BASED GREASE DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO CM LYTHOPLEX MOBILGREASE XHP222 SPECIAL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 655352001015
5
BULK ‘
A |6 ALLON) TRANSYND OIL N/A N/A N/A
1B (552;3&:4) TRANSYND OIL NO BID $1,420.00 $1,672.00
: DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO QUATRASYND MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 632493001001 ATF
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARDIEXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:

Isl Wé’

—

DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

¥ i"ﬁ’i‘ T

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: MNotor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSEgg'TC%;K&S’ Agc' TRANSPORTATION, INC.|  WHOLESALE, INC.
! EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC
22 | GALLoN) BLEND AT N/A N/A N/A
DRUM | MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC
28 | ssanion BLEND ATF NO BID NO BID $g§sl}5“:
MANUFACTURER
BRAND PRODUGT NUMBER MOBIL MULTI-VEHICLE ATF
BULK ‘
3A | GALLoN) ATF+4 N/A N/A N/A
DRUM
3B ATF+4 NO BID $797.50 $761.75
(55 GALLON) | DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO TRANSGARD
BRAND PRODUGT NUMBER 633179001001 MOBIL ATF+4

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Is! 9/\)& ‘

DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO bxocd

T
BID TABULATION FORM |
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
ERMO FLUID .
THS(?OT?'SD?\LES, Algc TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
? EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
v At 3
ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
1A (GALLON) MERCON V N/A N/A N/A
DRUM
4B (55 GALLON) MERCON V NO BID NO BID/ NO BID
MANUFACTURER SUB MOBIL MULTI
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER VEHICLE ATF
BULK
5A (GALLON) DEXRON Vi N/A N/A N/A
DRUM - ‘ ! |
5B DEXRON VI NO BID NO BID $756.80
(55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ¢ .
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DEXRON VI ATF
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Isl 9/\} b

— IS7 &7 DATE:_03/07/12 23




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ﬁﬁ?

BID TABULATION FORM
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil &_ Fluids Department: General Services
L TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
FLUID )
THgggnTgssgLEsxgc TRANSPORTATION, INC.|  WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | UNIT | DESCRIPTION UNIT PRIGE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK | HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO
6A | GaLLON) VG 100 N/A | N/A N/A
DRUM | HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO
6B | 55 eniton) VG 100 NO BID NO BID $830.50
DRUM
MANUFACTURER MOBIL DTEIDEXCEI
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SERIES 100
7A (GiEIEgN) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26 N/A N/A N/A

7B | sseniron | HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26 NO BID $492.80 $621.50
‘ DRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER CITGO AW68 IS0 68 MOBIL DTE 26

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 633430001001

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:  Js/ 2«)& DATE:_03/07/12 : 24




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
ety

Cliy

T

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051
Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THSE(I;(I;HT?;:SX:_DES’/:;C' TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
! EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
UNIT A UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK
8A (GALLON) MOBIL 424 N/A N/A NIA
DRUM
8B MOBIL 424 NO BID $632.50 $596.20
(55 GALLON) ‘ DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO TRANSGUARD THC MOBIL FLUID 424
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 633311001001
BULK
9A (GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL N/A N/A N/A
DRUM
9B HEAT TRANSFER OIL NO BID $616.00 $667.70
(55 GALLON) DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO HYTHERM 46 MOBILTHERM 43
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 635023001001
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:

w VP

—_—

DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO brerey

All-RresicaCliy

i f
BID TABULATION FORM | "
Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 . Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
HERMO FLUIDS, INC.
T sC OTTSIIS ALE ! AZC TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM u UN]T DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE
10A (GALLON) J20C-D) N/A N/A N/A
DRUM POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE
10B NO BID $632.50 NO BID
(55 GALLON) J20C-D) DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO TRANSGARD THF SUB MOBILFLUID 424
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 633311001001
BULK
11A (GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE NI/A N/A N/A
DRUM :
11B (55 GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE NO BID $616.00 NO BID
DRUM _
MANUFACTURER CITGO CP HYDRAULIC FLUID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 633933001001

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY; Isf ‘9’\} 6

DATE:_03/07/12 26




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-AmesicaClly

T

2010

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012
Project Name: Nlotor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Qil & Fluids

Solicitation #: 2012-051

Department: General Services

TIGUA WESTERN REFINING
THgggﬁ;lﬁzﬂsﬂc' TRANSPORTATION, INC.| WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
12A (Giftgn) HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46 NO BID $6.20 NOT STATED
GALLON GALLON
DRUM
12B HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46 NO BID $360.80 $576.95
(55 GALLON) DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER CITGO MILEMASTER AWA46 MOBIL NIETO46
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 661446008097
SED 6] L
MUST BE LISTED SEPAR
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE
1. BUYBACK WASTE MOTOR OIL $1.05/ PER GALLON NO BID NO BID
2, BUYBACK USED OIL FILTERS $0.00 / PER DRUM NO BID NO BID
3, BUYBACK USED ANTIFREEZE $0.00 / PER DRUM NO BID NO BID

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATJON ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Is] (91/ &

DATE:_03/07/12
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CITY OF EL PASO Exso

All-Rmtexica City

BID TABULATION FORM W

Bid Opening Date: February 15, 2012 ' Solicitation #: 2012-051
Project Name: Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluids Department: General Services
TIGUA : WESTERN REFINING
THSECR(I;AT?.QSK:?ES’ Agc' TRANSPORTATION, INC. WHOLESALE, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF X
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF
THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), X ' X X
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED l:’ l:l I:I I:l

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROGUREIIENT Ca ves | | Nno YEs | | no ves [ | No YES D No ] '
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY ' e =
DELIVERY SECTION, BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS: NOT STATED 2 DAYS
_|VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY NOT STATED 4 HOURS 48 HOURS
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. :
ADELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: __ 40 BIDS RECEIVED: 7 _ BIDS CONTAGTED-LOCAL: 32 NOBIDS: 0
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTOAL AWARDIEXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY: Is] 2(} /3>

DATE:_03/07/12 28
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BIG BEAR OIL COMPANY INC
1025 WALL
EL PASO, TX 79915

CANYON STATE OIL CO INC
10925 MARCONI LN
EL PASO, TX 79935

DESERT WEST OIL RECOVERY
1013 WALL RD
EL PASO, TX 79915

JAY F STEWART OIL CO INC
26 BUTTERFIELD TRAIL BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79906

METRO MOBILE LUBE
3613 BUXTON DR
EL PASO, TX 79928

PHOENIX FUEL COMPANY
4585 RIPLEY DR
EL PASO, TX 79822

RAPID ENVIORMENTAL LLC
3505 LEE BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79936

TRANSAMERICA LUBRICANTS INC
113956 JAMES WATT DR
EL PASO, TX 79936

CHEVRON USA INC
PO BOX 20002

BREWER OIL CO
P.O. BOX 1347
ARTESIA, NM 88211

CHEVRON GLOBAL LUBRICANTS
4157 RIO BRAVO DR
EL PASO, TX 79902

FABENS OIL COMPANY
P.0. BOX 577
FABENS, TX 79836

LUBE N GO
6400 AIRPORT DR
EL PASO, TX 79925

NUNN PETROLEUM WASTE MGMT
400 VALLEY CHILE RD
ANTHONY, TX 79821

PINNACLE SOLUTIONS
2105 ROBERT WYNN ST
EL PASO, TX 79936

SAM'S CLUB #5602
7001 GATEWAY BLVD WEST
EL PASO TX 78925

VINTAGE EXPRESS LUBE
8857 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79925

TRANSMOUNTAIN OIL COMPANY
6767 GATEWAY WEST BLVD

Favpann ) srusises s

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC
8528 ALAMEDA AVE
EL PASO, TX 79907

D-A LUBRICANT COMPANY, INC
1340 WEST 29™ STREET
INDIANAPOLIS, IN 46208

IBT INC
6915 INDUSTRIAL AVE

EL PASO, TX 79915

MASTER LUBE
3010 TRAWOOD
EL PASO, TX 79936

PEP BOYS AUTO
7465 N. MESA ST
EL PASO, TX 79912

PRONTOLUBE
5862 CROMO DR
EL PASO, TX 79912

THERMACYCLE
15721 MONTANA AVE
EL PASO, TX 79938

WESTERN REFINING CO
6501 TROWBRIDGE AVE
EL PASO, TX 79905

HENRY MENDOZA SALES CO
SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
PO.BOX.221783

EL'PASO TX 79998

ELPASO TX 79925

EL PASO TX 79913

2012-051 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oil & Fluids — PAGE 1
Previous Bids: 2008-078; 2008-136; 2009-054 & 2009-235




CARQUEST AUTO PARTS
11220 ROJAS DR SUITE C-7
EL PASO TX 79935

EQUILON ENTERPRISES LLC
4157 RIO BRAVO ST
EL PASO TX 79902

GORMAN INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
1701 TEXAS AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79901

HILLGER OIL CO
801 W OREGON PO BOX 1989
LAS CRUCES NM 88004

A

\

SOUTHWEST ENERGY DIST INC
FORMERLY WOOD OIL DISTRIBUTING
PO BOX 711

ODESSA TX 79760

C L NORTH INDUSTRIAL SALES
5355 EL PASO DR
EL PASO, TX 79905

SHELL
4157 RIO BRAVO ST
EL PASO, TX 79912

MESA OIL INC
7239 BRADBURN ST
WESTMINSTER CO 80030

J

1

Lavpaas by avasiiees e

ACME SERVICES INC
GOVERNMENT CONTRACT
5246 TRANSPORTATION BLVD
GARFIELD HEIGHTS OH 44125

H I TINDUSTRIES
P O BOX 3550
EL PASO, TX 79923

WESCO DISTRIBUTION
6510A GATEWAY EAST BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79905

TIGUA ENTERPRISES
1025 WALL STREET
EL PASO, TX 78915

2012-051 Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Oil & Fluids — PAGE 2
Previous Bids: 2008-078; 2008-136; 2009-054 & 2009-235






