CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services

AGENDA DATE: May 14, 2013

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:  Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director, 621-6822
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
Solicitation No. 2013-151, Wheel and Axle Alignment and Steering & Suspension Parts and Services

Discussion and action that the Purchasing Manager, Financial Services, Purchasing Division, be
authorized to issue a Purchase Order to Stanley Springs and Suspension, El Paso, Texas effective the date
of the award. The estimated annual expenditures are $349,000.00 ($211,000.00 Parts, $138,000.00

Service) with an estimated total expenditure of $1,047,000.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
The General Services - Fleet Division is recommending the award of the above bid. Stanley Spring and

Suspension was the lowest responsive, respons1ble bidder. The city currently owns a fleet of over 2,000
light and heavy vehicles that will require wheel alignments and/or suspension parts and service.. The

approval of this contract would allow for the continual maintenance and upkeep of these vehicles. This

allows for consistent, safe and efficient operation of these vehicles while maintaining ‘maximum
- reliability. Local busmess is bemg supported. :

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: .
Yes. Council previously approved contract 2010-135 on July 13, 2010, Item 8A.

SELECTION SUMMARY:
This solicitation was advertised on February 26, 2013, and opened on April 3, 2013.bid no’uﬁoatlon postcards

were mailed out, the solicitation was posted on the City’s website and the email (Purmail) notification was sent
out. A total of twenty three (23) bidders were sohcited All (23) bldders were local A total of (3) bidders

responded.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: .

Department: General Services Department

Amount $1,047,000.00

Funds Available: . Dept: 231 Div: 37020 Acct: 53 1210 Fund 3600 Program: P3711

Dept: 231 Div: 37020 Acct: 531250 Fund: 3600 Program: P3701
General Sves Internal Sve Fund — Inventory Purchases — Materials and Supplies

Funds Source:
' General Sves Internal Sve Fund — Equipment Outside Repair Services

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

ION********************

********************AUTHORIZ

DEPARTMENT HEAD: % '

Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM

(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

*****************************************POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of May 14, 2013.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2013-151 (Wheel & Axle Alignment, Steering &
Suspension Parts and Service) to Stanley Spring & Suspension for an initial term award of $1,047,000.00.

Department:
Award to Vendor:

ltem(s):

Estimated 1 Year Award:

Option to Extend:

Total Initial Term Estimated Award:
Option Amount:

Total Estimated Award:

Account No.:

Funding Source:

District(s):

General Services — Fleet Division
Stanley Spring & Suspension

El Paso, Texas

Group | & 11,

$349,000.00

2 Years

$ 1,047,000.00 (3 Years)

$ 698,000.00 (2 Years)

$ 1,745,000.00 (5 Years)
231-37010-580540-4960
General Services Department — Cars, Pickups, Vans
All

This is a Best Value, unit price contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Services — Fieet Division recommend award as
indicated to Stanley Spring & Suspension, the sole responsive, responsible bidder. It is also recommended
that Dalton Brake & Wheel be deemed non-responsive for bidding services only and not parts as required
by the bid and Truck Enterprises, Inc. be deemed non-responsible for not providing a Price Adjustment

Factor(s) and Type of Price List(s) as required by the bid.

***************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW*****************-k************'k**************’k




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*******************************************
Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of May 14, 2013.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2013-151 (Wheel & Axle Alignment, Steering &
Suspension Parts and Service) to Stanley Spring & Suspension for an initial term award of $1,047,000.00.

Department: General Services — Fleet Division
Award to Vendor: : Stanley Spring & Suspension
' El Paso, Texas
ltem(s): Group | &1,
Estimated 1 Year Award: $349,000.00
Option to Extend: 2 Years
Payment Terms: Net 30 days |
\ __Jotal Initial Term Estimated Award: $ 1,047,000.00 (3 Years)
Total Estimated Award: . $ 1,745,000.00 (5 Years)
Account No.: 231-37010-580540-4960
Funding Source: General Services Department — Cars, Pickups, Vans
District(s): All '

This is a Best Value, unit price contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Services — Fleet Division recommend award as
indicated to Stanley Spring & Suspension, the sole responsive, responsible bidder. It is also recommended
that Dalton Brake & Wheel be deemed non-responsive for bidding services only and not parts as required
by the bid and Truck Enterprises, Inc. be deemed non-responsible for not providing a Price Adjustment
Factor(s) for establishing a basis for parts pricing as required by the bid.

***************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW******************’****************************




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

29010

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE
BlD DATE: APRlL 03, 2013

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

BID # 2013-151

STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE | DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION INC, WHEEL
GROUP I: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNVIENT SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
DESCRIPTION COST PER SERVICE COST PER SERVICE COST PER SERVICE COST PER SERVICE
'T'f"" AUTOMOTIVE VEHICLES ~$40.00 N/A $45.00 $0.00
. Front Alignment only
W/ Rear alig. $20 more
'TE"" HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS $80.00 $79.00 NO BID $0.00
. PER HOUR .
SUBTOTAL - GROUP 1 $120.00 NO BID $65.00 $0.00

Cars w/ front & rear alignment

PART A: PARTS - PRICE LIST PRICING

DESCRIPTION

GROUP II: STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS lNSTALLATlON SERVICE AND PRICING

NET L] - NET NET L] NET
ITEM STEERING PARTS OR OR OR OR
1. (To be used in conjunction with ____ % DISCOUNT [[] —_ %DISCOUNT [] —_%DISCOUNT [] —_ % DISCOUNT
Group II: Installation Service) OR OR OR OR
30 % MARK-UP L] _  %mark-up L] _  %markup L] _  o%maArkuP
(note Manufacturer :rrgreat:tl\l(;:nc:t:éofpplicable) FLAGG —DAYTON
TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER L] ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L[] [] [ ]
JOBBER L] L] [ ] [ ]
DEALER L] L]
RETAILER | ) L L ]
OTHER / [ omher . [ ] omuer [ | omHer [ | other

NOTE: This is a Best ¥alue Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NOTE: The information é

APPROVED BY: 4
DATE: cf(: 1/ 2013

ntained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO PR
2010 )
BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE BID # 2013-151
BID DATE: APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
F SUSPENSION INC. WHEEL
EL PASO, TX _ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il: STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING '
DESCRIPTION
STEERING PARTS [ NET [ NET NET [ NET
ITEM (To be used in conjunction with o o 0 9 .
iy Group Il: Installation Service) Q % DISCOUNT (L:R] % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT 0 — % DISCOUNT
ALTERNATE
( ) 30 % MARK-UP ] % MARK-UP % MARK-UP L] % MARK-UP
Price List or Catalog '
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) FLAGE —DAYTON
List Number TSS-0413D NO BID
Dated —04/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER [] [ ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L] [ | [ ]
JOBBER L] [ ] [] [ ]
DEALER 1 N n ==
RETAILER [ ] [ ] A [ ] [ ]
OTHER [ ] omher [ ] otHer OTHER [_] otHer
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. ‘

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulaticn is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

- -



CITY OF EL PASO

‘BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

xgiggr

2010

PRIL 03, 2013

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE:

BID # 2013-151
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION INC. WHEEL
- - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP II: STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING
DESCRIPTION . . '
NET NET NET ’ NET
ITEM SUSPENSION PARTS Q Q g;] Q
1 (To be used in conjunction with D % DISCOUNT D ____ % DISCOUNT R _____ % DISCOUNT D ____ % DISCOUNT
; Group II: Installation Service) OR OR OR ’ OR
30 % MARK-UP ] %MARK-UP | [ ] % MARK-UP J % MARK-UP
Price List or Catalog :
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) FLAGG —DAYTON
List Number _TSS-0413D NO BID
Dated —04/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] [ ] L] [ ]
DISTRIBUTOR L1 [ | [ |
JOBBER L] [ ] [ [ |
DEALER [ ] N ] [
RETAILER L] [ ] [ ] L]
OTHER [ | other [ ] omer L1 omher [ | omher
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: .
2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND S
paTE: 7, ol %

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

ERVICE -




CITY OF EL PASO - ELEees

] Ali-imerica City
‘ 2010
BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNNIENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE BID # 2013-151
BID DATE: APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION INC. WHEEL
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il: STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING
DESCRIPTION \
SUSPENSION PARTS Q NET oF NET OF NET Q NET
n‘gfm (Ts‘::jp“:_e‘I’r:;‘t;;:t‘i‘;:°§;’\'ﬁ‘g’;h O % DISCOUNT ] % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT m % DISCOUNT
(ALTERNATE) OR OR OR OR
X]  sowmarckur | [] % MARK-UP ] % MARK-UP ] % MARK-UP
Price List or Catalog
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) —fLASG —DAYTON
List Number__. | TSS:0413D S NO BID
Dated 04/2013 )
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] [ ] [ ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L]- [ ] ] ]
JOBBER L] [ ] [ ] [ ]
DEALER [ ] ] [ ] [ ]
RETAILER [ ] [ ] ]
OTHER [ otHer L] omher [ other L] omHerR
PART B: STEERING & SUSPENSION SERVICE LABOR RATES
DESCRIPTION : . =
$45.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $45.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle
ITEM . Regular Hour Rates N/A Regular Hour Rates . Regular Hour Rates
1. AUTOMOTIVE VEHICLES $45.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle
Holiday Hour Rates N/A Holiday Hour Rates Holiday Hour Rates

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for infomation only and does not constitute actual award/executiori of contract.

APPROVED BY:
A : ) 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -
pate: T /[ 7/203

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID DATE: APRIL 03, 2013

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS A

ND SERVICE

BID # 2013-151

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

STANLEY SPRING &
SUSPENSION
EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE

PART B: STEERING & SUSPENSION SERVICE L ABOR RATES

DESCRIPTION

ITEM

1. HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

$45.00 per vehicle
Regular Hour Rates

INC.
EL PASO, TX

$79.00 per vehicle
Regular Hour Rates

$0.00 per vehicle
Regular Hour Rates

DALTON BRAKE &
WHEEL
EL PASO, TX

$0.00 per vehicle
Regular Hour Rates

$45.00 per vehicle
Holiday Hour Rates

$79.00 per vehicle
Holiday Hour Rates

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

$0.00 per vehicle
Holiday Hour Rates

$0.00 per vehicle
Holiday Hour Rates

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: J E736-55 338-1218 DAYTON
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $47.36 $109.53 $
IT% CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) 61.57 $571.85 NO BID $
(Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)LABOR GOST Tﬁgl? |:§0)l(' :a1tt132 Trufk—‘[::.b%rate s Truck labor rate
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) | $129.07 $79.00 PER HOUR $
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

[NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

pate: 7, [ 7/20 3

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

%ﬂgx‘neﬂm ety

2010

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: APRIL 03,2013

BID # 2013-151

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION : INC. WHEEL
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

NG

s

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: FKP99-C 300-265 DAYTON
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $ 266.58 $ 53592 $
ITEM lCITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $ 346.55 $ 28307 NO BID $
2.
$ 4500 HRx 8.HR $ 79.00 $
(Assume one (1) hour labor from PART BJLABOR COST Truck labor rate Truck labor rate Truck labor rate
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $ 70655 -
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER
- —
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: B1408-46 327-487 DAYTON
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) '$_13.19 $ 28.11 $
ITEM |CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $ 1715 8.83 NO BID $
3. .
o, $ 4500x11HR $ 79.00 $
(Assume one (1) hour labor frem PART BJLABOR COST Truck labor rate Truck labor rate Truck labor rate
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $_66.65 $ 79.00 PER HOUR $
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE:

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ¢ /203

The information contained in this bid tabulation i

s for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVIGE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

El Paso

Al-Rmerica Clty

-

2010

BID DATE: APRIL 03, 2013

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

0

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

ITEM

$ 8042

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMRER

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

ES3030R

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: E693-55 330-157 DAYTON
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $ 16.86 $ 39.11
crmy's COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $ 2192 $ 20.66

$_45.00x1.3. $ 79.99
(Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)LABOR COST Truck labor rate Truck labor rate
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST)

BID # 2013-151
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION INC. WHEEL
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

NO BID

Truck labor rate

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $14549 $346.18 $

ITEM CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $188.75 $182.85 NO BID $
(Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)LABOR COST T%e Trucs;l:% rate $ Truck labor rate

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $ 24125 $79.00 $

SUBTOTAL COST - GROUP 1I $ 1229.94 BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID $

SUBTOTAL COST - GROUP | $120.00 BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID $

TOTAL EXTENDED COST - GROUPS 1 & I $1,349.94 BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID $

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE

D BY: ’
D.L\‘ns:[///l9 7/20/ 2

—

3

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

El F;so

Al-imericaClty

BID DATE: APRIL 03, 2013

2010
BID # 2013-151

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
STANLEY SPRING & | TRUCK ENTERPRISE DALTON BRAKE &
SUSPENSION INC. WHEEL
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACTOR FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRAGT.
NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

IF THE

), IFTHE .

L]

L]

[]

[]
L]

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

NET - 30 DAYS

3% - 10 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER AGREES TO EXPECTED PERFORMANCE

ves[ x| wno[ |

ves[X] no[ ]

ves|_ | no[X] ves[_| wno[ ]

(TURN-AROUND) TIME AS LISTED ABOVE

YES NOD

YES NOD

ves[ x| No

YES

no[ |

IF A BIDDER SPECIFIES A LONGER RESPONSE TIME THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED RESPONS
BIDS RECEIVED: 3

BIDS SOLICITED: 23

E TIME, THE CITY'S RESPONSE TIME SHALL PREVAIL OR THIS MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS LOCAL: 3

NOBID: 1

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evalu

APPROVED BY: £
DATE: (/(j 7;0.)0/3

ated to determine an awardee.

2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

BID NO.: 2013 - 151
BID TITLE: Wheel & Axle Alignment, Steering & Suspension Parts & Service
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT
STANLEY SPRING AND
SUSPENSION
EL PASO, TX
Cost $1,047,000.00
(# points/percent max) 60 65.00
Reputation & Quality of the 5.00
Bidder's Services
(# points/percent max) 15
Employee Medical Benefits
and Incentives
, 10 2.00
Bidder's Operational
Information
Local Maintenance and
Service Facility 10 | 10.00
Past Performance
5.00
(# points/percent max) 5
GRAND TOTAL 100 : 87.00
(100 points/percent max)
Cost based on comparable

items




INDUSTRIAL BRAKE & FASTNER
11179 ROJAS DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79935

DALTON BRAKE & WHEEL
ALIGNMENT SPECIALISTS
610 E. WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79902

EL PASO TIRE CENTER
6656 GATEWAY EAST
EL PASO, TX 79915

FIRESTONE TIRE & SERVICE
5000 MONTANA
EL PAO, TX 79903

U.JOINTS INC.
11213 ROJAS DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79935

MAGIC MUFFLERS & BRAKE CENTER
8701 DYDER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79904

BORDER INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
12283 ROJAS DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79936

HUGULEY ALIGNMENT & BRAKE
SERVICE

4405 HERCULES

EL PASO, TX 79904
Undeliverable/Unable to forward

WESTERN FLEET SERVICE, INC.
3800 SHELL STREET
EL PASO, TX 79925

YEARWOOD TIRE CENTER
5401 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79904

TOP’S TIRE & WHEELS
1100 TX AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

MARTIN TIRE CO.
9425 MONTANA
EL PASO, TX 79925

WICKER TIRE CO.
701 W. PAISANO
EL PASO, TX 79901

MAGIC MUFFLERS -

TOMAS OR HENRY GUTIERREZ
8701 DYER

EL PASO, TX 79904

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
13675 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79926

BASSETT TIRE & SERVICE

6201 EDGEMERE BLVD.

EL PASO, TX 79925

Refurn to Sender/Unable to Forward

WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

PEP BOYS AUTOMOTIVE
1910 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

ADVANCE AUTO

JOHNNY HINOJOS, GEN. MGR
7676 ALAMEDA

EL PASO, TX 79915

DISCOUNT TIRE CO OF TX,

INC.

112010 GATEWAY WEST SUITE A
EL PASO, TX 79836

INDUSTRIAL BRAKE
ATTN: SAM GUIDO

11179 ROJAS DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79935

STANLEY SPRING & SUSPENSION
8800 CASTNER DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79907

RUSH TRUCK CENTER
12253 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
10901 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79935




