CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: _STREETS

AGENDA DATE: May 19, 2009

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director (621-6750)
Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, (541-4313)

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
SUBJECT:
Bid 2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Recommend that the contract be awarded to Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc.,
DBA Republic ITS, as the lowest bidder and most responsive and responsible bidder

meeting specifications, for an estimated annual amount of $173,678.00. Total contract

award of $521,034. Contract is for a term of 36 months.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

N/A
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

32010288 (Traffic Signals), 503203 (Public Accesses Maint and Repairs), Fund 01101 (General Fund),
Class 32000 $208,413.60

99331117 (2006 CO’s), 508027 (Construction), Fund 27263 (2006 CO’s), Class 32000, Project PCP06ST013
(Signal/Flasher Installation) $312,620.40.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

LEGAL: (if required) FINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD: @/M

Cc: Jane Shang, Deputy City Manager Mobility Services
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM
DATE: May 5, 2009

PROJECT: Traffic Signal Heads
SOLICITATION NO: 2009-155 DEPARTMENT: Street
BUDGET NO: 32010288-503203-01101

99331117-508027-27263
FUNDING SOURCE: General Fund and 2006 CO’s
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc., dba Republic TS
' Grand Prairie, TX
ltem: All :
Amount:  $173,678.00 estimated annual expenditures

Street and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest responsive, responsible Bidder. -

| This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type'contract for Traffic Signal Heads. Vendor offers the City
the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit price for one (1) additional year if the option is
exercised prior to the expiration of the original term of the contract. No prompt payment discount is offered.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget. :

BIDS SOLICITED- 13 (2 local)
BIDS RECEIVED-
“NO BID” RECEIVED

_6
_0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:  $521,034.00
-Estimated Total 3 yr Expenditures

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services, Purch

cc: Bid File




Dedicated to Outstanding Customer Service for a Better Community

SERVICE SOLUTIONS SUCCESS

April 30, 2009
TO: Terrence Freiburg, Deputy Director Financial Services
ATTN: Leticia Rivera, Procurement Analyst

Vot

SUBJECT:  Bid No. 2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

FROM: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to
Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc. DBA Republic ITS, as the lowest
bidder and most responsive and responsible bidder meeting specifications, for an estimated
annual amount of $173,678.00, total contract award of $521,034.00. Contract is for a

term of 36 months.
If you have any questions please call me at 621-6750.

DWC/en

DEPARTMENT

Daryl W. Cole, Director

7968 SAN PAULO DRIVE e EL PASO. TEXAS 79907 e (915) 621-6750 e FaX (915) 621-6772

John F. Cook

City Council

District 1
Ann-Morgan Lilly

District 2
Susannah M. Byrd

District 3
Emma_ Acosta

District 4

Melina Castro

District 5:
Rachel Quintana

District 6

Eddie Holguin Jr.

- District 7
- Steve Ortega

District 8
Beto O’Rourke

City Manager
Joyce A. Wilson




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

B

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155

APPROVED BY: 2 @2;
DATE: %Z ’ "UI‘%/W

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT

DEPARTMENT: STREET
) CONSOLIDATED
AFPELBAUM TRAFFIC GENERAL TRAFFIC MCCAIN, ING.
INDUSTRIAL INC. CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. LEAGUE CITY, TX
EL PASO, TX ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM || ANN. EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. || QTY./UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1. | 180 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, $576.00 $103,680.00 $419.00 $75,420.00 $375.00 $67,500.00 $418.00 $75,240.00
EA TYPEE
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS PEEK : GTE CORP. MCCAIN, INC.
MODEL SG203A2CTXC1Y30 HSC83B003FO LEOTEK || T30-ALUM-N-N-RYG-N-T-Y-Y-Y-HPBA M66275-TX
2. 120 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEADS $472.80 $56,736.00 $338.00 $40,560.00 $375.00 $45,000.00 $349.00 $41,880.00
EA :
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS PEEK GTE CORP. MCCAIN, INC.
MODEL SG7SZ20C1YFF 4302AFY,02,01,01 LEOTEK| P7-H/M-LEDCD-SOPEP M32029/M50062/M50122
3. 50 LED MODULE CIRCULAR RED $59.00 $2,950.00 $44.00 $2,200.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $47.00 $2,350.00
EA ' (BIDDER'S EXT. PRICE: $2,955.00) .
. {MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK ‘NONE STATED SWARCO
MODEL DR6-RTFB-17A TSL-12R-LX-IL3-A1 NONE STATED FL-12R-S2
4. 100 LED MODULE CIRCULAR AMBER $115.20 $11,520.00 $76.00 $7,600.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $74.00 $7,400.00
EA . . | _
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED SWARCO
MODEL DR6-YTFB-17YX TSL-12Y-LX-IL.3-A1C NONE STATED FL-12Y-82
5. 50 LED MODULE CIRCULAR GREEN $92.00 $4,600.00 $69.00 $3,450.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $6.3.00' $3,150.00
EA '
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED SWARCO
MODEL DRG-GCFB-17A TSL-12G-LX-ILA-A1 NONE STATED FL-12G-52
6. 60 LED MODULE AMBER ARROW $84.25 $5,055.00 $45.00 . $2,700.00 $45.00 $2,700.00 $74.00 $4,440.00
EA ' (BIDDER'S EXT. PRICE: $5,054.40) : .
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED SWARCO
MODEL DR6-YTAAN-17A-YX TSL-12YA-LD-A1 NONE STATED FL-12Y-S2-A




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155

DEPARTMENT: STREET
CONSOLIDATED
AFPELBAUM TRAFFIC GENERAL TRAFFIC MCGAIN, ING.
INDUSTRIAL INC. CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. LEAGUE CITY, TX
EL PASO, TX ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM || ANN. EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. [| QTY./JUOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE v PRICE
7. 60 LED MODULE GREEN ARROW $68.80 $4,128.00 $58.00 $3,480.00 $65.00 $3,900.00 $68.00 $4,080.00
EA
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED SWARCO
MODEL DR6-GCAAN-17A TSLA2YG-LD-A1 NONE STATED FL-12G-S2-A
8. 200 LED OPTICAL UNIT PEDESTRIAN $259.75. | $51,950.00 | $184.00 | $36,800.00 | $199.00 | $39,800.00 | $199.00 $39,800.00
EA SYMBOLIC COUNTDOWN (BIDDER'S EXT. PRICE: $59,950.00)
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED LEOTEK
MODEL PS7-CFF1-26A TSL-PED-16-CIL-9 NONE STATED TSL-PED-16-CIL-9
LED MODULE FOR ,
9. 72 PROGRANMMABLE VIEW $84.25 $6,066.00 $48.00 $3,456.00 $79.00 $5,688.00 $72.00 $5,184.00
EA SIGNAL RED
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED DIALIGHT
MODEL DR3-YCFB-01A TO5R-A-6100 NONE STATED DR3-RCFB-01A
LED MODULE FOR
10. | 72 PROGRAMMABLE VIEW $84.25 - | $6,066.00 $49.00 $3,528.00 $89.00 $6,408.00 $72.00 $5,184.00
EA SIGNAL AMBER '
MANUFACTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED DIALIGHT
MODEL DR3-YCFB-01A TO5Y-A-6100 “NONE STATED DR3-YCFB-01A
LED MODULE FOR
11. 72 PROGRAMMABLE VIEW $112.30 $8,085.60 $82.00 $5,904.00 $100.00 $7,200.00 $128.00 $9,216.00
EA SIGNAL GREEN ‘ :
MANUFAGTURER SIEMENS LEOTEK NONE STATED DIALIGHT
MODEL - DR3-GCFB-01A TO5G-A-CA01 NONE STATED DR3-GCFB-01A
GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1 -11): $260,836.60 $185,098.00 $189,446.00 $197,924.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

AFPELBAUM

INDUSTRIAL iNC.

EL PASO, TX

CONSOLIDATED
TRAFFIC

CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC
EQUIPMENT CORP.
NEWBURGH, NY

MCCAIN, INC.
LEAGUE CITY, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT. ‘

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRAGCT.

NGO OPTION OFFERED

]

]

]

(]

o

]

]

>

]

]

PAYMENT TERMS: 100% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD- YEs[X| wNo[ ] YES[X] No[ ] YES[X] No[ | YES[X] No[ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days. 25-30 30-60 . 60 30

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS

BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

REPUBLIC INTELLIGENT
PARADIGM TRAFFIC TRANSPORTATION SERVICES,
SYSTEMS, INC. INC., DBA REPUBLIC ITS
ARLINGTON, TX GRAND PRAIRIE, TX
ITEM )| ANN. EST. EXTENDED ] EXTENDED
NO. || QTY./UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1. 180 12" TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, $457.00 $82,260.00 $432.00 $77,760.00
EA TYPE E :
MANUFACTURER PELCO, ECONOLITE, DURALITE MCCAIN
MODEL NONE STATED #M66275
2. 120 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEADS $181.00 $21,720.00 $305.00 $36,600.00
EA
MANUFACTURER PEEK, PELCO MCCAIN
MODEL NONE STATED #M32029
3. 50 LED MODULE CIRCULAR RED $50.81 $2,540.50 $37.00 $1,850.00
EA
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED 433121003XL
4. 100 LED MODULE CIRCULAR AMBER $80.59 $8,059.00 $63.00 $6,300.00
EA v
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED £333230901XL
5. 50 LED MODULE CIRCULAR GREEN $75.00 $3,750.00 $66.00 $3,300.00
EA ' '
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED 4332220001XL
6. 60 LED MODULE AMBER ARROW- $59.00 $3,540.00 $53.00 $3,180.00
EA :
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED 4313334901XODTE

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155

PARADIGM TRAFFIC
SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

REPUBLIC INTELLIGENT
TRANSPORTATION SERVICES,
INC., DBA REPUBLIC ITS

DEPARTMENT: STREET}

GRAND PRAIRIE, TX
ITEM [[ ANN. EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. | QTY./JUOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE - "PRICE

7. 60 LED MODULE GREEN ARROW $63.79 $3,827.40 $58.00 $3,480.00
EA :
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED 4322324001XODTE
8. 200 LED OPTICAL UNIT PEDESTRIAN $202.98 $40,596.00 $147.00 $29,400.00
EA SYMBOLIC COUNTDOWN
MANUFACTURER DURALITE DIALIGHT
MODEL NONE STATED 4306479001
LED MODULE FOR - .
9. 72 PROGRAMMABLE VIEW N/A N/A $45.00 $3,240.00
EA - SIGNAL RED
MANUFACTURER NO BID DIALIGHT
MODEL P463R33003
LED MODULE FOR '
10. 72 PROGRAMMABLE VIEW N/A N/A $49.00 $3,528.00
T Ea SIGNAL AMBER .
MANUFACTURER NO BID DIALIGHT
MODEL P463Y33003
B LED MODULE FOR _
1. 72 PROGRAMMABLE VIEW N/A N/A $70.00 $5,040.00
EA SIGNAL GREEN
MANUFACTURER NO BID DIALIGHT
MODEL P463G33003
GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1 -11): $166,292.90 $173,678.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY GF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: APRIL 1, 2009

BID # 2009-155

PARADIGM TRAFFIC
SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

REPUBLIC INTELLIGENT
TRANSPORTATION SERVICES,
INC., DBA REPUBLIC ITS
GRAND PRAIRIE, TX

DEPARTMENT: STREET

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
§iF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRAGT.

NONE STATED

I

]

=

]

NO OPTION OFFERED D lj

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES D NO YES NO D

BIPD_ER'S PROMISEP DELIVERY: NONE STATED 30 - 60

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 13

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2009-155 TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS - STREET DEPARTMENT




* TRAFFIC PARTSINC:
P.0.BOX837
SPRING, TX 77383

CENTERLINE SUPPLY
530 JESSE STREET
GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75051

PRIME VENDOR, INC.
4608 CEDAR AVENUE SUITE 106
WILMINGTON, NC 28403

APPELBAUM INDUSTRIAL -
6006 N. MESA SUITE 510
EL PASO, TX 79912

US TRAFFIC CORPORATIONIZT7

BDESIGN - ., chr¥”

9603 JOHN STREET 4oA5 £ UHBI ) 149-BROGKSLANE T o“"‘“‘&?% S,g

SANFAFESPRINGS; CA 90670
e (A ase]

MEDLEY MATERIAL HANDLING
4201 WILL ROGERS PARKWAY
OKLAHOMA CITY, OK 73108

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT
259 BROADWAY
NEWBURGH, NJ 12550

MESA ELECTRIC
502 JOE ANGE ROAD
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

BASTROP, TX 78602 ?“M
PEEK TRAFFIC CORP (EV M
P. O. BOX 622 %

141 RAILROAD STREET M)O\
BEDFORD, PA 15522

ECONOLITE
811 ST. MICHAELS DRIVE SU!TE 102

SANTA FE, NM 87505

ALL TRADES ELECT
11005 ARGAL COURT
EL PASO, TX 79935




