CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Environmental Services

AGENDA DATE: May 22, 2007

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Ellen A. Smyth, P.E. /621-6719 , Terrence Freibura, 541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: Citywide
SUBJECT:

Award Contract 2007-122 to Envirosolve, Inc. for City-wide Waste Removal and Disposal Services. Amount of
this award will vary based on the need for the services.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The staff recommends awarding the contract to Envirosolve, Inc. based upon best value criteria. The contract is for
the scheduled and unscheduled pickup and removal of hazardous and non-hazardous waste from City facilities,
emergency spills, and/or illicit discharges. Envirosolve currently provides Hazardous Household Waste services for
the City under Solicitation 2005-065 and performs its work in a timely manner, within budget, and according to
project specifications.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

These services were previously bid three years ago (Solicitation 2004-146) on June 2, 2004, and the contract was
extended an additional 1-year on May 2, 2006. We are at the end of the current contractual arrangement and have
used up extension periods.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

This item has been budgeted and will be funded by Environmental Services funds. The following is the account
information: Department — 34010286; Fund — 40403; Account — 502215.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION*****************7‘:7‘:*

LEGAL: (if required) _ /] j FINANCE: (if required)

v/ _
DEPARTMENT HEAD: C/éé —7L~1 ”

(Example: if RCA is inifiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information-copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA: |

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: MAY 4, 2007

PROJECT: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES
REP NO.: 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
BUDGET No.: 34010286-40403-502215

FUNDING SOURCE: ENVIRONMENTAL CODE
CONTRACTS-NOCE

RESPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT (S): ALL
R e R B R i R I 2 2
RECOMMENDATION: VENDOR ENVIROSOLVE INC.
TULSA, OK

ITEM (S)ALL

AWARD $50,000.00 EST/YEAR

CONTRACT PERIOD 36 MONTHS

OPTION 2 YEARS AT ANY TIME

PROMPT PAYMENT NONE

TOTAL EST AWARD $150,000.00

ENFORCEMENT-SWM-OUTSIDE

Financial Services, Purchasing

Division and Environmental Services
recommend awards as indicated.

BIDS SOLICITED

17 BIDS LOCALS 10
BIDS RECEIVED 02
BIDS SVCS 06
"NO BIDS" RECEIVED 00

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $150,000.00
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FUNDS: AVATILABLE NOT AVAILABLE COMPTROLLER
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COUNCIL: APPROVED REJECTED CITY CLERK
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Crty COUNCIL

JoHN COOK ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
MAYOR SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT 5
JOYCE WILSON EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6
CITY MANAGER STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
PAT ADAUTO
DEPUTY CITY MANAGER

FOR DEVELOPMENT & INFRASTRUCTURE

ELLEN A SMYTH, P.E.

DIRECTOR
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
TO: Ray Heredia

A

/1
17 /] [ B
v

A,
FROM: Ellen Smyth (-
SUBJECT: Evaluation of Bids for Waste leoval and Disposal Services
Solicitation 2007122
DATE: May 1, 2007

Based on our review of the bids for the above mentioned project, we recommend awarding the
contract to Envirosolve, Inc. This vendor provides the best-value and is the low bid. A summary
scoring sheet is attached which shows the points awarded to each bidder for the evaluation
factors.

As indicated, we are returning the copies of the bids along with the signed RCA form. Please
contact me at 621-6719 or John Garza at 621-6835 if you have any questions.

Attachments
1. Score Sheet for all Bidders
2. Agenda Item Summary Form
3. Copies of bid proposals

7969 SAN PAULO, EL PASO, TEXAS 79907
915/621-6700 / FAX: 915-621-6711



Waste Removal and Disposal Services
Solicitation No. 2007-122
Bidder Evaluation Score Sheet

Bidders

Envirosolve,| Rinchem
Evaluation Factors Inc. Company
Cost(40pis) 40 20
Safety and Environmental Compliance Record (15 pts) 15 15
Bidder's past relationship with the City (10 pts) 10 10
Permits: provide documentation of all Federal, State, - ' ]
And Local Permits/Licenses (20 pts) 20 20|
Liability Insurance (10 pts) 10 10
Employee Insurance Benefits (5 pts) 5 0
Total (possible 100 pts) 100 75

“no info provided by Rinchem

Cost Evaluation was based on a comparison of those items that both Contractors provided bid prices.

Envirosolve was overall low bid; points awarded = 40 points
2nd low bid was Rinchem; points awarded = 20 points




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES BID # 2007-122
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007 DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
ENVIROSOLVE, INC. RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
DESCRIPTION: PER HOUR PER DAY PER HOUR PER DAY

A. FIRM UNIT PRICES:

1 MANPOWER HOURLY RATE:
PROJECT MANAGER

SUPERVISOR
TECHNICIAN
CHEMIST
2 WLWJMMMEWMMMMW

PICK-UPTRUCK

(UTILITY/53' VAN)
JRALER | __$1800/$60.00 | NONESTATED | $3750 | ___ ¢ $30000 i

(STRAIGHT TRUCK 16' - 24"
VAN s $55.00 [ NA_ L $125 | §250.00 |
BACKHOE RENTALCOST+20% | $75.00 | I $600.00 |
o ROCKET LAUNCHER
b %105.00 | __NONESTATED | $7500 | ___$600.00 |
| VAC TANKER 1
$105.00 | NONE STATED $75.00 $600.00

L 2f-¢>% : SAL S -
DATE: 7 e 2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT . 1

APPROVED BY: o~ %




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.
TULSA, OK

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT AT ANY
TIME DURING THE CONTRACTOR PERIOD.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE:

A. TWELVE (12) MONTHS DURING THE CONTRACT PERIOD.
B. TWENTY-FOUR (24) MONTHS DURING THE CONTRACT

PERIOD.
C. NO OPTION OFFERED.

YES GZ] NO D

YES [z[ NO D

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

APPROVED BY:

* PO N M TTEN }4 1 -y
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DATE: 2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES BID # 2007-122
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007 DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC. RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $145.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
1. AEROSOLS FLAMMABLE (PROCESSABLE) $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $211

$/55 GAL: $325.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: 633

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

AEROSOLS NON-PROCESSABLE

$/5 GAL: $74

$/5 GAL: $145.00

$/15 GAL: $140

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $159

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $211

$/55 GAL: $325.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: 633

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

/
<50 MM J $245 NO BID
(< 66 POUNDS/PACKAGE)
3. AMMUNITION <
250 MM 4 CASE BY CASE NO BID
\ .
$/5 GAL: $25 $/5 GAL: $160.00
$/15 GAL: $46 $/15 GAL:
4, ANTI-FREEZE $/30 GAL: $53 $/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $70

$/55 GAL: $225.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
: $/5 GAL: $25 $/5 GAL: $100.00
- $/15 GAL: $46 $/15 GAL:
5. ANTI-FREEZE AND SOLID SORBENT $/30 GAL: $53 $/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $70

$/55 GAL: $180.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $210

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

BALLASTS (PCB)

$/5 GAL: $123

$/5 GAL: $217.00 MINIMUM

$/15 GAL: $232

$/115 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $264

$/30 GAL:

- $/55 GAL: $351

$/55 GAL: $1.37/LB MINIMUM $495.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $1,053

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

BALLASTS (NON-PCB)

$/5 GAL: $62

$/5 GAL: $130.00

$/15 GAL: $115

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $132

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $176

$/55 GAL: $270.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $528

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

BATTERIES, LEAD ACID

$/5 GAL: $40

$/5 GAL: $100.00/MINIMUM

$/15 GAL: $75

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $86

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $115

$/55 GAL: $0.60/LB MINIMUM $250.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

BATTERIES, LITHIUM

$/5 GAL: $152

$/5 GAL: $350.00 MINIMUM

$/15 GAL: $286

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $325

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $433

$/55 GAL: $10.00/LB MINIMUM $350.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $152 $/5 GAL: $820.00
$/15 GAL: $286 $/15 GAL:
10. BATTERIES, MERCURY $/30 GAL: $325 $/30 GAL:
‘ $/55 GAL: $433 $/55 GAL:

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

1.

BATTERIES, NICAD

$/5 GAL: $139

$/5 GAL: $100.00 MINIMUM

$/15 GAL: $257

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $297

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $396

$/55 GAL: $1.65/LB MINIMUM $200.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

$/5 GAL: $139

$/5 GAL: $100.00 MINIMUM

$/15 GAL: $257 $/15 GAL:
12. BATTERIES, NIMH $/30 GAL: $297 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $396 $/55 GAL: $1.65/LB MINIMUM $200.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $195.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
13. CORROSIVE LIQUID (ACID) $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $211 $/55 GAL: $595.00 ‘
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $195.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
14, CORROSIVE LIQUID (BASE) $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $211

$/55 GAL: $595.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE - PRICE
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $195.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
15. CORROSIVE SOLID (ACID) $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $211 $/55 GAL: $595.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $633 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: 74 $/5 GAL: $195.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
16. CORROSIVE SOLID (BASE) $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:
’ $/55 GAL: $211 $/55 GAL: $595.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $633 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
17. DIESEL AND SOLID SORBENT $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $210.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 ~ $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
18. DIESEL FUEL $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $200.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $40 $/5 GAL: $200.00
$/15 GAL: $75 $/15 GAL:
19. FLAMMABLE LIQUID $/30 GAL: $86 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $115 $/55 GAL: $700.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC. RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $200.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
20. FLAMMABLE CORROSIVE LIQUID $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $211 $/55 GAL: $700.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $74 $/5 GAL: $200.00
$/15 GAL: $140 $/15 GAL:
21. FLAMMABLE POISON LIQUID $/30 GAL: $159 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $211 $/55 GAL: $700.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $97 $/5 GAL: $200.00
$/15 GAL: $183 $/15 GAL:
22 FLAMMABLE SOLID $/30 GAL: $207 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $276 $/55 GAL: $700.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $1,021 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $97 $/5 GAL: NO BID
$/15 GAL: $183 $/15 GAL:
23. FLAMMABLE CORROSIVE SOLID $/30 GAL: $207 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $1.021 $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $1,021 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $152 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $286 $/15 GAL:
24. FLARES/FUSES $/30 GAL: $325 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $433 ~ $/55 GAL: $60.00/BOX
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$0.30/LINEAR FOOT $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL:
25. FLUORESCENT LAMPS (INCLUDES PACKAGING) $/30 GAL:
\ : ~ $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $131 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $247 $/15 GAL:
26. FREON GAS $/30 GAL: $280 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $373 $/55 GAL: $350.00 MED.
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $131 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $247 $/15 GAL:
27. FREON GAS (R12) $/30 GAL: $280 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $373 $/55 GAL: $350.00 MED.
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: N/A $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $131 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $247 $/15 GAL:
28. FREON GAS (R22) $/30 GAL: $280 $/30 GAL:
1 $/55 GAL: $373 $/55 GAL: $350.00 MED.
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
29. GASOLINE AND SOLID SORBENT $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
' $/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $1.40/LB MINIMUM $250.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX: .

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
: ' $/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
30. GREASE AND/OR TAR $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $160.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
31. LATEX PAINT $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $160.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $152 $/5 GAL: $820.00
: $/15 GAL: $286 $/15 GAL:
32. MERCURY $/30 GAL: $325 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $433 $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $152 $/5 GAL: $1,040.00
$/15 GAL: $286 $/15 GAL:
33. MERCURY SWITCHES $/30 GAL: $325 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $433 $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL:
: ~ $/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
34, MIXED AUTO FLUIDS AND $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
SOLID SORBENT WITH GASOLINE $/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $1.40/LB MINIMUM $250.00
' $/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE: R 2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC. RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
35. MIXED AUTO FLUIDS AND $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL.:
SOLID SORBENT WITHOUT GASOLINE $/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $160.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL.:
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL.:
36. MIXED PAINT AND SOLID SORBENT $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $1.40/LB MINIMUM $250.00
$/ICUBIC YARD BOX: $240 (NONE RCRA) $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $30 $/5 GAL: $90.00
$/15 GAL: $55 $/115 GAL:
37. NON-RCRA LIQUID* $/30 GAL.: $64 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $85 $/55 GAL: $160.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $255 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $28 $/5 GAL: $75.00
$/15 GAL: $53 $/15 GAL:
38. NON-RCRA SOLID* $/30 GAL: $60 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $80 $/55 GAL: $145.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $240 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $53 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL; $75 $/15 GAL:
39, OiL BASED PAINT RELATED MATERIALS $/30 GAL: $113 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $150 $/55 GAL: $545.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $350 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
*NOT OTHERWISE CLASSIFIED

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

L

2007-122 WASTE REMOVAL. AND DISPOSAL SERVICES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $100.00 MINIMUM
$/15 GAL: $150 $/15 GAL:
40. OTHER ELECTRIC LAMPS SUCH AS $/30 GAL: $175 $/30 GAL:
QUARTZ, LOW PRESSURE SODIUM HALOGEN $/55 GAL: $226 $/55 GAL: $2.20/LB MINIMUM $200.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $123 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
$/15 GAL: $232 $/15 GAL:
M. OXIDIZER LIQUID $/30 GAL: $264 $/30 GAL:
~ $/55 GAL: $351 $/55 GAL: $4.00/LB MINIMUM $250.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $123 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
$/15 GAL: $232 $/15 GAL:
42, OXIDIZER SOLID $/30 GAL: $264 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $351 $/55 GAL: $4.00/LB MINIMUM $250.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
. $/15 GAL: $150 $/15 GAL:
43. PESTICIDES AND FERTILIZERS (LIQUID) $/30 GAL: $176 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $225 $/55 GAL: $650.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
: $/15 GAL: $150 $/15 GAL:
44, PESTICIDES AND FERTILIZERS (SOLID) $/30 GAL: $176 $/30 GAL:
‘ $/55 GAL: $225 $/55 GAL: $650.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
- $/15 GAL: $150 ~ $/15 GAL:
45, POISON B SOLID $/30 GAL: $176 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $226 $/55 GAL: $650.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $684 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $220.00 MINIMUM
$/15 GAL: $150 $/15 GAL:
46. POISON SOLID $/30 GAL: $176 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $226 $/55 GAL: $650.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $684 $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $25 EACH $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $/15 GAL:
47. PROPANE GAS (5 GALLON) $/30 GAL: $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $/55 GAL: $300.00 MED.
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $5 EACH $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $/15 GAL:
48. PROPANE GAS (CAMPING STYLE) $/30 GAL: $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $/55 GAL: $20.00/EA
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $750 $/5 GAL: NO BID
$/15 GAL: NA $/15 GAL:
49. RADIOACTIVE MATERIAL $/30 GAL: NA $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: NA $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $40/$97 $/5 GAL:
$/15 GAL: $75/$83 $/15 GAL:
50. RCRA IGNITABLE (LIQUID/SOLID)* $/30 GAL: $86/$207 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $115/$276 $/55 GAL: $800.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA/$1,021 $/CUBIC YARD BOX: '
$/5 GAL: $176 $/5 GAL: $250.00 MINIMUM
$/15 GAL: $332 $/15 GAL:
51. RCRA REACTIVE (LIQUID/SOLID)* $/30 GAL: $377 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $502 $/55 GAL: $4.00/LB MINIMUM $250.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $80 $/5 GAL: $225.00
$/15 GAL: $150 $/15 GAL:
52, RCRA TOXIC (LIQUID/SOLID)* $/30 GAL: $176 $/30 GAL:
: $/55 GAL: $226 $/55 GAL: $650.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: NA $/5 GAL: NO BID
$/15 GAL: NA $/15 GAL:
53. REGULATED MEDICAL WASTE $/30 GAL: $40/32 G $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $50/40 G $/55 GAL:
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $34 $/5 GAL: $125.00
$/15 GAL: $49 $/15 GAL:
54, WASTE GASOLINE $/30 GAL: $74 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $98 - $/55 GAL: $200.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
*NOT OTHERWISE CLASSIFIED

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
ATTACHMENT A PRICE PRICE
$/5 GAL: $34 $/5 GAL: $150.00
$/15 GAL: $49 $/15 GAL:
55. WASTE OIL (HALOGENATED 24,000 PPM) $/30 GAL: $74 $/30 GAL::

$/55 GAL: $98

$/55 GAL: $305.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

56. |WASTE OIL (HALOGENATED > 1,000 PPM <4,000 PPM)

$/5 GAL: $34

$/5 GAL: $150.00 ‘

$/15 GAL: $49

$/15 GAL:

$/30 GAL: $74

$/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $98

$/55 GAL: $305.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

$/5 GAL: $25

$/5 GAL: $75.00

$/15 GAL: $46 $/15 GAL:
57. WASTE OIL (NON-HALOGENATED) $/30 GAL: $53 $/30 GAL:
$/55 GAL: $70 $/55 GAL: $100.00
$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA $/CUBIC YARD BOX:
$/5 GAL: $131 $/5 GAL: $200.00
$/15 GAL: $247 $/15 GAL:
58. WASTE OIL (PCB CONTAMINATED) $/30 GAL: $280 $/30 GAL:

$/55 GAL: $373

$/55 GAL: $500.00

$/CUBIC YARD BOX: NA

$/CUBIC YARD BOX:

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

59. BATTERIES, LEAD ACID

AUTOMOTIVE: $1/EACH
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

BID # 2007-122

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.

TULSA, OK ALBUQUERQUE, NM
C. MATERIAL UNIT COST: PRICE PRICE
85 GALLON OVERPACK DRUM $/DRUM: $135 $/DRUM: $250.00
55 GALLON . OPEN HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: $100.00
55 GALLON CLOSED HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: $80.00
5 GALLON METAL BUCKETS $/BUCKET: $11 $/BUCKET: $20.00
2 GALLON METAL BUCKETS $/BUCKET: $9 $/BUCKET: NONE STATED
55 GALLON PLASTIC DRUMS $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: $115.00
5 GALLON PLASTIC BUCKETS $/BUCKET: $11 $/BUCKET: $20.00
2 GALLON PLASTIC BUCKETS $/BUCKET: $9 $/BUCKET: NONE STATED
20 GALLON FIBER DRUMS $/DRUM: $40 $/DRUM: NONE STATED
20 GALLON PLASTIC DRUM $/DRUM: $40 $/DRUM: $75.00
20 GALLON OPEN HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $40 $/DRUM: NONE STATED
20 GALLON CLOSED HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $40 $/DRUM: NONE STATED
30 GALLON FIBER DRUMS $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: NONE STATED
30 GALLON PLASTIC DRUM $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: $100.00
30 GALLON OPEN HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: . $100.00
30 GALLON CLOSED HEAD METAL DRUM $/DRUM: $45 $/DRUM: $100.00
- TUB SKID PAINT BOXES $/BOX: NA $/BOX: NONE STATED
CUBIC YARD TRI-WALL BOXES $/BOX: $85 $/BOX: $130.00
ABSORBENT FOR LAB PACKING $/IQTY: $13 $/QTY: $25.00/BAG
ABSORBENT FOR SPILL CLEAN-UP $/QTY: $13 $/QTY: $20.00/BAG
' DRUM LINERS
$1.50/LINER

8 QT. SHARPS CONTAINER

$7.50/CONTAINER

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

BID # 2007-122

C. MATERIAL UNIT COST:

ENVIROSOLVE, INC.
TULSA, OK

RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$/QTY: $50.00 EACH

CHLOR DETECT $/IQTY: $11/EA
PID $/QTY: $30/HR $/QTY: $150.00 EACH
COLORIMETRIC TUBES $/QTY: $10/EA $/QTY: $100.00 EACH
HAZ CAT ID $/QTY: NO CHARGE $/QTY: $100.00 EACH
OIL TEST KIT $/QTY: $11/EA $IQTY:
RADIATION METER
$25/HR
FOUR GAS METER
$100/DAY

MERCURY VAPOR ANALYZER

$275/DAY

ANY OTHER ANTICIPATED EQUIPMENT

N-DEX GLOVES, NITRILE _

D. PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT THAT MAY BE USED BY CONTRACTOR PERSONNEL
LEVEL A $/PERSON/DAY $450 $900.00 EACH
LEVEL B $/PERSON/DAY $150 $150.00 EACH
LEVEL C $/PERSON/DAY $35 $50.00 EACH
PLASTIC SHEETING $/QTY: $100/ROLL $/QTY: $140.00 ROLL
TAPE $/QTY: $6/ROLL $/QTY: $8.00 ROLL
PERSONAL EXPOSURE MONITORING EQUIPMENT $/QTY: $125/DAY $/QTY: $50.00 EACH
SAMPLE TUBES $/QTY: $5/EA $/QTY: $5.00 EACH
SAMPLE JARS $/QTY: $2/EA $/QTY: $5.00 EACH
COLIWASA SAMPLER $/QTY: $20.00 EACH

$IQTY $15/EA

$30/BOX

AIR BOTTLE REFILLS

$35.00 EACH

GLOVES

$20.00 EACH

02 + LEL

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: WASTE REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL SERVICES BID # 2007-122
BID DATE: APRIL 11, 2007 DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
ENVIROSOLVE, INC. RINCHEM COMPANY, INC.
TULSA, OK ' ALBUQUERQUE, NM
E. OTHER: B _ .
‘ SORBEN COMPRESSOR
$/QTY: $100/BALE . $/QTY: $200.00 DAY
LABELS, RCRA & DOT PUMPS
$/QTY: $2/EACH $/QTY: $100.00 DAY
$/IQTY: $/QTY:
$/IQTY: $/QTY:
$/QTY: ' $/QTY:

APPROVED BY:
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