. DEPARTMENT: General Services — Fleet Division ' |
- : o !

AGENDA DATE: 05/24/11
CONTACT PERSON NAME AND PHONE NUMBER: Stuart Ed, Director, General Service, (915) 621-6822

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: ALL

DEPARTMENT HEAD: L

the contract.

"AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: -

CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

Bruce Collins, Purchasing Manager (915) 541-4313

SUBJECT:
Approve the award of bid 2011-025 to Sun City Towing and Recovery for the purchase of towing services related to

City owned vehicles. Estimated annual expenditures are $115,000.00 for a total of $345,000 over the three (3) year term of

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: :
The City currently owns approximately 1850 light duty and 450 heavy vehicles which are operated daily. The approval

of this conract would allow for the towing of these vehicles in case of an accident, mechanical or incidental problems
resulting in the inability to drive a vehicle. Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: |
Has the Council previously considered this item or 2 closely related one?

Yes. Council previously approved contract 2008-083 on April 29,2008.

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by .
account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

37370510-503125-45202-37000 - General Services Dept, Internal Service Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

Rt Lk bk ko ik .‘REQU]RED AUTHOR‘[ZATION:— dederri ekl de o ook '

(¥f Department Head Summary Form is initiated by Purchasing, client department should

sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager




SOLICITATION NO: 2011-025

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION TITLE: TOWING OF MOTOR VEHICLES - CITY OWNED

AD Wrecker Dominguez Towin Sun City Towing &
N Maximum Service,Inc. g 9 Recovery, LP
\Vi\ Criteria Points El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX
R 0, 0,
Total Cost ‘ o $446.44 (3%30N30) o .0.00 $417.53 (5%10N30)
ITEM 1A, 2A, 3A & 4A 65.47 Bid on item 1A only 70
incomplete
Reputation and Quality of the
Bidder's Service 15 15 0 15
Employee Medical Benefits and 10 5 0 6
Incentives
Past Relationship/Performance 5 3 0 5
with the City
(Maximum 100 Points)
GRAND TOTAL 8547 0 9%
COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

PAGE 1 OF 1




Bid Opening Date: March 30, 2011
rect ®

N Towing of Motor Vehicles - City Owned

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

De

ElPaso

Al-perdcaGity

4 2010 5
Solicitation #: 2011-025
hartment: General Services

AD WRECKER DOMINGUEZ TOWING SUN CITY TOWING &
SERVICE, INC. EL PASO, TX RECOVERY, LP
EL PASO, TX EL PASQ, TX
'TN%M * [TEM DESCRIPTION CITY'S COST CITY'S COST CITY's COST
_ANY VEHICLE WITH GROSS VEHICLE WEIGHT (GVW) OF
11,000 POUNDS OR LESS MUST BE TOWED WITH A TOW
1A. | TRUCK THAT SHALL MEET ALL FEDERAL, STATE AND $42.50 $45.00 $49.50
LOCAL LAWS, REGULATIONS AND ORDINANCES ' :
INCLUDING HIGHWAY WEIGHT LIMITS PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW
1B. EXCESS TIME AT SITE IN 30 MINUTES INCREMENTS $.99 $36.00 $49.50
, AFTER THE FIRST 45 MINUTES ON SITE PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES
ANY VEHICLE WITH GROSS VEHICLE WEIGHT (GVW)
BETWEEN 11,001 AND 33,000 POUNDS MUST BE TOWED ’
2A. | WITHATOW TRUCK THAT SHALL MEET ALL FEDERAL, $109.00 NO BID $90.00
STATE AND LOCAL LAWS, REGULATIONS AND ) )
ORDINANGES INCLUDING HIGHWAY WEIGHT LIMITS PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW
2B, EXCESS TIME AT SITE IN 30 MINUTES INCREMENTS $1.50 NO BID $49.50
‘ AFTER THE FIRST 45 MINUTES ON SITE PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES
ANY VEHICLE WITH GROSS VEHICLE WEIGHT (GYW) ’
BETWEEN 33,001 AND 42,000 POUNDS MUST BE TOWED
3A. | WITHATOW TRUCK THAT SHALL MEET ALL FEDERAL, $144.00 NO BID $125.00
" STATE AND LOCAL LAWS, REGULATIONS AND -
. ORDINANGES INCLUDING HIGHWAY WEIGHT LIMITS PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW
3B. EXCESS TIME AT SITEIN 30 MINUTES INCREMENTS $1.75 NO BID $90.00
AFTER THE FIRST 45 MINUTES ON SITE PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES
ANY VEHICLE WITH GROSS VEHICLE WEIGHT (GVW) IN
EXCESS OF 42,001 (FIRE/EMS DEPARTMENT UNITS) WUST BE
4A. | TOWED WITH A FLAT BED TOW TRUCK THAT SHALL MEET $164.75 NO BID $175.00
) ~ ALL FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL LAWS, REGULATIONS
- I AND ORDINANCES INCLUDING HIGHWAY WEIGHT LIMITS PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW PER VEHICLE TOW
4B. EXCESS TIME AT SITE IN 30 MINUTES INCREMENTS $1.75 NO BID $90.00
: AFTER THE FIRST 45 MINUTES ON SITE PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES PER 30 MINUTES

NOTE: This is a Best value Procurement. Price and other fac
The information contained in this bid tabulation is

APPROVED BY:

for information only and does

tors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. ' }
not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

sl




Bid Opening Date: March 30, 2011
Project Name: Towing of Motor Vehicles -

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

EIPass

i‘ All-Americacity

12000 E '
Solicitation #: 2011-025.
Department: General Services

AD WRECKER DOMINGUEZ TOWING SUN CITY TOWING &
SERVICE, INC. EL PASO, TX RECOVERY, LP
: EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
'L':-)M ’ ) ITEM DESCRIPTION . CITY'S COST GITY'S COST CITY'S COST
- _TOWING FEES FOR TOWS BEYOND CITY LIMITS, THE -
5. CITY LANDFILLS WILL BE OUTERMOST BOUNDARIES $2.00 $2.50 $1.95
CONSIDERED TO BE WITHIN THE CITY LIMITS "PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE
6. CANCELLED CALL (CANCELLED THROUGH CALL $-0- $0 $0
 CENTER PRIOR TO ARRIVING ON THE SCENE) PER CALL - PER CALL PER CALL
7. | DEAD CALL (NO TOWING ON THE SCENE AFTER ARRIVAL) - $-0- $10.00 $0
PER CALL PER CALL PER CALL

o dPTlON TOQ EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THé CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
|conTRACT FOR: ‘

“|ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION 1S
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
rCONTRACT. ’

N0 OPTION OFFERED .~

X

IX i
L

NOTE: ~This Is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be eva uated to defermine an awardee. '
_The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: ﬁ 2/%[ /; 2

ae

APPROVED BY:‘f_f/AL__




Bid Opening Date: March 30, 2011

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Atl-Awnetica Gity

2070 ) X
Solicitation #: 2011-025
Department: General Services

Project Narhe: Towing of Motor Vehicles - City Owned

PAYMENT TERMS:

3% -~ 30 DAYS

AD WRECKER DOMINGUEZ TOWING SUN CITY TOWING &
SERVICE, INC. EL PASO, TX RECOVERY, LP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1% - 10 DAYS 5% - 10 DAYS
2% - 20 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 3% - 20 DAYS

2% - 30 DAYS

_ , . NET - 30 DAYS ) (LISTED BUT NOT CHECKED)
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT NONE STATED
_ YES|X| NO YES NO| X
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: . D D vyes - no ]
Bl!)DL_ER S VPROMISED ARRIVAL TIME IS: : 45 45 s
Within minutes
|F BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER ARRIVAL TIME, THE CITY'S REQUIRED' ARRIVAL TIME SHALL PREVAIL. ARRIVAL TIME LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED ARRIVAL TIME.MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION QF THE BID.
BIDS LOCAL: 67 NO BIDS: 0

BIDS SOLICITED: 76

BIDS RECEIVED: 3

awardee.

OTE: This Is a Best Value Brocurement. Price and other 1actors sh
“The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on

APPROVED BY: fZ [ h ( t

pATE: /- /ﬁ .//Z

all be evaluated to determine an
ly and does not constitute actua

| award/execution of contract.




24-7 TOWING & RECOVERY HECTOR
- MARTINEZ ‘ o
5824 WESTSIDE DRIVE
'EL PASO, TX 79932

ALLIED TOWING
601 MAGNOLIA STREET
.- ELPASO; TX 79903

ALAMO TOWING SERVICE
612 S. RAYNOR STREET
EL PASO, TX 79905 (53¢

&

AMERICAN & EUROPEAN TOWING
4220 DYER STREET
EL PASQ, TX 79930

ARROW TOWING
132 BAUXITE AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79932

ADVANCED TOWING & LOCK OUT SERVICE
11501 JERRY LEWIS WAY
EL PASO, TX 79936

AD WRECKER SERVICE
8368 ALAMEDA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79907

A D TOWING & RECOVERY

. 3565 LEEBLVD

EL PASO, TX79936

ALAMEDA TOWING
801 MAGNOLIA STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

~ AARON’S TOWING -
" 601 MAGNOLIA STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

A-1 AUTO TOWING
1140 DIESEL DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79907

ALBA SOUTHWEST WRECKER SERVICE
1401 S. DARRINGTON ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79928

AARDVARK WRECKER SERVICE
13250 AYLA ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79938

ASSET TOWING & RECOVERY
4941 ROYAL
EL PASO, TX 79924

ADVANCED TOWING S‘ERVICE
3640 PABLO SANCHEZ PLACE
EL PASO, TX 79938

AB WRECKER SERVICE
7500 DONIPHAN DRIVE
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

AAA :
1214 MONTANA AVENUE # A
EL PASO, TX 79902

APE TOWING & RECOVERY LLC |
9313 BILLY THE KID STREET
EL PASO, TX 79907

ACCESS TOWING

: ; VA
5918 BROOK HOLLOW DRIVE K\

EL PASO, TX 79925

AFFORDABLE TOWING INC
3733 SHELL STREET
EL PASO, TX 79925 fed o

LS

ALLSTAR TOWING
7555 ACAPULCO AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

APEX TOWING & REPAIR
201 BROOKS ROAD
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

A.S.AP. TOWING
5751 ETHEL STREET
EL PASO, TX 79932

A FAST TOWING
1609 COACH ROAD
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

AD TOWING & RECOVERY
3565 LEE BOULEVARD
EL PASO, TX 79936

AAA TOWING & TRANSPORT
300 N. CAROLINA DRIVE |
EL PASO, TX 79915 Q)\i\:\- 4

ATOWA4LESS. - ,
2922 GATEWAY BLVD E 1301
EL PASO, TX 79905

W Q\Q&

-

X




'ACE TOWING SERVICE -

256 S. MARYLAND

EL PASO, TX 79905

A DAMAGE FREE TOWING

P. 0. BOX 972121
EL PASO, TX 79997

BUSY BEE TOWING
4712 TUMBLEWEED AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79924

CARRASCO WRECKING Q\
462 E. VINTON ROAD \
EL PASO, TX 79821 R;’

C C & MTOWING
10528 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79924 :

VA(@X

DEPENDABLE TOWING
5847 WAYCROSS
EL PASO, TX 79924

DNM TOWING
373 RIO DULCE
EL PASO, TX 79932

EXTREME TOWING SERVICE
4852 SUN VALLEY DRIVE
EL: PASO, TX 79924

EL PASO PIK ALOCK TOWING &
RECOVERY ‘

11109 SHINER AVENUE

EL PASQ, TX 79936

ABACK TOWING '
340 RANCHO ESPENCIA STREET

~ EL PASO, TX 79907

A FAST & WILD TOWING
950 SUNLAND PARK DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79822

BUDGET TOWING
8300 DONIPHAN
VINTON, TX 79821

CENTURY TOWING
5847 WAYCROSS AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79824

CAMPOS TOWING & AUTO SERVICE
4501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

DISCOUNT TOWING
4019 MONTANA AVENUE .
EL PASO, TX 79903

DOMINGUEZ TOWING -
11512 CLEAR LAKE WAY
EL PASO, TX 79936

EL PASO TOWING
428 FREDERICK ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79905

EL PASO RECOVERY GROUP LLC

.9821 MONTANA AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79925

.. AGE PLACEUS WRECKING
13200 MONTANA AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79938

A C WRECKING
14460 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79938 -

BEST WRECKER SERVICE

-5843 WAYCROSS AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79924

CUSTOM TOWING
9846 LILLY DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79938

C & M TOWING SERVICE @5{
1411 LABRAKE STREE
EL PASO, TX 79938

DIAMOND TOWING
11985 PELLICANO DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79936

EL CANDADO LOCKSMITH & TOW \p(LAL

7580 ALAMEDA AVENUEQ Cb
ijﬂ%

EL PASO, TX 79915

EXPRESS TOWING
P.O.BOX 26426

10400 DYER STREET STE-D.
EL PASO, TX 79926-6426

FRONTERA TOWING SERVICE $\L
3020 N. PIEDRAS STREET %
EL PASO, TX 79930 \\)




FERRISS BROS TOWING
9720 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79924

HECTOR-7 TOWING
1634 DICK MAYERS DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79915

LONE STAR TOWING
261 VINTON ROAD
ANTHONY, TX 79821

MESA TOWING
1536 BILL OGDEN DRIVE
EL PASQO, TX 79936

PARRA’S WRECKER SERVICE
10733 HORN CIR.
EL PASO,TX 79927

SUN CITY TOWING & RECOVERY 7 A
12590 WEAVER ROAD 1)\ 2 M
EL PASO, TX 79928 \'O;u Sy

SOCORRO TOWING
565 BUFORD ROAD
SOCORRO, TX 79927

P
SUN CITY TOWING & RECOVERY
P.0.BOX71022 =
-EL PASO, TX 79917-1022

" FAST LANE TOWING

- 8505 BASIL CT.
EL PASO, TX 79925

JAG TOWING SERVICE
1615 ST JOHN DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79903

LUCKY TOWING SERVICE
141 MCARTHUR DRIVE
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

MONTANA TOWING :
6232 MONTANA AVENUE.,, SPC A-1
EL PASO, TX 79925

X

R AND R TOWING SVC
1502 LOMALAND DRIVE .\ ./
EL PASO, TX 79935 \é

SOHLE EXPRESS TOWING
1109 MOHEGAN LN,
EL PASO, TX 79912

VIP TOWING
9508 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

Conkeact Oppor s H s Cerder
MM Mike Avila
254 Lovlowd Ren 6lﬂqN N

o Puso (LG

X
oft

FERZA TOWING

12801 HARNOSE DRIVE

“EL PASO, TX 79928

KAMEL TOWING -
601 MAGNOLIA STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

M & M TOWING /\@%
821 MONTANA VISTA [.\<\

ANTHONY, TX 79821

PERFORMANCE TOWING
3329 JEFFERSON AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79930

RIO GRANDE TOWING AND \3{/
WRECKER SERVICE A
10936 TED WILLIAMS O
EL PASO, TX 70034 '©

SOUTHWEST WRECKER SERVICE
1401 DARRINGTON ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79928

WESTSIDE TOWING
269 CUPRICE DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79932

ROD ROBERTSON ENTERPRISES, INC.] .
1802 NW MILITARY HWY SUITE 100
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78213




