CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
: AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT:  Police ‘/O(‘\
AGENDA DATE: June 8, 2010 o,
CONTACT PERSON NAME AND PHONE NUMBER: . Eric Shelton, Assistant Chief, 564-7301

Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria CFO, 541-4293

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

SUBJECT:

Award Solicitation 2010-156 Police Uniform Accessories to the following companies: Group I, Items 1-6, 15-17,
20-21, and Group 11, Items 1 and 6, to Uniforms of Texas, 6601 Montana Ste. B and C, El Paso, TX 79925, for total
_ estimated value of $8,655.91 for one year, $25,967.73 for three years; Group I, Items 7-11, to On Time
Embroidery, 1340 Ridge Ave., Elk Grove Village, IL 60007, for total estimated value of $3,085.00 for one year,
$9,255.00 for three years; and Group I, Items 14, 18-19,22-23, to MTM Recognition, 3405 SE 29% St.. Del City,
OK 73115, for total estimated value of $4,280.00 for one year, $12,840.00 for three years; Group II, Items 2-5, to
Rocks AKA Schoolwear, 4727 Hondo Pass Ste. H, El Paso, TX 79904, for total estimated award of $4,923.00 for
one year, $14,769.00 for three years. All items will be purchased on an as-needed basis. This is a three-year

contract.
BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

This bid is for the purchase of regular work uniform accessories for sworn Police personnel as required by the
Collective Bargaining Agreement between the City of El Paso and the El Paso Municipal Police Officers’
Association, and for work uniforms for selected civilian Police personnel as needed for uniformity ar‘1d consistency.

PRIOR COUNCII, ACTION: , N
A previous related contraét was approved by Council for award on July 11, 2006.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: Account # 21010060 — 503120 - 01101

All items to be purchased on an as-needed basis. Total amount for one year is $20,943.91. Total amount for three
years is $62,831.73. -

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:. .

N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

(If Department Head Summary Form is initiated by Purchasing, client department
should sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager’




PROJECTFORM  Fig
DATE: May 26, 2010

PROJECT: Police Uniform Accessories
SOLICITATION NO: 2010-156
DEPARTMENT: Police Department

FUNDING SOURCE:  General Fund — Uniforms and Apparel
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Uniforms of Texas

El Paso, TX
ltem (s):  Group |, ltems 1-8, 15-17, 20-21 and Group I, ltems 1
and 6

Amount:  $8,655.91 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor:  On Time Embroidery
Elk Grove Village, IL
ltem(s): Group |, ltems 7-11
Amount:  $3,085.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor:  MTM Recognition
Del City, OK
Item(s): Group |, Items 14, 18-19, 22-23
Amount:  $4,280.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: Rocks-AKA-School Wear
El Paso, TX
Item(s): Group Il, Items 2-5
Amount:  $4,923.00 estimated annual expenditures

Group |, Items 12 and 13 “No Award”

BIDS SOLICITED: 24 (12 local)
BIDS RECEIVED: 6
“NO BID” RECEIVED: 0

ANNUAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $20,943.91

" The Police Department and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest
responsive, responsible bidders. ‘

This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract. Uniforms of Texas, On Time
Embroidery, and MTM Recognition offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract
at the same unit price for an additional two (2) year period if the option is exercised prior to the
expiration of the original term of the contract. Rocks-AKA-School Wear offers the City the
option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit price for an additional one (1) year
period if the option is exercised prior to the expiration of the original term of the contract.
Rocks-AKA-School Wear offers a 2.0%10N30 payment discount.




The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost
of this contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the
sum total at the end of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the

budget.

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:  $62,831.73
Estimated Total 3 yr Expenditures
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APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: June 8, 2010

Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria
Chief Financial Officer
- Financial Services Department, Purchasing Division




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-156
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S

MTM RECOGNITION

. ONTIME -

ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
' SUPPLY, INC. CORPORATION EMBROIDERY INC. EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES VERO BEACH, FL DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL.
ITEM| ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
NO. | ary. _ .
1. 288 TIE CLIP, SILVER $3.85 $1,108.80 NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN
IEATALOG NUMBER c510
2. 144 TIE CLIP, GOLD $3.85 $554.40 NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
EA )
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN
CATALOG NUMBER C510
3. 20 GROSS BUTTON, SILVER NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
EA :
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
4. 10 GROSS BUTTON, GOLD NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
EA ‘
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
{5 | 200 NAME TAG, SILVER $6.60 | $1,320.00 $6.50 | $1,300.00 N/A N/A NO BID
e ,
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM REGOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER C558D NONE STATED
6. 75 NAME TAG, GOLD $7.70 $577.50 $6.50 $487.50 N/A N/A NO BID
' EA
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER C558D NONE STATED

'2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSQRIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT -




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES BID # 2010-156
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
B R T ] ; ,

| LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S|. MTM RECOGNITION ON TIME ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
v ‘ - : SUPPLY, INC. CORPORATION EMBROIDERY INC. EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES VERO BEACH, FL DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL
'LEM ANg'Tsﬂ' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRIGE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
7. | 2,000 CHEVRON, CORPORAL NO BID $0.72 $1,440.00 $0.40 $800.00 -NO BID
. EA A :
MANUFACTURER MTM RECOGNITION CORP ON TIME INC
CATALOG NUMBER NONE STATED E-2638
N-8. | 2,000 HASH MARK, SILVER NO BID $0.72 $1,440.00 $0.24 $480.00 NO BID
' EA :
MANUFACTURER MTM RECOGNITION CORP ON TIME INC
CATALOG NUMBER NONE STATED E-2639
0. 500 HASH MARK, GOLD NO BID $0.72 $360.00 $0.24 - $120.00 NO BID
EA , .
MANUFACTURER MTM RECOGNITION CORP ON TIME INC
CATALOG NUMBER NONE STATED E-2640
10. | 2,500 PATCH, POLICE, LARGE NO BID NO BID $0.65 $1,625.00 NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER ON TIME INC
CATALOG NUMBER E-2641
1.1 100 PATCH, POLICE, SMALL NO BID NO BID - $0.60 $60.00 NO BID

S EA ‘

X ANUFACTURER ON TIME ING
CATALOG NUMBER E-2642

12.| 200 BADGE, SHIRT, SYMBOL ARTS $49.50 $9,900.00 | $35.00 $7,000.00 N/A N/A NO BID
EA ‘
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER " S36TX2MOD NONE STATED

APPROVED BY:, D é

4113170

NATE- 2010186 POL ICF llNlF‘ﬂRMS ACCFSKORIFES . PNI INF NFPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - BID # 2010-156]
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S MTM RECOGNITION ON TIME ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
SUPPLY, INC. - CORPORATION EMBROIDERY INC. EL PASO, TX
GROUP §: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES VERO BEACH, FL DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL
'L‘é"" ANg'T:iST‘ DESCRIPTION : UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
13. 200 BADGE, WALLET, SYMBOL ARTS $49.50 $9,900.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 N/A N/A - NO BID
EA ’
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER 'S36TX2MOD ‘ NONE STATED
14, 500 CHEVRON, SERGEANT NO BID " $0.72 - $360.00 N/A " NIA NO BID
EA -
MANUFACTURER MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER NONE STATED ’
15. 200- RIBBON BAR, CLOTH . NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
EA ' )
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
16. 50 AWARD BAR, CERAMIC NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID .
EA
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
_\17. 30 . HYDRATION SYSTEM, HANDS-FREE NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID
o EA
NwANUEACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
18. 100 BADGE, DRESS HAT $30.25 $3,025.00 $28.00’ $2,800.UO N/A N/A NO BID
EA SOLID SILVER RHODIUM W/POLICE TAB
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER S110MOD _ NONE STATED

APPROVED BY: M

NATF- 4/’8) //0

2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

U

.

. |BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-156]
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

APPROVED BY:

Db

DATE-

<1310

2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT

NONE STATED)

LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S| MTM RECOGNITION ON TIME ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
- SUPPLY, INC. CORPORATION EMBROIDERY ING. EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES VERO BEACH, FL DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL
'L'(E)“’f_ ANSSST'. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE .| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
19.1 20 BADGE, DRESS HAT $35.20 $704.00 $28.00 $560.00 N/A N/A NO BID
EA SOLID GOLD PLATED WIRANK TAB
- [MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER S110MOD NONE STATED
20. | 100 STRAP, EXPANDABLE METALLIC, NO BID NO BID - N/A N/A NO BID
- EA DRESS HAT, SILVER RHODIUM FINISH '
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
21.| 20 STRAP, EXPANDABLE METALLIC, NO BID NO BID NIA N/A NO BID
EA DRESS HAT, GOLD FINISH ‘
MANUFACTURER
CATALOG NUMBER
2.1 15 BADGE, MOTORCYCLE HELMET $29.70 $445.50 $28.00 $420.00 N/A - N/A NO BID
EA SILVER RHODIUM FINISH '
MANUFACTURER SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER MB10 NONE STATED
| 23. 5 BADGE, MOTORCYCLE HELMET GOLD FINISH $33.00 $165.00 $28.00. $140.00 N/A N/A NO BID
T EA , : . .
\mANUFACTURER- SMITH & WARREN MTM RECOGNITION CORP
CATALOG NUMBER M810 NONE STATED
GROUP I: TOTAL $27,700.20 $21,307.50 $3,085.00 _ NONE STATED
(BIDDER'S GROUP 1 TOTAL: $17,947.50) (BIDDER'S GROUP | TOTAL:




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-156
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

v LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S

MTM RECOGNITION

ON TIME ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
- - 'SUPPLY, INC. CORPORATION EMBROIDERY INC. ' EL PASO, TX
. GROUP li: ACADEMY AND RECRUITS VERO BEACH, FL . DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL
'LZM ANg'T$3T' ' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 200 "SHORTS, 6" IN SEAM, DRAWSTRING, NOBID | NOBID N/A N/A $9.60 $1,920.00
EA VARIOUS COLORS h (XXL ADD $1.00 EACH)
MANUFACTURER . ANVIL
CATALOG NUMBER 122 PAGE 90
Nl 200 SHIRT, TEES, 50/50 HEAVYWEIGHT, NO BID NO BID N/A N/A '$2.95 $590.00
EA ASSORTED COLORS : {(XXL ADD $1.00 EACH)
MANUFACTURER FRUIT OF THE LOOM 5930
CATALOG NUMBER PAGE 110 #5930
3. 200 SWEAT SHIRT, 80/20 HEAVYWEIGHT, NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $10.50 $2,100.00
EA WI/WHITE LOGO, NO HOOD, VARIOUS COLORS (XXL ADD $1.00 EACH)
MANUFACTURER GILDAN
CATALOG NUMBER 9000 PAGE 271
SWEAT PANTS, 80/20 HEAVYWEIGHT,
4. 200 DRAWSTRING, VARIOUS COLORS NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $10.10 $2,020.00
EA W/WHITE EPPD LETTERS {XXL ADD $1.50 EAGH)
MANUFACTURER GILDAN 12100
CATALOG NUMBER #12100 PAGE 281C
5. 30 POLO SHIRTS, 50/50 ASSORTED COLORS NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $7.10 $213.00
k EA (XXL ADD $1.50 EAGH)
Y __ANUFACTURER HANES
CATALOG NUMBER 054X PAGE 329
6. 200 CAP, BASEBALL, NAVY BLUE NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $3.20 ‘ $640.00
EA -
MANUFACTURER OTTO CAPS
CATALOG NUMBER PG 51 18-868
GROUP Il TOTAL: NO BID (BIDDER'S GROUP Il TOTAL: $3,780.00) NONE STATED $7,483.00

APPROVED BY: 0@

DATF:

+13/10

2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID‘ TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-156
- DEPARTMENT: POLICE

LAWMEN'S & SHOOTER'S

MTM RECOGNITION

ON TIME

ROCKS-AKA-SCHOOL WEAR
SUPPLY, INC. CORPORATION EMBROIDERY INC. EL PASO, TX
VERO BEACH, FL DEL CITY, OK ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIMER PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE

JEONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS

EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT. o

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS

|EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT.

7

L]
L]

NO OPTION OFFERED. D l:l 1:1
PAYMENT TERMS: " NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS | NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES No [ ] ves[X] no[ | YEs| | No YES No [ |
BI.DE!ER S PROMISEP DELIVERY: 30-45 20 30 7-10

. \Within ___ consecutive calendar days. ,

ithin____hours or ovérnight after receipt of verbal order N/A 4 N [ A 4
[in cases of emergency.

llF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: Dﬁ
nare. 112D

2010-156 POI ICE LINIFORMS ACCFSSORIFS - PO ICF NEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES v . BID # 2010-156
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010 - DEPARTMENT: POLICE
Z o S s e i UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC.
DBAUNIFORMS AND UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
e o ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES NORTHRIDGE,.CA
ILEOM ANg'.I'EST. - DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 288 TIE CLIP, SILVER $2.95 $849.60 $1.38 $397.44
EA
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER IN 30 P51,
N2, 144 TIE CLIP, GOLD $2.95 - |. $424.80 $1.38 $198.72
EA - - ‘ v
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS 8 ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER .
CATALOG NUMBER IN 39 P50
3. 20 GROSS BUTTON, SILVER NONE STATED . $71.56 $1',431.20
. EA |. _ -
MANUFACTURER WATERBURY
CATALOG NUMBER SMALL P BUTTON
4. 10 GROSS BUTTON, GOLD NONE STATED $93.93 $939.30
EA | ‘
MANUFACTURER WATERBURY
CATALOG NUMBER SMALL P BUTTON
_ 5. 200 NAME TAG, SILVER $5.99 $1,198.00 $4.25_ $850.00
II . EA = =
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE HERMES
CATALOG NUMBER NTO5S 35608
6. v 75 NAME TAG, GOLD $5.99 $449.25 $4.25 $318.75
EA . ) .
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE HERMES
CATALOG NUMBER NT04G 35591

APPROVED BY:_ ¢ Dé

nare. 1 1BI1D

2010-156 POI ICF LINIFORMS ACCFSSORIFS - POI ICF NFPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES BID # 2010-156
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010 . . . DEPARTMENT: POLICE
B = - UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC. :
DBA UNIFORMS AND UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
, ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE ~ EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES - NORTHRIDGE, CA
IL%M ANS%EST‘ ’ DESCRIPTION ) UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
7. | 2,000 ’ CHEVRON, CORPORAL $1.99 $3,980.00 $0.69 $1,380.00
EA ’
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE || - PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER CUSTOM EMBLEM - NONE STATED
-6 2,000 HASH MARK, SILVER $2.29 $4,580.00 $0.35 $700.00
EA ‘ "
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER EH15 NONE STATED
9. 500 : HASH MARK, GOLD $2.29 $1,145.00 $0.35 $175.00
EA :
MANUFACTURER _UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHQUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER EHO3 NONE STATED
10. 2,500 'PATCH, POLICE, LARGE - - $1.99 $4,975.00 $0.85 . $2,125.00
- EA ) :
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER CUSTOM EMBLEM EPPD-LG
) _11. 100 PATCH, POLICE, SMALL $2.29 $229.00 $0.79 $79.00
{0 EA '
IMANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER CUSTOM EMBLEM EPPD-SM
12. 200 BADGE, SHIRT, SYMBOL ARTS NONE STATED $60.00 $12,000.00
"EA - | (ALT. $54.24) | ($10,850.00)
MANUFACTURER SYMBOL. ARTS
CATALOG NUMBER BLACKINGTON X-BADGE

L e

APPROVED BY:. ‘Dﬁ
oare. L/ 13100

2010156 POI ICF HINIFNRMS ACCFSSNRIER . POI ICF NFRPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES : BID # 2010-156
BID DATE: MARCH 31 2010 ' DEPARTMENT: POLICE
= ‘ UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC.
- DBA UNIFORMS AND - UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
s ; | ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES NORTHRIDGE, CA _
IL%M ANg‘TEST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE (| UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
13. 200 - BADGE, WALLET, SYMBOL ARTS NONE STATED - $60.00 $12,000.00
EA ‘ (ALT. $54.24) (($.10,850.00)
MANUFACTURER - SYMBOL ARTS
CATALOG NUMBER BLACKINGTON X-BADGE
—i4. | 500 CHEVRON, SERGEANT . : $1.99 $995.00 $0.79 $395.00
, _ EA ‘
MANUFACTURER UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER EC13 NONE STATED
15. 200 v RIBBON BAR, CLOTH : NONE STATED ) $1.49 $298.00
EA | | ‘
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER RBC
16. 50 AWARD BAR, CERAMIC . NONE STATED $3.55 $177.50
EA A | l -
MANUFACTURER PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER RBC
_17. 30 HYDRATION SYSTEM, HANDS-FREE NONE STATED $34.90 $1,047.00
: EA : . .
MANUFACTURER CAMELBAK
CATALOG NUMBER 71000
18. 100 BADGE, DRESS HAT - NONE STATED $34.00 $3,400.00
. EA SOLID SILVER RHODIUM W/POLICE TAB ’ | '
MANUFACTURER : BLACKINTON
CATALOG NUMBER B627

APPROVED. BY: I’ﬂ 5
nATE- ~4’//?)//()

2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
1, 2010

BID # 2010-156

: : 4 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
= = = o UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC. .
\ DBA UNIFORMS AND UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
o | ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE . ELPASO, TX
GROUP I: UNIFORM ACCESSORIES NORTHRIDGE, CA
ILEOM ANg'TEST" DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
19.. 20 BADGE, DRESS HAT NONE STATED $39.00 $780.00
EA | SOLID GOLD PLATED W/RANK TAB | :
MANUFACTURER . : ' BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NUMBER B627
N0, 100 ’ STRAP, EXPANDABLE METALLIC, NONE STATED $6.50 $650.00
EA DRESS HAT, SILVER RHODIUM FINISH | ~
MANUFACTURER ‘ PREMIER
.|CATALOG NUMBER " STRAP-SLV
21. 20 : STRAP, EXPANDABLE METALLIC, NONE STATED $6.50 $130.00
EA DRESS HAT, GOLD FINISH : |
MANUFACTURER - PREMIER
CATALOG NUMBER STRAP-GLD
22.. 15 , BADGE, MOTORCYCLE HELMET NONE STATED . $29.95 $449.25
EA _ SILVER RHODIUM FINISH : |
MANUFACTURER ' BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NUMBER B949
|23 5 BADGE, MOTORCYCLE HELMET GOLD FINISH NONE STATED $33.95 $169.75
“[MANUFACTURER BLACKINGTON
CATALOG NUMBER B949
GROUP I: TOTAL $18,825.65 $40,090.91
(BIDDER'S GROUP | TOTAL:
$18,830.65).

APPROVED BY:__. %

£ )
DATF: ; //% //0 . 2010-156 POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-156
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC.

“DBA UNIFORMS AND UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
: ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il: ACADEMY AND RECRUITS NORTHRIDGE, CA ,
IIIEOM AN::%EST' ' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 200 " SHORTS, 6" IN SEAM, DRAWSTRING, NONE STATED $8.50 $1,700.00
EA VARIOUS COLORS | ,
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER ' 8187
2. | 200 SHIRT, TEES, 50/50 HEAVYWEIGHT, NONE STATED $5.66 $1,132.00
EA ASSORTED COLORS _
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER 8000
3. 200 SWEAT SHIRT, 80/20 HEAVYWEIGHT, NONE STATED $10.78 $2,156.00
EA WWHITE LOGO, NO HOOD, VARIOUS COLORS | :
MANUFACTURER NONE STATED BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER ' 9000
SWEAT PANTS, 80/20 HEAVYWEIGHT, .
4. 200 DRAWSTRING, VARIOUS COLORS NONE STATED $11.95 $2,390.00
EA W/WHITE EPPD LETTERS ]
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER 4850MP
LS 5. 30 POLO SHIRTS, 50/50 ASSORTED COLORS NONE STATED $8.95 $268.50
(o : EA
“|MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER 8800
6. 200 CAP, BASEBALL, NAVY BLUE NONE STATED $2.59 .$518.00
EA |
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER 6363V
GROUP 1] TOTAL: NONE STATED $8,164.50

APPROVED BY: < Dﬁ

oare. 413170
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS ACCESSORIES
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010
o 5o 2 e

£
-

25
S

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIMER PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACT FOR:

- E (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE bPTION IS

“JEXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) IF THE OPTION IS

FEXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT

BID # 2010-156
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS 4 ALL, INC. .
" DBA UNIFORMS AND . UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
ACCESSORIES WAREHOUSE EL PASO, TX
NORTHRIDGE, CA
\

]

Fn cases of emergency.

|NO OPTION OFFERED. L L]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY ; i
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES D NO YES NO D
BI-DD.ER S PROMISEP DELIVERY:. NONE STATED 30
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight aftgr receipt of verbal order NONE STATED

NONE STATED

* BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY D?

TE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJ

ECTION OF THE BID.

_.DS SOLICITED: 24

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

BIDS LOCAL: 12

NO BIDS: 0.

A'PP OVED BY:: Dg
DAT: // ‘)/ /
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ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B. HUECO STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

PIMA UNIFORMS

3760 S. PARK AVENUE SUITEC

TUCSON, AZ 85713

ELBECO PROFESSIONAL
PERFORMANCE UNIFORMS
ATTN: MIKE KORN

P.O. BOX 13099

READING, PA 19612-3099

SIGNATURE UNIFORMS
6356 EDGEMERE ’
EL PASO, TX 79925

FAMOUS UNIFORMS, INC.
DBA B. J.'S UNIFORMS
3942 LEOPARD

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

1346 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3555 N. YARBROUGH DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925

U.S. CAVALRY
2855 CENTENNIAL AVENUE

RADCLIFF, KENTUCKY 40160-2000

LA POLICE GEAR, INC.
28022 INDUSTRY DR
VALENCIA, CA 91355

MISSION LINEN SUPPLY
1409 TEXAS AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79901

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S STORE

2430 E. YANDELL
EL PASO, TX 79903

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY
141 SUMMIT AVENUE SUITE #2
PLANO, TX 75074

ARAMARK WORK APPAREL
& UNIFORM SERVICES

141 LONGWATER DRIVE
NORWELL, MA 02061

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERVICE
SUBS. OF UNIFIRST CORP.
P. 0. BOX 26159

EL PASO, TX 79926

HARBOR LINEN CO.
P. 0. BOX 3510
CHERRY HILL, NJ 08034

SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION
361 RANDY ROAD, UNIT 101
CAROL STREAM, IL 60188

SCORPION SALES
ATTN: DAVID PEARLMAN
P.0. BOX 12570 ’

EL PASO, TEXAS 79913

OUTDOOR FITTERS
372 RICHMOND STREET WEST
TORONTO, CANADA M5V 1X6 -

BM@OUTDOOROUTFITS.COM

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMARRON
EL PASO, TX 79915

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA '
EL PASO, TX 79925

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FL. 32205

SUPREME UNI.FORMS
2631 WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVENUE
GARDENA, CA 90247

LEHIGH SAFETY SHOES

- 10203 KOTZEBUE SUITE 110

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217

LAWMEN’S & SHOOTERS’ SUPPLY
INC.

ATTN: SUSAN OCANA

7750 9'" STREET SW

VERO BEACH, FL 32968

FECHHEIMER BROTHERS CO
ATTN: LORI HAYES
601 ROBINSON ST
EL PASO, TX 79902




