CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Police %

AGENDA DATE: June 8, 2010

CONTACT PERSON NAME AND PHONE NUMBER: Eric Shelton, Assistant Chief, 564-7301
Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria CFO, 541-4293

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT;:

Award Solicitation 2010-006 Police Uniforms to Uniforms of Texas, 6601 Montana Ste. B and C, El Paso, TX
79925 as follows: Group I, Itéms 2-4, 6, 8-11, Group II, Items 1-6, Group 111, Ttems 1-3, 5-9, Group IV, Items 1-6,
and Group V, Item 1 for a total annual estimated value of $156,439.80 ; and Uniforms of Texas (Alternate #1) for
Group I, Items 1, 5, 7, 12, Group III, Item 4 for a total annual estimated value of $34,210.00. The total annual
estimated valué is $190,649.80 and $571,949.40 for three years. All items will be purchased on an as-needed basis.
This is a three-year contract. This is a Best Value Procurement.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

This bid is for the purchase of regular work uniforms for sworn Police personnel as required by the
Collective Bargaining Agreement between the City of El Paso and the El Paso Municipal Police Officers’
Association, and for work uniforms for selected civilian Police personnel as needed for uniformity and consistency.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

A previous related contract was approved by Council for award on July 11, 2006.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: Account # 21010060 — 503120 - 01101

All items to be purchased on an as-needed basis. Total amount for one year is $190,649.80. Total amount for three
years is $571,949.40.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

(If Department Head Summary Form is initiated by Purchasing, client department
should sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager




PROJECT FORM
DATE: May 20, 2010

PROJECT: Police Uniforms .
SOLICITATIONNO:  2010-006 N
DEPARTMENT: Police Department

FUNDING SOURCE:  General Fund-Uniforms and Apparel
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

RECOMMENDATION: Vendor (1): Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, TX
Item(s): Group 1-2,3,4,6,8,9, 10, 11

Groupll—1,2,3,4,5,6
Group lll-1,2,3,5,6,7,8,9
GroupIlV—-1,2,3,4,5,6

Group V -1
Amount; $156,439.80 Estimated expenditures
Vendor (2): Uniforms of Texas (Alternate #1)
El Paso, TX
Item(s): Group1-1,5,7,12
Group lll - 4
Yearly Amount: $34, 210.00 Estimated expenditures

Police and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the Bidder offering the best value to the
City.

This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract for Police Uniforms.  Vendor offers the City the
option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit price for an additional two (2) year period if the
option is exercised prior to the expiration of the original term of the contract. No prompt payment discount is

offered.

Service Wear Apparel, Nashville, TN was deemed non-responsive because they did not submit their bid on
City Forms as per Specifications.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED- 24 (12 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 04
“NO BID” RECEIVED 01

ANNUAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $190,649.80

TOTAL RECOMMENDED ESTIMATED AWARD: $571,949.40
Estimated Total 3 yr Expenditures

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: June 8, 2010

Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria, CFO

cc. Bid File




Dedicated to Outstanding Customer Service for a Better Community

TO: Deniese Baisley, Purchasing

FROM: A/AC Michelle Gardner

DATE: May 12, 2010

RE: : Recommendation for Award Police Uniforms #2010-006

The above solicitation is a best value solicitation. After a review of the bids submitted,
the recommendation for award is to Uniforms of Texas for the individual items as listed
below. Uniforms of Texas was the only responsive bidder meeting all specifications.
Uniforms of Texas submitted three bids. ltems from Uniforms of Texas’ primary bid
and Alternate # 1 were considered for award as the third bid (Alternate # 2) did not City Council
have any samples available to evaluate. In addition, Uniforms of Texas’ Alternate # 2
offered a limited number of items and the prices were considerably higher than the first

two of this company’s bids. District 1

Ann Morgan Lilly

As selection of items were from the sole responsive vendor, Price, Reputation and

Quality of Bidders Services and Past Relationship with the City were not relevant District 2

* criteria with which to determine the best value of particular items. Comfort Level (15%) Susannah M. Byrd
and Design Recommendations (10%) were the criteria used in order to determine the
best value of the few items where the low bid was not selected. Dishict3

‘ Emma Acosta
Uniforms of Texas:

Group I: Regular Duty Uniforms g:j"ftéobmson

Item # Quantity Total $ Amount
- District §

2 1,000 39,000.00 Rachel Quintana
3 10 ‘ 878.00 .
4 100 260.00 D
6 ' 800 ) 22,800.00 e .
8 500 19.500.00 Eddie Holguin Jr.
9 150 11,340.00 .
10 100 1,650.00 , Distriot 7
11 100 3,550.00 | Hloerieos
Group | Total 3 $98,978.00 ' District 8

Beto O'Rourke

City Manager
Joyce A Wilson

 Chiefof Police
_ Gregory K. Allen

911 N. Raynor - El Paso, Texas 79903 - (915) 564-7000 — www.eppd.org




Group Il: SWAT/Canine/Criminalistics

ltem # Quantity Total $ Amount
1. 300 6,570.00
2 60 1,314.00
3 60 1,314.00
4 300 6,870.00
5 60 1,314.00
6 60 1,314.00
Group |l Total 18,696.00

Group llI: Civilian Uniforms

ltem # Quantity Total $ Amount
1 : 80 1,800.00
2 80 1,640.00
3 100 3,900.00
5 100 2,796.00
6 10 175.00
7 25 1,487.50
8 50 1,097.50
9 20 61.80
Group lll Total 12,957.80

Group IV: Bicycle Unit Uniforms

Item # Quantity Total $ Amount
1 50 3,750.00
2 60 2,340.00
3 60 1,848.00
4 100 3,300.00
5 80 -3,560.00
6 150 450.00
Group IV Total 15,248.00

Group V: Police Motors

Item # Quantity Total $ Amount
1 180 10,560.00
Group V Total 10,560.00

| TOTAL GROUP I-V | $156,439.80

911 N. Raynor - El Paso, Texas 79903 - (915) 564-7000 — www.eppd.org




Uniforms of Texas (Alternate #1):

Group I: Regular Duty Uniforms

Item # Quantity Total $ Amount
1 200 7,810.00
5 » 200 5,800.00
7 200 7,150.00
12 400 - 10,400.00
Group | Total ‘ 31,160.00

Group lll: Civilian Uniforms

Item # Quantity Total $ Amount
4 100 3,050.00
Group lll Total 3,050.00
| TOTAL GROUP 1 & I | $34,210.00
TOTAL ESTIMATED ‘ $190,649.80

EXPENDITURES PER YEAR

911 N. Raynor - El Paso, Texas 79903 - (915) 664-7000 — www.eppd.org




BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS

BID DATE:

MARCH 31, 2010
il .

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2010-006
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

NASHVILLE, TN EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: REGULAR DUTY UNIFORMS *NON-RESPONSIVE* - (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
ITEM | ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
No. | ary. . .
1. 200 TROUSERS, WOMEN'S $39.00 $7,800.00 -$39.05 $7,810.00 $47.52 $9,504.00
% EA - : : ]
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER SAMTRO161B W10167 8560
2. 1,000 TROUSERS, MEN'S $39.00 $39,000.00 $39.05 $39,050.0Q $47.52 $47,520.00
EA . ol . . :
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER SAMTRO160B 10167 8560
3. 10 COMMAND JACKET . $87.80 $878.00 $85.58 $855.80 NO BID
_ EA ; |
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER FECHHEMIER
CATALOG NUMBER (NO CITY FORMS 32133 32133
SUBMITTED) - _
4. 100 * TIE, BLACK, CLIP-ON $2.60 $260.00 $2.90 $290.00 NO BID
EA ,
MANUFACTURER SAM BROONE SAM BROOME
CATALOG NUMBER 90010 90010
5. 200 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, WOMEN'S $28.50 $5,700.00 $29.00 $5,800.00 $40.99 $8,198.00
A _ _
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS ~ BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER 157R8486Z W11067 8460
6. | 800 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $28.50 | $22,800.00 $29.00 $23,200.00 $40.00 | $32,000.00
EA h ’ : - ) ' (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $32,792.00)
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER 57R8486Z 11067 8460

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:A{&”W ﬁ(/é%

anre. A 10070

2010006 POL IﬁFillNanRMS - POLICF NFPARTMFNT




BID ITEM: POLICE UN[FORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010
o e =

i

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2010-006
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
2 NASHVILLE, ™N EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: REGULAR DUTY UNIFORMS *NON-RESPONSIVE* : (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
'LZM ANg'Tss'r' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE:| TOTAL PRICE |
7. 200 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, WOMEN'S $39.00 $7,800.00 $35.75 $7,150.00 $45.32 $9,064.00
EA ' ; : : : . .
MANUFACTURER . FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER 107W38486Z W11068 8450
8. 500 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S $39.00 $19,500.00 | $35.75 $17,875.00 $45.32 $22,660.00
" A _
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS BLAUER
CATALOG NUMBER 07W8486Z 11068 8450
9. 150 JACKET, WINTER $75.60 $11,340.QO $69.30 $10,395.00 NO BID
EA L.
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER FECHHEMIER
CATALOG NUMBER 59130WP 51130WP
<10. 100 RAIN COAT, HEAVY-DUTY (NO CITY FORMS '$16.50 $1,650.00 $16.50 $1,650.00 NO BID
EA ‘ SUBMITTED)
MANUFACTURER LIBERTY LIBERTY
CATALOG NUMBER 580MYE 580MYE
11. 100 HAT, DRESS $35.50 $3,550.00 $35.50 $3,550.00 NO BID
EA .
MANUFACTURER MIDWAY MIDWAY
CATALOG NUMBER 4-STAR 4-STAR
12. 400 VEST, SAFETY, REFLECTIVE $26.00 ) $10,400.00 T $26.00 $10,400.00 NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER NESSE UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER NIV110 127P
GROUP I: TOTAL $130,678.00 $128,025.80 $128,946.00

(BIDDER'S GROUP | TOTAL: $129,738.00) |

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: /)'6

t)’/,-l‘;[/ g

" naTe-

2010-006 POLICE LINIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2010-006
BID DATE: MARGH 31, 2010 DEPARTMENT: POLICE
SERVICEWEAR APPAREL| UNIFORMS OF TEXAS [ UNIFORMS OF TEXAS | UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
- " NASHVILLE, TN EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ~ ELPASO, TX
GROUP Il: SWAT/CANINE/CRIMINALISTI *NON-RESPONSIVE* (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
'L'(E)M AN(';;ris"r' DESGRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. | 300 TROUSERS, BDU, DARK NAVY $21.90 $6,570.00 ' | $21.90 $6,570.00 NO BID
. EA .
MANUFACTURER PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER F520138405 F520138405
2. 60 TROUSERS, BDU, DIGITAL DESERT $21.90° | $1,314.00 $21.90 | $1,314.00 NO BID
EA - '
MANUFACTURER PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER F521138929 521138929
3. 60 TROUSERS, BDU, DIGITAL URBAN $21.90 $1,314.00 $21.90 $1,314.00 NO BID
EA :
MANUFACTURER PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER . F521138060 F521138060
SHIRT, BDU, DARK NAVY e . ,
4. | 300 (ADD ADDITIONAL EMBROIDERY "K-9" - (N(S)Ucémﬁé%';"s $22.90 | $6,870.00 $22.90 $6,870.00 NO BID
‘ EA . TO 25 SHIRT COLLARS) 4
MANUFACTURER - PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER F545238405 F545238405
5. 60 SHIRT, BDU, DIGITAL DESERT $21.90 $1,314.00 $21.90 $1,314.00 NO BID
EA _ , .
MANUFACTURER PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER F547038929 F547038929
6. 60 SHIRT, BDU, DIGITAL URBAN $21.90 $1,314.00 $21.90 $1,314.00 'NO BID
EA . . .
MANUFACTURER "~ PROPPER PROPPER
CATALOG NUMBER F547038060 F547036060
GROUP Il TOTAL: $18,696.00 $18,606.00 NO BID

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:

Db

DATE:

S%0

2010-006 POLICE UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT )
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BID # 2010-006

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
- - NASHVILLE, TN EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP lil: CIVILIAN UNIFORMS *NON-RESPONSIVE* (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
!LZM AN:'TS(ST' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
1. 80 SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S, WHITE $22.50 $1,800.00 $17.50 $1,400.00 NO BID
EA ‘ ‘
IMANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER , 35W5400 11403
2. 80 SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S, WHITE $20.50 $1,640.00 $16.50 $1,320.00 NO BID
EA -
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER 85R5400 11303
3. 100 SHORTS, TROUSER, MEN'S $39.00 $3,900.00 $30.50 $3,050.00 NO BID
EA : :
MANUFACTURER A FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER (NO CITY FORMS TRO160B 10167SH
SUBMITTED) _ .
4. 100 SHORTS, TROUSER, WOMEN'S ' $39.00 | $3,900.00 $30.50 $3,050.00 NO BID
EA v
MANUFACTURER FECHHEMIER UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER TRO1 618 10167SH
5. 100 PANTS, CARGO, KHAKI, NAVY, BLACK $27.96 $2,796.00 $27.96 $2,796.00 NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER 5.11 511
CATALOG NUMBER 74251 74251
6. 10 HELMET, SUN, MESH W/ADJUSTABLE - $17.50 $175.00 $17.50 $175.00 NO BID
EA HEAD BAND
MANUFACTURER BAYLY BAYLY
CATALOG NUMBER 0284 0284

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: Dé

NATF:

/354110

2010-006 POLICE UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT




BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS

BID DATE:

MARCH 31, 201
S - -

0

= =

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2010-006

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

DEPARTMENT: POLICE

GROUP IV: BICYCLE UNIT UNIFORMS

1. 50

JACKET, ROYAL/DARK NAVY BLUE,
EA DELUXE, BICYCLE OPTIONAL WINTER LINER
MANUFACTURER

o

CATALOG NUMBER

(NO CITY FORMS

PANTS, DARK NAVY BLUE, BIKE, RAINWEAR, :

2, 60
EA OPTIONAL WINTER LINER
MANUFACTURER

SUBMITTED)

CATALOG NUMBER

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
- NASHVILLE, TN EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP lil: CIVILIAN UNIFORMS *NON-RESPONSIVE* - (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
ITEM | ANN. EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
NO. | aTY. ! .
7. | 25 WORK SHOES, BLACK LEATHER, NYLON, - $59.50 $1,487.50 $59.50 $1,487.50 NO BID
EA UPPER, HI-TOP STYLE . '
MANUFACTURER MAGNUM HI-TEC MAGNUM HI-TECH
CATALOG NUMBER 5336 - 5336
8. 50 POLO SHIRT WIPOCKET, LONG SLEEVE, $21.95 $1,097.50 $21.95 $1,097.50 NO BID
EA . COLOR ASSORTED, EMBROIDERED )
. MANUFACTURER {NO CITY FORMS - ASH CITY ASH CITY
CATALOG NUMBER - SUBMITTED) "~ 85076 85076
0. 20 CAP, BASEBALL, BLACK $3.09 $61.80 $3.00 $61.80 NO BID
EA - - .
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NUMBER 6363V 6363V
GRQUP Il TOTAL: $1 6,857.80 i © $14,437.80 NO BID

$75;00 $3,750.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 NO BID
UNITED UNIFORMS UNITED UNIFORMS
- 9500 9500
$39.00 $2,340.00 $39.00 $2,340.00 NO BID

UNITED UNIFORMS

UNITED UNIFORMS

676L

676L

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:, Dﬂ

NATE-

510411

2010-006 POLICE UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT




BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2010-006
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
v . NASHVILLE, TN EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV: BICYGLE UNIT UNIFORMS *NON-RESPONSIVE* (ALTERNATE) (ALTERNATE)
'Li"' AN(';'TF(ST' DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE |- TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
3. 60 SHORTS, BIKE, DARK NAVY BLUE, 8" $30.80 $1,848.00 $30.80 $1,848.00 NO BID
EA A : : '
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER 376L - 376L
4. 100 SHIRT, POLO, NAVY, SHORT SLEEVE, $33.00 $3,300.00 $33.00 $3,300.00 NO BID
EA WIREFLECTIVE STRIPES AND PANEL ‘
MANUFACTURER : UNITED UNIFORMS UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER } 571R 571R1
_ (NO CITY FORMS :
5. 80 SHIRT, POLO, NAVY, LONG SLEEVE, SUBMITTED) | $44.50 $3,560.00 $44.50 $3,560.00 NO BID.
EA WI/REFLECTIVE STRIPES AND PANEL - -
MANUFACTURER UNITED UNIFORMS UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER 57111 571LR1
6. 150 - EMBROIDERY, NAME TAG $3.00 _ $450.00 $3.00 $450.00 - NO BID
EA ' :
MANUFACTURER JC BOWLING JC. BOWLING
' GROUP IV TOTAL: $15,248.00 $15,248.00 NO BID
GROUP V: POLICE MOTORS
1. 80 PANTS, MOTORCYCLE, FRENCH BLUE $132.00 | $10,560.00 | $132.00 | $10,560.00 NO BID
EA WITH POCKETS . : :
MANUFACTURER (NO CITY FORMS UNITED UNIFORMS UNITED UNIFORMS
CATALOG NUMBER SUBMITTED) 10317EP 10317EP
GROUP V TOTAL: $10,560.00 $10,560.00 NO BID

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: /95

onre: STAL) 1)

2010-006 POLICE UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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BID ITEM: POLICE UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MARCH 31, 2010

BT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIMER PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS,

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS
JEXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS

EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT. ' '

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2010-006
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

SERVICEWEAR APPAREL
" NASHVILLE, TN
*NON-RESPONSIVE*

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX |
(ALTERNATE)

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE)

(NO CITY FORMS
SUBMITTED)

]
=

L]

D _

= |

|no oprion OFFERED. ] [ ] ] L
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY ’

PROGUREMENT GARD: ves[ ] no[ | YES No [ ] YES No [ ] YES no [ |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: :
. . 90 90 90
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order 4 4 4
in cases of emergency.

'IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

|BiDS soviciTED: 24

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

BIDS LOCAL: 12

NO BIDS: 1

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: Aé

DATF- 6‘/)‘([//0

2010-006 POLICE UNIFORMS - POLICE DEPARTMENT
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ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B. HUECO STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARK AVENUE SUITE C
TUCSON, AZ 85713

ELBECO PROFESSIONAL
PERFORMANCE UNIFORMS
ATTN: MIKE KORN

P.0. BOX 13099

READING, PA 19612-3099

SIGNATURE UNIFORMS
6356 EDGEMERE
EL PASO, TX 79925

FAMOUS UNIFORMS, INC.
DBA B. J.'S UNIFORMS
3942 LEOPARD

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES
1346 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3555 N. YARBROUGH DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SCORPION SALES

ATTN: DAVID PEARLMAN
P.0. BOX 12570

EL PASO, TEXAS 79913

LEHIGH SAFETY SHOES

10203 KOTZEBUE SUITE 110

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217

(NOT DELIVERABLE AS ADDRESSED)

MISSION LINEN SUPPLY
1409 TEXAS AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79901

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN’S STORE
2430 E. YANDELL
EL PASO, TX 79903

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY
141 SUMMIT AVENUE SUITE #2
PLANO, TX 75074 ‘

ARAMARK WORK APPAREL
& UNIFORM SERVICES

141 LONGWATER DRIVE
NORWELL, MA 02061

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERVICE
SUBS. OF UNIFIRST CORP.
P.0.BOX 26159

EL PASO, TX 79926

" HARBOR LINEN CO.

P.0.BOX 3510
CHERRY HILL, NJ 08034

LAWMEN'’S & SHOOTERS' SUPPLY INC.
ATTN: SUSAN OCANA

7750 9™ STREET SW

VERO BEACH, FL 32968

FECHHEIMER BROTHERS CO
ATTN: LORI HAYES

601 ROBINSON ST

EL PASO, TX 79902

SAFETY SYSTEMS CORPORATION

361 RANDY ROAD, UNIT 101

CAROL STREAM, IL 60188

(NOT DELIVERABLE AS ADDRESSED)

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMARRON
EL PASO, TX: 79915

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA
EL PASO, TX 79925

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32205

SUPREME UNIFORMS

2631 WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221°S. WESTERN AVENUE
GARDENA, CA 90247

LA POLICE GEAR, INC.
28022 INDUSTRY DR

~ VALENCIA, CA 91355

U.S. CAVALRY '
2855 CENTENNIAL AVENUE
RADCLIFF, KENTUCKY 40160-9000

OUTDOOR FITTERS . \0)&&
372 RICHMOND ST WEST W}

TORONTO, CANADA M5V 1X6




