CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDAITEM .
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services — Facilities Division @K

AGENDA DATE: 6/08/10

CONTACT PERSON NAME AND PHONE NUMBER: Stuart Ed, Director, General Service, (915) 621-6822
Ed Hyatt, Administrative Analyst (915) 541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: ALL Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria, CFO, 541-4293

SUBJECT:
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to

do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $ amount if applicable.
Award group III-Item 1, Hybrid Sport Utility and optional items under Bid 2010-094 to Casa Ford Inc.

Ten (10) Hybrid Sport Utility Vehicles, Compact, for the use of city staff to conduct business. Price per vehicle is
$27,771.92 Ea. Additional options include 4WD for 5 vehicles at an additional cost of $1,540.00 Ea per vehicle.

Total award for 10 vehicles is $285,419.20.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably

complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of this
action? What are the citizen concerns?

The city is currently in the process of replacing the old fleet through a Fleet Replacement Program. The program
targets vehicles that have met their life expectancy and replacing them with vehicles that operate more efficiently,
more environmentally-friendly, and at a lower cost to the city. Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?
Yes. City Council previously approved the purchase of vehicles for the Police Department under Bid 2010-003 totaling

$3,251,867.40 on 03/09/10.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by

account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

37150068 — 508054 — 27265 — PFLESVCO1, General Services — Cars, Pickups, Vans, SUVs
37150067 — 508006 — 05590 — GEECBGO2, General Services — Green Fleet Vehicles, Vehicular Equipment

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

*******************REQU[RED AUTHORIZATION:’:****7‘:7’:**7’:********7‘:?‘:

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

(If Department Head Summary Form is initiated by Purchasing, client department should
sign also)

Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager




PROJECT FORM
DATE: June 1, 2010
PROJECT: . Fleet Vehicles
SOLICITATION NO: 2010-094 %
FUNDING SOURCE:  Vehicular Equipment; Green Fleet Vehicles ‘
DEPARTMENT: General Services

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL

dededokdekkk ik hhhhkhkhhhhhdhhhbrbrrns

RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Casa Ford, .Inc.
: _ -El Paso, Texas

ltem: Group lli, Item 1 and
Optional Item Four Wheel Drive
Amount:  $285,419.20 estimated annual expenditures

General Services — Fleet Division and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the sole
responsive, responsible bidder for the item as indicated. ‘

This is a twenty four (24) month requirements type contract for Fleet Vehicles. The term of this agreement
shall be through the manufacturer’s build-out date for model year 2011 vehicles. The Contractor has
offered the City the option of extending the term of the contract through the manufacturer’s build-out date
for model year 2012, 2013 and 2014 vehicles. No prompt payment discount is offered. \

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget. :

BIDS SOLICITED- 30 (18 local)
BIDS RECEIVED-' 4
“NO BID” RECEIVED 0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $570,838.40
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nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

APPROVED: \ COUNCIL MEETING DATE: June 8, 2010

Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria
Chief Financial Officer
Financial Services Department, Purchasing Division

cc: BID FILE




COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO: 2010-094 .
SOLICITATION TITLE: FLEET VEHICLES
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
Massey MHC Kenworth
Casa Ford Automotive Sterling El Paso Rudoliph Chevrolet|
: E{Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso. TX El Paso, TX
Cost
Group.l: Hybrid Automoblles Compact Sedan, 4 Door No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bld 0.00 No Bid 0.00
. Midstze Sedan, 4 Door §25,385.82 66.38 No Bk 0.00 No Bld 0.00 524,789.00 70.00
Group lI: Pickup Trucks Compact Regular Cab §14,494.38 70,00 No Bfd 0.00 No Bid 0.00 514,655.00 69.23
Compact Exdended Cab $14,693.38 70.00 §14,842.00 68.30 No 8id 0.00 $16,178,00 63,68
Compact 4 Door Crew Cab £20,916.38 57.68 $17,236.00 70,00 No Bld 0.00 $19.081.00 63.30
Group It Hybrid Sport Utility
Vehicles (SUVs} Compact Size §27,771.62 70.00 No Bld 0.00 NoBld 0.00 No Bid 0.00
Misize No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bl 0.00 No Bid 0.00
Group IV: Hybrlds Other Hybrid Vehiclas No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 $124,670.00 70,00 No Bid 0.00
Other Hybrid Vehicles No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 $46,485.00 70.00
Other Hybild Vehicles * No Bld 0.00 No Bld ' 0.00 No Bid 0.00 §35,294.00 70.00
TOTAL POINTS 70
Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service
Number of employees daalsrship ’ .
amploys locally (5%) 36 1.80 71 3,55 48 245 100 , 8.00
Number of faclory tralned and cerlified
by )
! responsible for service and .
malntenance of the vehcies offered In | Number of lechniclans - Number of technicians - Number of techniclans - Nurnber of echnicians ~
. bld (5%) a2, 5 11 0.07 2 0 12 1.88
. Average lum around time for dealership| :
responsible for warrenty repairs based
on paris on hang (5%) 1 day 4 1.6 hours 5 24 hours 4 1.6-2days 3
Approximate dollar value of on-hand  Value of parts invenlory - Value of parts inventory-| Value of paris invantory Value of parts inventory,
parts invenlory (5%) 830,000 4 $500,000 2 $1.2 Million 5 $600,000 3
‘
Referances (6%) Yas 8 Yes ] No 0 Yas 3
(# polntsipercent max) 25 20 1€ 12 16
Past Relafionship/Performance with the City
(# pointsipercent max) 5 5 0 5 ~ 5
GRAND TOTAL 100
(100 points/percent mex)
Groub i: Hybrid Automibiles Compact Sedan, 4 Door 24,8l 15.62 16.76 20,88
B 15.62 16.78 o0.88
Group II: Pickup Trucks 15.62 16.76 80.11
84.92 - 16.76 84.45
.%asls_gj 16.76 84.17
Group lll: Hybrid SUV's 15.62 20.88
15,62 20.88
Group IV: Hybrids 24.80 15.62
24,80 18,62
24,80 15.62




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION.

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010

s

GROUP I - HYBRID AUTOMOBILES

: ] BID # 2010-094
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CASA FORD INC.

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 50 PER YEAR) s
ITEM ' - DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN, 4-DOOR NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NO.
2. MIDSIZE SEDAN, 4-DOOR $25,385.92 NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2010 FORD
- [MODEL NoO. FUSION HYBRID
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING ‘ :
(GROUP | - AUTOMOBILES, ITEMS 1 - 2) COMPACT SIZE MIDSIZE COMPACT SIZE MIDSIZE
POWER SEATS NO BID STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH v STD
GROUP il: PICKUP TRUCKS . - o -
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) = -
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT REGULAR CAB $14,494.38 NO BID
YEARIMAKE 2010 FORD
MODEL NO. RANGER XL
2. COMPACT EXTENDED CAB - $14,693.38 $14,842.00
YEAR/MAKE 2010 FORD 2010 DODGE DAKOTA .
MODEL NO. RANGER SUPERCAB XL 4X2 BIGHORN/LONESTAR
3. COMPACT 4 DOOR CREW CAB $20,916.38 $17,236.00
YEARIMAKE 2010 FORD 2010 DODGE DAKOTA
MODEL NO. EXPLORER SPORT RAC 4X2 BIGHORN/LONESTAR

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED éY: %ﬂ
DATE: 3//Q [ /o

2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS : v BID # 2010-149)
BID DATE: MARCH 10 2010 : DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CASA FORD INC. MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING REGULAR | EXTENDED CREW REGULAR | EXTENDED CREW
(GROUP Il - PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 1 - 3) CAB CAB CAB CAB CAB CAB
POWER WINDOWS - $314.92 $314.92 STD NONE STATED STD STD
(DRIVER SEAT ONLY)
POWER SEATS N/A : N/A N/A NONESTATED |  $320.00 $320.00
POWER LOCKS . $265.00 $265.00 .- STD NONE STATED STD "STD
POWER MIRRORS , ' N/A N/A ., STD NONE STATED STD STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $320.00 $320.00 © STD NONE STATED STD STD 4
4WD N/IA $2,518.00 $2,386.00 NONE STATED | $4,250.00 | $2,950.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS N/A N/A STD NONE STATED STD STD
INTEGRATED/FITTED BED CAP ' $919.00 $919.00 - N/A NONE STATED | $1,050.00 | $1,050.00
ROLL TOP BED COVER $865.00 $865.00 N/A NONE STATED | $924.00 $924.00
FULL BED WIDTH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 13" DEEP $260.15 $260.15 N/A NONE STATED | $294.00 $294
GROUP ill: HYBRID SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES (SUVs) = - i o '

(APPROXIMATELY 20 PER YEAR) -

1. COMPACT SIZE $27,771.92 , NO BID
YEAR/MAKE ' 2010 FORD
MODEL NO. ESCAPE HYBRID
2. MIDSIZE - . , ) _ R ‘NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE NO BID } : : T
MODEL NO. Z
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING . i
D P ZE MIDSIZE
(GROUP I, SUVs, ITEMS 1. 2) COMPACT SIZE MIDSIZE COMPACT Sl siz
POWER SEATS STD NOBID -
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL ] STD 4
HITCH ' N/A
- TOWING PACKAGE W/7 PIN ELECTRICAL N/A - ¥
WD $1,540.00 NO BID

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

. . ~
APPROVED BY: ;m . '

oate:_2 /b [ /0 _ 2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS BID # 2010-149
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010 : , . DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
e
" CASA FORD INC. MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP
GROUP IV: HYBRIDS - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 5 PER YEAR) ‘
ITEM DESCRIPTION 'UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1.  OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) NO BID 'NO BID
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NO.
2. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) NOBID |
YEAR/MAKE ‘
MODEL NO.
3. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) NO BID
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NO. : M
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING '
OTHER OTHER
(GROUP IV, HYBRIDS, ITEMS 1- 5C) ) : ) .
POWER SEATS NONE STATED
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NONE STATED
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH NONE STATED

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. S o

APPROVED BY: %’é’

DATE: ‘3//4 /lo

2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION(S), TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR

WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

A. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF

FOR MODEL YEAR 2012 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

|B. VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2013 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

C. VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2014 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

PAYMENT TERMS:

BID # 2010-149
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CASA FORD INC.
EL. PASO, TX .

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP
EL PASO, TX

THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE

YES| X

YES| X

YES| X

NO

NO

"NO

YES  NO [X

YES NO | X

YES NO | X

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS N

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER PROMISED DELIVERY:

ves [ ]

vo [X]

YES no [ ] 1

Within consecutive calendar days.

120

JIF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID,

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: %f—
DATE: 3(/ ¢/l

2010-0:94 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES BID # 2010-094
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010 : ‘ DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
- - MHC KENWORTH STERLING EL PASO - RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
GROUP | - HYBRID AUTOMOBILES o EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 50 PER YEAR) ‘
ITEM DESCRIPTION : UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN, 4-DOOR . NOBID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NO.
2. MIDSIZE SEDAN, 4-DOOR NO BID ' $24,799.00
YEAR/MAKE . ‘ 2010 CHEV
MODEL NO. ) MALIBU 1ZF69
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING ' "
(GROUP | - AUTOMOBILES, ITEMS 1 - 2) COMPACT. SIZE MIDSIZE COMPACT SIZE MIDSIZE
POWER SEATS STD STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD STD
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD STD
GROUP II: PICKUP TRUCKS :
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) =
ITEM DESGRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. V COMPACT REGULAR CAB , NO BID $14,655.00
- [YEAR/MAKE R : 2010 CHEV
|mobEL NoO. ' . -~ COLORADO CS15403
2. _ COMPACT EXTENDED CAB NO BID $16,178.00 N
YEARIMAKE ‘ l 2010 CHEV
IMODEL No. . COLORADO CS15653
3. ’ COMPACT 4 DOOR CREW CAB . NOBID $19,061.00
YEAR/MAKE . ‘ 2010 CHEV
MODEL NO. , COLORADO CS15643

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: %Ié-

paTE:_3//6 /10 . 2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BIDTTEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010

‘DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2010-149]

MHC KENWORTH STERLING EL PASO

EL PASO, TX
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING REGULAR | EXTENDED CREW
(GROUP II - COMPACT PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 1 - 3) cAB CAB CAB
POWER WINDOWS )
POWER LOCKS

POWER MIRRORS

CRUISE CONTROLITILT WHEEL

4WD

FRONT BUCKET SEATS

INTEGRATED/FITTED BED CAP

ROLL TOP BED COVER

FULL BED WIDTH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 13" DEEP

GROUP lil: HYBRID SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES (SUVs)
(APPROXIMATELY 20 PER YEAR)

R COMPACT SIZE

YEAR/MAKE

NO BID

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

EL PASO, TX
REGULAR EXTENDED CREW
CAB CAB CAB
$675.00 PKG SAME STD
N/A SAME N/A
PKG SAME STD
PKG SAME STD
STD SAME STD
$3,260.00 $3,070.00 $3,330.00
N/A SAME N/A
$972.00 $972.00 $972.00
$965.00 $965.00 $965.00
$310.00 $310.00

NO BID

JMODEL NoO.

2. MIDSIZE

YEAR/MAKE

NO BID

NO BID -

IMODEL NO. .

OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING
{(GROUP III, SUVSs, ITEMS 1 - 2)

COMPACT SIZE

MIDSIZE

COMPACT SIZE

i

MIDSIZE

POWER SEATS

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL

HITCH

TOWING PACKAGE W/7 PIN ELECTRICAL

4WD

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: /\sz
DATE:__ P/, /0

2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




- CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

‘|BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS ' BID # 2010-149
BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010 ' ’ ) DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

MHC KENWORTH STERLiNG EL PASO ) RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
GROUP IV: HYBRIDS , EL PASO, TX _ EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 5 PER YEAR)
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. ' OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) $124,670.00 $46,485.00
YEAR/MAKE 2011 KENWORTH 2010 CHEV
MODEL NO. T370 CAB & CHASSIS TAHOE CC10706
2. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) NONE STATED $35,294.00
YEARIMAKE NONE STATED 2010 CHEV ‘
MODEL NO. - NONE STATED SILVERADO CREW CC10543
3. OTHER HYBRIb VEHICLE (IF REQUIRED) NONE STATED NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE NONE STATED
MODEL NO. - NONE STATED 7
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING  OTHER - ' - OTHER
(GROUP IV, HYBRIDS, ITEMS 1- 5C) -
POWER SEATS o NONE STATED STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NONE STATED ) STD
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH NONE STATED STD

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. o

APPROVED BY: (%ﬂ/

DATE: 3/l /1o ' 7 '

~ 2010-094 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: FLEET VEHICLES - TRUCKS AND VANS

BID DATE: MARCH 10, 2010

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION(S), TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

A. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2012 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

B. VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2013 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

C. VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2014 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

BID # 2010-149

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

MHC KENWORTH STERLING EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
EL PASO, TX

YES NO | X

YES NO | X

YES NO | X

'YES NO [X

YES NO | X

YESE NO | X

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER PROMISED DELIVERY:

ves [ | no[ |  NONESTATED

e[ ] o

Within _____ consecutive calendar days.

120

60 - 90

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

[BIDS SOLICITED: 30

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

BIDS LOCAL: 18

NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: M

DATE: 3/ / Q / 20 2010-0;)4 FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




DICK POE CHRYSLER
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SUNLAND PARK
PONTIAC BUICK GMC
955 CROCKETT WAY
EL PASO, TX 79922

HOY FOX AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
7230 VISCOUNT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MACK MASSEY MOTORS
950 CROCKETT STREET
EL PASO, TX 79922

DRIVEWAY DODGE
8434 GATEWAY BLVD. E
EL PASO, TX 79907

ASMAR TRUCK EQUIPMENT
7713 ALAMEDA AVENUE
“EL PASO, TX 79915

JACK KEY MOTORS
1840 N. MAIN
LAS CRUCES, NM 88001

BORMAN MOTOR COMPANY
470 W. BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM. 88005

MAXWELL AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
P. 0. BOX 1004 '
TAYLOR, TX 76574

VILLAGE AUTO GROUP
2101 COUNTRY DELL
GARLAND, TX 75040

DICK POE DEALERSHIPS
1363 AIRWAY BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MISSION CHEVROLET
1316 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

RUDOLPH AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
ATTN: MIKE RUFFIN

5625 S. DESERT

EL PASO, TX 79932

BRAVO CHEVROLET
CADILLAC HUMMER
6555 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EL PASO HONDA
1490 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

ENTERPRISE RENT-A-CAR
ATTN: JENNIFER JENNINGS
4115 N. MESA .

" EL PASO, TX 79902

WALLACE CHEVROLET. .
SOUTH MAIN & BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

SANDOVAL DODGE
ATTN: RUDY SANDOVAL
P. 0. BOX 608

LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

LAWRENCE MARSHALL
CHEVROLET

P.0.BOX 983
HEMPSTEAD, TX 77445

GRANDE TRUCK SALES
11215 N. WEIDER ROAD
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78220

MIDWAY CHEVROLET
5915 MONTANA AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79925

SHAMLALEY FORD

- . 11301 GATEWAY BLVD. W

EL PASO, TX 79936

- CASAFORD

ATTN: RICK KENLEY
5815 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

TRAVIS CRAWFORD BUICK
6800 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

 EXPRESSWAY FORD

5550 N. DESERT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79912

FABCO INDUSTRIES INC.
8406 SPRAGUE ROAD
ODESSA, TX 79764

~ SISBARRO BUICK, PONTIAC

425 W. BOUTZ ROAD
LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

VISION FORD LINCOLN-
MERCURY

1500 S. WHITE SANDS BLVD.
ALAMOGORDO, N 88310,

LAWRENCE MARSHALL
'DEALERSHIPS

P. 0. BOX 11541
AUSTIN, TX 78711-1541

ON THE BORDER
FREIGHTLINER

ATTN: SABIO GARCIA
1367 N. HORIZON BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79928




