

CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: Library

AGENDA DATE: ~~To be determined by Purchasing~~ 6/13/06 BC

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Carmen Arrieta-Candelaria, Director of Financial Services, X-4293

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: 5

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include \$ amount if applicable.

Award Group II of Bid #2006-069, the Library Shelving and Furniture for the Eastside Regional Library. This group is for the furniture portion of the bid.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of this action? What are the citizen concerns?

See attached memo the award amount and vendor.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes – furniture and shelving for the Lower Valley Library and the Main Library

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

Funds for this bid are under 31130562-508009-60003-PPW0056005YR2 – Eastside Regional Library

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A

*****REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION*****

LEGAL: (if required) _____ **FINANCE:** (if required) _____

DEPARTMENT HEAD: Carol A. Grey-Cassano
(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: _____ DATE: _____

DATE: June 1, 2006

TO: Municipal Clerk

FROM: Terrence Freiburg 
Deputy Director for Financial Services, ext.4308

THRU: Aurora Wells
Bid Clerk ext. 4038

Please place the following item on the **CONSENT** agenda for the Council Meeting of **JUNE 13, 2006**.

Item should read as follows:

Solicitation No. 2006-069 Library Shelving and Furniture for Eastside Regional Library
Award to: Vendor 1: Libra-Tech Corporation
Argyle, Texas

Items: Group II, #2: Qty 1 @ \$1,279.50/each
Group II, #3: Qty 1 @ \$841.22/each
Group II, #4A: Qty 3 @ \$835.51/each
Group II, #4B: Qty 2 @ \$966.31/each
Group II, #5: Qty 6 @ \$245.71/each
Group II, #6 Qty 13 @ \$302.38/each
Group II, #7A: Qty 12 @ \$252.50/each
Group II, #7B: Qty 8 @ \$228.72/each
Group II, #14: Qty 2 @ \$2,714.74/each
Amount: \$22,254.31

Vendor 2: El Paso Automated Office & Industrial Systems, Inc.
El Paso, Texas

Items: Group II, #8A: Qty 5 @ \$879.00/each
Group II, #8B: Qty 1 @ \$899.00/each
Group II, #9A: Qty 4 @ \$879.00/each
Group II, #9B: Qty 2 @ \$899.00/each
Group II, #23: Qty 1 @ \$2,980.00/each
Amount: \$13,588.00

Vendor 3: Rio Grande BPSI
El Paso, Texas

Items: Group II, #28: Qty 55 @ \$337.64/each
Group II, #29: Qty 11 @ \$406.64/each
Group II, #30: Qty 8 @ \$406.64/each
Group II, #31: Qty 2 @ \$569.94/each
Group II, #32: Qty 6 @ \$618.54/each
Group II, #33: Qty 6 @ \$345.92/each
Group II, #34: Qty 12 @ \$113.28/each
Group II, #35A: Qty 100 @ \$113.28/each
Group II, #35B: Qty 6 @ \$189.12/each
Amount: \$47,045.08

The Library and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive offerors meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Award for Group I, Library Shelving, was approved by Council on May 2, 2006. Offers for Group II, Furniture, were still under review at that time. This award is for Group II, Furniture.

This is a fixed-price, single (one-time) purchase, to purchase library furniture. Vendor No. 1 offers options to purchase up to one hundred percent (100%) of the original contract quantities, at the same unit prices, if the options are exercised within sixty (60), ninety (90) and/or one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of award of the contract; Vendor No. 2 offers no option to purchase additional quantities; and Vendor No. 3 offers an option to purchase up to one hundred percent (100%) of the original contract quantities, at the same unit prices, if the option is exercised within one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of award of the contract. No prompt payment discounts are offered.

<u>Department:</u>	<u>Library</u>
<u>Funds available:</u>	<u>31130562-508009-60003-PPW0056005YR2</u>
<u>Funding source:</u>	<u>Furniture and Fixtures, Library Facility 01 issue CP, Eastside Regional Library</u>
<u>Total award:</u>	<u>\$82,887.39</u>
<u>District (s):</u>	<u>5</u>

Contact person: Barbara Crumley, Procurement Analyst at 541-4315.

AGENDA FOR: **JUNE 13, 2006**

PROJECT FORM

DATE: May 31, 2006

PROJECT: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY
SOLICITATION NO: 2006-069 DEPARTMENT: Library
BUDGET NO: 31130562-508009-60003-PPW0056005YR2
FUNDING SOURCE: FURNITURE & FIXTURES, LIBRARY FACILITY 01 ISSUE CP, EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): 5

RECOMMENDATION: Vendor (1): Libra-Tech Corporation
Argyle, Texas
Items: Group II, #2: Qty 1 @ \$1,279.50/each
Group II, #3: Qty 1 @ \$841.22/each
Group II, #4A: Qty 3 @ \$835.51/each
Group II, #4B: Qty 2 @ \$966.31/each
Group II, #5: Qty 6 @ \$245.71/each
Group II, #6 Qty 13 @ \$302.38/each
Group II, #7A: Qty 12 @ \$252.50/each
Group II, #7B: Qty 8 @ \$228.72/each
Group II, #14: Qty 2 @ \$2,714.74/each
Amount: \$22,254.31

Vendor (2): El Paso Automated Office & Industrial Systems, Inc.
El Paso, Texas
Items: Group II, #8A: Qty 5 @ \$879.00/each
Group II, #8B: Qty 1 @ \$899.00/each
Group II, #9A: Qty 4 @ \$879.00/each
Group II, #9B: Qty 2 @ \$899.00/each
Group II, #23: Qty 1 @ \$2,980.00/each
Amount: \$13,588.00

Vendor (3): Rio Grande BPSI
El Paso, Texas
Items: Group II, #28: Qty 55 @ \$337.64/each
Group II, #29: Qty 11 @ \$406.64/each
Group II, #30: Qty 8 @ \$406.64/each
Group II, #31: Qty 2 @ \$569.94/each
Group II, #32: Qty 6 @ \$618.54/each
Group II, #33: Qty 6 @ \$345.92/each
Group II, #34: Qty 12 @ \$113.28/each
Group II, #35A: Qty 100 @ \$113.28/each
Group II, #35B: Qty 6 @ \$189.12/each
Amount: \$47,045.08

The Library and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive offerors meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

EL PASO PUBLIC LIBRARY

MEMORANDUM

TO: Barbara Crumley, Procurement Analyst
Financial Services -Purchasing Division

FROM: Carol A. Brey-Casiano, Director of Libraries *CAB*

SUBJECT: Bid # 2006-069

DATE: May 31, 2006

I would like to make the following recommendations for Bid #2006-069, Library Shelving and Furniture for Eastside Regional Library

Group II – Library Furniture

We are making the following awards based on low bids in each case.

I would like to recommend that *Libra-Tech Corporation* be awarded:

- Item #2 – Reading Tables – (\$1,279.50)
- Item #3 Reading Tables – (\$841.22)
- Item #4A – Children’s Table (29”) – 3 tables only (\$2,506.53)
- Item #4B – Children’s Tables (22”) – (\$1,932.62)
- Item #5 – Children’s Chair – 6 chairs only – (\$1,474.26)
- Item #6 – Adult Reading Chair – 13 chairs only (\$3,930.94)
- Item #7A – Children’s Chair (18”) – 12 chairs only – (\$3,030.00)
- Item #7B – Children’s Chair (16-1/2’) – (\$1,829.76)
- Item #14 – “W” Shaped Display Unit – (\$5,429.48)

Total cost for award to Libra-Tech is \$22,254.31

In the specifications for Items 2 and 3, the Library requested rectangular reading tables with Kestrel style legs. Item 6, is the Kestrel Style Side Chairs that go with these tables. The manufacturer for these tables and chairs is TMC, The Midlands Corporation. The wood finish for both the tabletop surface and the chairs is Tuscany 18. These reading tables and chairs are scheduled to be placed in the Study Rooms at the library.

El Paso Automated Office and Industrial Systems submitted a bid for items 2 and 3 (the reading tables) lower than the bid submitted by Libra-Tech Corporation. The manufacturer for the tables is Worden. We have requested a picture of the tables from El Paso Automated Office so that we could determine if the tables would have the Kestrel style legs that were specified in the bid. We also requested a wood sample so that we could determine if Worden could match the wood finish

on the tables to match the chairs that were being purchased from TMC. El Paso Automated was not able to comply with our request.

The Library recommends that Libra-Tech Corporation be awarded the bid for the tables and chairs with Kestrel style legs. Libra Tech's bid for the two reading tables and thirteen chairs totals \$6,051.66. The bid from El Paso Automated for these items is \$7,335.00. We believe that the styling of the legs and colors of the wood stain will not match since the tables and chairs would be produced by different manufacturers.

I would like to recommend that *El Paso Automated Office & Industrial Systems Inc.* be awarded:

- Item #8A – Chair with Tablet arm – (\$4,395.00)
- Item #8B – Chair with Tablet arm – (\$899.00)
- Item #9A – Chair with Tablet arm – (\$3,516.00)
- Item #9B – Chair with Tablet arm – (\$1,798.00)
- Item #23 – Lectern w/Integral Sound System – (\$2,980.00) – we would like to change the color to Natural Cherry

Total cost for award to El Paso Automated is \$13,588.00

I would like to recommend that *Rio Grande BPSI* be awarded:

- Item #28 – Armless Swivel – (\$18,570.20)
- Item #29 – Task Chair w/ Arms – (\$4,473.04)
- Item #30 – Task Chairs w/ Arms – (\$3,253.12)
- Item #31 – Work Chairs w/Arms – (\$1,139.88)
- Item #32 – Stools w/Arms – (\$3,711.24)
- Item #33 – Guest Chairs w/Arms – (\$2,075.52)
- Item #34 – Stackable Chairs – (\$1,359.36)
- Item #35A – Stack Chairs w/Carts – 100 chairs only (\$11,328.00)
- Item #35B – Carts for Stack Chairs – (\$1,134.72)

Brown Interiors was low bidder on Item Nos. 30, 31, 32 and 33 but they submitted a bid on a different style of chair (Knoll) than the bid from Rio Grande (Herman Miller). The Library would like only one style of chair throughout this new building for improved appearance and easier maintenance. The total chair bid from Brown Interior is \$63,056.06. The total chair bid from Rio Grande is \$47,045.08; therefore I recommend that they be awarded the bid.

Total cost for award to Rio Grande BPSI is \$47,045.08.

The total award for Group II –Furniture is \$82,887.39

The following items will be deleted from Bid #2006-069:

- Item #1 Rectangular Reading Tables
- Item #10 – Low Occasional Tables
- Item #11 – Low Occasional Table
- Item #12 – Club Chair with arms
- Item #13 – Recliner
- Item #15 – Computer Workstation

- Item #16 – Computer Workstations (ADA Compliant)
- Item #17 – Computer Workstation
- Item #18 – Computer Workstation
- Item #19 – Depressible Book Return Cart
- Item #20 – Book Trucks (w/ 3 flat Shelves)
- Item #21 – Lounge Table
- Item #22 – Adjustable Folding Tables
- Item #24 – Five-Tier Literature Rack
- Item #25 – Children’s Lounge Furniture
- Item #26 – Adult Lounge Furniture
- Item #27 – Curio Cabinet

These items will be purchased through state contracts.

Funding for this bid is:

- Department ID – 31130562
- Account – 508009
- Fund – 60003
- Project – PPW0056005YR2

Requisition 2006001751

The district that will benefit from this award will be District 5.

If you need additional information please call me at 541-4098 or Grace Sanchez at 541-4943.
Thank you.

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
GROUP I: SHELVING											
1.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/10" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 16A)		NO BID	\$1,095.00	\$1,095.00	\$735.39	\$735.39	\$624.00	\$624.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTION		L903620		
2.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/10" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 16B)		NO BID	\$1,569.00	\$1,569.00	\$1,071.78	\$1,071.78	\$936.00	\$936.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTION		L903620		
3.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/10" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 16C)		NO BID	\$2,549.00	\$5,098.00	\$1,744.56	\$3,489.12	\$1,560.00	\$3,120.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903620		
4.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/10" DEEP SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 16D)		NO BID	\$3,038.00	\$6,076.00	\$2,080.95	\$4,161.90	\$1,872.00	\$3,744.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903620		
	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/10" DEEP SHELVES, 21' RANGE (ITEM CODE 16E)		NO BID	\$3,528.00	\$3,528.00	\$2,417.34	\$2,417.34	\$2,184.00	\$2,184.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903620		
5.	14 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 90"H X 20"W (ITEM CODE 16F)		NO BID	\$499.00	\$6,986.00	\$696.52	\$9,751.28	\$952.00	\$13,328.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9020		HEPC249620		LD9020EPFL		

APPROVED BY: 
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY				BID # 2006-069						
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006				DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY						
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX	
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
7.	5 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17A)		NO BID	\$1,709.00	\$8,545.00	\$1,129.19	\$5,645.95	\$1,005.00	\$5,025.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	
8.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 12' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17B)		NO BID	\$2,188.00	\$2,188.00	\$1,484.37	\$1,484.37	\$1,340.00	\$1,340.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	
9.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17C)		NO BID	\$2,772.00	\$8,316.00	\$1,839.55	\$5,518.65	\$1,675.00	\$5,025.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	
10.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17D)		NO BID	\$3,309.00	\$9,927.00	\$2,194.73	\$6,584.19	\$2,010.00	\$6,030.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	
11.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17E)		NO BID	\$3,946.00	\$3,946.00	\$2,905.09	\$2,905.09	\$2,680.00	\$2,680.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	
12.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 27' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17F)		NO BID	\$4,913.00	\$9,826.00	\$3,260.27	\$6,520.54	\$3,015.00	\$6,030.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903624FB	

APPROVED BY: *POC*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
13.	25 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 90"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 17G)		NO BID	\$519.00	\$12,975.00	\$696.52	\$17,413.00	\$1,025.00	\$25,625.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		BI3LOMODEL		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9022		SEE EXCEPTIONS		LD9022EPFL		
14.	3 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 90"H X 22"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM 17G-1)		NO BID	\$419.00	\$1,257.00	\$400.19	\$1,200.57	\$823.00	\$2,469.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9023		HI:PP249620		LD9022EPP		
15.	4 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 3' RANGE (ITEM CODE 18A)		NO BID	\$998.00	\$3,992.00	\$571.33	\$2,285.32	\$241.00	\$964.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L663624FB		
16.	1 EACH	BOX FILLER 66"H X 22"D X 22"W (ITEM CODE 18B)		NO BID	\$385.00	\$385.00	\$172.46	\$172.46	\$180.00	\$180.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		CF662222		
17.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE W/PAPERBACK SHELVES (ITEM CODE 18C)		NO BID	\$2,328.15	\$4,656.30	\$1,759.37	\$3,518.74	\$1,205.00	\$2,410.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L6636A-LP2A-F3611BSA		
18.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18" RANGE (ITEM CODE 18D)		NO BID	\$2,948.00	\$2,948.00	\$3,155.63	\$3,155.63	\$1,446.00	\$1,446.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L663624FB		

APPROVED BY: *BSC*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
19.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 21' RANGE (ITEM CODE 18E)		NO BID	\$3,389.00	\$6,778.00	\$3,672.49	\$7,344.98	\$1,687.00	\$3,374.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L663624FB		
20.	10 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 22" W (ITEM CODE 18F)		NO BID	\$429.00	\$4,290.00	\$618.81	\$6,188.10	\$893.00	\$8,930.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9024		HEPC247220		LD6622EPFL		
21.	4 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 18F-1)		NO BID	\$449.00	\$1,796.00	\$618.81	\$2,475.24	\$893.00	\$3,572.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9025		HEPC247220		LD6622EPFL		
22.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 42"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 19A)		NO BID	\$889.00	\$2,667.00	\$534.64	\$1,603.92	\$504.00	\$1,512.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L423624FB		
23.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 42"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 19A-1)		NO BID	\$1,709.00	\$5,127.00	\$1,018.30	\$3,054.90	\$1,008.00	\$3,024.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BI3LOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L423624FB		
24.	5 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 42"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 19B)		NO BID	\$369.00	\$1,845.00	\$549.81	\$2,749.05	\$670.00	\$3,350.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9026		HEPC244820		LD4222EPFL		

APPROVED BY: BC
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
25.	4 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 42"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 19B-1)		NO BID	\$379.00	\$1,516.00	\$549.81	\$2,199.24	\$670.00	\$2,680.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9027		HIEPC244820		LD4222EPFL		
26.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20A)		NO BID	\$697.00	\$697.00	\$454.41	\$454.41	\$392.00	\$392.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		
27.	3 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20B)		NO BID	\$699.00	\$2,097.00	\$454.41	\$1,363.23	\$392.00	\$1,176.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		
28.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20C)		NO BID	\$1,048.00	\$1,048.00	\$655.33	\$655.33	\$588.00	\$588.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		
29.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 21' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20D)		NO BID	\$2,340.00	\$2,340.00	\$1,459.01	\$1,459.01	\$1,372.00	\$1,372.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		
30.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20E)		NO BID	\$2,711.00	\$2,711.00	\$1,860.85	\$1,860.85	\$1,568.00	\$1,568.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		

APPROVED BY: BC
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
31.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 33' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20F)		NO BID	\$3,632.00	\$3,632.00	\$2,262.69	\$2,262.69	\$2,156.00	\$2,156.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L903612FB		
32.	10 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 90"H X 13"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 20G)		NO BID	\$279.00	\$2,790.00	\$365.33	\$3,653.30	\$638.00	\$6,380.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9028		HEPP189620		LD9013EPP		
33.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL HINGED PERIODICAL SHELVING UNIT 71"H X 24"W X 14 1/2"D, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 21A)		NO BID	\$640.00	\$640.00	\$670.83	\$670.83	\$496.00	\$496.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		LPH78-5		
34.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIA SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22A)		NO BID	\$2,265.00	\$2,265.00	\$2,773.88	\$2,773.88	\$1,185.00	\$1,185.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L9036A; FS3608MSA; F3608MSBA		
35.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIAL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22B)		NO BID	\$4,450.00	\$4,450.00	\$4,408.64	\$4,408.64	\$1,896.00	\$1,896.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L9036A; FS3608MSA; F3608MSBA		
36.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIA SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 27' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22C)		NO BID	\$5,277.00	\$5,277.00	\$4,953.56	\$4,953.56	\$2,133.00	\$2,133.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L9036A; FS3608MSA; F3608MSBA		

APPROVED BY: BC
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
37.	6 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 90"H X 10"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 22D)		NO BID	\$229.00	\$1,374.00	\$331.19	\$1,987.14	\$599.00	\$3,594.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		HEPP129620		LD9010EPP		
38.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP SLOPING AND FLAT SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 23A)		NO BID	\$3,443.00	\$3,443.00	\$2,205.16	\$2,205.16	\$1,308.00	\$1,308.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L9036A-LS3610UDA LS3612A-L3612UDBSA		
39.	2 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP SLOPING AND FLAT SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 23B)		NO BID	\$2,865.00	\$5,730.00	\$1,845.96	\$3,691.92	\$1,090.00	\$2,180.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L9036A-LS3610UDA LS3612A-L3612UDBSA		
40.	4 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 90"H X 10"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 23C)		NO BID	\$279.00	\$1,116.00	\$331.19	\$1,324.76	\$599.00	\$2,396.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9030		HEPP129620		L09010EPP		
41.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL PAPERBACK SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 10" DEEP BASE W/9" DEEP SLOPED ADJUSTABLE DIVIDER SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 24A)		NO BID	\$1,950.00	\$1,950.00	\$1,251.00	\$1,251.00	\$483.00	\$483.00	
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL		
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L6636A; LS3610A; F3611BSA		
42.	2 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 10"W (ITEM CODE 24B)		NO BID	\$376.00	\$752.00	\$538.19	\$1,076.38	\$645.00	\$1,290.00	
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD		
PART NUMBER					X11-9031		HEPC127220		LD6610EPFL		

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY							BID # 2006-069			
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006							DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY			
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX	
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
43.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25A)		NO BID	\$580.00	\$580.00	\$359.38	\$359.38	\$396.00	\$396.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L6636A; LS3616A; L3616BSA	
44.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25B)		NO BID	\$1,450.00	\$1,450.00	\$1,101.30	\$1,101.30	\$990.00	\$990.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L6636A; LS3616A; L3616BSA	
45.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 33' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25C)		NO BID	\$3,190.00	\$3,190.00	\$1,768.42	\$1,768.42	\$2,178.00	\$2,178.00
MANUFACTURER					MJ 3000		BIBLOMODEL		MONTEL	
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED		SEE EXCEPTIONS		L6636A; LS3616A; L3616BSA	
46.	6 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 13"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 25D)		NO BID	\$349.00	\$2,094.00	\$329.76	\$1,978.56	\$747.00	\$4,482.00
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE		MBD	
PART NUMBER					X11-9032		HEPP187220		LD6613EPP	
TOTAL GROUP I, ITEMS 1 - 46:			NO BID		\$166,958.30		\$144,906.50		\$148,241.00	

APPROVED BY: BC

DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
GROUP II: FURNITURE											
1.	5 EACH	RECTANGULAR READING TABLE (ITEM CODE 1)		NO BID	\$1,869.00	\$9,345.00	\$2,394.56	\$11,972.80			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					DDD-TABLE		TTR3672V				
2.	1 EACH	READING TABLE (ITEM CODE 2)		NO BID	\$929.00	\$929.00	\$1,279.50	\$1,279.50			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					DDD-TABLE		XTBL				
3.	1 EACH	READING TABLE (ITEM CODE 2A)		NO BID	\$829.00	\$829.00	\$841.22	\$841.22			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					DDD-TABLE		TR3660V20				
4A.	5 EACH	CHILDREN'S TABLE @ 29" HEIGHT (ITEM CODE 3)		NO BID	\$979.00	\$4,895.00	\$835.51	\$4,177.55			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					DDD-TABLE		TC48V10				
3.	2 EACH	CHILDREN'S TABLE @ 22" HEIGHT (ITEM CODE 3)		NO BID	\$979.00	\$1,958.00	\$966.31	\$1,932.62			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					DDD-TABLE		ZTBL-48V15				
5.	10 EACH	CHILDREN'S CHAIR (ITEM CODE 5)		NO BID	\$359.00	\$3,590.00	\$245.71	\$2,457.10			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN		TMC FURNITURE				
PART NUMBER					MBZ00N-16.5		SLO11316				

APPROVED BY: bc
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY								BID # 2006-069		
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006								DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY		
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX	
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
9B.	2 EACH	CHAIR WITH TABLET ARM, LEFT FACING (ITEM CODE 9A)		NO BID	\$899.00	\$1,798.00	NO BID	NO BID		
MANUFACTURER					BRAYTON					
PART NUMBER					2102					
10.	5 EACH	LOW OCCASIONAL TABLE (ITEM CODE 10)		NO BID	\$680.00	\$3,400.00	NO BID	NO BID		
MANUFACTURER					DARRAN					
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED					
11.	1 EACH	LOW OCCASIONAL TABLE (ITEM CODE 10A)		NO BID	\$990.00	\$990.00	NO BID	NO BID		
MANUFACTURER					DARRAN					
PART NUMBER					AS SPECIFIED					
12.	6 EACH	CLUB CHAIR WITH ARMS (ITEM CODE 11)		NO BID	\$1,349.00	\$8,094.00	\$1,172.14	\$7,032.84		
MANUFACTURER							TMC FURNITURE			
PART NUMBER							SAL11118			
13.	3 EACH	RECLINER (ITEM CODE 11A)	\$1,381.10	\$4,143.30	\$1,299.00	\$3,897.00	NO BID	NO BID		
MANUFACTURER			LA-Z-BOY		LA-Z-BOY					
PART NUMBER			BEXR10		BEXR10					
14.	2 EACH	"W" SHAPED DISPLAY UNIT (ITEM CODE 12)		NO BID	N/B	N/B	\$2,714.74	\$5,429.48		
MANUFACTURER							BCI-TOTALIBRA			
PART NUMBER							50096000			

APPROVED BY: 

DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
15.	5 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION W/RETROFIT KIT (ITEM CODE 13)		NO BID	\$1,549.00	\$7,745.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					TOLEDO						
PART NUMBER					STES42.32.29						
16.	3 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION, ADA COMPLIANT (ITEM CODE 13A)		NO BID	\$1,219.00	\$3,657.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					TOLEDO						
PART NUMBER					STES60.30.29						
17.	14 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION (ITEM CODE 13B)		NO BID	\$649.00	\$9,086.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					TOLEDO						
PART NUMBER					STCA60.30.29.1						
18.	3 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION (ITEM CODE 13C)		NO BID	\$1,079.00	\$3,237.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					TOLEDO						
PART NUMBER					STEA30.30.27.1						
19.	2 EACH	DEPRESSIBLE BOOK RETURN CART (ITEM CODE 14)		NO BID	\$1,466.00	\$2,932.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					WORDEN						
PART NUMBER					T-320-DBT-R						
20.	15 EACH	BOOK RETURN W/3 FLAT SHELVES (ITEM CODE 15)		NO BID	\$519.00	\$7,785.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					DEMCO						
PART NUMBER					GH-6385-6S						

APPROVED BY: BJC
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			BROWN INTERIOR SOLUTIONS EL PASO, TX		EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE & INDUSTRIAL SYSTEMS, INC. EL PASO, TX		LIBRA-TECH CORPORATION ARGYLE, TX		LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC. HOUSTON, TX		
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
27.	1 EACH	CURIO CABINET (ITEM CODE 45)		NO BID	\$3,295.00	\$3,295.00	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER					PETER PEPPER						
PART NUMBER					USZ-B-367218						
28.	55 EACH	ARMLESS SWIVEL CHAIR (ITEM CODE 7)	\$565.27	\$31,089.85	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER			KNOLL								
PART NUMBER			55H3-3-A5K-GH								
29.	11 EACH	TASK CHAIR WITH ARMS (ITEM CODE 29)	\$565.27	\$6,217.97	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER			KNOLL								
PART NUMBER			55H3-3-A5K-GH								
30.	8 EACH	TASK CHAIR W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 29A)	\$363.75	\$2,910.00	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER			KNOLL								
PART NUMBER			33AA1BKTSXHC								
31.	2 EACH	WORK CHAIR W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 30)	\$363.75	\$727.50	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER			KNOLL								
PART NUMBER			33AA1BKTSXHC								
32.	6 EACH	STOOL W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 31)	\$582.25	\$3,493.50	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
MANUFACTURER			KNOLL								
PART NUMBER			8P5-2-A5GH-RPM								

APPROVED BY: bc

DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY			BID # 2006-069							
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006			DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY							
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX							
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
7.	5 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17A)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
8.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 12' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17B)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
9.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17C)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
10.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17D)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
11.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17E)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
12.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 27' RANGE (ITEM CODE 17F)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										

APPROVED BY: BC
DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
13.	25 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 90"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 17G)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
14.	3 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 90"H X 22"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM 17G-1)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
15.	4 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 3' RANGE (ITEM CODE 18A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
16.	1 EACH	BOX FILLER 66"H X 22"D X 22"W (ITEM CODE 18B)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
17.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE W/PAPERBACK SHELVES (ITEM CODE 18C)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
18.	1 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18" RANGE (ITEM CODE 18D)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											

APPROVED BY: DC
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY			BID # 2006-069							
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006			DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY							
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX							
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
19.	2 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 21' RANGE (ITEM CODE 18E)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
20.	10 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 22" W (ITEM CODE 18F)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
21.	4 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 18F-1)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
22.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 42"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 19A)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
23.	3 EACH	DOUBLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 42"H X 22" DEEP BASES W/11" DEEP SHELVES, 18' RANGE (ITEM CODE 19A-1)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
24.	5 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 42"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 19B)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY								BID # 2006-069			
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006								DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY			
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
25.	4 EACH	WOOD END PANEL, 42"H X 22"W (ITEM CODE 19B-1)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
26.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
27.	3 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20B)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
28.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 9' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20C)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
29.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 21' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20D)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
30.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20E)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											

APPROVED BY: *BC*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY								BID # 2006-069			
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006								DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY			
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
31.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 33' RANGE (ITEM CODE 20F)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
32.	10 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 90"H X 13"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 20G)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
33.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL HINGED PERIODICAL SHELVING UNIT 71"H X 24"W X 14 1/2"D, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 21A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
34.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIA SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
35.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIAL SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 24' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22B)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
36.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL MEDIA SHELVING UNIT 90"H X 6"D, 27' RANGE (ITEM CODE 22C)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											

APPROVED BY: *PC*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
43.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 6' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
44.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 15' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25B)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
45.	1 EACH	SINGLE FACED STEEL SHELVING UNIT 66"H X 13" DEEP BASES W/13" DEEP SHELVES, 33' RANGE (ITEM CODE 25C)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
46.	6 EACH	WOOD END PANEL 66"H X 13"W, NO CUT OUT DESIGN (ITEM CODE 25D)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
TOTAL GROUP I, ITEMS 1 - 46:			NO BID								

APPROVED BY: *BJC*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY								BID # 2006-069		
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006								DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY		
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX							
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
9B.	2 EACH	CHAIR WITH TABLET ARM, LEFT FACING (ITEM CODE 9A)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
10.	5 EACH	LOW OCCASIONAL TABLE (ITEM CODE 10)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
11.	1 EACH	LOW OCCASIONAL TABLE (ITEM CODE 10A)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
12.	6 EACH	CLUB CHAIR WITH ARMS (ITEM CODE 11)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
13.	3 EACH	RECLINER (ITEM CODE 11A)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
14.	2 EACH	"W" SHAPED DISPLAY UNIT (ITEM CODE 12)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										

APPROVED BY: 
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
15.	5 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION W/RETROFIT KIT (ITEM CODE 13)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
16.	3 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION, ADA COMPLIANT (ITEM CODE 13A)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
17.	14 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION (ITEM CODE 13B)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
18.	3 EACH	COMPUTER WORKSTATION (ITEM CODE 13C)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
19.	2 EACH	DEPRESSIBLE BOOK RETURN CART (ITEM CODE 14)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
20.	15 EACH	BOOK RETURN W/3 FLAT SHELVES (ITEM CODE 15)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											

APPROVED BY: bc
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY										BID # 2006-069	
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006										DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY	
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX								
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
21.	3 EACH	LOUNGE TABLE (ITEM CODE 36)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
22.	10 EACH	ADJUSTABLE FOLDING TABLE W/VERTICAL STORAGE CADDY (ITEM CODE 39)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
23.	1 EACH	LECTERN W/INTEGRAL SOUND SYSTEM (ITEM CODE 40)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
24.	2 EACH	FIVE TIER LITERATURE RACK (ITEM CODE 41)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
25.	9 EACH	CHILDREN'S LOUNGE FURNITURE (ITEM CODE 42)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											
26.	3 EACH	ADULT LOUNGE FURNITURE (ITEM CODE 43)									
MANUFACTURER			NO BID								
PART NUMBER											

APPROVED BY: *pc*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY			BID # 2006-069							
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006			DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY							
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX							
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
27.	1 EACH	CURIO CABINET (ITEM CODE 45)								
MANUFACTURER			NO BID							
PART NUMBER										
28.	55 EACH	ARMLESS SWIVEL CHAIR (ITEM CODE 7)	\$337.64	\$18,570.20						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			CJ111NAFC							
29.	11 EACH	TASK CHAIR WITH ARMS (ITEM CODE 29)	\$406.64	\$4,473.04						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			MR112AF							
30.	8 EACH	TASK CHAIR W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 29A)	\$406.64	\$3,253.12						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			MR112AF							
31.	2 EACH	WORK CHAIR W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 30)	\$569.94	\$1,139.88						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			AE112AWB							
32.	6 EACH	STOOL W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 31)	\$618.54	\$3,711.24						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			EN722AAF							

APPROVED BY: 
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY						BID # 2006-069				
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006						DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY				
			RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX							
ITEM NO.	ANN. EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
33.	6 EACH	GUEST CHAIR W/ARMS (ITEM CODE 32)	\$345.92	\$2,075.52						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			AE500P							
34.	12 EACH	STACKABLE CHAIRS (ITEM CODE 37)	\$113.28	\$1,359.36						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			WC410N							
35A.	125 EACH	STACK CHAIR W/CHARTS (ITEM CODE 38)	\$113.28	\$14,160.00						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			WC410N							
35B.	6 EACH	CART FOR STACK CHAIRS IN BID ITEM NO. 35A (ITEM CODE 38)	\$189.12	\$1,134.72						
MANUFACTURER			HERMAN MILLER							
PART NUMBER			WC904							
TOTAL GROUP II, ITEMS 1 - 35B:			\$49,877.08							

APPROVED BY: *pac*
 DATE: 3/13/06

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LIBRARY SHELVING AND FURNITURE FOR EASTSIDE REGIONAL LIBRARY		BID # 2006-069		
BID DATE: MARCH 8, 2006		DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY		
	RIO GRANDE BPSI EL PASO, TX			
<p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL QUANTITY OF ITEMS, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.</p> <p>ORDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:</p> <p>A. SIXTY (60) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>B. NINETY (90) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>C. ONE HUNDRED AND EIGHTY (180) DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>D. NO OPTION OFFERED.</p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>
PAYMENT TERMS:	NET - 30 DAYS			
BIDDER'S PROMISED INSTALLATION:	45 CONSECUTIVE DAYS			
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN INSTALLATION DATE, THE CITY'S REQUIRED COMPLETION DATE SHALL PREVAIL.				
A COMPLETION DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DATE MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.				
BIDS SOLICITED: 27		BIDS RECEIVED: 5		BIDS LOCAL: 15
				NO BIDS: 1

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*
 DATE: 3/13/06

WORK SPACE DYNAMICS
ATTN: CHRIS TINCU
4711 LOMAS BLVD
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87110

EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE &
INDUSTRIAL
11045 ARGAL COURT
EL PASO, TX 79935-3712

HARRISON-BROWN INTERIOR
SOLUTIONS
106 W. CASTELLANO DR.
EL PASO, TX 79912

FACILITIES CONNECTION
240 E. SUNSET DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79922

BUSINESS INTERIORS
1147-A LARRY MAHAN
EL PASO, TX 79925

CORPORATE EXPRESS
15-D ZANE GREY BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79906

TOTALIBRA
4810 FOREST RUN RD.
MADISON, WI 53704

E.S. AMERICAN OFFICE PRODUCTS
11394 JAMES WATT DR STE 807
EL PASO, TX 79936

EL PASO AUTOMATED OFFICE
11045 ARGAL CT
EL PASO, TX 79935-3712

EL PASO OFFICE PRODUCTS
11216 ARMOUR DRIVE SUITE A
EL PASO, TX 79935

NIGHT WIND PRODUCTION LLC
5305 CORNELL AVE
EL PASO, TX 79924

OFFICE FURNITURE LIQUIDATORS
II
11501 ROJAS DR, STE #C
EL PASO, TX 79936

PENCIL CUP OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC
1701 TEXAS AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79901

PINK DOLPHIN, INC.
500 W. OVERLAND, SUITE 101
EL PASO, TX 79901

CULTURAL SURROUNDINGS
1400 TURTLE CREEK BLVD
SUITE 101-A
DALLAS, TX 75207

ATTN: PENNY GROMATZKY
LIBRE-TECH CORPORATION
1115 THORNBRIDGE COURT
ARGYLE, TX 76226

ATTN: GABRIEL LOPEZ
GABRIEL'S UPHOLSTERY
4845 VULCAN
EL PASO, TX 79904

ATTN: STEVE BICKFORD
TEXAS CORRECTIONAL
INDUSTRIES
P. O. BOX 4013
HUNTSVILLE, TX 77340

ATTN: TINA CAMPBELL
AGATI
1219 W. LAKE STREET
CHICAGO, IL 60607

ATTN: SHYAM K. CHARI
AGRO LOGISTIC SYSTEMS, INC.
P. O. BOX 5799
DIAMOND BAR, CA 91765

ATTN: JAMES VEALE
OFFICE DEPOT, BSD
4110 RIO BRAVO STE. 104
EL PASO, TX 79902

YAMADA ENTERPRISES
16552 BURKE LN.
HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA 92647

THE MIDLANDS CO., INC.
119 E. ANN
ANN ARBOR, MI 48105

BRODART LIBRARY SUPPLIES &
FURNISHINGS DIVISION
100 NORTH RD.
CLINTON COUNTY IND. PARK
MCELHATTAN, PA 17748

ATTN: DEBBIE ABBOTT
ATD-AMERICAN CO.
135 GREENWOOD AVENUE
WYNCOTE, PA 19095-1396

BPSI
ATTN TOM GAGE
1616 BASSETT
EL PASO TX 79901

*No Reason
For Return
Mail*

DEMCO LIBRARY INTERIORS
PO BOX 8548
MADISON, WI 53708-8548

No Bid