CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: POLICE
AGENDA DATE: July 7, 2009

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: A/C Eric Shelton (915) 564-7309
Jorge Acosta (915) 564-7119
Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, 541-4308

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: Citywide

SUBJECT:

To approve Enterprise Leasing Co. and Acme Auto Leasing LLC as the selected vendors to
provide unmarked rental vehicle services to the El Paso Police Departments. The selection of
these vendors was based on bids submitted to the Purchasing Department and taking into
consideration the needs of the El Paso Police Department. This is a low bid selection. Total
estimated annual costs of leasing per company will be $420,284.00 for Enterprise Leasing Co.
and $67,800.00 for Acme Auto Leasing LLC.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
The El Paso Police Department is requesting the service of unmarked rental vehicles to be

provided by Enterprise Leasing Co. and Acme Auto Leasing to be utilized for undercover
operations. These expenses will be covered by federal and state grant funds.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
No.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

The cost of the proposed varies according to the vehicles provided to the department. No
matching funds are required. Federal and state grant money will fund this project to estimated
total of $488,084.00 per year. (See breakdown below)

Name Department | Grant Number | Amount | Fund Number | Account
HIDTA - STING FY09 21150040 G210955 | $197,936 05446 502408
HIDTA - Intelligence FY09 21150040 G210956 $6,756 05447 502408
HIDTA - Stash House FY09 21150040 G210957 | $30,192 05448 502408
HIDTA - Multi FY09 21150040 G210958 | $13,512 05449 502408
HIDTA - Enterprise FY09 21150040 G210959 $7,620 05450 502408
HIDTA - Transportation FY09 21150040 G210960 $6,912 05451 502408
HIDTA - Fugitive 09 21150040 G210961 $6,756 05452 502408
ABTPA FY09 21150002 G210902 | $218,400 05948 502408

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: (if required) " FINANCE: (if fequired)
DEPARTMENT HEAD: /\ZJ Y. . %W'

(Example:  if RCA idliffjtiated by Pur'chasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM
DATE: June 24, 2009

PROJECT: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES

BID: 2009-192

BUDGET NOs..

21150040 - 502408 - G210955 - 05446
21150040 - 502408 - G210956 - 05447
21150040 - 502408 - G210957 - 05448
21150040 - 502408 - G210958 - 05449
21150040 - 502408 - G210959 - 05450
21150040 - 502408 - G210960 - 05451
21150040 - 502408 - G210961 - 05452
21150002 - 502408 - G210902 - 05948

FUNDING SOURCE: High Intensity Drug Trafficking Area (HIDTA) GRANT AND Auto Burglary and Theft

Prevention Authority (ABTPA) GRANT

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL
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RECOMMENDATION:
NO AWARD:

VENDOR A:

ITEMS:

VENDOR B:

ITEMS:

Group I: Automobiles, Item 1
Group lI: Trucks, Items 1 and 3

ENTERPRISE LEASING COMPANY WEST
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

Group I: Automobiles, ltems 2-3

Group ll: Trucks, Iltem 2

Group lll: Vans, ltem 1

Group 1V:_Special Purpose Vehicles, ltems 1 and 3-4
Optional Equipment: ltems 1-4

Miscellaneous: ltems 1-3

AMOUNT VENDORA : $420,284.00 EST/YR

ACME AUTO LEASING LLC
NORTH HAVEN, CT

Group lI: Trucks, Iltem 4

Group 1V: Special Purpose Vehicles, ltem 2
Optional Equipment: items 1-4
Miscellaneous: Items 1-3

AMOUNT VENDOR B: $67,800.00 EST/YR

SUB-TOTAL EST/YR AWARD: $488,084.00

TOTAL EST. AWARD (36 Months): $1,464,252.00

DISCOUNT: NONE
OPTION: VENDOR A — NONE
OPTION: VENDORB -1 AND 2 YR

This is a thirty-six month requirements type contract with Vendor A, Enterprise Leasing Company
West, offering no option to extend and Vendor B, ACME Auto Leasing LLC, offering a 1 and 2 year




option. Capps Rent-A-Car Inc. took several exceptions to this bid and is therefore a non-responsive
bidder for Solicitation No. 2009-192, Lease of Unmarked Police Vehicles.

Financial Services, Purchasing Division and the Police Department recommend award as indicated.
Vendors offered the lowest cost for their awarded groups/items.

BID’S SOLICITED 14 BID’S LOCALS 09

BID’S RECEIVED 06

"NO BIDS" RECEIVED 00

CURRENT TAXES PAID

OUT-OF-TOWN .

TOTAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $1,464,252.00
kkkkkkkhkkkkkkikkkkhkkkhkkhkkkkkhkkkkkkkkkkkkihkkhkkkikkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkikkkkkikkkkkkhkkkikkkky
FUNDS: AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE COMPTROLLER
L T L T T o T S e e e st s e
COUNCIL: APPROVED REJECTED CITY CLERK
APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING OF JULY 07, 2009
TERRENCE FRIEBURG,

PURCHASING MANAGER




Dedicated to Outstanding Customer Service for a Better Community

To: Ect‘tence Freiburg, Purchasm;, anagnr
From: Grog Allen, Chigf of Police ¢
Date:  June 23, 2009

Re:  Police Unmarked Leased Vehieles

v 'P v
ILC‘ ( LML) The L‘! Yaso | 7c)hw anutmm j : u; tha %Iu.t:ota 0( l}uth
Enterprise Car, Inc. and Acme auto Leasing LLC. as the c’ompmn% providing the
unmarked leased vehicles for the Police Department,

The £l Paso Police Department lias broken dovn. its award to-each company by
eal c,g,,m m "Hns wﬂi bﬁ‘ dom to pmwfe t [mwa* eiamce sf‘ vs:hld or ths; umlumvm

Any questions regarding the selection, please fesl f'ree to contact me at 915-564~
7308,

000000 City Nall « El Paso, I“exm 79901 (91§) 000x 000()




GROUP I
Intermediate MIDSIZE 2 door
no bid
Intermediate MIDSIZE 4 door
2008 chrysler 300
2008 dodge charger
2008 ford Taurus
2008 Nissan Altima
2009 chevy malibu or similar
FULL SIZE 4 door

2009 Toyota camry

GROUP II
FULL SIZE Pick up 2 wd regular cab
no bid

FULL SIZE Pick up 2 wd extended cab

2009 ford f150 or similar

FULL SIZE Pick up 2 wd regular cab camper shell

no bid

FULL SIZE Pick up 2 wd extended cab with camper shell
Ford f150 crew cab 4 wd

2008 Nissan Titan crew cab 4 wd

2009 Ford f-150 or similar

Group 111
Passenger Mini Van
2008 Nissan Quest
2008 Chevrolet Uplander
2009 Dodge Caravan
Group IV

Midsize SUV 2 WD

2009 Ford Explorer or similar
Midsize SUV 4 WD

2008 Chevrolet Trailblazer
2008 Ford Explorer

2008 Ford Explorer Sporttrac
2009 Ford Explorer or similar
Full size SUV 2wd

2009 Chevy Tahoe

Full size SUV 4wd

2009 Chevy Tahoe

Acme
$ -

$ 675.00
$ 675.00
$ 675.00
$ 675.00
$ -

$ -

$ -
$ -

$ 900.00
$ 900.00
$ -

$ 750.00
$ 750.00
$ -

$ -
$ 750.00

$ 725.00
$ 725.00

Enterprise

$ -

$ 545.00

$ 975.00

$ 669.00

$ 680.00

$ 750.00

950.00

¥ B L o

$ 950.00

$1,150.00

Award
No award

Enterprise

Enterprise

No award
Enterprise
No award

ACME

Enterprise

Enterprise

ACME

Enterprise

Enterprise




Memo to File

June 01, 2009

Subject: Lease of Unmarked Police Vehicles (Re-Bid) Solicitation No. 2009-192

On April 22, 2009 bids were opened for the subject project.' Capps Rent-A~Car Inc; 8555 John Carpenter .
Freeway, Dallas, TX 75247 took several exceptions to the subject bid including:

Iﬁtermediate (midsize) sedans -4 door offered by the vendor are 4 cylinder engines not 6 cylinder as required

in the bid. ~
Vehicles in the bidder’s solicitation are two to three year old models not up to one model year old as required

.. inthebid.A _ : .
o  Vehicles in the bidder’s solicitation can not be returned by El Paso PD after reaching 25,000 miles. The
subject solicitation requires successful bidder to take back vehicles after they have reached 25,000.

Capps Rent-A-Car Inc. is therefore a non-responsive bidder for solicitation No. 2009-192, Lease of Unmarked
Police Vehicles. . : :

ASection B, Page 1

Mided 4/ pd,

Michael W, Plum, Administrative Analyst
Financial Services-Purchasing Division

FINANCIAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT, PURCHASING DIVISION
2 CIVIC CENTER PLAZA, 7™ FLOOR, EL PASO, TX 79901  MAIN: 916-541-4308 FAX: 916-541-4347  www.elpasolexas.gov




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES (RE-BID)

BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

BID # 2009-192

DEPARTMENT: POLICE
ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO
LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC -
NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT
(A) (B) (C) (D)
MONTHLY RATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

WITHOUT INSURANCE

MONTHLY RATE
WITHOUT INSURANCE

MONTHLY RATE
WITHOUT INSURANCE

MONTHLY RATE
WITHOUT INSURANCE

GROUP |: AUTOMOBILES

1. |INTERMEDIATE (MID SIZE) SEDAN, 2 DOOR NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
‘[ YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A

2. |INTERMEDIATE (MID SIZE) SEDAN, 4 DOOR $675.00 $675.00 675 675
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL 2008 CHRYSLER 300 | 2008 DODGE CHARGER | 2008 FORD TAURUS 2008 NISSAN ALTIMA

3. |FULL SIZE SEDAN, 4 DOOR NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A

GROUP lI: TRUCKS

1. |FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, REGULAR CAB NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A

2. |FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, EXTENDED CAB NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED .
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL . N/A _ N/A NONE STATED N/A

3. ||FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, REGULAR CAB WITH CAMPER SHELL NONE STATED NONE STATED N/A NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A

4. ||FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, EXTENDED CAB WITH CAMPER SHELL| NONE STATED NONE STATED 1$900.00 (4 WD, CREW CAB) | $900.00 (4WD, CREW CAB)

' YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A -N/A FORD F150 4X4 CREW CAB 2008 NISSAN TITAN

GROUP lli: VANS

1. |[PASSENGER MINI VAN $750.00. $750.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED

YEAR/MAKE/MODEL DODGE GRAND CARAVAN| 2008 NiSSAN QUEST N/A N/A

APPROVED BY: M M,/ <\6),\/ \ . /

OATE: [, - - 04

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES (RE-BID)
BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

BID # 2009-192

A VEHICLE IS USED FOR A PARTIAL MONTH:

(MONTYHLY RATE/30) X
NUMBER OF DAYS ON LEASE

(MONTHLY RATE/30) X
NUMBER OF DAYS ON LEASE

(MONTHLY RATE/30) X
NUMBER OF DAYS ON LEASE

DEPARTMENT: POLICE
ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO
LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC
NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT - NORTH HAVEN, CT
(A) (8) (C) (D)
MONTHLY RATE MONTHLY RATE MONTHLY RATE MONTHLY RATE
ITEM DESCRIPTION WITHOUT INSURANCE ' WITHOUT INSURANCE WITHOUT INSURANCE WITHOUT INSURANCE
GROUP IV: SPECIAL PURPOSE VEHICLES
1. |MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 2 WD NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
"~ |YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A
B2 MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 WD $750.00 $725.00 $725.00 NONE STATED
2008 CHEVROLET 2008 FORD EXPLORER
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL TRAILBLAZER 2008 FORD EXPLORER SPORT TRAC NIA ‘
3. ||FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 2WD NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A
4. |FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 WD NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL N/A N/A N/A N/A
OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONE TIME CHARGE ONE TIME CHARGE ONE TIME CHARGE ONE TIME CHARGE
INSTALLATION OF ALARM UNIT $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00
2. |FULL WINDOW TINTING $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
3. |BED LID FOR PICK UPS $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
4. |BED LINER FOR PICK UPS $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00
- MISCELLANEOUS
TI'EM DESCRIPTION PER UNIT PER UNIT PER UNIT PER UNIT
1. |EXCESS MILEAGE CHARGE: FOR MILES DRIVEN $.15 $.15 $.15 $.15
IN EXCESS OF 2,500 MI PER MONTH PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE
2. |MONTHLY RATE FOR A LOCKABLE TOOL BOX $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
MOUNTED BEHIND CAB ACROSS BED GF TRUCK
3. |PRO-RATE FORMULA TO BE UTILIZED IN THE EVENT

(MONTHLY RATE/30) X
NUMBER OF DAYS ON LEASE

APPROVED BY: 'Y ¢
DATE: {,-{~ 0OF

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES (RE-BID)

BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

BID # 2009-192

DEPARTMENT: POLICE
ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO ACME AUTO
LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC LEASING LLC
NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT NORTH HAVEN, CT
(A) (B) (C) (D)

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,

BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN
THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

B. _ER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

[ ]

]

:

|
[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: , NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
EgJODCESR’E‘:n’;iETSC;%’S?CEP T PAYMENT BY YES[X| NO[ ] YES[X] NO[ | YES[X] NO[ ] YES[X] NO[ ]
ED—D'IER_'SCF; igg"gjﬁ\?&it;ﬁi:gm . | NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
m‘g‘:gEFFHE%‘é‘;%gs&‘_’ERN'GHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: Muy?
DATE: {4 - [~ 09

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES (RE-BID)
BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

, BID # 2009-192
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

CAPPS RENT-A-CAR, INC
DALLAS, TX

ENTERPRISE LEASING
COMPANY WEST
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

MONTHLY RATE

MONTHLY RATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION WITHOUT INSURANCE WITHOUT INSURANCE
GROUP I: AUTOMOBILES '
1. |INTERMEDIATE (MID SIZE) SEDAN, 2 DOOR NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL NO BID
2 |INTERMEDIATE (MID SIZE) SEDAN, 4 DOOR $550.00 $545.00
2007-2008 HONDA ACCORD|{ 2009/CHEVY MALIBU OR
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL 2008 TOYOTA CAMRY SIMILAR
3. |FULL SIZE SEDAN, 4 DOOR ' NO BID $975.00
2009 TOYOTA CAMRY
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL OR SIMILAR
GROUP lI: TRUCKS
1. |FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, REGULAR CAB NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL NO BID
2. JFULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, EXTENDED CAB $550.00 $669.00
2008 CHEVY SILVERADO)
2008 GMC SIERRA, 2009 FORD F-150 OR
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL 2008 DODGE QUAD, SIMILAR
2008 TOYOTA TACOMA
3. |[FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, REGULAR CAB WITH CAMPER SHELL NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL NO BID
4. |FULL SIZE PICK UP, 2 WD, EXTENDED CAB WITH CAMPER SHELL NO BID $925.00
2009 FORD EXPLORER
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL OR SIMILAR
GROUP 1llI: VANS
1. |PASSENGER MINI VAN NO BID $680.00
2009 DODGE CARAVAN
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL OR SIMILAR

APPROVED BY: MM
DATE: £ - [- D9

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES (RE-BID)

BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

BID # 2009-192
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

CAPPS RENT-A-CAR, INC

ENTERPRISE LEASING

. DALLAS, TX COMPANY WEST
ALBUQUERQUE, NM
MONTHLY RATE MONTHLY RATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

WITHOUT INSURANCE

WITHOUT INSURANCE

GROUP |V: SPECIAL PURPOSE VEHICLES

1. |MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 2 WD $650.00 $750.00
2009 FORD EXPLORER
| _|YEAR/MAKE/MODEL TOYOTA 4-RUNNER OR SIMILAR
MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 WD NO BID $950.00
2009 FORD EXPLORER
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL OR SIMILAR
3. |FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 2 WD NO BID $950.00
. 2009 CHEVY TAHOE OR
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL SIMILAR
4. |FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4 WD NO BID $1,150.00
: 2009 CHEVY TAHOE OR
YEAR/MAKE/MODEL SIMILAR
OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONE TIME CHARGE ONE TIME CHARGE
1. |INSTALLATION OF ALARM UNIT NO BID $250.00 PER OCCURRENCE
2. |FULL WINDOW TINTING $142.00 $140.00 PER OCCURRENCE
3. |BED LID FOR PICK UPS NO BID $1,800.00 PER OCCURRENCE
4. |BED LINER FOR PICK UPS NO CHARGE NO CHARGE
MISCELLANEOUS
T DESCRIPTION PER UNIT PER UNIT
| 1. |EXCESS MILEAGE CHARGE: FOR MILES DRIVEN UNLIMITED MILES NO CHARGE
IN EXCESS OF 2,500 MI PER MONTH PER MILE PER MILE
2. |MONTHLY RATE FOR A LOCKABLE TOOL BOX
MOUNTED BEHIND CAB ACROSS BED OF TRUCK FREE UPON REQUEST $20.00
MONTHLY RATE DIVIDED | MONTHLY RATE DIVIDED BY
3. |PRO-RATE FORMULA TO BE UTILIZED IN THE EVENT|  BY ACTUAL DAYS IN NUMBER OF DAYS IN THE
A VEHICLE IS USED FOR A PARTIAL MONTH: MONTH TIMES NUMBER | MONTH TIMES THE NUMBER
. OF DAYS USED OF DAYS A VEHICLES IS USED

APPROVED BY: M (4?2
DATE: (, - ‘(- o4

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES
BID DATE: APRIL 22, 2009

(RE-BID)

BID # 2009-192
DEPARTMENT: POLICE

CAPPS RENT-A-CAR, INC
DALLAS, TX

ENTERPRISE LEASING
COMPANY WEST
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,

BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN
THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

B.. JER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

L]

]

]

[]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NOD YES NOD
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

' o
W.  {___ CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS. NONE STATED NONE STATED
WITHIN __ HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER

IN CASE OF EMERGENCY.

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DEL}
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S RE

IVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
QUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 14

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

LOCAL BIDS: 9

NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY: MW/
pATE: - [ - 09

2009-192 LEASE OF UNMARKED POLICE VEHICLES - RE-BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT




ADVANTAGE RENT-A-CAR
1210 AIRWAY BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79925

AVIS RENT-A-CAR
6500 CONVAIR ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79925

ENTERPRISE LEASING
ATTN: JENNIFER JENNINGS
8070 GATEWAY EAST

EL PASO, TX 79907

RED MCCOMBS DODGE
P. 0. BOX 72
FISHER, TX 78623

CURRY LEASING
ATTN: STEVE HARRIS
14850 MONTFORT #295
DALLAS, TX 75254

CAPPS RENT-A-CAR

ATTN: SAMUEL BRADING
8555 CARPENTER FREEWAY
DALLAS, TX 75247

BUDGET RENT-A-CAR
6500 CONVAIR ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79925

BUSH RAMSEY VILLAGE
ATTN: JOHN FENTER
134 N. CLACK

ABILENE, TX 79603

THRIFTY CAR RENTAL
6413 LOS ROBLES DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79912-2921

HERTZ LOCAL EDITION

ATTN: VICTOR NAVARETTE
6590 MONTANA, AVENUE SUITE F
EL PASO, TX 79925

STORY LEASING CO.
6555 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

HERTZ RENT-A-CAR
6510 CONVAIR ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79925

NATIONAL CAR RENTAL
6500 CONVAIR ROAD
EL PASO, TX 79907

MACK MASSEY
950 CROCKETT STREET
EL PASO, TX 79922

PHILPOTT MOTORS
ATTN: ALLAN WILEY
621 GATEWAY CIRCLE
GATESVILLE, TX: 76528




