CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Fire

AGENDA DATE:  July 10, 2007

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Terrence Freiburg-Purchasing Manager ; ext. 4313
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager
to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $ amount if
applicable.

Award Solicitation # 2007-149 to_the following responsive bidders: Bazaar Uniforms &

Men’s Store, 304 E. Overland St., El Paso, TX 79901 for all items in Group 1, items 3-11 in
Group II, items 1-6 in Group III, and all items in Group IV for total award value of $251,
998.76, Uniforms of Texas, 6601 Montana, Ste. B&C, El ntana, Ste. B&C, El Paso, TX 79925 for item 11 in

Group II for total award value of $3,900.00, Lion Apparel, 234 E. Devon Dr., Dayton, OH
45414 for items 1 & 2 in Group II for total award value of $3.562.50 and Rock’s/School

Wear, 4727 Hondo Pass, El Paso, TX 79904 for items 7 & 8 in Group III for total award

value of $1,920.00. Total value of this contract for all vendors is estimated to be $261.381.26

for twelve months.

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of
this action? What are the citizen concerns?

The items furnished under this contract are the duty uniforms for all firefighters covered by
the collective bargaining agreement.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

No.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by
account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

Funding for this contract will be from 01101-22010100-503120 for total estimated value of

$261.381.26 in Fiscal Years 2007 and 2008.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A
N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************
LEGAL: (ifrequired) _ FINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD: m m

(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:
CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT: Duty Uniforms-Rebid
NO:2007-149

BUDGET NO:22010100-503120-00-01101

PROJECT FORM

DATE: June 15, 2007

DEPARTMENT: Fire

FUNDING SOURCE: Fire Department General Operations Fund

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor:

Item(s):

Annual Estimated Amount:

RECOMMENDATION: 2) Vendor:

Item(s):
Annual Estimated Amount:

RECOMMENDATION: 3) Vendor:

Item(s):
Annual Estimated Amount:

RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor:

Item(s):
Annual Estimated Amount:

Bazaar Uniforms & Men’s Store

El Paso, Texas

Group |, #1, 2, 3 &4, Group I, # 3 thru #10, Group lll, #1
thru #6, Group IV, #1,2, 3, & 4

$ 251,998.76

Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, Texas
Group I, #11

$ 3,900.00

Lion Apparel
Dayton, Ohio
Group I, #1 & #2
$ 3.562.50

Rock’s/ School Wear
El Paso, Texas
Group lll, #7 & #8

$ 1.920.00

This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of twelve (12) months.

responsible bidder.

The Departments of Financial Services and Fire recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive,

Vendor #1, #2, #3 & #4 offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices
for one (1) additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from the date of the award.

Vendor #3 offers the City a prompt payment discount of 2% 20 days.

Vendor #4 offers the City a prompt payment discount of 2 %10 days.

BIDS SOLICITED- 41 (15 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 08
“NO BID” RECEIVED 00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 261,381.26
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COUNCIL APPROVED [] REJECTED [ ] MUNICIPAL CLERK
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: July 10, 2007

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services Depart




City COUNCIL

JoHN Cook ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
MAYOR SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
J. ALEXANDRO L0OZANO, DISTRICT 3
JOYCE WILSON MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4

PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT 5
EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6

CITY MANAGER

ROBERTO RIVERA STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
FIRE CHIEF BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
FIRE DEPARTMENT
MEMORANDUM
To: Jesus Juarez, Procurement Analyst
From: Michael Calderazzo, Logistics Chief wM ¢
Subject: Award Recommendation For Duty Uniforms
Date: June 8, 2007
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We have evaluated the bids for duty uniforms and are making recommendations to award each
item separately as indicated on the accompanying spreadsheet. The successful responsive
bidders were: Bazaar Uniforms, Uniforms of Texas, Lion Apparel, Rock’s/School Wear. Total
award value is estimated at $261,381.26 for twelve months and funding for this contract shall be
provided for through 01101-22010100-503120.

Fire Department v

ISO Class 1

8600 MONTANA AVE. * EL PAsO, TX 79925-1214 + 915.771.1000 « 915.771.1026 FAX * WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV
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men's trousers $62,645.00
female trousers $1,169.00
male polo $60,445.00
female polo $1,099.00 )
male dress pants $23.75 $2,375.00
female dress pants $23.75 $1,187.50
male white /s $1,329.00
female white /s $159.48
male white s/s $2,872.50
female white s/s $137.88
male blue I/s $5,316.00
female blue I/s $318.96
male blue s/s $3,447.00
female blue s/s $275.76
dress jacket __ $78.00{ $3,900.00
belt $5,751.00 .
shorts $31,625.00
t-shirt $20,955.00
clip on tie $49.50
tie $179.40
winter jacket $10,999.00
blue cap _$3.20| $1,280.00
white cap [ $320[ $640.00
male work boots $36,891.00
female work boots $2,639.40
male oxford $3,299.00
female oxford $395.88

$251,998.76total/vendor | $3,900.00ftotal/vendor $3,562.50{total/vendor | $1,920.00

Grand total for Uniforms|

$261,381.26]




[BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT:. FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS &

LION APPAREL

EL PASO, TX ~ MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
GROUP . 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS EL PASO, TX_
ITEM [ ANN. EST. | ; ,
NO. |QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNITPRICE | EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
TROUSERS, — §§_2_,§4_5_o_o__
1. | 5500 MEN'S CUT &l s17.00 $93,500.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND .  $175,945.00
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. DICKIES 2112272
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) DICKIES _ 874 DN
TROUSERS,
2. | 100 FEMALE CUT, $17.00 $1,700.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) DICKIES _FN11-DN
SHIRTS,
3. | 5500 POLO, MALE, $17.75 $97,625.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND

'IMANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

ALTERNATE 5:
RED KAP SK82WH

HARTWELL 330-946

APPROVED BY:

DATE 5’

s,

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID '

BID # 2007-149

BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007 ‘ DEPARTMENT: FIRE
| ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & LION APPAREL
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
EL PASO, TX '
ITEM | ANN. EST. : :
NO. |QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION _UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRTS, ' .
4. 100 POLO, FEMALE, $17.75 $1,775.00
EA POLY/COTTON, BLEND '

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

TOTAL (GROUP ):

GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS
TROUSERS,
1. 100 MEN'S CUT, $25.99 $2,599.00 $23.75 $2,375.00
EA 100% POLYESTER :
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. v EL BECO
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) , ~ E314 EDWARDS 2290
TROUSERS, .
2, 50 FEMALE CUT, $25.99 . $1,299.50 $23.75 $1,187.50
EA 100 POLYESTER :
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. EL BECO
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) E9314 EDWARDS 8270
SHIRT, MEN'S, : '
3. 100 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)
SHIRT, FEMALE,
4, 12 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

HARTWELL 330-946

$194,600.00

- $24.75 $2,475.00

EL BECO V610MWH

B e T ——

PERFECTION  1330WHN

$24.75 $297.00

I(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) ' ‘ ' | _PERFECTION 1330WHN

APPROVED BY: /‘7%
DATE:_ 3, / £, / 7

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT 2




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.

APPROVED

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

. BY: ;;;gﬁagz [:E &
DATE: o/[ J/[ 2 M

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & LION APPAREL
- EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
: EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ANN. EST. : : ' '
NO. [QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, MEN'S, $11.49
5. 250 WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, $22.00 $5,500.00
’ EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. '
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) PERFECTION 1300WHN
SHIRT, FEMALE,
6. 12 WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, - $22.00 $264.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. \
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) \ PERFECTION 1300WHN
SHIRT, MEN'S,
7. 400 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $24.75 $9,900.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) PERFECTION 1330 BLN
SHIRT, FEMALE, :
8. 24 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $24.75 $594.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) PERFECTION 1330BLN
: SHIRT, MEN'S,
9. 300 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $22.00 $6,600.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) , PERFECTION 1300 BLN
SHIRT, FEMALE,
10. | 24 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $22.00 $528.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. '
PERFECTION 1300 BLN




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID #2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE _

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & LION APPAREL
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
EL PASO, TX

ITEM | ANN. EST.

NO. |QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1.| 50 JACKET, MEN'S, $89.99 $4,499.50 NO BID

EA _ 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) FECCHEIMER 38802
TOTAL (GROUP II): $22,254.58 $29,720.50

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) .

APPROVED BY: :ZM My%
DATE:__ 5 /87 7

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT

1. | 900 BELT, SMOOTH, $8.68 $7,812.00 $6.39 $5,751.00 $12.50 $11,250.00
EA BLACK 11/2, LEATHER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. ,
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) DUTYMAN 1511 ART 2273 BOSTON _ 6600
. $5.75 | $31,625.00
2. | 5,500 EXERCISE SHORTS, $7.59 $41,745.00 $10.00 $55,000.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOGNO. | | REND 20
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) BRODER 122S-XL | "ALTERNATE BROD ANVIL 122
3. | 5500 EXERCISE T-SHIRT, $4.68 $25,740.00 $3.81 $20,955.00 $10.00 $55,000.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON : A
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. BRODER | ‘
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) (2XL-3X: $5.42 / 4XL-5XL: $6.84) BRODER _ 3930P HANES _ 5290
4. | 50 TIE, BLACK, CLIP ON, $2.38 $119.00 $0.99 $49.50 $5.00 $250.00
EA 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
SAM BOONE 90049 VAL BROOME __ 90001




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BAZAAR UNIFORMS &

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. LION APPAREL
EL PASO, TX MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
EL PASO, TX :
ITEM | ANN. EST.

NO. [QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

5. 60 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, $3.77 $226.20 $2.99 $179.40 $5.00 $300.00

; EA 100% SILK
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SAM BOONE 90099 VAL BROOME 90078

6. 100 JACKETS, WINTER, $129.56 $12,956.00 $109.99 $10,999.00 NO BID

- EA RED, WATER PROOF

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. WEARGUARD
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) STYLE 1308 RED / S - XL SPIEWAK S566CF/SF77CF

7. 400 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP, $6.55 $2,620.00 $3.59 $1,436.00 $15.00 $6,000.00

EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. SUN MAR OR -
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) HEAD MASTER 2283 OTTO  19-557-04 LEGEND

8. 200 SOLID WHITE, CAP, $6.55 $1,310.00 $3.59 $718.00 $15.00 $3,000.00

EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO ’ (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $300.00)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. SUN MAR OR
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) HEAD MASTER 9883 OTTO  19-557-016 LEGEND
TOTAL (GROUP lil): $92,528.20 $71,712.90 $130,800.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

~2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO. BAZAAR UNIFORMS & LION APPAREL
‘ ‘ EL PASO, TX "~ MEN'S STORE DAYTON, OH
GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ANN. EST. ,,
NO. [QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE . TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1. 900 MEN'S, INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, NO BID
EA BLACK STEEL TOE 3
ALTERNATE 3
$51.99 | $46,791.00
ALTERNATE 1: WEINBRENNER
SEMI osueue__z_s_o_g-_s_:;_s_o
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
. |(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) '
| : WEINBRENNER
SPORT 804-6033
2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR - $43.99 $2,639.40 NO BID
EA BLACK STEEL TOE :
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER COMMANDO
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) DEUCE 504-6086
3. 100 ~ SHOES MALE OXFORD, $32.99 $3,299.00 NO BID
EA BLACK, SMOOTH LEATHER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) WEINBRENNER  834-6041
4, 12 SHOES FEMALE OXFORD, $32.99 $395.88 " NO BID
EA BLACK, SMOOTH LEATHER

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

WEINBRENNER 834-6041

TOTAL (GROUP IV): |

$43,225.28

APPROVED BY:

DATE: S /&7//0

il

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

1

BID # 2007-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ALCO INDUSTRIAL CO.
EL PASO, TX '

BAZAAR UNIFORMS &
MEN'S STORE
EL PASO, TX

LION APPAREL
DAYTON, OH

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

B. NO OPTION OFFERED

NET - 30 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
A 30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSEGUTIVE
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY A COMPLETION DATE, THE CITY'S REQUIRED COMPLETION DATE SHALL PREVAIL.

|A COMPLETION DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DATE MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:

pate:_ S/ 8/ 7

s

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

» NAFECO R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCK'S/SCHOOL WEAR
, DECATUR, AL ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS
ITEM | ANN. EST. ,
NO. [QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
TROUSERS, ZE: -42 '
1. 5,500 MEN'S CUT $35.95 $197,725.00 $27.22 | $149,710.00 NO BID
EA ‘POLY/COTTON/BLEND (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: '$149,737.28)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (42-50: $29.89) (52-54: $32.56)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, 3021 HORACE SMALL HS2630
' TROUSERS, ' ’ SIZE: 4-20
2. 100 FEMALE CUT, $35.95 $3,595.00 $27.22 l $2,722.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND ) (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $2,722.50)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (22-24: $29.89)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, L3021 "HORACE SMALL HS2362
SHIRTS, IZE: S-XL ____$_1_4._§_Q_____|___§ZQ,'_7_5_0_._0_Q___
3. 5,500 - POLO, MALE, $27.95 $153,725.00 $15.90 | - $87,450.00 ALT: ULTRA CLUB:

1 EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $87,449.47) (SEE BG $18.60 I -$102,300.00
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. PRICE LIST FOR % + FOR LARGER SIZES) __P_O_R'_T_Al:l_'[li(_)_F_{_l_TX__l_(ggO_P____
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) TRI MOUNTAIN, 206, 209 BLUE GENERATION 7206 ALT: #8544

SHIRTS, SIZE: S-XL
4. 100 POLO, FEMALE, . $27.95 $2,795.00 $15.90 | $1,590.00 $14.50 $1,450.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND (SEE BG PRICE LIST FOR

% + FOR LARGER PRICES)

BLUE GENERATION 7206

PORT AUTHORITY K500P

- TOTAL (GROUP I):
GROUP lI: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS ,

TRI MOUNTAIN, 102, 602

$357,840.00

TROUSERS,
1. 100 MEN'S CUT, $28.95 $2,895.00
EA 100% POLYESTER

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

SOUTHEASTERN, 9001

'$241,472.00
OP I:

- $24.14 |  $2,414.00
(BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $2,413.99) -

(44-50: $28.10) (52-54: $32.05)

'$81,200.00

NO BID

HORACE SMALL HS2370

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

APPROVED BY:

gty

DATE:

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITYOFE

L PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

SOUTHEASTERN, 3102

(2X & UP: $28.10)

NAFECO R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCK'S/SCHOOL WEAR
DECATUR, AL ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ANN. EST.
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
TROUSERS, | SIZE: 4-20
2. 50 FEMALE CUT, $28.95 $1,447.50 $24.14 $1,207.00 NO BID
EA 100 POLYESTER (22-24: $28.10)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. , o
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, L9001 HS 2371
SHIRT, MEN'S, SIZE: S-XL
3. | 100 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $27.95 $2,795.00 $24.47 | $2,447.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $2,446.95)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (2X & UP: $28.10)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) , SOUTHEASTERN, 3103 HS 1484
SHIRT, FEMALE, . SIZE: SXL
4. 12 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $27.95 $335.40 $24.47 |  $293.64 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $229.40)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (2X & UP: $28.10)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, L3103 HS 1484
SHIRT, MEN'S, SIZE: S-XL
5 | 250 WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, $25.95 $6,487.50 $21.83 | $5,457.50 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $5,458.18)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (2X & UP: $24.93)
'|(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, 3203 HS 1485
, SHIRT, FEMALE, | SIZE: S-XL
6. 12, WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, $25.95 $311.40 $21.83 l $261.96 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON , : . (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $261.99)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (2X & UP: $24.93)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) | SOUTHEASTERN, L3203 HS 1485
SHIRT, MEN'S, SIZE: S-XL
7. | 400 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $27.95 $11,180.00 $24.47 | $9,788.00 NO BID
EA : POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $9.787.80)

HS 1484

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID. BID # 2007-149

BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007 , __DEPARTMENT: FIRE
NAFECO R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCK'S/SCHOOL WEAR
DECATUR, AL ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ANN. EST. ,
NO. |QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, FEMALE, , SIZE: S-XL ) '
8. 24 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $27.95 $670.80 $24.47 |  $587.28 NO BID
EA POLY[COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $587.27)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. « (2XL & UP: $28.10)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, L3102 HS 1484
SHIRT, MEN'S, SIZE: S-XL
9. 300 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $25.95 $7,785.00 $21.83 |  $6,549.00 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $6,549.81)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. ' (2XL & UP: $24.93)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, 3202 HORASE SMALL HS1485
) SHIRT, FEMALE, SIZE: S-XL
10. 24 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $25.95 $622.80 '$21.83 |  $523.92 NO BID
EA POLY/COTTON _ (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $523.98)
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (2XL & UP: $24.93)
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SOUTHEASTERN, L3202 HS 1485
1. 50 JACKET, MEN'S, $134.95 $6,747.50 NO BID NO BID
EA 100% POLYESTER :
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) WHALING, 211PY
TOTAL (GROUP ll): . $41,277.90 $29,529.30

BIDDER'S TOTAL: $38,510.85) | (BIDDER'S TOTAL: $29,466.37

1. 900 BELT, SMOOTH, $12.95
EA BLACK 1 1/2, LEATHER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) CHAMBERS, 6010

$11,655.00

APPROVED BY: %%
10
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT:. FIRE

NAFECO R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. - ROCK'S/ISCHOOL WEAR
DECATUR, AL ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ANN. EST. )
NO. |QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SIZE: S-2X
2. 5,500 EXERCISE SHORTS, $9.95 $54,725.00 $7.98 l $43,890.00 $7.30 $40,150.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON . " (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $43,869.76) '
IMANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. :
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) ANVIL, 122 SOFFE M774 ANVIL #122
SIZE: S-2X
3. 5,500 EXERCISE T-SHIRT, $10.95 $60,225.00 $4.03 I $22,165.00 $4.06 $22,330.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $22,188.67) - |
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. (3X - $6.93) ' .
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) ANVIL, 911P SOFFE M305P 100% COTTON HANES 5290
4, 50 TIE, BLACK, CLIP ON, $3.95 $197.50 NO BID NO BID
EA 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE rS_ECTION B FOR DETAILS) _ SAM BROOME, 90043
5. 60 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, NO BID NO BID
EA 100% SILK
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)
6. 100 JACKETS, WINTER, $239.95 $23,995.00 NO BID NO BID
EA ) RED, WATER PROOF ,
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. ,
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) 5.11 TACTICAL, 48001
7. 400 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP, $9.95 - $3,980.00 $5.51 $2,204.00 $3.20 $1,280.00
EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $2,204.36)

APPROVED

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

PORT AND CO., CP80

OTTO STYLE 19-536

v /7%
-

OTTO 18098

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO B

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

ID TABULATION

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

NAFECO R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCK'S/SCHOOL WEAR
DECATUR, AL ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
| ITEM [ANN. EST.
NO. |QTY.JUNIT __ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
8. 200 SOLID WHITE, CAP, $9.95 $1,990.00 $5.51 $1,102.00 $3.20 $640.00
EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO (BIDDER'S EXTENSION: $1,102.18)

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

PORT AND CO., CP80

OTTO STYLE 19-536

TOTAL (GROUP Ill):

GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR

$156,767.50

OTTO 18-098

. $69,361.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL: $69,364.97)

$64,400.00

1. 900 MEN'S, INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR, 1$69.95 $62,955.00 NO BID NO BID
EA BLACK STEEL TOE - '
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) THOROGOOD, 804-6091
2, 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $69.95 $4,197.00 NO BID
EA BLACK STEEL TOE
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. -
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) THOROGOOD, 804-6091
3. 100 SHOES MALE OXFORD, $84.95 $8,495.00 NO BID
EA BLACK, SMOOTH LEATHER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) - THOROGOOD, 834-6345
4. 12 SHOES FEMALE OXFORD, $84.95 $1,019.40 NO BID
EA BLACK, SMOOTH LEATHER

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
|(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

THOROGOOD, 534-6145

TOTAL (GROUP IV):

$76,666.40

APPROVED BY:

S%&é ///%
pate: S/L/07

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

NAFECO
DECATUR, AL

R4 INDUSTRIES, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

ROCK'S/SCHOOL WEAR
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

B. NO OPTION OFFERED

2% - 10 DAYS / NET - 30 DAYS

2% - 10 DAYS / NET - 30 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
‘ 45 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE :
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: _CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS 7 - 10 WORKNG DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY A COMPLETION DATE, THE CITY'S REQUIRED COMPLETION DATE SHALL PREVAIL.

|IA COMPLETION DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DATE MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: S /7

(s,

" 2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007 v

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

COMPANY, LLC EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM [ANN. EST. .
NO. |QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION _
. TROUSERS, | $35.00___| $192,500.00 _
1. | 5,500 MEN'S CUT NO BID ALTERNATE:

"EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND $14.90 | $81,950.00
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. | _FECH_ #49400
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) ALT:_DICKIE “8038

TROUSERS, | __$35.00___| _$3,500.00 _
2. 100 ~ FEMALE CUT, ALTERNATE: ,
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND $14.90 | $1,490.00

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

FECH #49450

ALT: DICKIE FP116

SHIRTS,
3. 5,500 POLO, MALE, $14.50 $79,750.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

BRODER BROTHERS 4603

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

SHIRTS,
4. 100 POLO, FEMALE, -~ $14.50 $1,450.00
EA POLY/COTTON/BLEND

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

BRODER BROTHERS  337W

TOTAL (GROUP I):

GROUP’ ll: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS

TROUSERS,
1. 100 MEN'S CUT, $2,950.00
EA 100% POLYESTER

$277,200.00

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

FECH #38200

(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

APPROVED BY:

D\ATE: \5/

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

COMPANY, LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM [ANN. EST. :
NO. |QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
TROUSERS, .
2. 50 FEMALE CUT, $25.50 $1,275.00
EA 100 POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) FECH #38233
SHIRT, MEN'S,
3. 100 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $13.50 $1,350.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) RED KAP SP56WH
SHIRT, FEMALE, ,
4. 12 WHITE, LONG SLEEVE $16.00 $192.00
EA : POLYICOTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) WHALING #W11403
SHIRT, MEN'S,
5. 250 WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, $12.29 $3,072.50
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) RED KAP SP66WH
SHIRT, FEMALE,
6. 12 WHITE, SHORT SLEEVE, $15.00 $180.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) WHALING #W11303
, SHIRT, MEN'S,
7. 400 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $13.79 $5,516.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. \
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) ' RED KAP SP56MB

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITYOFEL P

ASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

COMPANY, LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM | ANN. EST. : T ,
NO. |QTY./JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SHIRT, FEMALE, :
8. 24 BLUE, LONG SLEEVE, $15.50 $372.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) WHALING #W11402
SHIRT, MEN'S,
9. 300 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $12.19 $3,657.00
EA POLY/COTTON
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) RED KAP SP66MB
SHIRT, FEMALE, ‘
10. 24 LIGHT BLUE, SHORT SLEEVE, $14.50 $348.00
| _EA \ POLY/COTTON .
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. ,
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) "WHALING #W11303
‘ | __$85.00 _ | $4,250.00 _
1. 50 JACKET, MEN'S, ALTERNATE:
EA 100% POLYESTER $78.00 |  $3,900.00

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

FECH #38804

NEW PORT #211PY

TOTAL (GROUP li):

1.

900

EA

BELT, SMOOTH,

BLACK 11/2, LEATHER

$23,162.50

$6,930.00

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
- |(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

DUTYMAN #1511

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ‘5; /[2; 7 ( | %/

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE.DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007

BID # 2007-149

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS

COMPANY, LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM [ANN. EST. ,
NO. |QTY./JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
2. | 5,500 EXERCISE SHORTS, $6.50 $35,750.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON '_
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) BORDER BROTHER 8187
3. | 5,500 EXERCISE T-SHIRT, $4.00 $22,000.00
EA NAVY BLUE, 100% COTTON |
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) BORDER BROTHER 363MP
4. | 50 TIE, BLACK, CLIP ON, $2.20 $110.00
EA 100% POLYESTER
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE_SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SAM BROOME 90049
5, 60 TIE, BLACK, REGULAR STYLE, $3.50 $210.00
EA ' 100% SILK '
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SAM BROOME 90099
6. | 100 JACKETS, WINTER, $118.00 $11,800.00
EA RED, WATER PROOF ' '
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. |
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) SPIEWAK S$526-S577
7. | 400 SOLID NAVY BLUE, CAP, $4.50 $1,800.00
EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO

SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS)

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

ALPHA BX002

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PAS

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID

O BID TABULATION

BID # 2007-149
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

(SEE SECTION

B FOR DETAILS) .

BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007
THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
COMPANY, LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM | ANN. EST.
NO. [QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
8. 200 SOLID WHITE, CAP, $5.95 $1,190.00
EA WITH FIRE DEPARTMENT LOGO
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

ALPH BX002wW

TOTAL (GROUP llI):

GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR

MEN'S, INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR,

$79,790.00

(SEE SECTION

B FOR DETAILS)

LEHIGH STYLE #5236

1. 900 $45.00 $40,500.00 $72.00 $64,800.00
EA BLACK STEEL TOE
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) LEHIGH STYLE #5236 THOROGOOD 804-6906
2. 60 WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $45.00 $2,700.00 $44.00 $2,640.00
EA - BLACK STEEL TOE -
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

THOROGOOD 804-6086

3. 100
EA

SHOES MALE OXFORD,
BLACK. SMOOTH LEATHER

$40.00

$4,000.00

ALTERNATE:
$35.00 |  $3,500.00

(SEE SECTION

MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO.

B FOR DETAILS)

LEHIGH STYLE #7430

THOROGOOD 834-6905

TOTAL (GROUP IV):

- | __$66.00___| __$792.00_ __
4. | 12 SHOES FEMALE OXFORD, $40.00 $480.00 _ALTERNATE:

EA BLACK, SMOOTH LEATHER $35.00 |  $420.00
MANUFACTURER AND CATALOG NO. _THOROGOOD 534-6905 _
(SEE SECTION B FOR DETAILS) LEHIGH STYLE #7480 DICKIE ~CD3390

$47,680.00 $74,832.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE: S /

e

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS
BID DATE: MAY 2, 2007 _

BID # 2007-155
DEPARTMENT: STREET

THE LEHIGH SAFETY SHOE
COMPANY, LLC
NELSONVILLE, OH

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
" [TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

B. NO OPTION OFFERED

NET - 30 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
7 - 10 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS . CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY A COMPLETION DATE, THE CITY'
A COMPLETION DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DATE MAY E

S REQUIRED COMPLETION DATE SHALL PREVAIL.
BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 41

BIDS RECEIVED: 8

BIDS LOCAL: 15

NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:
,<//AV 7

s

NATE-

2007-149 DUTY UNIFORMS - REBID - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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ALCO INDUSRTRIAL
3525 HUECO STREET
EL PASO, TX 79303

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 72825

FAMOUS UNIFORMS

DBA B.J.'S UNIFORMS

3942 LEOPARD .
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408 -

IRON AGE PROTECTIVE CO.
2914 YANDELL AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

PROFESSIONAL POLICE SUPPLY
722 CLAT STREET
OAKLAND, CA 94507

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERV. SUBS OF
UNIFIRST CORP.

P. 0. BOX 26159

EL PASO, TX 79926

SUN CITY EMBRIODERY
8300 CARNEGIE SUITEB -

EL PASO, TX 79925

CLIFTON UNIFORM
529 MAIN STREET
LOVELAND, OH 45140

CABELA’S INC
ONE CABEL DRIVE
- SIDNEY, NE 69160

LION APPAREL
—6450-POE AVENUE-~ - -== = = -
DAYTON, OH 45413-0576

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMMARRON
EL PASO, TX 799015

EAGLE CREST, INC
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD.

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32205

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S, WESTERN AVENUE

- GARDENA, CA 90247

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3535 YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TX 79925

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY |
141 SUMIT AVENUE SUITE 2
PLANO, TX 75074

ROCK’S/SCHOOL WEAR
4727 HONDO PASS #H
EL PASO, TX 79904

PRUDENTIAL OVERALL SUPPLY
200 E. SUNSET DRIVE SUITE G
EL PASO, TX 79922

MAGIC CITY SALES
4363 FIRST AVENUE NORTH

- BIRMINGHAM, AL 35222

DICK RIDDLE.
P. 0. BOX 2168
MADISON, MS 39130

WEARGUARD

T41-LONGWATER DRIVE ~ ===+ = - ==

NORWELL, MA 02061

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MENS STORE |
304 E. OVERLAND '
EL PASO, TX 79901

EXCLUSIVE LAW ENFORCEMENT
3004 DONNER LAKE CIRCLE
DENTON, TX 76210-2900

HARBOR LINEN CO.
P. 0. BOX 3510
CHERRY HILL, IN 08034

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARKWAY SUITE C
TUCSON, AZ 85713

SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

WORKWEAR SAFETY
1346 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

PORTMOUTH ARMIE NAVIE STORES,
INC. . ‘ .
1817 HIGH STREET

PORTSMOUTH, VA 23704

.BOTACH

925 415T STREET SUITE 306 _
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33140

* UNIFORMS MANUFACTORING

P. 0. BOX 12716
SCOSTDALE, AZ 85267

PRIZM INC/UNIPRO

320 ELIZABETHAVENUE SUFTE 204— -

NEWWARK, NJ 07112




EMBRIODERY MACHINES PLUS LLC
1309 TEXAS AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

VERNON SALES PROWO
2625 DESERT AIRE
CHAPARRAL, NM 88081

US CAVALRY _
2855 CENTENNIAL AVENUE
RADCLIFF, KY 40160

PARROTT PROD’U’CTIONS
408 N. CAROLINA DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79915

MILTON A. GOLDBERT CO.
7 SEWARD AVENUE
BEVERLY, MA 01815

- SERENDIPITY

836 FREDERICKSBURG ROAD
NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130-6016

MATTEW OPPERMAN
15832 SW 66 LANE
MIAMI, FL 33193-3637

TRANSCON MANUFACTORING
5725 SOUTH MAIN STREET
LOS ANGELES, CA 90037-4171

THE TOMASTON CORP.

303 FIFTH AVENUE
NEW YORK, NY 10016

INDUSTRIAL DISC. FOOTWEAR
- 15324 WERLING COURT

EL PASO, TX 79928

. EMBLEM ENTERPRISE
. P. 0. BOX 10033

VANNUYS, CA 91410






