CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

AGENDA DATE: TBD by Purchasing - JULY 29, 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE ELLEN A. SMYTH, P.E., 621-6719
TERRENCE FREIBURG, PURCHASING MANAGER, 541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: ___ALL

SUBJECT:
Approve Bid #2008-149 in the amount of $89.,270.50 for uniform and safety items
for FY2007.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSIONS:

Approval of Bid #2008-149 would be beneficial to our department and city, to
provide department employees with proper uniforms as soon as possible at cost bid
by vendors in Fy2008.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
The City Council has not previously considered this item or a closely related one.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Items will be funded from current revenues. The items have been budgeted. The
account numbers are 503120 (Uniform Supplies) and 503123 (Safety Supplies). It
does not require a budget transfer. The amount is $89,270.50 and the fund is 40403.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION*******************

LEGAL: FINANCE: _

DEPARTMENT HEAD / CLIENT DEPT: T

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT:

SOLICITATION NO:

DEPARTMENT:
BUDGET NO:

FUNDING SOURCE:

PROJECT FORM
DATE: JULY 14, 2008

UNIFORMS

2008-149

ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
34010286-503120-503123 -40403
34010289-503120-503123 -40403
34010291-503120-503123 -40403
34010292-503120-503123 -40403
34010293-503120-503123 -40403
34010294-503120-503123 -40403
34010296-503120-503123 -40403

CODE ENFORCEMENT-ADMINISTRATIVE/SAFETY-COLLECTIONS-FLEET-AIR
QUALITY-SPECIAL COLLECTIONS-LANDFILL

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

RECOMMENDATION:

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

Vendor (1): BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN’S STORE, LLC
El Paso, TX

Iltem: 5,6,9, 10, & 11

Yearly Amount: $41,794.70 Estimated

Vendor (2): MISSION LINEN SUPPLY
El Paso, TX

Iltem: 1,12, 13, & 14

Yearly Amount: $22,801.00 Estimated

Vendor (3): ORIENT ARTS,INC./dba THE UNISOURCE COMPANY
Carlstadt, NJ

Item: 2

“Yearly Amount: $1,080.00 Estimated

Vendor (4): PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS, INC.
Green Bay, WI

ltem: 8

Yearly Amount: $1,079.70 Estimated

Vendor (5): R4 INDUSTRIES, INC.
Arlington, TX

ltem: 3,15,17, & 18

Yearly Amount: $16,006.60 Estimated

Vendor (6): UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
El Paso, TX

ltem: 4&16

Yearly Amount: $6,508.50 Estimated

ltem #7 — Item not needed. Department will not be furnishing this item.

This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of thirty-six (36) months.




The cost under this requirement contract is only an estimated value. The actual cost of this contract may be
higher or lower than the total estimated value and will be the sum total at the end of the contract term so
long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

Vendor (1) offers the City the option of extending the term of the contract:
One additional year, at the same unit price(s), if the option is exercised within one year from the date of
award of the Contract.

Vendor (2) offers the following payment terms: 2% - 10 days discount or 1% - 20 days discount.

Vendor (5) offers the City the option of extending the term of the contract:
One additional year, at the same unit price(s), if the option is exercised within one year from the date of
award of the Contract. Vendor (5) offers the following payment terms: 2% - 10 days discount.

Vendor (6) offers the City the option of extending the term of the contract:
One additional year, at the same unit price(s), if the option is exercised within one year from the date of
award of the Contract.

The Environmental Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award as indicated to the
lowest responsive, responsible Bidders.

BIDS SOLICITED 19 (13 local)
BIDS RECEIVED «
“NO BID” RECEIVED

—
o

o
o

ANNUAL ESTIMATED AWARD: $89,270.50
TOTAL RECOMMENDED ESTIMATED AWARD: $267,811.50
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;¢ ‘ : . ‘ COUNCIL MEETING DATE: JULY 29, 2008

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manag MMJ




ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

UNIFORM - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
BID NUMBER 2008-149

BAZAAR UNIFORM & MEN'S STORE- $41,794.70
ITEM#5 $2,669.70

ITEM#6  $11,798.00

ITEM#9 $5,936.00

ITEM#10 $17,835.00

ITEM #11 $3,556.00

MISSION LINEN SUPPLY -$ 22,801.00
ITEM#1 $15,232.00

ITEM#12 $2,890.00

ITEM#13 $2,385.00

ITEM # 14 $2,294.00

ORIENT ARTS INC. - $1,080.00
ITEM#2 $1,080.00

PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. - $1,079.70
ITEM#8 $1,079.70

- R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. - $16,006.60
ITEM#3 $1,859.00
ITEM # 15 $5,637.00
ITEM#17 $1,335.60
ITEM # 18 $7,175.00

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS- $6,508.50
ITEM#4 $1,10850
ITEM #16 $5,400.00

Total amount is $89 270.50

Funds are available in 34010286-503120 and 503123 Code Enforcement
Funds are available in 34010289-503120 and 503123 Administration/Safety
Funds are available in 34010291-503120 and 503123 Collections

- Funds are available in 34010292-503120 and 503123 Fleet

" Funds are available in 34010293- 503120 and 503123 Air Quality

Funds are available in 34010293- 503120 and 503123 Special Collections
‘Funds are available in 34010294- 503120 and 503123 Landfill

L Total amount allocated funds avallable $89 270. 50




ITEM #1
ITEM #2
ITEM #3
ITEM #4

ITEM #5

ITEM #6

ITEM #7

ITEM #8

ITEM #9

ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICEES
2007/2008 UNIFORM BID RECOMMENDATIONS
BID #2008-149

MISSION LINEN SUPPLY IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS
THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

ORIENT ARTS - IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS THEY ARE
THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS THEY
ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS
THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS IS THE SECOND LOWEST BIDDER AND IS
RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS THEIR PRODUCT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS. THE LOWEST BIDDER ROCKY MOUNTAIN’S
PRODUCT DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS. PRODUCT IS NOT A
DRESS BOOT AND DOES NOT HAVE WESTERN HEELS.

THIRD LOWEST BIDDERS IS BAZAAR; THEIR PRODUCT IS OUR
RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD AS IT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS.  LOWEST BIDDER NORTHERN IMPORTS
PRODUCT DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS. PRODUCT ONLY
COMES IN REGULAR SIZES, NO WIDE SIZES AVAILABLE.
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER ROCKY BRANDS PRODUCT IS A LOW
CUT SHOE, ANKLE SUPPORT NEEDED.

ITEM NOT NEEDED. DEPARTMENT WILL NOT BE FURNISHING
THIS ITEM.

PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
AS THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER.

SECOND LOWEST BIDDER BAZAAR UNIFORMS IS OUR
RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD AS IT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS. LOWEST BIDDER MISSION LINEN DOES NOT
MEET SPECIFICATIONS. MATERIAL IS OF HEAVY WEIGHT
BLEND.




ITEM #10

ITEM #11

ITEM #12

ITEM #13

ITEM #14

ITEM #15

ITEM#16

ITEM #17

SECOND LOWEST BIDDER BAZAAR UNIFORMS PRODUCT IS
OUR RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD AS IT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS. LOWEST BIDDER, MISSION LINEN SUPPLY’S
PRODUCT DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS AS IT ONLY HAS AN
18” BOTTOM LEG OPENING.

SECOND LOWEST BIDDER BAZAAR UNIFORMS IS OUR
RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD AS IT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS. LOWEST BIDDER MISSION LINEN SUPPLY
PRODUCT DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS, SAMPLE
PROVIDED DOES NOT HAVE LEFT CHEST POCKET.

MISSION LINEN SUPPLIES IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS
THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

MISSION LINEN SUPPLIES IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS
THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

MISSION LINEN SUPPLIES IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS
THEY ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

.R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS THEY

ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.

THIRD LOWEST BIDDER UNIFORMS OF TEXAS IS OUR
RECOMMENDATION FOR ~AWARD AS IT MEETS OUR
SPECIFICATIONS. LOWEST BIDDER MISSION LINEN SUPPLY
PRODUCT DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS. PRODUCT IS NOT
SCOTCHGUARD STAIN RESISTANCE PROTECTED AND IS NOT 8
%2 "TWILL. SECOND LOWEST BIDDER IS BAZAAR UNIFORMS.
THEIR PRODUCT DICKIE 211-2272 ALSO DOES NOT MEET
SPECIFICATIONS. PRODUCT IS NOT SCOTCHGUARD STAIN
RESISTANCE PROTECTED AND IS 7 % TWILL. THEIR
ALTERNATE PRODUCT DICKIE 874 IS HIGHER THAN BIDDER
NUMBER 3 WHICH ALSO PROVIDES THE SAME DICKIE 874
PRODUCT FOR $.49 TO $1.69 LOWER THAN BAZAAR
UNIFORMS.

R4 INDUSTRIES, INC IS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD AS THEY
ARE THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDDER.




ITEM #18 SECOND LOWEST BIDDER R4 INDUSTRIES INC’S PRODUCT
MEETS OUR SPECIFICATIONS AND IS OUR RECOMMENDATION
FOR AWARD. THE LOWEST BIDDER, MISSION LINEN SUPPLY’S
PRODUCT DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS. PRODUCT IS NOT
WESTERN CUT AND DOES NOT HAVE TRIPLE PEARL SNAPS ON
CUFFS.

RODOLFO F. MADRID
MATERIAL SPECIALIST
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
CITY OF EL PASO




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS CORPORATE CONNECTION MISSION LINEN AND DBA WORK WEAR
& MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX UNIFORM SUPPLY SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
, SHIRT, WORK, UNIFORM, LONG
1. 800 SLEEVE, LIGHT BLUE, W/REFLECTIVE $22.79 $18,232.00 $35.25 $28,200.00 $19.04 $15,232.00 N/B
MATERIAL WITH SLEEVE PATCH, (2XL & 3XL: $23.99)
DICKIE VL 101, OR EQUAL |
MANUFACTURER DICKIE VL 101 DICKIES DICKIES X
CATALOG NO. DICKIES 2008 vL101 VL101
2. 600 GAP, WITH SLEEVE PATCH $2.19 $1,314.00 $6.85 $4,110.00 $1.88 $1,128.00 N/B
MANUFACTURER OTTO CAP 19-061 OoTTO OTTO CAPS
CATALOG NO. oTTO 19028 27-063
3. 100 MEN'S SLASH POCKET JACKET $19.49 $1,949.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $19.91 $1,991.00 NB .
WITH SLEEVE PATCH (2XL AND UP: $23.39)
MANUFACTURER VF IMAGEWEAR JT22NV DICKIES _ DICKIES
CATALOG NO. RED KAP 2007 JT15 JT15
4, 30 COVERALL, INSULATED BLUE $38.99 $1,169.70 $61.00 $1,830.00 $40.87 $1,226.10 N/B
WITH SLEEVE PATCH (2XL AND ABOVE: $40.99)
MANUFACTURER VF IMAGEWEAR CT30NV DICKIES DICKIES
CATALOG NO. RED KAP 2007 TV261
5. 30 BOOT, WESTERN WORK, 13" $88.99 $2,669.70 $102.00 $3,060.00 N/IA $89.50 $2,685.00
COWHIDE, DOUBLE H 2307 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER - DOUBLE H BOOT 2307 DOUBLE H DOUBLE H
CATALOG NO. ‘ DOUBLE H BOOT 2307 2307
TENNIS SHOE, BLACK SPORT/WORK
6. 200 STYLE, SAFETY TOE, CONVERSE - $58.99 $11,798.00 $98.00 $19,600.00 N/A $45.95 $9,190.00
C1550 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD 804-6033 BIG BILL WORKWEAR CONVERSE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER 2007 BB-6200 C1950

“~
APPROVED BY:@. / Q@\g

DATE: ¢

/

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[ﬁ) ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.
BAZAAR UNIFORMS CORPORATE CONNECTION MISSION LINEN AND DBA WORK WEAR
& MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX UNIFORM SUPPLY SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM | EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
7. ~ 100 ROPER BOOT WITH STEEL TOE, $87.86 $8,786.00 $130.00 $13,000.00 $61.00 $6,100.00 $69.95 $6,995.00
HYTEST 15262 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD 804-4580 DOUBLEH SHOES FOR CREWS IRONAGE
CATALOG NO. WEINBRENNER 2007 3830 #8095 629
"MANAGER" OXFORD SHOES, CASUAL,
8. 30 DRESS STYLE STEEL TOE, PREMIUM $63.99 $1,919.70 $75.00 $2,250.00 N/A $49.50 $1,485.00
. EASY CARE LEATHER UPPER . : : :
MANUFACTURER NAUTILUS 7160 BLACK BIG BILL WORKWEAR HYTEST
» 2008 OCCUPATIONAL BB2101 50200
CATALOG NO. SAFETY FOOTWEAR
T-SHIRT, 50/50, VARIOUS COLORS
9. 1,400 & DESIGNS, LONG SLEEVES MEDIUM $4.24 $5,936.00 $7.85 $10,990.00 $3.58 $5,012.00 N/B
TO 4XL, ENVIRONMENTAL LOGO (2XL: $5.29)
IMPRINT ON FRONT LEFT SIDE (3XL: $5.79)
MANUFACTURER FRUIT OF THE LOOM 7930 JERZEES SAN MAR
CATALOG NO. APPAREL & ACCESSORIES 2008 29LS 50/50
10. 1,500 PANTS, DENIM, LOOSE FIT, $11.89 $17,835.00 $13.50 $20,250.00 $10.62 $15,930.00 $18.00 $27,000.00
DICKIE DD 300 OR EQUAL (46 AND UP: $12.89) o : :
MANUFACTURER DICKIES CR393RNB DICKIE DD300 (DISCONTINUED) RED KAP DICKIE .
CATALOG NO. DICKIES OCCUPATIONAL DICKIES 939NB PD61PW DO 300
SHIRT, POLO, 50/50 SPORT SHIRT ; ' } .
1. 400 WITH POCKET, VARIOUS COLORS, $8.89 ) $3,556.00 $13.75 $5,500.00 $6.04 $2,416.00 N/B
EMBROIDERED - 3 LINES, HANES (2XL - 4XL: $9.99)
STEDMAN 50150 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER ANVIL 4630 HANES SAN MAR
CATALOG NO. BRODER 2008 50150 HANES 50/50
PANTS, UNIFORM DRESS,
12. 200 VARIOUS COLORS, $15.89 ’ - $3,178.00 $17.50 $3,500.00 $14.45 $2,890.00 N/B
EDWARDS 2510 OR EQUAL (44 AND UP: $19.13)
MANUFACTURER EDWARDS 2510 EDWARDS EDWARDS
EDWARDS 2008 2510 2510
CATALOG NO. APPAREL & ACCESSORIES

APPROVED BY: Db
DATE: 5/'1/[ 08

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS CORPORATE CONNECTION MISSION LINEN AND DBA WORK WEAR
& MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX UNIFORM SUPPLY SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM || EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
13. 500° SHOP APRON, DENIM $6.79 $3,395.00 $9.25 $4,625.00 $4.77 $2,385.00 $7.29 $3,645.00
MANUFACTURER DICKIES AC20 DICKIES MISSION ERB
CATALOG NO. DICKIES 2008 CATALOG ACZONB Fa
3.SEASON JACKET, VARIOUS
14. 100 COLORS, CITY LOGO, $26.99 $2,699.00 $36.00 $3,600.00 $22.94 $2,294.00 N/B
- EMBROIDERED-3 LINES (2XL - 5XL: $28.99)
MANUFACTURER PORT AUTHORITY JP54 HARTMELL SAN MAR
CATALOG NO. APPAREL & ACCESSORIES 2008 3660 JP54 PG419
15. 300 MEN'S QUILTED VEST, BLUE, $19.49 $5,847.00 $24.50 $7,350.00 $19.76 $5,928.00 N/B
EMBROIDERED, 3 LINE (2XL AND ABOVE: $22.99)
MANUFACTURER RED KAP VT22NV RED CAP RED KAP
CATALOG NO. VF IMAGEWEAR 2007 VTZZ NV VT22
16. 400 PANTS, WORK, VARIOUS COLORS $12.59 $5,036.00 $23.00 $9,200.00 $12.10 $4,840.00 $17.50 $7,000.00
‘ : ‘ - (44 AND ABOVE: | (ALT: $13.99,44 8 : : -
$13.49) ABOVE: $15.19)
MANUFACTURER DICKIES 2112272 | (ALT: DICKIES DICKIES RED KAP DICKIES 874
CATALOG NO. DICKIES 2008 874) 874 PT10 874
- POLO SHIRT, FEMALE, VARIOUS .
17. 120- COLORS, EMBROIDERED - 3 LINE, $11.94 $1,432.80 $13.95 $1,674.00 $12.40 $1,488.00 N/B
HARTWELL 3015 OR EQUAL (SIZE 2XL AND ABOVE: $13.99)
MANUFACTURER : HARTWELL 3015 HARTWELL HARTWELL
CATALOG NO. HARTWELL 2008 3015 3015
18. 500 SHIRT, DENIM, WESTERN, BLUE $15.87 $7,935.00 $23.50 $11,750.00 $13.61 $6,805.00 N/B
CITY LOGO, EMBROIDERED 3-LINE (SIZE 2XL AND ABOVE: $18.49)
MANUFACTURER ‘ RED KAP SC14LB WALLS DICKIES
CATALOG NO. VG IMAGEWEAR 2007 B56039CY 1145573
GRAND TOTAL PRICE: $104,687.90 $153,989.00 $75,665.10 $58,000.00

- APPROVED BY: D /i
DATE: 5[24(2 9

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14,2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

NORTHERN IMPORTS INC.

|IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

B. TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO
EXPIRATION OF THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

A. ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,

]

[]

[]

BAZAAR UNIFORMS CORPORATE CONNECTION MISSION LINEN AND DBA WORK WEAR
& MEN'S STORE EL PASO, TX UNIFORM SUPPLY SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE

TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

PLEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX

NONE STATED NONE STATED

]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

2% - 10 DAYS / 1% - 20 DAYS
(% LISTED BUT NOT CHECKED OFF)

2% - 10 DAYS OR
NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

25 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

15 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

30 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

30 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLiER DE

| IVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

APPROVED BY: _K%_
onre; 5121 09

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ORIENT ARTS INC.

DBA THE UNISOURCE PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCKS/SCHOOL WEAR
COMPANY GREEN BAY, WI ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
CARLSTADT, NJ
ITEM | EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION ONITPRIGE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE_ || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
SHIRT, WORK, UNIFORM, LONG '
1. 800 SLEEVE, LIGHT BLUE, W/REFLECTIVE $27.75 $22,200.00 $31.00 $24,800.00 $23.54 $18,832.00 NO BID
MATERIAL WITH SLEEVE PATCH, (2X - 3X: $34.00)
DICKIE VL 101, OR EQUAL (TALLS: $37.00)
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES DICKIES
CATALOG NO. VL101 VL101 VL101
2. | 600 CAP, WITH SLEEVE PATCH $1.80 $1,080.00 $3.00 $1,800.00 $2.77 $1,662.00 NO BID
MANUFACTURER KC CAP KC CAP. oTTO
CATALOG NO. 1000 6010S 19-061 SOLID OR 19-092 2 TONE
3. 100 MEN'S SLASH POCKET JACKET $25.50 $2,550.00 $29.75 $2,975.00 $18.59 $1,859.00 NO BID
WITH SLEEVE PATCH (2X - 3X: $34.75)
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES DICKIES
CATALOG NO. JT15 JT15 JT15
$56.50 |  $1,695.00
4. 30 COVERALL, INSULATED BLUE $48.50 $1,455.00 (2X: $61.50) $40.52 $1,215.60 NO BID
" WITH SLEEVE PATCH ‘ (3X - 4X: $66.50)
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES - DICKIES
CATALOG NO. TV261 TV261 TV261,
5. 30 BOOT, WESTERN WORK, 13" $165.00 $4,950.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 NO BID NO BID
COWHIDE, DOUBLE H 2307 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER - GEORGIA BOOT DOUBLE H
CATALOG NO. G4943 2307
TENNIS SHOE, BLACK SPORT/WORK _
6. 200 STYLE, SAFETY TOE, CONVERSE $94.00 $18,800.00 $75.00 $15,000.00 NO BID NO BID
, C1550 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER LEHIGH CONVERSE
CATALOG NO. 5502 C1550

APPROVED BY: Oﬁ&
DATE: 5/3/103

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2008-149
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008 DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
ORIENT ARTS INC.
DBA THE UNISOURCE PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCKS/SCHOOL WEAR
COMPANY GREEN BAY, WI ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
\ CARLSTADT, NJ
ITEM || .EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
7. 100 ROPER BOOT WITH STEEL TOE, $145.00 $14,500.00 $120.00 $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID
HYTEST 15262 OR EQUAL :
MANUFACTURER GEORGIA BOOT HYTEST
CATALOG NO. G1075 15262 -
"MANAGER" OXFORD SHOES, CASUAL,
8. 30 DRESS STYLE STEEL TOE, PREMIUM $85.00 $2,550.00 $35.99 $1,079.70 NO BID NO BID
"EASY CARE LEATHER UPPER ' 4 .
MANUFACTURER LEHIGH MANAGER OXFORD
CATALOG NO. 5430
T-SHIRT, 50/50, VARIOUS COLORS
9. 1,400 & DESIGNS, LONG SLEEVE-MEDIUM $4.65 $6,510.00 $4.95 $6,930.00 $5.34 $7,476.00 $4.91 $6,874.00
TO 4XL, ENVIRONMENTAL LOGO (2X - 3X: $5.95) (XXL, 3XL, 4XL: $6.41 EACH)
IMPRINT ON FRONT LEFT SIDE (4X - 5X: $6.45) |
MANUFACTURER GILDAN GILDAN GILDAN JERZEES
CATALOG NO. G8800 8400 8400 29LS JERZEES
- ' WAIST: 30-44 '
-10. 1,500 PANTS, DENIM, LOOSE FIT, $18.10 $27,150.00 $21.95 $32,925.00 $19.20 $28,800.00 NO BID
DICKIE DD 300 OR EQUAL ‘ (WAIST 46-50: $23.95)
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES DICKIES
CATALOG NO. DD305 DD300 DD300 ‘ ..
SHIRT, POLO, 50/50 SPORT SHIRT . (SM-XL) $9.22 l © $3,688.00
1. 400 WITH POCKET, VARIOUS COLORS, $12.00 $4,800.00 $8.95 $3,580.00 $9.10 $3,640.00 (XXL ADD $1.50 EACH)
EMBROIDERED - 3 LINES, HANES (2X -4X: $9.75) (3XL ADD $2.00 EACH)
STEDMAN 50150 OR EQUAL I (4XL ADD $2.50 EACH)
MANUFACTURER HANES STEDMAN STEDMAN HANES STEDMAN BY HANES
CATALOG NO. 0504 0504 0504 STEDMAN 0504
PANTS, UNIFORM DRESS, WAIST: 28-42
12. 200 VARIOUS COLORS, $20.75 $4,150.00 $19.45 $3,890.00 $16.99 $3,398.00 NO BID
EDWARDS 2510 OR EQUAL ' (WAIST 42+: $23.34) '
MANUFACTURER EDWARDS EDWARDS EDWARDS
CATALOG NO. 2510 2510 2510

APPROVED BY: ’@b
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION
BID ITEM: UNIFORMS BID # 2008-149
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008 DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
ORIENT ARTS INC.
DBA THE UNISOURCE PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCKS/SCHOOL WEAR
COMPANY GREEN BAY, WI ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
CARLSTADT, NJ
ITEM | EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE
13. 500 SHOP APRON, DENIM $10.50 $5,250.00 $9.75 $4,875.00 $10.82 $5,410.00 NO BID
MANUFACTURER DICKIES MLF SEVEN MILE CREEK
CATALOG NO. ACZONB APTCO EL PASO ES CUSTOM
(SM-XL) $37.95 |  $3,795.00
14. 100 3-SEASON JACKET, VARIOUS $32.00 $3,200.00 $33.95 $3,395.00 $34.18 $3,418.00 (XXL ADD $1.00 EACH)
COLORS, CITY LOGO, (2X: $36.00) | (3X: $38.50) (3XL ADD $2.00 EACH)
EMBROIDERED-3 LINES (4X: $41.00) | (5X: $43.50) (4XL ADD $3.00 EACH)
HARTWELL RIVERS END HARTWELL (PRICED PER SPEC HARTWELL
MANUFACTURER WILOGO DIRECT EMB + 3 LINES)
CATALOG NO. 3660 2110 3660 3660
(SM-XL)
15. 300 MEN'S QUILTED VEST, BLUE, $26.25 $7,875.00 $22.75 $6,825.00 $18.79 $5,637.00 NO BID
_ EMBROIDERED, 3 LINE (2X - 3X: $26.95)
MANUFACTURER RED KAP RED KAP RED KAP
CATALOG NO. VT22 VT220H VT22NV
, WAIST 26-44:
16. 400 PANTS, WORK, VARIOUS COLORS $18.00 $7,200.00 $19.95 $7,980.00 $14.45 $5,780.00 NO BID
: (WAIST 46-50: $21.95) (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $5,410.00)
(WAIST 52-60: $23.95) ' |
MANUFACTURER DICKIES DICKIES DICKIES
CATALOG NO. 874 874 874
POLO SHIRT, FEMALE, VARIOUS ‘ (SM-XL) $1270 |  $1,524.00
17. 120 COLORS, EMBROIDERED - 3 LINE, $13.75 $1,650.00 $11.15 $1,338.00 $11.13 $1,335.60 (XXL ADD $1.00 EACH)
HARTWELL 3015 OR EQUAL (2X: $12.50) (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,3335.60) (3XL ADD $2.00 EACH)
MANUFACTURER HARTWELL HARTWELL HARTWELL HARTWELL
CATALOG NO. 3015 3015 3015 3015

APPROVED BY: ’<0 /&

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ORIENT ARTS INC.
DBA THE UNISOURCE PROMOTIONAL DESIGNS INC. R4 INDUSTRIES, INC. ROCKS/SCHOOL WEAR
COMPANY GREEN BAY, WI ARLINGTON, TX EL PASO, TX
CARLSTADT, NJ
ITEM || EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION SNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | . TOTAL PRICE

SHORT:

$16.15 $8,075.00

LONG:

18. 500 SHIRT, DENIM, WESTERN, BLUE $19.25 $9,625.00 $18.15 $14.35 $7,175.00 NO BID $0.00
CITY LOGO, EMBROIDERED 3-LINE (SHORT - 2X - 4X: $17.65)
(SHORT - 5X: $19.05)

(LONG - 2X - 3X: $19.65)

(LONG - TALLS: $21.65)
MANUFACTURER RED KAP . DICKIES RED KAP

SHORT SLEEVE: 7141573
CATALOG NO. sci4 LONG SLEEVE: 1145573 Sc14LB

GRAND TOTAL PRICE: $145,495.00 $142,912.70 $95,638.20 $15,881.00
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:
PLEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX | :
NONE STATED NONE STATED
A. ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF , .
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.
B. TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO [ ] [] ] [ ]
EXPIRATION OF THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.
o/, - of o
NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS: . NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: NONE STATED 30 CONSECUTIVE DAYS|30 CONSECUTIVE DAYS| 14 OR 10 WORKING DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

APPROVED'BY: ‘ZQ@

DATE: 5’;1//057
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

ROCKY BRANDS RETAIL LLC
DBA LEHIGH SAFETY UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
SHOE CO LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH ‘
ITEM | EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
SHIRT, WORK, UNIFORM, LONG
1. 800 SLEEVE, LIGHT BLUE, W/REFLECTIVE NO BID $22.00 $17,600.00
' MATERIAL WITH SLEEVE PATCH,
. DICKIE VL 101, OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. VL101
2. 600 CAP, WITH SLEEVE PATCH NO BID $3.89 $2,334.00
MANUFACTURER CHESTNUT
CATALOG NO. €800
3. 100 MEN'S SLASH POCKET JACKET NO BID $19.87 $1,987.00
WITH SLEEVE PATCH
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. JT15
4, 30 COVERALL, INSULATED BLUE NO BID $36.95 $1,108.50
WITH SLEEVE PATCH : :
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. TV261
5. 30 BOOT, WESTERN WORK, 13" $80.00 $2,400.00 NO BID
COWHIDE, DOUBLE H 2307 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER ROCKY
CATALOG NO. 6732
TENNIS SHOE, BLACK SPORT/WORK
6. 200 STYLE, SAFETY TOE, CONVERSE $48.00 $9,600.00 $64.50 $12,900.00
' C1550 OR EQUAL )
MANUFACTURER LEHIGH CONVERSE
CATALQG NO. 5502 C4375

Vi
APPROVED BY: AD
DATE: 5[3//0 4
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ROCKY BRANDS RETAIL LLC
DBA LEHIGH SAFETY UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
SHOE COLLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM || EST. QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
7. 100 ROPER BOOT WITH STEEL TOE, $80.00 $8,000.00 NO BID
: HYTEST 15262 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER GEORGIA BOOT
CATALOG NO. G1075
"MANAGER" OXFORD SHOES, CASUAL,
8. 30 DRESS STYLE STEEL TOE, PREMIUM $50.00 $1,500.00 “ $43.95 $1,318.50
' "EASY CARE LEATHER UPPER ' '
MANUFACTURER LEHIGH SHOE FOR CREWS
GATALOG NO. 5332
T-SHIRT, 50/50, VARIOUS COLORS
9. 1,400 & DESIGNS, LONG SLEEVE MEDIUM NO BID $4.50 $6,300.00
TO 4XL, ENVIRONMENTAL LOGO
IMPRINT ON FRONT LEFT SIDE
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NO. 8400
10. 1,500 PANTS, DENIM, LOOSE FIT, NO BID $13.95 $20,925.00
DICKIE DD 300 OR EQUAL :
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. DD305
SHIRT, POLO, 50/50 SPORT SHIRT '
1. 400 WITH POCKET, VARIOUS COLORS, NO BID $11.95 $4,780.00
‘ EMBROIDERED - 3 LINES, HANES
STEDMAN 50150 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NO. 436MP
PANTS, UNIFORM DRESS, _
12. 200 VARIOUS COLORS, NO BID $16.95 $3,390.00
. , EDWARDS 2510 OR EQUAL '
MANUFACTURER EDWARDS
CATALOG NO. 2510

APPROVED BY: Dd?g
DATE: 520\[!0)
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS

BID # 2008-149
DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

ROCKY BRANDS RETAIL LLC
DBA LEHIGH SAFETY UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
SHOE CO LLC EL PASO, TX
NELSONVILLE, OH
ITEM || EST.QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
13. 500 SHOP APRON, DENIM NO BID - $6.95 $3,475.00
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. : AC20
3-SEASON JACKET, VARIOUS
14, 100 COLORS, CITY LOGO, NO BID $23.95 $2,395.00
EMBROIDERED-3 LINES : , '
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. JN10
15. 300 MEN'S QUILTED VEST, BLUE, NO BID $23.00 $6,900.00
EMBROIDERED, 3 LINE
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. VT22
16. 400 PANTS, WORK, VARIOUS COLORS NO BID " $13.50 $5,400.00
MANUFACTURER DICKIE
CATALOG NO. 874
POLO SHIRT, FEMALE, VARIOUS ' '
7. 120 COLORS, EMBROIDERED - 3 LINE, NO BID " $15.99 $1,918.80
HARTWELL 3015 OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHERS
CATALOG NO. 6092
18. 500 SHIRT, DENIM, WESTERN, BLUE NO BID $17.50 $8,750.00
CITY LOGO, EMBROIDERED 3-LINE :
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. sCc14
GRAND TOTAL PRICE: $21,500.00 $101,481.80

APPROVED BY: @\5

DATE: ;222 (/0 Q
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: UNIFORMS
BID DATE: MAY 14, 2008

BID # 2008-149

DEPARTMENT: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ROCKY BRANDS RETAIL LLC
DBA LEHIGH SAFETY
SHOECO LLC
NELSONVILLE, OH

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

PLEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX

A. ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

B. TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICES, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO
EXPIRATION OF THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

]

]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS .

NET - 30 DAYS .

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

7 - 10 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

30 CONSECUTIVE DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJE

CTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 19

BIDS RECEIVED: 10

BIDS LOCAL: 13

NO BIDS: 0.-*

APPROVED BY: ﬁ%
DATE: 5[0”/009.

2008-149 UNIFORMS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT

12

I




HAREOR LINEN CO.
P. 0. BOX 3510,
CHERRY, HILL, NJ 08034

SCRUBS 4-U \)"Q
1805 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79902

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERVICE
P. 0. BOX 26159
EL PASO, TX 79926

ALCO INDUSTRIAL
3525 B. HUECO STREET
EL PASO, TX 79903

ATTN: RUDY CARRILLO
UNIFIRST

6920 COMMERCE AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES
1346 LEE TREVINO - :
EL PASO, TX 79936

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVENUE
GARDENA, CA 90247

HAMILTON UNIFORMS
P. 0. BOX 357
CROSSWICKS, NJ 08515

~ BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN’S STORE
304 E-OVEREANB-AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79984 Al M@

2130 €. \ands!)
£] Paso. "X 19903

SIGNATURE UNIFORMS
6356 EDGEMERE
EL PASO, TX 79925

PAM HEITZ

ROCK’S /| SCHOOL WEAR
4727 HONDO PASS STEH
EL PASO, TEXAS 79904
(915) 562-4798

(915) 566-0387

PRUDENTIAL OVERALL SUPPLY
200 EAST SUNSET DRIVE SUITE G
EL PASO, TX 79922

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA
EL PASO, TX 79925

EAGLE CREST, INC.
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FL. 32205

SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

LEHIGH SAFETY SHOES
10203 KOTZEBUE SUITE 110
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMARRON
EL PASO, TX 79915

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3555 N. YARBROUGH DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARK AVENUE SUITE C
TUCSON, AZ 85713




