CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services

AGENDA DATE: July 30,2013

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director, 621-6822
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
Solicitation No. 2013-164, Building Electrical Supplies and Related Products

Discussion and action that the Purchasing Manager, Financial Services, Purchasing Division, be
authorized to issue a Purchase Order(s) to Border States Industries, Inc., El Paso effective the date of the
award for an initial term of three [3] years with a 1 year option to renew. The estimated annual
expenditures are $180,000.00 with an estimated total expenditure of $540,000.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
There are currently over 150 facilities owned by the City which will require a variety of electrical supplies. If
approved, this award will allow for corrective and preventive maintenance of electrical repairs which will

enhance the operation of City owned facilities. Local business is being supported.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

This solicitation was advertised on March 12, 2013 and March 19, 2013, and opened on April 10, 2013.
Solicitation was posted on City Website on March 13, 2013. Post cards were mailed out on March 12, 2013;
Purmail notification on March 15,.2013. A total of seventeen [17] bids were solicited with all being local
bidders. A total of six [6] bids were received will all being local bidders.

The following bidders were deemed non-responsive:
Graybar Electric Co. took exemptions to the contract clauses.
Triangle Electrical Supply price list submitted did not match to City’s Cost offered by bidder.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Yes. Council previously approved contract 2009-126 on November 3, 2009, Item 9.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: General Services

Amount $540,000.00

Funds Available: Dept: 231 Div: 31040 Acct: 522260 Fund: 1000 Program Code: P3120
Funds Source: General Services Dept - General Fund — Building Facilities Maintenance

 BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

---------

*:’e:‘:*r’::‘::’:**:’:v‘::‘:**:’:v‘::‘f***AUTHORIZATION*****:’:*****xwxwxwwxw

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Stuart Ed, General Services Director




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(REQUIREMENTS)

dedokodokdokdekdokkkkkdkkkhihkkkihkikkkdhhhkihkkk POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of JULY 30, 2013.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2013-164 Building Electrical Supplies and Related
Products to Border States Industries, Inc./ Border States Electric Supply for an initial term estimated award of

$540.000.00.

Department:
Award to:

ltem(s):

Initial Term: ‘

Option to Extend:

Annual Estimated Award:
Initial Term Estimated Award:
Total Estimated Award:
Account No.: '
Funding Source:

District(s):

General Services

Border States Industries, Inc / Border States Electrical Supply
El Paso, TX

All

3 years

1 year

$180,000

$540,000

$720,000

213 — 31040 — 522260 — 1000 — P3120

General Services Dept — General Fund — Building Facilities Maintenance

All

This is a low bid, requirements type contract.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Services recommend that Gfaybar Electric Co.
and Triangle Electrical Supply be disqualified as non-responsive and the contract be awarded as indicated
to Border States Industries, Inc. / Border States Electrical Supply, the lowest responsive, responsible

bidder.

*******************************************AD D ITI O NAL I N Fo B E LOW********************************************** .




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Au-Ameril

[

2010

] Gity

«

BID'ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,

INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORKX INC.
SUPPLY ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
EL PASO, TX ' EL PASO, TX
20UPI LIGHT.BULR EL PASO, TX ;
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
'TEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [} NET [ NET [
ITEM LIGHT BULBS -80-85 % DISCOUNT [ x] - _75 % DISGOUNT - _ % DISGOUNT ]
1: + % MARKUP L1 |+ % MARKUP [ | +_35 %markup
Discbunthark-up or Net proposed from the
: Price List or Catalog OSRAM SYLVANIA SYLVANIA EIKO
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)‘
List Number ATTACHED ATTACHED PRICE LIST/CD
Dated 3/28/2013 4/10/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST ,
WHOLESALER L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR 1 ]
JOBBER Ll 1 1
DEALER Ll L] L]
RETAILER 1 1 L]
OTHER ] ' 1 L]

APPROVED BY: $ g

DI;TE: LQ\\&\ \3

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

[eD ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
SUPPLY ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
TEM DESCRIP — - ==
: ESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET. [] NET [ NET [ ]
ITEM LIGHT BULBS - %DISCOUNT L} - _75 % DISCOUNT - _%DISCOUNT L[]
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST) -
2: : + % MARKUP L1 + % MARKUP L1 + 35 % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Gatalog NO BID SAME AS ABOVE HALCO [ MAXLITE
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number O BID ATTACHED PRICE LIST/CD
Dated 4/10/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L] []
JOBBER 1 L1 L]
DEALER ] ] L]
RETAILER L] L] L]
OTHER 1 L L

APPROVED BY: & \')
pATE: _(p=\ ] -\3

: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

2010

[BiD TTEM: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES, :
INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
SUPPLY EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX : ;
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
'TEN DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
. NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM WIRE & WIRE CONNECTORS - %bpiscount (] - _20 % DISCOUNT - _ % DISCOUNT L]
1: 5 +_14 % MARKUP + % MARKUP HERE % MARKUP L1
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
' Price List or Catalog ENCORE WIRE IDEAL NO BID
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number TRADE SERVICE
Dated " 4/4/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] L]
JOBBER ] L] ]
DEALER ] ] L]
RETAILER 1 L] 1
OTHER x]  COPPER VALUE OF
(x] THE DAY L]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Q(V
DATE: lo— 2-12

-,

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Ali-AmericaClty

2010

EI ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 . DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
INC. /BORDER STATES ELEGTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
SUPPLY - ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX =0,
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION _ — : —
| OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
: NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM WIRE & WIRE CONNECTORS - %DISCOUNT L] -__ %DISCOUNT [ - _%DISCOUNT [l
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST)
2: + % MARKUP L] + % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP 1
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog NO BID NO BID NO BID
(MANUFACTURE.R OR BRAND NAME) .
List Number
Dated
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] L] ]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER (] ] L1
RETAILER ] L 1
OTHER 1
NOTE: The information c'omnt n; in

API;"ROVED BY: ﬂ g ‘

>

DATE: ol

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

BID iTEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
NC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC

CONSOLIDATED
ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)

ECO WORX INC.

ELSFK,J:sPé_YTX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESC I — - — —
WM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
, NeT [ NET [ NeT [
ITEM LIGHTING BALLASTS - 88-92 % DISCOUNT -~ _75 % DISCOUNT - _ % DISCOUNT ]
1 +. % MARKUP (] + % MARKUP ] + 35 % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
: Price List or Catalog UNIVERSAL HALCO
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number . UNIVERSAL TRADE DP509ZW| ATTACHED PRICE LIST
Dated 9/26/2012 4/10/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST .
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L1 L]
' JOBBER ] L1 L]
DEALER ] ] L]
RETAILER L] [ L]
OTHER ] ]

NOTE: The information cbnféiﬁe

APPROVED BY: ﬁp
DATE: _[p~13- 12

ation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

Rit-BmericaCity

' 210 )
[BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUGTS BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
ING. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
SUPPLY EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ;
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
'TEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM LIGHTING BALLASTS - %piscount 1. | -__ %mpiscount I - _%DISCOUNT LI
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST) - ,
2: + % MARKUP R % MARKUP L1 |+ 35 %mARKup
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog NO BID NO BID
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME) ’
List Number ATTACHED PRICE LIST
Dated 4/10/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR 1 1
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] [
RETAILER [ ] ]
OTHER M .
I

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: % ()

DA%E:

(M |

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




El Pa

S0
By

CITY OF EL PASO bt
BID TABULATION | 11l

2010

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,

NC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
: ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
SUPPLY El PASO.T EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ASO, TX

. PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING "~ PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION — — —
R OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [} NET [ NET L[]
ITEM CONDUIT & RELATED SUPPLIES -~ %DISCOUNT L] - _60 % DISCOUNT - _%DISCOUNT ||
1: : +_16__ % MARKUP + % MARKUP HEE % MARKUP L1
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
{(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE)
List Number ATTACHED LIST
Dated 1/14/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] ]
DISTRIBUTOR 1 L1 1
JOBBER [ ] []
DEALER ] 1 L]
RETAILER L1 1 ' ]
OTHER STEEL VALUE OF THE 1 1
DAY -

N e R S A s o s S0 i i
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for inform

onstitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: M 2

DATE: {@ - \3J ‘3 2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El Paso

A-fmaricaCity

»

2010

[BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES, -
NC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)
SUPPLY , EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ASO, |
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
C - Mn
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP : OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NeT [ NET L NET [
ITEM CONDUIT & RELATED SUPPLIES - %DISCOUNT || - %DISCOUNT LI - _%DISCOUNT [l
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST)
2: ' + - %MARKUP L1 |+ % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP L]
Dlscountll\nark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog NO BID NO BID NO BID
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
Lthumber
Dated
TYPE OF PRICE LIST B
WHOLESALER ] ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR L] 1 L]
JOBBER L] 1 L]
DEALER ] L] L1
RETAILER 1 L] L]
OTHER ] ]
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO NO
' OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE X X
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: B ()

o )

pATE: __ \0~ |

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

i Bt
Al-America City

T

2010

VBID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

ELECTRICA BIST 6. (cEp) =00 WORKNG,
EL PASO, TX » TX
EL PASO, TX ’
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION
: : FLQORESCE_NT:BU B 8" SINGL
DESCRIPTION: 20
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #21999 SYLVANIA ATTACHED 381764
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 989753 F96T12/CWI/SSECO E96T12
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP {IF APPLICABLE): $11.48 $17.00 $2.48
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $1.72 $4.25 $3.81
| ORESCENT BU
DESCRIPTION: IN.120V 35W.R,
TnlELEIE S, 244 PHILLIPS:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #22179 SYLVANIA ATTACHED 369785
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: . 1488945 F40/CWISS/ECO E48T12
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): .. $22.96 $8.00 $2.94
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): . $3.69 $2.00 $4.52
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #22052 .M24054
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: - 1185376 FB0/40*CW/SSECO EU6T12
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $25.41 $39.00 $7.37
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $5.08 $9.75 $11.33
NOTE: T

he information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Bo
DAfE: 12 "3

- 2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
Bli-Ameri

14

2010

[siD ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

ITEM

DESCRIPTION:

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
INC. IBORDER STATES ELECTRIC
SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

CONSOLIDATED

ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)

EL PASO, TX

ECO WORX INC.
EL PASO, TX

PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) ENCORE THHN

BIDDER PART NUMBER: 155808 THHN145TR
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Copper Value of the day $0.19
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): 075 ft $0.15

NO BID

4 GAUGE NO

DESCRIPTION: COPPER WIRE (BY THE FOO
ITEM [PRICE LISTICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) ENCORE THHN |
2. [BIDDER PART NUMBER: 155292 THHN14502 O BiD
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Copper Value of the day $0.17
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): 066 ft $0.13
DESCRIPTION: GAUGE STRANDED COPPER
: E@B
ITEM [PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) ENGORE THHN _ o
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 156228 THHN105TR NG BID
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Copper Value of the day $125.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): A78 ft $121.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on y and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Hﬁf
patE:_|p- 12-12

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL. SERVICES

10




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164

BORDER STATES .INDUSTRIES,
INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC

CONSOLIDATED

ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED)

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

ECO WORX INC.

_supPLY EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LISTICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #49943 UNIVERSAL DP50926W MV50160
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 1184049 B232UNVHPN ET12EB
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $117.96 $64.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $9.44 $16.00
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LISTICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #49945 UNIVERSAL DP50926W MV50160
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 1184050 B232UNVHPN ET12EB
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $139.48 $64.00 $10.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET). $11.16 $16.00 $15.35
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/ICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) OSRAM SYLVANIA #49135 UNIVERSAL DP50926W
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 2051294 B332UNVHPN NO BID
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNTIMARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $193.20 $68.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $23.13 $17.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on y and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: l:\_?
DATE: \p=12 - |5

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES

11




El Paso

K
At-AmetcaCity

CITY OF EL PASO ety
BID TABULATION EEEE

2010

[BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: ‘APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,

INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC ELECTglCZ:r}l\?_ODL'g?:\TIEg CED ECO WORX INC.
SUPPLY -INC.(CED)l  "g paso, TX
EL PASO, TX ,

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LISTICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) VARIOUS © WHEATLAND
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 167236 EMT-1/2 N BID
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Ste" Value of the day $4_75
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $1.48 - $1.90
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM [PRICE LISTICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) VARIOUS |  WHEATLAND
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 167243 EMT 1 NO BID
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Stell Value of the day $14.30
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): - $5.45 $5.75
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM [PRICE LIST/ICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) THOMAS & BETIS 52171-1/2-3/4-EW WHEATLAND
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 161029 52151-1/2-3/4 NO BID
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): Stell Value of the day $1.75
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $0.94 $0.70
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

. APPROVED BY: H;()

DATE: | /i { a: - ‘3 2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES 12




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION
IBID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 < - . __DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
BORDER STATES INDUSTRIES,
INC. /BORDER STATES ELECTRIC CONSOLIDATED ECO WORX INC.
ELECTRICAL DIST. INC. (CED) ;
SUPPLY EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT. A
NO OPTION OFFERED. X
PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 days 1% - 30 days 2% -10 days
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYNENT BY .
PROCUREMENT GARD: YES no [ | | ves No | ] VES No [ |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: !
Within ___ consecutive calendar days. . LEFT BLANK 2 24
WIthll’I ____hours or overnight after receipt of verbal . LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK 4
order in cases of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulatlon is for lnformatlon only and does not constltute actuaI awar Iexecuhon of contract.

APPROVED BY: ;&0 J
DATE: _ IQ’I 2"3

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES

13




- CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTNIEENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
L T ’
/ Ro EULEs EL PASO, TX ' EL PASO, TX
'PARTA:PRICELISTPRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
" NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
D = =R OR
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ ] NET [ ] NET [ ]
TEM | . LIGHT BULBS - 82 % DISCOUNT -__%DIsCOUNT [ ] - _T7_% DISCOUNT
1: + % MARKUP 3 [+ % MARKUP L1 [+ % MARKUP ]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog GENERAL ELECTRIC SYLVANIA PHILIPS -
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number 9200-D 20130228
Dated : o 812012 4/10/2013 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST ‘
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ]
JOBBER L] 1 L]
DEALER O ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER ]
lGOTE. The vmformatlon cqntalned in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract. ,

AP?ROVED BY: &()
DATE: (2~ 13

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED _PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES 14




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

ik Zatd
Al-Rmerica ity
BID TABULATION |
VBID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS ) ) BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 - DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., | o\ jiinne e e orric suppLy | TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ’ : EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
[TEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
) OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
' NET - [ ] NET 1 ' NET [ ]
LIGHT BULBS ' ‘ 0 9 o
ITEM - % DISCOUNT - ___ % DISCOUNT L1l -_60 %DISCOUNT X
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST) : L - : ’
2: . ' + % MARKUP 10+ % MARKUP N % MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog NOBID. NO BID Icp
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number
Dated : 41912013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST _ _ ‘
WHOLESALER ] L] ]
DISTRIBUTOR / O ] .
JOBBER ' ] ]
DEALER . ] L] 1
RETAILER I ] ]
OTHER EE l:E : .
NOTE: The information confaf

ation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: u()
pate:__[p-12-13

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES
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El Paso

et
Bl-AmericaClty

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

"

' 2010
7BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS '
BID DATE: APRIL10, 2013

BID # 2013-164}"

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
C — _— —
} 'TEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP . OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
| NET [ ] - ONET [ NET [ ]
TEM | - % DISCOUNT - _63 % DISCOUNT - __ % DISCOUNT
WIRE & WIRE CONNECTORS ° L . X} — 7 X}
: 50% Encore 30% Burndy
1: +_18 % MARKUP +_ %MARKUP . [ ] |+ % MARKUP ]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
, : UNITED COPPER
Price List or Catalog INDUSTRIES ENCORE WIRE ENCORE, BURNDY
{MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number Q1B-13 THWN-2-2287
Dated _ . o 4/1/2013 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST .
WHOLESALER L1 ]
DISTRIBUTOR L]
.JOBBER D ] D
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER ] (] ]
OTHER 3 ] L1
h]bTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract. ~
APPROVED BY: Qgp
pate:__\p-12-13

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES 16




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

EBID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

2010

BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., | o ynwne e eomic cippry | TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTIO - = -
M R N OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ ] NET [ ] NET [
WIRE & WIRE CONNECTORS N " o
ITEM - 34 % DISCOUNT X - % DISCOUNT -15- 3Nl % DISCOUNT
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST) - L =S x]
2: + % MARKUP R % MARKUP [] | +___ % WMARKUP I
- Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog 3M NO BID CERRO & 3M
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number
Dated 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] D L]
DISTRIBUTOR L]
JOBBER ] L] I
DEALER L1 L1 (]
RETAILER ] 1
OTHER 1 L

: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award

APPROVED BY: ﬁ 0’
DATE: Q"\ 9"’3

lexecution of contract.

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES

17




El aso

CITY OF EL PASO b
BID TABULATION il

2010
BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
o EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ION — — —
ITEM DESCRIPT . OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET L1 NET 1 ‘ NET L]
ITEM : - 92 % DISCOUNT - ___% DISCOUNT - _40 % DISCOUNT
LIGHTING BALLASTS ) 34% - Electric dimming 66% Comp Flu : o
] 64% Fluoresc _ 69% Hid
1: + % NMARKUP D + % MARKUP D + % MARKUP D
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the :
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number BAL-7200D DPS0926N
Dated 8/1/2012 312612013 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER L] ] L]
DEALER L] ] ]
RETAILER | (] ] ]
OTHER 1 1 L]
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardiexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: 1y ?‘
pate: Lo~ 1 -1

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING

BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO.

INC > | SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

EL PASO, TX

TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ ] NET [] | NET [ ]
ITEM LIGHTING BALLASTS - 86 % DISCOUNT %DISCOUNT || -_40 % DISCOUNT
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST)
2: +___%wArkup [ ] — % MARKUP L1 | +___%markup ~ []
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog ADVANCE/PHILIPS LIGHTING NO BID ADVANCE
{(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number 165CC
Dated 711/2012 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR 1
JOBBER ] L1
DEALER L] ]
RETAILER L1 1
OTHER L] ]

APPROVED BY: g: Q
patE: L0 (2 -13

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES
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) El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO R scrcatiy
BID TABULATION ).
2010
BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 ' DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ! EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
, NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITE C N — — -
TEM DESCRIPTIO OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
| NET [ ] ~ NET [ ] NET [}
ITEM : - - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - 25 % DISCOUNT [X
CONDUIT & RELATED SUPPLIES ’ - 55,557 ENT 85.82% INIG ==
, "85.90% RIAGO
1: +_18 % MARKUP + % MARKUP. ] + % MARKUP [ ]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog WESTERN TUBE & CONDUIT REPUBLIC CONDUIT ARLINGTON
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME) ‘ ' :
List Number WTC1298
Dated . 4/9/2013 4/10/2013 4/9/2013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
, X
VWHOLESALER D D
DISTRIBUTOR O
JOBBER ] L1
DEALER L S L]
RETAILER L] ]
OTHER ] 1
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: &() _ '
DATE: (Qf(j'a"g -

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

>BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

El Paso

Ali-America ity

%gé

2010

BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

BID # 2013-164

. NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on y and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __ |t 4
oate:_ Lo=12 -5

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., | o oo oomo o cuppLy | TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ; EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
' NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION = — =
S OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET. [] NET [ ]  NET [}
CONDUIT & RELATED SUPPLIES . . . .
ITEM - 83 % DISCOUNT - %o DISCOUNT - 40 % DISCOUNT X
(ALTERNATE PRICE LIST) x| = L] ==
2: , + % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP N E: % MARKUP 1
DlgcounUMark-up o.r Net. proposed from the THOMAS & BELTS / STEEL
| Price List or Catalog CITY NO BID COOPER-
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number GOLD BOOK
Dated 312612012 4192013
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] L1 ]
DISTRIBUTOR L1,
JOBBER ] [ ] 1
DEALER 1 1 ]
RETAILER ] . 1 ]
OTHER_. g ] 1
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES
OF EAGH GATALOGI/PRICE LIST ARE . | _
INGLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE. L] L1

2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION |

El Paso

-America City

£

2010

BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 ]

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO.,
INC.
EL PASO, TX:

LE PRICING EVALUATION

DESCRIPTION:

ITEMV PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER)

SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY | T RIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
EL PASO, TX SUPPLY
’ EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION:

9200-D SYLVANIA
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: F32T8/SSP41/ECO F032741EL021999 423194
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $9.75 $16.04 each
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $2.11 $3.69 :

PHILLIPS 24470
ITEM (PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) 9200-D PHILIPS
2. -|BIDDER PART NUMBER: F28T8/X6SPXA/ECO F028841XPS5EC022179 423889
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $20_1 5 $17.1 9 $7.82 each

CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $3.17

$3.61

DESCRIPTION: i
ITEM |PRICE LIST/ICATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) 9200-D SYLVANIA PHILIPS
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: F32T8/SP41/416 FB074122052 423087
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/IMARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $24.19 $25.41 $22.74 each
| CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $6.56 $5.34 $5.23
NOTE: The :information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Ve
APPROVED BY: |3 p

DKTE: Q"\ 2 - ]3
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

VBID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DA

2010

. BID # 2013-164
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ’

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION:
ITEM {PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) | Q1B-13 ENCORE ENCORE
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: THHN-14-STR-BLK-5005 14THWN-2STR THHN14STR
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): . $227.98 : $0.22798 $0.209 ft
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): » $0.07 / ft 0.08435 $0.104 ft
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) . QiB-13 ENCORE ENCORE
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: - THHN-14-SOL-BLK-50056 14THWN-2SOL THHN14SOL
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $199.98 ' $0.19998 $0.183 ft
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): ' $0.61 / ft. $0.07399 : $0.093 ft °
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) Q1B-13 ENCORE ENCORE
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: THHN-10-STR-BLK-5005 10THWN2STR THHN10STR
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE):  $477.00 $0.54046 $0.495 ft
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $0.165/ ft $0.19997 $0.247 ft
’ Subject to change. Based on copper @
. $3.481b
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on y and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Y P

DATE: iQ - !&/ A 3 2013-164 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES RELATED PRODUCTS - GENERAL SERVICES 23




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO :
BID TABULATION I

2010

g A

D) ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS BID # 2013-164
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 DEPARTNMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO., SUNMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION:

ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) BAL-7200-D UNIVERSAL ADVANCGCE
1. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: GE232MAX-N/ULTRA B232IVNVHP RELB2540N3S]
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $60.88 $27.22 40% Discount
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): 9.24 each $9.80 40% Discount
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM [PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) » BAL-7200-D UNIVERSAL “ADVANCE
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: GE33MAX-N/ULTRA B332IVNVHP ICN2P3N3SI
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $67.28 $32.50 40% Discount
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): 12.41 each : $11.70 40% Discount
DESCRIPTION:

ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) ~ BAL-7200-D “UNIVERSAL ADVANCE
3. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: _ GE254MVPS-D B254PUNVHB ICN3PS2N35
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $105.38 $70.83 40% Discount
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): 19.67 each $25.20 40% Discount
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information on y and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: L\:Q‘ '
pate: 071~ \3
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

% *
Afi-fmerica ity

18

2010

ITEM

DESCRIPTION:

[BD ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS
BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013 )

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID # 2013-164

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO.,
INC.
EL PASO, TX

SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION:

PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) WTC-0409 REPUBLIC WHEATLAND
BIDDER PART NUMBER: 1/2 - EMIT 1/2 EMT EMT 1/2

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $119.58 $11.958 $2.55 each
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $0.145 / it $1.60 $1.53 each

ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) WTC-0409 REPUBLIC WHEATLAND
2. |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 1-EMT 1 EMT EMT 1
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $428.13 ' $42.813 $9.15 each
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): - $0.53 | ft $5.74 $5.49 each
DESCRIPTION:
ITEM |PRICE LIST/CATALOG (TITLE AND NUMBER) GOLDBOOIK STEEL CITY COOPER
3. BlDDER PART NUMBER: - 52151-1234-EN 521711234EW 52151-1/2 & 3/4
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $2,278_72 . $0.85 each
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $0.40 / each $0.87 $0.51 each
NOTE: The information contairied in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: }_\:P
DATE: iQ.’)Q ’\3 ‘
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Ai-Americabity

'l

2010

-

BID ITEM: BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & RELATED PRODUCTS

BID DATE: APRIL 10, 2013

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE-(1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION 1S EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

BID # 2013-164

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO.,

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY TRIANGLE ELECTIRICAL
INC. EL PASO. TX SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX : ’ EL PASO, TX
) (] 3

.

NO OPTION OFFERED. D D
PAYMENT TERMS: . Net - 30 days Net - 30 days Net - 30 days
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY !
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES [ NO YES No [ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days. 24 o 24 days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

. 4 2 24
order in cases of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY’S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY NIAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 17 BIDS RECEIVED: 6 BIDS LOCAL: 17 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \A’E
DATE: __p— | & al
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BORDER STATES ELECTRIC SUPPLY

8101 LOCKHEED DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925

CED CONSOLIDATED ELECTRICAL
DISTRIBUTORS '
11500 ROJAS DRIVE SUITE S

EL PASO, TX 79936

CRESCENT ELECTRIC SUPPLY
6989 COMMERCE AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

DEALERS ELECTRICAL SUPPLY
1050 KASTRIN STREET
EL PASO, TX 79907

AFFORDABLE CONSTRUCTION
6023 MORNING GLORY CIRCLE
EL PASO,TX 79924

D&D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY

ATTN: JAVIER COSME

6825 MARBLE CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79912

LASER ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
2127 TEXAS AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

GRAINGER
1400 LOMALAND DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79935

GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO.
3300 DURAZNO AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79905

TRIANGLE ELECTRIC SUPPLY
3815 DURAZNO AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79905

WESCO DISTRIBUTION
6510-A GATEWAY EAST
EL PASO, TX 79905

SUMMIT ELECTRIC SUPPLY
7701 LOCKHEED DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79925

WESTERN STAR ENTERPRISES
11394 JAMES WATT DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79936

ELECTRIC SUPPLY SOURCE
101 CHELSEA STREET

EL PASO, TX 79905
RETURN TO SENDER

DESERT ELECTRICAL SUPPLY
11220 ROJAS DRIVE

EL PASO, TX 79835

RETURN TO SENDER

SQUARED COMPANY

1790 N, LEE TREVINO DRIVE

EL PASO, TX 79936
RETURN TO SENDER

ECO-WORX| INC.

860 KASTRIN

EL PASO, TX 79807
RETURN TO SENDER

2009-126 BUILDING ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES AND RELATED PRODUCTS - PAGE 1

(PREVIOUS BID 2006-097)




