CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services - Fleet Division

AGENDA DATE: 09/27/11

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Stuart C. Ed — Director, General Services - Fleet Division (915) 621-6822
Bruce D. Collins — Purchasing Manager (915) 541-4313

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:

Award the following contract: 2011-159 — Vehicle Batteries

To: Continental Battery of El Paso, TX

Estimated Annual Expenditures: $95,000.00

Total Estimated Expenditures: $285,000.00 over the initial 3 year contract term

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The General Services - Fleet Division is recommending the award of the above contract. Continental Battery
was the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder. The City currently owns over 2300 vehicles that require the
use of batteries. The approval of this contract would allow for the continual maintenance and upkeep of these
items and would permit for consistent and safe operation of vehicles. Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Yes. Contract 2008-150 was originally awarded on June 2, 2008.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: General Services - Fleet Division

Amount: $285,000.00 -
Funds Available:  37370510(Fleet)-503121(Parts)-45202(Internal Service Fund)-3 7000
Funds Source: General Services Internal Service Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A.

********************AUTHORIZATION********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

~




‘ ' El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO Exread

AU-Rinerica ey

BID TABULATION FORM R
2010
Bid Opening Date: .July 6, 2011 Solicitation #: 2011-159
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries

, ' : Department: General Services
‘ f

~

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC. | CONTINENTAL BATTERY FLEET PRIDE
- o EL PASO, TX CONMPANY 'EL PASO, TX
LT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE EL PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
BN, " DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
' | NET OR NET [ ] oOR "NET L[] oR
1. BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNT[_] OR | - 25%DISCOUNT OR | - 63 %DISCOUNT OR
| | +__ %MARK-UP ] +___%MARK-UP | +__ %MARK-UP [_|
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG '
INTERSTATE CONTINENTAL BATTERY PRIMA POWER
{Note: Manufacturér or Brand Name, as applicable) ‘
List Number | NONE STATED 08 622FP
Dated NONE STATED 4-11 12011

TYPE OF PRICE LIST:
WHOLESALER !

DISTRIBUTOR |
JOBBER

" DEALER
RETAILER . | | |

. OTHER | O | ] , [XJ __usT

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:




Bid Opening Date:
Project Name: Vehicle B?tteries

July 6, 2011

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Au-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC.

CONTINENTAL BATTERY

APPROVED BY:

DATE:___ 7/7, Qo1

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX COMPANY EL PASO, TX
EL. PASO, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING :
TEM NO DESCRIPTION | PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NONESTATED NET [ | OR NET (] OR [nonestateD NET L1 or
2. | BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNT[_] OR | - 15%DISCOUNT OR | -___%DISCOUNT[ | OR
(1ST ALTERNATE BRAND) +____%MARK-UP || +___ % MARK-UP [_| ‘4 %MARK-UP ]
- PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
| NONE STATED OPTIMA NONE STATED
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) ]
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated, NONE STATED 04-11 NONE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED
" WHOLESALER M ]
DISTRIBUTOR [ 1
JOBBER Ll L]
'DEALER 1 ]
RETAILER ] L]
 OTHER ] ] L] -
. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




hug|

3id Opening Date: July 6, 2011
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries
i |

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
%ﬂ-ﬂmerlcncll?
g
2010 4.
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC.

CONTINENTAL BATTERY

'FLEET PRIDE

"APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7, [ 7//)0/f

EL PASO, TX CONMPANY EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE EL PASO, TX
. PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
TEM NO. : | DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUS‘TMENT FACTOR
| NONESTATED NET ] OR NET [_] OR [nonestatep NET OR
3. . ' BATTERIES -__%DISCOUNTL_| OR | - 10 % DISCOUNT OR | -__ %pbiscount_] OR
(2ND ALTERNATE BRAND) +___ % MARK-UP | *____%MARK-UP [_] +____%MARK-UP [_]
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG ‘
{ NONE STATED TROJAN NONE STATED
x : _
{Note: Manufacturejr or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number_| NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
: )
Dated NONE STATED 04-11 NONE STATED
. TYPE jOF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED
_WHOLESALER ] 1 [
i
DISTRIBUTOR | 1 L] 1
JOBBER | O |
DEALER ] ] ]
~ RETAILER ] ] M
OTHER O 1 ]
The infoermation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and dees not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




| CITY OF EL PASO e
| BID TABULATION FORW W
1

2010 i
Bld Openmg Date: July 6 2011 _ |
P{ro;ect Name: Vehicle Batteries

Solicitation # 2011-159
‘ Department: General Services

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC. | CONTINENTAL BATTERY FLEET PRIDE
= - i EL PASO, TX COMPANY EL PASO, TX
ROUP [: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE EL PASO, TX
TWO {2) ELECTRONIC COPIES {OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT
THAT AN ELECTRONIC VERSION 1S NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH YEs| X NO YEs| X NO TES| X NO l:
MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID. b
ITEM NO. PART B: SAMPLE PRICING MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED) .
| DESCRIPTION I BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUFP 27,
1 : MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIVIUM 650 CCA MININIUM 650 CCA
1 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: _ MTP-27 27-72 F27-1000
" . |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: MTP-27 ' 27-72 NONE STATED
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): _ ' $87.95 $68.95 - $180.36
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $73.88 ' $51.95 , $66.73
DESCRIPTION | BATTERY GROUP 318S, BATTERY GROUP 31S, BATTERY GROUP 318,
‘ MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUNM 650 CCA _ MINIMUM 650 CCA
2 IMANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 31-VHD HD31C F315-650
" - |BIDBER'S PART NUMBER: 31-VHD HD-31C NONE STATED
: |PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $82.95 $78.95 $184.76.
_ICITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $69.68 $54.95 $68.36-
IDESCRIPTION ! BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GRQUP 31P,
: MINIMUNM 650 CCA MHNIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA
3. - [MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 29H-VHD HD-31-A F31A-650
" . |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 29H-VHD HD-31A NONE STATED
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $82.95 $78.95 $184.76
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $69.68 $54.95 $68.36
DESCRIPT!ON ‘ BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58,
) j MINIMUM 540 CCA MINIMUM 540 CCA MINIVIUM 540 CCA
4 MANUFACTURER PART NUNBER: MT-58 58-60 F58-750
" |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: MT-58 58-60 NONE STATED
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $71.95 $59.95 $144.53
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $60.44 $42.95 ' ' $53.48
The information contained i in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

" APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7// 7.[20 1/




’ El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO '

| BID TABULATION FORM NN
2010
Bid Openmg Date: July 61, 2011 Solicitation #: 2011-159
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries :

| : Department: General Services

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC. | CONTINENTAL BATTERY

. FLEET PRIDE
: EL PASO, TX COMPANY : EL PASO, TX
AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES EL PASO, TX '
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING )
) DESCRIPTION . PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR :
; NET [X] OR NET [ ] or NET [ ] OR
(. ' BATTERIES - _%DISCOUNT[_| OR | - 25%DISCOUNT [X] OR | - 63 %DISCOUNT [X] |
- +__ %MARK-UP || +__ %MARK-UP || *___%MARK-UP ||
PRICE LiST OR CATALOG .
| ‘ INTERSTATE CONTINENTAL BATTERY PRIMA POWER
{Note: Manufacturelr or Brand Name, as applicable) :
List Number NONE STATED 03 NONE STATED
Dated NONE STATED 04-11 NONE STATED

TYPE OF PRICE LIST:

WHOLESALER ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR M 1 - ]
"JOBBER O ]
DEALER ] ]

" RETAILER ] ] L1
COTHER. ] ] D] ust
The infdrmation contained in this bid '

| tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
i

' APPROVED BY:

DATE: ___ Z%(/‘/)o !/




fuil

) ‘ El Paso.
‘ . CITY OF EL PASQO . e
BID TABULATION FORM

, ’ : 2010 i
Bid Opening Date: July 6, 2011 4 Solicitation #: 2011-159
Plroject Name: Vehicle Be?tteries _ Department: Genetal Services

o

Prr]

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC. CONTINENTAL BATTERY FLEET PRIDE
GROUP II: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY EL PASO, TX COMPANY EL PASO, TX
AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES EL PASO, TX _
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
e DESCRIPTION. PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
_ NONE STATED NET [:l OoR NET D OR |noNEsTATED NET D OR
2. BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNTL_| OR | - 15%DISCOUNT OR | - %DISCOUNTL | OR
(1ST ALTERNATE BRAND) +___ %WMARK-UP [_] +__ % MARK-UP [_] +___ %MARK-UP [_]
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG )
' NONE STATED OPTIMA NOMNE STATED
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) ’
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated - NONE STATED NONE STATED
, ,
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED
 WHOLESALER L1 1
DISTRIBUTOR ] O
~ JOBBER O ™
. DEALER ] L]
- RETAILER ] , ]
- OTHER | ] ] ]
The infqrmation certained i

n this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

"APPROVED BY: E '/

7 DATE: '7//?/)0//
=




Biid Opening Date: July 6] 2011
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

=1 .Pzéso
mcrlcacl;y
Y8
2010 .
Solicitation #f 2011-159
Department: General Services

PRICE LIST OR CATALOG

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC. | CONTINENTAL BATTERY FLEET PRIDE
GROUP 1I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY EL PASO, TX COMPANY EL PASO, TX
AND SPEClAli SERVICE VEHICLES EL PASO, TX
PART A PRICE LIST PRICING -
TEMNON DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
: NONESTATED NET [ | OR NET [l OR |vonestatep NET [.] OR
3. BATTERIES -____%DISCOUNT[_] OR | -10%DISCOUNT [X] OR | -___ %DISCOUNT] ] OR
(2ND |ALTERNATE BRAND) +___ %MARKUP ||

+ % MARK-UP [ |

NONE STATED

+ % MARK-UP ||

TROJAN NONE STATED
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) _
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STA]’TED
Dated | NONE STATED 04-11 NONE STAirED
__TYPE OF PRICE LIST: _ NONE STATED NONE STATED
 WHOLESALER ™ 1
* DISTRIBUTOR ] ]
JOBBER ] 1
DEALER ] L]
' RETAILER ] ]
. OTHER [ 1 L]
;The information contained i

'APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7/% ?/«7 olf

n this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




El Paso
CITY OF EL. PASO Erseas
BID TABULATION FORMI ML
. 2010
id Opening Date: July 6! 2011 Solicitation #:  2011-159
roject Name: Vehicle Batteries Department: Genef_al Services

v M

e | ABONAY EL. SHADDAY INC. | CONTINENTAL BATTERY FLEET PRIDE
GROUP II: 12 VOLT BATTERIES EMERGENCY EL PASO, TX A COMPANY EL PASO, TX
) AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES EL PASO, TX -
TWO (2) ELECTRONIC COPIES (OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT .
THAT AN ELECTRONIC VE!}S!ON 1S NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH YES| X NG| . YEs| X NO YES| X NO
MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID. £
ITEM NO, ~~ PART|B: SAMPLE PRICING MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED) .
; DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58,
v MININMUM 850 CCA MINIMUM 850 CCA MINIMUN 850 CCA
1. MANUFA"CTURER PART NUMBER: NO BATTERY AVAILABLE TO 58-72 -
BIDDER'S PART/NUMBER: MEET MINIMUM 58-72
APRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): _ SPEClFlCATIONS' $64.95 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): i $48.95 NO BID
. \DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 78, BI|\TI'ERY GROUP 78, BATTERY GROUP 78,
: MINIMUM 800 CCA - MINIMUM 800 CCA MINIVIUM 800 CCA
2 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: MTP-78 78-72 ' FDT78-HP
.~ "|BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: MPT-78 . 78-72 NONE STATED -
{PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $93.95 $66.95 $204.37
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $78.92 $49.95 $75.62
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 31DC, BATTERY GROUP 31DC,. BATTERY GROUP 31DC,
' : MINIMUM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA
"3 |[MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: ' 31-ECL 31-DC F27D6-160.
" |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 31-ECL “TM-31DC NONE STATED
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $90.95 $80.95 $205.53
J|CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $76.40 $60.71 $76.05
. IDESCRIPTION ] BATTERY GROUP 8D, B.f\TrERY GROUP 8D, BATTERY GROUP 8D,
. j MINIMUM 1400 CCA MINIMUM 1400 CCA MINIMUN 1400 CCA
4 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8D-MHD ‘ 8D F8D 13¢0
", |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: ‘ 8D-MHD 8D - NONE STATED
_|PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $162.95 $146.95 $402.84
1 {CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $136.88" $110.21 ' $149.05
The infermation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract. :
| ‘ /
'APPROVED BY: 1/ A DATE: 7, / (/; 20/f 8




1
: OPTION TO EXTEND

Bid Opening Date: July 6, 2011
»}:i’roject Name: Vehicle Batteries

THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRET]
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,

X?IDDER OFFERS THE CIT_Y THE Q
CONTRACT FOR:
PNE ) AD:DITICNAL YEAR AT T

I

[THE CONTRACT.

NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

()‘N, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND

BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

PTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE

HE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION

l;S EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bl "Paso
‘Aiﬂé\ngrégn éll;
201? i
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

ABONAY EL SHADDAY INC.
EL PASO, TX

CONTINENTAL BATTERY
COMPANY
EL PASO, TX

FLEET PRIDE
y . EL PASO, TX

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT
S EXERGISED PRIOR TO THE E}
THE CONTRACT.

THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
KPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

<

BIDDER AGREES TO AG

CEPT PAYMENT BY

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

PROCUREMENT CARD:

CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY

vES | X

NO

YES NO

YES

NO

IF BIDDERDOES NOT SPECIFY AN EA

Within hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency )

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

RLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

The information contained

. o
-

-APPROVED BY: /

DATE: .7/4 C/‘//}O / /

n this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




v lsv]

id Opening Date: July 8
roject Name: Vehicle Ba

2011
tteries

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
nil—Amcrlcn‘ Chy
20310

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

[

3 <

APPROVED BY: 4

P
DATE: 7///,/7'0”

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SHAW REGIONAL
_ . EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC TRANSIT, LLC
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
. PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
ITEM NG. DESCRIPTION .-,
: | NET [ ] OR |voneEstatep NET [ ] OR NET- [X] OR
1. BATTERIES ~ 28 % DISCOUNT OR | -___%DISCOUNT[ | OR | -__ %DISCOUNTL ] OR
_*+___%MARK-UP [_| + % MARK-UP [ | + % MARK-UP ||
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG :
. ODESSEY BY ENERSYS
RAYOVAC NONE STATED CREQUESTED
" (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) ’
List Number BT.COM NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated NONE STATED NONMNE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED 4' i
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L] R
JOBBER ] ]
DEALER ] L]
_RETALLER | ]
1
| - OTHER | ] ] ]
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

To10




id Opéning Date: July 6

o livy]

2011

roject-Name: Vehicle Batteries

CiTY OF EL PASO

- BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

N %ﬂgmerlcuclly
2016 :

Solicitation #; - 2011-159
Department: General Services

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

SHAW REGIONAL

e e s EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC TRANSIT, l;LC
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING ' _ '
TEM TG DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUS'TMENT FACTOR
| NONEsTATED NET [ | OR |nonEstaTED NET [ | OR NET [x] ©OR
2. BATTERIES - %DISCOUNT] | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_ | OR | - %DISCOUNT[ | OR :
(1ST ALTERNATE BRAND) + % MARK-UP || B % MARK-UP [ | + %MARK-UP [ |
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
NONE STATED NONE STATED NOMNE STATED
{Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated NONE STATED . NONE STATED NONE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
“WHOLESALER L] ] U]
. DISTRIBUTOR U ] ]
© JOBBER O] O O
: DEALER | L] L] (]
‘RETAILER [:l ] [:]
 OTHER Ll L] L]
The inqumation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: DATE: 7/ /2o 1




id Opening Date: July 6
roject Name: Vehicle Ba

avillsy]

2011
tteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Atl-America City

1L
2010

Solicitation # 2011-159
Department: General Services

SR

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

SHAW REGIONAL

bl e = ‘ e EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC TRANSIT, LLC
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTE PURPOSE WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING ]
TEM NO. DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR :
- _ NoNESTATED NET [ ] OR |nonestatED NET [ | OR NET [X] OR
3. BATTERIES -___ %DISCOUNT| | OR | - %DISCOUNT[ | OR | -___ %DISCOUNT[_| OR
(2ND|ALTERNATE BRAND) +__ %MARK-UP | +__ %MARK-UP [ ] +____ %MARK-UP ||
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG ' ’
NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATE_D
Dated NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STA%ED
--TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STA:TED
" WHOLESALER : S ] ] -
- DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
- JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER m O n
| RETAILER ] ] O
OTHER ] ] ]
{The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract:
'APPROVED BY: ; DATE: '7// 7‘1 /;‘0[ / 12
7




B’id Opening Date: July 6
P[rojectName: Vehicle Bg

2011
tteries

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

BT 2y TRaT
Al-fmerica ity

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

SHAW REGIONAL

: e s . EL PASO, TX CANADAULC TRANSIT, £1L.C
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY; NJ
TWO (2) ELECTRCNIC COPIES (OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT .
THAT((A)N ELECTRONIC VEéSlCEN IS NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH YEs| X NO [j YES D NO D YES [:l NO D
MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID. N/A NONE STATED
TEM NO. || - PART|B: SAMPLE PRICING ] MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED) ,
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUP 27,
MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA
1 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 27F-60 NONE STATED. NO BID
" |BIDDER'S PARTINUMBER: SL127 NONE STATED
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $89.99 NONE STATED
H CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $64.79 NONE STATED
|DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 315, BATTERY GROUP 31S, BATTERY GROUP 318,
— MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA
5 |MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: HP-31D 902417 NONE STATED
) BIDDER'S PART|NUMBER: SLi131 SA 6402545 PC2150S%
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $109.99 $348.41 $577.10
-|CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): . $79.19 $257.82 $348.00
DESCRIPTION '‘BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GROUP 31P,
MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUNM 650 CCA VHNIMIUM 650 CCA
3 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: HP-31E 902417 PC2150S
’ BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: SLI31 PA 6402545 PC2150S
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $109.99 $348.41 $577.10
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $79.19 $257.82 $348.00
. IDESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58,
) MINIMUM 540 CCA MINIMUWM 540 CCA MINIMUNM 540 CCA
4 - [MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 58R-60 NONE STATED NO BID
- -+ |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: SLI58R NONE STATED
. |PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $89.99 NONE STATED
- |CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $64.79 NONE STATED
The information contained i

-

APPROVED BY:

et 2bess

n this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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{Bid Opening Date: July 6| 2011
FIrojec;t Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
AH-Amcrlc:) Cliy
2010 )
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

PRICE LIST OR CATALOG

o GORMAN BATTERIES LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SHAW REGIONAL
GROUP 1I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY EL PASO, TX CANADA ULCT TRANSIT, LLC
AND SPECIA!L SERVICE VEHICLES WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
PART A. PRICE LIST PRICING — :
i DESCRIFTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
‘ NET [ ] OR NET [ ] OR |vonesTaten NET || OR
R BATTERIES - 20 % DISCOUNT OR | -26%DISCOUNT [X] OR | -___ %DISCOUNT[ ] OR

+ % MARK-UP ||

+ % MARK-UP [_|

+ . %MARK-UP ||

APPROVED BY:

- RAYOVAC NEW FLYER S ODEL CREETER Iy
. (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) (*REQUESTED)
' List Number BT.COM NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated 7-6-11 NONE STATED NONE STATED
, TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED
_'WHOLESALER ] 1.
.DISTRIBUTOR L]
JOBBER ] ]
DEALER: 1 ]
. .RETAILER ] ]
 OTHER ] 1 Ll
The inforimation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

14




id Opening Date: July 6
roject Name: Vehicle Bz

oW

2011
tteries

GROUP lI: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

SHAW REGIONAL

EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC TRANSIT, LLC
AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING ~e E
TENMNO. DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FAC./OR |
: NET [_] OR |nvonESTATED NET || OR |NONESTATED NET b ] orR .
2. BATTERIES - 15 % DISCOUNT OR | - %DISCOUNT] | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_| OR
(1ST/ALTERNATE BRAND) +____%WMARK-UP [_|] +___%MARK-UP || + % MARK-UP [ ]
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG _
OPTIMA NONE STATED NOME STATED
| {(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
~ List Number BT.COM ' NONE STATED | NONE STATED
Dated 7-6-11 NONE STATER NONE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED
WHOLESALER L] ]
DISTRIBUTOR L] ]
- JOBBER ] ]
DEALER - ] ]
- RETAILER ] L]
" OTHER ] ] ]
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

a
/

_APPROVED BY:

7,” ?/w [/
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GROUP Ii: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY

Date: July 6, 2011
Froject.Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
I\!l-ﬂlnerlc}l’él(v
2010 i
Soiicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

SHAW REGIONAL

EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC TRANSIT, LLC
AND SPEC!A]!_ SERVICE VEHICLES WINNIPEG, MANITOBA LITTLE FERRY, NJ
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING , '
TENNO. DESCRIPTION P.RICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NONESTATED NOT [ ] OR |nonesTatED NET [ | OR |NONESTATED NET L] or:
3. BATTERIES - %DISCOUNT] | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_ | OR | - %DISCOUNT[ | OR
(2ND ALTERNATE BRAND) * % MARK-UP || + % MARK-UP [__| + % MARK-UP [__]
PRICE LiST OR CATALOG '
NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
Dated_ ‘NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED
. WHOLESALER ] L L]
" DISTRIBUTOR ] ] e
. JOBBER ] ] -
CDEALER. m ] il
RETAILER ] M ]
‘OTHER ] 1 1]
The information contained in thié bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: DATE: ’7% 7 /20 // 16 -




EXl Paso

CITY OF EL PASO - e
BID TABULATION FORM " | NN
id Opening Date: July 6| 2011 ’

2010

o

roject Name: Vehicle Batteries

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: - General Services

vy

~APPROVED BY:

w11/

. GORMAN BATTERIES LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SHAW REGIONAL
GROUP II: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC . TRANSIT, LLC
a AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES WINNIPEG, MANITOBA - TTLE FERRY, NJ
TWO (2) ELECTRONIC COPIES {OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT ;
THAT AN ELECTRONIC VEI:%S!ON IS NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH YES l:l NO D YES l:] NO l:' YES D . NQ D
MANUFACTURER'S PRIGE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID. NONE STATED N/A NONE STATED
ITEM NO., PART|B: SAMPLE PRICING MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED) .

. DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GRGUP 58,
: _ : ' MINIMUM 850 CCA MINIMUM 850 CCA MINIMUM 856 CCA
IMANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: NONE NONE STATED NO BID,
|BIDDER'S PART|NUMBER: NONE NONE STATED ;

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): NONE NONE STATED
{CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): NONE NONE STATED Ce
DESCRIPTION ' BATTERY GROUP 78, BATTERY GROUP 78, BATTERY GROUP 78,
' , MINIMUM 800 CCA MINIMUM 800 CCA MINIVUM 800 CCA
"IMANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 778NIF NONE STATED NO BID
"IBIDDER'S PART NUMBER: : SLI78M NONE STATED : '
|PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $104.99 NONE STATED
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $83.99 NONE STATED
IDESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 31DC, BATTERY GROUP 31DC, BATTERY GROUP 31DC,
MINIMUM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8051-160 202413 NO BID
BIDDER'S PART NUNMBER: OPT8051-160 6402546
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $279.99 $348.41
|CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $237.99 $257.82
- IDESCRIPTION ‘ BATTERY GROUP 8D, BATTERY GROUP 8D, BATTERY GROUP 8D,
. MINIMUM 1400 CCA MINIMUM 1400 CCA MINIMUM 1400 CCA
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 908D/1928 8D-1400 NO BID
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: ' ‘ SLISDABUS 6303403KIN
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $229.99 $307.06
|CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $183.99 . $227.22 _
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

D7




[Bid Opening Date: July

e

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

6, 2011

Troject»{.\_lame: Véhicle Batteries

El Paso
ke
Atl-AmerlcaCity

201’\}‘ -
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

GORMAN BATTERIES LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
EL PASO, TX CANADA ULC

SHAW REGIONAL
TRANSIT, LI'C

The information contained

WINNIPEG, VIANITOBA LITTLE FERRY; NJ
- OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
FHE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
1‘"HE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. , *PLEASE CONTACT NEW

: . FLYER AT OPTION TIME
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE TO SEE IF PRICING CAN
CONTRACT FOR: STILL BE HONORED
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION :

S EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF

THE CONTRAGT. C

TWO (2) ApmeNAL YEARS AT|THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION 4

IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF .

THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED ' X : X
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 D"AYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY :

! Y NQ YES "NO
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES | X NO ES| X X
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY: 4 NONE STATED 30
Within” _ conseutivecalendardays ___________ ) % ] FORESIATD o3 80
Wl-thm_ . hours or oveirnlght after receipt of verbal 24 . NONE STATED 79
order in'cases of emergency . _

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID. .

s
" "APPROVED BY: /

in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constifute actual award/execution of contract.

7/ 7/20/ /
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CITY OF EL PASO : Ex==xa
BID TABULATION FORWI S ML

’ 2010 )
Bid Opening Date: July 6, 2011 :
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries

) Solicitation #: 2011-159
‘  Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE ‘
STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL UusD, INC.
.| || DBAO'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE SPRINGFIELD, MO ,
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING _
T - DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR .
: NET OR NET [ 1 OrR | NET [_] OR
1. BATTERIES - %DISCOUNT[_ | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_ | OR | - 43 % DISCOUNT OR
! + % MARK-UP [ | + 15 % MARK-UP + % MARK-UP [ |
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG . ’
SUPER START (EAST PENN) | CONTINENTAL BATTERY AC DELGO
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Namber ONLINE . NONE STATED ACD 07 D!:ST
Dated NIA NONE STATED 3/2010.
TYPE OF PRICE LIST:
" WHOLESALER
" DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
" OTHER

Ll ]

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: g

DATE: -7/[ c/;/o’—dﬂ
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Bid Opening Date: July 6, 2011
Project:Name: Vehicle B

'atteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

ElL Paso
nll-n:nerlén cly
2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: Genefal Services

NOBID

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE l
STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL UsD, INC. !
DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASQO, TX |
SPRINGFIELD, MO ' . '
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
TEG, DEECRIPTIGH PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR .
’ ? NET [ | OR |NonestatTeEp NET || OR NET OR
2. BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNT[_| OR | -__ %DISCOUNT[_] OR | -___ %DISCOUNT L] or
| (1ST ALTERNATE BRAND) - *__ %MARKUP [ ] +__ %MARKUP || +__~ %MARK-UP | |
! PRICE LIST OR CATALOG. :

NONE STATED NO BID
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) |
List Number NONE STATED
Dated NONE STATED
TYPE OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED
WHOLESALER L]
" DISTRIBUTOR ]
JOBBER ]
. DEALER I
- RETAILER ]
* OTHER 1 ]
The info‘lrmation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

~
)

‘APPROVED BY:

{

DATE; 7” ? /)d b
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id Opening Date: July 6, 2011
roject Name: Vehicle Batteries

-

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EI Pz-l‘so
f‘?"g‘%ﬁ;rg_ﬂguﬁ
2013.0 i
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE

STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL USD, INC.
; el DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, T™X
GROUP I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE SPRINGFIELD, MO :
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
T DESCRIBTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR _
\ NET [_] OR {nonestaten NET [ | OR NET [ ] OR
3. BATTERIES - %DISCOUNT[_ | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_| OR | - %DISCOUNT[ | OR
. (2ND|ALTERNATE BRAND) + % MARK-UP [ | + % MARK-UP [ | + % MARK-UP [ |
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG :
' NO BID NONE STATED NQ BiD
- (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) '
 List Number NONE STATED
7 Dated NONE STATED
3 TYPE OF PRICE LIST: . NONE STATED
* WHOLESALER ] -
_ DISTRIBUTOR 1 ]
JOBBER ] ]
DEALER ] ]
' RETAILER ] ]
OTHER ] ]
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
7% ¢ / 20 (f
APPROVED BY: DATE: / =21




Bid Opening Date: July 6,

2011

Project Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
ﬁ!lélgrén@ﬂ;
2010 f
Solicitation #:: 2011-159
Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE .
STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL Uspb, iNC.:
. - ‘| DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP.I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR GENERAL PURPOSE SPRINGFIELD, MO
TWO (2) ELECTRONIC COPIES (OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT N
THAT AN ELECTRONIC VERSION IS NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH vEs[ ] NO ves( ] NO [] YEs| X NO [:
MANUFAGTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID|  PRICES AVAILABLE ONLINE NONE STATED :-
ITEM NO. |t PART B: SAMPLE PRICING MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)
DESCRIPTION : BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUP 27, BATTERY GROUP 27,
' MINIMUM 650 CCA, MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUNM 650 CCA
1 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 27-72 27-72 27-T YR
* |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 27-72 27-72 27-TYR
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $85.49 $58.61 $119.13
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $85.49 $68.95 $67.90
DESCRIPTION : BATTERY GROUP 315, BATTERY GROUP 31S, BATTERY GROUP 315,
MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA
2 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 31-4T HD-31C 1150 -
" |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 31-4T HD-31C 1150
PRICE LIST COS[I' (before Discount or Mark-up): $90.99 $52.00 $128.54 -
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $90.99 , $61.25 $73.27
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GROUP 31P, BATTERY GROUP 31P,
MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUM 650 CCA MINIMUNM 650 CCA
3 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 31-4 HD-31A 1151
" |BIDDER'S PARTINUMBER: 31-4 HD-31A 1151
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $90.99 $52.00 $128.54
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $90.99 - $61.25 $73.27 .
DESCRIPTION . BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58,
' MINIMUM 540 CCA MINIMUM 540 CCA MINIMUM 540:CCA
4 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 58-72 58-60 58-6 YR
" |BIDDER'S PART/NUMBER: | 58-72 58-60 58-6 YR
1PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $75.19 $50.96 $102.92 .
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $75.19 $59.95 $58.66 -
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract. '

-

APPROVED BY:___ ¢/

DATE: 7//? dOL ]




The information contained

[]

|
: .58 I’z}so
CITY OF EL PASO R
BID TABULATION FORM R
| B : _ 2010
Bid Opening Date: July (?, 2011 Solicitation #: 2011-159
Project Name: Vehicle Blat’teries Department: General Services
i O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE .
- e STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL UsSD, INC.
GROUP I1: 12 VOLT E}ATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES SPRINGFIELD, MO S
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
TG, DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR NET [ ] OR NET [_] OR
1. . BATTERIES - %DISCOUNT[ | OR | - %DISCOUNT[_|] O©OR | - 43 % DISCOUNT OR
: + % MARK-UP [ ]- + 15 % MARK-UP [X] + % MARK-UP | |
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
SUPER START (EAST PENN) CONTINENTAL BATTERY AC DELCQ
; (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
& List Number ONLINE NONE STATED ACD 07-DIST
Dated N/A 'NONE STATED 312010
: TYPE|OF PRICE LIST:
. WHOLESALER ] ]
" DISTRIBUTOR ™
. JOBBER ] L ]
DEALER ] ] ]
.‘RETAILER ] L] L]
. OTHER O

"APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7//?_/)'” i

in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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' Project-Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

]

Mi-Nanerlea City
2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
- . STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL USD, ING. -
GROUP II: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
= AND SPECIA!L SERVICE VEHICLES SPRINGFIELD, MO :
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING .
TENTNG. DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR N
- NET [ | OR |nonNestatTED NET [ | OR NET [ ] O©OR
2. BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNT[_|] OR | -__ %DISCOUNT] | OR | - % DISCOUNT Tl or
(1ST ALTERNATE BRAND) + % MARK-UP || * % MARK-UP [ | + % MARK-UP [ |
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
N/A NONE STATED NO BID
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number L NONE STATED
Dated NONE STATED
TYPE|OF PRICE LiST: NONE STATED o
WHOLESALER ] L] L]
- DISTRIBUTOR ] L] L]
'JOBBER L] L] L]
DEALER ] ] ]
'RETAILER ] ] ]
.OTHER (I ] L]
_The information contained fin this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution. of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 7/ 4 /’0//
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Bid Opening Date: July
Project Name: Vehicle B

6, 2011
atteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
Al-Ruterlca City
3 % % % g F
k3 ¥~
2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTONIOTIVE
- . STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL USD, INC.
GROUP 1I: 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
AND SPECIA!L SERVICE VEHICLES SPRINGFIELD, MO
PART A: BRICE LIST PRICING
AT DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET [ ] OR |vonestatTED NET | OR NET [ ] OR
3. BATTERIES -___%DISCOUNT[_|] OR | -___ %DISCOUNT[_] OR | - %DISCOUNT L] or
(2ND ALTERNATE BRAND) +____%MARK-UP || + % MARK-UP |__| F___ % WMARK-UP [ ]
PRICE LIIST OR CATALOG
N/A NONE STATED NO BID
- - (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) i
List Number | NONE STATED
*  Dated NONE STATED
T TYPE|OF PRICE LIST: NONE STATED
* WHOLESALER ]
DISTRIBUTOR L
. JOBBER ) L1
" DEALER ]
RETAILER ]
~ OTHER ] ]
The information contained

APPROVED BY:

in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: 7// | ? éo //
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:Bid Opening Date: July 6, 2011
Project Name: Vehicle Batteries

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

BT
At-Amer(en ity

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-159

Department: General Services

B
<

- APPROVED BY:

e 7l 3501

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
| STORES, INC. RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL USD, INC.
GROUP I 12 VOLT BATTERIES FOR EMERGENCY DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
"* AND SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES SPRINGFIELD, MO
TWO {2y ELECTRONIC COPIES (OR HARDCOPIES IN THE EVENT v :
THAT AN ELECTRONIC VERSION 15 NOT AVAILABLE) OF EACH YES D NO YES NO l:' YES| X j:'NO
WANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON WHICH THEY BASE THEIR BID,| PRICES AVAILABLE ONLINE HARD COPIES
' ITEM NO. PART B: SAMPLE PRICING MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED) -
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58, BATTERY GROUP 58,
. MINIMUM 850 CCA (580) MINIMUM 850 CCA MINIMUM-850 CCA
i MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 58EXT 58-60
) BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: . 58EXT 58-60 NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $83.19 $50.96
- |CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $83.19 $59.95 ’ .
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 78, BATTERY GROUP 78, BATTERY GROUP 78,
N . MINIMUM 800 CCA MINIMUM 800 CCA MINIMUM 800 CCA
2 MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: T8EXT 78-60 78DT-7 YR
" . |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: T8EXT 78-60 78DT-7 YR
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $87.73 $52.66 $131.27
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $87.73 $61.95 $74.82
DESCRIPTION BATTERY GROUP 31DC, BATTERY GROUP 31DC, BATTERY GROUP 31DC,
MINIMUNM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA MINIMUM 700 CCA
3. |MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 31-4(T) HD-31C DC 31
’ BIDDER'S PART NUMBER;: 31-4(T) HD-31C DC 31
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $90.99 $52.00 $168.60
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $90.99 $61.25 $96.10°
DESCRIPTION BATI'ERY GROUP 8D, BATTERY GROUP 8D, BATTERY GROUP 8D,
r MINIMUM 1400 CCA, MINIMUM 1400 CCA MINIMUM 1400 CCA
4 |[MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8D3 3D TT1A
" - |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 8D3 3D T7T1A
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $179.99 $124.91 $229.80
._|CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $179.99 $146.95 $130.99
The mforma’uon contained,in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract
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atteries

" OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT’

THE CONTRACT.

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,' BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE

Il'HE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), I[F THE OPTION
1S EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
I\Hfl\lncrlc;:lcllé
N
20110 :
Solicitation #: 2011-159
Department: General Services

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC.
DBA O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
SPRINGFIELD, NIO

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL

EL PASO, TX

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

[X]

(UNIT-RPRICE(S) DISCOUNTS)

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS A

THE CONTRACT.

T THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF

X

(UNIT-PRICE(S) DISCOUNTS)

NO OPTION OFFERED
3

L]

K|
PAYMENT TERMS: 2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY g
; Y NO ES JNO
PROCUREMENT CARD; YES | X NO ES| X Y X :
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:
eras . 1 4 2
Within___ consecutive calendardays Vo~
Within' ___hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 1 2 2
order in cases of emergency - .
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.:
IBIDS SOLICITED: 18

"The information contained

BIDS RECEIVED: 9

BIDS LOCAL: 6

NO BIDS: 0

.APPROVED BY: @

- 7/t 'z;éﬂ//

in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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BATTERY SHOP
11291 PELICANO DR.
EL PASO, TX 79935

AUTOZONE
1461 LEE TRAVINO DR.
EL PASO, TX 79936

INTERSTATE BATTERIES
ATTN: DONALD W. TOPE
12770 MERIT DR. SUITE 400
DALLAS, TX 75251

PREMIER FREIGHTLINER
1367 N. HORIZON BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79928
ATTN: PETER J. AGUILAR

ATTN: JOSE A. RAZO
PEP EXPRESS PARTS
309 AVENUE MIRADOR
ST. TERESA, NM 88008

GORMAN INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY

CONMPANY

ATTN: PETER VELARDE SR
1701 TEXAS AVE

EL PASO, TX 79901

EL PASO BATTERY
1800 TEXAS AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79901

RAZO AUTO PARTS
4814 MONTANA AVE.
EL PASO, TX 79903

WEST FLEET

ATTN: MARK MARNACH
11444 ROJAS, SUITE C-10
EL PASO, TX 79936

INTERSTATE BATTERY SYSTEMS
OF SUN CITY TEXAS

976 TONY LAMA ST.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79915-1305

ATTN: MARK ELLIOTT

ATTN: ANGIE MEEHAN
NATIONWIDE POWE CORP.
2311 ORANGE AVENUE
SIGNAL HILL, CA 90755

D & D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
ATTN: JAVIER COSME
6825 MARBLE CANYON

EL PASO, TX 79912

INTERSTATE BATTERY SYSTEMS

OF EL PASO
7198 MERCHANT AVE. SUITE B-2
EL PASO, TX 79915

ATTN: CARLOS ESCOBAR
APD

10501 GATEWAY WEST #11
EL PASO, TX 79925

ATTN: MIKE GONZALEZ
GONZALEZ PARTS & ACCESSORIES
5461 THORN RIDGE CIRCLE
EL PASO, TX 79932

CARQUEST OF ALAMEDA
6111 ALAMEDA

EL PASO, TX 79905

MEDLEY MATERIAL HANDLING CO.
4201 WILL ROGERS PARKWAY
OKLAHOMA CITY, OK 73108

2008-150 BATTERIES




