CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD'S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services-Fleet Service's

AGENDA DATE: 09/29/09

CONTACT PERSON/ Stuart Bd, Director, General Service, (915) 621-6822
PHONE: Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager (915) 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT;
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve.
Include § amount'if applicable. :

1

Approve A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. (Bid #2), American Tire Distributors, Broadway Motors dba Bill Williams Tire Center, Martin
Tire Company and The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company as the lowest, zesponsive, responsible biddets for part A (New Tires)

with the award distributed as follows:

A to Z Tire and Battery, Inc. (Bid #2) - Award items 2, 3,7, 11,12, 15,16, 17, & 23 $165407

American Tire Distributors - Award items 8, 19,25, 28, 31,32 & 33 $ 55,480
Broadway Motors dba '

Bill Williams Tire Center - Award items 5, 18, 20, 22, 24 & 26 $ 61,089
Mattin Tire Company- . Award items 4, 6, 9, 13, 14, 27,29 & 30 $ 67,558
The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Co - Award items 1 and 10 $ 7,581

Approve RB Wicker Tire & Rubber Company for part B (Re-tread, $ 113,865) and Fortest Tire Company for part C (Road Service,

$14,927). Estimated expenditures over three (3) years are $1,457,721.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: :
where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably complete description of the contemplated action. This should include

Discussion of the what, why,
attachment of bid tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. "What are the benefits to the City of this action? What are the citizen concerns?

The City cutrently owns 1850 light duty vehicles and 750 heavy duty vehicles which all will requite new ot re-tread tire replacements
during their life expectancy. Approving this contract would allow for continual maintenance and up keep of tires to enhance the safe

and efficient operation of vehicles. Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIT, ACTTON:

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes, council previously awarded Tires and Roadside Service under contracts 2006-078 and 2004-196.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: ' ,

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? if so, identify funding source by account numbers and description of account. Does it require 2 budget

transfer?

37370510-503125-45202-3700 or 37370510-503121-45202-3700-General Services Dept, Internal Service Fund

62620003-503121-40101 / Inventory Purchases, Airport Cost Centers
22010320-502228-01101 / Logistics, Government Opetations
60600015-503118-40348 / Mass Trans Inventory Purchases, S _M Inventory

BOARD /| COMMISSION ACTION:

Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A
dedededodeiedekdededehodedodeds -REQUIRED AUTHORIZ ATION********************
LEGAL: FINANCE:
. (If required) M (If required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD:
_Name Signature Date

(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
- Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager
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PROJECT FORM

DATE: September 8, 2009

PROJECT: Tire and Roadside Tire Service
SOLICITATION NO: 2009-224

DEPARTMENT: General Services, Airport, Fire & Sun Metro
BUDGET NO/

FUNDING SOURCE:  37370510-503125 or 503121-45202 / General Services, Internal Service Fund
62620003-503121-40101 / Inventory Purchases, Airport Cost Centers
22010320-502228-01101 / Logistics, Government Operations
60600015-503118-40348 / Mass Trans Inventory Purchases, S_M Inventory

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor:  Ato Z Tire and Battéry, Inc., Amarillo, TX (Bid #2)
ltem: Part Aitem 2, 3,7, 11, 12, 15, 16, 17 & 23
Amount:  $165,407.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor:  American Tire Distributors, Forth Worth, TX
ltem: Part A item 8, 19, 25, 28, 31, 32 & 33
Option: One Year

Amount:  $55,480.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: - Broadway Motors DBA Bill Williams Tire Center, Midland, TX
~ ltem: Part A item 5, 18, 20, 22, 24 & 26

Option: One Year

Amount:  $61,089.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: - Martin Tire Company, El Paso, TX
3 ltem: Part Aitem 4, 6, 9, 13, 14, 27, 29 & 30
' Amount:  $67,558.00 estimated annual expenditures

" Vendor:  The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company, El Paso, TX
ltem: Part Aitem 1 & 10
Amount:  $7,581.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: RB Wicker Tire & Rubber Company, El Paso, TX
Item: Part B (All items) 1 -8 '
Amount:  $113,865.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor:  Forrest Tire Company, El Paso, TX

Item: Part C (All items) 1A, 1B, 2A, 2B, 3A & 3B
Option: One Year

Amount:  $14,927.00 estimated annual expenditures

General Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest responsive,
responsible Bidder. .

This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract for Tires and Roadside Tire Service. - No prompt
payment discount is offered.

Recommend item 21 not be awarded at this time and will be purchased on as needed basis.

Low bids submitted for item #s 2, 3, 7, 8, 10, 12, 14, 15, 18, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 32 and 33
stated brands/manufacturers that were not specified in the bid and were deemed non-responsive.
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The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED- 36 (31 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 10
“NO BID” RECEIVED 0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $1,457,721.00
' Estimated total 3 yr expenditures
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COUNCIL APPROVED D REJECTED D MUNICIPAL CLERK
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: September 22, 2009

Reviewed by Edward Hyatt
L . Administrative Analyst
ant, Purehasing Division .

APPROVED:

/W
Terrence Freiburg

Purchasing Manager
Financial Services Departm

cc: Bid File

Frepared by Michast Lay




To:  Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager
From: .Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director 25 /W

Date: September 18, 2009
Re:  2009-224 — Tires and Roadside Tire Service

The General Services Department — Fleet Division recommends the approval of A to Z Tire & Battery,
Inc. (Bid#2), American Tire Distributors, Broadway Motors dba Bill Williams Tire Center, Martin Tire
Company and The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company for part A (New Tires), RB Wicker Tire &
- Rubber Company for part B (Re-tread) and Forrest Tire Company for part C (Road Service). Estimated

expendltures over three (3) years are $1,457,725.

The evaluation committee members for solicitation number 2009-224 were Reﬁé Barraza, Milton
Roberts and Edel Romero. Committee members evaluated this bid based on the lowest price for new

tires, re-tread service and roadside tire service.

There were a total of ten vendors who submitted bids for the required tire sizes in three separate
categories. The Fleet Division recommends splitting the award between seven vendors in the following

manner.

.

1) New Tires '
» The committee awarded this category to A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. (Bid#2), American Tire

Distributors, Broadway Motors dba Bill Williams Tire Center, Martin Tire Company and The
Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company. ‘These five vendors earned the award based on having the
lowest price for the various size categories of tire. As per discussions held by Mr. Stuart Ed and
Mr. Terrence Freiburg on September 18, 2009, item #21 was not awarded based on the low usage
and expenditures and will be bought using a direct PO once these tlres are needed. These are used

by the El Paso International Airport.
2) Ret1 ead Service

¢ The committee awarded this category to RB W1cker. This decision was based on having the
lowest price as well as being the most responsive by providing a price for all requested tires.

3) Roadside Tire Service

e The committee awarded this category to Forrest Tire. This decision was based on the vendor
having the lowest price.

- Should you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me or our Depértment Administrative
Manager, René Barraza at (915) 621-6831.

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT

1059 Lafayette Drive - El Paso, Texas 79907 - (915) 621-6822
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224] _
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
e = = ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
- _ = AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS . TIRE CENTER
PART A: TIRES (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES $43.02 $49.00 $54.00 $54.76
‘PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE - PERTIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SUMMIT SIEMPRE Vi COOPER TRENDSETTER FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FR380
PART NUMBER . 104930 01307 098043 FR380 '098043
.2, P215/60R16 100 TIRES $47.87° $50.00 $58.26 $69.03
: PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SUMMIT SIEMPRE Vi COOPER STARFIRE FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FR380
PART NUMBER 104557 34006 . 095961 FR710 061991
3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES $45.39 $48.00 $58.70 $55.43
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SUMMIT SIEMPRE Vi COOPER STARFIRE FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FR380 -
PART NUMBER 10_4949 ' 34015. 098329 FR380 098329
4 P225/60R16 260 TIRES $83.45 $83.45 $74.49 $75.53
|| (DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) PER TIRE PER TIRE - PERTIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER COOPER CS4 TOURING COOPER €S54 TOURING FIRESTONE FIRESTONE PURSUIT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22503 22503 067911 PV41 067911
5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES $118.87 $118.87 - $99.95 $98.75
(DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER COOPER CS4 TOURING COOPER TRENDSETTER FIRESTONE FIRESTONE PURSUIT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22504 22504 077342 GTZ 079342

APPROV
DATE: J/Z / 2’7
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY: /27 ( :

onte: 7 L/07

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

" |BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224].
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
" - ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS

BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
. s AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED)  (BID#1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. P225/70R15 ~ 400 TIRES $52.00 $52.00 $73.96 $72.11
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND COOPER TRENDSETTER | COOPER TRENDSETTER FIRESTONE FIRESTONE INDY 500
PART NUMBER 02912 02912 068938 PV41 119679
7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES $110.00 $119.74 $152.02 $162.10
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE - PERTIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON GL83 COOPER RM160 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS560
PART NUMBER 61128015 92802 160716 FS560 160716
8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES $65.00 $114.93 $85.09 $88.68
: " PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WESTLAKE SV308 COOPER TOURING 93V FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FIREHAWK
PART NUMBER - 11299238 22511 077325 GTZ GTZ 077325
9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES $64.00 $64.00 $77.49 $74.45
» PERTIRE PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
- MANUFACTURER COOPER COBRA 'COOPER COBRA FIRESTONE FIRESTONE INDY 500
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 39637 39637 118656 INDY 500 118656
10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES $59.56 $77.51 - $85.43 -$85.75
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER " NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE . - COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE DEST. LE
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 21299004 01933 054375 DESTINATION LE 054375




 CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 : DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
i - ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & : BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
- - AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
RT A: TIRES (CONTINUED) -(BID#1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE . EST.ANN. QTY. ~ UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
11. P235/75R15 200 TIRES $51.95 $51.95 $69.75 $65.11
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND COOPER STARFIRE COOPER STARFIRE FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FR380
PART NUMBER 34017 34017 098361 FR380 0938361
12. . P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES $127.35 $141.56 $171.02 $185.00
" PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE - PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON GL83 COOPER RM170 FIRESTONE COOPER RM10
PART NUMBER 61108020 95801 169981 FS560 - 95801
13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES $103.00 $123.96 $112.93 $115.89
PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND TOYO OPEN COUNTRY HT COOPER CTS FIRESTONE FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE
PART NUMBER 362430 04618 083190 DESTINATION LE 083190
14. P255/7T0R16 50 TIRES $68.71 $89.44 $84.83 $83.96
’ . PERTIRE 'PER TIRE . PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 21299200 01935 147033 DESTINATION LE 147033
15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES - $148.69 $157.39 $205.02 $195.50
PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
. MANUFACTURER SAMSON GL83 COOPER ROADMASTER RM120 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS560
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 88025 92322 192982 FS560 192982

APPROVED BY: z/jZ - C -
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 ) DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART A TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES -$201.38 $201.38 $254.40 $336.49
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE ~ PERTIRE
PRODUGT BRAND COOPER ROADMASTER RM 185 COOPER ROADMASTER RM185 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS590
PART NUMBER 92045 ~ +92045 156590 FS560 296937
17. P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES $389.39 $258.60 $369.95 $289.30
(DESCRIPTION: LOAD RANGE L 20-PLY) ) FER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND TOYO M320 COOPER ROADMASTER RM185 " BRIDGESTONE FIRESTONE FS400
PART NUMBER 784604 91822 186301 M860 216109
18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES $290.00 $439.31 $322.09 $307.32
PER TIRE ) PER TIRE PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ROADLUX R128 TOYO M320 FIRESTONE BRIDGESTONE M844F
PART NUMBER 0091 549070 294586 287938
19. P425/65R22.5° 15 TIRES $370.00 $469.31 $357.95 $363.50
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER ROADLUX R128 TOYO M320 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE T839
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 0096 549090 394594 T839 294594
20. P445/65R22.5 15 TIRES $516.00 . $516.00 $411.09 $350.78
PER TIRE PER TIRE PERTIRE . PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER KUMHO 943 KUMHO 943 BRIDGESTONE BRIDGESTONE M8RRF .
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 596748 596748 287954 M844F 287954

APPROVED BY: Zzz C .
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: - TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE _ -~ BID # 2009-224
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
.. A AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES $12.00 $12.00 $88.25 $110.00
(DESCRIPTION: WHITE NON MARKING) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND CARLISLE ST CARLISLE ST TITAN CHEN SHIN'WHITE
PART NUMBER "~ ~ 559056 559056 499018 499018
22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES $235.00 $235.00 $248.00 $244.78
PERTIRE - PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON G188 . SAMSON GL838 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE
PART NUMBER 61188865 61188865 294497 17819 T819 294497
23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES $184.70 $184.70 $220.00 $224.64
_ PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND COOPER ROADMASTER RM185( COOPER ROADMASTER RM185 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE FS560
PART NUMBER 92034 92034 156531 FS560 156531
24. 12R20 5 TIRES $327.00 $327.00 $415.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE,
MANUFACTURER SAMSON GL74 SAMSON GL74 NO BID GOODYEAR 6386
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 87480 78480 138389427
25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES $550.00 $1,156.00 $695.00 $889.35
(DESCRIPTION: L-3) PER TIRE PER TIRE " PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER SAMSON G2 DOUBLE COIN REM-8 BRIDGESTONE BRIDGESTONE VUT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 41401 1117184241 293954 VUT 293954
APPROVED BY; ~Z27 - Z—
oate: éA) 7
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE

BID # 2009-224

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
g = - ATCZTRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BA‘??ERY, iNC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
o AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES $472.80 $472.80 © $557.00 $509.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUGT BRAND SAMSON L2 SAMSON L2 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE SURE GRIP
PART NUMBER 306852 306852 425537 SRG 425129 '
27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES $65.65 $93.35 $87.93 $98.26
PER TIRE PER TIRE PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SAMSON AR110 COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORGE HT
PART NUMBER 75210 51411 189701 TRANSFORCE HT 189565
28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES .1 $61.91 $91.24 $76.08 $79.15
PERTIRE ) PER TIRE ) PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 1622575 - ’ 51412 189752 TRANSFORCE HT 189752
29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES $58.79 $81.03 $79.93 $79.73
. . PER TIR'E PER TIRE . PERTIRE . PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER SAMSON AR110 COOPER AST11 FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 75200 51407 189837 TRANSFORCE HT 189837
30. LT245/75R16 60 TIRES $69.24 $98.52 $88.93 1$92.30
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFAGTURER GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER AST11 - FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 624575 ' 51404 189769 TRANSFORCE HT 189769

approvED BY; 2 (-

DATE: o AKA <
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-224
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

A TQ Z TIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BAT‘-’FER‘?, G, BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
e = i - ANARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART A: TIRES {CONTINUED) _ (BID#1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM TIRE slze EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES $133.90 $141.75 $98.67 $101.72
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND TOYO OPEN COUNTRY HT COOPER HT FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 362620 50554 207483 TRANSFORCE HT 207483
32. LT265/75R16 25 TIRES $75.55 '$1 29.24 $86.13 $86.86
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCGT BRAND GREEN BALL HWY TROOPER COOPER SRMI FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 626575 64312 189786 TRANSFORCE HT 189786
33. LT265/70R17 25 TIRES $100.00 $146.22 $103.44 $107.57
: . PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND SUMMITT TC AW COOPER ATRE FIRESTONE FIRESTONE TRANSFORGE HT
~ PART NUMBER 220780 05503 200156 TRANSFORCE HT 200156
PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING ' = -
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)
1. P315/80R22.5 50 TIRES $106.00 $106.00 NO BID $125.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES NOT AVAILABL_E NOT AVAILABLE NGOG BID $110.00
i PER TIRE ' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
3. 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES $105.60 $100.00 NO BID $110.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY: /‘% - _ :
DATE:__ Y 9? i 2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 7




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 : DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
ATOZTIRE & : ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND BATTERY, INC. : BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) (BID#1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX ~ MIDLAND, TX
ITEM ) TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4. P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES $106.00 $106.00 NO BID $160.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE "NO BID $150.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
6. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES $106.00 $100.00 NO BID $150.00
. PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
TIRES CASING MUST BE A VIRGIN CASING WITH NO MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNCTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS. :
7. - P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES NONE STATED NONE STATE.D NO BID $95.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
8.. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID $55.00
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

" APPROVED BY: /V/’ ( -
pate: & %)7

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE . BID # 2009-224
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 , DEPARTMENT:” GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
- ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS
BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS
AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX ~ DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
PART C: ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE (BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX
ITEM ~ ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION FLAT RATE PER SER_VICE‘CALL FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL{FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL| FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL!
ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - - -
A. MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
' 8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVIGE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
- B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
2. | ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES | '
A. MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL * PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
3. | ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES -
A MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.» PER SERVICE CALL ] PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE QALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE, NO BID ~ NONE STATED
PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
APPROVED BY: ‘-
patE: 2/ 4, /) 2

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, -
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-224

ATOZTIRE & ATOZTIRE & BROADWAY MOTORS

BATTERY, INC. BATTERY, INC. AMERICAN TIRE DBA BILL WILLIAMS

AMARILLO, TX AMARILLO, TX DISTRIBUTORS TIRE CENTER
(BID #1) (BID #2) FORT WORTH, TX MIDLAND, TX

|

i

]

|

(CONTRACT RENEWAL WOULD HAVE TO
BE BASED ON MANUFACTURERS
COST INCREASE AT TIME OF RENEWAL)

]

o

i

]

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CGITY"

PAYMENT TERMS: : NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY '
YES no |X YES Nno (X YEs | X| NO Yes |X| NO
- fPROCUREMENT CARD: ) l:l . |:| D D
_ 24 (FOR PASSENGER AND LIGHT TRUCK || 24 (FOR PASSENGER AND LIGHT TRUCK

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: TIRES. TWICE A WEEK FOR LARGER TIRES. TWICE A WEEK FOR LARGER 24 24
{Delivery within consecutive hours. TIRES. 7 DAYS FOR RECAPS.) TIRES. 7 DAYS FOR RECAPS) :

Delivery wi-thin hours or ti.1e next morning 24 24 24 8

after receipt of verbal order in cases of emmergency. '

Roadside Service within __ hour(s) after receipt NOT AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE NO BID NONE STATED

of a telephone order from authorized City personng . :

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: ’7/ <,

DATE: 5%/ ‘/A?‘ :

2008-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TiRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-224

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

FORREST TiRE CO. WMARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
-~ . EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. - PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES ' EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES NONE STATED $45.34 - NONE STATED
PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ’ MASTERCRAFT NO BID
PART NUMBER 06308
2. P215/60R16 100 TIRES NONE STATED $52.61 NONE STATED
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND " MASTERCRAFT NO BID
PART NUMBER 05835
3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES NONE STATED $49.73 NONE STATED
PER TIRE PER TIRE 'PER TIRE PERTIRE
PRODUCT BRAND' MASTERCRAFT NO BID '
_ PART NUMBER 06313 -
4. P225/60R16 260 TIRES NONE STATED $73.57 NONE STATED
(DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) PER TIRE. PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
' MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22703
5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES NONE STATED $99.50 NONE STATED
(DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID -
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 22704

APPROVED BY: jzz ' (’ '

DATE: @/é/ﬁ 7

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TAB

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE .
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 '

ULATION

BID # 2009-224] _
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

FORREST TIRE CO.: MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
- EL PASOQ, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UN!T PRICE
6. P225/70R15 400 TIRES NONE STATED $49.82 ‘ $73.90
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ' MASTERCRAFT NO BID FIRESTONE FIREHAWK INDY 500
PART NUMBER 05812 #119679
7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES NONE STATED $133.57 _ $154.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER NO BID FIRESTONE FS560 PLUS
PART NUMBER 92802 #160716
8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES NONE STATED $102.20 NONE STATED
' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUGT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NO BID
PART NUMBER 22711
9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES NONE STATED . $58.55 NONE STATED
PERTIRE ' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 39737
10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES NONE STATED $78.98 NONE STATED
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 59533

APPROVED BY:

2/ C .
DATE: CF/K DS

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULAT!ON

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE : BID # 2009-224} .
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
. - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) ) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. P235/75R15 200 TIRES NONE STATED $53.69 NONE STATED
PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NOBID
~ PART NUMBER 06315
12. P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES .NONE STATED © $158.13 $172.50
PER TIRE PER TiRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND - ROADMASTER SEE#1 FIRESTONE FS560 RAD ST
PART NUMBER 92811 (169981)
13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES NONE STATED $95.29 NONE STATED
) ' PER TIRE ~ PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
'PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT NOBID
PART NUMBER 59507
14. P255/70R16 50 TIRES " NONE STATED $82.30 NONE STATED
' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 59535
15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES NONE STATED $172.17 $186.50
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER ROADMASTER NOBID FIRESTONE FT455 RAD ST -
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 92322 ‘ (183836)

APPROVED BY: _/L l~

DATE: ao// 0// 02

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE : BID # 2009-224|
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
' FORRE_'S'T TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
= EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES NONE STATED $209.59 $226.50
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER SEE #1 FIRESTONE FS560
PART NUMBER 92345 156590
17. P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES NONE STATED - $296.04 : $271.50
(DESCRIPTION: LOAb RANGE L 20-PLY) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
) PRODUCT BRAND ROADMASTER SEE#1 FIRESTONE T819
PART NUMBER 91822 (157147)
18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $323.50
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE #1 FIRESTONE T839
PART NUMBER (294586)
19. P425/65R22.5 15 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $359.50
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER 'NO BID SEE #1 FIRESTONE T839
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (294594)
20. . P445/65R22.5 15 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $412.50
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE#1 BRIDGESTONE M844F
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (287954).

APPROVED BY; afc < .
DATE: cP/ 7S

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION )

14




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224;
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
= - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) ' EL PASO, TX"
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID NONE STATED
(DESCRIPTION: WHITE NON MARKING) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER,T]RE
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID NO BID
PART NUMBER '
22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $254.00
* PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE # 1 FIRESTONE T819
PART NUMBER (294497)
23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID : $214.50
: ' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE N ~ PERTIRE
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE#1 GENERAL $360
PART NUMBER (0568371)
24. 12R20 5 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID NONE STATED
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER NO BID SEE#1
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES NONE STATED " NO BID $750.00
(DESCRIPTION: L-3) ~ ' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER NOBID SEE#1 BRIDGESTONE VUT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (293954)

APPROVED BY: "7// -{ .

DATE: Cf_lgg 425

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BiD ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TiRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-224

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVIGES - FLEET DIVISION

FORREST $IRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
. e EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) : EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $635.00
. PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND NO BID SEE #1 FIRESTONE 12PLY SRG
PART NUMBER ' ’ (425537)
27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES NONE STATED - $83.24 $92.50
- PERTIRE . PER TIRE PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE #1 FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56711 #189701
28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES NONE STATED $81.36 $80.75
' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUGCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE#1 FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56712 ' - #189752
29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES NONE STATED $72.25 NONE STATED
PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT SEE #1
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 56707
30. LT245/75R16 60 TIRES " NONE STATED . $87.85 $93.50
' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER MASTERCRAFT SEE#1 | FIRESTONE TRANSFORGE HT
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ' 56704 #189769

APPROVED BY: _VL ! C ’
DATE: rP/,{/a (=4 .

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITYOFELP

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

ASO BID TABULATION

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-224

FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
EL PASO,TX -~ EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES NONE STATED $118.39 NONE STATED
PER TIRE i - PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE #1
PART NUMBER 59502
32. L7265/75R16 25 TIRES NONE STATED $88.57 $90.80
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1 FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
PART NUMBER 56710 #189786
33. L.T265/70R17 25 TIRES NONE STATED, $128.64 -~ NONE STATED
’ PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND MASTERCRAFT SEE # 1
PART NUMBER '

PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)

59592

1. || P315/80R22.5 50 TIRES $215.00 NO BID $134.00 $157.00
PER TIRE  PERTIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES $160.00 NO BID $104.00 $124.60
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
3. _ 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES - $190.00 NO BID $104.00 - $124.60
PER TRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY; 27 é )
DATE: % 4/67

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-224

" PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND FORREST TIRE CO. WMARTIN TIRE COMPANY | RBWICKERTIRE& | REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX “RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) EL PASO, TX
ITEM :]'lRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT.PR|CE
4. P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES $185.00 NO BID $153.50 $170.35
. PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES $150.00 NO BID $115.50 © $126.90
PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
6. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES $170.00 NO BID $115.50 $126.90
) PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
TIRES CASING MUST BE A VlRGlN CASING WITH NG MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNGTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS. E
7. P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES $60.00 NO BID $70.00 $70.00
' PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE
8. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES NONE STATED NO BID $60.00 $55.00 .
. o PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY: ﬂ
DATE: L, / a7

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BiD TABULAT!ON

BID {TEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224;
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVIGES - FLEET DIVISION
FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
- ELPASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
PART C: ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE EL PASO, TX
ITEM ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL[ FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL|[FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL| FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL
1. | ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - o s
A MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 NO BID $50.00 $32.50/HR
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SER\{ICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60.00 NO BID $75.00 $65.00/HR
. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
2. | ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES =
A. MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 - NG BID $50.00 $32.50/HR
8:-00 A.I\jl. -5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60 00 NO BID $75.00 $65.00/HR
(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
3. | ROADSIDETIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES | - ' -
A MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, $30.00 NO BID $100.00 $65.00/HR
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. PER SERVICE CALL - PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS $60.00 NO BID $175.00 $85.00/HR
- PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL PER SﬁRVICE CALL _ PER SERVICE CALL

APPROVED BY: fz (—- .

DATE: 09/( / ne

(ALL SERVICE CALLS ARE PLUS

LABOR AT YOUR PRESENT RATE.)

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND RCADSIDE TIRE SERVICE

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM .OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

":BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT.TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
iF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

BID # 2009-224

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

FORREST TIRE CO. MARTIN TIRE COMPANY R B WICKER TIRE & REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX RUBBER CO. PHOENIX, AZ
' EL PASO, TX

i

i

i

|

]

i

i

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY"

S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NO OPTION OFFERED D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACGEPT PAYMENT BY ' V

YES Nno |X YES no |X YES E NO D YES E NO D

- {PROCUREMENT CARD: ' D . D . .

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: .

: ER P_R _M ELIVERY _ 6 4 4 TWENTY-FOUR (24)
Delivery within consecutive hours.
Delivery wi-thin hours or tr_le next morning 6 2 1 FOUR (4)
after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.
Roadside Service within hour(s) after receipt

2 - TWO (2

ot a telephone order from authorized City personng ! : NIA @
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

APPROVED BY: #2] - L .

DATE; _C?é@

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2069

BID # 2009-224]

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
THE GOODYEAR TIRE ’
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH ~ TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. P205/75R14 100 TIRES - $42.48 $46.02 :
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY
PART NUMBER 402-728-436 402728436
2. P215/60R16 100 TIRES $68.97 $68.97
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND ASSURANCE FUEL MAX GY
PART NUMBER 738-276-571 738276571
3. P215/75R15 100 TIRES $52.41 $61.19
. PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY
PART NUMBER 402-391-436 137025783 v
4. P225/60R16 260 TIRES $74.50 $74.50
(DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER EAGLE RS-A - QY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 732-354-500 732354500
5. P225/60R18 100 TIRES $112.00 $112.00
(DESCRIPTION: POLICE PURSUIT) " PERTIRE | PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER EAGLE RS-A GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 732-585-500 732585500
APPROVED BY: _4/%(

DATE: CP/_{/D <

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224}.
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
THE GOODYEAR TIRE - . ' )
& RUBBER COMPARY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. P225/70R15 400 TIRES $55.29 $59.90
PER TIRE PER TIRE
—_ PRODUCT BRAND INTEGRITY GY
_ PART NUMBER 402-392-436 402392436
7. P225/70R19.5 100 TIRES $219.19 $219.15
PER TIRE P PER TIRE .
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY
PART NUMBER 139-172-907 139418050
8. P235/55R17 260 TIRES $99.00 $96.85
' PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND .EAGLE RS-A GY
PART NUMBER 732-002-500 100215277
9. P235/70R15 100 TIRES $74.20 $76.00
. PER TIRE PER TIRE
e MANUFACTURER EAGLEGTII GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER - 116-969-011 732807500
10. P235/70R16 50 TIRES $66.66 $70.00
PER TIRE - - PERTIRE
MANUFACTURER INTEGRITY GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 402-027-477 402027477

APPROVED BY: ”/' 4

" DATE: &'{; D; .

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE JULY 22,2008

BID # 2009-224}

bEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) {ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
11, P235/75R15 200 TIRES - $68.47 $90.75
e PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A “GY
PART NUMBER 183-406-413 744826802
12. P245/70R19.5 25 TIRES $243.04 -~ $261.43
. PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY
PART NUMBER 139-177-907 139415050
13. P255/65R17 50 TIRES $107.75 $107.75
) ' PERTIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A GY
‘PART NUMBER 183-579-418 183579418
14. P255/70R16 50 TIRES $90.13 $91.07
B PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER WRANGLER SR-A GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 183-601-418 137840039
15. P255/70R22.5 25 TIRES $232.53 $239.26
) PER TIRE " PERTIRE
MANUFACTURER G169 GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 756-780-519 756780030

APPROVED BY: 27, £ .

DATE: a"’é/@ <

2008-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE , BID # 2009-224|-
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 : DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
- = THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
e - AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
16. P285/75R24.5 10 TIRES $318.92
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND N/A GY
PART NUMBER 756816519
BEVA P315/80R22.5 300 TIRES $341.17 $275.61
{DESCRIPTION: LOAD RANGE L 20-PLY) PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND G291 GY
PART NUMBER 756-254-420 756254592
18. P385/65R22.5 30 TIRES $392.21 $454.96
o PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND G286A . GY
PART NUMBER 759-315-200 759315200
19. P425/65R22.5 15 TIRES $438.19 $508.29
PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER G286A GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 759-313-200 759313200
20. P445/65R22.5 " 15 TIRES $495.02 $574.22
. PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER G286A GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 759-314-200 759314200

apprOVED BY: 7 (-

DATE:_

6./

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
-yBID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-224

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION]

THE GOODYEAR TIRE
& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) {ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
21. 4.8-8 6 TIRES -$20.00
(DESCRIPTION: WHITE NON MARKING) PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUGCT BRAND NO BID GY
~ PART NUMBER 659913150
22. 10.00R20 100 TIRES $256.89 $297.99
) PER T!RE ] PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND G149 GY
PART NUMBER 138-376-187 138376187
23. 11.00R22.5 250 TIRES $259.60 $253.78
) PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRCDUCT BRAND G316 FUEL MAX DUNLOP
PART NUMBER 138-953-263 271108673
24, 12R20 5 TIRES $417.77
PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER N/A GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 138389427
25. 14.00R24 20 TIRES $804.00
(DESCRIPTION: L-3) PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER NO BID GY
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 152712409

APPROVED BY;

DATE:

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE _ BID # 2009-224F
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 _ DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
THE GOODYEAR TIRE !
& RUBBER COMPANY " | WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART A: TIRES (CONTINUED) {ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
26. 17.5-25 20 TIRES $676.80
’ PERTIRE PER TIRE _
— PRODUCT BRAND NO BID GY
e PART NUMBER 123876458 .
27. LT215/85R16 50 TIRES $98.75 $103.60
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER HT RP
PART NUMBER - 744-821-900 357268033
28. LT225/75R16 60 TIRES $96.42 $103.72
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER HT RP
PART NUMBER 744-830-900 357943033
29. LT235/75R15 60 TIRES $76.23 $79.94
- PER TIRE PER TIRE
- MANUFAGTURER WRANGLER HT RP
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 744-826-802 366131103
30. LT245/T5R16 60 TIRES $101.80 $88.96
PER TIRE PER TIRE
MANUFACTURER - WRANGLER HT RP
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 744-395-900 366902103-

DATE:

APPROVED BY: w2/t 2
P S e

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TiRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 '

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-224{

PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND TIRE CASING

(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG WH LUG CAP)

P315/80R22.5

50 TIRES

NO BID

THE GOODYEAR TIRE |
& RUBBER COMPANY | WINGFOOT COMMERGIAL
- AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC :
PART A:"TIRES (CONTINl»JED)‘ (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
31. LT245/75R17 50 TIRES $124.63 $143.69
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A GY
PART NUMBER 179-636-492 748636189
32. LT265/75R16 25 TIRES $116.97 $112.32
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND WRANGLER SR-A RP
PART NUMBER 179-746-492 357846072
33. L T285/70R17 25 TIRES $124.10 $138.04
PER TIRE PER TIRE
PRODUCT BRAND "WRANGLER SR-A RP
PART NUMBER 179-696-217 357422231

$140.00

PER TIRE PER TIRE

2. 10.00R20 20 TIRES NO BID $140.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE

3. 11.00R22.5 50 TIRES NO BID $120.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE

APPROVED BY: /'% <

" DATE: igé; ;f"

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

TABULATION

BID # 2009-224;

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
"THE GOODYEAR TIRE _ ' -
PART B: RECAP/RETREAD TIRES AND & RUBBER COMPANY . | WINGFOOT COMMERGCIAL
TIRE CASING (CONTINUED) AKRON, OH TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
(TIRES RECAPPED USING A BANDAG BDM CAP) {ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) EL PASO, TX
ITEM TIRE SIZE EST. ANN. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4, P315/80R22.5 400 TIRES NO BID $140.00
PERTIRE PER TIRE
5. 10.00R20 20 TIRES NO BID $140.00
' PER TIRE . PER TIRE
6. " 41.00R22.5 250 TIRES NO BID $120.00
PER TIRE . PER TIRE
TIRES CASING MUST BE A VIRGIN CASING WITH NO MORE THAN ONE (1) PUNCTURE REPAIR AND NO SECTION REPAIRS.
7. P315/80R22.5 70 TIRES NO BID $75.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE
8. 11.00R22.5 40 TIRES NO BID $75.00
PER TIRE PER TIRE

approvep ay: 27, ( .
DATE: Y 2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 28




_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BiD ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE BID # 2009-224f
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

DEPARTMENT:" GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
THE GOODYEAR TIRE ' '
& RUBBER COMPANY | WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, OH ‘TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC
PART C: ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE (ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) ELPASO, TX
ITEM ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE DESCRIPTION FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL||FLAT RATE PER SERVICE CALL

3

1. ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LiGHT DUTY VEHICLES

A MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NO BID

$35.00
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. " PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NO BID $70.00

PER SERVICE CALL

PER SERVICE CALL

2. | ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLESj

A. MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, NO BID $35.00
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.. PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS ' NO BID $70.00
(INCLUDES ON-CALL SERVICE 4:00 P.M. - 6:00 P.M., M-F) PER SERVICE CAL PER SERVICE CALL

3 ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR OFF ROAD VEHICLES

A, MONDAY THRU FRIDAY, . NO BID $65.00
8:-00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M. A PER SERVICE CALL PER SERVICE CALL
B. AFTER HOURS, WEEKENDS & HOLIDAYS NO BID $120.00
PER SERVICE CALL " PER SERVICE CALL

" APPROVED BY: /27 . (.-

2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 29




—

_{IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIiRE SERVICE
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

THE GOODYEAR TIRE

BID # 2009-224}

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

& RUBBER COMPANY WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL
AKRON, QH ‘ TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC .
(ALL GOODYEAR PRODUCT OFFERED) » EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DlSCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELEGTED OPTIGNS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING-
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCGISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

NO OPTION OFFERED

i

L

|

i

i

x]

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQ

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TC ACCEPT PAYMENT BY . : ' -
Yes | X| noO YEs | X| no

APROCUREMENT GARD: ' ' D D

BIDI?ER'S PBO.MISED DELIVERY: - NONE STATED 1412

Delivery within consecuiive hours. .

Delivery wi-thin ] hours or trje next morning i NONE STATED 14/2

after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.

Roadside Service within hour(s) after receipt

of a telephone order from authorized City personng NONE STATED 1 (ONE) :

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

UIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 36

BIDS RECEIVED: 10

BIDS LOCAL: 31

NO BIDS: 0 .

appROVED BY:_27» L -
DATE:__// 24/35’

) 2009-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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ADAMS TIRE PROS & AUTO CENTER
2001 S. VALLEY DR.

-AS CRUCES, NM 88005
575-527-8473

ALAMEDA TIRE
3739 ALAMEDA AVE
ZL PASO, TX 79907
115-858-4941

31G O TIRES
1240 MONTANA AVE
:L PASO, TX 79925

> & M DISCOUNT TIRE CO.
1100 WEDGEWOOD DR.

L PASO, TX 79925

15-508-0315

NISCOUNT TIRE

1201 GATEWAY WEST, SUITE A
iL PASO, TX 79935

15-593-1481

L GALLITO INGLES
306 NORTH LOOP DR
L PASO, TX 79915
15-772-0027

iOODYEAR AUTO SERVICE CENTER
440 N. MESA ST.

L PASO, TX 79912

156-584-2666

=RRY'S AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE
720 DYER ST.

L PASO, TX 79924

16-775-2316

RNELAS TIRES

1360 HORIZON BLVD
L PASO, TX 79928
15-852-4644

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS INC
10808 NOTUS LN

EL PASO, TX 78935

915-774-0256

A & A TIRE SERVICES CENTER
1403 E. AMADOR AVE

LAS CRUCES, NM 88001
575-524-2663

BEST TIRE SERVICE
8801 DYER ST.

EL PASO, TX 79904
915-757-3411

DYER TIRE

9840 DYER ST.

EL PASO, TX 79924
915-755-7919

FORREST TIRE COMPANY INC
2305 GATEWAY SOUTH '
EL PASO, TX 79903
915-566-2639 -

GATEWAY EAST TIRE SHOP
2930 GATEWAY EAST

EL PASO, TX 78905
915-632-15622

MAX TIRE AND PERFORMANCE
3615 DYER ST.

EL PASO, TX 79830
9156-562-9996

PEP BOYS

10501 GATEWAY WEST 11
EL PASO, TX 79825
915-595-1958

J09-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE — PAGE 1
"REVIOUS BID 2009-099 (Solicitation expired), and 2006-078 GOODYEAR POLICE PURSUIT TIRES)

AG TIRES & TRUCK REPAIR
240 IRMA ST.

CHAPARRAL, NM 88081
915-491-9742

BIG O TIRES

1330 EL PASEO RD.
LAS CRUCES, NM 88001
575-524-3548

CALIFORNIA TIRE
6612 ALAMEDA AVE
EL PASO, TX 79805
915-779-3435

COSTCO WHOLESALE INC
6101 GATEWAY WEST BLVD
EL PASO, TX 79925
9156-774-5208

FIRESTONE COMPLETE AUTO
CARE

5000 MONTANA AVE

EL PASO, TX 79903

 915-772-4261

GLOBAL TIRES

2001 E. MILLS AVE

EL PASO, TX 79901
915-546-2302

INDUSTRIAL TIRE COMPANY .
8411 LOCKHEED DR.

EL PASO, TX 79925
915-540-7400

MARTIN TIRE COMPANY
1341 N. LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936
915-592-6496

QUALITY AUTOMOTIVE CENTER
5412 DONIPHAN DR.

EL PASO, TX 79932
915-585-0080




SEARS AUTO CENTER
3401 GATEWAY WEST
=L PASO, TX 79925
915-775-4992

FOP'S TIRE & WHEEL
1100 TEXAS AVE

zL PASO, TX 79901
)15-613-4445

NINGFOOT COMMERICAL TIRE
459 BESSEMER DRIVE

IL PASO, TX 79836
115-599-1400

)09-224 TIRES AND ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE — PAGE 2

SMART TIRES
5928 DYER ST.

EL PASO, TX 79904

915-565-7579

TIRE CONNECTION
6100 DEW DR.

EL PASO, TX 79912
915-833-1219

WICKER TIRE

701 W. PAISANO DR.

EL PASO, TX 79901
915-532-2615

SOLIDEAL ;I;E/CO/MPANY
11405 ROJAS DR.

EL PASO, TX 79936 O«(’-
915¢694-1661

THE GOODYEAR TIRE & RUBBER
COMPANY

P.O. Box 31565

PHOENIX, AZ 85046
602-309-0530

YEARWOOD TIRE CENTER
5401 DYER ST.

EL PASO, TX 79904
915-566-3943

REVIOUS BID 2009-099 (Solicitation expired), and 2006-078 GOODYEAR POLICE PURSUIT TIRES)




