CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: _STREETS

AGENDA DATE: October 7, 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director (621-6750)
Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, (541-4313)

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
SUBJECT:
Bid 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Recommend that the contract be awarded to Ransom Lawn Service, Inc., offering the best value to the City and
responsible bidder meeting specifications.

Base Bid I $20,394.92 Base Bid I $45,353.00 Base BidIII ~ $4,875.00

Total estimated contract award $70,622.92 with an estimated annual amount of $70,622.92.
Contract is for a term of one year.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

32010155 (Streets Medians), 502221 (Groundkeeping Contracts), Fund 01101 (General Fund), Class 32000

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************
LEGAL: (if required) FINANCE: (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Cc: Jane Shang, Deputy City Manager Mobility Services
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: ' DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: September 19, 2008

PROJECT: Grounds Maintenance — City Medians (Re-Bid)
SOLICITATION NO: 2008-228 DEPARTMENT: Street
BUDGET NO: 32010155-502221-01101 '

FUNDING SOURCE: Street Medians — General Funds
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Ransom Lawn Service, Inc.
El Paso, Texas
Item: Base Bid |, Base Bid Il and Base Bid Il
Amount:  $70,622.92 estimated annual expenditures

Street Department and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the Bidder offering the best
value to the City and the contract be awarded as indicated to the responsible bidder meeting specifications.

This is a twelve (12) month requirements type contract for Grounds Maintenance — City Medians (Re-Bid).
Vendor offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit price for an additional
two (2) years period if the option is exercised. A 1%10N30 payment discount is offered

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end"
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED- 37 (34 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- _8
“NO BID” RECEIVED _0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $70,622.92
Estimated Total 1 yr Expenditures

COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 7, 2008

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services, Pur sion

cc: Bid File




JOHN COOK
MAYOR

City COUNCIL
ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
EMMA ACOSTA, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
RACHEL QUINTANA, DISTRICT 5
JOYCE WILSON EDDIE HOLGUIN, JR., DISTRICT 6
CITY MANAGER STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
JANE SHANG
DEPUTY CITY MANAGER
DARYL W. COLE
STREETS DIRECTOR
STREET DEPARTMENT
September 18, 2008
TO: Terrence Freiburg, Deputy Director Financia
ATTN:

1 Services
Leticia Rivera, Procurement Analyst ﬁ '
FROM: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director %/ W
SUBJECT:  Bid No. 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE — CITY MEDIANS

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to
specifications.

Ransom Lawn Service, Inc., offering the best value to the City and responsible bidder meeting
Base Bid I

$20,394.92

Base Bid II $45,353.00

Base Bid III $4,875.00
Total $70,622.92

Total estimated contract award with an estimated annual amount of $70,622.
term of one year.

92. Contract is for a
. < ot
If you have any questions please call me at 621-6750.

DWCl/en




COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO: 2008-228
SOLICITATION TITLE: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
STREET DEPARTMENT
MG SUN EXCAVATION
BORDER TM H REPAIR MULTISOLUTIONS ONE TOUCH PDQ SERVICES RANSOM LAWN INC. DBA DESERT
\ INDUSTRIES INC. EPDS SOLUTIONS INC. LANDSCAPE INC. SERVICE, INC. SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
Cost
Base Bid 1: Street Trees $81,705.52 No Bid $19,305.00 $38,779.00 $18,980.00 $30,267.90 $20,190.97 $28,000.40
Base Bid 2: Turf Medians $96,358.58 $106,828.80 $57,350.70 $49,271.75 $38,780.00 $57,645.33 $44,899.47 $60,048.63
Base Bid 3: Emergency $6,250.00 $15,600.00 $17,325.00 $5,937.50 $15,000.00 $8,706.25 $4,826.25 $29,687.50
(# points/percent max) 70
(As submitted on bid $184,314.10 26.82 $127,530 38.76 $94,930 52.08 $98,935 49.97 $72,760 67.94 $97,105 50.91 $70,622.92 70.00 $124,206.18 39.80
Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 15 15.00 3.00 9.00 3.00 15.00 3.00 12.00 3.00
Medical Benefits and |
(# points/percent max) 10 10.00 0.00 2.00 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00 0.00
Past Relationship/Performance with the City
(# points/percent max) 5 2.00 2.00 5.00 2.00 0.00 3.00 5.00 0.00
GRAND TOTAL 100 53.82 43.76 68.08 54.97 82.94 58.91 89.00 42.80
(100 points/percent max)




'

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) ' BID # 2008-228
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008 DEPARTMENT: STREET
BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
, EL PASO, TX
BASE BID I: STREET TREES - ANNUAL TOTALS ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
BASE BID | TOTAL (a-I): $81,705.52 NO BID $19,500.00 $40,820.00
BASE BID Il: TURF MEDIANS - ANNUAL TOTALS ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
AREA I: CENTRAL CITY MEDIANS $64,798.63 $64,200.00 $35,400.00 $31,380.00
!
4
AREA Il: WESTSIDE CITY MEDIANS $31,559.95 $47,080.00 $22,530.00 $20,485.00
$111,280.00 -
BASE BID Il TOTAL (AREAS | AND li): $96,358.58 (BIDDER'S BASE BID TOTAL: $57,930.00 $51,865.00
NONE STATED)
BASE BID lll: EMERGENCY RESPONSE (ON AN AS-NEEDED BASIS) TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
BASE BID Iil TOTAL: $6,250.00 $16,250.00 $17,500.00 $6,250.00

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: 6%2

DATE: X/Z 7/0—2 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)

BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. ; EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX i :
v MAINTENANCE | ANNUALCOST (| MAINTENANCE | ANNUALCOST | MAINTENANCE | ANNUALCOST | MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL COST
BASEBID I: STREET TREES WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52)
a. CHIHUAHUA .15 MILES $91.83 $4,775.16
FROM PAISANO TO SAN ANTONIO (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $4,774.97) NO BID $20.00 $1,040.00 $45.00 $2,340.00
b. DURANGO .15 MILES $61.22 | $3,183.44 ]
FROM PAISANO TO WESTERN (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $3,183.31) NO BID $20.00 $1,040.00 $45.00 $2,340.00
c. ELPASO .58 MILES $21426 | $11,141.52 | :
FROM SIXTH TO MESA (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $11,141.59) NO BID $40.00 $2,080.00 $85.00 $4,420.00
d. LEON 1 MILE $98.63 | $5128.76 [
FROM PAISANO TO SAN ANTONIO (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $5,128.67) NO BID $20.00 $1,040.00 $35.00 $1,820.00
e. MAGOFFIN .48 MILES $309.49 | $16,093.48 ]
FROM VIRGINIA TO COTTON (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $16,093.41) NO BID $60.00 $3,120.00 $80.00 $4,160.00
f.  MISSOURI .6 MILES $278.88 | $14,501.76 ]
FROM CAMPBELL TO LEFT ON COLDWELL TO FRANKLIN (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $14,501.75) NO BID $40.00 - $2,080.00 $95.00 $4,940.00
g. OREGON 1 MILE $71.42 | $3,713.84 |
FROM MAIN TO SAN ANTONIO (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $3,713.86) NO BID $30.00 $1,560.00 $65.00 $3,380.00
h. OVERLAND .2 MILES $146.24 | $7,604.48 |
FROM PAISANO TO SANTA FE (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $7,604.58) NO BID $30.00 $1,560.00 $55.00 $2,860.00
i. PAISANO SQUARE 1 MILE !
PAISANO FROM OVERLAND TO SAN FRANCISCO $27.21 $1,414.92 NO BID $25.00 $1,300.00 $75.00 $3,900.00
SAN FRANCISCO FROM PAISANO TO DURANGO (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $1,414.81)
DURANGO FROM SAN FRANCISCO TO WESTERN
j-  SANANTONIO .25 MILES $95.23 $4,951.96
FROM PAISANO TO SANTA FE (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $4,95+.82) NO BID $30.00 $1,560.00 $65.00 $3,380.00
k. STANTON .35 MILES $81.62 | $4,244.24 l
FROM PAISANO TO EIGHT (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $4,244.81) NO BID $30.00 $1,560.00 $65.00 $3,380.00
I. TROWBRIDGE .35 MILES $95.23 | $4,951.96 [
FROM CLARK TO MARLOW (BIDDER'S ANNUAL COST: $4,951.81) NO BID $30.00 $1,560.00 $75.00 $3,900.00
BASE BID I: STREET TREES GRAND TOTAL: $1,571.26 | $81,705.52 No:BID $375.00 | $19,500.00 | $785.00 | $40,820.00

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:%"

DATE: g/ 27/ z4

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM
INDUSTRIES INC. EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
BASE BID lIl: TURF MEDIANS - AREA 1, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
a. |COPIA/HUECO/CLIFTON TRIANGLE .22 MILES
’ 1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $855.41 $540.00 $60.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $5,987.87 $420.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $5,987.86) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $875.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $279.70 $100.00 $15.00 $75.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,398.50 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,398.51) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $375.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $7,386.37 $495.00 :
) (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $671.49) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,130.00) $1,250.00
b. |BOLTON MEDIAN, 1600 BOLTON CIRCLE .05 MILES
18 - X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $194.41 - $540.00 $50.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,360.87 $350.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,360.88)) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,500.00) $875.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $63.57 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $317.85 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $317.84) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $425.00
$1,678.72 $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $1,830.00) $1,200.00
c. |DUKE MEDIAN, 1100 BLOCK OF DUKE .02 MILES :
1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $77.76 ' $540.00 $45.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $544.32 $315.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $544.35) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,350.00) $875.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $25.43 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $127.15 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $127.14) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $671.47 $390.00
) (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $671.49) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $1,680.00) $1,200.00
d. |MONTANA/CEBADA/HUECO TRIANGLE .22 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $855.41 $540.00 $90.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $5,987.87 $630.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $5,987.86) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,700.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $279.70 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,398.50 $75.00
: (BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,398.51) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $7,386.37 $705.00
(BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: LEFT BLANK) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $3,030.00) $1,840.00
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY:%
DATE: y/Z 7/()-3/ 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 3




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA |, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
e. |FRANKFORT TRIANGLE, FRANKFORT/JUSTIS/COPIA .02 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $77.76 $540.00 $50.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $544.32 $350.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $544.35) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,500.00) $875.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $25.43 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $127.15 $75.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $127.14) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $671.47 $425.00

(BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $671.49) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,830.00) $1,200.00

f.  |SAN JUAN MEDIAN, GATEWAY EAST/PINE/STEPHENSON .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $116.65 $540.00 $80.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $816.55 $560.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $816.53 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $38.14 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $190.70 $75.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $190.71) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,007.25 $635.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1007.23) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,730.00) $1,840.00
g. [HASTINGS MEDIAN, RAYNOLDS TO RADFORD .23 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $894.29 $540.00 $80.00 $395.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $6,260.03 $560.00 )

(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $816.53 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $2,765.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $292.42 $100.00 $15.00 $175.00 '
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,462.10 $75.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,462.08) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $875.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $7,722.13 $635.00

(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $7,722.12) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,730.00) $3,640.00

h. [PENNSYLVANIA MEDIAN, 250 BLOCK OF PENNSYLVANIA .14 MILES

1) 8 X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $544.35 $540.00 $90.00 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $3,810.45 $630.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $3,810.46) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,700.00) $1,750.00
2)$ X'5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $177.99 $100.00 $15.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $889.95 $75.00

(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $889.95) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $625.00

TOTAL PER YEAR $4,700.40 $705.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $4,700.42) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $3,030.00) $2,375.00
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY:, M
DATE: K/Z 7/0? 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 4




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)

; BID # 2008-228
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008 . o

DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS . || MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA I, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
RIDGECREST MEDIAN, 4200 BLOCK OF RIDGECREST .22 MILES
)8 X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $855.41 $540.00 $90.00 $225.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $5,987.87 $630.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $5,987.86) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,700.00) ° $1,575.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $279.70 $100.00 $15.00 $100.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,398.50 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,398.51) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $500.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $705.00
$7,386.37 $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $3,030.00) $2,075.00
ST. JOHNS MEDIAN, 1600 BLOCK OF ST. JOHNS .01 MILE
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $38.88 $540.00 $50.00 $175.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $272.16 $350.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $272.18) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,500.00) $1,225.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $12.71 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $63.55 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $63.57) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
.|TOTAL PER YEAR $335.71 $425.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $335.74) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,830.00) $1,700.00
STEVENS MEDIAN, HUECO/STEVENS/PERSHING .22 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $855.41 $540.00 $60.00 $295.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $5,987.87 $420.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $$5,987.86) . $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $2,065.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $279.70 $100.00 $15.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,398.50 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $63.57) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $750.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $7,386.37 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $335.74) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,130.00) $2,815.00
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY: %’Q‘
DATE: ?/2 7/9? 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 5




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
_BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA 1, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
I.  |[TROWBRIDGE MEDIAN, RAYNOLDS TO RADFORD .25 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $972.05 $540.00 $90.00 $325.00 .
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $6,804.35 $630.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $6,804.38) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,700.00) $2,275.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $317.84 $100.00 $15.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,589.20 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,589.22) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $750.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $8,393.55 $705.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $8,393.60) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $3,030.00) $3,025.00
m. |TROWBRIDGE MEDIAN, GATEWAY EAST TO CLARK .25 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $972.05 $540.00 $60.00 $395.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $6,804.35 $420.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $6,804.38) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $2,765.00
2)$ X § MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $317.84 $100.00 $15.00 $175.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,589.20 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,589.22) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $875.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $8,393.55 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $8,393.60) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,130.00) $3,640.00
n. |WAINWRIGHT MEDIAN, 1400 BLOCK OF WAINWRIGHT .02 MILE
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $77.76 $540.00 $50.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $544.32 $350.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $544.35) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,500.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $25.43 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $127.15 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $127.14) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $671.47 $425.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $671.49) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $1,830.00) $1,840.00
o. |WHEELING MEDIAN, WHEELING AT PIEDRAS TO ELM .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $116.65 $540.00 $70.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $816.55 $490.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $816.53) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,100.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $38.14 $100.00 $15.00 $75.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $190.70 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $190.53) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $375.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,007.25 $565.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,007.23) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,430.00) $1,740.00
AREA | TOTAL (Items a - o Total per Year): $64,798.45 $64,200.00 $8,230.00 $31,380.00

(BIDDER'S AREA | TOTAL: $64,798:63)

(BIDDER'S AREA | TOTAL: $35,400.00)

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: /ﬂ
5127 /68

DATE:
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
BASE BID Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA Il, WESTSIDE MEDIANS  MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
a. |BALTIMORE TRIANGLE, BALTIMORE/PARKIWINTER .02 MILES
18 X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $77.76 $540.00 $35.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $544.32 $245.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $544.35) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,050.00) $1,050.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $25.43 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $127.15 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $127.14 $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $671.47 $320.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $671.49) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $1,380.00) $1,375.00
b. |CINCINNATI TRIANGLE, CINCINNATI AT PARK .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $116.65 $540.00 $35.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $816.55 $245.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $816.53) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,050.00) $1,050.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $38.14 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $190.70 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $190.71) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,007.25 $320.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,007.23) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,380.00) $1,375.00
c. |COFFIN MEDIAN, COFFIN/FLORENCE/MISSISSIPPI .09 MILES :
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $349.94 $540.00 $60.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $420.00
$2,449.58 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $114.42 $100.00 $15.00 $75.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $572.10 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $572.12) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $375.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $3,021.68 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $3,021.70) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,130.00) $1,740.00
d. |FLAMINGO MEDIAN, STANTON/BRENTWOOD/WALLINGTON .11 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $427.70 $540.00 $60.00 $225.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $2,993.90 $420.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $2,993.93) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $1,575.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $139.85 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $699.25 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $699.26) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $3,693.15 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $3,693.19) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,130.00) $2,050.00
e. |KERN MEDIAN, KERN AT CINCINNATI .05 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $194.41 $540.00 $40.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,360.87 $280.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $1,360.88) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,200.00) $1,050.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $63.57 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $317.85 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $317.84) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,678.72 $4,280.00 $355.00
(BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR; $1,530.00) $1,375.00
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY: _%
8//2 7/0;? 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 7
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
BASE BID Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA I, WESTSIDE MEDIANS MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
f. [MADELINE TRIANGLE, MADELINE AT PARK .09 MILES
1) 8 _ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $349.94 $540.00 $80.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $560.00
. $2,449.58 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $114.42 $100.00 $15.00 $75.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $572.10 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $572.12) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $375.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $3,021.68 $635.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $3,021.70) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,730.00) $1,740.00
g. |PORFIRIO DIAZ MEDIAN, PORFIRIO DIAZIMUNDY/YANDELL .09 MILES :
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $349.94 $540.00 $60.00 $195.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $420.00 .
$2,449.58 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $1,365.00
2)$ X 5§ MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $114.42 $100.00 $15.00 $75.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $572.10 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $572.12) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $375.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $3,021.68 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $3,021.70) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,730.00) $1,740.00
h. |ROBINSON MEDIAN, ROBINSON/COFFIN - .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $116.65 $540.00 $40.00 $150.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $816.55 $280.00
) (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $816.53) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,200.00) $1,050.00
2)$ X § MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $38.14 $100.00 $15.00 $65.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $190.70 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $190.71) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $325.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,007.25 $355.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,007.23) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAU/YEAR: $1,530.00) $1,375.00
i. |SAN SABA MEDIAN, SAN SABA AT SAN ANGELO .18 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $699.88 $540.00 $60.00 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $420.00
$4,899.16 $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,800.00) $1,750.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $228.85 $100.00 $15.00 $105.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $1,144.25 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,144.24) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $525.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $6,043.41 $495.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $6,043.40) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,130.00) $2,275.00
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY: m’
8/2 7/ O’Y 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 8
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
_ EL PASO, TX
BASE BID [Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA 1l, WESTSIDE MEDIANS MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
j.  |WEST GREEN MEDIAN, SAPLINAS TO WEST VALLEY .11 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $427.70 $540.00 $80.00 $225.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $2,993.90 $560.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,993.93) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $1,575.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $139.85 $100.00 $15.00 $95.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $699.25 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY:  $699.26) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $475.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $3,693.15 $635.00
(BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $3,693.19) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,730.00) $2,050.00
k. [YUCCA MEDIAN, 5000 BLOCK OF YUCCA .14 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $544.35 $540.00 $80.00 $395.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $3,810.45 $560.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $3,810.46) $3,780.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,400.00) $2,765.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $177.99 $100.00 $15.00 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $889.95 $75.00
(BIDDER'S YEARLY: $889.96) $500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $330.00) $625.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $4,700.40 $635.00
(BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $4,700.42) $4,280.00 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $2,730.00) $3,390.00
AREA Il TOTAL (Items a - k Total per Year): $31,559.84 $47,080.00 $5,235.00 $20,485.00
(BIDDER'S AREA Il TOTAL: $31,559.95) (BIDDER'S AREA I TOTAL: $22,530.00)
BASE BID Il, TURF MEDIANS GRAND TOTAL $96,358.29 $111,280.00 $13,465.00 $51,865.00
(AREA 1 TOTAL + AREA Il TOTAL) (BIDDER'S BASE BID II (BIDDER'S BASE BID Il
GRAND TOTAL: $96,358.58) GRAND TOTAL: $57,930.00)
NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.
APPROVED BY: %ﬂ—
DATE: ?/2 7/ a’? 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT 9




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

BORDER TM EPDS H REPAIR SOLUTIONS MG MULTISOLUTIONS, INC.
INDUSTRIES INC. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX WINTER PARK, FL
EL PASO, TX
BASE BID lll: EMERGENCY RESPONSE HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL
$ ' HR X 250 (ESTIMATED NUMBER OF HOURS PER YEAR) $25.00 $6,250.00 $65.00 $16,250.00 $70.00 $17,500.00 $25.00 $6,250.00

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

[]

L]

[]

[]

NO OPTION OFFERED. D D |___| D ’
PAYMENT TERMS NET - 30 DAYS 4% - 10 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS 5% - 10 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD YEs[_] No[X] YES[X] No[ ] Yes[X] no[_] Yes[X] No[ |

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: ’%
§/277)0%

DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID I: STREET TREES - ANNUAL TOTALS ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
BASE BID | TOTAL (a-): $18,980.00 $30,420.00 $20,394.92 $29,474.10
BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - ANNUAL TOTALS ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
AREA I: CENTRAL CITY MEDIANS $24,500.00 $37,180.00 $30,703.75 $42,860.19
AREA Il: WESTSIDE CITY MEDIANS $14,280.00 $20,755.00 $14,649.25 $20,348.89
BASE BID Il TOTAL (AREAS | AND ll): $38,780.00 $57,935.00 $45,353.00 $63,209.08
BASE BID [ll: EMERGENCY RESPONSE (ON AN AS-NEEDED BASIS) TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
BASE BID Ill TOTAL: $15,000.00 $8,750.00 $4,875.00 $31,250.00

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: M

DATE: g/27/ﬁ 2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)

BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
MAINTENANCE ANNUAL COST MAINTENANCE ANNUAL COST MAINTENANCE ANNUAL COST MAINTENANCE ANNUAL COST
BASEBID I: STREET TREES WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52) WEEKLY (WEEKLY X 52)
a. CHIHUAHUA .15 MILES $40.00 $2,080.00
FROM PAISANO TO SAN ANTONIO $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $3,640.00) $17.25 $897.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
b. DURANGO .15 MILES $40.00 | $2,080.00 '
FROM PAISANO TO WESTERN $30.00 $1,560.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $3,640.00) $17.25 $897.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
c. ELPASO .58 MILES $60.00 | $3,120.00
FROM SIXTH TO MESA $40.00 $2,080.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $4,680.00) $66.70 $3,468.40 $68.57 $3,565.64
d. LEON A MILE $35.00 | $1,820.00
FROM PAISANO TO SAN ANTONIO $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $2,080.00) $11.50 $598.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
e. MAGOFFIN .48 MILES $60.00 | $3,120.00
FROM VIRGINIA TO COTTON $50.00 $2,600.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $4,680.00) $55.20 $2,870.40 $55.02 $2,861.04
f.  MISSOURI .6 MILES $65.00 | $3,380.00
FROM CAMPBELL TO LEFT ON COLDWELL TO FRANKLIN $40.00 $2,080.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $4,680.00) $69.06 $3,591.12 $75.88 $3,945.76
g. OREGON A MILE $35.00 | $1,820.00
FROM MAIN TO SAN ANTONIO $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $2,680.00) $11.50 $598.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
h. OVERLAND .2 MILES $40.00 | $2,080.00
FROM PAISANO TO SANTA FE $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN, COST: $3,640.00) $23.00 $1,196.00 $44.51 $2,314.52
i.  PAISANO SQUARE A MILE
PAISANO FROM OVERLAND TO SAN FRANCISCO $25.00 $1,300.00 $45.00 $2,340.00 $11.50 $598.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
SAN FRANCISCO FROM PAISANO TO DURANGO (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $3,640.00)
DURANGO FROM SAN FRANCISCO TO WESTERN
j.  SAN ANTONIO .25 MILES $45.00 $2,340.00
FROM PAISANO TO SANTA FE $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $3,640.00) $28.75 $1,495.00 $44.51 $2,314.52
k. STANTON .35 MILES $60.00 | $3,120.00
FROM PAISANO TO EIGHT $30.00 $1,560.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $4,680.00) $40.25 $2,093.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
. TROWBRIDGE .35 MILES $60.00 | $3,120.00
FROM CLARK TO MARLOW $25.00 $1,300.00 (BIDDER'S ANN. COST: $4,680.00) $40.25 $2,093.00 $39.76 $2,067.52
$585.00 [ $30,420.00
BASE BID I: STREET TREES GRAND TOTAL: $365.00 | $18,980.00 (BIDDER'S BASE BID | GRAND $392.21 | $20,394.92 | $566.81 | $29,474.12
TOTALS - ANN. COST: $46,360.00)

NOTE: THIS IS A.BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: ﬂ
8§/2/5¢

DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

e ——————————————————————————————————————————
BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA |, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
a. |COPIA/HUECO/CLIFTON TRIANGLE .22 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $220.00 $400.00 $115.50 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $3,797.64
$1,540.00 $2,800.00 $808.50 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $3,797,04)
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $120.00 $195.00 $96.25 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $600.00 $975.00 $481.25 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $2,140.00 $3,775.00 $1,289.75 $4,747.04 -
b. |BOLTON MEDIAN, 1600 BOLTON CIRCLE .05 MILES
1) § X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $130.00 $115.50 $111.56
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $980.00 $910.00 $808.50 $780.92
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $70.00 $96.25 $55.80
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $500.00 $350.00 $481.25 $279.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,260.00
$1,480.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $1,325.00) $1,289.75 $1,059.92
c. |DUKE MEDIAN, 1100 BLOCK OF DUKE .02 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X § MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $60.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $300.00 $481.25 $318.80
TOTAL PER YEAR _ $1,100.00 $1,000.00 $1,289.75 $1,032.80
d. |[MONTANA/CEBADA/HUECO TRIANGLE .22 MILES
108 X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $220.00 $400.00 $154.00 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,540.00 $2,800.00 $1,078.00 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $120.00 $195.00 $134.75 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $600.00 $975.00 $673.75 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $2,140.00 $3,775.00 $1,751.75 $4,747.04
e. |FRANKFORT TRIANGLE, FRANKFORT/JUSTIS/COPIA .02 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $60.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$300.00 $300.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $318.75)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
: _ $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.75)
f.  [SAN JUAN MEDIAN, GATEWAY EAST/PINE/STEPHENSON .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $110.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $770.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $65.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$500.00 $325.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
$1,900.00 $1,095.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: ‘4%/2‘
DATE: &/Zﬂ/df

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[ETD ITEM: GROUNDS MAIVNTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)

BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228 .
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID [Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA T, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE | MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE || MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
HASTINGS MEDIAN, RAYNOLDS TO RADFORD .23 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $220.00 $400.00 $346.50 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,540.00 $2,800.00 $2,425.50 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $120.00 $195.00 $308.00 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $600.00 $975.00 $1,540.00 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $2,140.00 $3,775.00 $3,965.50 $4,747.04
PENNSYLVANIA MEDIAN, 250 BLOCK OF PENNSYLVANIA .14 MILES
1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $300.00 $231.00 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $2,100.00 $1,617.00 $1,750.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $45.00 $211.75 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $225.00
$500.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $750.00) $1,058.75 $625.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $2,325.00
$1,900.00 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $2,850.00) $2,675.75 $2,375.00
RIDGECREST MEDIAN, 4200 BLOCK OF RIDGECREST .22 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $400.00 $115.50 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON . $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $808.50 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $195.00 $96.25 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $500.00 $975.00 $481.25 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,900.00 $3,775.00 $1,289.75 $4,747.04
ST. JOHNS MEDIAN, 1600 BLOCK OF ST. JOHNS .01 MILE
1)$ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $80.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$300.00 $400.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
_ $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)
STEVENS MEDIAN, HUECO/STEVENS/PERSHING .22 MILES
1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $400.00 $231.00 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,617.00 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $195.00 $211.75 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $500.00 $975.00 $1,058.75 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,900.00 $3,775.00 $2,675.75 $4,747.04
TROWBRIDGE MEDIAN, RAYNOLDS TO RADFORD .25 MILES
18 X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $410.00 $462.00 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $2,870.00 $3,234.00 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $205.00 $423.50 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $500.00 $1,025.00 $2,117.50 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,900.00 $3,895.00 $5,351.50 $4,747.04

APPROVED BY: W"

§/277) 5

DATE:

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

o ——————————————————————————————————————
BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID Il: TURF MEDIANS - AREA I, CITY MEDIANS - CENTRAL MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
m. (TROWBRIDGE MEDIAN, GATEWAY EAST TO CLARK .25 MILES
1) § X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $410.00 $192.50 $542.52
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $2,870.00 $1,347.50 $3,797.64
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $205.00 173.25 $189.88
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $500.00 $1,025.00 866.25 $949.40
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,900.00 $3,895.00 $2,213.75 $4,747.04
n. |WAINWRIGHT MEDIAN, 1400 BLOCK OF WAINWRIGHT .02 MILE
1) § X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 - $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $65.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$300.00 $325.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
$1,000.00 $1,025.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)
0. |(WHEELING MEDIAN, WHEELING AT PIEDRAS TO ELM .03 MILES
1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $110.00 $154.00 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $770.00 $1,078.00 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $70.00 $134.75 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$400.00 $350.00 $673.75 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
$1,100.00 $1,120.00 $1,751.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)
AREA | TOTAL (Items a - o Total per Year): $24,500.00 $36,590.00 $30,703.75 $42,861.00
) (BIDDER'S AREA | TOTAL: $37,180.00) (BIDDER'S AREA | TOTAL: $43,649.39)
BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA I, WESTSIDE MEDIANS MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE t|| MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
a. |BALTIMORE TRIANGLE, BALTIMORE/PARK/WINTER .02 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $80.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $560.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $65.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$300.00 $325.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
_ $860.00 $1,025.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)
b. |CINCINNATI TRIANGLE, CINCINNATI AT PARK .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $65.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$400.00 $325.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTAL/YEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,032.80
$1,100.00 $1,025.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: M"
g/27/08

"DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

IBID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228

DEPARTMENT:. STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA 1l, WESTSIDE MEDIANS MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
c. |COFFIN MEDIAN, COFFIN/FLORENCE/MISSISSIPPI .09 MILES
1)$ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $195.00 $115.50 $187.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $980.00 $1,365.00 $808.50 $1,309.00
2)$ X § MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $105.00 $96.25 $93.50
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $525.00 $467.50
$400.00 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $325.00) $481.25
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,380.00 $1,890.00 $1,289.75 $1,776.50
d. |FLAMINGO MEDIAN, STANTON/BRENTWOOD/WALLINGTON .11 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $195.00 $154.00 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $980.00 $1,365.00 $1,078.00 $1,750.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $105.00 $134.75 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $525.00 $673.75 $625.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,380.00 $1,890.00 $1,751.75 $2,375.00
e. |KERN MEDIAN, KERN AT CINCINNATI .05 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $115.00 $115.50 $111.56
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $805.00 $808.50 $780.92
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $80.00 $96.25 $55.80
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $300.00 $400.00 $481.25 $279.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,000.00 $1,205.00 $1,289.75 $1,059.92
f. |MADELINE TRIANGLE, MADELINE AT PARK .09 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $180.00 $115.50 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON . $980.00 $1,260.00 $808.50 $1,750.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $120.00 $96.25 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $600.00 $481.25 $625.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,380.00 $1,860.00 $1,289.75 $2,375.00
g. [PORFIRIO DIAZ MEDIAN, PORFIRIO DIAZ/MUNDY/YANDELL .09 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $180.00 $115.50 $250.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $980.00 $1,260.00 $808.50 $1,750.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $120.00 $96.25 $125.00
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $600.00 $481.25 $5625.00
TOTAL PER YEAR $1,380.00 $1,860.00 $1,289.75 $2,375.00
h. |ROBINSON MEDIAN, ROBINSON/COFFIN .03 MILES
1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $100.00 $100.00 $115.50 $102.00
YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $700.00 $700.00 $808.50 $714.00
2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $60.00 $80.00 $96.25 $63.76
YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $318.80
$300.00 $400.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $318.76)
TOTAL PER YEAR i $1,032.80
$1,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $1,032.76)

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: %e‘
8/22/a8

DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

BASE BID II: TURF MEDIANS - AREA I, WESTSIDE MEDIANS MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE || MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE || MONTHLY AND YEARLY PRICE
i. |SAN SABA MEDIAN, SAN SABA AT SAN ANGELO .18 MILES

1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $200.00 $380.00 $115.50 $333.00

YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,400.00 $2,660.00 $808.50 $2,331.00

2)$ X § MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $100.00 $280.00 $96.25 $41.63

YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $208.15

$500.00 $1,400.00 $481.25 (BIDDER'S TOTALIYEAR: $208.13)
TOTAL PER YEAR $2,539.15
$1,900.00 $4,060.00 $1,289.75 (BIDDER'S YEARLY: $2,539.13)

i- |WEST GREEN MEDIAN, SAPLINAS TO WEST VALLEY .11 MILES

1) $ X 7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $140.00 $180.00 $115.50 $250.00

YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $980.00 $1,260.00 $808.50 $1,750.00

2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $100.00 $96.25 $125.00

YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $500.00 $481.25 $625.00

TOTAL PER YEAR $1,380.00 $1,760.00 $1,289.75 $2,375.00
k. |YUCCA MEDIAN, 5000 BLOCK OF YUCCA .14 MILES

1) $ X7 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE GROWING SEASON) $160.00 $300.00 $115.50 $250.00

YEARLY TOTAL GROWING SEASON $1,120.00 $2,100.00 $808.50 $1,750.00

2)$ X 5 MONTHS (MONTHLY PRICE DORMANT SEASON) $80.00 $200.00 $96.25 $125.00

YEARLY TOTAL DORMANT SEASON $400.00 $1,000.00 $481.25 $625.00

TOTAL PER YEAR $1,520.00 $3,100.00 ] $1,289.75 $2,375.00

AREA |l TOTAL (items a - k Total per Year): $14,280.00 $20,775.00 $14,649.25 $20,348.97
(BIDDER'S AREA Il TOTAL: $20,755.00) (BIDDER'S AREA Il TOTAL: $20,348.89)
BASE BID II, TURF MEDIANS GRAND TOTAL $38,780.00 $57,365.00 $45,353.00 $63,209.97

(AREA 1 TOTAL + AREA Il TOTAL)

(BIDDER'S GRAND TOTAL: $57,935.00)

(BIDDER'S GRAND TOTAL: $63,209.08)

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: M’

§8/272/0 &

DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS (RE-BID)
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-228
DEPARTMENT: STREET

ONE TOUCH LANDSCAPE PDQ SERVICES, INC. RANSOM LAWN SUN EXCAVATION, INC.
EL PASO, TX LAS CRUCES, NM SERVICE, INC. DBA DESERT SUN EXCAVATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BASE BID Il EMERGENCY RESPONSE HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL HOURLY TOTAL
$ I HR X 250 (ESTIMATED NUMBER OF HOURS PER YEAR) $60.00 $15,000.00 $35.00 $8,750.00 $19.50 $4,875.00 $125.00 $31,250.00
(MAN)

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION|
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

[]

[]

L]
[]

[]

[]

PAYMENT TERMS

NET - 30 DAYS .5% - 20 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS 5% - 20 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD YES No[_] YEs[X] No[ ] Yes[_| No[X] NONE STATED
BIDS SOLICITED: 37 BIDS RECEIVED: 8 BIDS LOCAL: 34 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: VXZ—
$/27/c8

DATE:

2008-228 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - CITY:MEDIANS (RE-BID) - STREET DEPARTMENT
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H REPAIR SOLUTIONS
ATTN: ARTURO ESCALANTE
12243 DE LA CROIX

EL PASO, TX 79936-0948

GOODWILL INDUSTRIES
ATTN: DESI SMITH
7015 ALAMEDA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

EL PASO TRENCH SAFTY
ATTN: LOUIS CEPEDA
P. O. BOX 370196

EL PASO, TX 79937

RAINMAKER MAINTENANCE
ATTN: DOUGLAS GELO
2915 E. WYOMING AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79903

2008-XXX PRODUCT NAME

TRUGREEN CHEMLAWN
ATTN: VERNON AUTREY, JR.
1330 NORTHWESTERN DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79912

BUILDING EXPRESSIONS
ATTN: ADRIAN MENDOZA
P. O. BOX 1247
CANUTILLO, TX 79835

TONEY’S MAINTENANCE
ATTN: ANN WASHINGTON

4620-ROLEING STONE-AVENUE

EL PASO, TX 79924 <150\
PO. Box SHO3GTF

NATIVE LANDSCAPE

ATTN: ADAM NIETO

1713 GAMBLE QUAIL DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79936

PRIDE MAINTENANCE
ATTN: JAVIER NAVARRO
1918 E. YANDELL DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79903

ITS QUEST

ATTN: CYNTHIA CHAVEZ
6601 MONTANA SUITE E
EL PASO, TX 79925






