CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: _STREETS

AGENDA DATE: OCTOBER 7, 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director (621-6750)
Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, (541-4313)

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
SUBJECT: Bid 2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to Traffic Parts, Inc.,
General Traffic Equipment Corp, and Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc., for items listed below, offering
the lowest, most responsive and responsible bidder meeting specifications.

Traffic Parts Inc. for items 1, 2, 3, 4, 10, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 21, 22, 23, and 25
Estimated annual dollar amount of $23,378.60. Contract estimated amount of $70,135.80

General Traffic Equipment Corp. for items 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 12, 20, 24, and 26
Estimated annual dollar amount of $24,540.00. Contract estimated amount of $73,620.00

Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. for items 17, 18, and 19
Estimated annual dollar amount of $27,420.00. Contract estimated amount of $82,260.00

Total estimated contract award of $226,015.80. Contract is for a term of 36 months.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

32010288 (Traffic Signals), 503203 (Public Accesses Maint & Repairs), Fund 01101 (General Fund), Class
32000, $30,135.44 estimated annually.

99331117 (2006 CO’s), 508027 (Construction), Fund 27263 (2006 CO’s), Class 32000, Project PCP06ST013
(Signal/Flasher Installation) $45,203.16 estimated annually.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: (if required) FINANCE: (if required)

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Cc: Jane Shang, Deputy City Manager Mobility Services
APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: September 11, 2008

PROJECT: Traffic Signal Components
SOLICITATION NO: 2008-222 DEPARTMENT: Street Department
BUDGET NO: 32010288-503203-01101
99331117-508027-27263
FUNDING SOURCE: Public Access Maintenance and Repairs
Construction

REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Traffic Parts, Inc.

Conroe, Texas
Items: 1,2, 3,4, 10, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 21, 22, 23, and 25
Amount: $23,378.60 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: General Traffic Equipment Corp.
Newburgh, New York

ltems: 5,6,7,8,9, 12, 20, 24, and 26

Amount: $24,540.00 estimated annual expenditures

Vendor: Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.
Arlington, Texas

Iltems: 17,18, and 19

Amount: $27,420.00 estimated annual expenditures

Street Department and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest responsive, responsible
Bidders.

This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract for Traffic Signal Components.  Traffic Parts, Inc. and
Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. do not offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract. General Traffic
Equipment Corp offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract for two additional years. No prompt
payment discounts are offered.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this contract may be
higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end of the contract term, so
long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED-
BIDS RECEIVED-
“NO BID” RECEIVED

(2 local)

oo m

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $226,015.80
Estimated Total 3 yr Expenditures
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COUNCIL/APPROVED [] REJECTED [ ] MUNICIPAL CLERK
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 7, 2008

ouiTS

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services, Purg

cc: Bid File




JOHN COOK City COUNCIL
MAYOR
ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2
EMMA ACOSTA, DISTRICT 3
MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
RACHEL QUINTANA, DISTRICT 5

JOYCE WILSON EDDIE HOLGUIN, JR., DISTRICT 6

CITY MANAGER STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8
JANE SHANG
DEepUTY CITY MANAGER

DARYL W. COLE

STREETS DIRECTOR
STREET DEPARTMENT
September 23, 2008
TO: Terrence Freiburg, Deputy Director Financial Services

ATTN: Leticia Rivera, Procurement Analyst %
FROM: Daryl W. Cole, Streets Director (S g /z f/o b
SUBJECT:  Bid No. 2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

We have reviewed the above-subject bid and we recommend that the contract be awarded to
Traffic Parts, Inc., General Traffic Equipment Corp, and Consolidated Traffic Controls,
Inc., for items listed below, offering the lowest, most responsive and responsible bidder meeting
specifications.

Traffic Parts Inc.
Items 1, 2, 3,4, 10, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 21, 22, 23, and 25
Estimated annual dollar amount of $23,378.60. Contract estimated amount of $70,135.80

General Traffic Equipment Corp.

Items 5, 6,7, 8,9, 12, 20, 24, and 26

Estimated annual dollar amount of $24,540.00. Contract estimated amount of $73,620.00
Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.

Items 17, 18, and 19

Estimated annual dollar amount of $27,420.00. Contract estimated amount of $82,260.00
Total estimated contract award of $226,015.80. Contract is for a term of 36 months.

If you have any questions please call me at 621-6750.

DWCl/en




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222

DEPARTMENT: STREET

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC |  GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC | PELCO PRODUCTS, INC.
CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. EDMOND, OK
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY FT. WORTH, TX
ITEM EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTy. UNITPRICE | QTY. X UNITPRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY.X UNIT PRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY.XUNITPRICE)|| UNITPRICE | QTY.X UNIT PRICE)
100 :
1. | PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY 5" X7" | EACH | $66.00 $6,600.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $67.00 $6,700.00 $80.31 $8,031.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE2115 | GTE CORP. PBA-1010ADA| PELCO __ SE-2115 PELCO SE-2115
70 '
2. | PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY 9"X 12" | EACH | $86.00 $6,020.00 $65.00 $4,550.00 $88.00 $6,160.00 | $104.90 | $7,343.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE2113 | GTE CORP. PBA-1020ADA| PELCO SE-2113__| PELCO SE-2113
100
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" X 7" EACH | $10.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO
70
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" X 12" EACH | $13.00 $910.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/VMODEL PELCO
_ TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES 20 / :
5. (ARROW) GREEN EACH | $40.00 $800.00 $20.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/MODEL GENERAL SIGNAL )
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES 20
6. (ARROW) AMBER EACH | $40.00 $800.00 $20.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/MODEL GENERAL SIGNAL
20
7. | TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES GREEN | EACH | $30.00 $600.00 $15.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/VMIODEL GENERAL SIGNAL
. 20 .
8. | TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES AMBER | EACH | $30.00 $600.00 $15.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER/MODEL GENERAL SIGNAL
‘ 20
9. TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES RED EACH | $30.00 $600.00 $15.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER/MODEL

GENERAL SIGNAL

APPROVED BY: MM&/

¥

DATE: g'/ 1808

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222
DEPARTMENT: STREET

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC: GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC PELCO PRODU__CTS, INC.
CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. EDMOND, OK
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY FT. WORTH, TX
ITEM EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Qry. UNIT PRICE | QTY.X UNIT PRICE) || UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) [ UNITPRICE | QTY. X UNITPRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY.X UNIT PRICE)
100
10. | ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER EACH $91.00 $9,100.00 NO BID $93.00 $9,300.00 $110.58 $11,058.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SK00230 PELCO SK-0230 PELCO SK-0230
100
11. | MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET| EACH $70.00 $7,000.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $73.00 $7,300.v00 $86.33 $8,633.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO AB3009-62 | GTE CORP. RM-MAC-62 PELCO AB-3009-62 PELCO AB-3009
50 :
12. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS EACH $23.00 $1,150.00 $12.00 $600.00 $24.00 . $1,200.00 $27.96 $1,398.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE4038 GTE CF-260 PELCO SE-4038 PELCO SE-4038
HARDWARE HORIZONTAL 50
13. _SLIP TEE (STEEL) EACH $12.00 $600.00 NO BID $13.00 $650.00 $15.00 $750.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE0458 PELCO SE-0458 PELCO SE-0458
100 -
14. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE EACH $11.00 $1,100.00 $8.00 $800.00 $11.00 $1,100.00 $13.57 $1,357.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0357 GTE PBH-425 PELCO SE-0357 PELCO SE-0357
120
15. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE EACH $13.00 $1,560.00 $8.00 $960.00 $13.00 $1,560.00 $15.71 $1,885.20
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 4071 GTE PBH-420 PELCO SE-4071 PELCO SE-4071
ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON 50
16. ASSEMBLY WITH 2" PLUNGER EACH $48.00 $2,400.00 $29.50 $1,475.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $59.08 $2,954.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 2100 GTE PBB-ADA-2 PELCO SE-2100 PELCO SE-2100
60
17. | SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL EACH $37.00 $2,220.00 $38.00 { $2,280.00 $38.00 $2,280.00 $44.90 . $2,694.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 3106 GTE PTS-102 PELCO SE-3106 PELCO SE-3106
50 :
18. | ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 15' EACH $274.00 $13,700.00 NO BID $307.00 $15,350.00 $336.94 $16,847.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO ‘PB5100-15 PELCO PB-5100-15 PELCO PB-5100

" DATE:

APPROVED BY: m}"

8/18/¢8

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

- BID # 2008-222

DEPARTMENT: STREET

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC PELCO PRODUCTS, INC.
CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. EDMOND, OK
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY FT. WORTH, TX
ITEM EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTY. UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY.XUNIT PRICE) | UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE)
50
19. | ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 12" | EACH $230.00 $11,500.00 NO BID $233.00 $11,650.00 $277.86 $13,893.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO PB5100-12 PELCO PB-5100-12 PELCO PB-5100
50
20. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) EACH $7.00 * $350.00 $4.00 $200.00 $7.00 $350.00 $8.57 $428.50
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE0309-02 GTE PELCO SE-0309-02 PELCO SE-0309
50
21. NIPPLE, HEX (ALUM) EACH $5.00 . $250.00 $3.50 $175.00 $5.00 - $250.00 $5.41 $270.50
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0448 GTE CN-H-150 PELCO SE-0448 PELCO SE-0448
100
22, SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) EACH $0.50 $50.00 $0.35 $35.00 $1.00 $100.00 _$0.41 $41.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO FS3217-SS PELCO FS-3217-SS PELCO FS-3217-SS
50
23. NIPPLE, HEX (ALUM) EACH $5.00 $250.00 $3.50 $175.00 $5.00 $250.00 $5.51 $275.50
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0443 GTE CN-H-150 PELCO SE-0443 PELCO SE-0443
100 ;
24. GASKET 70 DURO NEOPRENE EACH $0.50 $50.00 $0.40 $40.00 $1.00 $100.00 $0.41 $41.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0354 GTE RW-150 PELCO SE-0354 PELCO SE-0354
50
25. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE EACH $4.00 $200.00 $2.25 $112.50 $3.00 $150.00 $4.08 '$204.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE4088 GTE CC-195 PELCO -SE-4088 PELCO SE-4088
200 :
26. | BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL EACH $166.00 $33,200.00 $110.00 $22,000.00 $186.00 $37,200.00 $206.03 $41,206.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SP1014-TX PELCO SP1014-TX PELCO SP-1014-TX
' PB-5306, PB-0602 AND PB-0603 PB-5306; PB-0602; PB-0603
TOTAL (ALL ITEMS): $102,610.00 $46,102.50 $119,309.70

APPROVED BY: m
pate: 8/18/68

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT

$104,150.00




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222

DEPARTMENT: STREET

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC PELCO PRODUCTS, INC.
CONTROLS, INC. EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. EDMOND, OK
_ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY FT. WORTH, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINIl
TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINA
TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

L]

L]

[x]

[ ]

]

L]
X

NO OPTION OFFERED E
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - .30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES NO YES NO | YES NO YES NO
PROCUREMENT CARD: [ ] [ ] [ ] ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 45 - 60 CONSECUTIVE 30 - 60 CONSECUTIVE 30 - 45 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE
Within consecutive calendar days. CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS
Within four hours or overnight after receipt of verbal YES - NO YES YES NO YES NO
order (in cases of emergency): [:I OVERNIGHT [:l D

APPROVED BY:W

pate: 918 /t€

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: 'AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222

DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
PRODUCTS LTD CONROE, TX
ROUND ROCK, TX
ITEM EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. ‘ DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTY. UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) || UNIT PRICE QTY. X UNIT PRICE)
, PUSH BUTTON 100
1. ASSEMBLY 5" X 7" EACH $67.44 $6,744.00 $40.49 $4,049.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 2115 CH TP#PB-S10-B23-Y
PUSH BUTTON 70
2. . ASSEMBLY 9" X 12" EACH $88.14 $6,169.80 $56.79 $3,975.30
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 2113 CH TP#PB-S10-B43-Y
100
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" X 7" EACH NO BID $6.24 $624.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL HALL / R10-4b 5x7.75 NO ARROW
70
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" X 12" EACH NO BID $9.14 $639.80
MANUFACTURER/MODEL HALL / R10-4b 9x12 NO ARROW
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES 20 v
5. (ARROW) GREEN EACH NO BID $36.00 $720.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL KOPP TP#1652
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES 20
6. (ARROW) AMBER EACH NO BID $36.00 $720.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL KOPP TP#1653
20
7. TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES GREEN EACH NO BID $24.50 $490.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL KOPP TP#603
: 20
iK:? TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES AMBER EACH NO BID $24.50 $490.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL KOPP TP#602
20
9. TRAFFIC SIGNAL LENSES RED EACH NO BID $24.50 $490.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL KOPP TP#601

APPROVED BY:W

DAT;E: ﬂ[@/gf’

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: . AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222
DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
PRODUCTS LTD CONROE, TX
ROUND ROCK, TX -
ITEM : EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Qry. UNITPRICE | QTY. X UNITPRICE) | UNITPRICE | QTY.X UNIT PRICE)
) 100
10. | ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER EACH $92.88 $9,288.00 $45.73 $4,573.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SK-0230 CH/TP#6113 *MANUF. PAINT YELLOW
MAST ARM MOUNT 100
1. SIGNAL BRACKET EACH $72.54 $7,254.00 $62.00 $6,200.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO AB 3009-62 CH - TP#5624
50
12. | _HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS EACH $23.52 $1,176.00 $14.50 $725.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 4028 CH TP#5860
HARDWARE HORIZONTAL 50
13. . SLIP TEE (STEEL) EACH $12.60 $630.00 $10.50 $525.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0458 CH /TP #2750 | PAINT YELLOW
100
14, HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE EACH $11.40 $1,140.00 $7.26 $726.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0357 CH TP#5357
120
15. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE EACH $13.20 $1,584.00 $7.50 $900.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 4071 CH TP#5358
ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON 50
16. ASSEMBLY WITH 2" PLUNGER EACH $49.62 $2,481.00 $15.79 $789.50
‘ MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 2100 CH TP#PB-S10-B00-Y
] SLIPFITTER FOR 60
17. " TWO WAY SIGNAL EACH $37.74 $2,264.40 $37.50 $2,250.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 3106  |[CH/TP#2583/TP#14 | PAINT YELLO
ALUMINUM PEDESTAL 50
18, POLE 4" X 15' . EACH $283.08 $14,154.00 $295.00 $14,750.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO PB 5100-15 CPI TP36055-15X/TP#1005

APPROVED BY: %ﬂMW’

DATE: 87/3'/58/

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222
DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
PRODUCTS LTD CONROE, TX
ROUND ROCK, TX
ITEM EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST. TOTAL PRICE (EST.
NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Qry. UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) || UNIT PRICE | QTY. X UNIT PRICE)
50
19. | ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 12' | EACH $233.40 $11,670.00 $250.00 $12,500.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO PB-5100-12 CPI TP#6054XITP#1005
50
20. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) EACH $7.20 $360.00 $8.00 $400.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0309-02 CH TP#7245
50
21. NIPPLE, HEX (ALUM) EACH $4.56 $228.00 $2.32 $116.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0448 CH TP#232
100
22, SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) EACH $0.50 $50.00 $0.16 $16.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO FS 3217-88S CH TP#5271
50
23. NIPPLE, HEX (ALUM) EACH $4.68 $234.00 $2.95 $147.50
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0443 CH TP#4290
100
24, GASKET 70 DURO NEOPRENE EACH $0.50 $50.00 $0.44 $44.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 0354 CH TP#2127
50 :
25. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE EACH $3.48 $174.00 $1.95 $97.50
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SE 4088 CH TP#231
200
26. | BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL EACH $173.88 $34,776.00 $175.00 $35,000.00
MANUFACTURER/MODEL PELCO SP1014-TX | CPI&CH (1)TP#6016

TOTAL (ALL ITEMS):

APPROVED BY:; m{/f,ﬂ-/
DATE: 8//[57 og

PB5306, PB0602, PB0603

$100,427.20 |

(4) #4208 1 (3 #7155 ] (3) #7156

| $91,957.60

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT 7




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2008

BID # 2008-222
DEPARTMENT: STREET

TEXAS HIGHWAY
PRODUCTS LTD
ROUND ROCK, TX

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
CONROE, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

hBIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINA
TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINA
TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

[ ]

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED 1 X‘ E
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES NO YES NO
PROGUREMENT CARD: ] L]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: v 45 CONSECUTIVE 30 CONSECUTIVE
Within consecutive calendar days. CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS
Within four hours or overnight after receipt of verbal YES DEPENDS ON YES NO
order (in cases of emergency): ITEM & QTY. D

BIDS SOLICITED: 14

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY: m"
oate. W(8l0Y

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

2008-222 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - STREET DEPARTMENT




PELCO PRODUCTS INC.
320 SW 18™ STREET
EDMOND, OK 73013-3628

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS
5705 AIRPORT FREEWAY
FORT WORTH, TX 76117

TRAFFIC PARTS INC.
P. 0. BOX 837
SPRING, TX 77383

U. S. TRAFFIC CORPORATION
ATTN: PATRICE DAVEZAN
9603 JORNSTREET

SANTA-FE-SPRINGS, CA—90670
HULS E-LD POLwie T, ¢i% e
BAHCAR A 532500

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP.

259 BROADWAY
NEWBURGH, NY 12550

MCCAIN TRAF%QUPPLY INC.

2575 RIONEER AYENUE ¢
VISTA, 92083-5411 \)/
!

TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS CORP.

1309 B CLARK STREET
ROUND ROCK, TX 78680

HI-TECH SIGNALS INC.
P. O. BOX 24071
FORT WORTH, TX 76124

ATTN: Ag?l GANDARA

INDU RIES . /
. BOX 3550

EL ASO,TX 79923

ROSANNA COPPER

5605 DEVON AVENUE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79924

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC
CONTROLS INC.

P. 0. BOX 151837
ARLINGTON, TX 76015

TRAFFIC ENGINEERING &
CONTROLS INC.

4193 FM 811
CENTERVILLE, TX 758833

- ATTN: ZACHARY J. OLIPHANT

RELIAPOLE SOLUTIONS, INC.
16835 EAST MAGLITTO CIRCLE
TOMBALL, TX 77377

TRAFFIC ENGINEERING
AND CONTROLS

114 24™ STREET

SAN LEON, TX 77539




