‘CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services-Fleet Services
AGENDA DATE: 10/13/2009

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Stuart Ed, Director, General Service, (915) 621-6822
. Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager (915) 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council

to approve. Include $ amount if applicable.

Approve C&R Distributing (Chevron) as the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder for Motor Oil,
Lubricants, Transmission, and Hydraulic Fluids. C&R offered the overall lowest prices in both Groups I and
II. Estimated expenditures over two (2) years are}$2,500,000. :

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably complete description of the contemplated action. This
should include attachment of bid tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of this action? What are

the citizen concerns?

The City’s current fleet requires the use of motor, transmission oils, lubricants and hydraulic fluids. This
contract would allow for the purchase of these items and continual maintenance of these vehicles allowing
them to operate safely and in accordance with manufacturer’s specifications.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?
Yes.
. AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by account numbers and description of account. Does
it require a budget transfer? .

37370510-503121-45202-37000, General Services Dept, Internal Service Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A
***************_****REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

LEGAL: FINANCE:
(If required) required) / '
DEPARTMENT HEAD: W@ ' CK/ 4 Oct
Name Signature  \ Date f l \

(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

“APPROVED FOR AGENDA:
CITY MANAGER: ~ DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: September 30, 2009

PROJECT: Motor Oil, Lubricants, Transmission and Hydraulic Fluids
SOLICITATION NO: 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: General Services

BUDGET NO: 37370510-503121-45202

FUNDING SOURCE:  General Services Dept., Internal Service Fund
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: C & R Distributing, Inc.
El Paso, Texas
Item: All (Chevron bid)
Amount;  $1,250,000.00 estimated annual expenditures

General Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest responsive,
responsible Bidder.

This is a twenty-four (24) month requirements type contract. Vendor offers the City the option to extend the
term of the contract at the same unit price for an additional one (1) or two (2) year period if the option is
exercised prior to the expiration of the original term of the contract. No prompt payment discount is offered.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end
of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED- 34 (22 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 7
“NO BID" RECEIVED 0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:  $2,500,000.00
Estimated Total 2 yr Expenditures

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 13, 2009

Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services, Purchasing Division

cc: Bid File




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS BID # 2009-235
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
. | C&RDISTRIBUTING INC. | C & RDISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(15,950 GALLONS [230 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. SAE 10W MOTOR OIL $575.00 $323.95 . $431.00 $812.90
(55 GALLON}) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER 'EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRAMAX SG10
BERAND PRODUCT NUMBER DELVAC 1610 DELO 400 131 - #067J
2. SAE 30W MOTOR OiL $575.00 $343.75 $407.00 $812.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
" MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs LUBRA MAX SG30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ~ DELVAC 1630 "~ DELO 400 57 #264J '
3. SAE 5W20 MOTOR OIL $343.75 © $323.95 $410.00 $881.65
- (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG 5W20
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MORBIL CLEAN SUPREME 121-55 #541J
4. SAE 5W30 MCTOR OIL $343.75 $323.95 $410.00 $881.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG 5W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL CLEAN SUPREME 93-55 #542J
5. SAE 10W30 MOTOR OiL $332.75 1 $323.95 $410.00 $782.65
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER 'EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA MAX MG10W30
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL CLEAN SUPREME 59 #285J

APPROVED BY %

DATE: :'Z /15 9

LA

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PAS@ BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULlC FLUIDS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC.

(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX a EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(7,975 GALLONS [145 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) . IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. ATF DEXRON il $825.00 $335.00 $417.00 $832.15
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM 7
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMSATF Y
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL ATF DIM ATF MD-3 44 #176J
7. MERCON V TRANSMISSION FLUID $825.00 $515.00 $636.00 $2,165.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs M/M TRANS V ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER . MOBIL MERCON V SYN BLEND MULTI-VEHICLE ATF 225-55 #443J
8. ATF+3 TRANSMISSION FLUID $825.00 $695.00 $484.00 NO BID
{55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL ATF + 4 ATF +4 223-55

9. TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID - $346.56 $385.00 $326.00 $867.90 7]
‘ o i (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM . (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER _ EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL FLUID 424 1000 THF 12 #617J

DATE

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID ITEM: MCTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

BID. # 2009-235
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC.

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC..

FLEET PRIDE

(7,480 POUNDS [136 DRUMS] OF THE FOLLOWING)

13. MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE,

NCH CORPORATION
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(2,475 GALLONS [45 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10. UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 $540.00 $402.00 $395.00 $984.00
i (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM ‘
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT PTGL GEARCO 85W140
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILUBE HDT UGL 85-140 85W140-55G #137J
1. | SYNTHETIC GEAR OIiL 50 $1,375.00 $1,230.00 $803.00 $2,244.00
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs LUBRA SYSTEMS SYN 50
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DEL VAC SYN TRAN FLUID |DELO SYNTHETIC FLUID 50 219-55 #346J
12. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 $1,375.00 $1,230.00 $803.00 $3,024.00
. (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT{ CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA TECH SYNTHETIC 75W140
BRAND PRCDUCT NUMBER DEL VAC SYN GEAR OIL || DELO SYNTHETIC GEAR 80-140 218-55 #329J

$955.20 $960.00 $1,104.00
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED GREASE (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT|| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID LUBRAPLEX
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILUX EP #2 MOLY DELO HD MOLY 3 EP2 #208J

o (lomd K

DATE: 7—/ 28/09

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

GROUP 1I: TRANSMISS

ND

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIiL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009 )

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC.

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC.

FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS EL PASOQ, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(5,995 GALLONS [109 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION ' UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. TRANSYND OiL $1,600.00 $845.00 $1,500.00
' (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT] . NONE STATED NO BID —
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DELVAC SYN ATF SYNTHETIC ATF HEAVY DUTY- 709701
2. MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC $650.00 $515.00 $656.00
BLEND ATF (55 GALLON) DRUM ’ {55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

. (1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)

ATF+4

MULTI VEHICLE ATF

MULTI-VEHICLE ATF

$650.00 $695.00 $550.00
{55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT||CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER VOBIL ATF + 4 ATF +4 224-55
4, MERCON V $650.00 $515.00 $636.00 $2,165.90 o
(55 GALLON) DRUM " (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM 7]
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS M/M TRANS V ATF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULT!-VEHICLE ATF MULTI-VEHICLE ATF 225-55 #443J
5. DEXRON Vi $925.00 $625.00 $637.00
o (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
~ MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs NOBID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DEXOT ATF DEX VI 228-55

APPROVED BY:

paTE: 1/ 24)

-t ot

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

e lond Bt
Y25/

DATE: 2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

MV (FORMERLY RYKON)

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS BID # 2009-235
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
GROUP lI: TRANSMISSION AND C &R DISTRIBUTING INC. | C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DiVISION
(1,485 GALLONS [27 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (EXXON MOBIL) (CHEVRON) , IRVING, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. DTE-18M HYDRAULIC OIL ISC VG100 $481.25 $396.00 $421.00 $749.65
: (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT||CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA GUARD 100
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE HYD . RANDO'HDZ 100 310 #006J B v
7. MOBIL DTE 26 HYDRAULIC OIL $398.75 $285.00 $306.00 $749.65
) (55 GALLON) DRUM . (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVs LUBRA GUARD 68
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE HYD CHEV. AW 68 43 #005J
8. MOBIL 424 $346.50 $385.00 $1,816.00 $867.90
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT SVS LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 'MOBIL FLUID 424 1000 THF 236 #617J
S. HEAT TRANSFER OIL $748.50 $354.85 $908.15
: (55 GALLON) DRUM {55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID FTHTO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBILTHERWM 603 HEAT TRANSFER OIL 46 ' : #506J
10. POWERTECH (JOHN DEERE J20G-D) $346.50 $585.00 $867.90 :
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT||CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID LUBRA SYSTEMS THF
JZOL CHEVRON 1000 THF ) )
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL FLUID 424 JZOD CHEVRON SYNTHETIC #617J
ALL WEATHER THF
i1. RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE $481.25 $370.15 :
. (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER EXXON MOBIL OR EQUIVALENT| CHEVRON OR EQUIVALENT NO BID NO BID
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MOBIL DTE 18M RANDO HD PREMIUM OIL




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

B!D ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

iBID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

C & RDISTRIBUTING INC.

verbal order in cases of emergency.

C &R DISTRIBUTING INC. FLEET PRIDE NCH CORPORATION
EL PASQ, TX EL PASG, TX EL PASO, TX CHEMSEARCH DIVISION
(EXXON MGBIL) (CHEVRON) IRVING, TX
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WiTHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS: |
~,
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR: _
) NONE STATED

ONE (1) ADDITIGNAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF _
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, _ ]
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.
- . . —
PAYMENT TERMS- NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 10 DAYS

DD C N
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES NO D . YES NO l:‘ YES NO D YES NO D _
PRCCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: _ 24 4 NONE STATED
Within hour or the next morning. : .
Within hours or overnight afier receipt of 5-T7DAYS ARO

— ¥ overn'd recelpt o 24 24 NONE STATED

A

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

o L Yt

DATE: %XA?

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

STEWART &

SUPER SELECT 10W30GF-4/SM

10W30

TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
{15,950 GALLONS [290 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX : EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. SAE 10W MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $513.96 $374.81
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO FLEET ™
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DIESEL SUPREME PLUS 10W - 10
2. SAE 30W MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $613.49 $398.57
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRﬂM {55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO FLEET
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER DIESEL SUPREME PLUS 30W 30
3. SAE 5W20 MOTCR OiL NONE STATED $499.95 $356.40
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SUPER SELECT 5W20GF-4/SM 5W20
4. SAE 5W30 MOTOR GIL NONE STATED . $374.95 $356.40 N
) (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | . CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMRER SUPER SELECT 5W30GF-4/SM 5W30
5. SAE 10W30 MOTOR OIL NONE STATED $348.39 $349.27
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO SYNTH. BLEND
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

e D U

DATE: 7([ 13 /04

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

DATE: /& X[ Oq

_ - . STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(7,975 GALLONS [145 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX ' EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. ATF DEXRON I NONE STATED $426.85 $361.75
l ’ (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO ]
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULTI-TRANSMISSION ATF SUPER ATF
7. MERCON V TRANSMISSION FLUID NONE STATED $476.39
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON)‘ DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MERCON V
8. ATF+3 TRANSMISSION FLUID NONE STATED , , $678.70
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID KENDALL VERSA TRAN
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER SYN BLEND ATF
(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING)
9. TRACTOR'HYDRAULIC FLUID NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER POWERTECH UNIVERSAL POWER TRAN
TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




CiTY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR Gii, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

STEWART &

TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
GROUP I: LUBRICANTS AND MOTOR OIL (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(2,475 GALLONS [45 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION » UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10. UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 NONE STATED $572.88 $500.14
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALL.ON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

MULTIGEAR SELECT 85W140GL-5

UNIV. GEAR LUBE 85W140

(7,480 POUNDS [136 DRUMS] OF THE FOLLOWING)

11. SYNTHETIC GEAR OiL 50 NONE STATED $1,758.90 $1,338.26
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MONARCH SYNTRAN PLUS 50W| SYNCON TRITON TRANS 50
12. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 NONE STATED $1,626.24 $1,339.47
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MONARCH SYNGEAR PLUS 80W140 ||  SYNCON TRITON 80W140

e Do T

13. 'MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, NONE STATED $666.40- $862.40 $937.44
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED GREASE (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | CONOCO CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER CROWN ROYAL MOLY - | SUPER STAMOLY! MEGAPLEX XD3
GRAPHITE EP GREASE 2 (1% MOLY) #2 (3% MOLY)

BID # 2009-235
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

DATE: ,T/Z-X; 01 2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

:




CITY OF EL. PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS
BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

BID # 2009-235

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP lIl: TRANSMISSION AND STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS STEVENSON LLC - EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(5,995 GALLONS {109 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASOQ, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. TRANSYND OIL $1,481.65 $1,234.20 | $1,301.36
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM |
MANUFACTURER CTDR NO BID " CONOCO MOBIL —
SYNCON HIGH SYNTH.
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 27101 PERFORMANCE ATF ATF
2. . MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC NONE STATED $662.95 $730.24 $678.70
BLEND ATF (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL | MOBIL MULTI- | KENDALL VERSATRAN
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MULTI-TRANS PLUS ATF SYNTHETIC||  VEHICLE ATF SYN BLEND ATF
(1,045 GALLONS [19 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) (FULLY SYNTHETIC LUBRICANT)
.| ATF+4 NONE STATED ~ $678.70
} (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID KENDALL VERSA
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

TRAN SYN. BLEND ATF

4. MERCON V NONE STATED $476.39
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM .
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MERCON V
5. ~ DEXRON Vi NONE STATED $680.63
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID MOBIL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ' DEXRON VI

S Py e

DATE: ; 2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

GROUP Il: TRANSMISSION AND

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

NONE STATED

STEWART & TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
HYDRAULIC FLUIDS (CONTINUED) STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
(1,485 GALLONS [27 DRUMS] OF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM . DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6. DTE-i8M HYDRAULIC OIL ISC VG100 NONE STATED . $548.33 $648.75
(55 GALLGN) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID MOBIL DTE 18M MOBIL DTE 10
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER (DISCONTINUED) EXCEL 100 Y
. "\,‘ ’
7. MOBIL DTE 26 HYDRAULIC OIL NONE STATED $264.95 $474.56
- (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG./WRIGHT OIL MOBIL DTE 26
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ROZEP AW HYDRAULIC 68 NONE STATED
8. MOBIL 424 NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63 $475.75
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG.\WRIGHT OIL CONOCO MOBIL FLUID
POWERTECH UNIVERSAL
BRAND PRODUGT NUMBER TRACTOR FLUID POWERTRAN 424
9. HEAT TRANSFER OiL NONE STATED : $348.48
(55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO HEAT TRANSFER OIL
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER NONE STATED
10. POWERTECH (JOHN DEERE J20C-D) NONE STATED $412.95 $366.63 $475.75
: (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER ROYAL MFG.WRIGHT OIL CONOCO MOBIL FLUID
POWERTECH UNIVERSAL TRACTOR
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER FLUID FOR JOHN DEERE POWER TRAN 424
11. RYKON ISC NON-CONDUCTIVE NONE STATED $5586.60
{55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM (55 GALLON) DRUM
MANUFACTURER NO BID CONOCO MULTI-PURPOSE R&0
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER ~

DATE: ’?/ 28/0f

2009-235 MOTOR blL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 22, 2009

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
GPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTICN IS EXERCGISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF
THE CURRENT CONTRACT TERM.

BID ITEM: MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

BID # 2009-235

STEWART &

TIGUA ENTERPRISES, INC. WESTERN REFINING
STEVENSON LLC EL PASO, TX WHOLESALE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

]

g

]

]

]

x|

NO OPTION OFFERED E E
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY ‘
YEs |X| nO YES Nno | X YES Nno |X .

PROCUREMENT CARD: D _ D D ~
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within hour or the next morning. 24 24 24
Within hours or overnight after receipt of -

— 4 4 4
verbal order in cases of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 34

BIDS RECEIVED: 7

BIDS LOCAL: 22 '

NO BIDS: 0

—y e

DATE: 7 2370

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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BREWER OIL CO
105 COMPRESS RD
LAS CRUCES NM 88005

ATTN MR SONNY STEWART
JAY F STEWART OIL COMPANY
INC

26 BUTTERFIELD TRAIL BLVD
EL PASO TX 79906

CANYON STATE OIL COMPANY
INC

2131 E MISSOURI AVE

EL PASO TX 79903

HENRY MENDOZA SALES CO
SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
PO BOX 221783

EL PASO TX 79913

BIG BEAR OIL CO INC
1025 WALL RD
EL PASO TX 79915

ATTN ACME SERVICES INC
GOVERNMENT CONTRACT
5246 TRANSPORTATION BLVD
GARFIELD HEIGHTS OH 44125

ATTN KAREN HURLEY
CASCADE DISTRIBUTING INC
136 E MAIN ST SUITE 6

KENT OH 44240

C L NORTH INDUSTRIAL SALES |

5355 EL PASO DR
EL PASO, TX 79905

ATTN: SUSIE ARCHIBEQUE
GORMAN INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
1701 TEXAS AVE.

EL PASO, TX 79901

SHELL
4157 RIO BRAVO ST
EL PASO, TX 79912

ATTN SALES

CHEVRON USA INC
PO BOX 20002
EL PASO TX 79998

MESA OIL INC
7239 BRADBURN ST
WESTMINSTER CO 80030

FABENS OIL COMPANY
PO BOX 577 -
FABENS TX 79836

C & R DISTRIBUTING INC
8528 ALAMEDA AVE
EL PASO TX 79907

SOUTHWEST ENERGY DIST INC
FORMERLY WOOD OIL DISTRIBUTING
POBOX 711

ODESSA TX 79760

ATTN CARLOS JUAREZ JR
EQUILON ENTERPRISES LLC
4157 RIO BRAVO ST

EL PASO TX 79902

CHEVRON LUBRICANTS
9401 WILLIAMSBURG PLZ SUITE 201
LOUISVILLE KY 40222

ADOLFO MOLINAR
10 JOE TURNER
EL PASO, TX 79915

LUNE’'N GO
6400 AIRPORT RD., SUITEW
EL PASO, TX 79925

1. B. T. INC.

ATTN: STEVE NAVARRO
6915 INDUSTRIAL AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

.I ‘
rILLGER OIL CO

801 W OREGON PO BOX 1989
LAS CRUCES NM 88004

TRANSMOUNTAIN OIL COMPANY
6767 GATEWAY WEST BLVD
EL PASO TX 79925

DESERT WEST LUBRICANTS INC
1013 WALL RD
EL PASO TX 79915

CARQUEST AUTO PARTS
ATTN: RUBEN PINON

11220 ROJAS DR SUITE C-7
EL PASO TX 79935

ATTN CARLOS ESCOBAR DIST MNGR
PEP BOYS AUTOMOTIVE

1100 RANGER ST

EL PASO TX 79907

ATTN TONY SANTA CRUZ SUPPLY
BSE BORDER STATES ELECTRIC
8101 LOCKHEED DR

EL PASO TX 79925

DANNY “SKIP” HERNANDEZ IN C/O
SAM’S CLUB WEST ‘

7970 N MESA ST

EL PASO TX 79932

MARIA GANDARA, VICE PRESIDENT
H 1T INDUSTRIES

P O BOX 3550

EL PASO, TX 79923

ATTN: MICHAEL MCTANMNEY

THE PEP BOYS
3111 WEST ALLEGHENY AVENUE

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19132

MIDWEST INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, INC.
ATTN: SHANNON NOBLE

P.0. BOX 8431

CANTON, OH 44711




WESCO DISTRIBUTION
ATTN: TONY SANTA CRUZ

6510A GATEWAY EAST BLVD.

EL PASO, TX 79905

PETRO-CANADA

ATTN: BRUCE HYATT
P.O. BOX 586
NEWTONVILLE, NY 12128

uHEMSEARCH, A DIV. OF NCH CORP
P. 0. BOX 152170
IRVING, TEXAS 75015-2170

2009-235 MOTOR OIL, LUBRICANTS, TRANSMISSION AND HYDRAULIC FLUIDS

)
+RANSMOUNTAIN OIL CO

PO BOX 10093
EL PASO, TX 79995-0093






