: CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

- DEPARTMENT: General Services Department
- AGENDADATE:  FBPbyPurchasing  October 16, 2007
B ,CO_NTACT PERSON/PHONE: Jeff Belles, 621-6821 ; Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, ext. 4313
: ‘:DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Mapager to
do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Inc%ude $ amount if applicable.

Award all items for bid 2007-251 Emergency Vehicle Lighting and Accessories to Alamo Auto Supply. Estimated
annual expenditures are $50,000.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably ~
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of this

action? What are the citizen concerns?

See attached bid tabulations. Alamo was the lowest responsive bidder meeting specifications. New
Mexico Emergency Products was disqualified because it did not meet the specifications for delivery
time. '

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by
account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

45202-37370510-503121, General Services Department, Fleet Services Internal Service Fund
*********:&*********REQUIRED_ AUT.HORIZATION***‘******‘********-k**

s DEPARTMENT HEAD: Jeffrey A Belles, October 2, 2007 @W &4‘ 9 ﬁ z ﬁ

(Example: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

i f: APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

_ CITY MANAGER: DATE:




PROJECT FORM

DATE: 10/05/2007

i :P'ROJECT: Emergency Lighting, Warning and Communication Equipment and Installation
. -'SOLICITATION NO: 2007-251 DEPARTMENT: General Services
- BUDGET NO: 45202-37370510-503121

* " -FUNDING SOURCE: General Services, Internal Service Fund
.- REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): ALL

Fedkkkdoddkdkdddokdodddodkdeokkdokdkdodeddddedddkdekdhkdhkdkddkhhkhkhhrhkhkhkhhdhkrhhddhkdhkhhddhkdhdhkdhdhkhkhhdhdhkhhkhkhkhkhhkhkdhdhkk

' '.RECOMMENDATION: Vendor:  Alamo Industries, Inc. dba Alamo Auto Supply
e El Paso, TX
Item: All

Amount:  $50,000.00 (Estimated Annually)

- The General Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the lowest responsive,

~ responsible Bidder.

‘This is a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract for the purchase of Emergency Lighting, Warning
and Communication Equipment and Installation. No prompt payment discount is offered.

- BIDS SOLICITED- 8 (8 local)

- BIDS RECEIVED- 3

¥ “NO BID” RECEIVED 0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $150,000.00 (Estimated)

: edesdedededededododededodedede de e dode dedededodedede dededede de de e dedede de e e dededededede e e dedededede de e de dede de e dede de dedededededededededededededededededededededededede ke dedededededededede ke dedededede ke dededede ke dedededede ke dededekeokk

COUNCIL APPROVED I____I ‘REJECTED D MUNICIPAL CLERK
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COUNCIL MEETING DATE: 10/16/2007

- Terrence Freiburg
~ Purchasing Manager




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNIC

ATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
GROUP I: EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND WARNING NET [ ] NET [ ] NET [ ]
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the =28% DISCOUNT  [x] =12% DISCOUNT -38% DISCOUNT
1. Federal Signal Price List [OR Catalog] ‘
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) + % MARKUP E___l + % MARKUP D + % MARKUP I:l
List Number 1100SL-8 / 1-1-07 1206.50 2007 PRODUCT CATALOG
Dated (ALSO INCLUDES DISCOUNT 1-1-07 NONE
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed: FROM AMBER-ND PRICE LIST
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL: | JOBBER 002900 DATE 11/2007)
WHOLESALER ] (]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] L]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER ] L] L]
RETAILER ] x] ]
OTHER LIST ] (]
APPROVED BY: 2¢/ %
e, 700/ \_ CQUPMENT e e o TS WARNNG D COMNGATION 1




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [] NET [] NET []
-28% DISCOUNT E -12% DISCOUNT =38% DISCOUNT
2. Code 3 Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ %MARKUP D +_ % MARKUP D +__ %MARKUP D
List Number LIST PRICE 819.96 NONE
Dated JULY 9, 2007 7/9/07 1/8/07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] [ ] [ ]
JOBBER L ] ]
DEALER ] [ ] [ ]
RETAILER [ ] ]
OTHER LIST [] ]

APPROVED BY: /V/ .
DATE: ?/9@,/ o7

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [X] NET [] NET []
-___ % DISCOUNT [_] -12% DISCOUNT -45% DISCOUNT
3. Able ll Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ %MARKUP [:} +___ % MARKUP l:l +___ % MARKUP El
List Number JOBBER PRICE 1282.44 2007 B
Dated ‘ 2007 1-1-2007 1-1-07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ]
JOBBER ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER L] 1]
OTHER (] (] []

APPROVED BY:_ ﬂ% é ‘2

DATE: 7:/57{2/ o7

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION -
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

BID # 2007-251

NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX -EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET L] NET ] NET ]
"—%DISCOUNT [X] |- %DISCOUNT [| | :44%DISCOUNT | |
4. Unity Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP D
List Number 123-07 N/A 122-07
Dated 9/10/2007 9-10-07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ' ] ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ]
JOBBER ] []
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER L] ] ]
OTHER ] ] ]

APPROVED BY: % l .
DATE: 9/ )Q/DZ

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




- CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

e

NEW MEXICO :
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [] NET [ ] NET [ ]
=21.43% DISCOUNT  [X | -12% DISCOUNT -___%DISCOUNT [ ]
5. 911 EP Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP D +___ %MARKUP l:l
List Number MSRP 1046.29 NO BID
Dated 12/1/2006 1-1-06
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] [ ] L]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER ] [] []
RETAILER L] ]
OTHER X] LisT [] (]

APPROVED BY: /7// C .

DATE: 9,/3’(3/‘3 7

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

BID # 2007-251

ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC.
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

HI-TECH AUTO
RESTYLING
EL PASO, TX

NEW MEXICO
EMERGENCY
PRODUCTS, LLC
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

e e ———————————————]

ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [ NET [] NET [ ]
=10% DISCOUNT E =12% DISCOUNT =-31% DISCOUNT
6. WHELEN Price List [OR Catalog] ]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ % MARKUP D +__ % MARKUP D + % MARKUP D
List Number PLO71WL 130.00 PL07.1W
Dated 7/1/2007 7-1-07 711/07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER L] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER ] [ ] [ ]
RETAILER L] x] ]
OTHER LIST ] ]

APPROVED BY: ﬂ% é '

(3

DATE: .. o

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTIN
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

G, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

B

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL

ID # 2007-251

SERVICES - FLEET

EQUIPMENT: SHOP BILLING RATE:

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

NEW MEXICO -
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [] NET [] NET [ ]
‘ " %DISCOUNT [ ] |- %DISCOUNT [ | | -15% DISCOUNT
7. Wanco Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP D
List Number NO PRICE LIST IS PRINTED. N/A WANCO - NO
Dated ALL PRICES BY QUOTE. LIST AVAILABLE
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER L] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] [ ] [ ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] L]
RETAILER L] ] ]
OTHER ] ] ]
SERVICE LABOR RATES: FOR EMERGENCY
8.  LIGHTING, WARNING, AND COMMUNICATION $68.25 $70.00 $75.00

APPROVED BY: / / ( .

DATE: 9// —7/‘/’/ 5;

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
GROUP Il: COMMUNICATION MOUNTING EQUIPMENT NET [] NET [ NET [ ]
-SEE NOTES% DISCOUNT L] - % DISCOUNT D -40% DISCOUNT
1. Gamber Johnson Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +_ % MARKUP D + % MARKUP D + % MARKUP D
List Number LIST PRICE / 2007 N/A 2007 LIST
Dated (SECTION A - 20% DISCOUNT 2007
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed: SECTION B - NET)
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER ] [ ] [ ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER [] (] (]

APPROVED BY: ”//( .

DATE: 7//—7/0"/5 7Z

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
_PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [} NET [} NET [ ]
=15% DISCOUNT  [X] | -12% DISCOUNT -___%DISCOUNT [ |
2. Troy Price List [OR Catalog]
(Manufacturer or Brand Name) +___ % MARKUP D + % MARKUP D +___ % MARKUP |:l
List Number PRICE LIST 490.00 NO BID
Dated 11/1/2006 1-1-07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER (] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] L]
JOBBER L] ] ]
DEALER ] L] ]
RETAILER L] ]
OTHER X] LisT ] ]

APPROVED BY: ﬁ// (/ '

DATE: 9/901/0/7

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTIN
BiD DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

G, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC.
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

HI-TECH AUTO
RESTYLING
EL PASO, TX

NEW MEXICO
EMERGENCY
PRODUCTS, LLC
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

3.

Kustom Signal Price List [OR Catalog]

(Manufacturer or Brand Name)

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up proposed from the NET [x] NET [ ] NET []
- %DISCOUNT [_] -____%DISCOUNT [_] -5% DISCOUNT

+ % MARKUP [_]

+ % MARKUP [_]

+ % MARKUP [_]

EQUIPMENT: SHOP BILLING RATE:

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

List Number USER PRICE LIST N/A
Dated. 3/23/2007 NONE STATED
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:

FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] L]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] L]
RETAILER L] ] ]
OTHER ] ] ]
SERVICE LABOR RATES: FOR EMERGENCY

4. LIGHTING, WARNING, AND COMMUNICATION $68.25 $70.00 $75.00

(PER HOUR) EXCLUDES PARTS

APPROVED BY; /% é .

DATE; 7@/‘0 yd

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT

10




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC.
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

HI-TECH AUTO
RESTYLING
EL PASO, TX

NEW MEXICO
EMERGENCY
PRODUCTS, LLC
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

PRICE _ADJUSTMENT FACTOR

1. JOTTO DESK Price List [OR Catalog]

(Manufacturer or Brand Name)

NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
GROUP Ill: MISCELLANEOUS NET [X] NET [ NET [ ]
- %DISCOUNT [_] |-__ %DISCOUNT [ ] -5% DISCOUNT

+ %MARKUP [

+___ %MARKUP [ ]

+___ %MARKUP [ ]

List Number PRICE LIST N/A 2007
Dated 2007 1M1/07
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:
FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:

~ WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] L]
RETAILER L] ] ]
OTHER [ ] PRICELIST ] FLEET 2

APPROVED BY: / é .

DATE: ?/519//3

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT

"




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
NEW MEXICO Y
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR

NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT

ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
GROUP Ill: MISCELLANEOUS NET [X] NET [ NET [X]
-____%DISCOUNT [_] -___%DISCOUNT [_] -___%DISCOUNT [ |

2. BIG SKY GUNLOCKS Price List [OR Catalog]

(Manufacturer or Brand Name)

+ %MARKUP [_] [+ % MARKUP [_] + % MARKUP [ ]

List Number PRICE LIST N/A 2007
Dated 1/1/2007 1-1-07

As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:

FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:

WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] L] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER L] ] ]

APPROVED BY: '/ é ’

é /( 2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION
DATE: 9{ / D;Z EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT

12




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

3.

ANGEL TRAX Price List [OR Catalog]

(Manufacturer or Brand Name)

NEW MEXICO ’
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
GROUP ll: MISCELLANEQUS NET [X] NET [ ] NET [

- %DISCOUNT [_|

-____%DISCOUNT [ ]

% DISCOUNT [ ]

+__ %MARKUP [ ]

+ % MARKUP [_]

* % MARKUP [ ]

e _ ————=a

List Number PRICE LIST N/A NO BID
Dated 7/24/2007
As supplemented, for any quantity as needed:

FROM PRICE LIST FOR MARKETING LEVEL:
WHOLESALER L L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] [ ] [ ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER [ ] [ ]
RETAILER L] ] ]
OTHER ] ] ]

APPROVED BY: //-/, / é ’
DATE: ? /743/ o/

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT

13




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

'DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

BID # 2007-251

ITEM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST IDENTIFICATION}” .

ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC.
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

HI-TECH AUTO
RESTYLING
EL PASO, TX

NEW MEXICO
EMERGENCY
PRODUCTS, LLC
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

MANUFACTURER SETINA T BAR NONE STATED
1. PRICE LIST FORM NUMBER PRICE LIST FEDERAL SIGNAL
AND/OR DATE 7/1/2007 1-1-07
MANUFACTURER LIGHT BAR
2. PRICE LIST FORM NUMBER CODE 3
AND/OR DATE 7-9-07
MANUFACTURER LARGE LE ARROW BOARD
3. PRICE LIST FORM NUMBER ABLE I
AND/OR DATE 1-1-2007
MANUFACTURER TRAFFIC WARNING LIGHT
4. PRICE LIST FORM NUMBER 911 EP
AND/OR DATE 1-1-06
MANUFACTURER STROBE BEACON MOUNT
5. -PRICE LIST FORM NUMBER WHELEN
AND/OR DATE 7-1-07 !

APPROVED BY: 4% é/,

DATE: 3/ J'O,Z)J

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION
EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION - GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DEPARTMENT

14




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION BID # 2007-251
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLING PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM
GROUP I:_ SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION- EMERGENCY LIGHTING AND WARNING ITEMS
DESCRIPTION: HALOGEN BULB HALOGEN BULB HALOGEN BULB
SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: FEDERAL Z8107141A FEDERAL Z8107141A FEDERAL Z8107141A
ITEM 1. [YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER Z8107141A Z8107152A Z8107141A
YOUR BASE PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $8.25 $6.50 $8.25
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $5.94 $5.72 512
DESCRIPTION: SPOTLIGHT HANDLE SPOTLIGHT HANDLE SPOTLIGHT HANDLE
SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: UNITY 6701-V UNITY 6701-V UNITY 6701-V
ITEM 2. [YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER U-6701-0101 N/A U-6701-0101
YOUR BASE PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $26.40 $60.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: ' $26.40 ] $33.60
DESCRIPTION: HEADLIGHT FLASHER | HEADLIGHT FLASHER | HEADLIGHT FLASHER
SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: CODE 3,700 CODE 3, 700 ' CODE 3,700
ITEM 3. [YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER CODE 3700 "~ #700 700
YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $71.67 $71.67 $71.67
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $51.60 $63.07 $44.44
DESCRIPTION: ELECTRONIC SIREN ELECTRONIC SIREN ELECTRONIC SIREN
SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: ABLE I, 302109 ABLE I, 302109 ABLE I, 302109
ITEM 4. [YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER 30.2109 30.2109 30.2109
YOUR BASE PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $124.76 $199.61 $199.61
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $124.76 $175.66 $109.79
LED WARNING LIGHT, | LED WARNING LIGHT, | LED WARNING LIGHT,
DESCRIPTION: RED/BLUE RED/BLUE RED/BLUE
SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: 911 EP, 640006-2100 911 EP, 640006-2100 911 EP, 640006-2100
ITEM 5. |YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER LS12RB TD-WL 36RB - NO BID -
YOUR BASE PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $316.58 $839.73
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $248.74 $738.96

APPROVED BY: 4% C - )
é 0/ 2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION
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- CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007

BID # 2007-251

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET

ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC.
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

GROUP I: SAMPLE PRICI

HI-TECH AUTO
RESTYLING
EL PASO, TX

NEW MEXICO
EMERGENCY
PRODUCTS, LLC
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NG EVALUATION: EMERGENCY LIGHTING AND WARNING ITEMS (CONTINU

ED):

DESCRIPTION: STROBE HEAD, RED STROBE HEAD, RED STROBE HEAD, RED

SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: WHELEN, PAR36ES-R | WHELEN, PAR36ES-R WHELEN, PAR36ES-R
ITEM 6. YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER PAR36ES-R PAR 36 ES-R PAR36ESR

YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $100.00 $100.00 $100.00

CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $90.00 $88.00 $69.00

DESCRIPTION:

ARROW BOARD BULB

ARROW BOARD BULB

ARROW BOARD BULB

SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER:

WANCO, 100373-001

WANCO, 100373-001

WANCO, 100373-001

ITEM 7. YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER 100373-001 N/A 100373-001

YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP:; $26.00 $12.00

CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $26.00 $13.80

GROUP Ii: SAMPLE PRICING EVALUATION: COMMUNICATION MO UNTING EQUIPMENT

DESCRIPTION: COMPUTER MOUNT COMPUTER MOUNT COMPUTER MOUNT

SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER: GAMBER JOHNSON, 7110-0421GAMBER JOHNSON, 7110-042{GAMBER JOHNSON, 7110-0421
ITEM 1.|YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER OBSOLETE N/A 7110-0421

YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: NO LONGER $302.00

CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: AVAILABLE $181.20

DESCRIPTION:

EQUIPMENT CONSOLE

EQUIPMENT CONSOLE

EQUIPMENT CONSOLE

SAMPLE PRODUCT PART NUMBER:

TROY, CC-C04, 7110-0421

TROY, CC-C04, 7110-0421

TROY, CC-C04, 7110-0421

ITEM 2.

YOUR (BID) PRODUCT PART NUMBER CC-Co4 CC-Co4 NO BID
YOUR LIST PRICE, BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $315.00 $315.00
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $267.75 $277.20

APPROVED BY: ’/ é .

DATE: Q/Qgﬁj

2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION
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BID ITEM: EMERGENCY LIGHTING, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION EQUIPM

ENT AND INSTALLATION

BID # 2007-251

BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 12, 2007 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET
NEW MEXICO
ALAMO INDUSTRIES, INC. HI-TECH AUTO EMERGENCY
D/B/A ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY RESTYLI NG PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
FILING PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS,
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:; ,D D D
TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, x] )
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN: | :
A TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. | | Yesx] No[ ] YES__ | No[ | YES[ | No[ |
B. THREE YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. | YES[X] NO[ ] YESX] NoO[_| YES[X No[ |
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. ] ] ' L]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 5% - 10 DAYS
ADDITIONAL PAYMENT TERMS: BIDDER AGREES TO
ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YES[X] No[] YES[X] No[] YES[X] No[]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: ‘NONE STATED 4 CONSECUTIVE HOURS 720 CONSECUTIVE HOURS
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 8 BIDS RECEIVED: 3 BIDS LOCAL: 8 NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

- 2007-251 EMERGENCY LIGHTI

NG, WARNING AND COMMUNICATION

‘EQUIP’MENTA‘ND INSTALLATION - GENERALSERVICES-FLEETDEPARTMENT7‘ _ S : CmEe e AT




CASA FORD, INC. MIDWAY /CHEVROLET ACCESSORY CHOICE %
5815 MONTANA AVE 5915 MONTANA AVE 9501 GATEWAY WEST \Jf\

- EL PASO, TEXAS 79925 EL PASO, TEXAS 79925 EL PASO, TEXAS 79925
ALAMO AUTO SUPPLY 4-WHEEL CENTER SUNLAND INTL. A Q
5923 GATEWAY WEST 7210 GATEWAY EAST 5800 COMMERCE \)

EL PASO, TEXAS 79925 EL PASO, TEXAS 79915 EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

VALUE COMMUNICATION DESERT COMMUNICATION
PRODUCTS SYSTEM

6800 COMMERCE, UNIT F 6452 MORNINGSIDE CIRCLE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915 EL PASO, TEXAS 79904






