CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: General Services

AGENDA DATE: October 23, 2012

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:  Stuart Ed, General Services Director, 621-6822
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
Solicitation No. 2012—298 Paper Sundries

Discussion and action that the Purchasing Manager, Financial Services, Pmchasmg Division, be
authorized to issue a Purchase Order(s) to:

Part A
 Spectrum Paper Co., Inc., El Paso (Alternate Bid) - Items 1 - 4

Baron Chemical Co., El Paso Inc. — Items 5 - 7

PartB
Laun-Dry Supply, El Paso —Items 1-7

Effective the date of the award for an initial term of three (3) years with a 1 year option to renew. The
estimated annual expenditures are $304,842.00 with an estimated total expenditure of $914,526.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
General Services — Facilities Division is recommending the award of the above mentioned bid. The award

is for the purchase of paper sundries to include non-recycled and recycled toilet tissue and paper towels. If
approved, this contract will allow for a continuous supply of these products for various City Buildings and
will help in maintaining areas clean and sanitary. ‘Local business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
. Yes. Council previously approved Region 19 contract 11-6698 on January 24, 2012, Item 5D.

SELECTION SUMMARY:
Solicitation was advertised on 07/24/2012 and 07/31/2012. The postcards were mailed out on 07/24/2012. The

solicitation was posted on the City’s website on 07/24/2012. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on
‘07/24/2012. A total of Twelve (12) local bidders were solicited. A total of four (4) local bids were received.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: =~ - General Services

Amount $914,526.00

Funds Available: Dept: 231 Div: 31040 Acet: 531110 Fund: 1000 Pr ogtam Code: P3120
Funds Source: General Services Dept - General Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

Stk ded kR 88 A TTTHORIZA TION ot e ot oo

DEPARTMENT HEAD: CTY?‘%

Stuart Ed, General Services Director




*****************************************POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of October 23, 2012.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2012-298 (Paper Sundries) to Spectrum Paper Co., Inc.,
Baron Chemical Co. and Laun-Dry Supply for an initial term estimated award of $914,526.00

Department:
Award to Vendor 1:

ltem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Award to Vendor 2:

ltem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:
Award to Vendor 3:

Item(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Account No.:
Funding Source:
District(s):

COUNCIL PROJECT FORM

(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

General Services
Spectrum Paper Co., Inc.
El Paso, TX

Part A, ltems 1, 2, 3, & 4 (Alternate Bid)
3 Years

1&2 Years

1% 20 Days & N30
$58,817.00

$176,451.00 (3 Years)
$235,268.00 (4 Years)
$294,085.00 (5 Years)

Baron Chemical Co.
El Paso, TX

Part A, Items 5,6, &7
3 Years

1 Year

1% 10 Days
$84,282.50
$252,847.50 (3 Years)
$337,130.00 (4 Years)

Laundry-Dry Supply
El Paso, TX

Part B, Items 1-7

3 Years

1 Year

N30

$161,742,50
$485,227.50 (3 Years)
$646,970.00 (4 Years)

$304,842.00

$914,526.00 (3 Years)

$1,219,368.00 (4 Years)

$1,524,210.00 (5 Years)
231-31040-531110-1000-P3120
General Services Dept. — General Fund

All

This is a low bid, unit price contract.




The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and General Services recommend award as indicated to

Spectrum Paper Co., Inc., Baron Chemical Co., and Laun-Dry Supply the lowest responsive, responsible
bidder.

**********************'k********************ADD ITI O NAL I N FO B E LOW*********************************************-k




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO brsers
BID TABULATION |1

2010 -

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS & CENTRAL POLY-BAG
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC. | BARON E?_H],Eggp‘lr‘xco' INC. CORPORATION
MONROE, LA ; LINDEN, NJ
PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS :
ESTIMATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PRLCAESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PR:;\ESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRg: ;‘\ESFE’EER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
NO., QUANTITY QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
C-FOLD ABSORBENT, '
WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED|  $22.70 $1,135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10%4" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 3V5" x 10
WUFKCTURER_O'R—B'RKND"NKME,
1 . 50 AS APPLICABLE VONDREHLE
CASES PART NUMBER: 524-w
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25" X 13"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16

C-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, 10%4" x 13"

$22.70

$36,320.00 $17.25 $27,600.00 NO BID NO BID
FOLDED SIZE 315" x 104" .
"~ WANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE;
) 1,600 AS APPLICABLE VONDREHLE GEQ. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 524-W 206-03
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25" X 13" 10.1 X 13.2
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150 240
. PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 10/240/2400

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /sl

DATE:

09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-AmericaCity

»

2010,

»Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation # : 2012-298

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS &
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.

MONROE, LA

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CE

NTRAL POLY-BAG
CORPORATION
LINDEN, NJ

ESTIMATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
ITEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PR?:S';ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRg:AEsZER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRQ‘;%‘;ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
NO. | QuaNTITY QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, $20.70 $33,120.00 $17.96 $28,736.00 NO BID NO BID
91/8" x 9 1/2"
— MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE;
. 1,600 'AS APPLICABLE VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 548-W 202-04
SIZE PER SHEET: 9 1/4" X 9 1/2" 9.2 x9.4
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 16 250
PACKAGES PER CASE: 250 16
SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,
UNBLEACHED, $22.20 $7,770.00 $15.84 $5,544.00 NO BID NO BID
911/16" x 10 3/4"
[ WANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
A 350 AS APDLICABL B VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 540-K 235-04
SIZE PER SHEET: 91/4" X 10 1/4" 9.25" X 10"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 16
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /sl

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO bt
BID TABULATION | W

2010
Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012 Solicitation # : 2012-298

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES

| ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS & CENTRAL POLY-BAG
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.| BARON E?_HIEESA}‘XCO' INC. CORPORATION
MONROE, LA ’ LINDEN, NJ
‘ TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
ITEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PRgfsEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED P R:;CESZER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRg;EsEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
NO. || QUANTITY QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE,
NON PERFORATED, $31.50 $4,725.00 $22.15 . $3,322.50 NO BID NO BID
W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CGORE

_mUFKCTURER_‘O'R'B'MND—NW
150 E

5 'AS APPLICABLE | VONDREHLE | GEO. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 863-B 266-01
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9" X600 77/8"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED 800" RL

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 6/CS

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,

W7 7/8" x L800", $26.20 $41,920.00 $18.25 $29,200.00 NO BID NO BID
134" CORE SIZE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE,

6 1,600 AS APPLICABLE VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 863-N 263-01 NON PERFORATED
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9" X 600 778"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED - 800' RL
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 6/CS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 3




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-imericaCily

-

2010

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation #: 2012-298

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS & CENTRAL POLY-BAG
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC. |  BARON E?_HFF/'\V'S'SA}'XCO' INC. CORPORATION
MONROE, LA ’ LINDEN, NJ
ESTIMATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
ITEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT P Rng';ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PR?:SFE’ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PR&%:ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
No. | quanmiTy QUANTITY =TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET
_ TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO
LARGER THAN 4.5 k 4.5"W AND No|  $39-40 $63,040.00 $32.35 $51,760.00 NO BID NO BID
SMALLER THAN 3.8"L x 4.5"W
WMANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWIE,
, 1,600 AS DDA VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC
CASES PART NUMBER: 6022 198-80-01
: ) " . 4 X 4.05"
SIZE PER SHEET: 4.5" X 4.5 500-2 PLYSHEETS PER ROLL
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED 80M SHEETS/CS
PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 80 RLI/ICS
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (ITEMS 1-7) $188,030.00 $146,162.50 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ s/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO | pooxt
BID TABULATION {Ul]]

© 2010
Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012 : Solicitation # : 2012-298

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS & CENTRAL POLY-BAG
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC. | BARON E‘f_“lfgg‘\}‘xco' INC. CORPORATION
MONROE, LA ’ LINDEN, NJ
PART B: RECYCLED PRODUCTS -
ESTIATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
TEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PRL‘;ESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PR?:SEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRgsPEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
no. | auanmiry QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY =TOTAL)
C-FOLD ABSORBENT,
WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED $22.70 $1,135.00 NO BID NO BID $19.60 $980.00
10%4" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 3v5" x 10| -
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
) 50 AS ADDLICAne VONDREHLE PUTNEY
CASES PART NUMBER: 524-W P100B
' SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25" X 13" 101/8 X 13
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150 150
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 ) 16

C-FOLD TOWELS,

BLEACHED, 104" x 13" $22.70 $36,320.00 $17.25 $27,600.00 $17.10 $27,360.00
FOLDED SIZE 3%2" x 101"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,

2 1,600 AS APPLICABLE VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC PUTNEY
CASES PART NUMBER: ‘\ 524-W 206-03 P100B
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25" X 13" 10.1 X 13.2 - 101/8 X13
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150 ' 240 150
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 10/240/2400 16

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 5




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-AmericaCily

(3

i 2010

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation #: 2012-298

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS &

.| SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.

MONROE, LA

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG

CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,
UNBLEACHED,

ESTIVAT TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
ITEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PR?:SEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRLCAESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRg:;SZER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
No. | auanmiTy QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, $20.70 $33,120.00 $17.96 $28,736.00 $17.80 $28,480.00
91/8" x 9 1/2"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
. 1,600 AS LAl VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC PUTNEY
CASES PART NUMBER: 548-W 202-04 P200B
SIZE PER SHEET: 91/4" X 91/2" 9.2X94 9.25 X9.5
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 16 250 250
" PACKAGES PER CASE: 250 16

16

$22.20

$7,770.00 $15.84 $5,544.00 $17.90 $6,265.00
9 11/16" x 10 3/4"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANME
g VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC PUTNEY
4 350 AS APPLICABLE
CASES PART NUMBER: 540-K 235-04 P600
SIZE PER SHEET: 91/4" X 10 1/4" 9.25" X 10" 10.25 X 9.25
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250 334
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 16 12
NOTE:

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Isl

09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-AmericaCity

2010

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS &
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CENTRAL POLY-BAG

CORPORATION
MONROE, LA EL PASO, TX LINDEN, NJ
ESTIMATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
TEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PRL‘ZESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRL‘;ESEER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRgfs‘;ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
NO. | quanTiTy QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE,
NON PERFORATED, $31.50 $4,725.00 $22.15 $3,322.50 $26.70 $4,005.00
W 77/8" xL 400" WITH 1.5 CORE
—MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE
: VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC PUTNEY
5 150 AS APPLICABLE
CASES PART NUMBER: 863-B 266-01 P724N
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9" X600 77/18"W 8 X 425'
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED 6 RL @ 800" - 1
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 4-800 12
ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,

$26.20 $41,920.00 $18.25 $29,200.00 $23.66 $37,856.00
134" CORE SIZE
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME
? VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC PUTNEY
6 1,600 AS APPLICABLE

CASES PART NUMBER: 863-N 263-01 P728N-6
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9 X 600 77/8" 8 X 800°

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED 6 4800'/EA 1

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 . 800'/R 6

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

W7 7/8" x 800",

APPROVED BY:__ Js/

DATE:

09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

AlfimericaGity

-

. 2010

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation #: 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS &

SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.

MONROE, LA

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG
CORPORATION
LINDEN, NJ

NOTE:

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (ITEMS 1-7)

ESTIMATED TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
ITEM |~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT PR(':(;\ES';ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PRgfs;ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED PR?:S';ER PER CASE x ESTIMATED
NO. | quanTiTy QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL) QUANTITY = TOTAL)
COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET
TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO
LARGER THAN 4.5 x 4.5"W AND NO $39.40 $63,040.00 $32.35 $51,760.00 $37.99 $60,784.00
SMALLER THAN 3.8"L x 4.5"W .
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
, 1,600 AS A A VONDREHLE GEO. PACIFIC ATLAS
CASES PART NUMBER: 6022 198-80-1 A250
SIZE PER SHEET: 45" X 45" 4" X 4.05 45X3.8
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED 550 SHEETS * 500 SHTS/RL
PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 80 RLS/CS 88,000/CS 96

$188,030.00

$146,162.50

$165,730.00
BIDDER'S PRICE: $162,130.00

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Isl

09/13/2012

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Ai-hmericatity

. 2010

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ALPHA OMEGA SYSTEMS &
SERVICES MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC.

MONROE, LA EL PASO, TX

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

CENTRAL POLY-BAG
CORPORATION
LINDEN, NJ

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO I:I YES NO YES NO I:I
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within __ consecutive calendar days 2 DAYS 2 DAYS 10-14 DAYS

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 24 HOURS 4 HOURS 7-10 HOURS

of emergency. :

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___ /sl

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO b
BID TABULATION

2010

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES
INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. "AUE"I'_'I'Z%C?UT';PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ’ - EL PASO, TX
PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS
TTEM | ESTIMATED PRICE PER T TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|  PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRIGE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
C-FOLD ABSORBENT,
WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLLEACHED NO BID NO BID . $27.30 $1,365.00 NO BID NO BID
10%4" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 315" x 10
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
1 50 AS APPLICABLE BAY WEST
CASES PART NUMBER: 52500
SIZE PER SHEET: 9X 10
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150
PACKAGES PER CASE:

15

C-FOLD TOWELS

BLEACHED, 104" x 13" NO BID NO BID $18.05 $28,880.00 NO BID NO BID
FOLDED SIZE 315" x 1014"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWIE,
1,600 AS APPLICABLE : BAY WEST
2 | cASES PART NUMBER: 29190

SIZE PER SHEET: 101/8 X 13

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual

award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 10




CITY OF EL PASO El Paso

Al-Americatity

BiD TABULATION | i

12010 .

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012 Solicitation # : 2012-298
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. LAL:E'\I'_'IETS(C?UT';PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
Sl il I T e il e Ml ol B v
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, NO BID ’ NO BID $18.90 $30,240.00 NO BID NO BID
91/8" x 9 1/2"
) 1,600 MANUFAC;éliIFE,I;’ SSA?BT/;ND NANE, BAY WEST
CASES PART NUMBER: 48300
SIZE PER SHEET: 91/8X91/2
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200
PACKAGES PER CASE: 20

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, NO BID NO BID $15.95 $5,582.50 NO BID
9 11/16" x 10 3/4"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
4 350 AS APPLICABLE BAY WEST
CASES PART NUMBER: 27000

SIZE PER SHEET: 9X10
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 268
PACKAGES PER CASE: 15

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

APPROVED BY:__ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 11




CITY OF EL PASO |

BID TAB

ULATION

El Paso

Qi-RmercaCily

1 2010

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation # : 2012-298

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

NO BID $20.45 $32,720.00 NO BID NO BID
134" CORE SIZE
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
6 1,600 AS APPLICABLE BAY WEST
CASES PART NUMBER: 45800
‘ SIZE PER SHEET: 8' X 800
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 6
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,

W 7 7/8" x L80O",

NO BID

SERVICES, INC. LA‘Q}{E%SUT';PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
| —
ITEM || ESTIMATED PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE[  PRICEPER [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
NO. ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE,
NON PERFORATED, - NOBID NO BID $25.00 $3,750.00 NO BID NO BID
W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANME,
5 150 AS APPLICABLE BAY WEST
CASES PART NUMBER;: 46300
SIZE PER SHEET: 8" X 425"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASC
BiD TABULATION

El Paso

Al-AmericaCity

2010 .

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298

Department: GENERAL SERVICES
INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. LA‘fE"l'_‘giggUT';PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)"
EL PASO, TX ; EL PASO, TX
TTEM | ESTIMATED ' PRICE PER T TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| ~ PRICE PER ~[TOTAL EXTENDED PRIGE PRIGE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET
TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO NO BID NO BID $29.60 $47,360.00 NO BID NO BID
LARGER THAN 4.5 x 4.5"W AND NO
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE,
1,600 AS APPLICABLE ELEMENT
7 CASES PART NUMBER: 60101
SIZE PER SHEET: 4X31
SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

500 SHEETS PER ROLL

PACKAGES PER CASE:

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (ITEMS 1-7)

NO BID

96

$149,897.50

PART A NOT INCLUDED IN B
SUBMITTED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ Js/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

13




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO | -
' v BID TABULATION 5!“

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLGC
SERVICES, INC. LA‘:E'\I'_"STS'(?UT?LY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ; EL PASO, TX

PART B: RECYCLED PRODUCTS

TEW | ESTIMATED PRICE PER T TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICE PER [ TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|PRICE PER |TOTAL EXTENED PRICE PRIGE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
C-FOLD ABSORBENT,
WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED| NO BID NO BID $27.30 $1,365.00 $22.93 $1,146.50
10%" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 315" x 10
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
50 AS APPLICABLE . BAY WEST SAALFELD
" | casks PART NUMBER: 52500 4440480
SIZE PER SHEET: 9X10 10 1/8 X 12.75
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 150 250
15 16

PACKAGES PER CASE:

e —
C-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, 104" x 13" NO BID NO BID $18.05 $28,880.00 $22.93 $36,688.00
FOLDED SIZE 315" x 1014"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE,
, 1,600 AS APPLICABLE BAY WEST SAALFELD
CASES PART NUMBER: 49190 4440480
SIZE PER SHEET: 10 1/8 X 13 10 1/8 X 12.75
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200 . 250
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 16

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 14




CITY OF EL PASO ey
BID TABULATION

2010

>Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-298
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES
INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. LAUET_'gigOS UT':(PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ; EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ESTIMATED PRICE PER  [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE|| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICE PER ~[T0TAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, $17.65 $28,240.00 $18.90 $30,240.00 $23.14 $37,024.00
91/8" x 9 1/2"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE,
1,600 AS ArmL A ROYAL-PAPER BAY WEST SAALFELD
3 | cASES PART NUMBER: 37-405 48300 4440720 -
SIZE PER SHEET: 9.1" X 94" 91/8 X91/2 9.5X91/8
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 200 200
PACKAGES PER GASE: 16 20 20

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,
UNBLEACHED, $18.25 $6,387.50 $18.25 $6,387.50 $21.61

$7,563.50
9 11/16" x 10 3/4"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE,
4 350 AS APPLICABLE ROYAL-PAPER BAY WEST SAALFELD
CASES PART NUMBER: 37-412 47300 441870
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.2" X 9.0" 9X10 10 1/4 X 9.25
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 268 - 250
PACKAGES PER CASE: ' 16 15 16
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual

award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 15




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Al-AmericaCity

-

‘2010

Solicitation # : 2012-298

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,
W7 7/8" x L800", $20.40 $32,640.00 $20.45 $32,720.00 $30.60 $48,960.00
134" CORE SIZE ’
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
6 1 ,600 AS APPLICABLE ROYAL-PAPER BAY WEST SAALFELD
CASES PART NUMBER: 37-436 45800 4441110
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9" X 800" 8" X 800" 7/8 X 1.800 7.8 DIM
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 6 6
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. LAL:E"I’_'gi; SUTF;(PLY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX g EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED PRICE PER TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE PRICE PER [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE] PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE]
NO. | ANNUAL PESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE,
NON PERFORATED, $19.60 $2,940.00 $25.00 $3,750.00 $26.89 BIDDER?:;,‘F’;I’C?’E-_5°
: $4,033.80
W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
150 AS APPLICABLE ROYAL-PAPER BAY WEST SAALFELD
5 PART NUMBER: 37-421 46300 442767
CASES
SIZE PER SHEET: 7.9" X 350" 8" X 425" 7 7/8 X 300L
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 ROLL NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 ROLLS 12

12

APPROVED BY:__ /sI

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-Amercatity

2010

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES
INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
SERVICES, INC. LAUET:II?,‘I:\S(OS UT';::LY (aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX ! EL PASO, TX
PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|| PRICEPER |[TOTAL EXTENDED PRIGE (PRICE| PRICEPER [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
NO. ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
CUNINERGIAL NULCL, TUICET )
TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO $70,688.00
LARGER THAN 4.5 x 4.5"W AND NO $39.65 $63,440.00 $36.50 $58,400.00 $44.18 BIDDER'S PRICE: $70,694.40
SMALLER THAN 2 8% v 4 5"/
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
1 ,600 AS APPLICABLE ROYAL-PAPER BAY WEST SAALFELD
7 CASES PART NUMBER: 37-602 54900 4226040
SIZE PER SHEET: 4.5" X 4.0 43/8 X33/4 45X 3.75
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 500 SHEETS PER ROLL NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 96 NOT STATED
= Y $206,103.50
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (ITEMS 1 -7) $133,647.50 $161,742.50 BIDDER'S PRICE: $206,110.20
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

17




[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-AmecaEity

© 2010 ]

ro'ect Name: PER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SANE UNIT PRICE(S), IF
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY

SERVICES, INC.
EL PASO, TX

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC
(aka: THE MRI CO.)
EL PASO, TX

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY X

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO [ ] YES vo ] YES No [ ]
|BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ___ consecutive calendar dayg 2 DAYS 1 DAY 2 DAYS *(r ORDERED BY 12:00 PM)
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases % .

of emergency. 24 HOURS 24 HOURS 24 HOURS *(iF oRDERED BY 12:00 PM)
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ Js/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TAB

ULATION

El Paso

Al-NmericaGity

Ui2010 0

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE BID)

ESTIMATED

PRICE PER " [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE PRICE| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRIGE| ~ PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE PRIGE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED

C-FOLD ABSORBENT,

WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED| $17.25 $862.50 $18.20 $910.00 $16.20 $810.00

10%4" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 315" x 10

50 MANUFACX: iﬁﬁﬁ&%ﬁ"n NAME, KIMBERLY CLARK GEORGIA-PACIFIC PAPER SOURCE-CLASSIQUE
. _
CASES PART NUMBER: #05123 20603 CF 2452
SIZE PER SHEET: 9.1" X 10.25" 10 1/4" X 13" 10 1/4" X 13"

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 244 240 200
"PACKAGES PER CASE: 10 10 12

C-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, 10%4" x 13"

$24.00

$38,400.00 $18.20 $29,120.00 $16.20 $25,920.00
FOLDED SIZE 315" x 1014"
, 1,600 MANUFAC::?E;SEA%END NAME, KIMBERLY CLARK GEORGIA-PACIFIC PAPER SOURCE-CLASSIQUE
CASES PART NUMBER: #01510 20603 CF 2452
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.125" X 13.15" 10 1/4™ X 13" 10 1/4" X 13"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200 240 200
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 10 12
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation 1S Tor information only and does not constitute actual

APPROVED BY:__ /sl

DATE:__09/13/2012

award/execution of contract.

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

19




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

A-Americacily

..

. 2010

Solicitation #: 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

SOUTHWESTERN MILL

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

DISTRIBUTORS, INC. SPECTR;&"'P'DA";':)E?)?O" INC. EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ; (ALTERNATE BID)
el T Ml i Il s e e
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, $20.55 $32,880.00 $17.90 $28,640.00 $16.76 $26,816.00
9 1/8" x 9 1/2"
1 ,600 AS APPLICABLE ? KIMBERLY CLARK CRYSTAL WARE ROSES
3 | cAsES PART NUMBER: #01804 MFW 25016/NB225 203
SIZE PER SHEET: 9.2" X 9.4" 91/8" X 9 1/2" 95X9.2
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250 250
PACKAGES PER CASE:

16

16

16

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,
UNBLEACHED,

NO BID NO BID

$16.30

$5,705.00 $15.06 $5,271.00
911/16" x 10 3/4"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,
4 350 AS APPLICABLE GEORGIA-PACIFIC PRIMESOURCE
CASES PART NUMBER: 23504 4301
SIZE PER SHEET: 9 11/16™ X 10 3/4" 10.5" X 9.3"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 268
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 : 15
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

A-fmericatily

-

2010

7Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation # : 2012-298

SOUTHWESTERN MILL

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX (ALTERNATE BID)
z ITEM || ESTIMATED PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE[| PRICEPER [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICEPER |TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE]
NO. ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE, 5
NON PERFORATED, $31.50 $4,725.00 $21.71 $3,256.50 $19.25 $2,887.50
W7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE
150 MANUFAC;: RAIE';SEAE:;_’;ND NAME, KIVBERLY CLARK ROSES ELEMENT ECONOMY WHITE
5 CASES PART NUMBER: #02068 28706 60332-S
SIZE PER SHEET: 7 718" X 400 18" X 350" 7 7/8" X 300"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 12/CASE 12
ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,
W7 7/8" x L800", $42.50 $68,000.00 $18.86 $30,176.00 $18.50 $29,600.00
134" CORE SIZE
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME, Y
1.600 AS APPLICABLE KIMBERLY CLARK ROSES ELEMENT HWTKRAFT 720
6 i ]
CASES PART NUMBER: #04142 209 60 335
SIZE PER SHEET: 7 718" X 800" 7 718" X 800 7718"X720'/1.6
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 6/CASE 6
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___ Is/

DATE:

09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO

All-mertcaCity
BID TAB
[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

1%
ULATION 13
Solicitation # : 2012-298
P oject Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES

SOUTHWESTERN MILL SPECTRUM PAPER CO.,, INC.
DISTRIBUTORS, INC. SPECTR[;JFPPA‘I;F())EBI_;(:O" INC. EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ; (ALTERNATE BID)
TTEM | ESTIMATED PRICEPER  [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|  PRICEPER [ TOTAL EXTENED PRICE [PRICE
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET
TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO NO BID NO BID $33.33 $53,328.00 $27.90 $44,640.00
LARGER THAN 4.5 x 4.5"W AND NO
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NANE,
600 AS ABRLIC A ROSES | . ELEMENT TISSUE
7 ’ PART NUMBER: 42136 0103
CASES 6
SIZE PER SHEET: 4.0X45 4.0" X 3.15"
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 96/CASE 96/CASE
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (|TEMS 1-7) $144,867.50 $151,135.50 $135,944.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 22




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-imericaCity

T

© 2010

»Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

PART B: RECYCLED PRODUCTS

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE BID)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation ;s for information only and does not consfitute actual

C-FOLD TOWELS,

BLEACHED, 10%4" x 13"
FOLDED SIZE 315" x 1014"

$16.95

$27,120.00

$18.20

[TEM | ESTINATED PRICE PER [ TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [PRICE| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|  PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE [FRICE
no. | AnnuaL | DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
C-FOLD ABSORBENT,
WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED $17.25 $862.50 $18.20 $910.00 $16.20 $810.00
10%4" x 13" FOLDED SIZE 315" x 10
1 50 MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWE, KIMBERLY CLARK GEORGIA PACIFIC PAPER SOURCE-CLASSIQUE
AS APPLICABLE :
CASES
PART NUMBER: #05123 20603 CF2452
SIZE PER SHEET: 9.1" X 10.25" 10 1/4" X 13" 101/4 X 13
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 244 240 200
PACKAGES PER CASE- 10 10 12

$29,120.00

$25,920.00

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME,

1,600 AS APPLICABLE EASYPORT GP PAPER SOURCE-CLASSIQUE
CASES PART NUMBER: CFW2400 20603 CF2452
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25" X 13" 10 1/4" X 13" 101/4 X 13
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200 240 200
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 10 12

APPROVED BY:___Js/

DATE:__09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO =)
BID TABULATION

2010 -

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES
; SOUTHWESTERN MILL X SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
DISTRIBUTORS, INC. SPECTR:E"P'X;%E?)?O" INC. EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’ (ALTERNATE BID)
ESTIVATED | PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| ~ PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|  PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
MULTI-FOLD TOWELS,
BLEACHED, $15.95 $25,520.00 $17.90 $28,640.00 $16.76 $26,816.00
91/8" x91/2"
MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME
’ ROYAL PAPER CRYSTAL WARE ROSES
3 1,600 AS APPLICABLE
CASES PART NUMBER: #37405 MFW 25016/MB225 203
SIZE PER SHEET: 9.1" X 9.4" 91/8" X9 1/2" 91/2X9.2
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250 250
PACKAGES PER CASE: : 16 16 16

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, $16.95 $5,932.50 $16.30 $5,705.00 $15.05 BlDDER?f;ﬁfffs w7100
9 11/16" x 10 3/4" | e

. 350 MANUFAC:;’iﬁﬁSgA%ﬁND NAME, ScA GEORGIA PACIFIC PRIMESOURCE
CASES PART NUMBER: SK1850E 23504 4301
SIZE PER SHEET: 10.25 X 9.125 9 11/16" X 10 3/4" 10.5 X 9.3
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250 268
PACKAGES PER CASE: 16 16 15

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does nbt constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ /s/

DATE:__09/13/2012 . 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 24




CITY OF EL PASO breied
BID TABULATION

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012 Solicitation # : 2012-298
Project N : PAPER SUNDRIES Department: GENERAL SERVICES

SOUTHWESTERN MILL SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
DISTRIBUTORS, INC. SPECTR;[‘"P'Z@%E?)?O" INC. EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ' (ALTERNATE BID)
No. | ANWUAL | DESCRPTIONAWDESTWATED awounr | PRCETER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRIE PRICE| ™ PRI PER [ ToTAL EXTEDE ESTMATED. | ohse | pEn pman D PRICE PRICE
ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHE,
NON PERFORATED, $22.95 $3,442.50 $21.71  $3,256.50 $19.25 $2,887.50
W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE
s 150 MA"UFACII: ';IE';SEA%'T_‘:ND NAME, » SCA ROSES ELEMENT ECONOMY WHITE
CASES PART NUMBER: RB350 28706 60-332-5
SIZE PER SHEET: 7 718" X 350° 18" X 350" 7 718" X 300°
SHEETS PER PACKAGE 1ROLL NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 12

12/CASE 12

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL,

W7 7/8" x L800", $16.38 $26,208.00 $18.86 $30,176.00 $18.50 ¢ ' $29,600.00
134" CORE SIZE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAWNE,

1.600 'AS APPLICABLE BENMORE ROSES ELEMENT HWT KRAFT 720
6 3
CASES PART NUMBER: #60335 209 60335
SIZE PER SHEET: 8" X720 7 7/8" X 800 7718"X720'/11.6
SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 1 ROLL NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 6/CASE 6

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__ Js/

DATE:__09/13/2012 2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES 25




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-AmericaCily

2010

[Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012

T ITEM

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

SOUTHWESTERN MILL
DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

EL. PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO,, INC,

(ALTERNATE BID)

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (ITEMS 1-7)

$152,925.50

ESTIMATED ‘ - PRICEPER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE|| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE| PRICEPER [TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (PRICE
NO. ANNUAL DESCRIPTION AND ESTIMATED AMOUNT CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED CASE PER CASE x ESTIMATED
COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET
TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO
LARGER THAN 4.5 % 4.5"W AND No|  $39-90 $63,840.00 $33.33 $53,328.00 $27.90 $44,640.00
SMALLER THAN 3.8"L x 4.5"W
1,600 MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME, |
7 CA’SES AS APPLICABLE ROYAL PAPER ROSES ELEMENT TISSUE
PART NUMBER: #37602 42136 60103
SIZE PER SHEET: 45" X 4.0" 40X 45 4.0" X 315

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 500 SHT/RL NOT STATED NOT STATED
PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 96/CASE 96/CS

$151,135.50

$135,941.00

BIDDER'S PRICE: $135,944.00

APPROVED BY:__ Is/

DATE: _ 09/13/2012

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contra

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

ct.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-nmeﬂcaill;

L2010

Bid Opening Date: August 15, 2012
|Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

Solicitation # : 2012-298
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

SOUTHWESTERN MILL

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE BID)

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS: AMOUNT NOT STATED 1% - 20 DAYS / NET - 30 DAYS 1% - 20 DAYS / NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO D YES D NO YES D NO
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within __ consecutive calendar day 7 DAYS 2 DAYS 2 DAYS

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases

of emergancy. NOT STATED f12 HOURS 12 HOURS

[GNING UPON RECGE]

- ONLY AND IN SALABLE CONDITION"

PY.GIVENTO CU

ETURN ACCEPTED FULL CASES

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 6

BIDS RECEIVED:

9 BIDS LOCAL: 6

NO BID:

0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/e

APPROVED BY:___Js/

DATE: _ 09/13/2012

2012-298 PAPER SUNDRIES - GENERAL SERVICES

xecution of contract.
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Baron Chemical
817 Texas Ave.
El Paso, TX. 79901

Eco-Worx INC.
860 Kastrin Dr.
El Paso, TX. 79907

Laun-Dry Supply
3800 Durazno Ave.
El Paso, TX. 79905

Southwestern Mill Distributors, Inc.

310 N.Dallas
St. El Paso, TX. 79947

Spectrum Paper Co., Inc.
27 Concord St.
El Paso, TX. 79906

Springtime Janitorial Supply
5548 EIl Paso Dr.
El Paso, TX 79905






