CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

+ AGENDA DATE: OCTOBER 25, 2011

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: DARYL W. COLE, DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DIRECTOR,

621-6750
BRUCE D. COLLINS, PURCHASING MANAGER, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

SUBJECT:
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council

to approve. Include $ amount if applicable.

Department of Transportation recomumends award to the following bidders for solicitation 2011-320
Traffic Signal Components for an estimated 3 years total of $214,417.50. '

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably complete description of the contemplated action. This
should include attachment of bid tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of this action? What are

the citizen concerns?

Department of Transportation has reviewed solicitation 2011-320 and recommends the contract be
awarded to General Traffic Equipment Corporation (V1) for items 1, 2, 12, 15 & 19 for an estimated
annual amount of $9,880.00; Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. (V2) for items 13, 14 & 21 for an estimated
annual amount of $45,150.00; and Traffic Parts, Inc. (V3) for items 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 16, 17, 18 &
20 for an estimated annual amount of $16,442.50; as the lowest bidders, most responsive and responsible
bidders meeting specifications for the items awarded.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 8/16/2011 and 8/23/2011. The postcards were mailed out on 8/16/2011. The
solicitation was posted on City website on 8/16/2011. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on
8/16/2011. A total of fourteen bidders including two local vendors were solicited. A total of four bids were
received including none being a local vendor.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Council awarded Contract No. 2008-222 Traffic Signal Components on October 7, 2008.
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDPING:

How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by account numbers and description of account. Does
it require a budget transfer?

32010288-503203-01101-32000 Public Access Maintenance & Repairs — General Fund
BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Name . Signature Date




CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

ar-americaClty

|

BID TABULATION FORM
. 20Z0.
Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011 Solicitation #: 2011-320
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components Department: Transportation
GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNITRRICE | (EST.QTY.X | UNITPRICE | (EST.QTY.X | UNITPRICE | (EST.QTY.X | UNIT PRICE (EST.QTY. X
. NO. | ary. UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
.| 100 PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 5" X 7" $40.00 $4,000.00 $56.00 $5,600.00 $55.10 $5,510.00 $41.95 $4,195.00
EACH ' EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBA - 1010 ADA SE-2011-08 SE-2011-08 TP#PB-S10-B23-Y
2 70 PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" X 12" | $55.00 $3,850.00 $74.00 $5,180.00 $72.60 $5,082.00 $60.95 $4,266.50
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBA - 1020 ADA SE-2013-08 SE-2013-08 TP#PB-510-B43-Y
3. 100 PUSH BUTTON SIiGNS 5" X 7" $10.00 $1,000.00 | NOBID NO BID $7.00 $700.00 $6.50 $650.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA. )
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP CRYSTAL SIGNS HALL
MODEL R10-4B-5X7LR R10-4B 5X7.75 NO ARROW
fI 70 PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" X 12" $13.00 $910.00 NO BID NO BIiD $10.00 $700.00 $9.50 $665.00
~L -1 EacH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP CRYSTAL SIGNS HALL
MODEL R10-4B-9X12LR R10-4B 9X12 NO ARROW
5. 100 ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER NO BID $104.00 | $10,400.00 | $102.30 | $10,230.00 $50.50 $5,050.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA. . |
MANUFACTURER PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL SK-0230 SK-0230 TP#6113 MANUF. PAINT YELLO
is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

/ /
APPROVED BY:I/ [((/Z\’/>g’v

MNOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation

onre LS 0/




Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
ject Name: Traffic Signal Components

P

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El FPaso

A-Rmterica City

2010 .

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRIGE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. | QTy. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
C[ 100 | MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET| $60.00 $6,000.00 $70.37 $7,037.00 $69.75 $6,975.00 $59.50 $5,950.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL AB-3009-62-S3 AS-3009-84-SS TP#5624
7. 50 HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS $14.00 $700.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $19.90 $995.00 $11.95 $597.50
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA. )
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL . CF-260 SE-4038 SE-4038 TP#5860
8. 50 HARDWARE - HORIZONTAL $12.00 $600.00 $17.00 $850.00 $17.05 $852.50 $10.00 $500.60
EACH SLIP TEE (STEEL) EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL TF -250RR SE-4092-SBE SE-4092-SBE TP#2750/TP#12 PAINT YELLOW
P 100 HUB 8" FOR MIAST ARM HOLE $8.00 $800.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $9.65 $965.00 $7.25 $725.00
J || _EAcH EA. EA. EA. EA. :
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO, AS PICTURED, FIG. 9 CH
MODEL PBH - 4251.G SE-0357 SE-0357 TP#5357
10. 120 "HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE $8.00 $960.00 $11.00 $1,320.00 $9.65 $1,158.00 $7.25 $870.00
EAGCH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBH - 420 SE-4071 SE-0454 TP#5358
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:%/ ( 1

DATE: 5‘::/(7;» (/// '




El Paso

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

AR-America City

-

2010

Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011 Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | pRICE (EST. QTy.
NO. | QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
'\E-; 50 ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON $20.00 $1,000.00 $52.00 $2,600.00 $52.00 $2,600.00 $16.00 $800.00
EAGH ASSEMBLY WITH 2" PLUNGER EA. EA. EA. EA. :
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP - PELCC PELCO CH :
MODEL PB-3-ADA SE-2149-08 SE-2149-08 TP#PB-S10-B00-Y
i2. 60 SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL $30.00 $1,800.00 $32.00 $1,920.00 $32.50 $1,950.00 $37.10 $2,226.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PJS - 110 SE-3106 SE-3108 TP#2583/TP#14 PAINT YELLOW
13. 50 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 15' | NO BID $243.00 | $12,150.00 | $259.00 | $12,950.00 | $297.00 $14,850.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER PELCO PELCO CPI
MODEL PB-5100-15 PB-5100-15, PB-5402 TP#6055-15X/TP#1005
a4, 50 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 12' | NO BID $200.00 | $10,000.00 | $219.00 | $10,950.00 | $247.00 | $1 2,350.00
\ EACH EA. EA. EA. i EA.
' MANUFACTURER PELCC PELCO CPi
" MODEL PB-5100-12 PB-5100-12, PB-5402 TP#6054X/TP#1065
15. 50 NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) $4.00 $200.00 $6.25 $312.50 "$6.10 $305.00 $10.00 $500.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA. _
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PN-150-A-2.50 CT SE-0309-2.13 SE-0309-02.125 TP#7245

MOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /% C .

DATE: 5?4% s




‘ El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2030
Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011

Solicitation #: 2011-320
P :_Traffic Signal Com

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM || EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRIGE | PRICE (EST.QTY. || UNIT PRIGE | PRICE (EST.QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
Mo, | 100 HEX NIPPLE FIG. 16 ITEM PART 1 $3.00 $300.00 $4.00 $400.00 $3.90 $390.00 $2.40 $240.00
EACH EA. EA. EA, EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL HN-150 SE-0448 SE-0448 TP#232
17. { 100 SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) $0.30 $30.00 $0.40 $40.00 $0.50 $50.00 $0.25 $25.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCQ PELCO CH
MODEL FS-3217-SS FS-3217-S8 . TP#5271
18. | 100 HEX NIPPLE FIG. 16 ITEM PART 6 $3.50 $350.00 $4.00 $400.00 $4.05 $405.00 $2.75 $275.00
' EACH ' EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL CN-H-150 SE-0443 SE-0443 TP#4290
A9, 100 GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE $0.30 $30.00 $06.30 $30.00 $0.45 $45.00 $0.44 $44.00
{|. || EacH EA. "~ EA. ) EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER : GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
NIODEL RW-150 SE-0354 SE-0354 TP#2127
20. 50 CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE $2.00 $100.00 $3.00 $150.00 $2.95 $147.50 $1.90 $95.00
EACH EA. EA. ' EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO Ci
MODEL CC-195 SE-4088 SE-4088 TP#231
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of confract.

apPROVED BY:__ 2] / - DATE: 74[) /// 7




Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traific Signal Components

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-Armerica City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
' EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL| - EXTENDED TOTAL . EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST.. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | pRIGE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | prICE (EST. QTY.
NO. | ary. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
:[ 200 | BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL $118.00 | $23, 600.00 $115.00 | $23,000.00 | $175.00 $35,000.00 | $178.00 | $35,600.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER COMPONENT PELCO PELCO CPI & CH
MODEL PRODS SP-1014-TX SP-1014-TXTT TPi#1-6016, 4-4208, 3-7155, & 3-7156
CITEMS 1 - 21 TOTAL PRICE: $46,230.00 $83,389.50 $97,960.00 $90,474.00
(BIDDER'S EXT. TOTAL PRICE:
. NONE STATED)
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERGISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
TPI”‘ERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR: .
- {ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), : —
iF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION [ [ I:
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT. -
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), j
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION E E
{OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED [ X | X [z
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of coniract

APPROVED BY: /L// . (/ ¢

/ _o?//




Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Alt-; City

111K

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-320
Department: Transportation.

GENERAL TRAFFIC

PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS - NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIRDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
L | SROGUREIENT Cra: YES [X] NO[ | YES[ | NO YES [X] No[ | YES [ X] No[ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
o ] ~ 30 30-45 20-45 30-45
Within ___consecutive calendar days
Within ___ih(-)urs or cvernight after receipt of 48 30-45 NA 24
verbal order in cases of emergency .
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY NMAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 14

BiDS RECEIVED: 4

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: A (‘ L ’

e 22/




PELCO PRODUCTS INC.
320 SW 18™ STREET
EDMOND, OK 73013-3628

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS
5705 AIRPORT FREEWAY
FORT WORTH, TX 76117

TRAFFIC PARTS INC.
P. 0. BOX 837
SPRING, TX 77383

U. S. TRAFFIC CORPORATION
ATTN: PATRICE DAVEZAN
9603 JOHN STREET

SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA 20670

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP.

259 BROADWAY
NEWBURGH, NY 12550

MCCAIN TRAFFIC SUPPLY INC.
2575 PIONEER AVENUE
VISTA, CA 92083-5411

TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS CORP.

1309 B CLARK STREET
ROUND ROCK, TX 78680

HI-TECH SIGNALS INC.
P. 0. BOX 24071
FORT WORTH, TX 76124

ATTN: MARIA GANDARA
H1TINDUSTRIES

P. 0. BOX 3550

EL PASO, TX 79923

ROSANNA COPPER
5605 DEVON AVENUE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79924

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC
CONTROLS INC.

P. 0. BOX 151837
ARLINGTON, TX 76015

TRAFFIC ENGINNERING & 7777

CONTROLS INC.
4193 FM 811
CENTERVILLE, TX 758833

ATTN: ZACHARY J. OLIPHANT
RELIAPOLE SOLUTIONS, INC.
16835 EAST MAGLITTO CIRCLE
TOMBALL, TX 77377

TRAFFIC ENGINEERING
AND CONTROLS

114 24™ STREET

SAN LEON, TX 77539




