CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: El Paso Zoo

AGENDA DATE: October 31, 2006

L.R. Hutchinson, YMD, MS -521-1850 o
TeARen€ F&’éi%u_a@ﬁ ~-54]-43)3 AW

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: N/A
SUBJECT:
Approve awarding Bid 2006-183 — Zoo Animal Food, Frozen products (36 months) as follows:

Group | — Frozen Fish

Atlantic Pacific Products — Items 1 through 5
Estimated annual amount - $ 35,021.00 Contract amount $ 105,063.00

Group Il = Frozen Whole Prey
The Animal Works dba The Big Cheese Rodent Factory — Items 1 through 8
Estimated annual amount - $ 7,958.75 Contract amount $23,876.25

Group lll — Frozen Horsemeat/Horsemeat Products
The zoo respectfully requests to withdraw the bid at this time pending diet review and revisions.

Group IV — Shipping Costs
The zoo respectfully requests to withdraw the bid at this time pending diet review and revisions

9
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BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Term of contract for Thirty Six (36) months. Bid tabulation attached for review.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

E€:2 Wy €2 1309

Ld30 %y

Yes.
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Fund 15445-Z.00 Operations., Dept. 52152001- Zoo Gate Revenue/Admin,, Acct. 503110 — Animal Food &
Supplies, Class 52000 — Zoo Administration.

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A

9 _~FINANCE: (if required)

LEGAL: (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD:

if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

'(Exafnple:

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:
DATE:

CITY MANAGER:



PROJECT FORM
DATE: October 20, 2006

PROJECT: Zoo Animal Food-Frozen Products

NO:2006-183 DEPARTMENT: Zoo

BUDGET NO: 52152001-503110-15445-52000

FUNDING SOURCE: Zoo Operations-Zoo Gate Revenue/Administration-Animal Food and Supplies
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor:  Aflantic Pacific Products, Inc.
North Kingston, RI
Item(s): Group | (Frozen Fish), #1 to #6

Annual Estimated Amount;: $ 35,021.00

RECOMMENDATION: 2) Vendor: The Animal Works
. dba The Big Cheese Rodent Factory
Forth Worth, TX
ltem(s): Group Il (Frozen Whole Prey) #1 to #8
Annual Estimated Amount: $7,958.75

Total Estimated annual Amount : - $42,979.75
This is a requirements type contract with an initial term of thirty six (36) months.

The Departments of Financial Services and Zoo recommend award as indicated to the lowest responsive,
responsible bidder.

Group Il (Frozen Horsemeat/Horsemeat Products) and Group 1V (Shipping Costs for Horsemeat) will not
be awarded as indicated on the attached memo.

Vendor #2 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for two (2)
additional years if the option is exercised within two (2) years from the date of the award. Vendor also offers
the City a prompt payment discount of 2% 10 days.

BIDS SOLICITED- 25 (02 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 07
“NO BID” RECEIVED 00

CURRENT TAXES PAID-
OUT-OF-TOWN-

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECOMMENDED AWARD:$ 128,939.25
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COUNCIL APPROVED [ ] REJECTED [ ] MUNICIPAL CLERK

rd
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APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 31, 2006

//A/(/f/f/t/
Terrence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services Depa




City CouncIiL

JoHN Cook ANN MORGAN LILLY, DisTRICT 1
MAyoR SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2

J. ALEXANDRO LozANO, DISTRICT 3

Joyce Wilson MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
City MANAGER PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT 5

Eppie HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6
L.R. Hutchinson, VMD, MS STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7
Director BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8

EL PAso Zoo

Date: October 23, 2006

To: Jesus M. Juarez - Procurement Analyst
From: L. R. Hutchinson, VMD, MS - Zoo Dire

Subject: Bid #2006-183 — Zoo Animal Food — Frozeh Products

Bid tabulations have been reviewed and award recommendations are as follows:

Group | — Frozen Fish
Atlantic Pacific Products — Items 1 through 6
Total estimated amount - $ 35,021.00

Group Il — Frozen Whole Prey
The Animal Works dba The Big Cheese Rodent Factory — ltems 1 through 8
Total estimated amount - $ 7,958.75

Group Il — Frozen Horsemeat/Horsemeat Products
The zoo respectfully requests to withdraw the bid at this time pending diet review and revisions.

Group IV — Shipping Costs
The zoo respectfully requests to withdraw the bid at this time pending diet review and revisions.

Funding is as follows:

Dept. 562152001 Zoo Gate Revenue Admin

Fund 15445 Zoo General Operations
Acct 503110 Animal Food & Supplies
Class 52000 Zoo Administration

4001 E. Paisano Dr., El Paso, Texas 79905-4223 (915) 521-1850 Fax (915) 521-1857
www.elpasotexas.gov - m-mail: elpasozoo@elpasotexas.gov




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

ATLANTIC PACIFIC

DALLAS CROWN, INC.

HIGHWAYICITY

MESILLA VALLEY

PRODUCTS, INC. KAUFMAN, TX DEBRIS POLICE FEEDERS, LLC
GROUP I: FROZEN FISH NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI ~ EL PASO, TX MESILLA, NM
ITEM | ANN. EST. - UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT |  TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
' [7260 X $0.59 = TOTAL PRICE) [7260 X $0.75 = TOTAL PRICE]
1. 7260 'CAPELIN - 3" - 5" LONG $0.59 $4,283.40 NO PRICES GIVEN NO PRICES GIVEN $0.75 $5,445.00
LB 20 - 40 LB PER BOX LB FOR THESE ITEMS FOR THESE ITEMS LB
- |# PER BOX 33
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH 5" 6"
‘ [7260 X $0.51 = TOTAL PRICE] [7260 X $0.77 = TOTAL PRICE]
2. 7260 HERRING - 8" - 10" LONG $0.51 $3,702.60 $0.77 $5,590.20
LB 20 - 40 LB PER BOX LB ' LB
# PER BOX ' 50
APPROXIMATELY LEENGTH 10"
' [7000 X $0.95 = TOTAL PRICE] [7000 X $0.96 = TOTAL PRICE]
3. 7000 CAPELIN - 3" - 5" LONG $0.95 $6,650.00 $0.96 $6,720.00
LB 20 - 40 LB PER BOX LB ‘ LB
# PER BOX 50
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH 8" - 10"
[3500 X $1.65 = TOTAL PRICE] [3500 X $3.45 = TOTAL FRICE]
4, 3500 SILVERSIDES - 2" - 3" LONG $1.65 $5,775.0b $3.45 $12,075.00
LB 50 (5 LB BAGS) LB l LB
# PER BOX 5LB 15
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH 3" 2.5"

APPROVED BY:__

DATE: 5:/7/// b

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FRO
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

ZEN PRODUCTS

| BID # 2006-183

ATLANTIC PACIFIC

DALLAS CROWN, INC.

HIGHWAY/CITY

 DEPARTMENT: Z0OO

MESILLA VALLEY

GROUP [I: FROZEN WHOLE PREY

ITEM | ANN. EST.

PRODUCTS, INC. ) KAUFMAN, TX DEBRIS POLICE FEEDERS, LLC
GROUP I: FROZEN FISH NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI EL PASO, TX MESILLA, NM
‘ ' o [11400 X $1.05 = TOTAL PRICE] ' [11400 x $1.19 = TOTAL PRICE]
5. 11400 SQUID $1.05 | $11,970.00 NO PRICES GIVEN NO PRICES GIVEN 1$1.19 $13,566.00
LB 50 LB BOXES LB FOR THESE ITEMS FOR THESE ITEMS : LB
# PER BOX 12/5LB 50
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH N/A ; 7" - 10"
[480 X $5.50 = TOTAL PRICE] [480 X $1.95 = TOTAL PRICE]
6. - 480 KRILL - 1/8 INCH $5.50 $2,640.00 1$1.95 $936.00
LB 40 LBS PER BOX LB LB '
# PER BOX 8X67/8 33
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH 1/6"
'GROUP | TOTAL: $35,021.00 $44,332.20

|

TOTAL UNIT TOTAL . UNIT TAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE ~ PRICE 'PRICE PRICE
| ‘ $0.85 l $2,380.00 $81.30 ’ $2,276.40
1. 2800 FROZEN MICE, ADULT, LARGE N/A NO PRICES GIVEN BAG | . BAG
EA 100 PER BAG l FOR THESE ITEMS [2800 X $0.85 = TOTAL PRICE] [2800/ 100 X 81.30 = YOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR v ' 25 - 25
# PER BAG .
| | $0.80 ) $1,960.00 $66.51 | $1,629.50
2. 2450 'FROZEN MICE, ADULT, MEDIUM N/A BAG ' BAG
EA 100 PER BAG , [2450 X $0.80 = TOTAL PRICE] [2450 /100 X $66.51 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 25 ‘ 50
# PER BAG v

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

ATLANTIC PACIFIC DALLAS CROWN, INC. HIGHWAYICITY MESILLA VALLEY
PRODUCTS, INC. KAUFMAN, TX DEBRIS POLICE FEEDERS, LLC
GROUP II: FROZEN WHOLE PREY (CONTINUED) NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI EL PASO, TX MESILLA, NM
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$0.70 $1,890.00 $57.02 $1,539.54
3. 2700 FROZEN MICE, ADULT, SMALL - N/A NO PRICES GIVEN BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG (WEANLING) l FOR THESE ITEMS [2700 X $0.70 = TOTAL PRICE) [2700/100 X 57.02 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR 50 . 100
# PER BAG
| $0.50 k $350.00 $26.06 $182.42
4, 700 FROZEN MICE, PINKIE N/A BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG I [700 X $0.50 = TOTAL PRICE] (700 / 100 X $26.06 = TOTAL PRICE))
QTY/BAG AND/OR 100 100
# PER BAG
I (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $929.39)
5. 3500 FROZEN MICE, FUzZzY N/A $0.55 l $1,925.00 $26.18 $916.30
EA 100 PER BAG BAG BAG
[3500 X $0.55 = TOTAL PRICE] (3500 /100 X $26.18 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR 50 100
# PER BAG
6. 1350 FROZEN RATS, MEDIUM rLIA $1.75 $2,362.50 $255.55 $3,449.93
EA 100 PER BAG BAG BAG
[1350 X $1.75 = TOTAL PRICE] (1350 / 100 X $255.55 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR 15 10
# PER BAG il

APPROVED BY: % M

DATE:_/ o/ 3/a/é /@04%/

(Corrected (Z/opy)

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF

EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS

BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

ATLANTIC PACIFIC

DALLAS CROWN, INC.

HIGHWAY/CITY

MESILLA VALLEY

PRODUCTS, INC. KAUFMAN, TX DEBRIS POLICE FEEDERS, LLC
GROUP II: FROZEN WHOLE PREY (CONTINUED) NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI EL PASO, TX MESILLA, NM
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY./UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
(BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE
7. 1350 FROZEN RATS, SMALL N/A NO PRICES GIVEN $2.00 $2,700.00 ROUNDED OFF CENTS)
EA 100 PER BAG FOR THESE ITEMS BAG $137.02 $1,849.80
(1350 X $2.00 = TOTAL PRICE) BAG
: - | (1350 /100 X $137.02 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG . AND/OR 15 20
# PER BAG
8. 1725 FROZEN CHICKS, SMALL NO PAGES WERE $37.35 $644.29 $52‘.61 $907.53
EA 100 PER BAG SUBMITTED FOR BAG BAG
THESE ITEMS (1725/100 X $37.35 = TOTAL PRICE) || (1725/100 X $52.61 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR 100 20
# PER BAG
GROUP Il TOTAL: $11,831.79 ©$12,751.41
! (BIDDER'S GROUP Il TOTAL: $644.29) | (BIDDER'S GROUP Il TOTAL: $12,764.59)
GROUP lll: FROZEN HORSEMEAT/HORSEMEAT PRODUCTS
ITEM| ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY./JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
[BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE ' 410 CASES]
1. 410 FROZEN HORSEMEAT, 10% FAT X $1.00 X 40 LBS - $16,400.00] $38.00 $15,580.00 $48.00 $19,680.00
CcS 40 LB PER CASE $1.00 $410.00 CASE CASE
CASE :
_ [410 X $1.00 = TOTAL PRICE] (410 x $38.00 = TOTAL PRICE) (410°X $48.00 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR "~ . 40
# PER CASE ' 40 LB 40

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

(Corrected Copy)

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

ATLANTIC PACIFIC

) DALLAS CROWN, INC. HIGHWAY/CITY MESILLA VALLEY
GROUP Ill: FROZEN HORSEMEAT/HORSEMEAT PRODUCTS, INC. KAUFMAN, TX - DEBRIS POLICE FEEDERS, LLC
PRODUCTS (CONTINUED) NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI EL PASO, TX MESILLA, NM
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
[BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: 12 CASES
2. 12 FROZEN HORSEMEAT, CHUNK NO PAGES WERE X $1.00 X 50 LBS = $600.00] $66.70 $800.40 $60.00 $720.00
cs 50 LB PER CASE (IN 1 LB PACKAGES) SUBMITTED FOR $1.00 $12.00 CASE CASE
: " THESE ITEMS CASE )
. : [12 X $1.00 = TOTAL PRICE] [12 X $66.70 = TOTAL PRICE] [12 X $60.00 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 50
# PER CASE 50 LB ‘ 50 -
‘ [BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: 12 CASES
3 12 FROZEN TAIL BONES X $0.35 X 44 LBS = $184.80] $40.25 $483.00 $18.48 $221.76
cs ‘44 LB PER CASE $0.35 $4.20 CASE CASE
CASE
, [12 X $0.35 = TOTAL PRICE] [12 X $40.25 = TOTAL PRICE] [12 X $18.48 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 50
# PER CASE : 44 1B 44
GROUP Il TOTAL $426.20 $16,863.40 $20,621.76
L4 (BIDDER'S GROUP il TOTAL: $17,184.80) (BIDDER'S GROUP Il TOTAL: $16,825.90)
GROUP IV: SHIPPING COSTS PLEASF IDENTIFY SHIPPING COSTS (FOR GROUP III) BASED ON FREQUENQY AND QUANTITY
» HORSEMEAT
A. | WEEKLY: QUANTITY: NONE STATED - $500.76 $650.00
(E.G., # OF PACKS, BAGS, ETC.) WEEKLY: 434 CASES WEEKLY: 350#
B. | MONTHLY: QUANTITY: NONE STATED NONE STATED $2,100.00
MONTHLY: 1460#
C. OTHER: $952.00 NONE STATED N/A
EVERY 3 MONTHS ESTIMATE
FOR SHIPPING APPROX.
8,605 LBS NONE STATED N/A
A4

APPROVED BY:_

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

ATLANTIC PACIFIC
PRODUTTS, INC.
NORTH KINGSTOWN, RI

DALLAS CROWN, INC.
KAUFMAN, TX

HIGHWAYI/CITY
DEBRIS POLICE
EL PASO, TX

MESILLA VALLEY
FEEDERS, LLC
MESILLA, NM

THE CITY AT ITS DISCRETION MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,
BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS. ‘ '

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES,
IF THE OPTION 1S EXERCISED WITHIN:

NONE WERE CHECKED

]
L]

X
L]

]
[x]

A. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE ves| | No[_] YES X ] No[_] YEs_ ] No[_] ves[x] No[ ]
CONTRAGT. | '

B. NO OPTION OFFERED ] | L] ]

PAYMENT TERMS: NONE STATED % - 30 DAYS NONE SUBMITTED 2% - 10 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

NONE SUBMITTED

30 CONSECUTIVE
CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: _

DATE:.f/?//j: b

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS

BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

THE ANIMAL WORKS

NATURAL BALANCE dba THE BIG CHEESE THE GOURMET
PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
GROUP I: FROZEN FISH PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
ITEM | ANN. EST. . UNIT TOTAL 'UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT IT‘EMDESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 7260 CAPELIN - 3" - 5" LONG NO PRICES WERE NO PRICES WERE. NO BID
LB 20 - 40 LB PER BOX SUBMITTED FOR SUBMITTED FOR
# PER BOX THESE ITEMS  THESE ITEMS
APPROXIMATELY LENGTH
2, 7260 HERRING - 8" - 10" LONG
LB 20 - 40 LB PERBOX
# PER BOX

APPROXIMATELY LENGTH

3. 7000 CAPELIN - 3" -'5" LONG
LB 20 - 40 LB PER BOX
# PER BOX

APPROXIMATELY LIENGTH

SILVERSIDES - 2" - 3" LONG

4. 3500
l_B 50 (5 LB BAGS)
# PER BOX

APPROXIMATELY LENGTH

APPROVED BY:_

DATE:. f/?// A

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




"~ CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

NATURAL BALANCE

THE ANIMAL WORKS
dba THE BIG CHEESE

THE GOURMET

APPROXIMATELY LIENGTH

PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
GROUP I: FROZEN FISH PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
5. 11400 ~ sQuib NO PRICES WERE NO PRICES WERE NO BID
LB " 50 LB BOXES SUBMITTED FOR SUBMITTED FOR
## PER BOX THESE ITEMS THESE ITEMS

6. 480 KRILL - 1/8 INCH
LB 40 LBS PER BOX
# PER BOX

APPROXIMATELY LIENGTH

GROUP | TOTAL:

GROUP Il: FROZEN WHOLE PREY

é‘«gm»> S
ITEM | ANN. EST. UNIT . TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 2800 FROZEN MiCE, ADULT, LARGE NO PRICES WERE $12.75 $1,428.00 $26.00 $1,456.00
EA 100 PER BAG SUBMITTED FOR BAG BAG
THESE ITEMS [2800/25X $12.75 =TOTAL PRICE) || [2800 /50 X $26.00 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR ‘ 50
# PER BAG ‘ 25
2, 2450 FROZEN MICE, ADULT, MEDIUM $21.50 $1,053.50 $23.50 $1,151.50
EA 100 PER BAG BAG BAG
» [2450 1 50 X $21.50 = TOTAL PRICE] || [2450/50 X $23.50 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 50
# PER BAG v 50

APPROVED BY:_

y/a

* DATE: f/?/;ﬁé

2008-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

THE ANIMAL WORKS

NATURAL BALANCE dba THE BIG CHEESE THE GOURMET
PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
GROUP Il: FROZEN WHOLE PREY (CONTINUED) PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$19.00 $1,026.00 $37.00 $999.00
3. | 2700 FROZEN MICE, ADULT, SMALL NO PRICES WERE BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG (WEANLING) SUBMITTED FOR [2700 /50 X $19.00 = TOTAL PRICE] || [2700 /100 X $37.00 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR THESE ITEMS 100
# PER BAG 50
$8.00 $112.00 $37.00 $259.00
4. 700 FROZEN MICE, PINKIE BAG BAG
EA 100 PER LONG [700 /50 X $8.00 = TOTAL PRICE) [700/100 X $37.00 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 100
# PER BAG 50
$9.50 $665.00 $37.00 $1,295.00
5. | 3500 FROZEN MICE, FUZZY BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG [3500 / 50 X $9.50 = TOTALPRICE] | [3500 /100 X $37.00 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 100
# PER BAG 50
$13.70 $1,849.50 $14.70 $1,984.50
6. | 1350 FROZEN RATS, MEDIUM BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG [1350 /10 X $13.70 = TOTAL PRICE] || [1350/10 X $14.70 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR 10
# PER BAG 10

APPROVED BY:

DATE: f/;’/ﬁé

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: 20O

THE ANIMAL WORKS
NATURAL BALANCE dba THE BIG CHEESE THE GOURMET
PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
GROUP lI: FROZEN WHOLE PREY (CONTINUED) PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$13.95 $1,255.50 $21.40 $1,444.50
7. 1350 FROZEN RATS, SMALL NO PRICES WERE BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG SUBMITTED FOR [1350/15 X $13.95 = TOTAL PRICE] || [1350/20 X $21.40 = TOTAL PRICE]
QTY/BAG AND/OR THESE ITEMS 20
# PER BAG 15
$8.25 $569.25 $6.75 $465.75
8. 1725 FROZEN CHICKS, SMALL BAG BAG
EA 100 PER BAG [1725/25 X $8.25 = TOTAL PRICE] || [1725/25 X $6.75 = TOTAL PRICE)
QTY/BAG AND/OR 25
# PER BAG 25
$65,478.75
GROUP Il TOTAL: $7,958.75 (BIDDER'S TOTAL:
v $9,073.75 + SHIPPING) *
GROUP llIl: FROZEN HORSEMEAT/HORSEMEAT PRODUCTS
ITEM | ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY.JUNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
$40.00 $16,400.00 NO PRICES WERE
1. 410 FROZEN HORSEMEAT, 10% FAT CASE (FROZEN BEEF MEAT) SUBMITTED FOR NO BID
cs 40 LB PER CASE ($1.00/LB OF PRODUCT) THESE ITEMS
QTY/BAG AND/OR
# PER CASE 40 LBS v
* | HAVE ESTIMATED 12 SHIPMENTS
PER YEAR AT $125/SHIPMENT TO
THE Z00 FOR ADDITIONAL FREIGHT
|_CHARGES,
APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT 10




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

THE ANIMAL WORKS
NATURAL BALANCE dba THE BIG CHEESE THE GOURMET
GROUP Ill: FROZEN HORSEMEAT/HORSEMEAT PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
PRODUCTS (CONTINUED) PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
ANN. EST. UNIT TOTAL "UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY.IUNIT v ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
, $26.00 $312.00 NO PRICES WERE
2. 12 FROZEN HORSEMEAT, CHUNK CASE (BEEF MEAT) SUBMITTED FOR NO BID
CS 50 LB PER CASE (IN 1 LB PACKAGES) (MEAT EATING BIRD DIET) THESE ITEMS
QTY/BAG AND/OR 2X 10 LB BAGS
# PER CASE 20 LBS @ 41.30/LB
R NO PRICE
3. 12 FROZEN TAIL BONES WAS SUBMITTED
cs 44 LB PER CASE FOR THIS ITEM
QTY/BAG AND/OR
# PER CASE
GROUP Il TOTAL $16,712.00
- : v ¥
GROUP IV: SHIPPING COSTS PLEASE IDENTIFY SHIPPING COSTS (FOR GROUP Ill) BASED ON FREQUENCY AND QUANTITY
A. | WEEKLY: | QUANTITY: $0.14 - $0.17/LB NONE STATED N/A
(E.G., # OF PACKS, BAGS, ETC.) 6,000-10,000 LBS/SHIPMENT
B. |MONTHLY:| QUANTITY: $0.19/LB NONE STATED
4,500-5,999 LBS/SHIPMENT )
C. | OTHER: NONE STATED FOB, EL PASO Z0OO
_ ‘ ANIMAL COMMISSARY
SHIPMENT TO BE WITHIN
' 7-10 DAYS OF
RECEIPT OF ORDER. v

APPROVED BY;_

DATE: lf//;:‘/ﬂf[;:

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS
BID DATE: JULY 19, 2006

BID # 2006-183
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

NATURAL BALANCE

THE ANIMAL WORKS
dba THE BIG CHEESE

THE GOURMET

PET FOODS, INC. RODENT FACTORY RODENT, INC.
PACOIMA, CA FORT WORTH, TX ARCHER, FL
THE CITY AT ITS DISCRETION MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,
BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE
WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, ] X] ] L]
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:
TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, ] ] ] |
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:
A. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE YES| | nNo[_] YEs[ | No[_] YES[X] No[_] YES ] No[_]
CONTRACT. |
B. NO OPTION OFFERED [x] | ] ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
- 14 CONSECUTIVE 20 CONSECUTIVE - 7 CONSECUTIVE
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE |LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 2§

BIDS RECEIVED: 7

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 0

2006-183 ZOO ANIMAL FOOD - FROZEN PRODUCTS - ZOO DEPARTMENT
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NORTHERN OCEAN MARINE, INC.
3-5 PARKER ST.
GLOUCESTER, MA 01930

THE MOUSE FACTORY
P.0.BOX85. oo

ALPINE, TEXAS 79831

THE GOURMET RODENT
ATTN: WILLIAM BRANT
6115 SW 137™ AVENUE
ARCHER, FLORIDA 32618

PRIVETT HATCHERY
P.0.BOX 176
- PORTALES, NM 88130

LUNDS FISHERIES, INC.
997 OCEAN DRIVE
CAPE MAY, NJ 08204

GRUBCO, INC.
P. 0. BOX 15001-0001
HAMILTON, OH 45015

ALTANTIC PACIFIC
P.0.BOX 874 :
N. KINGSTON, RI1 02852

NATURAL BALANCE
12924 PIERCE ST.
PACOIMA, CA 91331

ATTN: MARCIA BRANT
THE GOURMET RODENT
6115 SW 137" AVENUE

ARCHER, FL 32618

CARNEGIE FOODS, INC.
ATTN: ARMANDO ESCOE AR
3701 SHELL ST.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

- NATIONAL FISH & SEAFOOD

11-15 PARKER ST
GLOUCESTER, MA 01930

C.
P. 0. BOX 1750
BOCA RATON, FLORIDA 33432

SEA PRIDE INTERNATIONAL, II(

FLYNN SEAFOQD, INC. (-
174 BELLEVUE AVE. SUITE 308 \{'
NEWPORT, RI 02840 N

EL PASO MEAT CO.
1523 MYRTLE AVENUE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

JUNCKER ASSOCIATES & CO.
ATTN: KEEGAN DIGREGORIO
1 STATE FISH PIER
GLOUCESTER, MA 01930

MC ROBERTS
P.0.BOX 489
RUSKIN, FLORIDA 33575

BIG CHEESE RODENTS
2527 WEST DICKSON ST.
FORT WORTH, TEXAS 76110

&
A

THE MOUSE HOUSE
1500 BRITTMORE, SUITE 401

“ HOUSTON, TEXAS 77043

STATE FISH CO. - -

2104 SIGNAL PLACE
SAN PEDRO, CA 90731

CANAL MARINE INC.
20 FREEZER ROAD
SANDWICH, MA 025635

SEATTLE FISH CO.
2500 COMANCHE N. E.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87107

RONNIE’S RODENT RANCH
628 HEMLOCK ROAD
GILMER, TEXAS 75644

CAJUN MICE
P.0.BOX 238
CENTERVILLE, LA 70522

DALLAS CROWN
2000 WEST FAIR
KAUFMAN, TEXAS 75142

H & J PET FOOD FARM
328 CO.RD. 3311
DE KALB, TEXAS 75559






