CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION (RCA)

DEPARTMENT: General Services Department
AGENDA DATE: November 18, 2008

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: John Neal, 621-6821
Terrence Freiburg, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: All

SUBJECT:
APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City Manager to do
what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $ amount if applicable.

Award Group III, Animal Transport Vehicles, of contract 2008-211, City Vehicles, to Rudolph
Chevrolet of El Paso Texas. Estimated expenditures are $190,000. Groups I, II, IV, V and VI are not
to be awarded. Administration is currently doing a vehicle needs assessment at this time and is only
recommending the award of critical needs vehicles. In response to this, the City is looking at issuing
equipment notes to address future needs.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably complete
description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid tabulation, or

ordinance or resolution if appropriate.

See attached bid tabulation. Rudolph Chevrolet was the only bidder on the Animal Transport
Vehicles.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source by
account numbers and description of account. DeptiD/account/fund/project.

37150068-508006-27507, General Services Department, Fleet Services Division, Equipment Replacement
Fund

DEPARTMENT HEAD: John Neal, November 7, 200

(Exandple: if RCA is initiatéd by Purchasing, client department should sign also)

Infbrmation copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager
APPROVED FOR AGENDA; j“‘ U;[‘A»

CITY MANAGER: /

paTE: /) /2 -8




PROJECT FORM
DATE: November 7, 2008

PROJECT: City Vehicles
SOLICITATION NO: 2008-211 DEPARTMENT: General Services
BUDGET NO: 37150068-508006-27507

FUNDING SOURCE: Equipment Replacement Fund
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All

B R R R R T e e e st et et

RECOMMENDATION: Vendor: Rudolph Chevrolet
El Paso, Texas
Item: Group lll: Animal Transport Vehicles

Amount: $190,000 estimated annual expenditures

General Services and Financial Services Departments recommend award to the Bidder offering the best value to
the City.

Groups |, II, IV, V and VI are not to be awarded. Administration is currently doing a vehicle needs assessment at
this time and is only recommending the award of critical needs vehicles. In response to this, the City is looking at
issuing equipment notes to address future needs.

Purchasing bid a thirty-six (36) month requirements type contract for City Vehicles. Rudolph Chevrolet offered
the City pricing for twelve (12) months and does not offer the City the option to extend the term of the contract.
No prompt payment discounts are offered.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this contract
may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end of the
contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

BIDS SOLICITED- 35 (18 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- _4
“NO BID” RECEIVED _0

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:  $190,000
Estimated Total 1 yr Expenditure
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APPROYED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: November 18, 2008

errence Freiburg
Purchasing Manager
Financial Services, Purchasifg Divisio

cc: Bid File




\

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

o o~

XY

: BlD ITEM: ClTY VEHJCLES "BID #2008-211
BID DATE AUGUST 20, 2008 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION
CASA FORD, INC. DICK POE DODGE, LP
GROUP 1: AUTOMOBILES. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR). '
ITEM DESCRIPT[ON UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. ' COMPACT SEDAN, 4-DOOR "$14,386.74 $15,o:3.4.7o
YEAR/IMAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE -
MODEL NO. “FOCUS SE CALIBER PVIDL49
. M : N
2, INTERMEDIATE SEDAN, 4-DOOR [ ‘FUSION: $17,196.74 $17,946.15
: . _ TAURUS: $19,683:90 .
YEARIMAKE i ' 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO, _ FUSION/ TAURUS CHARGER LXD H48
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING 'INTERMEDIATE ]
(GROUP | - AUTOMOBILES ITEMS 1- 2) COMPACT FUSION TAURUS - COMPACT INTERMEDIATE
POWER SEATS N/A STD STD N/A $350.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $187.00 STD STD. $250.00 STD
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD’ STD | STD STD
STATION WAGON 4 NIA $3 STD
GROUP-1i:*PICKUPTRUCKS: (APPROXIMATELY30 PER. YEAR) CKUPTRL S
ITEM * DESCRIPTION ~ UNlT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. - COMPACT REGULAR CAB $1_5,320.90
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD “N/IA i
MODEL NO. RANGER -
2.  COMPACT EXTENDED CAB $15,386.90 - $13,995.10
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. RANGER DAKOTA ND1L33
3, " COMPACT 4 DOOR CREW CAB $19,866.90 $16,062.10
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. SPORT TRAC DAKOTA ND1L84

r""F’\‘

NOTE THISIS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT OTHER FACTORS. BESIDES PRICE WILL:BE. CONSIDERED

i

APPROVED- BY ﬂ%

DATE 6?/ %/0—8'

2008

-211 OlTY- V_EHICLES_ ~ GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

LY




o CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION | B
BID ITEM: "CITY.VEHICLES — —— .

» ‘ S ‘ BID #.2008-211 _ T
BID DATE: AUGUST 20,2008 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP Il: PICKUP TRUCKS

CASA FORD, INC.
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR)

DICK POE DODGE, LP

: . EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
COMPACT PICKUP TRUCKS (CONTINUED) _
' ' OPTIONALITEMPRICING . ] REGULAR | EXTENDED 'REGULAR | EXTENDED
(GROUP I, COMPACT PICKUP TRUCKS; ITEMS 1-3) - ) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
. POWER WINDOWS - -$299.00 $299.00 STD $312.60 $724.00
POWER SEATS N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 STD. $184.48 $368.96
POWER MIRRORS N/A N/A STD N/A N/A
CRUISE CONTROLI/TILT WHEEL $320.00 $320.00 STD $250.00 $250.00
AWD N/A $2,514.00 | $2,279.00 $4,013.00 | $2,836.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS N/A N/A STD STD STD
INTEGRATED/FITTED BED GAP $919.00 $919.00 $919.00 $995.00 $995.00
ROLL-TOP BED COVER $916.80 $916.80 $916.80 $916.80 $916.80
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 13" DEEP $255.00 $255.00 $255.00 $225.00
GROUP:II:-PJ CKUPfffoRUCKS’EE(AE-EROXIMA?E_EEY- Ofi?RER:zNEAR ) J2TON:PICKU PTRUC e s
ITEM ‘ :  DESCRIPTION ' i UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
‘4. +1/2 TON REGULAR CAB $14,167.90 $17,251.40
YEARIMAKE E ' ‘ , 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. . . F150 RAM DS1L61
5| 12 TON EXTENDED CAB $17,526.90 $21,104.95
YEAR/MAKE : - . 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE L~
MODEL NO. B = F150 RAM DS1L41 A
6. . 1/2 TON 4 DOOR CREW'CAB $20,526.90 $28,720.01
YEARIMAKE I 2009 FORD _ 2009'DODGE
MODEL NO. e B : ' F150 - - RAM DS1TH98
OPTIONAL ITEM;PRICING (GROUPII, 1/2 TON || REGULAR | EXTENDED REGULAR | EXTENDED | .
PICKUP TRUCKS; ITEMS 4-6) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS $299.00 $299,00 $598.00 - $312.16 $724.00 STD
POWER SEATS N/A N/A N/A . N/A N/A N/A

NOTE: THIE; IS A'BEST VALUE PROC_URE_M_ENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

,APPROVED,BY:_M'

DATE: Q["—/’/Oﬁ’ 1 :

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID.ITEM: CITY VEHICLES
BID.‘DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID #2008-211 .
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

" GROUP Il PICKUP TRUCKS

CASA FORD, INC.

DICK POE DODGE, LP

(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX
‘ ICKUP- (CONTINUED) :
OPTIONAL ITEM:PRICING (GROUP 11, 1/2 TON REGULAR | EXTENDED _
PICKUP'TRUCKS, ITEMS 4-6) CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 $290.00
POWER MIRRORS N/A N/A " N/A
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $187.00 $187.00 $187.00
REAR SEAT N/A STD STD
4WD $4,227.00 . $2,755.00 $3,465.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS. N/A $249.00 $249.00
HITCH $206.28 $206.28 $206.28
TOWING PACKAGE W/7 PIN ELECTRICAL $291.00 $291.00 $291.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 | $2,595.00 $2,595.00
‘LONG.BED $262.00 $2,915.00 N/A
INTEGRATED/FITTED BED-CAP, REGULAR BED $949.00 $949.00 $949.00
: ROLL'TOP BED COVER $947.92 $947.92 $947.92
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 17" DEEP $311.77 $311.77 $311.77

-COMMENTS

POWER WINDOWS, POWERLO
FACTORY POWER PKG - $826.00,

CKS AND POWER MIRRORS:

EL PASO, TX
REGULAR EXTENDED -
CAB CAB CREW CAB
. $184.48 $368.96 STD .
N/A N/A INCL
INCL INCL INCL
N/A INCL INCL
$2,887.00 | $2,471.00 $2,950.00
N/A N/A N/A
$180.00 $180.00 $180.00
$295.00 $295.00 $295.00
$2,200.00 | $2,200.00 $2,200.00
V-8 REQ
$1,300.00 N/A N/A
$995.00 $995.00 $995.00
$916.80 $916.80 $916.80
$312.00 $312.00 $312.00

V-8 ENGINE REQUIRED ON ALL 4WD

V-8 REQUIRED FOR REGULAR CAB LONG BED

4WD: ELECTRONIC SHIFT AVAILABLE OGN 4 51V8
6 SPD TRANS $876.00 UPCHARGE. 4WD OPTION
(REB. CAB) MANUAL SHIFT UPGRADE ELECTRONIC SHIET
$876.00 INCLUDES 4.6V8 3 VALVE, 6 SPD AUTO TRANS,

(3V) ENGINE
STD4.6V8

LONG BED ROLL TOP BED GOVER §947.09

SHORT BED ELECTRIC ROLL TOP BED COVER $1,695.54

LONG BED ELECTRIC ROLL TOP BED COVER $1,753.87

EXTENDED CABS ARE QUAD CAB PICKUPS

6 ’SPDAUTO

LONG BED: SUPERCAB

INCLUDES H.D. PAYLOAD, 5413,

CREW CABS ARE MEGA-CAB PICKUPS

G’ROUP-S%Ili%???F.'i-lC,KUEE?ETRUCK’S,??(AEERQXIMA’EE N

ITEM g

DESCRIPTION - UNIT PRICE
7. 13/4 TON REGULAR CAB $17,660.54 $17,435.95
YEARIVMAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. . F250 ‘RAM DH2L62L62
2. . 34TONEXTENDED CAB $19,519.54 $19,369.95
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL No. F250 RAN DH2L41

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST-VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

. . Y
APPROVED BY;

DATE: _ Q/‘f/oﬁ ‘ | éoos

-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

| R




BIDITEM: CITY VEHICLES
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID #2008.211

ERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

GROUP II: - PICKUP TRUCKS

CASA FORD, INC.

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL S

DICK POE DODGE, LP

FACTORY POWER PKG - $681.00

(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
34 P ' TRUCKS (CONTINUED)
CITEM ~___" - DESCRIPTION i UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
9 3/4 TON 4 DOOR CREW CAB - $20,797.54. $23,935.55
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. " . F250 RAM DH2H81
10. 3/4 TON WITH SERVICE BODY $22,510.34
REGULAR CAB - .
YEARIMAKE S 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
- IMODEL NO. . v F250 N/A
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP II, 3/4 TON REGULAR | EXTENDED SERVICE | REGULAR | EXTENDED SERVICE
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 7-10) CAB CAB CREW CAB BODY CAB CAB CREW CAB BODY
POWER WINDOWS $299.00 $299.00 |- $598.00 | $299.00 $312.16 $724.00 STD
POWER SEATS N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 $290.00 $170.00 $184.48 $368.96 STD
POWER MIRRORS N/A N/A N/A N/A “NIA N/A~ $88.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $320.00 $320.00 | $320.00 $320.00 $250.00 STD STD
REAR SEAT N/A STD STD N/A N/A STD ‘STD
~ 4WD $2,636.00 | $2,740.00 | $2.740.00 $2,740.00 || $2,816.00 | $2,739.00 $2,730.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS $427.00 .| $427.00 $427.00 | $427.00 ~ N/IA NI/A N/A
DIESEL ENGINE $5,723.00 | $5,723.00 $5,723.00 | $5,723.00 - $6,600.00 | $6,600.00
HITCH' $210.80 '$210.80 $210.80 $210.80 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL N/C N/IC N/C N/C $295.00 $295.00 $295.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 $2,595.00 $2,595.00 | $2,595.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 | $2,200.00
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SPOT STD STD ___STD STD N/A $88.00 $88.00
: ~ LONG BED N/C $170.00 $170.00 N/C STD $200.00 N/A
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX - $311.77 $311.77 $311.77 | $311.77 $312.00 $312.00 $312.00
ROLL TOP-BED-COVER $947.92° | " $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92
COMMENTS POWER WINDOWS, POWER LOCKS AND'POWER MIRRORS: {IEXTENDED CABS ARE QUAD CAB PICKUPS

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUEPROCUREMENT. OTHER FA

APPROVED BY:; 73@

DATE; ‘?/ ‘//Df :

2008

CTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

CREW CABS ARE 'MEGA-CAB' BICKUPS
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

|BIDTEN: CITY, VEHIGLES —
'BlD:DATE': AUGUST 20, 2008'v'

BID #2008-211T

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION -

| GROUPII; .PICKUP TRUCKS

CASA FORD, INC.

DICK POE DODGE, LP

IIFACTORY POWER PKG - $681.00

(APPROXIMATELY-:&O’ PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PICKUP'TR (CONTINUED) .
ITEM iK ' DESCRIFTION — . UNIT PRICE - "UNIT PRICE
5 P PR - ONE TON REGULAR CAB $18,287.54 $25,270.35
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE.
MODEL NO. F350 RAM D13L62
12 . ' ONE TON EXTENDED CAB. $20,428.54 $26,813.50
YEAR/MAKE - 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NoO. - F350 RAM D13L41
13, ONE TON 4 DOOR CREW CAB .$21,597.54 $32,205.25
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD. 2009 DODGE
.IMODEL No. T _ F350 ' RAM D13L41
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP Il, ONETON REGULAR | EXTENDED REGULAR | EXTENDED
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 11-13) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS $299.00 $299.00 $598.00 $312.16 $724.00 STD
POWER SEATS N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
'POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 $290.00 $184.48 $368.96 STD
POWER MIRRORS N/A N/A N/A N/A N/C $88.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $320.00 $320.00 $320.00 STD STD STD
‘REAR SEAT N/A STD __STD N/A STD STD
4WD $2,731.00 | $2,741.00 $2,737.00 $2,704.00 | $2,459.00 $2,650.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS $427.00 $427.00 $427.00 N/A N/A __NIA
HITCH $210.80 $210.80 $210.80 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL N/C N/C NIC $242.00 $242.00 $242.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 | $2,595.00 $2,595.00 $2,200.00 | $2,200.00 | $2,200.00
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SPOT STD STD STD N/A N/C $88.00
‘DUAL REAR WHEELS $626.00 $594.00 $1,040.00 STD STD STD
LONG BED N/C $170.00 $170.00 STD STD STD
DIESEL ENGINE $5,723.00. | $5,723.00 $5,723,00 STD STD STD
, (AVAILABLE IN DIESEL-ENGINE ONLY)
DUAL ALTERNATORS. $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 N/A N/A N/A
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX $311.77 $311.77 $311.77 $312.00 $312.00 $312.00
ROLL TOP BED COVER $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 $947.92 |
COMMENTS POWER WINDOWS, POWER LOCKS AND POWER MIRRORS: EXTENDED CABS ARE QUAD CAB PIGKUPS

I

CREW CABS ARE MEGA CAB PICKUBS

NOTE: THIS'IS A BEST VALU}_E PROCUREMENT..-_OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY; - é’

DATE:__ Q/‘/’/Ug l

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




‘ k L .
BID ITEM: CITY, VEHICLES .
|BID'DATE: "AUGUST 20, 2008

] _CITY.OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID # 2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

" : GROUP'll: PICKUP TRUCKS

. NOTE: THISIS A BEST VALU}::E PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY;

DATE; Q/‘//Uf’ ‘ ) 2008

-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

) (APPROXIMATELY'3O PER YEAR) CASA FORD, INC, DICK POE DODGE, LP
ONE TON PICKUP TRUCK-CAB AND CHASSIS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
. § (CONTINUED) - Oy :
ITEM - . 4 * DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE .
- 4. . ONE TON REGULAR CAB $19,085.54 . - $17,301.60
' : i CAB AND CHASSIS
|YEARIMAKE i - 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO, B F350- RAM DC8L63
15. . : 'ONE TON EXTENDED CAB $21,087.54 $19,384.10
‘ 1 CABAND CHASSIS
YEAR/MAKE . i ' 2009 FORD 2009 DODGE
"|MODEL No. F350 RAM QUAD CAB DC3L43
16. : .| ONETON CREW CAB $21,982,50 ' X
| : 4 CABAND CHASSIS 4 |
YEAR/MAKE : 2009 FORD - N/A i
MODEL NO. N ‘ , . F350 . ;i
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP Il, ONE TON PICKUP REGULAR | EXTENDED 'REGULAR | EXTENDED ,
TRUCKS - CABIAND CHASSIS, ITEMS 14-16) CAB. 'CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS $299.00 $299.00 $598.00 A A
POWER SEATS N/A NJA N/A N/A N/A
POWER LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 $290.00 A A
POWER MIRRORS N/A ‘N/IA N/A A A |
-CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $320.00 $320.00 $320.00 STD STD
REAR STREET N/A STD STD N/A STD
4AWD " $2,684.00 | $2,676.00 $2,618.00 $2,500.00 | $2,500.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS $427.00 $427.00 $427.00 N/A N/A
: * HITCH SEE BELOW NOTATION $190.00 _$190.00
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL SEE BELOW NOTATION $250.00 $250.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE SEE BELOW NOTATION N/A N/A
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SPOT- STD ] STD | STD A A
(DUAL REAR WHEELS) ARE STD ON THIS QUOTATION
DIESEL ENGINE $5,432.00 | $5,432.00 | $5.432.00 $8,310.00 | $8,310.00
: (DIESEL ENGINE ONLY):
_DUAL ALTERNATORS $315.00 | $315.00 | $315.00 N/A N/A

~,




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

'[BIDTTEN: CITY VERICLES.
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID #2008-211

:"GROUP II: "PICKUP TRUCKS

(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) CASA FORD, INC.
ONE TON PICKUP: TRUCKS-CAB AND-CHASSIS. EL PASO, TX
S (CONTINUED)‘ . B
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP Il, ONE TON PICKUP - REGULAR | EXTENDED
TRUCKS - CAB'AND CHASSIS, ITEMS 14-1 6)- CAB CAB CREW CAB
. 9'FLAT BED WITH WOOD FLOOR $2,815.00 | $2,815.00 | $2.815.00

9" FLAT BED WITH-STEEL FLOOR

$2,815.00 | $2,815.00 | $2,815.00

11" FLAT BED WITH WOOD ‘FLOOR

$3,226.00 | $3,226.00 $3,226.00

11' FLAT BED WITH-STEEL FLOOR

$3,226.00 | $3,226.00 3,226.00

12' STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48"
REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES-WITH STEEL FLOOR

(40" REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES)
$4,646.00 | $4,646.00 | $4,646.00 °

12! STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48"
REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES WITH WOOD FLOOR
14' STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48"
REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES WITH STEEL FLOOR

- (40™REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES)
$4,646.00 | $4,646.00 | $4,646.00
~ (40" REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES)
$5,786.00 | $5,786.00 | $5,786.00

14 STAKE-BED WITH STANDA_RD 42"-48"
REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES WITH WOOD FLOOR

(40" REMOVABLE STEEL SIDES)
$5,786.00 ‘| $5,786.00 $5,786.00

$8,225.00 | $8,225.00 $8,225.00

3/4 YARD DUMP BODY-

L

COMMENTS

1,000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE PART OF UPFITTER PACKAGES

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
DICK POE DODGE, LP

EL PASO, TX
- REGULAR | EXTENDED:

CAB CAB CREW CAB.
N/A N/A

$2,147.00 | $2,147.00
N/A N/A .

$2,627.00 | $2,627.00

$4,080.00 | $4,080.00 ™
N/A N/A

$4,760.00 | $4,760.00
N/A N/A
N/A N/A

DUAL REAR WHEELS ARE STANDARD ON THIS QUOTATION

POWER WINDOWS, POWER LOCKS AND POWER MIRRORS:
FACTORY POWER PKG - $681.00,

POWER WINDOWS, LOCKS AND MIRRORS ARE IN (A)

ONEPRICE IS $458.00

HITCH & TOW PACKAGE W7 PiN ELEGTRIGAL PROV!DED
BY UPFITTER PART OF BODY PACKAGES

STD STEEL STAKES ARE 40" HIGH

14! STAKE BODY ONLY AVAILABLE ON E450-F550 TRUCKS

3/4 YARD DUMP RECOMMENDED ON F550 WiTH 19,500 #GVWR
3 YARD WET SAND = 97204

ALTERNATE BID FOR 14" STAKE AND 3/4 YD DUMP:

" 2009 FORD F450, 189" WHEEL BASE, DIESEL, AUTOMATIC,

- AIC, REG. CAB, 15,000 #GVWR =$30 037.30/EA
. . 2009 FORD F550, 165" WHEEL BASE, DIESEL, AUTOMATIC,

|__-AIC, REG, CAB, 19,500 #GVWR = $32.042 30/EA

JATTACHMENTS: BODY UPFIT SPECS, ADDITIONAL

ACCESSORIES PRICING CLARK TRK EQUIP & FABCO.

ALL CAB AND CHASSIS ARE STD W/DUAL WHEELS

ER¥YEAR

. \GROUP:IIFEA] NlMALT RANSPORT:VAN(A RRROXIMA’:FEE 5P

T ITEM DESCRIPTION. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1, ' ANIMAL TRANSPORT VAN NO'BID NO BID
: . 34TON .
YEARIMAKE ' : NO BID
MODEL NO,

NOTE: THISIIS A BEST VALUE RROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESleS PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. -

£

APPROVED BY: ZJQJ

T)ATE: Q/‘f/()??

' 2008-211°CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION




BID lTEM CITY: VEHICLES

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE AUGUST 20, 2008

BID #2008-211

)

GROUP Il ANIMAL TRANSPORT VAN
(APPROXIMATELY 5 PER YEAR) (CONTINUED)

OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP Il ANIMAL -

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION'

CASA FORD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE, LP
EL PASO, TX

TRANSPORT VAN, ITEM 1) 3/4 TON. 3/4 TON .
POWER WINDOWS NO BID
POWER LOCKS NO BID
POWER MIRRORS NO BID.
__CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID
REAR:DOOR WINDOWS NO-BID
' REAR AND:SIDE DOOR WINDOWS NO BID
SLIDING SIDE DOOR NO BID
GROUPV:: VANS{APPROXIMATELY: ) PER'YEAR)'=:CARGOVANS - :
ITEM ' ___DESCRIPTION _ UNIT PRICE - UNlT PRICE
1. "~ 1/2TON CARGO '$16,505.98 NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL NO. - E150
2. ' ' ~ . 3/4TONCARGO $18,107.98 NO BID
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL. NO.- E250
3. . ONETONCARGO $19,272.98 - NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD .
MODEL NO. E350
-OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV VANS, [TEWS 1-3) 1/2 TON -3/4 TON ONETON 12TON -| 3/4TON ONE TON
POWER WINDOWS - $299.00 $299.00 $299.00
POWER LOCKS . $290.00 $290.00 $290.00
POWER MIRRORS - N/A N/A N/A
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL _ $199.00 $199.00 $199.00
_ROOF MOUNTED LADDER RACKS $581.78 $581.78 $581.78
~ REAR DOOR WINDOWS . $50.00 $50.00 $50.00

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: ZC/&*

DATE:. ‘ Q/L//Uf [ ' 2008-211 CITY'VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

.




BIDITEM; CITY:VEHICLES - -
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID #2008-211

GROUP IV: 'VANS - CARGO-VANS

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CASA FORD, INC.

DICK POE DODGE, LP

V ‘ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 10 PER YEAR) (CONTINUED) '
"OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROURTV: 'VANS, ITEMS1-3) 1/2TON 3/4 TON ONE TON 1/2TON 3/4 TON ONE TON
___* "REAR AND:SIDE DOOR WINDOWS - -$108.00 $108.00 $108.00 '
SLIDING SIDE DOOR $83.00 $83.00 $83.00
__*BULKHEAD $438.51 $438.51 $438.51
INTERIQR RACKS AND BINS N/C N/C N/C
EXTENDED VAN $870.00° | $1,000.00 $809.00 |
o INTERIOR RACKS AND BII CTORYRACKS &BINSNIC
: . ROOF MOUNTED [ADBER : DOUBLE LADDER QUOTED, 3 RAIL
COMMENTS - LAD_D.EB CK $296. : DOUBLE LADDER 1 DROP DOWN $1,096.00
! WER LOCKS, POWER MIRRORS: POWER
g 556.00 WIND /MIRRORS. :
PASSENGERIVAN
___" % TDESCRIPTION. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4. : 1/2 TON PASSENGER (8 PAX) $18,466.98 NO BID
'|YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD "
MODEL NO, E150
5 3/4.TON PASSENGER (12 PAX) $20,654,98 | | NO BID
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL NO. E350
6. ONE TON PASSENGER (15.PAX) $22,562.98 NO BID
YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL NO. - T ; "~ E350
' OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV VANS- ]
PASSENGER VANS, ITEMS 1.3) 112 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON 112 TON 314 TON ONE TON
POWER WINDOWS $299.00 $299.00 $299.00
POWER SEATS N/A NA | NA
POWER'LOCKS $170.00 $170.00 $170.00
POWER MIRRORS N/A N/A N/A

NOTE: THISIS A BEST VALUE'PROCUR_EMENT-. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL.BE CONSIDERED.

'

APPROVED BY;_

el dlog

2008

-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET-DIVISION

T




CITY O E:.E__L PASO BID TABULATION
BID. ITEM CITY. VEHICLES ’

. o - ’ ' BID #2008-211
BID DATE AUGUST 20, 2008 - : ‘

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
CASA FORD, INC. _ DICK POE DODGE, LP
GROUP v: VANS PASSENGER VANS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 10 PER YEAR) (CONTINUED)
~ORTIONALITEM PRICING (GROUP IV: VANS - v
" PASSENGER VANS, ITEMS 1:3) 1/2 TON 3/4TON" | -ONETON 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $199.00 $199.00 $199.00
SLIDING SIDE DOOR N/C N/C N/C
" REAR A/C $685.00 - $685.00 N/C
. OPTIONAL: REAR STEP BUMPER .
: 141.00 141.00 141.00 i
COMMENTS ITEI\;I$ 5: FORD HAS JO alfPASSENGER VJ\N i PASS. IS E350. .
) POWER WINDOWS AND POWER LOCKS: FACTORY POWER LOCKS.
. IAND WINDOWS $411.00 -
'ANS-‘ f?'MINI VA_N§
" DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
A A : MINI CARGO VAN NO BID . $17,572.00
YEAR/IMAKE . . " NOBID - ’ 2009 DODGE
MODEL No. - - . GRAND CARAVAN RTKE53
8. “MINI PASSENGER VAN . $25,867.90 $19,405.10
YEAR/MAKE . - 2009 FORD . 2009 DODGE
MODEL NO. ' FLEX GRAND CARAVAN RTKH53
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV: VANS - - : '
MINI VANS, ITEMS 7-8) . CARGO | PASSENGER CARGO | PASSENGER o~
POWER WINDOWS : 'NO BID STD STD STD 1
POWER LOCKS NO BID STD STD STD
POWER MIRRORS NO BID STD STD STD
POWER SEATS NO BID STD N/A N/A
CRUISE CONTROLITILT WHEEL NO BID STD
REAR AND SIDE WINDOWS NO BID N/A STD N/A
BULKHEAD NO BID N/A $1,368.29 N/IA
RACKS AND BINS NO BID N/A ‘ N/A
COMMENTS ITEM 8: FORD FLEX IS TERMED CROSSOVER EQUAL TO |RACKS AND BINS INCLUDES BULKHEAD WITH DOOR
CHEVY UPLANDER :

NOTE: THISIS A EEST VALUE PROCUREMENT: OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CQNSIDERED. :

APPROVED BY

DATE: Q/LP/W : . ( '2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 10




BIDITEM: .CITY VEHICLES _

~_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID #2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

CASA FORD, INC. DICK POE DODGE, LP
GROUPV: SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES (SUVs) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 1. PER YEAR)
ITEM . ) - 'DESCRIPTION . UNIT PRICE -UNIT PRICE"
1, . SMALL SiZE $18,931.74 NO BID
“[YEARIMAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL NO. ESCAPE
2, MEDIUM SIZE $20,755.90 NO BID -
YEAR/MAKE 2009 FORD
MODEL NO. EXPLORER
' OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP V; SPORT MEDIUM- MEDIUM
_UTILITY VEHICLES -SUVs, ITENS 1-2) SMALL SIZE SIZE SMALL SIZE SIZE
'POWER SEATS "STD 'STD ’
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD STD
HITCH $293.00 $234.00
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELEGTRICAL ‘INCLUDED WITH HITCH
4WD $1,592.00 | $2,110.00
GROQUP:VI: 1‘HYBRIDS'-(APBRQXIMA5FE"')ﬁfisoﬁPERf%_Y:;EAR)‘i i
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN NO BID NO BID -
YEAR/MAKE NO BID
MQDEL NO.
2. " MIDSIZE SEDAN . NO BID NO-BID
YEAR/MAKE NO BID
MODEL NO. - '

iNOTE: THIS'IS A BEST VALUE-PRCCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY: Zf@ .

DATE:_ il iz {2 & ) 2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION:-

11

P




Cl'ITY OF EL. PASO BID TABULATION

_|BIDITEM: CITYVEHICLES
" |BID: DATE AUGUST20 2008

BID # 2008-211 . '
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DlVlSlON

GROUP VI:.

-'~.

CASA FORD, INC.

DICK POE DODGE, LP

L,

: HYBRIDS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY 1 PER YEAR) (CONTINUED) . |
ITEM T DESCRIPTION T "UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
. T
‘3. COMPACT-SUV i $27,289.74 NO-BID
[YEARWIAKE I 2009 FORD
MODEL'NO. - ; ] ESCAPE-
4 ;  FULLSIZE Suy NO BID NO BID
YEARIMAKE ' NO BID
MODEL NO. ~
5A. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLES f_ NO BID NO BID
~__ (IF REQUIRED)
YEARIMAKE T NO BID
MODEL NO." |
= : ' 1
5B. "OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE % NO BID NO BID
(IF REQUIRED) -
YEAR/MAKE ' NO BID
MODEL NO. § :
5C. ' OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE | NO BID NO BID
(IF REQUIRED) i
YEARIMAKE S ] NO BID
MODEL NO. R '
S OPTIONAL [TEN'PRICING COMPACT/ | COMPACT | FULL SIZE COMPACT/ | COMPACT | FULL SIZE
_(GROUP VI: HYBRIDS, ITEMS 1.5€) ‘MID-SIZE Suv Suv OTHER MID-SIZE SuV Suv OTHER
POWER SEATS R ) NO BID STD NO BID NO BID
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID- STD NO BID NO BID
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH ”-NO BID STD NO BID NO BID

" NOTE: THIS ISA BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT OTHER FACTC

APPROVED BY:

9/4/0? '_

DATE:

20.08-2|'_11'CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

)RS BESIDES PRICE WILL'BE CONSIDERED.

12




_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BIDTTE: CITY VEFIGIES-

BID # 2008-211

|BID DATE: AUAGUS'AT 20;'2008

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION |

CASA FORD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE, LP
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY, AT TS SOL’EDISPRETION,'MAY EXERCISE ANY_:OP'I;ION TO EXTEND THE .
TERM OF THE AGREEMENT BY'GIVING 'THE.CQNTRAC'_I'.OR'WRIITEN NOTICE WITHIN:.

THE TIME PERIOD'NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACTFOR: : =~ "% -~ S '

4

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM.OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE ORTION IS
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED,

VEHICLE PRICING WILL BE REVIEWED ON PP]
UPFITTER REQUEST PRICE ADJUSTMENT BASED

ON STEEL, FUEL, TRANSPORTATION.

X
- [x]
]

o
[X]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

- |BIDDERS PROMISED DELlVERY:

45 TO 120. CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

120 CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIEY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. QTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 47‘;/0'(? T 2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

13
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- CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: -CITY. VEHICLES o
BID-DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

. BID #2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DlVlSION

CONTROL NOT AVAILABLE ON BASE COBALT

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
GROUP:I: AUTOMOBILES: EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
' (APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) :
ITEM | " DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. ' COMPACT SEDAN, 4-DOOR. $15,672.00 $14,119.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE" 2009 CHEVY
MOQEL NO. CALIBER -COBALT
2, : lNTERMEDlATE SEDAN, 4-DOOR $17,354.00 - $18,077.00
YEAR/MAKE 2009 CHRYSLER 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. SEBRING MALIBU
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING
(GROUP | - AUTOMOBILES, ITEMS 1- 2) COMPACT | INTERMEDIATE COMPACT INTERMEDIATE .
____POWER SEATS NA ] ~INCL STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL INCL INCL STD .
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH INCL INCL STD
STATION-WAGON INCL -N/A N/A N/A
COMMENTS REPAIR MANUALS $250,00 FOR EACH VERICLE TILT WHEEL STANDARD ON COBALT, POWER SEATS

GROUP II: "PICKUP TRUCKS{APPROXIVIATELY 30 PERYEAR) =

ONE TIME CHARGE (2 PER VEHICLE)
TP 7

-

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. ' COMPACT REGULAR CAB NO BID $14,952.00
|YEARIMAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODELNO. & COLORADO
2  COMPACT EXTENDED CAB $15,655.00 $16,326.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
NMODEL No. DAKOTA EXT CAB COLORADO
E ' COMPACT 4 DOOR CREW CAB: -$17,718.00 $18,093.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. DAKOTA CREW CAB COLORADO

NOTE: THIS ISA BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT OTHER' FACTORS BESIDES PRICE’ WlLL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:

o /4lo8 i

2008-211 CITY'VEH'IOL'ES- GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

14




BIDITEM: CITY. VEHICLES

CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BIDDATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID #2008-211
DEPARTMENT GENERAL SERVlCES FLEET DIVlSlON

" GROUP II: PICKUP TRUCKS

—

APPROVED BY‘ i

‘7/4/07?’ |

.DATE: :

‘NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
: (CONTINUED) - . '
OPTIONAL ITEM'PRICING - R “REGULAR | EXTENDED. 'REGULAR. | EXTENDED
_(GROUP Il, COMPACT PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 1-3) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS. /I INCL INCL $400.00 PKG | $400.00 PKG STD
POWER SEATS \ / N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
POWER LOCKS N\ / INCL. INCL PKG. PKG STD
_POWER MIRRORS . \ _/ INCL INCL PKG PKG STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL \/ INCL INCL STD STD STD
4WD /\ $3,873.00 | $2,696.00 $3,208.00 | $3,020.00 | $3,545.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS / \ INCL INCL N/A N/A N/A
INTEGRATED/FITTED BED CAP / \ | $1,122.00 $1,120.00 | $1,019.00 | $1,019.00 | $1,019.00
ROLL TOP BED COVER / \ | $917.00 $917.00 $1,017.00 | $1,017.00 | $1,017.00
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 13" DEEP $255.00 $255.00 $295.00 $295.00 $295.00
COMMENTS REPAIR MANUALS FOR THESE VEHICLES IN CD FORMAT
R . 2 COPIES $250 00 TOTAL (ONE T )
GROUPII: "PICKUP-TRUCKS (APPROXIMATEL R ‘PICK : T
ITEM * |- . DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
A ~ “1/2 TON REGULAR CAB $1 8,484.00 $16,237.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO." RAM 1500 REG CAB SILVERADO
5, 1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB NO BID $18,307.00
YEAR/IMAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. SILVERADO
6. 1/2 TON 4 DOOR CREW CAB: "$21,453.00 $21,291.00
YEARI/MAKE 2009 DODGE: 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. R : A RAM 1500 CREW-CAB SILVERADO
" OPTIONAL ITEM:PRICING (GROUP I, 1/2 TON ‘REGULAR | EXTENDED " REGULAR | EXTENDED
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 4-6) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS $735.00 INCL $475.00 PKG | $475.00 PKG | $475.00 PKG
POWER SEATS N/A N/A $220.00. $220.00 | $220.00

- 15




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

-|BIDITEM: CITY VEHICLES .~
BID: DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID # 2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DlVlSlON'

" GROUP Il: PICKUP TRUCKS MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLG
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
T (CONTINUED) : ~ :
OPTIONAL ITEM.PRICING (GROUP 11,1/2 TON REGULAR EXTENDED : REGULAR EXTENDED
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 4-6) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW.CAB
. 'POWER LOCKS INCL /| $190.00 PKG PKG PKG
POWER MIRRORS INCL [\ /1 INCL PKG PKG PKG
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL INCL \ / INCL $200.00 $200.00 .| $200.00
REAR SEAT N/A \ / INCL N/A STD STD
4WD $3,009.00 \/ $3,531.00 $2,882.00 | $3,870.00 | $2,790.00
(40/20/40 SPLIT) (40/20/40 SPLIT)
FRONT BUCKET SEATS N/A \ / N/A N/A N/A N/A
" HITCH INCL X INCL - $185.00 $185.00 $185.00
TOWING PACKAGE WI7 PIN'ELECTRICAL $335.00 /\ $335.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 [\ $2,595.00 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00
-LONG BED $300.00 / \ N/A $357.00 $270.00 N/A
- INTEGRATED/FITTED-BED CAP, REGULAR BED $1,160.00 | / \ T $1,160.00 $1,049.00 | $1,049.00 | $1,049.00
ROLL TOP BED COVER $917.00° [/ \ | $917.00 $1,048.00 | $1,048.00 | $1,048.00
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX, 17" DEEP- $312.00 $312.00 | , $360.00 $360.00 $360.00
: IF YOU DO'NOT REQUIRE A LONG BED OR4 WHEEL DRIVE THE

RAM 1500 REG CAB COMES-WITH A 3.7L V6 ENGINE. THE PRICE

MODEL NO.

WOULD BE $17,583.00.
, THE OPTIONS OF TWO HITCH-POWER AND CRUISE CONTROL
,C'OM-MENTS WOULD BE THE SAME.
‘ IREPAIR MANUALS FOR BOTH VERICLES, 3 COPIES WilT BE
‘[$250.00 TOTAL -
GROUP: .'?=?3?PICKUP TRUCKS (APPROXIMATEL 30:PERYYEAR)#" 'Ti.O,N.PlCKUP T, UCKS: R
" ITEM. DESCRIPTION" ' ' “UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE '
T 3/4 TON REGULAR CAB $17,792.00 $18,155.00 ,
YEAR/MAKE 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. RAM 2500 REG CAB SILVERADO 2500 HD
8. 314 TON EXTENDED CAB NO BID $20,508.00
YEARIMAKE - 2009 CHEVY
SILVERADO 2500 HD

NOTE: THISIS A BEST VALUF;Z PROCUREMENT." OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PR(_CEVWILL BE CONSIDERED. -

APPROVED BY:

67/&//0-5’

DATE:__

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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' CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BIDITEM: CITY VEHICLES - . BID # 2008-211
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008 - _ DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
GROUP II: PICKUP TRUCKS MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
(APPROXIMATELY‘ 30.PER YEAR) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
K P UP TR CK (CONTINUED)
ITEM _|. - - - % ° DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE - UNIT PRICE
9, 3/4 TON 4 DOOR -CREW CAB $19,671.00 $21,316.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE- 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. RAM 2500 CREW CAB SILVERADO 2500 HD
10. 3/4 TON WITH SERVICE BODY $27,206.00 - $23,288.00
REGULAR CAB
YEARIMAKE o - . 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL No. - , R RAM 2500 WITH SERVICE BODY REG CAB SILVERADO 2500 HD
OPTIONAL ITEM;PRICING (GROUP 1I, 3/4 TON REGULAR | EXTENDED SERVICE | REGULAR | EXTENDED SERVICE
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 7-10) - CAB CAB CREW CAB BODY | caB CAB CREW CAB BODY
POWER WINDOWS $500.00 /| $616.00 $500.00 || $736.00 PKG | $800.00 PKG | $475.00 PKG | $736.00 PKG
POWER SEATS N/A \ / N/A N/A $220.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00
POWER LOCKS: INCL \ / INCL INCL PKG PKG " PKG PKG
POWER MIRRORS INCL \ / INCL INCL PKG PKG PKG PKG
CRUISE CONTROLITILT WHEEL $250.00 \ / $250.00 $250.00 $200.00 - | $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
REAR SEAT NA [V INCL N/A NIA STD STD N/A
. 4WD $2,866.00 \ / $3,290.00 | $2,866.00 | $2,788.00 $2,788.00 | $2,788.00 | $2,788.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS ___NIA \/ N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
DIESEL ENGINE - $7,500.00 X $7,500.00 | $7,500.00 | $6,216.00 | $6,216.00 ° $6,216.00 | $6,216.00
(INCL IN TOW PKG) (INCL'IN»TQW PKG) | (INCL IN TOW PKG) | :
. HITCH , INCL / \ INCL INCL $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $260.00
_ TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL " $335.00 / $335.00 $335.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $65.00
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE - $2,595.00 / $2,595.00 | $2,595.00. | $2,300.00% | $2,300.00 $2,300.00* | $3,000.00%*
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SPOT ~$100.00 | / $100.00 $100.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00
» 'LONG BED INCL / $840.00 INCL . INC INC INC INC
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX © $312.00 $312.00 $312.00 $360.00 $360.00 . | $360.00 N/A
ROLL.TOP BED COVER $948.00 $917.00 $948.00: || $1,050.00 | $1,050.00 | $1,050.00 N/A
; REPAIR MANUALS FOR BOTH VEHICLES, Z COPIES WILL BE $250.00 |* EXTENDABLE CAMPER STYLE MIRRORS (FACTORY)
COMMENTS TOTAL FOR ALL VEHICLES. B WITH CONVEX MIRROR
‘ VEHICLES ONLY COME WITH VINYL SEATS, MAYBE ABLE TG * 1000 LB TOMMY LIFT #60-1040TP PICK UP MOUNT
ORDER CLOTH WHEN ORDERING TIME COMES. 7~ 1800 LB TUCK-A-WAY LIFT MOUNTED ON UTILITY BOBY

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROGUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY;_

7

DATE:__ 7/‘7‘/0}3’ | ’

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES.-.GENERAI,. SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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ClTY OF EL: PASO BID TABULATION

BlD ITEM: CITYVEHICLES o
BID -DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008

BID # 2008-211

DEPARTMENT GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DlVlSlON : .

GROUP Il PICKUP TRUCKS
(APPROXIMATELY 30 PER YEAR)

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

COMMENTS

VEHICLE ONLY COMES WITH VINYL SEATS., MAY BE ABLETO

ORDER CLOTH WHEN WE ORDER;

MP_LQKUHM (CONTINUED) EL PASO, TX -EL PASO, TX"
ITEM - DESCRIPTION ' UNIT PRICE ‘UNIT PRICE
11. _ ONE TON RE_GULAR_ CAB $25,836.00 $17,918.00
YEAR/MAKE: 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. RAM 3500 REG CAB SILVERADO 3500 HD
12. _ ONE TON EXTENDED CAB NO BID $20,945.00 :
. . TN
YEARIMAKE 2009 CHEVY a
MODEL NO. SILVERADO 3500 HD
13, ONE TON 4 DOOR CREW CAB $26,970.00 $22,274.00
YEARIMAKE K 2009 DODGE" 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO., " -~ RAM 3500 CREW CAB SILVERADO 3500 HD
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP 1], ONE TON REGULAR [ EXTENDED REGULAR | EXTENDED
PICKUP TRUCKS, ITEMS 11-13) CAB CAB CREW CAB CAB CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS $700.00 |\ $700,00 $736.00 PKG | $800.00 PKG | $667.00 PKG
POWER SEATS. NIA \ / N/A $220.00 $220.00 $220.00
POWER LOCKS. _INcL / -INCL PKG PKG PKG
POWER MIRRORS INCL \ / INCL - PKG PKG . PKG
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $250.00 \ / $250.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
REAR SEAT N/IA \ / INCL N/A INC INC
4WD $2,759.00 \ / $2,929.00 $3,385.00 $2,790.00 $2,520.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS NIA \ / N/A NIA N/A NIA
HITCH INCL \/ INCL $184.00 PKG | $184.00 PKG | $184.00 PKG
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL $275.00 )y $275.00 PKG PKG PKG
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 [\ $2,595.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SFOT $100.00 [\ $100.00 $145.00 $145.00 $145.00
_ ' / \ (4WD ONLY)
DUAL REAR WHEELS INCL INCL $520.00 $550.00 $275.00
LONG BED INCL / \ [ $1,062.00 STD STD STD
DIESEL ENGINE INCL / \ INCL $6,216.00 $6,216.00 $6,216.00
DUAL ALTERNATORS N/A / \ N/A $216.00 $216.00 $216.00
FULL BED WITH LOCKING TOOL BOX $312.00 |/ ~ \| "$312.00 $359.00 $359.00 $359.00
ROLL TOP BED COVER $948.00 \|  $917.00 $1,030.00 $1,030.00 $1,030.00
REPAIR MANUALS FOR BOTH VEHICLES, 2 COPIES WILL BE $250.00 TOTAL |[1000 LB TOMMY LIFT 60-1040TP PICKUP BED MOUNT

NOTE: THISIS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED

APPROVED BY:

9/4/03’

DATE:

" 2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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_CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[EIOTTEN: CITY VEFIGLES
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008 .

BID # 2008-211 ; '
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

.GROUP II: PICKUP TRUCKS
(APPROXIMATELY .30 PER YEAR)
ONE TON PICKUP TRUCK-CAB AND CHASSIS

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES.PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY;

DATE: Q/‘#/

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(CONTINUED) - .
~ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
14. ONE TON REGULAR CAB $19,376.00 $19,437.00
* CAB AND CHASSIS
YEAR/MAKE B I 2009 DODGE . 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. . REGULAR CAB C-A-60" SILVERADO 3500 HD (84" CAB TO AXLE)
' !
15. ONE TON EXTENDED CAB NO BID $21,860.00
' CAB AND CHASSIS
YEAR/MAKE - 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NoO. SILVERADO 3500 HD
16. . ONETON 4 DOOR CREW CAB $21,451.00 $21,747.00
: " CAB-AND CHASSIS , '
YEAR/MAKE y ' ' 2009 DODGE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. - S ' CREW CAB C-A-60" SILVERADO 3500 HD -
"' OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP I, ONE TON PICKUP REGULAR' | EXTENDED REGULAR | EXTENDED
‘ TRUCKS - CAB'AND CHASSIS, ITEMS 14-16) CAB " __CAB CREW CAB - CAB CREW CAB
POWER WINDOWS .$520.00. /1 $520.00 $800.00 PKG | $667.00 PKG
POWER SEATS N/A \ / NIA $220.00 | $220.00
POWER LOCKS. INCL |\ / INCL PKG PKG
POWER MIRRORS INCL \ / INCL PKG PKG
CRUISE CONTROLITILT WHEEL INCL N INCL $200.00 $200.00
REAR STREET N/A \ / INCL INC INC N
4AWD $2,950.00 \/ $2,950.00 $3,385.00 | $2,790.00 | $2,520.00
' T (40/20/40 SPLIT) (40120140 SPLIT)
FRONT BUCKET SEATS N/A N/A | N/A N/A N/A
HITCH INCL VAN INCL $495.00 PKG | $495.00 PKG | $495.00 PKG
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL $300.00 / .\ $300.00 PKG PKG PKG
1000 POUND CAPACITY LIFT GATE $2,595.00 / \ $2,595.00 $3,000.00 | $3,000.00 | $3,000.00
WEST COAST MIRRORS WITH CONVEX SPOT INCL / \ INCL $145.00 $145.00 $145.00
DIESEL ENGINE _$9,275.00 |/ \ | $9,275.00 $6,216.00 | $6,216.00 | $6,21 6.00
DUAL ALTERNATORS™ N/A \ N/A $216.00 $216.00 $216.00
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_ CITY OF EL PASO BID. TABULATION R

BID ITEM:- CITYJ:\IEHICLE‘S: BID #2008-211 - :

BID DATE: AUGUST 20,2008 ) . : DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
- o GROUP_H: PICKUP TRUCKS . ' . :
_(APPRQXIMATE_LY 30 PER YEAR) MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
ONE TON PICKUP TRUCKS-CAB AND CHASSIS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
. (CONTINUED) . _ .
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP i, ONE TON PICKUP REGULAR [ EXTENDED ' ‘ REGULAR | EXTENDED -
- TRUCKS - CABIAND CHASSIS, ITEMS 14-16) CAB . CAB CREW CAB " CAB CAB CREW CAB
- 9'FLAT BED'WITH WOOD FLOOR $4,468.00 j $4,468.00 $2,696.00 | $2,696.00 $2,696.00
9'FLAT BED WITH STEEL FLOOR . $3,316.00 | $3,316.00 _$2,796.00 | $2,796.00 | $2,796.00
11' FLAT BED WITH WOOD FLOOR $4,903.00 $4,903.00 $3,000.00 | $3,000.00 | $3,000.00
11" FLAT BED WITH STEEL FLOOR $3,606.00 $3,606.00 $3,100.00 | $3,100.00 | $3,100.00"
12" STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42°-48"
REMOVAL STEEL SIDES WITH STEEL FLOOR $4,697.00 : $4,697.00 $4,406.00 | $4,406.00 | $4,406.00 ~,
12" STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48" ' .
REMOVAL STEEL SIDES WITH WOOD FLOOR 1| $5,950.00 $5,950.00 $4,286.00 | $4,286.00 | $4,286.00
14" STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48"
REMOVAL STEEL SIDES WITH STEEL FLOOR N/A NIA , $5,404.00 | $5,404.00 | $5,404.00
- 14" STAKE BED WITH STANDARD 42"-48" -
REMOVAL STEEL SIDES WITH'WOOD FLOOR N/A ‘ N/A _ | $5,184.00 | $5,184.00 $5,184.00
3/4 YARD DUMP BODY $8,739.00 , $8730.00 | 1 $8,500.00 | $8,500.00 $8,500.00
‘ THE 11 AND 12 FOOT BED SIZES REQUIRE A CAB TO AXLE|1800 LB LIFT GATE
MEASUREMENT OF ‘84" 3/4 YARD DUMP BODY: OPTION FOR DUMP BODY -
FOR THIS VEHICLE THE OPTIONS WOULD BE THE SANE ~||SEMI AUTO/MANUAL ROLL TARP $1,160.00
COMMENTS AS THE REG CAB 60" BUT THE COST OF THE VEHICLE
' WOULD BE $19,658.00
. |[REPAIR MANUALS FOR BOTH VEHIGLES, 5 COPIES
: T : : WOULD BE $250.00 TOTAL ‘
G-ROU.P*HI-“f‘f'ANlMAlﬁ?é‘::'ERANS,PI:ORH"-S%NAN??(AR'EJROXIMATEE 5:PER:YEAR'
“ ITEM I = DESCRIPTION & "' B UNIT PRICE —
1, ANIMAL TRANSPORT VAN : NO BID $36,960.00
3/4.TON _ 4 : "
VEARINAKE : - ' ' 2 2009 CHEVY ™
MODEL NO. : - . EXPRESS 2500 :
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP I, ANIMAL '
TRANSPORT VAN, ITEM 1) 3/4TON . "3/4 TON
POWER WINDOWS - NO BID || $380.00 PKG
POWER LOCKS NOBID PKG
POWER MIRRORS . NO BID $92.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL " NOBID $316.00
" REAR'DOOR WINDOWS NO BID | $48.00
REAR AND:SIDE DOOR WINDOWS NO BID $104.00
SLIDING SIDE DOOR NO BID $120.00

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREM_ENT. O;I'HER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED. -

APPRQVED BY:_ /) % . .

DATE: 5]/ ‘//O(?' © 2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION : To20




CITY OF. EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: CITY VERICLES

‘BID # 2008-211
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008 ) DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION
MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
GROUP IlI: ANIMAL TRANSPORT VAN - EL PASO, TX. EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY. 5-PER YEAR) (CONTINUED) :
GROUB|V: -5555VANS (APPROXIMATE :
ITEM " DESCRIPTION T UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. .12 TON CARGQ NO BID $18,133.00
|
YEAR/MAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. EXPRESS 1500
2. ' 3/4 TON CARGO NO BID $17,603.00
YEARIMAKE . . 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. EXPRESS 2500
3. . ONETON CARGO NO BID $20,130.00
YEAR/MAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NoO. _ EXPRESS 3500
' OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV: VANS, ITEMS 1-3) 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ‘ONE TON
POWER WINDOWS $380.00 PKG | $380.00 PKG | $380.00 PKG
POWER LOCKS PKG PKG PKG
POWER MIRRORS $92.00 $92.00 $92.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $316.00 $316.00 $316.00
ROOF MOUNTED LADDER RACKS $340.00 $340.00 $340.00
REAR DOOR WINDOWS $48.00 $48.00 $48.00
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV: VANS, ITEMS 1-3) 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON
REAR AND SIDE. DOOR WINDOWS $104.00 $104.00 $104.00
SLIDING SIDE DOOR $120.00 $120.00 $120.00
BULKHEAD $468.00 $468.00 $468.00
INTERIOR RACKS AND BINS $1,550.00 | $1,550.00 | $1,550.00
EXTENDED VAN N/A $1,650.00 $785.00
2 LADDER LOCK DOWN RACK $670.00
COMMENTS

2 LADDER DROP DOWN RACK $1,260.00

RACK AND BIN PKG INCLUDES BULKHEAD

NOTE: THISIS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:;

9/4/08

DATE;,

‘ 2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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ClTY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

-1BID ITEM; CITYVEHICLES
BID DATE AUGUST 20,2008

BID #2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

Pt N

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV: VANS -~ PASSENGER. VANS
ITEM »' _DESCRIPTION” UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4. 1/2 TON PASSENGER (8 PAX) NO BID $18,930.00
YEAR/MAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO, EXPRESS 1500 .
5. 3/4 TON PASSENGER (12 PAX) NO BID $20,956.00
YEARIMAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. EXPRESS 2500
6. . 'ONE TON PASSENGER (15 PAX) NO BID $24,570.00
YEAR/MAKE 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. : EXPRESS 3500
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV; VANS -
-PASSENGER VANS, ITEMS 1-3) 1/2 TON 314 TON ONE TON 1/2 TON 3/4ATON .| ONETON |
POWER WINDOWS $380.00 PKG | $380.00 PKG | $380.00 PKG
POWER SEATS $220.00 | $220.00 $220.00 | (PER SIDE)
POWER LOCKS PKG PKG PKG ‘
POWER MIRRORS $92.00 $92.00 $92.00
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING (GROUP IV: VANS -
PASSENGER VANS, ITEMS 1-3) 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONETON 1/2 TON 3/4 TON ONE TON
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $316.00 $316.00 $316.00
SLIDING SIDE DOOR $120.00 $120.00 $120.00
REAR AIC $696. 00 S_TD
GROUPIV:EVANS:MINE YANS® e T T T e o
ITEM . DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRIGE
7. - MINI CARGO VAN $18,427.00
|YEARIMAKE 2009 DODGE N/A
MODEL NO. GRAND CARAVAN CARGO .

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

lAPPROVED BY: /W A
" DATE: 7/ %//M

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES ~GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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BID ITEM: CITY: VEHICLES

BID DATE: AUG}UST-‘Z'D,"ZOOB '

__ CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID #2008-211

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
‘GROUP IV:: VANS ~ MINI VANS
8. ‘MINI PASSENGER VAN $19,764.00
YEARIMAKE - 2009 DODGE N/A
MODEL NO. _ - GRAND CARAVAN PASSENGER
"~ OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING.(GROUP IV: VANS -
MINI VANS, ITEMS 7-8) CARGO | PASSENGER CARGO | PASSENGER
POWER WINDOWS - INCL INCL
POWER LOCKS INCL INCL
POWER MIRRORS INCL INCL
POWER SEATS 400 $400.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL INCL INCL
REAR AND SIDE WINDOWS INCL N/A
BULKHEAD- 420 N/A
RACKS AND BINS * N/A
"IN ORDER FOR ME TO QUOTE AN ACCURATE PRICE ON THE
IRACKS-AND BINS | NEED TO.KNOW EXACTLY WHAT YOU WANT -
COMMENTS HOW MANY RACKS, BINS, ETC. | WOULD SUGGEST $1,000.00 AS A .
N BUDGET ESTIMATE-ONLY: .
2'COPIES OF REPAIR MANUALS ON G5 FOR BOTI VEHIGLES
— - $250.00 TOTAL :
GROUP:V:#SRORTAUTIL Y:VEHICEESHSUV &
ITEM U _DESCRIPTION . UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. SMALL SIZE $16,991.00 $20,597.00 ’ \
YEAR/MAKE 2009 JEEP 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. COMPASS EQUINOX
2. MEDIUM SIZE $18,898.00 $20,208.00
YEAR/MAKE ~ 2009 JEEP 2009 CHEVY
MODEL NO. LIBERTY TRAIL BLAZER

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED,

APPROVED BY; @Q

ontes 9o

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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__UIIY OFEL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: CITY VEHICLES BID #2008-271 :
BID DATE: AUGUST 20, 2008 DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION ]
: MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
GROUP V: SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES-(SUVS) EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(CONTINUED) . . .
OPTIONAL ITEN PRICING (GROUP V: SPORT MEDIUM MEDIUM
UTILITY VEHICLES -SUVs, ITEMS 1-2) || SMALL size SIZE SMALL SIZE SIZE
POWER SEATS N/A $300.00 N/A STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL $250.00 | $250.00 STD STD
HITCH N/A INCL $280.00 PKG | STD
TOWING PACKAGE WITH 7 PIN ELECTRICAL N/A | $580.00 PKG -|  sTD v
4AWD ' $1,592.00 $1,495.00 _ $1,805.00 $1,970.00 ST
COMMENTS RE NUALS FOR BOTH VEHICLES (2 COPIES) TOTAL $250,00 S BULKHEAD WITH DOOR
GROUP':VI:'-»HYBRIDS?{('APP,ROX]MATE_E'?W?SO?PERNEAR """" T T
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN NO BID $22,324.00
JYEARIMAKE 2009 HONDA
MODEL NO, CIVIC
2. MIDSIZE SEDAN NO BID $23,836.00
YEARINAKE 2009 CHEVY
-IMODEL NO.™ MALIBU
s - COMPACTSUV NO BID
YEAR/MAKE ‘ ’ L
MODEL NO. . i
| 4. FULL SIZE suy NO BID $46,260.00
|YEARIVAKE 2009 CHEVY
-[MODEL No. TAHOE
5A. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLES NO BID
: (IF REQUIRED)" -
YEARIMAKE K -
MODEL NO,

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT, OTHER FACTQRS BESIDES PRICE WILL BE CQNSIDERED.

APPROVED BY:;

DATE: | ?/9‘ 18

2008-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION
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_CITY OF EL PASO.BID TABULATION

|BIDITENE: -CITY VERICLES
BID DATE: ‘AUGUST 20, 2008

BID # 2008-211

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE, LP

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET DIVISION

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

GROUP VI: HYBRIDS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(APPROXIMATELY; 30 PER YEAR) (CONTINUED) )
5B. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID
, S " {(IFREQUIRED)
YEARIMAKE -+ R
MODELNO. -~ £
5C. OTHER HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID
- : (IF REQUIRED)
YEAR/MAKE .
MODEL NO. - , o
OPTIONAL ITEM PRICING COMPACT/ | COMPACT | FULL SIZE | FULL SIZE | COMPACT SUY
(GROUP VI: HYBRIDS, ITEMS 1-5¢) MID-SIZE suv Suv OTHER COMPACT | MID-SIZE suv OTHER
POWER SEATS K N/A STD STD
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD STD STD |
FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD STD STD |

THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED GPTIONS,

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACTFOR: =~~~ - . C
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL .:YEARSVAT THE_' SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

THE CITY, AT ITS SOLE DISCRETIQQ{, MAY_»EXERC_ISE ANY'OPTION TO EXTEND THE
TERM OF THE AGREEMENT BY GIVING THE CONTRA,CTOR{WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN

"[ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS
OF THE'.ORIG_INAL TERM.OF THE CONTRACT.

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

[]

L]
X]

IS

XL [

BIDS SOLICITED: 35

- BIDS RECEIVED: 4

BIDS LOCAL:

NO OPTION OFFERED, A . .
: (OPTION FOR 2009 MODEL YEAR ONLY) (GENERAL MOTORS WILL GUARANTEE PRICING FOR ONE YEAR)

PAYMENT TERMS: - .- - 'NET-30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDERS PROMISED DELIVERY; » ' 120 CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS - 120 CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL,

A DELIVERY.DATE LATER THAN THE GIT;Y-‘SQRE'QUIRED DEL]VERY'MA_Y BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

18 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: THIS is A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. OTHER FACTORS BESIQES PRICE WILL BE CONSIDERED.

APPROVED BY;

owre G/4J08

2008

-211 CITY VEHICLES - GENERAL SERV(CES DEPART_MENT - FLEET DIVISION
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DICK,POE CHRYSLER PLYMOUTH
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SUNLAND PARK .
PONTIAC BUICK GMC
955 CROCKETT WAY
EL PASO, TX 79922

HOY FOX AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
7230 VISCOUNT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MACK MASSEY MOTORS
950 CROCKETT STREET
EL PASO, TX 79922

DRIVEWAY DODGE
8434 GATEWAY BLVD. E
EL PASO, TX 79907

ASMAR TRUCK EQUIPMENT
7713 ALAMEDA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

JACK KEY MOTORS

1840 N. MAIN
LAS CRUCES, NM 88001

BORMAN MOTOR COMPANY
470 W. BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

VAXWELL AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
2. 0. BOX 1004
TAYLOR, TX 76574

/ILLAGE AUTO GROUP
101 COUNTRY DELL
3ARLAND, TX 75040

DICK POE DEALERSHIPS
1363 AIRWAY BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MISSION CHEVROLET |
1316 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

RUDOLPH AUTOMOTIVE GROUP

5625 S. DESERT
EL PASO, TX 79932

BRAVO CHEVROLET
CADILLAC HUMMER
6555 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EL PASO HONDA
1490 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

B & D FABRICATING
391 N. 17™ STREET
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

WALLACE CHEVROLET

SOUTH MAIN & BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

SANDOVAL DODGE
ATTN: RUDY SANDOVAL
P. 0. BOX 608

LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

LAWRENCE MARSHALL
CHEVROLET

P. 0. BOX 983
HEMPSTEAD, TX 77445

GRANDE TRUCK SALES ~

11215 N. WEIDER ROAD

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78220

MIDWAY CHEVROLET
5915 MONTANA AVENUE
ELPASO, TX 79925

SHAMALEY FORD
11301 GATEWAY -BLVD. W
EL PASO, TX 79936

CASA FORD

ATTN: RICK KENLEY
5815 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

TRAVIS CRAWFORD BUICK
6800 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EXPRESSWAY FORD
5550 N. DESERT BLVD:
EL PASO, TX 79912

FABCO INDUSTRIES INC.
8406 SPRAGUE ROAD
ODESSA, TX 79764

SISBARRO BUIC, PONTIAC, GMC
425 W. BOUTZ ROAD
LAS CRUCES, NM 88004

VISION FORD LINCOLN-MERCURY
1500 S. WHITE SANDS BLVD.
ALAMOGORDO, NM 88310

LAWRENCE MARSHALL
DEALERSHIPS

P.O. BOX 11541
AUSTIN, TX 78711-1541

ENTERPRISE RENT-A-CAR

. ATTN:  JENNIFER JENNINGS

4115 N. MESA
EL PASO, TX 79902




CAPPS RENT-A-CAR INC.
ATTN: 5AM BRADING

8555 CARPENTER FREEWAY
DALLAS, TX 75247

LUTE RILEY HONDA

ATTN: PAUL PARKER

1331 N. CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY
RICHARDSON, TX 75080

- HOWDY\HONDA' (
4114 SANTIAGO | )

Ausm( TX 78745

ON THE BORDER FREIGHTLINER
ATTN: SABIO GARCIA

1367 N. HORIZON BLVD

EL PASO, TX 79928

BORNE CHRYSLER
30300 IH 10W
BORNE, TX 78006






