CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: El Paso Zoo

AGENDA DATE: - November 30, 2010

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: _Steve Marshall, Zoo Director 521-1850
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All _ Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Manager, 541-4313

SUBJECT:

The Purchasing Manager for Financial Services Department award Bid #2011-026 — Animal Food
(Grains, Pellets, Etc.) as follows:

Northeast Feed Inc. — Items 12, 27-30, 37, 40, 44 and 50. No options offered.

Total estimated Annual amount - $5,643.40.
Total estimated (3 year) Contract amount - $16,930.20.

Premium Nutrition Products, Inc — Items 7, 13, 17, 22 and 57-62. Contract option to extend one
additional year if option is executed prior to the expiration of the original term of the contract.
Total estimated Annual Amount - $10,010.00

Total estimated (3 year) Contract amount - $30,030.00

Total estimate including option to extend - $40,040.00

Valley Feed & Supply, Inc. — ltems 1-6, 8-11, 14-16, 18-21, 23-26, 31-36, 38-41, 45-49, 51-54, and 56.

No options offered.
Total estimated Annual Amount - $94,815.35
Total estimated (3 year) Contract Amount - $284,446.05.

X BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
- December 18, 2007

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Dept. 52152005 — Animal Health & Nutrition
Fund 15445 — Zoo Gate Revenue Admin
Acct 503110 — Animal Food & Supplies
Class 52000 — Zoo Administration

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

_ N/A

***********#*******REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION*********’k**********

LEGAL: (if required) . FINANCE: (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD:

(E'Xaﬁlple: if RCA is initiated by Purchasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager ‘

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

'CITY MANAGER: o DATE:




*****************************************POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B E LOWww Fedekddek

COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

wededekede * dededededede * Fedededededodedededek

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda (under BIDS) for the Council Mee‘ung of November

30, 2010.

The award of Solicitation No. 2011-026 [Animal Food (Grains, Pellets, Etc.)] to Northeast-Feed, Inc. of El Paso,
TX: Premium Nutritional Products, Inc. of Shawnee, KS; and Valley Feed and Supply, Inc. of El Paso, TX for an
initial term estimated award of $331,406.25.

Department:
Award to:

ttem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Funding Source:
District(s):

Department:
Award to:

ltem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:

Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:
Funding Source:
District(s):

Department:
Award to:

ltem(s):

Initial Term:

Option to Extend:
Payment Terms:

Annual Estimated Award:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Funding Source:
District(s):

Zoo

Northeast-Feed, Inc.

El Paso, TX

12, 27 - 30, 37, 40, 44 and 50
3 years

None

Net 30

$5,643.40

$16,930.20 (3 years)

Zoo Gate Revenue Administration — Animal Food and Supplies
All

Z0oo

Premium Nutritional Products, Inc.

Shawnee, KS

7,13,17,22 and 57 - 62.

3 years

One year if exercised prior to the expiration of the original term
Net 30

$10,010.00

$30,030.00 (3 years)

$40,040.00 (4 years)

Zoo Gate Revenue Administration — Animal Food and Supplies
Al

Zoo

Valley Feed and Supply, Inc.

El Paso, TX

1- 6,8-11, 14-16, 18-21, 23-26, 31-36, 38-41, 45-49, 51-54, AND 56
3 years

None i

Net 30

$94,815.35

$284,446.05 (3 years)

Zoo Gate Revenue Administration — Animal Food and Supplies

All

This is a requirements type contract.

Note: To award multiple vendors, repeat all items frbm “Award to:" through “Annual Estimated Award:"

DATE: 11/22/2010




The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost of this
contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the sum total at the end

of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the budget.

The Financial Services - Purchasing Division and Zoo recommend award as indicated to Northeast-Feed,
Inc.; Premium Nutritional Products, Inc.; and Valley Feed and Supply, Inc., the lowest responsive, responsible

bidders.

*******************************************AD D ITI ONAL I N Fo B E LOW***********************************

Northeast Feed only delivers larger order quantities, and Premium Nutritional Products provides free
delivery for shipments of 500 pounds or more. The Zoo accepts these conditions. There were no bids for

Item 55 — CeDeEgg and the Zoo will procure this from other sources.




Dedicated to Outstanding Customer Service for a Better Community

EL PASO Z0OO
Date: November 8, 2010
To: Pete Dunavant - Administrative Analyst
From: Steve Marshall - Directow
Subject: Bid #2011-026 Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.)

Bid tabulations have been reviéwed and award recommendations for 36
months as follows:

Northeast Feed Inc. — ltems 12, 27-30, 37, 40, 44 and 50. No options offered.
Total estimated Annual amount - $5,643.40.
Total estimated (3 year) Contract amount - $16,930.20.

Premium Nutrition Products, Inc — ltems 7, 13, 17,:22 and 57-62.
Contract option to extend one additional year if option is executed prior
to the expiration of the original term of the contract. ‘

Total estimated Annual Amount - $10,010.00

Total estimated (3 year) Contract amount - $30,030.00

Total estimate including option to extend - $40,040.00

Valley Feed & Supply, Inc. — Items 1-6, 8-11, 14-16, 18-21, 23-26, 31-
36, 38-41, 45-49, 51-54, and 56. No options offered.

Total estimated Annual Amount - $94,815.35

Total estimated (3 year) Contract Amount - $284,446.05.

Dept. 52152005 - Animal Health & Nutrition
Fund 15445 - Zoo Gate Revenue Admin
Acct. 503110 - Animal Food and Supplies
Class 5200 — Zoo Administration

/rmg

Aﬂ-Ameﬁca City

4001 E. Paisano Dr., El Paso, TX 79905-4223

Phone (915) 521-1850, Fax (915) 521-1857
www.elpasozoo.org




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010 )
Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America Cily

" =010

Solicitation #: 2011026

NORTHEAST FEED INC.

Department: Zoo ’

PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM || ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE
WILD HERBIVORE PLUS v
1. 75 MAZURI #5ZK4 NONE STATED NO BID $29.82 $2,236.50
BAGS ) 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG ) NO BID 50 .
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
2. 12 MARINE TABS NONE STATED NO BID $249.48 $2,993.76
CONTAINERS MAZURI #5TWX PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
CONTAINER SIZE NO BID 1.5 KG
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
FLAMINGO COMPLETE
3. 25 MAZURI #5644 NONE STATED NO BID $76.18 $1,904.50
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG " PER BAG PER BAG
~ LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # ' NONE STATED
FLAMINGO BREEDER
4. 25 MAZURI #5645 NONE STATED NO BID $91.40 $2,285.00
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
RATITE
5. 150 MAZURI #5647 NONE STATED NO BID $25.11 $3,766.50
BAGS ~ 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
# PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
RODENT DIET
. B. 200 MAZURI #5663 NONE STATED NO BID $17.98 $3,596.00
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG _ PER BAG PER BAG
L BS PER BAG NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVEDngzfj;igzzdyrtzﬂgf¢£:7

3

DATE:‘QZL&QQL@




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

AN-America City

L2010

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Project Department: Zoo
NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
' SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
FERRET DIET
7. 12 MAZURI #5M08 NONE STATED $35.99 $355.60 $35.99 $431.88
BAGS 25 LLB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 30 LBS/BAG 25
ZUPREEM PREMIUM FERRET
BRAND/STOCK # DIET SKU #69550 NONE STATED
8. 36 EMCELLE NONE STATED NO BID $161.54 $5,815.44
LITERS MAZURI #10111 PER LITER PER LITER PER LITER
CONTAINER SIZE ’ NO BID 1LITER
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
HERBIVORE ADF 16 '
9. 250 MAZURI #5648 NONE STATED NO BID $22.45 $5,612.50
: BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
LLAMA SUPPLEMENT
10. 12 MAZURI #5M17 NONE STATED NO BID $23.99 $287.88
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LLBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
ELEPHANT SUPPLEMENT C A
11. 200 MAZURI #5666 NONE STATED NO BID $28.90 $5,780.00
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
CRICKET FOOD, HI CALCIUM
12. 12 MAZURI #5M38 $19.95 $239.40 NO BID $129.00 $1,548.00
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG ‘ PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 251B NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # MAZURI NONE STATED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

e JO19)610

APPROVED BY: l




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010 \

Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-AmericaCity

2010

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Department: Zoo
PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
NORTHEAST FEED INC. "PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
. EL PASO, TX SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
GUINEA PIG DIET
13. 48 MAZURI #5664 NONE STATED $11.09 $665.40 $16.92 $812.16
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 20 LBS/BAG 25
UPREEM NATURE'S PROMIS
BRAND/STOCK # GUINEA PIG DIET SKU #o750q, ~ ONE STATED
REPTOVITE MINERAL :
14. 20 SUPPLEMENT NONE STATE/D NO BID $69.00 $1,380.00
CONTAINERS 5 LB. CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
|_LBS/ICONTAINER NO BID 5
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
LABORATORY RABBIT
15. 6 DIET HF, PURINA #5326 " NONE STATED NO BID $24.24 $145.44
BAGS 3 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
ENRICH 32 HORSE
16. 24 PURINA NONE STATED NO BID $25.83 $619.92
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
CHINCHILLA DIET
17. 15 MAZURI #5M01 NONE STATED $12.80 $243.20 $16.96 $254.40
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 20 LBS/BAG 25
TUPREEM NATURE'S PROMISY
BRAND/STOCK # CHINCHILLA DIET SKU #9850 ~ NONE STATED
INSECTIVORE . :
18. 20 MAZURI #5MK8 NONE STATED NO BID $35.37 $707.40
BAGS 25 LLB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
CONTAINER SIZE NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: !Qg l 3! 20/6




. El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO bt
BID TABULATION FORM

-

. 2040
Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010 Solicitation #: 2011-026
Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc . Department: Zoo
NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
.EL PASO, TX ' PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
: ‘ SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM || ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
GAMEBIRD LAYENA
19. 190 CRUMBLES, MAZURI #5438 NONE STATED NO BID $17.56 $3,336.40
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
SENIOR EQUINE
20. 190 PURINA $19.50 $3,705.00 NO BID $18.99 $3,608.10
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # : PURINA NONE STATED
21. 12 CORN, CRACKED $9.95 $119.40 NO BID $9.69 $116.28"
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # VALLEY MILLS NONE STATED
OMNIVORE CHOW
22, 200 ZUPREEM NONE STATED $12.40 $2,480.00 $19.85 $4,545.65
BAGS 20 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 20 LBS/BAG 17.5 LBS/BAG
ZUPREEM OMNIVORE DRY
BRAND/STOCK # SKU #69950 NONE STATED
WATER FOWL MAINTENANCE
23. 75 MAZURI #5642 NONE STATED NO BID $34.83 $2,612.25
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
WILD HERBIVORE DIET,
24. 500 HI FIBER, MAZURI #5ZF1 NONE STATED NO BID $26.46 $13,230.00
-BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: !Qéﬁl ao’ 6 . ' 4




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010

Project Nai

Ani

mal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso.

All-America City

200
Solicitation #: 2011-026
Department: Zoo

NORTHEAST FEED INC.

PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM [ ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
. EXOTIC CANINE
25. 55 MAZURI #5M52 NONE STATED NO BID $33.97 $2,853.48
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 33 LBSIBAG
BRAND/STOCK # . NONE STATED
CRANE MAINTENANCE
26. 30 MAZURI #5646 NONE STATED NO BID $36.09 $1,082.70
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
27. 15 PARROT SEED MiX $49.95 $749.25 : NO BID $35.20 $1,056.00
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG - 501LB NO BID 25 LBS/BAG
BRAND/STOCK # BROOKS NONE STATED
28. 24 FINCH SEED MIX $23.95 $1,149.60 NO BID $33.99 $1,631.52
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
-I.BS PER BAG 251B NO BID 25 LBS/BAG
BRAND/STOCK # BROOKS ‘ NONE STATED
29. 12 SUNFLOWER SEEDS $35.95 $431.40 NO BID $43.76 $525.12
' BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LLBS PER BAG 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # EXCELLO NONE STATED
30. 48 PEANUTS, RAW IN SHELL $59.95 $2,877.60 NO BID $72.99 $3,503.52
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # . HI MESA (NM) NONE STATED
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY%

owre:_10]19) {:&6/6 -




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010

P

:_Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
. All-america Gity
2010 i
Solicitation #: 2011-026
Department: Zoo .

NORTHEAST FEED INC.

PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
v SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM || ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
31. 4 BRAN $12.95 $51.80 NO BID $12.83 $51.32
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # CORTEZ MILLING NONE STATED
IAMS LESS ACTIVE :
32, 30 CAT FOOD, IAMS NONE STATED NO BID $17.68 $671.84
BAGS 10 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 8 LBS/IBAG
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
BROWSE BISCUITS
33. 180 MAZURI #5MA4 NONE STATED NO BID $36.82 $6,627.60
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
GROWTH & REPRO, PRIMATE - )
34. 24 MAZURI #5MA1 NONE STATED NO BID $21.36 $512.64
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
. IGUANA DIET :
35. 8 MAZURI #5M35 NONE STATED NO BID $65.88 $527.04
CASES 6/CASE PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE
CANS PER CASE NO BID 6
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
KOI POND NUGGETS
36. 2 MAZURI #5M78 NONE STATED NO BID $46.99 $93.98
BAGS : 20 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS./CONTAINER NO BID 20
BRAND/STOCK # - NONE STATED
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 10 ! & ‘ Q;Q-;O, U




Bid Opening Date:

October 13, 2010

Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

- 0] ity

"EEEB'

" 2010 i
Solicitation #: 2011-026
Department: Zoo

NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
- ELPASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
. SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM || ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE || UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
37. 20 SALT BRICKS $2.95 $59.00 NO BID $3.99 $79.80
BRICKS PER BRICK PER BRICK PER BRICK
LBS PER BRICK 41B NO BID 4
BRAND/STOCK # RANCH HOUSE NONE STATED
SHEEP LOCO
38. 35 MAZURI #5655 NONE STATED NO BID $24.90 $871.50
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
TORTOISE DIET
39. 100 MAZURI #5M21 NONE STATED . NO BID $26.83 $2,683.00
BAGS 25 LB. BAG- PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
40. 1 ROLLED OATS $13.95 $13.95 : NO BID $14.85 $14.85
BAG 50 LBS. PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # HI PRO FEED NONE STATED
WATER FOWL BREEDER
41. 2 MAZURI #5640 NONE STATED NO BID $36.93 $73.86
BAGS 50 LB BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
I
42, 6 CALCIUM CARBONATE NONE STATED NO BID N/A
BAGS : 50 LBS. PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG PERBAG |
L BS PER BAG NO BID
BRAND/STOCK #

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

P

Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010
j : imal

od !Pellets, Grains, Etc.!

El Paso

All-America City

AN

© 2010

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Department: Zoo
NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM |} ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
43. 2 OATMEAL NONE STATED NO BID N/A
' BAGS 50 LBS. PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG PERBAG |
LBS PER BAG NO BID
BRAND/STOCK #
44, 4 OYSTER SHELL $9.95 $39.80 NO BID $18.99 $75.96
BAGS 50 LBS. PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # SEA GULL NONE STATED
45, 120 GEL, BIRD ZULIFE NONE STATED NO BID $35.87 $4,304.40
KGS MAZURI #5ME4 PER KG PER KG PER KG
KG PER CONTAINER NO BID B 1
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
46. 120 GEL, CALLITRICHID DIET NONE STATED NO BID . $21.47 $2,576.40
KGS MAZURI #5M15 PER KG PER KG PER KG
KG/CONTAINER NO BID 1
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
47. 2 TABLETS, VITA ZU BIRD NONE - STATED NO BID $142.98 $285.96
CONTAINERS MAZURI #5M25 PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
TABLETS/CONTAINER NO BID 12LB
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
48. 1 TABLETS, MAMMAL VITAMIN NONE STATED NO BID $179.30 $179.30
CONTAINER MAZURI! #5M26 PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
TABLETS/CONTAINER NOBID 1.5 KG
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: I‘Dlﬂgjaglo




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010

P

: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-Rmerica City

© 2010

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Department: Zoo
NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX . PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
- SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM || ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
THIAMINE-E
49, 12 ) MAZURI #10112 NONE STATED NO BID $25.92 $311.04
CONTAINERS| 80 GRAMS PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
GRAMS/CONTAINER - ' NO BID 80
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
50. 12 TRACE BLACK $6.95 $83.40 NO BID $9.99 $119.88
BLOCKS BLOCK PER BLOCK PER BLOCK PER BLOCK
LBS PER BLOCK 50 LB NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # RANCH HOUSE NONE STATED
TURTLE DIET, FRESHWATER
51. 4 MAZURI #5M87 NONE STATED NO BID $43.83 $175.32
BAGS 25 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS. PER BAG NO BID 25
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
VIONATE MINERAL '
52. 14 SUPPLEMENTS NONE STATED NO BID $52.00 $728.00
CONTAINERS 10 LB. CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER PER CONTAINER
LBS. PER CONTAINER NO BID 10
BRAND/STOCK # NONE STATED
ZEBRA PELLETS
53. 225 MAZURI #5662 NONE STATED NO BID $25.96 $5,841.00
BAGS 50 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
- LBS. PER BAG NO BID 50
BRAND/STOCK # : NONE STATED
PETTING ZOO :
54. 150 MAZURI #5795 NONE STATED NO BID $27.65 $4,147.50 :
BAGS 40 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS. PER BAG NO BID 40
BRAND/STOCK # ) NONE STATED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: !01 zﬁl&élﬁ




Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010
Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grains, Etc.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El'Paso

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Department: Zoo
: PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
NORTHEAST FEED INC. PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
EL PASO, TX SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
ITEM | ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
55. 1 CE DE EGG NONE STATED NO BID N/A
KG KILOGRAM PER KG PER KG PERKG |
BRAND/STOCK # NO BID
56. 4 GEL, AQUATIC OMNIVORE NONE STATED NO BID $45.90 $183.60
KGS _DIET, MAZURI #5794, KG PER KG PER KG PER KG
- BRAND/STOCK # NO BID NONE STATED
$23.28 $1,164.00
57. 50 CANNED PRIMATE NONE STATED PER CASE $41.52 $2,076.00
CASES ZUPREEM, 24/CASE PER CASE (BIDDER'S TOTAL PRICE: $1,161.50) | PER CASE
CANS PER CASE 24 CANS/CASE 24
ZUPREEM PRIMATE DIET
58. 15 CANNED MARMOSET NONE STATED $23.28 $349.20 $41.52 $622.80
CASES ZUPREEM, 24/CASE PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE
, CANS PER CASE 24 CANS/CASE 24
ZUPREEM MARMOSET
BRAND/STOCK # DIET CANNED SKU #9200 NONE STATED
59. 150 PRIMATE DRY MAINTENANCE NONE STATED $17.41 $2,611.50 $39.17 $6,737.24
BAGS ZUPREEM, 20 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
L.LBS PER BAG 20 LBS/BAG 17.5 LBSIBAG
ZUPREEM PRIMATE DRY
60. 4 FRUIT BLEND NONE STATED $37.80 $113.40 $34.12 $170.60
BAGS ZUPREEM, 20 LB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG ~ 35 LBS/BAG 17.5 LBSIBAG
ZUPREEM FRUITBLEND FOR
BRAND/STOCK # LARGE PARROTS SKU #8435( NONE STATED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

e, JO[125/0¢0
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Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Ali-America Gty

- 'zo10

Solicitation #: 2011-026

Department: Zoo

NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX ’ PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
SHAWNEE, KS - EL PASO, TX
ANN. EST. QTY. ITEM DESGRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRIGE | TOTAL PRIGE
NATURAL/CANARIES-FINCH/
61. 65 SOFTBILL (LOW IRON) NONE STATED $22.53 $1,464.45 $32.99 $2,474.25
BAGS ZUPREEM, 20 LB. BAG PER BAG v PER BAG PER BAG
LBS PER BAG 20 LBS/BAG 17.5 LBS/BAG
ZUPREEM NATURAL FOR
BRAND/STOCK # CANARIES & FINCHES SKU #9050 NONE STATED
: NATURAL/PARROT/CONJURE/ ‘ _
62. 25 SOFTBILL LOW IRON NONE STATED $22.53 - $563.25 $33.37 $967.73
BAGS ZUPREEM, 20 LLB. BAG PER BAG PER BAG PER BAG
L.BS PER BAG 20 LBSIBAG 17.5 LBS/BAG
ZUPREEM NATURAL FOR
BRAND/STOCK # PARROTS & CONURES SKU #9350 NONE STATED

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIMER PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR;
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED X ‘

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: %

DATE: l 0! LBZ QO/ é
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM .

2010
Bid Opening Date: October 13, 2010 . , : Solicitation #: 2011-026

Rli-Anterica City

Project Name: Animal Food (Pellets, Grain Et_c Department: Zoo
NORTHEAST FEED INC. | PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL 'VALLEY FEED &
EL PASO, TX PRODUCTS, INC. SUPPLY, INC.
SHAWNEE, KS EL PASO, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET- 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
ves[] woix] | Yesx] wo[] | ves[] wofx]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: ’ 10 30
Within ___ consecutive calendar days DOES NOT APPLY. NO
ithi i i DELIVERY AVAILABLE.
Within hc.::urs or overnight after receipt of  NONE STATED NONE STATED
verbal order in cases of emergency
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL, A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE GAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 16 BIDS RECEIVED: 3 BIDS LOCAL: 6 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 19 Z f 21&0/ [ 12




- VALLEY FEED
368 YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915

SUNDANCE FEEDS-N-NEEDS
ATTN: RALPH DURAN

11638 ALAMEDA

EL PASO, TX 79927

CUTTLEBONE PLUS
768 AN TWINOAKS VALLEY RD
SAN MARCOS, CA 92069

RELIABLE PROTEIN PRODUCTS I}\IC.

21001 N, TATUM BLVD STE. 1630-620
PHOENIX, AZ 85050

UPPER VALLEY FEED
6400 DONIPHAN DRIVE
EL PASO, TX 79932

NORTHEAST FEED
10410 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79924

ANDERSON FEED CO
3338 S. CHANARD.
CHANA, IL 61015

PREMIUM NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
10504 W 797 ST.
SHAWNEE, KS 66214

GIDDYAP GIRL BISCUIT
P O BOX 1246

- COSTA MESA, CA 92626

HI-PRO FEEDS
P. 0. BOX 519
FRIONA, TX 79035-0519

MAZURI
1160 NORTH 1750 EAST
LOGAN, UT 84341

SUPERIOR PRODUCE
125 N. STEVENS

EL PASO TX 79905

PURINA MILLS INC.
P. 0. BOX 66812
ST. LOUIS, MO 63166-66812

HMS

1222 ECHO LANE
BLUFFTON, IN 46714

PETS MART
655 SUNLAND PARK DRIVE

EL PASO, TX 79912

HIGGINS GROUP
3198 NW 125 8T .
MIAMI, FL 33167






