CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Fire
AGENDA DATE: November 29. 2005

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Michael Calderazzo 771-1071
DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: N/A

SUBJECT:

APPROVE a resolution / ordinance / lease to do what? OR AUTHORIZE the City
Manager to do what? Be descriptive of what we want Council to approve. Include $
amount if applicable.

Award Bid # 2005-264 to responsive bidders as per award recommendation memo.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Discussion of the what, why, where, when, and how to enable Council to have reasonably
complete description of the contemplated action. This should include attachment of bid
tabulation, or ordinance or resolution if appropriate. What are the benefits to the City of
this action? What are the citizen concerns?

Award of this bid allows the Fire Department to continue purchasing duty uniforms for all fire personnel for the
coming fiscal year in accordance with the Collective Bargaining Agreement.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Has the Council previously considered this item or a closely related one?

Yes. Last contract was awarded three vears ago by Council.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
How will this item be funded? Has the item been budgeted? If so, identify funding source
by account numbers and description of account. Does it require a budget transfer?

Operating budget Fund 01101
Account 503120
Dept ID 22010100
Class 22050

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
Enter appropriate comments or N/A

N/A
*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************
LEGAL: (if required)

— %E_ (if required)
DEPARTMENT HEAD: /%Luﬁ' 4//&4//

(Example:”  if RCA is initiated by Pu;éhasing, client department should sign also)
Information copy to appropriate Deputy City Manager

APPROVED FOR AGENDA:

CITY MANAGER: DATE:




DATE:

November 30, 2005

TO: Municipal Clerk (r’

FROM:

Byron E. Johnson, C.P.M.

Deputy Director, Financial Service!

xt. 4313

THRU:

Aurora Wells

Bid Clerk ext. 4038

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda for the Council Meeting of

DECEMBER 13, 2005.

Iltem should read as follows:

Solicitation No. 2005-264

Duty Uniforms

Award to: Vendor 1: Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, Texas

ltem(s): Group |, 1a, 2a, 4a, 5a, 5b, Group Il, #1, 2, 3, 4,5, &6,
Group lll, #2. 4. 5, & 6

Amount: $317,990.00 (estimated)

Award to: Vendor 2: Bazaar Uniforms & Men's Store
El Paso, Texas

ltem(s): Group |, 1b, 2b, 3a, 3b, 4b, Group I, #1, 7a & 7b, Group
IV.#1 &2

Amount: $368,536.00 (estimated)

Award to: Vendor 3: Rock’s/School Wear
El Paso, Texas

ltem(s): Group Il #3

Amount: $18,270.00 (estimated)

Award to: Vendor 4: Iron Age corporation
Pittsburgh, PA

Item(s): Group IV, #3 & #4

Amount: $2.472.00 (estimated)

Department: Fire

Funds available:

22010100-503120-01101

Funding source:

Fire Department General Operating Funds-Uniform &

Apparel Supplies

. Total award:

$707.268.00 (estimated)

District (s):

All

Fire Department and Financial Services-Purchasing Division recommend award as

indicated to the lowest responsive offer meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Vendor #1 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit




prices for two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2)
years from the date of the award.

Vendor #2 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for one (1) or two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or
two (2) years from the date of the award.

Vendor #3 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for one (1) additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from the
date of the award. Vendor also offers the City a prompt payment discount of 2% ten (10)

days.

Vendor #4 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit
prices for two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2)
years from the date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twelve (12) months.

Contact person: Jesus M. Juarez, Procurement Analyst at 541-4317.
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AGENDA FOR: DECEMBER 13, 2005
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PROJECT FORM
DATE: November 28, 2005

PROJECT: Duty Uniforms

NO:2005-264 DEPARTMENT: Fire
BUDGET NO: 22010100-503120-01101

FUNDING SOURCE: Fire Department General Operating Funds-Uniform & Apparel Supplies
REPRESENTATIVE DISTRICT(S): All
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RECOMMENDATION: 1) Vendor: Uniforms of Texas
El Paso, Texas
Item(s): Group |, 1a,2a,4a,5a,5b Groupll #1,2,3,4,5,& 6,Group llI,
#2,45, &6
Amount: $311,9&O.Q0_(esﬂma1ed_)
RECOMMENDATION: 2) Vendor: Bazaar Uniforms & Men'’s Store
El Paso, Texas
Item(s): Group |, 1b,2b, 3a, 3b, 4b ,Group I, #1, 7a & 7b, Group V. #1
&2
Amount: $368,536.00 (estimated )
RECOMMENDATION: 3) Vendor: Rock’s/School Wear
El Paso, Texas
ltem(s): Group IlI, #3
Amount: $18,270.00 (estimated )
RECOMMENDATION: 4) Vendor: Iron Age corporation
Pittsburgh, PA
Item(s): Group IV, #3 & #4

Amount: $2,472 00 (estimated )

The Fire Department and Financial Services-Purchasing Division recommend award as indicated to the
lowest responsive offer meeting specifications, from responsible parties.

Vendor #1 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for two (2)
additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2) years from the date of the award.

Vendor #2 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for one (1) or
two (2) additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2) years from the date of the award.

Vendor #3 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for one (1)
additional year if the option is exercised within one (1) year from the date of the award. Vendor also offers
the City a prompt payment discount of 2% ten (10) days.

Vendor #4 offers the City the option to extend the term of the contract at the same unit prices for two (2)
additional years if the option is exercised within one (1) or two (2) years from the date of the award.

This is a Requirements Type Contract with an initial term of Twelve (12) months.




BIDS SOLICITED- 44 (15 local)
BIDS RECEIVED- 06
“NO BID” RECEIVED Q0

CURRENT TAXES PAID-
OUT-OF-TOWN- _

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD: $707,268.00 (estimated)
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COUNCIL APPROVED [] REJECTED [] MUNICIPAL CLERK
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APPROVED: COUNCIL MEETING DATE: December 13, 2005

] Ve

Byron E. Joh , C.P.M. W
Deputy Directdr-\Financial Services




ROBERTO RIVERA

JOHN COOk
MAYOR

JOYCE WILSON
CITY MANAGER

FIRE CHIEF

FIRE DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

CitY COUNCIL
ANN MORGAN LILLY, DISTRICT 1
SUSANNAH M. BYRD, DISTRICT 2

J. ALEXANDRO LOZANO, DISTRICT 3

MELINA CASTRO, DISTRICT 4
PRESI ORTEGA, JR., DISTRICT 5
EDDIE HOLGUIN JR., DISTRICT 6

STEVE ORTEGA, DISTRICT 7

BETO O’ROURKE, DISTRICT 8

To: Jesus Juarez, Procurement Analyst

From: Michael Calderazzo, Logistics Chieby/‘f.

Subject: Bid # 2005-264, Duty Uniforms Award Recommendation
Date: November 16, 2005

After reviewing the bids received for duty uniforms we make the following award
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recommendations:

Item

Description

-

56-Hour Employee Uniform

Unit Price

Vendor

Shirt

la. 100% Cotton NFPA Navy Blue |28.50 Uniforms of Texas
Trouser - Male

1b. 100% Cotton Navy Blue Trouser — | 14.09 Bazaar Uniforms
Male Men’s Store

2a. 100% Cotton NFPA Navy Blue |29.95 Uniforms of Texas
Trouser — Female

2b. 100% Cotton Navy Blue Trouser — | 14.09 Bazaar Uniforms
Female Men’s Store

3a. 100% Cotton NFPA Navy Blue Polo | 24.99 Bazaar Uniforms

Men’s Store

Short Sleeve Shirt

4a. 100% Cotton NFPA Men’s White | 28.50 Uniforms of Texas
Short Sleeve Shirt

4b. 100% Cotton Men’s White Short | 26.99 Bazaar Uniforms
Sleeve Shirt Men’s Store

Sa. 100% Cotton NFPA Men’s Light Blue | 28.50 Uniforms of Texas

ﬂ

Fire Department

ISO Class 1

8600 MONTANA AVE. * EL PASO, TX 79925-1214 « 915.771.1000 « 915.771.1026 FAX * WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV
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Item Description Unit Price Vendor
#
5b. 100% Cotton Men’s Light Blue Short | 26.95 Uniforms of Texas
Sleeve Shirt
M 40-Hour Employee Uniform
1. Navy Blue Dress Trousers, Men’s 25.95 Uniforms of Texas
2. White Dress Shirt Long Sleeve, Men’s | 13.95 Uniforms of Texas
3. White Dress Shirt Short Sleeve, Men’s | 12.50 Uniforms of Texas
4. Light Blue Dress Shirt Long Sleeve, | 14.10 Uniforms of Texas
Men’s
5. Light Blue Dress Shirt Short Sleeve, | 12.50 Uniforms of Texas
Men’s
6. Dress Jacket 80.00 Uniforms of Texas
I Common Items *
1. Black Belt (Gold or Silver) with “D” | 6.59 Bazaar Uniforms &
Ring Buckle Men’s Store
2. Exercise Shorts, Navy Blue 6.50 Uniforms of Texas
3. Exercise T-Shirts, Navy Blue 4.06 Rock’s/School Wear
4. Black Tie, Clip-on Style 2.25 Uniforms of Texas
5. Black Tie, Regular Style 3.50 Uniforms of Texas
6. Winter Jacket 118.00 Uniforms of Texas
7b. Solid White Baseball Cap 3.46 Bazaar Uniforms &
Men’s Store
- Footwear
1. Safety Toe Men’s Industrial Footwear | 47.99 Bazaar Uniforms &
Men’s Store
2. Steel Toe Women’s Industrial | 47.99 Bazaar Uniforms &
Footwear Men’s Store
3. Shoes, Oxford Male 41.20 Iron Age Corp.
4. Shoes, Oxford Female 41.20 Iron Age Corp.

Two items above have been highlighted because they represent a selection that requires some
explanation. Item 3b, under the 56-hour employee uniforms, 100% Cotton Navy Blue Polo
Shirt, at $14.94 ea. is not the lowest bid listed for that item, but is an offering that meets our
quality standards. Neither Bazaar’s lowest bid polo at $11.99 nor Uniforms of Texas’ polo at
$12.50 met our needs for fade resistance.

The other item in question is item 7a under the Common items group, the solid navy blue
baseball cap. Samples submitted from the other vendors did not meet our expectations for
quality. Bazaar’s offering at $3.46 is the lowest bid for an acceptable baseball cap, so we
recommend award to Bazaar for the blue baseball cap as well as the white one.

Fire Department ‘v@%ﬁ

ISO Class 1

8600 MONTANA AVE. * EL PASO, TX 79925-1214 « 915.771.1000 » 915.771.1026 FAX * WWW.ELPASOTEXAS.GOV
PAGE 2 OF 2




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2005-264
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE | CORPORATION WEAR
GROUP I: 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX |[PITTSBURGH, PA| EL PASO, TX

ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION ) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1a. 5,500 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE TROUSER - MALE $30.99 NO BID

MANUFACTURER LION NO BID
CATALOG NO. ‘ 0150NV-00

1b. 5,500 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE TROUSER - MALE $14.09 NO BID

MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. PC20DN

2a. 600 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE TROUSER - FEMALE $30.99 NO BID
MANUFACTURER LION NO BID
CATALOG NO. 7141NV

2b. 600 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE TROUSER - FEMALE $14.09 NO BID

MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. PC20DN

3a. 5,500 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE POLO SHIRT $24.99 NO BID

MANUFACTURER LION NO BID
CATALOG NO. 0420

$14.94
3b. 5,500 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE POLO SHIRT ALT 1: $11.99 NO BID
ALT 2: $12.09

MANUFACTURER LEE NO BID

CATALOG NO. 7702

APPROVED BY:

DATE: Z/dﬂ/js/ ( |

ALT 1: ANVIL/6003 NAVY
ALT 2: GILDAN/3900 NAVY

2005-264 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2005-264
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE CORPORATION WEAR
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX |PITTSBURGH, PA| EL PASO, TX

ITEM|  QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

4a. 400 100% COTTON NFPA MEN'S $32.99 NO BID

» WHITE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

MANUFACTURER LION NO BID
CATALOG NO. 0527WH-00

4b. 600 100% COTTON MEN'S WHITE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT $26.99 NO BID

MANUFACTURER HORACE SMALL NO BID
CATALOG NO. HS1426

5a. 200 100% COTTON NFPA MEN'S $32.99 NO BID

LIGHT BLUE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

MANUFACTURER LION NO BID
CATALOG NO. 0527MB

5b. 200 100% COTTON MEN'S $26.99 NO BID

LIGHT BLUE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

MANUFACTURER HORACE SMALL NO BID

CATALOG NO. HS1428

APPROVED BY: @Uw . gz,

DATE: %//z)///af
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE | CORPORATION WEAR
GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX PITTSBURGH, PA EL PASO, TX

ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 350 NAVY BLUE DRESS TROUSERS, MEN'S $29.49 NO BID
MANUFACTURER ELBECO NO BID
CATALOG NO. E8941

2. 100 WHITE DRESS SHIRT LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S $14.24 NO BID
MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. SP56WH ‘

3. 250 WHITE DRESS SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $12.62 NO BID
MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. SP66WH

4. 150 LIGHT BLUE DRESS SHIRT LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S $14.24 NO BID
MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. SP56MB

5. 300 LIGHT BLUE DRESS SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $12.62 NO BID
MANUFACTURER RED KAP NO BID
CATALOG NO. SP66MB

6. 10 DRESS JACKET $84.99 NO BID

*Note: Jacket must match dress trouser (Group Il-item1)

MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER NO BID
CATALOG NO. 38802

APPROVED BY:

2005-264 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE | CORPORATION WEAR
GROUP Ill: COMMON ITEMS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX |PITTSBURGH, PA| EL PASO, TX
ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 800 BLACK BELT, (GOLD OR SILVER) "D" RING BUCKLE $6.59 NO BID
MANUFACTURER ARTCRAFT NO BID
CATALOG NO.

2. 4,500 EXERCISE SHORTS, NAVY BLUE $7.34 $6.67 NO BID $7.79 EA
MANUFACTURER ANVIL ALPHA ANVIL COTTON DELUXE
CATALOG NO. 122 S - 2XL 122 NAVY #122

3. 4,500 EXERCISE T-SHIRTS, NAVY BLUE $4.79 $4.47 NO BID $4.06 EA
MANUFACTURER HANES BRO BROS HANES
CATALOG NO. 5290 S - XL 5290

4. 50 BLACK TIE, CLIP ON STYLE $2.99 NO BID
MANUFACTURER VAL NO BID
CATALOG NO.

5. 100 BLACK TIE, REGULAR STYLE $6.99 NO BID
MANUFACTURER VAL NO BID
CATALOG NO.

é. 600 WINTER JACKET NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER NO BID NO BID
CATALOG NO.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: ?/dé/// S
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS BID # 2005-264
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005 DEPARTMENT: FIRE
BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & | . IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE | CORPORATION WEAR
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX |PITTSBURGH, PA| EL PASO, TX
ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
7A. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE BASEBALL CAP $5.42 $3.46 NO BID $3.33 EACH
MANUFACTURER HEAD MASTER OTTO OTT10
CATALOG NO. 2283 18098-NAVY 19-536
7B. 100 SOLID WHITE BASEBALL CAP $5.64 $3.46 NO BID $3.48 EACH
MANUFACTURER HEAD MASTERS OTTO CAP OTTO
CATALOG NO. 9683 18098-616 19-536
GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR T P
1. 750 SAFETY TOE MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $47.99 $49.20
WEINBRENNER KNAPP
MANUFACTURER COMMANDO GRABBERS NO BID
CATALOG NO. 804-6086 #2303
2. 50 STEEL TOE WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $47.99 $49.20
WEINBRENNER KNAPP
MANUFACTURER COMMANDO GRABBERS NO BID
CATALOG NO. 504-6086 #2303
3. 50 SHOES, MALE OXFORD NO BID $41.20
MANUFACTURER NO BID KNAPP GRABBERS NO BID
CATALOG NO. #2311
4. 10 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD NO BID $41.20
MANUFACTURER NO BID KNAPP GRABBERS NO BID
CATALOG NO. — #2327

APPROVED BY: Qau 0 Y ZQLW?
/

DATE: 7//)0/ ﬂf
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

[BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BAZAAR
ALCO UNIFORMS & IRON AGE ROCK'S/SCHOOL
INDUSTRIAL CO.| MEN'S STORE | CORPORATION WEAR
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX [PITTSBURGH, PA| EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

]

x]

[

x]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

CALENDAR DAYS

CALENDAR DAYS

CALENDAR DAYS

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION x] [X] ] ]
IS EXERCISED WITHIN:
A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES[ | NO[_ || ves(x] No_]| ves(x] No_]| YEs(x] No[ ]
B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES(X] No[ || veslx] wNo[ || ves(x] No[ || ves_ ] wNo ]
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. ] L[] ] ]
2% - 10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS | NET - 30 DAYS | NET - 30 DAYS | NET - 30 DAYS
[30 CONSECUTIVE30 CONSECUTIVE|T4 CONSECUTIVE 7-10

WORKING DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THEY CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: @/}{L/) /7//, /QL&’B/
;

DATE: Z/Jn///f
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
GROUP I: 56 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1a. 5,500 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE TROUSER - MALE $28.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. $74,200.00
1b. 5,500 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE TROUSER - MALE $14.90 $0.00
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. PC20DN
2a. 600 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE TROUSER - FEMALE $29.95 $0.00
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 74250
2b. 600 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE TROUSER - FEMALE $29.95 $0.00
MANUFACTURER HORCE SMALL
CATALOG NO. 2311
SHORT LONG
3a. 5,500 100% COTTON NFPA NAVY BLUE POLO SHIRT SLEEVE SLEEVE
$28.50 $36.95
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 07600
SHORT LONG
3b. 5,500 100% COTTON NAVY BLUE POLO SHIRT SLEEVE SLEEVE $0.00
$12.50 $14.99
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 6003

APPROVED BY

DATE: 4

!/‘
: L (4
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264

DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
' TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
4a. 400 100% COTTON NFPA MEN'S $28.50 $0.00
WHITE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 7001
4b. 600 100% COTTON MEN'S WHITE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT $27.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 7001
5a. 200 100% COTTON NFPA MEN'S $28.50 $0.00
LIGHT BLUE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 7002
5b. 200 100% COTTON MEN'S $26.95 $0.00
LIGHT BLUE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT
MANUFACTURER HORCE SMALL
CATALOG NO. 1428

APPROVED BY:Q&M_%
DATE: Z/,%/:l/d 5 V4 -
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
GROUP II: 40 HOUR EMPLOYEE UNIFORM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 350 NAVY BLUE DRESS TROUSERS, MEN'S $25.95 $0.00
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 38200

2, 100 WHITE DRESS SHIRT LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S $13.95 $0.00
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP56WH

3. 250 WHITE DRESS SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $12.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP66WH

4. 150 LIGHT BLUE DRESS SHIRT LONG SLEEVE, MEN'S $14.10 $0.00
MANUFACTURER ) RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP56MB

5. 300 LIGHT BLUE DRESS SHIRT SHORT SLEEVE, MEN'S $12.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER RED KAP
CATALOG NO. SP66MB

é. 10 DRESS JACKET $80.00 $0.00

*Note: Jacket must match dress trouser (Group lI-ltem1)
MANUFACTURER FECHHEIMER
CATALOG NO. 38169
APPROVED BY: -
L/ 2005-264 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT 9
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
GROUP IlI: COMMON ITEMS EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 800 BLACK BELT, (GOLD OR SILVER) "D" RING BUCKLE $8.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER DUTYMAN
CATALOG NO. 1511

2. 4,500 EXERCISE SHORTS, NAVY BLUE $6.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER ALPHA
CATALOG NO. 8187NV

3. 4,500 EXERCISE T-SHIRTS, NAVY BLUE $5.01 $0.00
MANUFACTURER BRODER BROTHER
CATALOG NO. 363MP

4, 50 BLACK TIE, CLIP ON STYLE $2.25 $0.00
MANUFACTURER SAM BROOME
CATALOG NO. 90049

5. 100 BLACK TIE, REGULAR STYLE $3.50 $0.00
MANUFACTURER SAM BROOME
CATALOG NO. 90099

6. 600 WINTER JACKET $118.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER SPIEWAK
CATALOG NO. §526CF/S577CF

APPROVED BY: gjﬂzw /7//5}76&4?,

DATE: /5’)@// S~

2005-264 DUTY UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
7A. 800 SOLID NAVY BLUE BASEBALL CAP $4.49 $0.00
MANUFACTURER ALPHA
CATALOG NO. BX002-NV

7B. 100 SOLID WHITE BASEBALL CAP $4.69 $0.00
MANUFACTURER ALPHA
CATALOG NO. BX002-WH

GROUP IV: FOOTWEAR

1. 750 SAFETY TOE MEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $69.00 $49.00
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD |HYTEST-GUARDSMAN
CATALOG NO. 804-6906 53045

2. 50 STEEL TOE WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL FOOTWEAR $67.00 $49.00
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD |[HYTEST-GUARDSMAN
CATALOG NO. 534-6906 53045

3. 50 SHOES, MALE OXFORD $53.00 $48.00
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD |[[HYTEST-GUARDSMAN
CATALOG NO. 834-6130 66215

4, 10 SHOES, FEMALE OXFORD $62.00 $48.00
MANUFACTURER THOROGOOD |[HYTEST-GUARDSMAN
CATALOG NO. 534-6145 68040

APPROVED BY:

—

DATE: K}éﬂ/ b
/A
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CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: DUTY UNIFORMS
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2005

BID # 2005-264
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

UNIFORMS OF WORK WEAR
TEXAS SAFETY SHOES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

[

l

[

[

TWO ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICES, IF THE OPTION x] [X] ] ]

IS EXERCISED WITHIN:
A. ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES(X] No__] | Yes[x] wNo[ || ves__] wNo[ ]| ves__] wNo ]
B. TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YESX] No[_]| vesix] wNo[ ]| ves__] No_ ]| ves__]| wNo_]
C. NO OPTION OFFERED. L] L] ] ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS | NET - 30 DAYS

30 CONSECUTIVE(10 CONSECUTIVE

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: CALENDAR DAYS |CALENDAR DAYS
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THEY CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID. .
BIDS SOLICITED: 44 ' BIDS RECEIVED: & BIDS LOCAL: 15 NO BIDS: 0

APPROVED BY:
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ALCO INDUSRTRIAL
3525 HUECO ST
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

UNIFORMS OF TEXAS
6601 MONTANA AVE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

FAMOUS UNIFORMS

DBA B.J.’S UNIFORMS

3942 LEOPARD

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78408

IRON AGE PROTECTIVE CO.
2914 YANDELL AVE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

PROFESSIONAL POLICE SUPPLY
722 CLAT ST.
OAKLAND, CA 94607

TEXAS INDUSTRIAL SERV. SUBS
OF UNIFIRST CORP.

PO BOX 26159

EL PASO, TEXAS 79926

SUN CITY EMBRIODERY
9300 CARNEGIE, STE B
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

CLIFTON UNIFORM
529 MAIN ST.
LOVELAND, OH 45140

CABELA’S INC
ONE CABEL DR
SIDNEY, NE 69160

LION APPAREL
6450 POE AVE
DAYTON, OH 45413-0576

ALFA SAFETY PRODUCTS
1137 CIMMARRON
EL PASO, TEXAS 799015

EAGLE CREST, INC
5353-1 RAMONA BLVD
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32205

GOLDWATER INDUSTRIES
17221 S. WESTERN AVE
GARDENA, CA 90247

MARCOBO UNIFORMS
3535 YARBROUGH
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

REGIONAL UNIFORM & SUPPLY
141 SUMIT AVE. STE 2
PLANO, TEXAS 75074

GT DISTRIBUTORS
5426 GUADALUPE ST/~
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78751

PO BOX 7455
TAMPA, FL 33673

\&O
MARTIN’S UNIFOR%II;//

MAGIC CITY SALES
4363 FIRST AVE NORTH
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35222

DICK RIDDLE
PO BOX 2168
MADISON, MS 39130

WEARGUARD
141 LONGWATER DR
NORWELL, MA 02061

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MENS
STORE

304 E. OVERLAND

EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

DENTON, TEXAS 76202

HARBOR LINEN CO.
PO BOX 3510
CHERRY HILL, IN 08034

PIMA UNIFORMS
3760 S. PARKWAY
STE.C

TUCSON, AZ 85713

SUPREME UNIFORMS
2631 WYOMING AVE.
EL PASO, TEXAS 79903

WORKWEAR SAFETY
1346 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TEXAS 79936

PORTMOUTH ARMIE NAVIE
STORES, INC.

1817 HIGH ST.
PORTSMOUTH, VA 23704

BOTACH
925 4157 ST, STE 306
MIAMI BEACH.FL 33140

UNIFORMS MANUFACTORING
PO BOX 12716
SCOSTDALE, AZ 85267

PRIZM INC/UNIPRO
320 ELIZABETH AVE SUITE 204
NEWWARK, NJ 07112

XCLUSIVE LAW ENFORCEMENT
3004 DONNER LAKE CIRCLE
DENTON, TX 76210-2900




EMBRIODERY MACHINES PLUS
LLC

1309 TEXAS AVE

EL PASO, TEXAS 79901

VERNON SALES PROMO
2625 DESERT AIRE
CHAPARRAL, NM 88081

US CAVALRY
2855 CENTENNIAL AVE
RADCLIFF, KY 40160

PARROTT PRODUCTIONS
409 N. CAROLINA DR
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915

PRUDENTIAL OVERALL SUPPLY
200 E. SUNSET DR, SUITE G
EL PASO, TEXAS 79922

MILTON A. GOLDBERT CO.
7 SEWARD AVE
BEVERLY, MA 01915

UTDR K /?/},L’}M)

, TEXAS 79912'

MATTEW OPPERMAN
15832 SW 66 LANE
MIAMI, FL 33193-3637

TRANSCON MANUFACTORING
5725 SOUTH MAIN ST
LOS ANGELES, CA 90037-4171

THE TOMASTON CORP.
303 FIFTH AVE v?g?‘
NEW YORK, NY 10016 \3

INDUSTRIAL DISC. FOOTWEAR
15324 WERLING CT
EL PASO, TEXAS 79928

EMBLEM ENTERPRISE
PO BOX 10033
VANNUYS, CA 91410

SERENDIPITY
36 FREDERICKSBURG ROAD
NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 78130-6016




