
Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

EST. UNIT EXTENDED
QTY. PRICE PRICE

MOTOR DRIVERS BLOWER
1. 30 EA [LONG BLADE ASM] NO BID NO BID

#2899-006-033 R6309980

2. 150 EA VOLTAGE REGULATOR $150.00 $22,500.00
R15581645

3. 10 EA FAULT INDICATOR $550.00 $5,500.00
G1001797R

4. 10 EA XSHIFT SELECTOR ALLISON $450.00 $4,500.00
R23048153

5. 10 EA ECU W/O PROM ALLISON $2,000.00 $20,000.00
R1228283

6. 5 EA ISO-OUTPUT CARD ALLEN BRADLEY $140.00 $700.00
1746-OX8 R037215

7. 15 EA SLC-OUTPUT CARD ALLEN BRADLEY $220.00 $3,300.00
1746-OW16 R037214

UNITITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

THE JANEK CORPORATION
TUCKERTON, NJ

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

R15581645

MANUFACTURER / BRAND G1001797R

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

MANUFACTURER / BRAND R1228283

MANUFACTURER / BRAND R23048153

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1746-0W16

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1746-0X8

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     1



Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

EST. UNIT EXTENDED
QTY. PRICE PRICE

8. 5 EA SLC-INPUT CARD ALLEN BRADLEY $170.00 $850.00
1746-1B16 R037212

9. 5 EA BDC RELAY BROAD ALLEN BRADLEY $1,000.00 $5,000.00
1791-8BR R037425

10. 10 EA BDC RELAY BROAD ALLEN BRADLEY $575.00 $5,750.00
1791-8BR R037425

11. 10 EA RELAY CARD ALLEN BRADLEY $600.00 $6,000.00
1747-L524 R037217

12. 5 EA REMOTE I/O SCANNER ALLEN BRADLEY $500.00 $2,500.00
1747-SN R037216

13. 5 EA POWER PACK ALLEN BRADLEY $450.00 $2,250.00
1746-A7 R037828

14. 5 EA SHIFT SELECTOR ALLISON $600.00 $3,000.00
R029507949

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

THE JANEK CORPORATION
TUCKERTON, NJ

ITEM 
NO. UNIT DESCRIPTION

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1791-24BR

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1746-1B16

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1747-L524

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1791-8BR

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1746-A7

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1747-SN

MANUFACTURER / BRAND R029507949

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     2



Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

EST. UNIT EXTENDED
QTY. PRICE PRICE

15. 5 EA SHIFT SELECTOR ZF $300.00 $1,500.00
6006-017-208

16. 20 EA MODULE, WHEELCHAIR $120.00 $2,400.00
G1074538R

17. 150 EA VOLTAGE REGULATOR $150.00 $22,500.00
15581645

18. 50 EA MODULE KNEEL $100.00 $5,000.00
G1074539

19. 8 EA J-BOX ASSY SEP-DEPLOY $500.00 $4,000.00
LU12 371-0317 LIFT-U

20. 8 EA J-BOX ASSY LIFT-U $500.00 $4,000.00
D371-0184

21. 6 EA SHIFT SELECTOR $600.00 $3,600.00
23048153

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

TUCKERTON, NJ

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
MANUFACTURER / BRAND 23048153

THE JANEK CORPORATION

MANUFACTURER / BRAND D371-0184

ITEM 
NO. UNIT DESCRIPTION

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 6006-017-208

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 15581645

MANUFACTURER / BRAND G1074538R

MANUFACTURER / BRAND LU12371-0317

MANUFACTURER / BRAND G1074539

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     3



Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

EST. UNIT EXTENDED
QTY. PRICE PRICE

22. 9 EA SHIFT SELECTOR $600.00 $5,400.00
29507949

23. 5 EA 1/0 BLOCK ALLEN BRADLEY $1,000.00 $5,000.00
1791-24BR-R037430

24. 5 EA MULTIPLEX MODULE VMM VANSCO $600.00 $3,000.00
MDL 233660

25. 5 EA BLOWER 24V NO BID NO BID
MCC#15-0584 6341385

26. 5 EA BLOWER 24V NO BID NO BID
MCC#15-0584 6341385

27. 5 EA BOOSTER BLOWER 24V NO BID NO BID
MCC# 150512 218687

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

THE JANEK CORPORATION
TUCKERTON, NJ

ITEM 
NO. UNIT DESCRIPTION

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 1791-24BR

MANUFACTURER / BRAND 29507949

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

MANUFACTURER / BRAND VMM VANSCO

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     4



Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

EST. UNIT EXTENDED
QTY. PRICE PRICE

28. 5 EA BLOWER 24V NO BID NO BID
MCC#15-1984 6319932

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

MANUFACTURER / BRAND

TUCKERTON, NJ

ANNUAL TOTAL: $138,250.00

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

THE JANEK CORPORATION

ITEM 
NO. UNIT DESCRIPTION

X

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     5



Solicitation #:  2011-318
Project Name:  Rebuilt Electrical Components Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

in cases of emergency

BIDS SOLICITED:  23 BIDS RECEIVED:  1 BIDS LOCAL:  11 NO BIDS:  0
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order
24

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
14

THE JANEK CORPORATION

Bid Opening Date:  August 24, 2011

TUCKERTON, NJ

   NO

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

YES

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

X

APPROVED BY:     /s/            DATE:     08/25/2011     6


