Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE (EST. QTY. X UNIT PRICE (EST. QTY. X UNIT PRICE (EST. QTY. X UNIT PRICE (EST. QTY. X
NO. QTY. UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
1. 100 PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 5" X 7" $40.00 $4,000.00 $56.00 $5,600.00 $55.10 $5,510.00 $41.95 $4,195.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBA - 1010 ADA SE-2011-08 SE-2011-08 TP#PB-S10-B23-Y
2 70 PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" X 12" $55.00 $3,850.00 $74.00 $5,180.00 $72.60 $5,082.00 $60.95 $4,266.50
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBA - 1020 ADA SE-2013-08 SE-2013-08 TP#PB-S10-B43-Y
3. 100 PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" X 7" $10.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $7.00 $700.00 $6.50 $650.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP CRYSTAL SIGNS HALL
MODEL R10-4B-5X7LR R10-4B 5X7.75 NO ARROW|
4 70 PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" X 12" $13.00 $910.00 NO BID NO BID $10.00 $700.00 $9.50 $665.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP CRYSTAL SIGNS HALL
MODEL R10-4B-9X12LR R10-4B 9X12 NO ARROW
5. 100 ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER NO BID $104.00 | $10,400.00 | $102.30 | $10,230.00 $50.50 $5,050.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL SK-0230 SK-0230 TP#6113 MANUF. PAINT YELLOW

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE:

9/8/11



Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
6. 100 |MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET| $60.00 $6,000.00 $70.37 $7,037.00 $69.75 $6,975.00 $59.50 $5,950.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL AB-3009-62-SS AS-3009-84-SS TP#5624
7. 50 HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS $14.00 $700.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $19.90 $995.00 $11.95 $597.50
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL CF - 260 SE-4038 SE-4038 TP#5860
8. 50 HARDWARE - HORIZONTAL $12.00 $600.00 $17.00 $850.00 $17.05 $852.50 $10.00 $500.00
EACH SLIP TEE (STEEL) EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL TF -250RR SE-4092-SBE SE-4092-SBE TP#2750/TP#12 PAINT YELLOW
9. 100 HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM HOLE $8.00 $800.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $9.65 $965.00 $7.25 $725.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO, AS PICTURED, FIG. 9 CH
MODEL PBH - 425LG SE-0357 SE-0357 TP#5357
10. 120 HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE $8.00 $960.00 $11.00 $1,320.00 $9.65 $1,158.00 $7.25 $870.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PBH - 420 SE-4071 SE-0454 TP#5358

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Is/

DATE:

9/8/11



Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011

Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
11. 50 ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON $20.00 $1,000.00 $52.00 $2,600.00 $52.00 $2,600.00 $16.00 $800.00
EACH ASSEMBLY WITH 2" PLUNGER EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PB-3-ADA SE-2149-08 SE-2149-08 TP#PB-S10-B00-Y
12. 60 SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL $30.00 $1,800.00 $32.00 $1,920.00 $32.50 $1,950.00 $37.10 $2,226.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PJS - 110 SE-3106 SE-3106 TP#2583/TP#14 PAINT YELLOW
13. 50 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 15' | NO BID $243.00 | $12,150.00 | $259.00 | $12,950.00 | $297.00 | $14,850.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER PELCO PELCO CPI
MODEL PB-5100-15 PB-5100-15, PB-5402 TP#6055-15X/TP#1005
14. 50 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" X 12' | NO BID $200.00 | $10,000.00 | $219.00 | $10,950.00 | $247.00 | $12,350.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER PELCO PELCO CPI
MODEL PB-5100-12 PB-5100-12, PB-5402 TP#6054X/TP#1005
15. 50 NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) $4.00 $200.00 $6.25 $312.50 $6.10 $305.00 $10.00 $500.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL PN-150-A-2.50 CT SE-0309-2.13 SE-0309-02.125 TP#7245
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE:

9/8/11



Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
16. | 100 HEX NIPPLE FIG. 16 ITEM PART 1 $3.00 $300.00 $4.00 $400.00 $3.90 $390.00 $2.40 $240.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL HN-150 SE-0448 SE-0448 TP#232
17. | 100 SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) $0.30 $30.00 $0.40 $40.00 $0.50 $50.00 $0.25 $25.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL FS-3217-SS FS-3217-SS TP#5271
18. 100 HEX NIPPLE FIG. 16 ITEM PART 6 $3.50 $350.00 $4.00 $400.00 $4.05 $405.00 $2.75 $275.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL CN-H-150 SE-0443 SE-0443 TP#4290
19. | 100 GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE $0.30 $30.00 $0.30 $30.00 $0.45 $45.00 $0.44 $44.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL RW-150 SE-0354 SE-0354 TP#2127
20. 50 CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE $2.00 $100.00 $3.00 $150.00 $2.95 $147.50 $1.90 $95.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER GTE CORP PELCO PELCO CH
MODEL CC-195 SE-4088 SE-4088 TP#231
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE:

9/8/11




Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320

Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL EXTENDED TOTAL
ITEM | EST. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST.QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. || UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE | PRICE (EST. QTY.
NO. QTY. X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE) X UNIT PRICE)
21. | 200 BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL | $118.00 | $23,600.00 | $115.00 | $23,000.00 | $175.00 | $35,000.00 | $178.00 | $35,600.00
EACH EA. EA. EA. EA.
MANUFACTURER COMPONENT PELCO PELCO CPI & CH
MODEL PRODS SP-1014-TX SP-1014-TXTT TP#1-6016, 4-4208, 3-7155, & 3-7156
ITEMS 1-21 TOTAL PRICE: $46,230.00 $83,389.50 $97,960.00 $90,474.00
(BIDDER'S EXT. TOTAL PRICE:
NONE STATED)
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), — — — —
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: T T - T
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), — — — —
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: T T - T
NO OPTION OFFERED ] X | X | X |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE:

9/8/11




Bid Opening Date: August 31, 2011
Project Name: Traffic Signal Components

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2011-320
Department: Transportation

GENERAL TRAFFIC PARADIGM TRAFFIC TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS TRAFFIC PARTS INC
EQUIPMENT CORP. SYSTEMS, INC. ROUND ROCK, TX CONROE, TX
NEWBURGH, NY ARLINGTON, TX
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
oy PROCUREMENT CARD: YES[X] No[ ] YES[ | No[X] YES[X] No[ ] YES[X] No[ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
o _ 30 30-45 30-45 30-45
Within ___ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of
48 30-45 NA 24

verbal order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 14

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE:

9/8/11






