



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011
 Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335
 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

		MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION			
1.	A/C COMPRESSOR AND PARTS CARRIER TRANSICOLD	NET <input type="checkbox"/> OR - <u>25</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> OR + ___ % MARK-UP <input type="checkbox"/>	NONE STATED NET <input type="checkbox"/> OR - ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> OR + ___ % MARK-UP <input type="checkbox"/>	
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG _____		<u>CARRIER 2011</u>	<u>NONE STATED</u>	
(Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)				
List Number _____		<u>NONE STATED</u>	<u>NONE STATED</u>	
Dated _____		<u>NONE STATED</u>	<u>NONE STATED</u>	
TYPE OF PRICE LIST:		<u>NONE STATED</u>	<u>NONE STATED</u>	
WHOLESALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
DEALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
OTHER _____		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <u>LIST</u>	<input type="checkbox"/> _____	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011
 Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335
 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

	MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION		
2.	A/C COMPRESSOR AND PARTS THERMO KING	NET <input type="checkbox"/> OR - ____% DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> OR + ____% MARK-UP <input type="checkbox"/>	NONE STATED NET <input type="checkbox"/> OR - ____% DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> OR + ____% MARK-UP <input type="checkbox"/>
PRICE LIST OR CATALOG _____ (Note: Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)		<u>NO BID</u>	<u>NONE STATED</u>
List Number _____		_____	<u>NONE STATED</u>
Dated _____		_____	<u>NONE STATED</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST:		<u>NONE STATED</u>	
WHOLESALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____		<input type="checkbox"/> _____	<input type="checkbox"/> _____

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / sl

DATE: 09/14/2011



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011

Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

	MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
TWO (2) ELECTRONIC COPIES OR HARDCOPIES OF EACH MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) SUBMITTED:		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> NONE STATED
ITEM NO.	PART B: SAMPLE PRICING	CARRIER TRANSICOLD	
1.	DESCRIPTION:	A/C COMPRESSOR REMANUFACTURED CARRIER TRANSICOLD #17-44062-00	A/C COMPRESSOR REMANUFACTURED CARRIER TRANSICOLD #17-44062-00
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	17-44062-00RM2	NONE STATED
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$2,247.00	NONE STATED
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$1,685.25	NONE STATED
1A.	DESCRIPTION:	CORE CHARGES (WHEN APPLICABLE) 17-44062-00RM2C	CORE CHARGES (WHEN APPLICABLE) 17-44062-00RM2C
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	17-44062-00RM2C	NONE STATED
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$1,000.00	NONE STATED
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$750.00	NONE STATED
1B.	DESCRIPTION:	A/C COMPRESSOR NEW CARRIER TRANSICOLD #17-44062-00	A/C COMPRESSOR NEW CARRIER TRANSICOLD #17-44062-00
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	17-44062-00 / 17-44062-00C	NONE STATED
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER / CARRIER	NONE STATED
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$2,824.05 / \$2,118.04	NONE STATED
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$1,000.00 / \$750.00	NONE STATED

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011
 Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335
 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

		MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
ITEM NO.	PART B: SAMPLE PRICING	CARRIER TRANSICOLD		
2.	DESCRIPTION:	SUCTION VALVE 68PD-1-323	SUCTION VALVE 68PD-1-323	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	68PD-1-323	NONE STATED	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$262.08	NONE STATED	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$196.56	NONE STATED	
3.	DESCRIPTION:	DISCHARGE VALVE 68PD-1-333	DISCHARGE VALVE 68PD-1-333	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	68PD-1-333	NONE STATED	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$133.71	NONE STATED	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$100.28	NONE STATED	
4.	DESCRIPTION:	SEAL KIT 16I-2-112	SEAL KIT 16I-2-112	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	17-44770-00	NONE STATED	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$136.27	NONE STATED	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$102.20	NONE STATED	
5.	DESCRIPTION:	HUB 17-44041-01	HUB 17-44041-01	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	17-44041-01	NONE STATED	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	CARRIER	NONE STATED	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	\$100.21	NONE STATED	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):	\$75.16	NONE STATED	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011
 Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335
 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

		MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
ITEM NO.	PART B: SAMPLE PRICING	THERMO KING		
6.	DESCRIPTION:	A/C COMPRESSOR REMANUFACTURED THERMO KING #8102-499	A/C COMPRESSOR REMANUFACTURED THERMO KING #8102-499	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		810-2917	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		810-2917	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$2,879.54	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$2,289.23	
6A.	DESCRIPTION:	CORE CHARGES (WHEN APPLICABLE)	CORE CHARGES (WHEN APPLICABLE)	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		810-2917C	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		810-2917C	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$1,500.00	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$1,500.00	
6B.	DESCRIPTION:	A/C COMPRESSOR NEW THERMO KING #8102-499	A/C COMPRESSOR NEW THERMO KING #8102-499	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		810-2917	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		810-2917	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$2,879.54	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$2,289.23	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011
 Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335
 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

		MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
ITEM NO.	PART B: SAMPLE PRICING	THERMO KING		
7.	DESCRIPTION:	SUCTION VALVE 66-9404	SUCTION VALVE 66-9404	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		66-9404	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		66-9404	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$501.58	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$358.13	
8.	DESCRIPTION:	DISCHARGE VALVE 66-9406	DISCHARGE VALVE 66-9406	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		66-9406	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		66-9406	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$408.28	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$291.51	
9.	DESCRIPTION:	SEAL KIT 107-192	SEAL KIT 107-192	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		107-192	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		107-192	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$963.12	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$678.04 (\$378.67)	
10.	DESCRIPTION:	HUB 77-2392	HUB 77-2392	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:		77-2392	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:		77-2392	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):	NO BID	\$453.25	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up):		\$319.09 (\$323.62)	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011

Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

	MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
CARRIER TRANSICOLD, THERMO KING O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED FOR PARTS, SERVICE TECHNICIANS AND REMANUFACTURED A/C COMPRESSOR	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	
<p style="text-align: center;"><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
NO OPTION OFFERED	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Bid Opening Date: August 24, 2011

Project Name: A/C Compressor's Carrier Transicold & Thermo King

Solicitation #: 2011-335

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

	MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	THERMO KING WEST EL PASO, TX.	
PAYMENT TERMS:	NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD:	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ___ consecutive calendar days	10/20 PARTS/COMPRESSORS	7	
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency	N/A	24-48	
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			
BIDS SOLICITED: 38	BIDS RECEIVED: 2	BIDS LOCAL: 17	NO BIDS: 1

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE: 09/14/2011