
Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

1A ANTIFREEZE YELLOW

1B ANTIFREEZE YELLOW

2A ANTIFREEZE RED

2B ANTIFREEZE RED

3A

3B

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 

UNIT PRICE

NO BID

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

$330.16 + TAX IF ANY

NO BID

GALLON

DRUM

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

DRUM

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department:  General Services

GROUP A:  ANTIFREEZE 

Solicitation #:  2012-051

MANUFACTURER 

NO BID

DRUM

NO BID

$452.77 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

ANTIFREEZE RED / EXTENDED 
LIFE NO BID NO BID

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

ANTIFREEZE RED / EXTENDED 
LIFE $452.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

PAR PRODUCTS
ANTIFREEZE 50/50

CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50

227811 982

CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50

227811 982

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 1



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

4A ANTIFREEZE BLUE

4B ANTIFREEZE BLUE

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

1A MOTOR OIL CJ4

1B MOTOR OIL CJ4

2A

2B

NO BID

Solicitation #:  2012-051

NO BID NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department:  General Services

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
330 GL TOTE 330 GL TOTE

GROUP A:  ANTIFREEZE 

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

GALLON GALLON GALLON
$9.23 $18.05 $18.05 NO BID

$530.20 + TAX IF ANY $1,062.60 $1,062.60 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM

SINCLAIR HD SYNTHETIC

BLEND 814-001

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
STRATA XTREME CJ-4 15W40

10177023 / 10181792

GALLON
N/A N/A N/A N/A

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

NO BID

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

MOTOR OIL 15W40 
LOW ASH

MOTOR OIL 15W40 
LOW ASH

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

$780.45 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BID

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CHEVRON HDAX
15W40 232331

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
ULTRA 15W40LJ-4

10177022 / 10172337

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 2



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

3A

3B

4A

4B

5A

5B

N/A N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) $711.15 + TAX IF ANY $867.35 NO BID

DRUM DRUM

N/A
MOTOR OIL SAE 10WBULK

(GALLON)

$867.35MOTOR OIL SAE 10W
DRUM

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

UNIT PRICE
GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

Solicitation #:  2012-051

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 30W N/A N/A

CHEVRON DELO 400 30W

235118

DRUM DRUM
$711.15 + TAX IF ANY $867.35

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 30W

N/A N/A N/A N/A
BULK

(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20

$667.15 + TAX IF ANY $947.10DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
STRATA XTREME 5W20

10187682

$947.10 NO BID

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

VALVOLINE PC 5W20

VV110

DRUM DRUM DRUM

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

DRUM

N/A

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
SG10W

10189916

$867.35 NO BID

N/A

CHEVRON DELO 400 10W 

235109

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
STRATA 10

10187718

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
ULTRA 5W20

10189896

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
STRATA 30

10042697

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
SG30W

10185486

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 3



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

6A

6B

7A

7B

8A

8B

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

Solicitation #:  2012-051

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30

N/A N/A N/A N/A

$459.25 + TAX IF ANY $947.10

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30

DRUM

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30 $658.35 + TAX IF ANY $947.10

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department:  General Services

$947.10 NO BID

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30

DRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

$947.10 NO BID
DRUM

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

N/A

$916.30 NO BID

BULK
(GALLON) ATF DEXRON III

N/A N/A

$476.85 $916.30DRUM
(55 GALLON) ATF DEXRON III

DRUM DRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

N/A N/A

10189901

CHEVRON ATF NOD3 CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
LUBEMASTER ATF

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA 
SYSTEM ATF

226502 10190019 10190008

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

N/A

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
ULTRA 10W30VALVOLINE PC 10W30 CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 

STRATA XTREME 10W30

N/A N/A

DRUM DRUM

SINCLAIR SUPREME

SYNTHETIC BLEND 5W30

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
STRATA XTREME 5W30

VV124 10062946

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA MAX 
ULTRA 5W30

10187679 10189893

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 4



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

9A

9B

10A

10B

11A

11B

Solicitation #:  2012-051

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

N/A N/A N/A
BULK

(GALLON)
TRANSMISSION FLUID 

MERCON V

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

N/A

$881.65 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00 $2,255.00 NO BID

Department:  General Services

DRUMDRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

TRANSMISSION FLUID 
MERCON V

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

BULK
(GALLON) TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 $1,051.05 + TAX IF ANY NO BID

BULK
(GALLON) MERCON LV

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM

N/A NO BID NO BID N/A

NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MERCON LV NO BID NO BID

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
M/M TRANS V ATF

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

226533

226719 10187344 10187344

CHEVRON ATF + 4

CHEVRON ATF MERCON5

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CHEMSEARCH M/M TRANS V 
ATF

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 5



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

12A

12B

13A

13B

14A

14B

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

225039 10194601 10193091

CHEVRON RPM UNIVERSAL 
GEAR OIL 85W140

CHEMSEARCH GEARCO SAE 
85W140

Solicitation #:  2012-051

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA 
SYSTEMS TH

226608 10070636 10189989

UNIT PRICE

N/A N/A
BULK

(GALLON) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

N/A N/A

$750.75 + TAX IF ANY $930.60 $930.60 NO BID

N/A N/A

$1,104.00

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
CERTOP 85W140

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
BULK

(GALLON) UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140
N/A N/A

NO BID

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
(55 GALLON) UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140

DRUM DRUM DRUM
$750.00 + TAX IF ANY

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

N/AN/A
BULK

(GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50
N/A

DRUM DRUM DRUM

N/A

$1,104.00

DRIVE TRAIN CHEVRON FLUID 
30W

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
OIL ALL PLUS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department:  General Services

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TXGROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

DRUM

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

$1,680.00 + TAX IF ANY $2,396.00 $2,396.00 NO BIDDRUM
(55 GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50

DRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER CHEVRON RPM SYNTHETIC 50 CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
LUBEMASTER SAE 50

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA 
SYSTEMS SYN SAE 50

210456 10172926 10172734

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 6



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

15A

15B

16A

16B

1A

1B

$1,513.00 + TX IF ANY $2,120.00 $2,120.00

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Department:  General Services
Solicitation #:  2012-051

N/A

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

N/A

UNIT PRICE
BULK

(GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140
N/A N/A

NO BID
DRUM

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 

CERTOP SN 80W140
CHEMSEARCH LUBRA TECH 

SYN 80W140

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140

DRUM
CHEVRON DELO SYNTHETIC 

GEAR LUBE 80W140

277109

BULK
(GALLON)

MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, 
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED 

GREASE
N/A N/A

N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, 
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED 

GREASE
$1,052.00 + TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) TRANSYND OIL

N/A N/A

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

CHEVRON SYNTHETIC ATF HD CERTIFIED LABORATORIES M/M 
TORQUE GLIDE

TRANSYND OIL
DRUM DRUM

$1,517.45 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00 $2,255.00 $1,642.74

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM DRUM

N/A

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

DRUM

10172931 10172731

CHEVRON MOLY GREASE #2

$1,212.00
DRUM DRUM

N/A N/A

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
LITHIPLEX CHEMSEARCH LUBRAPLEX 

$1,212.00 NO BID

CASTROL TRANSYND 

226718 10177252 10177252 ALLISON TES295

CHEMSEARCH M/M TORQUE 
GLIDE

255660 10190625 10189890

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 7



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

2A

2B

3A

3B

Solicitation #:  2012-051

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department:  General Services

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

NO BID NO BID

N/A N/A N/A N/ABULK
(GALLON)

MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC 
BLEND ATF

NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC 
BLEND ATF

N/A

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

N/A

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

BULK
(GALLON) ATF+4

$1,051.05 + TAX IF ANY NO BID NO BIDDRUM
(55 GALLON) ATF+4 NO BID

N/A N/A

DRUM
CHEVRON ATF + 4

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

226533

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 8



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

4A

4B

5A

5B

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES M/M 
TRANS V ATF

Department:  General Services
Solicitation #:  2012-051

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

BULK
(GALLON) MERCON V

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

N/A N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MERCON V $881.65 + TAX IF ANY $2,255.00

DEXRON VI

$2,255.00 NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM

10187344 10187344

N/A

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) DEXRON VI N/A N/A N/A

$1,111.55 + TAX IF ANY NO BID

DRUM

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER CHEVRON DEXRON VI ATF

CHEVRON MERCON 

226719

226532

CHEMSEARCH M/M TRANS V 
ATF

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 9



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

6A

6B

7A

7B

DRUMDRUM

$791.45

DRUM

$791.45

N/A

NO BID

N/A

N/A N/AN/A

$667.15 + TAX IF ANY

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
HOC68CHEVRON RANDO HD68

273279 10172716 10186293

N/A

UNIT PRICE

$737.35 + TAX IF ANY

BULK
(GALLON)

HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO 
VG 100

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

N/AN/A

NO BID$791.45 $791.45

273263 10042741 10189950

DRUM
CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 

HOC100

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

CHEVRON RANDO 
HDZ 100

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

DRUM

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26

MANUFACTURER 

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO 
VG 100

DRUM

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA GUARD 
ISO 68

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA GUARD 
ISO 100

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 10



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

8A

8B

9A

9B

N/A

NO BID

N/A

$981.20

N/A

UNIT PRICE

$669.90 + TAX IF ANY

UNIT PRICE

N/A

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

$930.60 NO BID

UNIT PRICE

BULK
(GALLON) MOBIL 424 N/A

UNIT PRICE

N/A

DRUMDRUM DRUM

BULK
(GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL

$492.25 + TAX IF ANY $930.60

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOBIL 424

N/AN/A

MANUFACTURER CHEVRON HEAT TRANSFER 
OIL 46

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
PYROTHERM

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL $981.20

DRUM

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

231709 10188458 10193147

CHEMSEARCH FT HTO

DRUM DRUM

CHEVRON 1000 THF

226606 10070636 10189989

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES OIL 
ALL PLUS

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA 
SYSTEMS TH F

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 11



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

10A

10B

11A

11B

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE 
J20C-D)

BULK
(GALLON)

POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE 
J20C-D)

N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE

NO BID

N/A

N/A N/A

$930.60 NO BID
DRUM

NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA 
SYSTEMS TH  F

10189989

Department:  General Services

N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
$930.60

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES OIL 
ALL PLUS

10070636

NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 12



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

12A

12B

ITEM

1.

2.

3.

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BUYBACK USED ANTIFREEZE

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

PRICEDESCRIPTION

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46
330 GL TOTE

GALLON GALLON

330 GL TOTE
$7.29 + TAX IF ANY $13.60 $13.60 NO BID

$426.25 + TAX IF ANY $791.45

BULK
(GALLON)

NO BID
DRUM DRUM DRUM

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
GROUP D:  RECYCLE OR BUYBACK OF 

USED OIL AND FILTERS
MUST BE LISTED SEPARATELY ON ALL INVOICES

BUYBACK WASTE MOTOR OIL

BUYBACK USED OIL FILTERS

10035453 / 10197155-330

CHEMSEARCH LUBRA GUARD 
ISO-46

$791.45

GALLON

255674 10063996 / 10177153-330

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES 
HOC46CHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL 46

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 13



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF
THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

Department:  General Services

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051

NO   YES          NO

NET - 30 DAYS ____% - 30 DAYS ____ % - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

  YES          NO   YES          NO   YES          

PURSUANT TO THE ABOVE REQUIREMENTS IN THE REQUIRED 
DELIVERY SECTION, BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS:                          
WITHIN___________CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS                                

WITHIN______________HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF 
VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY

BREWER OIL CO.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

2 DAYS 5 - 7 DAYS 5-7 DAYS 14 DAYS

NCH CORPORATION
CERTIFIED 

LABORATORIES DIV.
IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION
CHEMSEARCH DIV.

IRVING, TX

STEWART & 
STEVENSON POWER 

PRODUCTS, LLC
EL PASO, TX

24 HOURS
2 DAYS - ALL HAZARDOUS 

INCLUDING ORMA & LIMITED 
QUANTITY  NOT ALLOWED TO 
GO AIR WITHOUT APPROVAL

2 DAYS - ALL HAZARDOUS 
INCLUDING ORMA & LIMITED 

QUANTITY  NOT ALLOWED TO 
GO AIR WITHOUT APPROVAL

24 HOURS

X

X

X X

X X

X

X

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 14



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

1A ANTIFREEZE YELLOW

1B ANTIFREEZE YELLOW

2A ANTIFREEZE RED

2B ANTIFREEZE RED

3A

3B

THERMO FLUIDS 
ECO-SHIELD

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

GROUP A:  ANTIFREEZE 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BULK
(GALLON) GALLON GALLON

DRUM

$5.00 NO BID $8.23

$297.00 NO BID $499.40

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) GALLON

ECO-SHIELD

DRUM
MANUFACTURER THERMO FLUIDS 

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

$5.50 NO BID $15.00
GALLON

DRUM
(55 GALLON) $324.50 NO BID

GALLON

$871.75
DRUM DRUM

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON)

ANTRIFREEZE RED / 
EXTENDED LIFE $5.50 NO BID $15.00

NO BID $871.75

GALLON

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

THERMO FLUIDS 
ECO-SHIELD

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

ANTRIFREEZE RED / 
EXTENDED LIFE DRUM

$324.50

FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL 
CONCENTRATE

OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES 
FINAL CHARGE GLOBAL 

CONCENTRATE
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

DRUM

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES 
FULL FORCE LONGLIFE 

CONCENTRATE

OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES 

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 15



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

4A ANTIFREEZE BLUE

4B ANTIFREEZE BLUE

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

1A MOTOR OIL CJ4

1B MOTOR OIL CJ4

2A

2B

GROUP A:  ANTIFREEZE 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

BULK
(GALLON) GALLON

$4.75 NO BID NO BID

DRUM
(55 GALLON) $283.25 NO BID NO BID

DRUM

UNIT PRICE

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

GALLON

UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS 
ECO-SHIELD

UNIT PRICE

DRUM

BULK
(GALLON) NO BID $7.64

MANUFACTURER 

GALLON

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

DRUM
NO BID $440.00 $521.95

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON)

MOTOR OIL 15W40 
LOW ASH GALLON GALLON

NO BID $9.68 $12.91

NO BID $549.45 $750.20
DRUM

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MOTOR OIL 15W40 
LOW ASH DRUM

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

MOBIL FLEET

$8.78

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MOBIL GEO 15W40

CITGO MILEMASTER
661455008097 15W40 CJ4

CITGO CITGARD NATURAL GAS

632015001097

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 16



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

3A

3B

4A

4B

5A

5B

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

MOTOR OIL SAE 10W N/A N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W NO BID $399.30

BULK
(GALLON)

DRUM DRUM

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 30W N/A N/A N/A

NO BID $409.75 $650.65
DRUM

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 30W

DRUM

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20 N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W20 NO BID $409.75 $545.05

DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

MOBIL DELVAC 1230

MOBIL SPECIAL 5W20

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MOBIL HYDRAULIC 10W

$664.95

CITGO MILEMASTER
661450008097

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITGO MILEMASTER
661453008010

CITGO MILEMASTER
661402008097

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 17



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

6A

6B

7A

7B

8A

8B

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30 N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 5W30 NO BID $409.75 $542.85

DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30 N/A N/A N/A

$409.75 $535.15
DRUM

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOTOR OIL SAE 10W30

DRUM
NO BID

BULK
(GALLON) ATF DEXRON III N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) ATF DEXRON III NO BID $399.30

DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

661433008097

MOBIL SPECIAL 5W30

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL ATF D/M

$565.40
DRUM

661405008097

CITGO MILEMASTER MOBIL SPECIAL 10W30
661413008097

CITGO MILEMASTER

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 18



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

9A

9B

10A

10B

11A

11B

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

BULK
(GALLON)

TRANSMISSION FLUID 
MERCON V N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

TRANSMISSION FLUID 
MERCON V NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3 N/A N/A N/A

NO BID $797.50 NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) TRANSMISSION FLUID ATF+3

DRUM

633179001001
CITGO TRANSGARD ATV

BULK
(GALLON) MERCON LV N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MERCON LV NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SUB MOBIL MULTI VEHICLE 
ATF

SUB MOBIL ATF+4

MOTOR CRAFT DEALER 
PRODUCT

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 19



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

12A

12B

13A

13B

14A

14B

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

N/A N/A N/ABULK
(GALLON) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR

MANUFACTURER 

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC FLUID TRACTOR NO BID $415.80

DRUM DRUM

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) UNIVERSAL GEAR OIL 85W140 NO BID $678.00 $664.00

N/A N/A N/A

$1,600.50

BULK
(GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 50 NO BID

DRUM DRUM

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

$1,451.25

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

631815001001

CITGO MILEMASTER TF MOBIL FLUID 424
661435008097

CITGO PREMIUM GEAR MP 85-
140 MOBILUBE PLUS 85-W140

631320001027

CITGO SYNTH. GEAR 50

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC 
TRANSMISSION FLUID 50

DRUM

$596.20

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 20



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

15A

15B

16A

16B

1A

1B

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

GROUP B:  MOTOR OIL & LUBRICANTS
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

BULK
(GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W140 NO BID $1,755.00 $1,290.00

DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON)

MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, 
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED 

GREASE
N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

NO BID $935.60 $1,051.52DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MOLY EXTREME PRESSURE, 
NLGI GRADE-2 BASED 

GREASE

BULK
(GALLON) TRANSYND OIL

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) TRANSYND OIL

DRUM
NO BID $1,420.00 $1,672.00

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

CITGO QUATRASYND

CITGO CM LYTHOPLEX
655352001015

632493001001

CITGO SYNTHETIC 75-140
632497001027

DRUM

DRUM

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC 
GEAR OIL 80W-140

MOBILGREASE XHP222 SPECIAL

MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC 
ATF

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 21



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

2A

2B

3A

3B

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

N/A

BULK
(GALLON)

MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC 
BLEND ATF

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

NO BID

N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

MULTI-VEHICLE SYNTHETIC 
BLEND ATF NO BID

N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) ATF+4

DRUM
(55 GALLON) ATF+4

DRUM
NO BID $797.50 $761.75

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM

$836.55
DRUM

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITGO TRANSGARD   
633179001001

MOBIL ATF+4

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MOBIL MULTI-VEHICLE ATF

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 22



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

4A

4B

5A

5B

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

BULK
(GALLON)

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

MERCON V N/A N/A N/A

N/A

NO BID NO BID

BULK
(GALLON) DEXRON VI N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MERCON V

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

NO BID NO BID $756.80DRUM
(55 GALLON) DEXRON VI

MOBIL DEXRON VI ATFMANUFACTURER 

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

DRUM

NO BID

SUB MOBIL MULTI 
VEHICLE ATF

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 23



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

6A

6B

7A

7B

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BULK

(GALLON)
HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO 

VG 100 N/A N/A

MANUFACTURER 

$830.50DRUM
(55 GALLON)

HYDRAULIC OIL DTE-18M ISO 
VG 100 NO BID

MOBIL DTEIDEXCEI 
SERIES 100

DRUM
NO BID

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26 N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL MOBIL DTE 26

N/A N/A

DRUM
NO BID $492.80 $621.50

DRUM
MOBIL DTE 26MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
CITGO AW68 ISO 68

633430001001
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

Department:  General Services
Solicitation #:  2012-051

N/A

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 24



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

8A

8B

9A

9B

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TXGROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

BULK
(GALLON) MOBIL 424

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) MOBIL 424 NO BID $632.50

633311001001

$596.20
DRUM DRUM

CITGO TRANSGUARD THC MOBIL FLUID 424MANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL N/AN/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HEAT TRANSFER OIL

DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
CITGO HYTHERM 46 MOBILTHERM 43

NO BID $616.00 $667.70

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.
635023001001

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 25



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

10A

10B

11A

11B

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

BULK
(GALLON)

POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE 
J20C-D) N/A N/A N/A

DRUM
(55 GALLON)

POWER TECH (JOHN DEERE 
J20C-D) NO BID $632.50

633311001001

NO BID
DRUM

CITGO TRANSGARD THFMANUFACTURER 
BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

BULK
(GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE N/AN/A N/A

NO BIDDRUM
(55 GALLON) RYKON ISO NON-CONDUCTIVE

DRUM
CITGO CP HYDRAULIC FLUID

633933001001
THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

NO BID $616.00

SUB MOBILFLUID 424

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 26



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

ITEM UNIT DESCRIPTION

12A

12B

ITEM

1.

2.

3.

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP C:  TRANSMISSION & HYDRAULIC 
OIL & FLUIDS

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

BULK
(GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46

GALLON
NO BID $6.20 NOT STATED

GALLON

DRUM
(55 GALLON) HYDRAULIC OIL GRADE 46 NO BID $360.80 $576.95

DRUM DRUM
MANUFACTURER 

BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER
GROUP D:  RECYCLE OR BUYBACK OF 

USED OIL AND FILTERS

CITGO MILEMASTER AW46 MOBIL NIETO46

661446008097

MUST BE LISTED SEPARATELY ON ALL INVOICES
DESCRIPTION PRICE

BUYBACK WASTE MOTOR OIL $1.05 / PER GALLON NO BID NO BID

BUYBACK USED ANTIFREEZE $0.00 / PER DRUM NO BID NO BID

BUYBACK USED OIL FILTERS $0.00 / PER DRUM NO BID NO BID

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 27



Bid Opening Date:  February 15, 2012
Project Name:  Motor Oil, Antifreeze, Lubricants, Transmission And Hydraulic Oil & Fluid

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED:                 13                       BIDS RECEIVED:               7                    BIDS LOCAL:       3               NO BIDS:         0

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.
SCOTTSDALE, AZ

TIGUA 
TRANSPORTATION, INC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN REFINING 
WHOLESALE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

48 HOURS

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #:  2012-051
Department:  General Services

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

  YES          NO   YES          NO   YES          NO   YES          NO

THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY
PURSUANT TO THE ABOVE REQUIREMENTS IN THE REQUIRED 
WITHIN______________HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF 

NOT STATED
NOT STATED

2 DAYS
4 HOURS

2 DAYS

X X X

X

X X X

APPROVED BY:____/s/_________ DATE:_03/07/12__ 28
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