
Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. 30 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (TRUCKS) $86.00 $2,580.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

2. 5 SOLDER TYPE - LARGE TRUCK $196.00 $980.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA. EA.

 

3. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - TRUCKS $196.00 $980.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

4. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT $306.00 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $6,070.00 $0.00 $0.00

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

QUANTITY

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE

PART A: REPAIR SERVICE
GROUP I:  RADIATORS - CLEAN AND REPAIR

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. 30 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (SEDANS & TRUCKS) $96.00 $2,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

2. 5 SOLDER TYPE - LARGE TRUCK $306.00 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA. EA.

 

3. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - TRUCKS $306.00 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

4. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT $476.00 $2,380.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $8,320.00 $0.00 $0.00

RE-TANK

 PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

RE-TANK

 PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

ONE TANK

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

ONE TANKA.  RADIATORS - RE-TANK ONE TANK

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

GROUP II:  RADIATORS - RE-TANK

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
RE-TANK

 PRICE

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. 30 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (SEDANS & TRUCKS) $196.00 $5,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TANKS TANKS TANKS

2. 5 SOLDER TYPE - LARGE TRUCK $456.00 $2,280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 TANKS TANKS TANKS

 

3. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - TRUCKS $456.00 $2,280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TANKS TANKS TANKS

4. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT $976.00 $4,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TANKS TANKS TANKS

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $15,320.00 $0.00 $0.00

BOTH TANKS BOTH TANKS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

GROUP II:  RADIATORS - RE-TANK (CONTINUED)

B.  RADIATORS -- RE-TANK

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
RE-TANK

 PRICE
QUANTITY

BOTH TANKS

RE-TANK

 PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

RE-TANK

 PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

EXTENDED PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

RETANK PRICE)

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. 5 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (SEDANS & TRUCKS) $196.00 $980.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

2. 5 SOLDER TYPE - LARGE TRUCK $456.00 $2,280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA. EA.

 

3. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - TRUCKS $456.00 $2,280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

4. 5 BOLT-ON TYPE - OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT $976.00 $4,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $10,420.00 $0.00 $0.00

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

GROUP III:  RADIATORS - RE-CORE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICEITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEM UNIT PRICE

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. 6 MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES $256.00 $1,536.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

2. 6 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT $356.00 $2,136.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA. EA.

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $3,672.00 $0.00 $0.00

UNIT PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

GROUP IV:  AIR-TO-AIR COOLER -- CLEAN AND REPAIR

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICEQUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEMITEM

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093
Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

1. HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES:

A. 5  STERLING PART #05-20667-002 $1,225.00 $6,125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

2. SOLDER TYPE - LARGE TRUCK

A. 5 KENWORTH PART #55179C $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

B. 5 CHEVY/GMC PART #550460 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

 EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

3. BOLT-ON TYPE-- TRUCKS:

A. 5 KENWORTH PART #239337 $1,695.00 $8,475.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

NO BID

SEE EXHIBIT A - BACK OF BID

SRM 8048

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

SRK7100-4 SPL CB

SEE EXHIBIT A - BACK OF BID

NO BID

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICE

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

GROUP V:   NEW RADIATORS 

ITEM QUANTITY
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

AND PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

4. BOLT-ON TYPE- OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT:

A. 5 KOMATSU PART #17A-03-0010 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

5. AIR TO AIR COOLER:

A. 5 STERLING/CONDOR AIR TO AIR COOLER $1,795.00 $8,975.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PART # 01-27978-002 EA. EA. EA.

BIDDER'S PART #

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE: $23,575.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SEE EXHIBIT A - BACK OF BID

ITEM QUANTITY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

AND PART NUMBER

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE 

(QUANTITY x 

UNIT PRICE)

EMMETT RADIATOR SERVICE, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

GROUP V:   NEW RADIATORS 

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

THE CONTRACTOR MAY BE REQUIRED TO PROVIDE OR USE

PARTS FOR THE SERVICING OF THE ABOVE ITEMS AND WILL

BE REIMBURSED BY THE CITY FOR THOSE PARTS. 

COPIES OF SUPPLIER'S INVOICES FOR THE COST OF ANY 

PARTS USED BY THE VENDOR MUST BE SUBMITTEND ALONG

WITH THE VENDOR'S INVOICES IN ORDER TO VERIFY THE NET 

COST AFTER APPLYING MARK-UP DISCOUNT AS NOTED BELOW.

INDICATE BELOW BY MARKING THE APPROPRIATE BLOCK IF 

THE CHARGE TO THE CITY WILL BE THE NET COST OF THE

PRODUCT OR IF A MARK-UP OR DISCOUNT WILL BE APPLIED

BY THE VENDOR.

NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

PART B: PARTS INVOLVED IN REPAIR SERVICE

NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP

EMMETT RADIATOR 

SERVICE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

             NET 

(NO COST TO THE CITY) 

  

_____% DISCOUNT

  167  % MARKUP 

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

             NET 

(NO COST TO THE CITY) 

  

_____% DISCOUNT

_____% MARKUP 

             NET 

(NO COST TO THE CITY) 

  

_____% DISCOUNT

_____% MARKUP X

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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Bid Opening Date:  July 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-093

Project Name:  VEHICLE RADIATOR & TANK REPAIRS AND SERVICES Department:  General Services

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE

TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDS SOLICITED:       10                       BIDS RECEIVED:      1                                           BIDS LOCAL:        10                     NO BID:   0      

     YES           NO      YES           NO      YES          NO

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

1% - 10 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EMMETT RADIATOR 

SERVICE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

X

X

APPROVE BY:       /s/      

DATE:  07/18/2012 
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