El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION JIL

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES BID # 2012-115|
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012 DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION
AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -| BORDER CONSTRUCTION
KWAL PAINT SHERWIN WILLIAMS DBA GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL PAIN
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CENTER SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ’ STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
ITEM | EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. | QTY. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 1" $2.64 $264.00 $3.00 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 1 1/2" $3.96 $396.00 $4.36 $436.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 2" $5.27 $527.00 $5.75 $575.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 50 THINN ER-MINERAL SPIRIT 1 GALLON $7.49 $374.50 $7.14 $357.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 25 CANVAS DROPS 4' x 15' 1002 $9.64 $241.00 $12.49 $312.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
25 CANVAS DROPS 9" x 12" 8 0z $14.27 $356.75 $18.65 $466.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$31.88
7 25 CANVAS DROPS 12'x15' 30 0z $41.36 $1,034.00 1007 $797.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$201.00
PAINTERS SPRAY SOCKS $0.55 $165.00 $0.67 VENDORS PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 300 $134.00
STRAINERS W/ELASTIC BAN $228.00 $600.00
9 300 (5 GALLONG SIZE) $0.76 VENDORS PRICE $2.00 VENDORS PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
NO BID $400.00
10 25 SMALL BRASS BRUSHES NO BID $1.59 $39.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3/4 WIRE BRUSH W/HANDLE & CRISSCROSS
12 15 DESIGN NO BID $4.69 $70.35 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$34.95 $12.79
13 50 BOX OF RAGS (COTTON) 25 LBS R hox $1,747.50 PER BOX $639.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8LBS
14 50 ROLLER GRID, METAL (5 GALLON SIZE) $1.24 $62.00 $1.35 $67.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:___6/26/12 2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNS'L_SP(/)M!I\_]; SHEII;IENFLQ;\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCFI’EIT\‘CT)EIFEQSSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ' STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
15 50 PREMIUM GREEN MASKING PAPER 9"x 180' $1.54 $77.00 $1.29 $64.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 60 BRUSH 3" POLYESTER $16.59 $995.40 $8.59 $515.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
17 60 BRUSH 1 1/2" ANGLE SASH POLYESTER $6.50 $390.00 $5.55 $333.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 60 BRUSH 2 1/2" ANGLE SASH POLYESTER $8.00 $480.00 $7.25 $435.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
19 | 400 ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 9" $3.96 $1,584.00 $3.19 $1,276.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 | 150 ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 4" $0.92 $138.00 $0.83 $124.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
21 | 150 WINNIE ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 6" $0.75 $112.50 $0.79 $118.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
22 | 350 LAMBSKIN ROLLER COVER 3/4" $7.20 $2,520.00 $7.45 $2,607.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23 200 LAMBSKIN ROLLER COVER 1 1/4" $7.84 $1,568.00 $7.59 $1,518.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
24 | 200 POLYESTER ROLLER COVER 4" $1.97 $394.00 $1.65 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
25 | 100 POLYESTER WINNIE ROLLER COVER 6" $1.65 $165.00 $3.47 $347.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$13.40
NO BID $0.67 VENDORS PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 20 5 GALLON BUCKET OPENER TOOL $335.00
27 15 4'x8' HEAVY DUTY EXTENSION POLES NO BID $18.75 $281.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
28 20 ROLLOR COVER & BRUSH CLEANER TOOL NO BID $13.85 $277.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
29 50 DUCT TAPE - RED $5.62 $281.00 $4.64 $232.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
30 60 WD-40 120z, SMART STRAW NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
a1 | o5 BUTTY KNIFE 1" $0.96 $24.00 $111-/§,5 $31.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
32 25 PUTTY KNIFE 3" $3.27 $81.75 $1.67 $41.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:__ 6/26/12

APPROVED BY: /sl

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -| BORDER CONSTRUCTION
KWAL PAINT SHERWIN WILLIAMS DBA GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL PAIN
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX CENTER SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ’ STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUN CITY BEIGE $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $71.70 | $43,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
33 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 SONORAN INT/EXT S/G
SUN CITY MARBLE $68.47 | $41,082.00 $71.70 | $43,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
34 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521391005 SONORAN INT/EXT S/G
SUN CITY OFF WHITE $68.47 |  $41,082.00 $71.70 |  $43,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
35 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521391005 SONORAN INT/EXT S/G
JOE PICKETT RED $42.08|  $25,248.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
36 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521635005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
CRIMSON RED $42.08 |  $25,248.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
37 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521635005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY WHITE $68.47 |  $41,082.00 $71.70 |  $43,020.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
38 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521391005 SONORAN INT/EXT S/G
CORNELLUS BROWN $61.30 |  $36,780.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
39 | 600
KWAL
APPROVED BY: MANWYFACTURER/BRAND #9521393005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNS'L_SP(/)M!I\_]; SHEEC/\/;Q;/\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCFI’EIT\‘CT)EIFEQSSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
' ' STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
HECTOR BROWN $50.17 |  $30,102.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
40 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521395005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
PARKS BROWN $50.17 |  $30,102.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
41 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521395005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY PEANUT SHELL $61.30 |  $36,780.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
42 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521393005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUNCITY / MISSION GREEN $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
43 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY PINK $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
44 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUNCITY YELLOW $61.30 |  $36,780.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
45 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521393005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

/sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNS'L_SP(/)M!I\_]; SHEII;IENFLQ;\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCFI’EIT\‘CT)EIFEQSSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
' ' STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUN CITY MAUVE $61.30 |  $36,780.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
46 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521393005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY DOGWOOD $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
47 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY GRAY $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
48 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY BLUE $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
49 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
SUN CITY VERDE $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
50 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
BRIDGE GREEN $68.47 |  $41,082.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
51 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521391005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
MACK GREEN $50.17 |  $30,102.00 $77.25|  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
52 | 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521395005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN

NOTE: AppRdwmmBan contgiyed in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNS'L_SP(/)M!I\_]; SHEEC/\/;Q;/\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCFI’EIT\‘CT)EIFEQSSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ’ STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
No. | oTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUNCITY PEACH $63.55 $38,130.00 $77.25 $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
53 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
ROBERT GREEN $63.55 $38,130.00 $77.25 $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
54 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
PARKS BLUE $50.17 $30,102.00 $77.25 $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521395005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
PARKS BEIGE $63.55 $38,130.00 $77.25 $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
56 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #9521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
BLACK
$52.66 $31,596.00 $77.25 $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
57 600
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND 49521630605 DURA-CRAFT SATIN
es | 600 NIZZLE GREEN $63.55 |  $38,130.00 $77.25 |  $46,350.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
KWAL
MANUFACTURER/BRAND 49521392005 DURA-CRAFT SATIN

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

/sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNS'L;SP(/)M!I\_]; SHEEC/\/;Q;/\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCF;IT\‘CT)EIFEQSSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ’ STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
No. | oTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EXTERIOR, LATEX-MASONRY, FLAT, 100 ACRYLIC
VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT EXCEED 260 g/L
59 | 600 PINNACLE $62.88 |  $37,728.00 $72.10 | $43,260.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND KWAL #9521632005 DURA-CRAFT FLAT
EXTERIOR, PRIMER-ENAMERL UNDERCOAT VOC
CONTENT SHALL NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (LGALLON)
60 | 100 COLOR - RED $13.13 $1,313.00 $24.97 $2,497.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
A-10 PRIMER
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #845089004323 PRO-BLOCK LTX INT / EXT PRIMA
INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT,
GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)
61 | 100 COLOR ALUMINUM $25.34 |  $2,534.00 $23.12|  $2,312.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMEX
MANUFACTURER/BRAND 4845089004156 INDUSTRIAL ENL
INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT, GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL
NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)
62 100 COLOR - BLACK $22.05 $2,205.00 $21.44 $2,144.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMEX
MANUFACTURER/BRAND BAR089004187 INDUSTRIAL ENL
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -

BORDER CONSTRUCTION

E\LNQ'IA\_SP(?I-II\_I;(I' SHEECN;&;/\(/;L#;(AMS DBA GLIDDENCPEF:\‘?-EI;SSIONAL PAIN SPECIALTIES, LLC
’ ’ STONGSVILLE, OH PHOENIX, AZ
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. | QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT, GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL
NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)
63 | 100 COLOR - MACK GREEN OR HUNTER GREEN $22.97 $2,297.00 $21.44 $2,144.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND AT INDUSTRIAL ENL
POLYURETHANE- SEALER WATER BASE (TO PROTECT
MURALS OR PAINTED CONCRETE SURFACE) VOC CONTENT
SHALL NOT EXCEED 540 g/L (1 GALLON)
64 | 100 COLOR - CLEAR COAT $32.81 $3,281.00 $37.77 $3,777.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMEX MINI-WAX WATER BASE
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #845089999780 POLYURTHANE
EPOXY WATER BASE, PART A VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 540 g/L (1 GALLON)
65 | 100 COLOR - CLEAR COAT $42.97 $4,297.00 $31.87 $3,187.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND 5 4%(%2"9%;66 WATER B;\ASFETE:OXY SIG
EPOXY WATER BASE, PART B VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 540 g/L (1 QUART)
66 | 100 COLOR - CLEAR COAT $8.22 $822.00 $7.96 $796.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMEX WATER BASE
MANUFACTURER/BRAND #845089004576 EPOXY HARDERNER PART B
TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATED PRICE $1,265,359.25
(ITEMS 1 THRU 66) $1,001,833.40 VENDORS PRICE
$1,265,359.30
| |
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:__ 6/26/12

/sl

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

KWAL PAINT
EL PASO, TX

SHERWIN WILLIAMS
EL PASO, TX

AKZO NOBEL PAINTS LLC -
DBA GLIDDEN PROFESSIONAL PAIN
CENTER

STONGSVILLE, OH

BORDER CONSTRUCTION
SPECIALTIES, LLC
PHOENIX, AZ

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE [1] ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO [2] ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

]
L]

NOT CHECKED
PAYMENT TERMS: 0% NET 30 DAYS NET- 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT
ves[x] o [] | vesp] v [] | ves[Jwe [] | ves[Jro[]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2.5 DAYS 7 DAYS

WITHIN CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
1|”|r

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115|

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT

SERVICE CENTER INC.

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
ITEM | EST. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
No. | QT ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 1" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 1 1/2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 100 MASKING TAPE BLUE 2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 50 THINN ER-MINERAL SPIRIT 1 GALLON $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 25 CANVAS DROPS 4' x 15' 1002 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
6 25 CANVAS DROPS 9' x 12" 8 0z $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
7 25 CANVAS DROPS 12'x15' 30 0z $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PAINTERS SPRAY SOCKS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

8 300

STRAINERS W/ELASTIC BAN
9 300 (5 GALLONG SIZE) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 25 SMALL BRASS BRUSHES $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
11 25 SMALL STEEL BRUSHES $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3/4 WIRE BRUSH W/HANDLE & CRISSCROSS

12 15 DESIGN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 50 BOX OF RAGS (COTTON) 25 LBS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
14 50 ROLLER GRID, METAL (5 GALLON SIZE) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

10



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT

SERVICE CENTER INC.

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED p%'\,l(l;TE ExTT(ELADLED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
15 50 PREMIUM GREEN MASKING PAPER 9"x 180" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 60 BRUSH 3" POLYESTER $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
17 60 BRUSH 1 1/2" ANGLE SASH POLYESTER $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 60 BRUSH 2 1/2" ANGLE SASH POLYESTER $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
19 | 400 ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 9" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 | 150 ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
21 | 150 WINNIE ROLLER FRAME HEAVY DUTY 6" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
22 | 350 LAMBSKIN ROLLER COVER 3/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23 | 200 LAMBSKIN ROLLER COVER 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
24 | 200 POLYESTER ROLLER COVER 4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
25 | 100 POLYESTER WINNIE ROLLER COVER 6" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 20 5 GALLON BUCKET OPENER TOOL
27 15 4'x8" HEAVY DUTY EXTENSION POLES $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
28 20 ROLLOR COVER & BRUSH CLEANER TOOL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
29 50 DUCT TAPE - RED $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
30 60 WD-40 120z, SMART STRAW $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
31 o5 PUTTY KNIFE 1" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
32 25 PUTTY KNIFE 3" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTER INC. O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUNCITY BEIGE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
33 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY MARBLE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
34 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUNCITY OFF WHITE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
35 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
JOE PICKETT RED $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
36 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
CRIMSON RED $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
37 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY WHITE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
38 | 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
CORNELLUS BROWN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
39 | 600
APPROVED BY: MANYFACTURER/BRAND

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTER INC. O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. | QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
HECTOR BROWN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
40 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
PARKS BROWN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
41 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY PEANUT SHELL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
42 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUNCITY / MISSION GREEN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
43 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY PINK $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
44 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUNCITY YELLOW $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
45 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

/sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTER INC. O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
No. | QTv. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUN CITY MAUVE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
46 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY DOGWOOD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
47 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY GRAY $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
48 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUNCITY BLUE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
49 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
SUN CITY VERDE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
50 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
BRIDGE GREEN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
51 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
MACK GREEN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
52 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND

NOTE: AppRrdwmmBan contgiyed in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES

BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTER INC. O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. | QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUNCITY PEACH $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
53 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
ROBERT GREEN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
54 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
PARKS BLUE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
PARKS BEIGE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
56 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
BLACK $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
57 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
NIZZLE GREEN $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
58 600
MANUFACTURER/BRAND

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

/sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
s
11

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115
DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTER INC. O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM | EST. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EXTERIOR, LATEX-MASONRY, FLAT, 100 ACRYLIC
VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT EXCEED 260 g/L
59 | 600 PINNACLE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
EXTERIOR, PRIMER-ENAMERL UNDERCOAT VOC
CONTENT SHALL NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (1GALLON)
60 | 100 COLOR - RED $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT,
GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)
61 | 100 COLOR ALUMINUM $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND
INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT, GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL
NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)
62 | 100 COLOR - BLACK $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER/BRAND

NOTE: KB?’%‘VI:”@B% contqg}ed in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

2010

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012

BID # 2012-115

DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

EL PASO PAINT
SERVICE CENTER INC.
EL PASO, TX

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE
STORES, INC. DBA
O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
SPRINGFIELD, MO

ITEM

EST.
QTY.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
EXTENDED
PRICE

63

INDUSTRIAL, OIL BASE PAINT, GLOSS VOC CONTENT SHALL
NOT EXCEED 420 g/L (1 GALLON)

100

COLOR - MACK GREEN OR HUNTER GREEN

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MANUFACTURER/BRAND

64

POLYURETHANE- SEALER WATER BASE (TO PROTECT
MURALS OR PAINTED CONCRETE SURFACE) VOC CONTENT
SHALL NOT EXCEED 540 g/L (1 GALLON)

100

COLOR - CLEAR COAT

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MANUFACTURER/BRAND

65

EPOXY WATER BASE, PART A VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 540 g/L (1 GALLON)

100

COLOR - CLEAR COAT

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MANUFACTURER/BRAND

66

EPOXY WATER BASE, PART B VOC CONTENT SHALL NOT
EXCEED 540 g/L (1 QUART)

100

COLOR - CLEAR COAT

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

MANUFACTURER/BRAND

TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATED PRICE
(ITEMS 1 THRU 66)

NOTE:

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__ 6/26/12

2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION JIL

BID ITEM: PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES BID # 2012-115
BID DATE: MAY 30, 2012 DEPARTMENT: TRANSPORTATION

2010

EL PASO PAINT O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE

STORES, INC. DBA
SERVICE CENTERINC.| mtr v AUTG PARTS

EL PASO, TX SPRINGFIELD, MO

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE [1] ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF I:‘ I:‘ I:‘ I:‘
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
TWO [2] ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF I:‘ I:‘ I:‘ I:‘
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED D D D D

PAYMENT TERMS:

CB:LI\DSDERAGREESTOACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT YESI:l NO |:l YESI:l NO |:l YESI:l NO |:l YESI:l NO |:l

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
WITHIN CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDS SOLICITED: 19 BIDS RECEIVED: 6 BIDS LOCAL: 14 NO BID: 0
AFPFPROVED BY. /ST

DATE:___6/26/12 2012-115 PAINT AND PAINTING SUPPLIES - TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT




