
Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.
NET OR   NET OR   NET OR   

A.    - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR   
   +____% MARK-UP    +       % MARK-UP    +       % MARK-UP

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________
NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

VEEDER - ROOT 

576047-172

NO BIDDated__________________________

N/A

Mar-11 NO BID

________________________

PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
N/A

NO BID

(Note:  Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________

____________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST:

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

NO BID

PART A:  PRICE LIST PRICING

VEDEROOT/GILBAR CO
UNDERGROUND TANK-

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012
Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

DESCRIPTION

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

X

X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 1



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.
NET OR   NET OR   NET OR   

2.    - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR   
   +____% MARK-UP    +       % MARK-UP    +       % MARK-UP

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________
NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

N/A

ROTARY LIFTS
(Note:  Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST:

________________________

1.  HEAVY DUTY

N/A

List Number_____________________

N/A

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

NO BID

ROTARY

Jan-12

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

________________________

PART A:  PRICE LIST PRICING

LIFT - ROTARY

Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands
Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012

DESCRIPTION

PRICE LIST OR CATALOG

2.  LIGHT DUTY

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

____________

NO BID

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

X

X X

X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 2



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.
NET OR   NET OR   NET OR   

3.    - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR      - ____% DISCOUNT OR   
   +____% MARK-UP    +  15  % MARK-UP    +       % MARK-UP

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________

              YES                 NO   

NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS: YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

NONE STATED

TYPE OF PRICE LIST:

________________________ CONTRACT

Dated__________________________ Jul-11 7/1/2011 NO BID

List Number_____________________ CLEAN ENERGY FUELING 
PRODUCTS CLENP NO BID

CNG FUELING ISLAND

PRICE LIST OR CATALOG
OPW________________________

(Note:  Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

PART A:  PRICE LIST PRICING
P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O RDESCRIPTION

OPW CLEAN ENERGY N/A

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012
Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

X

X

X

X

X X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 3



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.

NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Part #886100010

NONE STATED

          NO

NO BID

      YES

NO BID

          NO

Part #886100010

$335.00

FLOAT ASSEMBLY FLOAT ASSEMBLY

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

VR886100.010

$69.00

VR794380.208
$178.00

NO BID
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

NO BID

SUMP SENSOR
N/ANO BID

NONE STATED

Part #794380208

NO BID

SUMP SENSOR

N/A
Part #794380208

NONE STATED
NONE STATED

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor

N/A

DESCRIPTION

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up): $335.00

$178.00

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net):

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Part #886100010

$69.00

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

A1.

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $404.00

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor
from PART A Regular Rate):

DESCRIPTION FLOAT ASSEMBLY

NO BID

      YES

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012

$247.00

A2. CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net):

from PART A Regular Rate):

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost):

Part #794380208

SUBMITTED, WITH OFFER, TWO (2) ELECTRONIC COPIES (OR 
HARDCOPIES) OF EACH MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST(S) ON 

WHICH BID WAS BASED:

SUMP SENSOR

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

          NO      YES

N/A

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

X X X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 4



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.

NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION SEAL HYDRA W/SPRING-12 5/8

$353.50

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor $69.00 NO BID $75.00 / HR
$288.75from PART A Regular Rate):

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Part #ROJC220 KIT

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $266.00 NO BID

B4. PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):
NO BID

NO BID

SEAL 101 HYDRA SEAL

JK227-KIT
$86.00

$363.50
SEAL HYDRA W/SPRING-12 5/8

$75.00

CORRECT PART NUMBER 
JG220-KIT

 Part #ROJC220 KIT

NO BID

 Part #CT-1000S   (LS)

$64.75

INSTALL EXCLUDED

N/A

Part #ROJK227KIT

$74.75
$75.00 / HR

$288.75

SEAL 101 HYDRA SEAL

$1,339.19
BIDDER'S PRICE:  NA

B3.

Part #ROJC220 KIT

SEAL 101 HYDRA SEAL

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net):
LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor
from PART A Regular Rate):

DESCRIPTION

$75.00

SEAL HYDRA W/SPRING-12 5/8

$69.00

$144.00TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost):

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012
Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

Part #ROJK227KIT

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

C5.

ROJK227KIT

ROJL220KIT

$75.00

NO BID

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

CNG NOZZLE

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

NONE STATEDN/A

$1,339.19
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):

$197.00
$197.00

$1,361.74

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor

NO BID

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

NONE STATED

NO BID

NO BID

Part #ROJK227KIT

Part #CT-1000S 
N/A

NONE STATED$1,388.18

NO BID

CNG NOZZLE

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: OPCT1000SS CT-1000S

DESCRIPTION CNG NOZZLE

from PART A Regular Rate):

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): PARTS ONLY $1,361.74

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Part #CT-1000S 

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net): $1,361.74

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net):

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 5



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

ITEM NO.

NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

SHOP BILLING RATE:  REGULAR

C6. CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up or Net):

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost):

PART C:  INSTALLATION SERVICE, REPAIRS, 
CALIBRATION & INSPECTION RATES

ANNUAL TOTAL

TOTAL FOR 36 MONTHS

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up):

from PART A Regular Rate):

DESCRIPTION

$2,362.94
BIDDER'S PRICE: NONE STATED $717.00

NONE STATED

OPILB-5

CNG BREAKAWAY

$1,061.21

CNG BREAKAWAY

NA

PER HOURA:  SERVICE & REPAIRS - UNDERGROUND TANK

$3,483.95
EXCLUDES CNG INSTALLATION

$10,451.85
EXCLUDES CNG INSTALLATION

$1,061.21

CNG BREAKAWAY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012

Part #ILB-5 

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor INSTALL EXCLUDED

ILB-5
Part #ILB-5 

$1,061.21

SHOP BILLING RATE:  AFTER 
HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS

Part #ILB-5 
N/A

$1,023.75
NONE STATED

N/A$1,023.75
BIDDER'S PRICE:  NA

NONE STATED

PARTS ONLY $1,061.21

YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

NO BIDNO BID$69.00
PER HOUR PER HOUR

YES                 NO   O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS: YES                 NO   

NO BID

$7,088.82
BIDDER'S PRICE: NONE STATED $2,151.00

$103.50

YES                 NO   

Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

NO BID

YES                 NO   

X X X

X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 6



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

PART C:  INSTALLATION SERVICE, REPAIRS, CALIBRATION & INSPECTION 
RATES

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012
Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR
$69.00 NO BID N/A

N/A

N/A

SHOP BILLING RATE:  AFTER 
HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS

SHOP BILLING RATE:  REGULAR

SHOP BILLING RATE:  AFTER 
HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS $103.50

A:  INSPECTION RATES - UNDERGROUND TANK PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS: YES                 NO   YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

SHOP BILLING RATE:  REGULAR $69.00

$103.50

A:  CALIBRATION RATES - UNDERGROUND TANK

N/A

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS: YES                 NO   YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

B:  SERVICE & REPAIRS - LIFT PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR

SHOP BILLING RATE:  AFTER 
HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS $103.50 $110.00

SHOP BILLING RATE:  REGULAR $69.00 NO BID $75.00

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS: YES                 NO   YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

C:  SERVICE & REPAIRS - CNG FUELING ISLAND PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR
SHOP BILLING RATE:  REGULAR N/A  LABOR EXCLUDED NO BID N/A

YES                 NO   YES                 NO   YES                 NO   

SHOP BILLING RATE:  AFTER 
HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS N/A  LABOR EXCLUDED N/A

O.E.M. CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: MARK 
APPROPRIATE BOX AND ATTACH DOCUMENTS:

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

NO BID

X

X

X X

X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 7



Solicitation #:   2012-130
Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE
CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF
THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDS RECEIVED: 3                    BIDS LOCAL:  3 NO BIDS:  0
NOTE:  THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS BID TABULATION IS FOR INFORMATION ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACTUAL AWARD/EXECUTION OF CONTRACT.

D&H UNITED PUMP SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

NOYES

NET - 30 DAYS

YES NO

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED:     7                                

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

YES NO

NET - 30 DAYS

PERFORMANCE EQUIPMENT
OF EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

Project Name:  Service And Parts For Tank/Lift & Fueling Islands
Bid Opening Date:  January 25, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

SECTION, BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS:

WITHIN _______CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

WITHIN _______HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL
ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY 
PROCUREMENT CARD:

PAYMENT TERMS:

PURSUANT TO THE ABOVE REQUIREMENTS IN THE REQUIRED DELIVERY

NOTE:  IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE 
CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

7 DAYS* BASED UPON AVAILABILITY 
FROM MANUFACTURER PLUS EXPEDITED 

FREIGHT

2 DAYS
ITEMS WILL BE PUT IN STOCK IF CONTRACT IS 

AWARDED
10 DAYS

36 HOURS* BASED UPON AVAILABILITY 
FROM MANUFACTURER PLUS EXPEDITED 

FREIGHT
NONE STATED 24 HOURS

GRANBERRY SUPPLY CORP
DBA HOSE POWER USA

EL PASO, TX

X X

X X X

X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/______ DATE:____02/13/2012____ 8


