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CITY OF EL PASO Ees
BID TABULATION FORM U

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

AL )
AMO SHOOTERS m>N>>W.CZ_mO_~_<_m & | BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC.
SUPPLY MEN'S STORE INC. SHREVEPORT. LA
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ROCHESTER, IN ’
ITEM||  ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mxﬂmmw_wu UNIT PRICE mxﬁﬂw_.mc UNIT PRICE mxwmﬂ_wrmc UNIT PRICE mxwwﬂw_.mo
# EST.ary. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 200 COAT, NO BID NO BID $760.00 | $152,000.00 NO BID
EA ° | PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, INC.
MODEL NUMBER 20813A
2. 200 PANTS, NO BID NO BID $540.00 $108,000.00 NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, INC.
MODEL NUMBER 20813B
3. 10 COAT, NO BID NO BID NO BID $850.00 $8,500.00
EA PROTECTIVE, PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER GLOBE FIRE FIGHTER SUITS
MODEL NUMBER GXCELL P/N D1822-G
4. 10 PANTS, NO BID NO BID NO BID $685.00 $6,850.00
PAIR PROTECTIVE, PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER GLOBE FIRE FIGHTER SUITS
MODEL NUMBER GXCELL PIN E1882-G

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE wﬁg
DATE: O/ 5/ (%~
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BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

El'Paso
Erafred

All-Rmerica City

gy

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALAMO SHOOTERS BAZAAR UNIFORMS & | BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, | .\ <. INDUSTRIES, INC.
SUPPLY MEN'S STORE INC. SHREVEPORT. LA
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ROCHESTER, IN ’
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE quqm”w_wc UNIT PRICE mx.ﬂmﬂw_,m_u UNIT PRICE mxﬂ.umﬂ_wrmc UNIT PRICE quqﬂ_vquou_.mc
# EST.QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5. 300 HELMET, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA FIRE FIGHTER
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
6. 250 HOOD, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA FLASHOVER, KNIT
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
7. 400 GLOVES, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
8. 200 BOOTS, $263.25 $52,650.00 $193.00 $38,600.00 NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER BLACK DIAMOND THOROGOOD 804-6379
MODEL NUMBER 277-0912 804-6379
9 200 SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA DYNA BACK OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: E
u>4mumxmmmmv\
2012-180 STRUGTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE 2
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

El Paso
ek kok ok

Al-AimenicaCity

Bl | L

2000

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALAMO SHOOTERS m>N>>x.cz__uox_sm & | BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC.
SUPPLY MEN'S STORE INC. SHREVEPORT. LA
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ROCHESTER, IN ’
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mxﬁﬂﬁﬂ_wc UNIT PRICE mxﬁwﬂ_h_,u_.mc UNIT PRICE vaOm_q,_w_,mc UNIT PRICE mxﬁm.n»u_w_u
# EST.QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
10 10 HELMET, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
11. 10 COVER, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY/ALUMINIZED
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
12. 10 HELMET SHROUD, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
13. 10 FACESHIELD, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
14. 10 GLOVES, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: _S/ w\\k

2012-180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

El Paso
Exvfead

An-RruericaCiy

qpy

520010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALAMO SHOOTERS m>N>>_~.cz=uo_~_<_m & | BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL, CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC.
SUPPLY MEN'S STORE INC. SHREVEPORT. LA
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX ROCHESTER, IN ’
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mXH.._.a_Um._—“_\»U_.mU UNIT PRICE mx.m—.n_umﬂw_w_u UNIT PRICE mx.“n_vm."_\._,urmc UNIT PRICE mx._.._.ﬁ_um.".‘.w_umu
# EST.QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
15, 10 BOOTS, NO BID LEFT BLANK NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
16.| 250 PPE GEAR BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
17. 200 FIRE HELMET, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA FRONTS
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER _
18.| 400 FIRE HELMET, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA ID
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
TOTAL ITEMS #1 THRU #18 $52,650.00 $38,600.00 $260,000.00 $15,350.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _\w&

DATE: _S/3 Nmm\

2012-180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

L 1]

El Paso
i o s k|

A-Aimerica City

qpy

© 2010 -
SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

ALAMO SHOOTERS

BAZAAR UNIFORMS &
MEN'S STORE
EL PASO, TX

SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX

BRISTOL FIRE APPAREL,
INC.
ROCHESTER, IN

CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC.
SHREVEPORT, LA

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

]

]

[X]

[X]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NONE SELECTED NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES _H_ zO_H_

NOT SELECTED

YES H zOD

YES D NO E

YES H zo_u

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within __ consecutive calendar days

30 DAYS 30 DAYS

12-14 WEEKS FROM RECEIPT OF
ORDER AND SIZES

30 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY’S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: N Vm
DATE: U NW \W

2012-~180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE




El Paso
ke ok Ak

Ar-America €y

Ly

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT | DOOLEY TACKABERRY, FIRE FIGHTER TOOL FIRE SERVICE
INC. INC. SUPPLY EQUIPMENT, INC.
LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX SPRING, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM| ~ ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE mxwwmwrmo UNIT PRICE EXTENDED
# || EST.QIY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 200 COAT, $869.00 $173,800.00 | $838.00 | $167,600.00 | $831.31 $166,262.00 MMMM%MA“ Mm‘wwmummwco%k
EA PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL . T
MANUFACTURER LION INNOTEX QUAKER HONEYWELL LTO-3416
MODEL NUMBER JANESVILLE LIBERTY INNO6000 76C-9G-2F-79 *ALT. RANGER RNG-341G
2. 200 PANTS, $613.00 |$122,699.00 | $575.00 |$115,000.00 | $525.48 $105,096.00 WMMM%%O\ mmwwwﬂomm%mk
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL VENDOR'S PRICE: $122,600.00 AR
MANUFACTURER LION INNOTEX QUAKER HONEYWELL LTO-341G
MODEL NUMBER JANESVILLE SUPER PANT INNO6000 76P-9G-2F-79 *ALT. RANGER RNG-341G
*ALTERNATE BID MEETS SPECIFICATION
3. 10 COAT, $797.00 $7,970.00 $828.00 $8,280.00 $879.84 $8,798.40 $1,023.00 | $10,230.00
EA PROTECTIVE, PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER LION INNOTEX QUAKER HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER JANESVILLE AERO LIBERTY INNO6000 76C-40-2F-73 LTO-7603
4. 10 PANTS, $691.00 $6,910.00 $650.00 $6,500.00 $614.38 $6,143.80 $785.00 $7,850.00
PAIR _uvmo._.mnw-—._<mu PROXIMITY VENDOR'S PRICE: $6,503.00
MANUFACTURER LION INNOTEX QUAKER HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER JANESVILLE AERO SUPER PANT INNO6000 76P-40-2F-73 LTO-7603

NOTE: The information
APPROVED BY:

DATE: S[3 /2

ntained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLLOTHING

El Paso
o ik e

At-imerica City

Y

F2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

. - DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT | DOOLEY TACKABERRY, | FIRE FIGHTER TOOL FIRE SERVICE
NG INC. SUPPLY EQUIPMENT, INC.
LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX SPRING, TX EL PASO, TX
TEu WMJZM”W DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mX._.._.W.“..nu—.mc UNIT PRICE mx._.._.n_um.r>UrmU UNIT PRICE mx._.._%m.rﬁurmu UNIT _uW_O_m mx.m._.wmﬂ\_ru_.m_u
# E e PRICE : PRICE PRICE PRICE
5.| 300 HELMET, $168.00 | $50,400.00 | $176.80 | $53,040.00 | $130.65 | $39,195.00 | $135.00 | $40,500.00
EA FIRE FIGHTER VENDOR'S PRICE: $53,010.00
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD MORNING PRIDE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER LEGACY 5 FX HT-LFL-HDO LITE FORCE PLUS
6. | 250 HOOD, $18.00 | $4,500.00 N/A $24.42 | $6,105.00 | $38.00 | $9,500.00
EA FLASHOVER, KNIT
MANUFACTURER PACII MAJESTIC HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER P84 P84 PACII 30022557FNF
7. 400 GLOVES, $80.00 $32,000.00 N/A $71.50 $28,600.00 $88.00 $35,200.00
PAR | PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER LION DRAGON FIRE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER 3DX KEVLAR WRISTLET ALPHAX SGKCG
8. | 200 BOOTS, $273.00 | $54,600.00 NIA $306.32 | $61,264.00 | $254.00 | $50,800.00
PAR | PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER LION HAIX HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER SIC MARSHALL FIRE HUNTER XTREME 4200
9 | 200 |SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY,| $26.00 | $5,200.00 NIA NO BID $27.00 | $5,400.00
EA DYNA BACK OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER LION HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER EZH H-BACK SP-DFQ

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

c.ﬁm"%%
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID [TEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

il

El Paso
ek ok

At-Amenca Gty

qy

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT | DOOLEY TACKABERRY, FIRE FIGHTER TOOL FIRE SERVICE
| INC. INC. SUPPLY EQUIPMENT, INC.
LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX SPRING, TX EL PASO, TX
| ITEM mb,wz_.zMwW DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mx._.‘m.”_’u_.mc UNIT PRICE mx._..qn_.mﬂ\_ru_.mc UNIT PRICE mx“ﬂﬂ»wrmc UNIT PRICE mx.m_.n_vm._.z.v_.m_u
v # RS PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
_ 10 10 HELMET, $430.00 $4,300.00 *$440.10 *$4,401.00 $316.78 $3,167.80 $313.00 $3,130.00
*INCLUDES SHROUD, HELMET COVER,
EA PROXIMITY AND GOLD COATED _n>o_<_mm:_m5m_~
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD MORNING PRIDE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER LFH 3910G LEGACY 5 PROXIMITY HELMET| AX HT-LFL-PRO X HT-LF2-PROX
11. 10 COVER, $93.00 $930.00 $93.20 $932.00 $43.18 $431.80 $88.00 $880.00
EA PROXIMITY/ALUMINIZED
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD MORNING PRIDE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER LFH1011 ALUMINIZED SHELL COVER R260 HP-PHCL HP-PHCB
12. 10 HELMET SHROUD, $242.00 $2,420.00 $271.90 $2,719.00 $59.65 $596.50 m\_co.co‘ $1,000.00
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD MORNING PRIDE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER SHROUD W? RT7100 R757 HP-PEF-2007 HP-PEF-2007
13. 10 FACESHIELD, $109.00 $1,090.00 $105.70 $1,057.00 $105.97 $1,059.70 $205.00 $2,050.00
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER LION BULLARD MORNING PRIDE HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER GOLD COATED FACESHIELD R340 HP-E130GC HP-E130-GC
14. 10 Q_.O<mm. $124.00 $1,240.00 N/A $95.15 $951.50 $118.00 $1,180.00
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER LION HONEYWELL HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER GL 5200 GL-BPR-RGA GLBRRGA

zoqmungm @ww mo:\nmm:mg Ez_mmzn.nmc:_mao:mmﬁo_;:*o:,:m:o:o:_z-m:aaomm:oﬁoozmzﬁﬁmmoﬁcm_mimq&mxmo:ao:anosqmor
DATE: S /3/12° .

2012-180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE




BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

El Paso
Bregfoearsd

AR-RntericaCRy

Y

- 2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT | DOOLEY TACKABERRY, FIRE FIGHTER TOOL FIRE SERVICE
INC. INC. SUPPLY EQUIPMENT, INC.
LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX SPRING, TX EL PASO, TX
_._.M._s _Wﬂ.zmww DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mx.qqn_umﬂw_w_..« UNIT PRICE mx,m_.nmﬂﬂ_.mc UNIT PRICE mx.”.nmﬂ,ormc UNIT PRICE mx.ﬂm,_—“_\yc_.mc
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
15. 10 BOOTS, LEFT BLANK N/A NO BID $145.00 $1,450.00
PAIR PROXIMITY _
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER 6211
16. 250 PPE GEAR BAG LEFT BLANK N/A $37.24 $9,310.00 $43.00 $10,750.00
EA
MANUFACTURER OK-1 HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER 3000 B30RS
17. 200 FIRE HELMET, LEFT BLANK $50.90 $10,180.00 $37.99/ | $7,598.00/ $31.00 $6,200.00
$8.73 $1,746.00
EA FRONTS
MANUFACTURER DOOLEY TACKABERRY, INC. MORNING PRIDE FAHRENHEIT UNIFORMS
MODEL NUMBER PASSPORT FRONT HF-PS3 I HF-PS4 EPFD SPEC.
18. 400 FIRE HELMET, LEFT BLANK NO BID $21.74 $8,696.00 $9.00 $3,600.00
EA D
MANUFACTURER MORNING PRIDE FAHRENHEIT UNIFORMS
MODEL NUMBER HF-PS2 EPFD SPEC.
$453,275.50 /
516,320.00
TOTAL ITEMS #1 THRU #18 $467,960.00 $369,709.00 $447,423.50 .Ea%.wm:mxz_am PRICE: $468.42000
VENDOR'S PRICE: LEFT BLANK VENDOR'S PRICE: N/A VENDOR'S PRICE: $455,021.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: %%
DATE: ﬂm NT\
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25,2012

L o

El Paso
Bty

m:m:.”_w-_m:w_—“

" 2010 ,'”
SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT | DOOLEY TACKABERRY, FIRE FIGHTER TOOL FIRE SERVICE
INC. INC. SUPPLY EQUIPMENT, INC.
LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX SPRING, TX EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

NOTE: QUOTE IS VALID 1 YEAR FROM
AWARD - PRICE INCREASE NOT TO
EXCEED 5% PER YEARFORTHE 2 (1
YEAR) RENEWAL PERIODS,

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

consecutive calendar days

NO OPTION OFFERED H H md'ﬂ_y H
NONESTATED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT x| No
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YEs|[X| No|_| YES[X] No[ ] Yes| | no[ ] YES|X| No[_|
NONE STATED ADD 3% TO THE PURCHASE
ﬂ_wmmm.m PROMISED DELIVERY: 90 - 120 DAYS 30 - 45 DAYS 45 DAYS NONE STATED

_=u BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED wm“M\ mm

DATE: S/5/12-

2012-180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

.

El Paso
et sk

At-merica Gity

gy’

L2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FREIGHTLINER, STERLING, | QUEST ENTERPRISES,
WESTERN STAR OF ARIZONA INC.
TOLLESON, AZ WALSENBURG, CO
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mx._.qﬁ_vm.uyc_.mc UNIT PRICE mx._..qmm.rﬂ_.mc UNIT PRICE mx._m.”_ﬂ_.mc UNIT PRICE mx._.._,nm.ﬂ_bw_.mc
# EST. QrY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 200 COAT, $822.50 | $164,500.00 | $864.00 | $172,800.00
EA PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LTD QUEST ENTERPRISES
MODEL NUMBER CVNG-804-903-42-GBT PS 1115 QNETIC COAT
2. 200 PANTS, $518.97 | $103,794.00 | $573.00 |$114,600.00
PAIRR | PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LTD QUEST ENTERPRISES
MODEL NUMBER TVNG-804-903-41-GBT PS 1155 QNETIC COAT
3. 10 COAT, $973.86 $9,738.60 NO BID
EA PROTECTIVE, PROXIMITY ,
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LTD
MODEL NUMBER CVCP-907-903-00-ABT
4. 10 PANTS, $671.91 $6,719.10 NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER VERIDIAN LTD
MODEL NUMBER TVCP-907-903-00-ABT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: b\ W
DATE: S NM\Nwl

2012-180 STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE
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L

BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

El Paso
e

Al-Rmesica City

"W

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FREIGHTLINER, STERLING, | QUEST ENTERPRISES,
WESTERN STAR OF ARIZONA INC.
TOLLESON, AZ WALSENBURG, CO
B = -

ITEM|  ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE quqn_um”,_,urmc UNIT PRICE mxwmﬂ_w_.mc UNIT PRICE mvuqmﬂb_w_.mo UNIT PRICE mxﬁwﬁ‘w_wo
# EST.QrY. : PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5. 300 HELMET, NO BID NO BID

EA FIRE FIGHTER
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
6. 250 HOOD, NO BID NO BID
EA FLASHOVER, KNIT
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
7. 400 GLOVES, NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
8. 200 BOOTS, NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
9 200 SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY, NO BID $40.00 $8,000.00
EA DYNA BACK OR EQUAL
MANUFACTURER QUEST ENTERPRISES
VMIODEL NUMBER X-BACK, 8-BUTTON
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: %
DATE: §/3 :w\
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

El Paso
Bty

RR-Amerdca City

1LY

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FREIGHTLINER, STERLING, | QUEST ENTERPRISES,
| WESTERN STAR OF ARIZONA INC.
TOLLESON, AZ WALSENBURG, CO
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mx._.._.n_vm._v.-\w_:mc C.Z_._. PRICE mx.ﬂﬂm.”w_u_um_u UNIT PRICE mx.m‘ﬂn_um._-ﬂ_bc_.mc UNIT PRICE mX._..an—H->_u_um_u
# EST.QrY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
10| 10 HELMET, NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
1.0 10 COVER, NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY/ALUMINIZED
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
12.| 10 HELMET SHROUD, NO BID NO BID
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
13.] 10 FACESHIELD, NO BID NO BID -
EA PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
14.0 10 GLOVES, NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER

NOTE: H?wxm%@mmqwﬂmo ntained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: _S/ w /1
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

El Paso
| ik |

Alt-AmericaChy

T

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

FREIGHTLINER, STERLING, | QUEST ENTERPRISES,
WESTERN STAR OF ARIZONA INC.
TOLLESON, AZ WALSENBURG, CO
ITEM ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE mx._‘_.ﬁ_vm.nw—mmc UNIT PRICE _mx._.._%mﬂﬂ_um_u UNIT PRICE mx,m_‘nwmﬂwrmc UNIT PRICE mx._.._.n_vm._—”.\mu_mm_u
# EST. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
15. 10 BOOTS, NO BID NO BID
PAIR PROXIMITY
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
16.| 250 PPE GEAR BAG NO BID NO BID
EA
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
17.| 200 FIRE HELMET, NO BID NO BID
EA FRONTS
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
18.| 400 FIRE HELMET, NO BID NO BID
EA ID
MANUFACTURER
MODEL NUMBER
TOTAL ITEMS #1 THRU #18 $284,751.70 $295,400.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: @
DATE: IM\WQDN\
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CITY OF EL PASO e

At-imedca Glty

BID TABULATION FORM Uy’

2010

SOLICITATION #: 2012-180
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

BID ITEM: STRUCTURAL AND PROXIMITY FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING
BID DATE: APRIL 25, 2012

FREIGHTLINER, STERLING, | QUEST ENTERPRISES,
WESTERN STAR OF ARIZONA INC.

TOLLESON, AZ WALSENBURG, CO

| THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

W OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

| GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X ] [ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

m_._u_u.m_w.m _u_NO_s_mm.U DELIVERY: 30 DAYS 70 DAYS

Within consecutive calendar days

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.
E_Um SOLICITED: 16 BIDS RECEIVED: 10 BIDS LOCAL.: 6 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \QW
DATE: rva /12

~
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT GARD: YES|X]| NO[ ] YES[X] NO[ ] YES[ | NO[ ] YES[ ] NO[ ]
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