
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. TRANSYND GALLON $27.59 $2,255.00 $180,400.00
+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

1.A TOTE

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

2 QUART 800 $6.06 $4,848.00
QUARTS + TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

3 QUART 600 N/A
QUARTS

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

4 25,000 $15.07 $9.44

+TAX IF ANY PER GAL
MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

5 $748.00 $399.72 $947.10 $18,942.00

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

CHEVRON DELO 400NG

CHEVRON SUPREME 5W20

$44,880.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$14,960.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

OEM ONLY

BREWER OIL CO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC
EL PASO, TX

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES A DIV 
OF NCH CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

$121,396.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$40,465.33

MOBIL DEL VAC ATF M/M TORQUE GLIDE #10177252

CHEVRON GEO RPM 15W-40

LEFT BLANK
$56,826.00

BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

$541,200.00
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

NO BID

$14,544.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$4,848.00

NO BID

$376,750.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$125,583.33 + 
TAX IF ANY

$1,130,250.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$376,750.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

$14,960.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$4,986.66 + TAX 

IF ANY

$5.15
PER CASE 

$30.92

MOBIL DEL VAC ATF

Solicitation #:  2012-201BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012

$28.12
PER DRUM 
$1,546.87

LEFT BLANK80 DRUMS 
(55 GAL 
DRUM)

$364,188.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$121,396.00

Department:  Sun Metro

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

CHEVRON SYNTHETIC ATF-HO

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CHEVRON SUPREME SYNTHETIC

$28.12
PER TOTE 
$7,030.00

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

10 TOTES 
(250 GAL 

TOTE)
TRANSYND

SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL

MERCON LV AFT TRANSMISSION OIL 
MOTOR CRAFT

ENGINE OIL, 15W - 40 LOW ASH 
(CUMMINS APPROVED)

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 20W OR EQUIVALENT

NORTH AMERICAN PURATECH PURA-
SYN 5W-20

MOBIL SPECIAL 5W-20 STRATA XTREME 5W20 #10187682

GAL 
BULK

55 GAL. 
DRUM 20

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 1



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

6 $657.80 $399.72 $947.10 $47,355.00

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

7 $720.50 $399.72 $947.10 $66,297.00

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

8 $496.52 $356.87 $791.45 $87,059.50
+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

$12.12
9

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

10 50

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

11 55

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

CHEVRON SUPREME 5W30

CHEVRON SUPREME 10W30

BREWER OIL CO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

MOBIL SPECIAL 5W-30

MOBIL SPECIAL 10W-30

NORTH AMERICA PURAMAX 68WCHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL 68

CHEVRON RANDO HDZ #15

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BIDPER 5 GAL 
PAIL  $60.61

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

NO BID

STRATA XTREME 5W30 #10187679

STRATA XTREME 10W30 #10062946

HOL68 #10172716

$261,178.50
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

$142,065.00
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

$198,891.00
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

NO BID

$54,617.20
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$17,215.45 + 
TAX IF ANY

$163,851.60
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$51,646.30 + 
TAX IF ANY

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012

$32,890.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$10,963.33 + 
TAX IF ANY

$98,670.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$32,890.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

$50,435.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$16,811.66 + 
TAX IF ANY

$376,750.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$125,583.33 + 
TAX IF ANY

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
Department:  Sun Metro

C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC
EL PASO, TX

5055 GAL. 
DRUM

7055 GAL. 
DRUM

HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR 
EQUIVALENT

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES A DIV 
OF NCH CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
10W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL 
DRUM 110

HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-
1542 OR EQUIVALENT 50

BULKTRANSMISSION FLUID, (ZF LIST OF 
LUBRICANTS)

1 GAL 
CAN

1 GAL 
CANESTER OIL CAN. R134a

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 2



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

12 150

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING
$12.12

13

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

14 $1,700.00 $1,259.69 $2,120.00 $25,440.00

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

15 $368.05 $246.76 $408.00 $5,712.00

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

16 $4.41

+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

17 $5.29
+ TAX IF ANY

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

BREWER OIL CO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES A DIV 
OF NCH CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012

CHEVRON RANDO HDZ #15

CHEVRON RPM SYN GEAR OIL 75/90 NORTH AMERICA PURATECH 
PURA-SYN 75W-90

CHEVRON DELO EP #2 NORTH AMERICAN PURATECH HI-TEMP

CERTOP SN 75W90 #10172929

LITHIPLEX #10190627

CHEVRON MERCON V CHEVRON MULTI-VEHICLE ATF

Department:  Sun Metro

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

CHEVRON DEXRON VI MOBIL ATF +4

LEFT BLANK

PER 5 GAL 
PAIL $60.61 

C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC
EL PASO, TX

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

PER QT 
$3.50 

PER DRUM 
$770.65

PER QT 
$3.63 

PER DRUM 
$799.20

NO BID

$76,320.00
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

$17,136.00
BIDDER'S 
PRICE: $0

NO BID

NO BID

$5,152.70
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$1,717.56 + TAX 

IF ANY

$20,400.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$6,800.00+ TAX 

IF ANY

$61,200.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$20,400.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

NO BID

NO BID

QUART 100DEXTON IV PLUS TRANSMISSION FLUID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 
OR EQUIVALENT

1 GAL 
CAN 100

REFRIGERANT OIL, 
R-22

1 GAL 
CAN

14

MERCON V (OR VI WHEN AVAILABLE) 
TRANSMISSION FLUID QUART

GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC 
SAE 75W-90W

400 
POUND 
DRUM

12

100

AUTO GREASE
120 

POUND 
CAN

$15,458.10
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$5,152.65 + 
TAX IF ANY

$441.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: $147.00 
+ TAX IF ANY

$1,323.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$441.00 + TAX

IF ANY

$529.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: $176.33 
+ TAX IF ANY

$1,587.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$529.00 + TAX

IF ANY

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 3



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

18 $9.21

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

$8.12
$447.00

BREWER OIL CO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES A DIV 
OF NCH CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

NO BIDANTIFREEZE GAL

N/A DID NOT BID ALL ITEMS NOT STATED

10,000

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 12 MONTHS

$92,100.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$30,700.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

$276,300.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$92,100.00 + 
TAX IF ANY

CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50

$431,205.50

NOT STATEDN/A DID NOT BID ALL ITEMS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 36 MONTHS $0.00

C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC
EL PASO, TX

LEFT BLANK

CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201

X X

X

X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 4



BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within ___7__ 
consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt by the contractor of
a written notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within __24___ hours or the
next morning.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

3 DAYS 2 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS:

24 HOURS 24 HOURS LEFT BLANKWithin ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
of emergency.

       YES                     NO          YES                     NO   

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET

C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC
EL PASO, TX

receipt shown on the Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

NET - 30 DAYS

       YES                     NO   

NET - 30  DAYS

CERTIFIED LABORATORIES A DIV 
OF NCH CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

BREWER OIL CO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

5 - 7 DAYS

.5% - 10 DAYS

X X X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 5



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. TRANSYND GALLON $2,255.00 $180,400.00 $1,800.00 $1,669.45 $133,556.00 $400,668.00 

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

1.A TOTE $8,180.00 $8,347.25 $83,472.50 $250,417.50

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

2 QUART 800 $4.70 
QUARTS

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

3 QUART 600
QUARTS

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

4 25,000 $12.15

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

5 $947.10 $436.75

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

$81,800.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$27,267.00

$245,400.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$81,800.00

$3,760.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$1,253.00

$11,280.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$3,760.00

NO BID

$303,750.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$101,250.00

$911,250.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$303,750.00

$8,735.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$2,912.00

$26,205.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$8,735.00

NO BID

NO BID

MAXUM PETROLEUM
EL PASO, TX

$144,000.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$48,000.00

$432,000.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$144,000.00

M/M TORQUE GLIDE #10177252

SHELL SYNTHETIC BLEND 5W20

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LUBRA MAX ULTRA 5W20 #10189896

SHELL ROTELLA T3-NG-15W40

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 20W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM 20 $18,942.00 LEFT BLANK NO BID

ENGINE OIL, 15W - 40 LOW ASH 
(CUMMINS APPROVED)

GAL 
BULK

LEFT BLANK

SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL

CASTROL TRANSYND CASTROL TES 295

TRANSYND 10 TOTES 
(250 GAL 

TOTE)

NO BID

NO BID

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

CHEMSEARCH A DIV OF NCH 
CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

MERCON LV AFT TRANSMISSION OIL 
MOTOR CRAFT

80 DRUMS 
(55 GAL 
DRUM)

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

NO BID

CASTROL TRANSYND CASTROL TES 295

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

NO BID

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 6



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

6 $947.10 $47,355.00 $436.75

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

7 $947.10 $66,297.00 $436.75

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

8 $791.45 $87,059.50 $439.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

9

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

10 50

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

11 55

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

$144.870.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$48,290.00

SHELL 10W30

$21,837.50
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$7,279.00

$65,512.50
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$21,838.00

NO BID

SHELL SYNTHETIC BLEND 5W30

PERFORMANCE 500 - PREMIUM 68

$30,572.50
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$10,191.00

$91,717.50
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$30,573.00

$48,290.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$16,097.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

LUBRA GUARD 68 #10011113

NO BID

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
10W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM

BULK

110

50

50

LUBRA MAX ULTRA 10W30 #10189901

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LUBRA MAX ULTRA 5W30 #10189893

70

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ESTER OIL CAN. R134a 1 GAL 
CAN

HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-
1542 OR EQUIVALENT

1 GAL 
CAN NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDTRANSMISSION FLUID, (ZF LIST OF 
LUBRICANTS)

NO BID

HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR 
EQUIVALENT

55 GAL 
DRUM

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM

CHEMSEARCH A DIV OF NCH 
CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

MAXUM PETROLEUM
EL PASO, TX

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 7



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

12 150

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

13

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

14 $2,120.00 $25,440.00 $1,551.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

15 $408.00 $5,712.00 $293.50

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

16

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

17

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

LUBRA TECH SYNTHETIC 75W90 
#12018895

LUBRAPLEX #10189892

NO BID

NO BID

$4,109.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$1,370.00

$12,327.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$4,109.00

SHELL S6AXRME 75W90

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

SHELL S3X220

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AUTO GREASE
120 

POUND 
CAN

14

MERCON V (OR VI WHEN AVAILABLE) 
TRANSMISSION FLUID QUART 100

1 GAL 
CAN 100

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

NO BID

NO BID

CHEMSEARCH A DIV OF NCH 
CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

MAXUM PETROLEUM
EL PASO, TX

$18,612.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$6,204.00

$55,836.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$18,612.00

GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC 
SAE 75W-90W

400 
POUND 
DRUM

12

REFRIGERANT OIL, 
R-22

1 GAL 
CAN

AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 
OR EQUIVALENT

Solicitation #:  2012-201

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DEXTON IV PLUS TRANSMISSION FLUID QUART 100

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 8



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

18 $8.20

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 12 MONTHS $431,205.50 $747,466.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:  $249,156.00

10,000
$82,000.00

BIDDER'S 
PRICE:  

$27,333.00

$246,000.00
BIDDER'S 

PRICE:  
$82,000.00

SHELL ROTELLA ELC 50/50 ASTM - D5345

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 36 MONTHS $1,293,616.50 
BIDDER'S PRICE:  NOT PROVIDED

$2,242,398.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:  $747,467.00

$651,085.50

ANTIFREEZE GAL

Solicitation #:  2012-201

$217,028.50

CHEMSEARCH A DIV OF NCH 
CORPORATION

IRVING, TX

MAXUM PETROLEUM
EL PASO, TX

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

 X

X

X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 9



BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within ___7__ 
consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt by the contractor of
a written notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within __24___ hours or the
next morning.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

NOT PROVIDED 12 HOURS 24 HOURS
of emergency.

5 - 7 DAYS 2 DAYS 7 DAYS

receipt shown on the Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

Department:  Sun Metro
CHEMSEARCH A DIV OF NCH 

CORPORATION
IRVING, TX

MAXUM PETROLEUM
EL PASO, TX

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

X X X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 10



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. TRANSYND GALLON $1,418.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

1.A TOTE

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

2 QUART 800 $7.92 QT. $5.44 $4,352.00 $13,056.00 4.68 QT.
QUARTS

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

3 QUART 600 $4.20 $2,520.00 $7,560.00
QUARTS

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

4 25,000 $9.68 $9.91

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

5 $407.75 $607.57 $12,151.40 $36,454.20

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

FORD MOTORCRAFT XT-10-QLVC

NO BID

FORD MOTORCRAFT X0-5W20-DSP MOBIL SPECIAL 5W20

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
CITGO MILEMASTER

MOBIL GEO 15W40

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 20W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM 20

CITGO CNG-LNG ENGINE OIL

LEFT BLANK
$9.91 GAL

$545.05 
DRUM

MERCON LV AFT TRANSMISSION OIL 
MOTOR CRAFT

NO BID

ENGINE OIL, 15W - 40 LOW ASH 
(CUMMINS APPROVED)

GAL 
BULK LEFT BLANK

PACKAGE NOT AVAILABLE

SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL

CITGO SUPERGUARD 5-20 FORD MOTORCRAFT X0-5W20-QFS MOBIL SUPER SYNTHETIC 5W20

LEFT BLANK

CITGO QUATRASYND DRUM

CITGO QUATRASYND DRUM MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC ATF

TRANSYND
10 TOTES 
(250 GAL 

TOTE)

$6,445.50
PER 250 GAL 

TOTE
NO BIDLEFT BLANK

80 DRUMS 
(55 GAL 
DRUM)

LEFT BLANK NO BID

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

NO BID

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

TIGUA TRANSPORTATION INC.
EL PASO, TX

USD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201

WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, 
INC.

EL PASO, TX

$1,310.10
23.82 GAL 

DRUM

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

$5,955.00 SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

TOTES ARE SPECIAL ORDER AT SAME PRICE AS 
DRUM 23.82 GAL

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 11



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

6 $407.75 $495.00 $24,750.00 $74,250.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

7 $407.75 $495.00 $34,650.00 $103,950.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

8 $489.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

9

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

10 50

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

11 55

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

NO BID

$8.19 GAL
$450.45 
DRUM

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

NO BID

NO BIDESTER OIL CAN. R134a 1 GAL 
CAN NO BID

TRANSMISSION FLUID, (ZF LIST OF 
LUBRICANTS) BULK NO BID

HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-
1542 OR EQUIVALENT

1 GAL 
CAN 50 NO BID

CITGO MILEMASTER

HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR 
EQUIVALENT

55 GAL 
DRUM 110 LEFT BLANK

CITGO MILEMASTER

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
10W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM 70

AC DELCO 19287763

Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

TIGUA TRANSPORTATION INC.
EL PASO, TX

USD INC.
EL PASO, TX

WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, 
INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET

ENGINE OIL, MULTI GRADE, SHELL, SAE 
5W - 30W OR EQUIVALENT

55 GAL. 
DRUM 50 SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 

PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

$9.86 GAL
$542.30 
DRUM

MOBIL SPECIAL 5W30

AC DELCO 19287764 MOBIL SPECIAL 10W30

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

$9.73 GAL
$535.15 
DRUM

HUMBLE HYDRAULIC 68CITGO MILEMASTER

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 12



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

12 150

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

13

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

14 $1,454.36

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

15 $288.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

16 $4.19 $419.00 $1,257.00

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

17

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

$3.63
QUART

MOBIL DEXRON V1 ATF

NO BID

NO BID

375 LB DRUM 
$1,256.25

$3.35LB DRUM

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL

$284.40
$2.37 LB KEG

$3.63
QUART

MOBIL DEXRON V1 ATF

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTSDEXTON IV PLUS TRANSMISSION FLUID QUART 100

MERCON V (OR VI WHEN AVAILABLE) 
TRANSMISSION FLUID QUART 100

AUTO GREASE
120 

POUND 
CAN

14

GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC 
SAE 75W-90W

400 
POUND 
DRUM

12

REFRIGERANT OIL, 
R-22

1 GAL 
CAN

NO BID

AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 
OR EQUIVALENT

1 GAL 
CAN 100 NO BID

TIGUA TRANSPORTATION INC.
EL PASO, TX

USD INC.
EL PASO, TX

WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, 
INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

CITGO SYNTH GEAR 75-90

CITGO MYSTIC J+6 MOBILGREASE 222

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

FORD MOTORCRAFT XT-5-QML

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 13



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

18

MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

$4.94
GALLON

OLD WORLD FLEET CHARGE 50/50

SUBJECT TO ALLOWED 
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LEFT BLANK

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 36 MONTHS LEFT BLANK $326,527.20 LEFT BLANK

ITEMS 1-18, TOTAL 12 MONTHS LEFT BLANK $78,842.40

ANTIFREEZE GAL 10,000

Department:  Sun Metro

TIGUA TRANSPORTATION INC.
EL PASO, TX

USD INC.
EL PASO, TX

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201
BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012

NO BID

WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, 
INC.

EL PASO, TX

X

X X

X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 14



BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within ___7__ 
consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt by the contractor of
a written notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within __24___ hours or the
next morning.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

BIDS SOLICITED:                                      BIDS RECEIVED:                                  BIDS LOCAL:                            NO BID:                   
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

4 DAYS 2 DAYS

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 24 HOURS 4 HOURS
48 HOURS - CAN BE SAME DAY 

EMERGENCY DELIVERY SUBJECT TO 
$35.00 DELIVERY EMERGENCY FEE

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

7 DAYS

of emergency.

receipt shown on the Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BID OPENING DATE:   MAY 2, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

TIGUA TRANSPORTATION INC.
EL PASO, TX

USD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET Solicitation #:  2012-201

WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, 
INC.

EL PASO, TX

X X X

APPROVED BY:     /S/     

DATE:     5/17/2012    2012-201 LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET - SUN METRO 15


