
ITEM ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. EST QTY PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED

1a.

2a.

3 $1,754.00 $52,620.00 $157,860.00 $1,529.59 $45,887.70 $137,663.10

3a.

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY 
DBA MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY 

MUNCIE, IN

$0.00 NO CORE REQUIRED

$100.00

CUMMINS S/S# 2881781NX

REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER 
CUMMINS PART #288178ANX WITH CORE 

CHARGE EXCHANGE

CORE CHARGE (WHEN APPLICABLE)

$1,601.23

$300.00 NEW EXCHANGE$0.00

30 EA

DETROIT DIESEL E23535332

HOLSET CUMMINS S/S# 4089445 NEW ONLY

$300.00 NEW EXCHANGE

HOLSET 4089445MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING

MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING GARRETT 

TURBOCHARGER DETROIT SERIES 50 ENGINE 
PART #E23535332  WITH CORE CHARGE 

EXCHANGE

CORE CHARGEE (WHEN APPLICABLE)

$1,829.95 $45,748.75 $137,246.25

CORE EXCHANGE (WHEN APPLICABLE)

$145,463.25 $960.00 $24,000.00 $72,000.00

DESCRIPTION

REMANUFACTURED CUMMINS PART #4025407 
WITH CORE EXCHANGE $1,939.51 $48,487.75

$0.00 $300.00

NO BID $3,817.00

30 EA

$179,541.45

$76,340.00 $229,020.00 $4,395.25 $87,905.00

$500.00

$263,715.00

$96,524.65

$289,573.95 $458,880.00

2

$152,960.00GRAND TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-3a

GRAND TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-3a

$48,036.90 $144,110.70

MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING HOLSET 4955609 HOLSET

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

DIESEL EQUIPMENT SALES 
& SERVICE

POTTERVILLE, MI

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

Solicitation #:  2012-212BID ITEM:  BUS TURBOCHARGERS

1

BID OPENING DATE:  MAY 16, 2012

20 EA

20 EA

$538,624.35

Department:  Sun Metro

25 EA

25 EA

APPROVED BY:_____/s/____

DATE:__5/22/2012______  2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO 1



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:                  

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY 
DBA MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY 

MUNCIE, IN

10 DAYS1 DAY

24 HOURS 1 HOUR

NET - 30 DAYS

10 DAYS

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

Department:  Sun Metro
BID ITEM:  BUS TURBOCHARGERS

DIESEL EQUIPMENT SALES 
& SERVICE

POTTERVILLE, MI

NET - 30 DAYS

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

NET - 30 DAYS

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO   

N/AWithin ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
of emergency.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

       YES                     NO    

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

Solicitation #:  2012-212
BID OPENING DATE:  MAY 16, 2012

X

X

X

X X X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/____

DATE:__5/22/2012______  2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO 2



ITEM ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS

NO. EST QTY PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED

1a.

2a.

3 $1,617.15 $48,514.50 $145,543.50

3a.

$480.00

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL
EL PASO, TX

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

NO BID

N/A $115.00

$146,062.50 $2,433.30 $60,832.50 $182,497.50

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING QUOTING ALL NEW NO REMAN OFFERED AT 
THIS TIME, NO CORE AVAILABLE

DESCRIPTION

25 EA $1,947.50 $48,687.50

DETROIT LEFT BLANK

REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER 
CUMMINS PART #288178ANX WITH CORE 

CHARGE EXCHANGE
30 EA

NO BID
$2,154.50 $64,635.00 $193,905.00

$180,472.50
BIDDER'S TOTAL:  N/A

$205,504.40 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-3a $541,417.50
BIDDER'S TOTAL:  N/A

$616,513.20 $0.00

MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING QUOTING ALL NEW NO REMAN OFFERED AT 
THIS TIME, NO CORE AVAILABLE 2881781NX CUMMINS

CORE CHARGE (WHEN APPLICABLE) 30 EA

$227,800.80
BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 
$227,800.98

CORE CHARGEE (WHEN APPLICABLE) 20 EA N/A $375.00

$3,357.50 $67,150.00 $201,450.00 $96,157.40 $288,472.20 $3,796.68
$75,933.60

BIDDER'S 
PRICE: 

$75,933.66

2
TURBOCHARGER DETROIT SERIES 50 ENGINE 

PART #E23535332  WITH CORE CHARGE 
EXCHANGE

20 EA

MANUFACTURE SUBMITTING QUOTING ALL NEW NO REMAN OFFERED AT 
THIS TIME, NO CORE AVAILABLE 4089445 CUMMINS

CORE EXCHANGE (WHEN APPLICABLE) 25 EA N/A N/A

PREVOST CAR (US) INC
ELGIN, IL

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2012-212
BID OPENING DATE:  MAY 16, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro
BID ITEM:  BUS TURBOCHARGERS

1

$4,807.87

GRAND TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-3a

REMANUFACTURED CUMMINS PART #4025407 
WITH CORE EXCHANGE

APPROVED BY:_____/s/____

DATE:__5/22/2012______  2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO 3



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:                  

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

PREVOST WILL MAINTAIN INVENTORY 
FOR HIGH USAGE PARTS TO BE 

DELIVERED WITHIN 3-5 BUSINESS 
DAYS

STEWART & STEVENSON POWER 
PRODUCTS LLC

EL PASO, TX

10 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED:             23                                     BIDS RECEIVED:               6                           BIDS LOCAL:          13                         NO BID:        1

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 24 HOURS 24 HOURS
of emergency.

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

PREVOST CAR (US) INC
ELGIN, IL

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL
EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  BUS TURBOCHARGERS Solicitation #:  2012-212
BID OPENING DATE:  MAY 16, 2012 Department:  Sun Metro

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

10 DAYS

X

X X

X X X

APPROVED BY:_____/s/____

DATE:__5/22/2012______  2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO 4


